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[57] ABSTRACT

An improved method and apparatus for routing data
transmissions among computer networks. The com-
puter networksare interconnected withaseries ofgate-
way circuits. Each gateway identifies all destination
computers to which it is connected and identifies the
path or paths to each destination computer. For each
identified path, the gatewaystores the topological delay
time for a transmission, the path bandwidth for the
narrowest bandwidth segment of a path and a number
corresponding to the reliability of the path. When a
transmission is received, the gateway examines the vari-
ous paths in accordance with a predetermined algo-
rithm which also considers the channel occupancy of
each path to determine a best path for transmision. The
data transmission is then directed over the best path. If
more than one path exists, the data may be directed in
multiplex fashion over two or more paths with the
amount of data on each path being related to the quality
of the path. The routing information to destination net-
worksis broadcast periodically by each gatewaycircuit
to its neighboring gateway circuits.

64 Claims, 11 Drawing Sheets
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