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Genentech Laboratory Notebook Procedures

Important steps for maintenance of your notebooks:

1)

2)

3)

4)

5)

6)

8)

9)

10)

Use dark permanent ink to record all of your work in your notebook on a daily basis. Sign and date
each day’s entries.

Permanently affix all attachments without covering any other entries. Please attach copies of any
computer data entered into your computerfiles. These data are considered part of your experimen-
tal record.

Make any changes in data in dark permanent ink and, if appropriate, initial and date in the margin.
Ensure that the original entry remains visible. Leave no open areas. When the book is completed line
out any unused portion of a page at the end of each experiment.

Have a witness who understands and is aware of your work, but who is not directly involved in your
project, sign and date your notebookentries (not later than one month after you do the work).

Don’t hold back data for later entry and don’t keep a "rough draft’ notebook.

Report the quantitative or qualitative results only. Avoid over broad and potentially inflammatory
comments like "failed experiment", "doesn’t work", or "toxic compound.”

The source and character of starting materials should be described. Preferably, refer to the notebook
pages describing the starting material and its method of preparation.

Be sure your notebook record is understandable. Omit abbreviations or slang that would not be
understood by others working in your field. It is helpful to introduce each experiment with a state-
ment of purpose, and make liberal use of cross-references to related experiments. While sufficient
detail should be included to enable reproduction of experiments, it is acceptable to refer to conven-
tional or published procedures. However, record any changes you may make to such procedures.

Record your ideas too, not just experimental data. This is important to demonstrate when an inven-
tion or thought occurred to you, and is an important part of establishing priority in inventorship
contests. Don't hesitate to broaden the scope of your ideas; there is no reason to limit them to
specific experiments planned for the next few days, although you should include as much detail as
possible. Your notebook will not be published and there is no penalty for guessing wrong on note-
book idea entries, so don’t hesitate to let your imagination run.

Try to keep a different notebook for each product and/or project. Please complete the table of con-
tents indicating which product and/or project this work concerns.

Genentech’s success, and with it your own prosperity and research support, depends upon the quality
and timing of your work. This may require that we prove what you did and when youdid it in the face
of a contrary challenge. Such challenges have and will continue to arise in judicial proceedings, in patent
validity or infringement or challenge, inventorship priority contests and productliability actions. The
key to winning in such casesis the ability to supply appropriate evidence.
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