

LIST OF TIME/FEE ENTRIES INCURRED BUT NOT REQUESTED IN PETITIONER'S MOTION

\*Time entries split across three related matters are combined in this list.

Time Entry Date:	Services Performed By:	Services Performed:	Hours*:	Hourly Fee:
1-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	ADDRESS PROBLEMS WITH SECOND ROUND OF AIT FILINGS; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE WITH AIT'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JEREMY REGARDING STRATEGY FOR CALL WITH BOARD AND SANCTIONS TO REQUEST; CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING SAME	2.2	\$460.00
1-Dec-15	E. HUNT	STRATEGY WORK, CONFERENCES AND COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING HANDLING PROTECTIVE ORDER VIOLATIONS; PREPARE FOR TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PTAB REGARDING RPI REPLY AND SANCTIONS	3.6	\$1,005.60
1-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	TELEPHONE CALL TO PTAB TO <i>[address protective order breach]</i> ; UPDATE PLEADINGS INDEX WITH DOCUMENTS FILED BY PATENT OWNER	0.4	\$32.20
2-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	PREPARE OUTLINE FOR BOARD CALL; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM AIT COUNSEL REGARDING NEW LEAD COUNSEL AND PROTECTIVE ORDER ISSUES; CONFER WITH JEREMY REGARDING SAME	5.2	\$1,087.30
2-Dec-15	E. HUNT	SCHEDULE AND PREPARE FOR PTAB TELEPHONE CONFERENCE	5.7	\$1,592.10
2-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	UPDATE PLEADING INDEX; DOCKET CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOARD; [...]	0.9	\$70.80
3-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT CALL WITH BOARD REGARDING REPLY ON RPI AND PROTECTIVE ORDER SANCTIONS; DEBRIEF WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING SAME	6.4	\$1,338.20
3-Dec-15	E. HUNT	PREPARE FOR, ATTEND, AND FOLLOW UP ON TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PTAB; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BRODSKY AND OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING SAME	5.1	\$1,424.40

4-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	[...] CONFER WITH E. HUNT REGARDING PRODUCING [document] REGARDING PROTECTIVE ORDER BREACH	0.3	\$62.70
4-Dec-15	E. HUNT	REVIEW AND DISCUSS BOARD'S ORDER; PREPARE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENT PRODUCTION	2.4	\$670.20
4-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	DOWNLOAD ORDER OF THE BOARD; ATTEND TO DOCKETING DEADLINES IN BOARD ORDER; UPDATE PLEADINGS INDEX; BATES LABEL ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS TO PRODUCE; COMMUNICATE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING THE SAME	0.9	\$70.80
9-Dec-15	E. HUNT	ASSIST WITH RPI REPLY AND MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	0.9	\$251.40
10-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	DRAFT MOTION TO SEAL; PREPARE LIST OF PROBLEMS WITH AIT FILINGS IN PREPARATION FOR MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; EDIT UPDATED LIST OF EXHIBITS	1.2	\$94.50
16-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	COMMUNICATE WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING PREPARATION OF EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; COMMUNICATE WITH HELP DESK REGARDING COLLECTION OF EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL TO USE AS EXHIBITS; UPDATE PRODUCTION INDEX TO REFLECT CONFIDENTIAL DESIGNATION OF RPX DOCUMENTS PRODUCED[]; BEGIN TO GATHER POTENTIAL EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; DOCKET DUE DATE FOR SUR-REPLY TO PATENT OWNER PRELIMINARY RESPONSE]	4.8	\$377.80
22-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	SERVE AS-FILED DOCUMENTS RELATED TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS ON CLIENT; MANAGE SIGNED ACKNOWLEDGMENTS TO PROTECTIVE ORDER	0.3	\$22.50
9-Jan-16	V. WEEKS	EMAIL WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING STATUS OF AIT'S OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	0.1	\$0.00
13-Jan-16	V. WEEKS	DOWNLOAD OPPOSITION AND EXHIBITS FILED BY AIT; ATTEND TO UPDATING PLEADINGS INDEX	1.5	\$0.00

14-Jan-16	R. GIUNTA	REVIEW AIT REPLY REGARDING SANCTIONS; [...]	4.5	\$500.00
14-Jan-16	E. HUNT	STUDY AIT'S SANCTIONS OPPOSITIONS; [...]	4.8	\$2,280.00
25-Jan-16	R. GIUNTA	PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT CALL WITH BOARD; DEBRIEF WITH JEREMY AND STEVE REGARDING SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING PREPARING MOTION TO SEAL	1.5	\$1,260.00
25-Jan-16	E. HUNT	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING SAME; PREPARE DRAFT REDACTIONS TO PATENT OWNER'S OPPOSITION TO SANCTIONS	2.7	\$1,282.50
26-Jan-16	R. GIUNTA	REVIEW BOARD ORDER REGARDING RPX FILING MOTION TO SEAL AIT FILINGS	0.2	\$168.00
26-Jan-16	E. HUNT	REVIEW PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD ORDER	0.3	\$142.50
26-Jan-16	V. WEEKS	REVIEW BOARD DECISION; ATTEND TO DOCKETING DEADLINE FOR MOTION TO SEAL	0.3	\$34.00

TOTAL HOURLY FEES: \$14,227.50

**TOTAL FEES INCURRED BUT NOT REQUESTED: \$12,093.38**  
(in mixed time entries related to protective order breaches)