

Invoice No. 16020633

February 24, 2016

RPX CORPORATION
ATTN: MR. JEREMY BRODSKY
SENIOR DIRECTOR, CORPORATION DEVELOPMENT
ONE MARKET PLAZA, STEUART TOWER, SUITE 800
SAN FRANCISCO, CALIFORNIA 94105

FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND COSTS INCURRED THROUGH 01/31/16

R0723.60001US00 INTER PARTES REVIEW OF US 8484111 (AIT)
Serial No: IPR2015-01750
Client Reference: IPR-005

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/9/16	VLW	EMAIL WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING STATUS OF AIT'S OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	0.10	\$0.00
1/13/16	VLW	DOWNLOAD OPPOSITION AND EXHIBITS FILED BY AIT; ATTEND TO UPDATING PLEADINGS INDEX	0.50	\$0.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/14/16	EHH	STUDY AIT'S SANCTIONS OPPOSITIONS; [REDACTED]	1.60	\$760.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]

RPX EXHIBIT 1052
RPX v. AIT
IPR2015-01751

[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/25/16	EHH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD;OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING SAME; PREPARE DRAFT REDACTIONS TO PATENT OWNER'S OPPOSITION TO SANCTIONS	0.90	\$427.50
1/26/16	VLW	REVIEW BOARD DECISION; ATTEND TO DOCKETING DEADLINE FOR MOTION TO SEAL	0.10	\$0.00
1/26/16	EHH	REVIEW PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD ORDER	0.10	\$47.50
1/27/16	EHH	REVIEW FEEDBACK ON REDACTIONS	0.10	\$47.50
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/28/16	EHH	WORK ON REDACTIONS AND MOTION TO SEAL	0.60	\$285.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]

R0723.60002US00 INTER PARTES REVIEW OF US 7356482 (AIT)
Serial No: IPR2015-01751
Client Reference: IPR-005

[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/13/16	VLW	DOWNLOAD OPPOSITION AND EXHIBITS FILED BY AIT; ATTEND TO UPDATING PLEADINGS INDEX	0.50	\$0.00

1/14/16	EHH	STUDY AIT'S SANCTIONS OPPOSITIONS; [REDACTED]	1.60	\$760.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/25/16	EHH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING SAME; PREPARE DRAFT REDACTIONS TO PATENT OWNER'S OPPOSITION TO SANCTIONS	0.90	\$427.50
1/26/16	VLW	REVIEW BOARD DECISION; ATTEND TO DOCKETING DEADLINE FOR MOTION TO SEAL	0.10	\$0.00
1/26/16	EHH	REVIEW PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD ORDER	0.10	\$47.50
1/27/16	EHH	REVIEW FEEDBACK ON REDACTIONS	0.10	\$47.50
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/28/16	EHH	WORK ON REDACTIONS AND MOTION TO SEAL	0.60	\$285.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]

R0723.60003US00

INTER PARTES REVIEW OF US 7356482 (PETITION 2) (AIT)

Serial No: IPR2015-01752
Client Reference: IPR-005

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/13/16	VLW	DOWNLOAD OPPOSITION AND EXHIBITS FILED BY AIT; ATTEND TO UPDATING PLEADINGS INDEX	0.50	\$0.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/14/16	RFG	REVIEW AIT REPLY REGARDING SANCTIONS;	4.50	\$500.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/14/16	EHH	STUDY AIT'S SANCTIONS OPPOSITIONS; [REDACTED]	1.60	\$760.00
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
1/25/16	RFG	PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT CALL WITH BOARD; DEBRIEF WITH JEREMY AND STEVE REGARDING SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING PREPARING MOTION TO SEAL	1.50	\$1,260.00

1/25/16	EHH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING SAME; PREPARE DRAFT REDACTIONS TO PATENT OWNER'S OPPOSITION TO SANCTIONS	0.90	\$427.50
1/26/16	RFG	REVIEW BOARD ORDER REGARDING RPX FILING MOTION TO SEAL AIT FILINGS	0.20	\$168.00
1/26/16	VLW	REVIEW BOARD DECISION; ATTEND TO DOCKETING DEADLINE FOR MOTION TO SEAL	0.10	\$34.00
1/26/16	EHH	REVIEW PATENT TRIAL AND APPEAL BOARD ORDER	0.10	\$47.50
1/27/16	RFG	REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED REDACTIONS TO AIT SANCTIONS OPPOSITION	0.90	\$0.00
1/27/16	EHH	REVIEW FEEDBACK ON REDACTIONS	0.10	\$47.50
1/28/16	RFG	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING JEREMY'S COMMENTS REGARDING REDACTIONS; REVIEW EMAIL TO JEREMY REGARDING SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING MOTION TO SEAL	1.20	\$0.00
1/28/16	EHH	WORK ON REDACTIONS AND MOTION TO SEAL	0.60	\$285.00



Explore Litigation Insights

Docket Alarm provides insights to develop a more informed litigation strategy and the peace of mind of knowing you're on top of things.

Real-Time Litigation Alerts



Keep your litigation team up-to-date with **real-time alerts** and advanced team management tools built for the enterprise, all while greatly reducing PACER spend.

Our comprehensive service means we can handle Federal, State, and Administrative courts across the country.

Advanced Docket Research



With over 230 million records, Docket Alarm's cloud-native docket research platform finds what other services can't. Coverage includes Federal, State, plus PTAB, TTAB, ITC and NLRB decisions, all in one place.

Identify arguments that have been successful in the past with full text, pinpoint searching. Link to case law cited within any court document via Fastcase.

Analytics At Your Fingertips



Learn what happened the last time a particular judge, opposing counsel or company faced cases similar to yours.

Advanced out-of-the-box PTAB and TTAB analytics are always at your fingertips.

API

Docket Alarm offers a powerful API (application programming interface) to developers that want to integrate case filings into their apps.

LAW FIRMS

Build custom dashboards for your attorneys and clients with live data direct from the court.

Automate many repetitive legal tasks like conflict checks, document management, and marketing.

FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS

Litigation and bankruptcy checks for companies and debtors.

E-DISCOVERY AND LEGAL VENDORS

Sync your system to PACER to automate legal marketing.