

**LIST OF ATTORNEY'S FEES REQUESTED IN PETITIONER'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES**

\*Time entries split across three related matters are combined in this list.

<b>Time Entry Date:</b>	<b>Services Performed By:</b>	<b>Services Performed:</b>	<b>Hours*:</b>	<b>Hourly Fee:</b>
15-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	PREPARE MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH JEREMY REGARDING SAME	3.7	\$1,909.20
15-Dec-15	E. HUNT	REVIEW AIT'S DECLARATIONS REGARDING SCOPE OF UNAUTHORIZED DISCLOSURE OF PROTECTIVE ORDER MATERIALS; ASSIST WITH INITIAL PREPARATION OF MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	0.6	\$167.70
15-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	DOWNLOAD COPIES OF ORDERS ON MOTIONS FOR SANCTIONS FOR R. GIUNTA'S REVIEW; EMAILS WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING INFORMATION NEEDED IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	0.6	\$47.20
16-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	PREPARE MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	12.8	\$2,676.30
17-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH JEREMY REGARDING SAME	5.8	\$1,212.70
17-Dec-15	E. HUNT	ASSIST WITH MOTION FOR SANCTIONS AND REVISED PROTECTIVE ORDER	3.3	\$921.60
17-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	COMMUNICATE WITH R. GIUNTA AND E. HUNT REGARDING PREPARATION OF MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; SAVE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DESKSITE; PREPARE ADDITIONAL EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; SAVE PLEADINGS TO DESKSITE; CREATE SCREEN [CAPTURES/SHOTS]	3.6	\$283.30
18-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR SANCTIONS AND NEW PROTECTIVE ORDER; CONFER WITH JEREMY REGARDING SAME	7.1	\$1,484.50
18-Dec-15	E. HUNT	ASSIST WITH MOTION FOR SANCTIONS AND REVISED PROTECTIVE ORDER	1.5	\$418.80

RPX EXHIBIT 1050 RPX v. AIT IDB2015-01751
---

18-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	COMMUNICATE WITH R. GIUNTA REGARDING PREPARATION OF MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; ATTEND TO CREATION OF EXHIBITS AND EDITS TO EXHIBITS; DRAFT MOTION TO SEAL; ADD PAGE NUMBERS TO EXHIBITS	4.8	\$377.80
20-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	APPLY EXHIBIT LABELS TO EXHIBITS IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	1.5	\$118.00
21-Dec-15	R. GIUNTA	PREPARE MOTION TO SEAL SANCTIONS MOTION; FINALIZE SANCTIONS MOTION; CONFER WITH E. HUNT REGARDING SAME AND CONFIRMING WITH AIT	5.4	\$2,786.40
21-Dec-15	E. HUNT	PREPARE MOTION FOR SANCTIONS, EXHIBITS AND MOTION TO SEAL	6.6	\$1,843.50
21-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	UPDATE PLEADINGS INDEX; [REVISE AND LABEL EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR SANCTIONS; EDIT] UPDATED EXHIBIT LIST; COMMUNICATE WITH E. HUNT AND R. PRITZKER REGARDING PREPARATION AND FORMATTING OF MOTION TO SEAL, MOTION FOR SANCTIONS AND EXHIBITS TO SAME; ELECTRONICALLY FILE MOTIONS, EXHIBIT LIST AND NUMEROUS EXHIBITS; PREPARE SERVICE EMAIL TO OPPOSING COUNSEL	8.7	\$684.70
23-Dec-15	V. WEEKS	ATTEND TO DOCKETING RESPONSE DEADLINE FOR MOTION FOR SANCTIONS	0.3	\$23.70
27-Jan-16	R. GIUNTA	REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED REDACTIONS TO AIT SANCTIONS OPPOSITION	0.9	\$0.00
27-Jan-16	E. HUNT	REVIEW FEEDBACK ON REDACTIONS	0.3	\$142.50
28-Jan-16	R. GIUNTA	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING JEREMY'S COMMENTS REGARDING REDACTIONS; REVIEW EMAIL TO JEREMY REGARDING SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. HUNT REGARDING MOTION TO SEAL	1.2	\$0.00
28-Jan-16	E. HUNT	WORK ON REDACTIONS AND MOTION TO SEAL	1.8	\$855.00

TOTAL HOURLY FEES: \$15,952.90

**TOTAL FEES BILLED AND REQUESTED: \$13,559.97**