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A method of encoding a message including a plurality of 
data items, includes identifying maximum and minimum 
numbers of first edges to be associated with data items. A 
first distribution of different numbers of first edges, ranging 
from the maximum to the minimum number of first edges, 
to be associated with the data items is computed. A first 
associated number of first edges, within the range, is estab­
lished for each data item, the different numbers of first edges 
being associated with the data items according to the com­
puted first distribution. A maximum and minimum number 
of second edges to be associated with redundant data items 
are identified. A second distribution of numbers of second 
edges, ranging from the maximum to the minimum number 
of second edges, to be associated with the redundant data 
items is computed. An associated number of second edges, 
within the range, is established for each redundant data item, 
the different numbers of second edges being associated with 
the redundant data items according to the determined second 
distribution. A threshold number of potentially lost/ 
corrupted data items is established. An encoded message is 
formed with the redundant data items associated with the 
data items according to the first distribution and with the 
data items associated with the redundant data items accord­
ing to the second distribution only if the number of data 
items which are recoverable or correctable exceeds the 
threshold. 
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