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[57] ABSTRACT
A computer controlled defibrillator comprising a set

[111 3,862,636

[451 .lan.28, 1975 

of electrodes which are engageable with a patient and
which are connected to a source of electrical energy
by a circuit means. The circuit means comprises stor-
age capacitors, energy selector, computer, manual and
reset switches. voltage monitor. current monitor, and
output meter. The computer responds to certain exter-
nal inputs. automatic and manual. and controls the
output delivered to the patient. The energy selector
permits the selection of the energy which is desired to
be delivered to the patient. The sequence is started by
closing the manual reset switch which zeroes the out-
put meter and activates the power supply (electrical
energy) at a voltage which is dependent on the energy
selector. The energy derived from the power supply is
stored in the storage capacitors. The energy selector,
which is manually set to the energy desired, also feeds
an input to the computer. When the manual switch is
activated, the computer causes the stored energy
source to be connected to the patient through the
electrodes. The current monitor and voltage monitor
feed instantaneous signals to the computer which
computes the energy as a continuous integration pro-
cess. When the computed energy equals the selected
energy, the computer causes the energy source to be
disconnected from the patient. The total energy deliv-
ered to the patient is indicated as a steady reading on
the output meter. A modified form of. the defibrillator
is also disclosed wherein the magnitude of current in
the electrical circuit means may be manually or auto-
matically selected to enable the defibrillator to com-
pensate for the patient‘s body weight.

5 Claims, 8 Drawing Figures
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