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[57] ABSTRACT 

A method and apparatus are provided for altering data by 
manipulation of representational dynamic graphs. Speci? 
cally, a method and apparatus are provided for using 
dynamic graphs wherein the computer user is able to 
manipulate the graph shape directly, which in turn not only 
modi?es the graph, but also alters the corresponding and 
underlying tabularized data, as well as any associated 
numeric representations of the data that may be presented to 
the computer user. The method and apparatus are provided 
for use with a computer system having a processing unit, 
system memory, a user manipulation device, and a video 
display, wherein a dynamic graph is created having at least 
one data representation element which may be focused or 
unfocused. Creation of the dynamic graph includes creating 
and saving graphical and statistical characteristics of the 
dynamic graph. Manipulation of a data representation ele 
ment via the user manipulation device may include recon 
?guring the dynamic graph to select a focused data repre 
sentation element desired to be manipulated. Modi?cation of 
the dynamic graph according to user manipulation includes 
altering not only the graphical display, but also the under 
lying graph data corresponding to the dynamic graph. The 
method and apparatus thereby provide a simple and easy 
way for users to alter their data and modify the interrela 
tionship between associated data by intuitive manipulation 
of representational dynamic graphs. 
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