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A portable computer that is configurable between a plurality 
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an easel mode in which the base of the computer and its 
display component stand vertically forming an inverted “V” 
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gation buttons that permit a user to control or manipulate 
various aspects of operation of the portable computer (such as 
Volume or display brightness) and/or content displayed the 
computer. 
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PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE 
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS 

RELATED APPLICATIONS 

This application claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Patent Application No. 61/041,365 filed Apr. 
1, 2008, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MUL 
TIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS, which is incorpo 
rated herein by reference in its entirety. 

BACKGROUND 

1. Field of Invention 
The present invention relates generally to portable comput 

ers and, more particularly, to a portable computer that is 
configurable into different functional and positional modes. 

2. Discussion of Related Art 
Portable computers, such as laptop computers or notebook 

computers, have become increasingly popular and ubiquitous 
in the home and workplace. Conventional portable computers 
most commonly have a “clam-shell’ configuration, with a 
base including the keyboard, various ports, connectors and/or 
inputs (e.g., for power and connecting peripheral devices), 
and the majority of the electrical components (e.g., the central 
processing unit and memory), and a display component piv 
otably coupled to the base by a hinge. The display component 
is movable about the hinge between a closed position, with 
the display screen positioned adjacent the keyboard, and an 
open position, with the display Screen inclined at a desired 
Viewing angle. 
Some portable computers are able to accept user inputs via 

a touch screen in addition to via conventional tools, such as a 
keyboard or mouse. The use of a touch screen to input data is 
sometimes referred to as operating in “tablet mode” because 
the computer is being used in a manner similar to a tablet of 
paper. U.S. Pat. No. 6,771,494 discloses a hybrid tablet-type 
portable computer that is capable of operating either as a 
normal laptop computer receiving user input via a keyboard 
("laptop mode'), or as a tablet computer receiving user input 
via a touch screen. The 494 patent further discloses that the 
display component of the computer is attached to the base of 
the computer by hinges that allow the display to be tilted 
relative to the base (for laptop mode), and to be rotated and 
folded against the base to configure the computer into tablet 
mode. 

Another variation of a portable computer with a moveable 
display is disclosed in U.S. Pat. No. 6,266,236. The 236 
patent discloses a computer including a base, a display mem 
ber and an arm assembly coupling the display member to the 
base. According to the 236 patent, the arm assembly allows 
pivotable movement of the display member between a plu 
rality of positions, including a notebook mode configuration, 
a tablet mode configuration, a presentation mode configura 
tion, and a closed mode. 

SUMMARY OF INVENTION 

Aspects and embodiments of the present invention are 
directed to a portable computer that is configurable between a 
laptop mode (in which the portable computer has a conven 
tional laptop appearance) and an easel mode in which the base 
of the computer and its display component stand upright 
forming an inverted “V” as discussed further below. The 
display component is pivotably coupled to the base of the 
portable computer by a hinge that allows the display compo 
nent to be rotated or tilted about a longitudinal axis running 
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2 
along an interface between the base and the display compo 
nent. Unlike the computers discussed in U.S. Pat. No. 6,266, 
236 and U.S. Pat. No. 6,771,494 above, the portable computer 
according to embodiments of the invention does not require 
an arm assembly, nor multiple, different hinge assemblies to 
be configured into the different modes. Furthermore, the por 
table computer according to embodiments of the invention is 
capable of different display modes and different functionality 
in the different configurations, as discussed below. 

Further aspects and embodiments are directed to a portable 
computer having an embedded scroll wheel that can be con 
figured to allow a user to control various features and func 
tionality of the portable computer. For example, as discussed 
further below the scroll wheel can be used to navigate among 
information displayed on the portable computer's display 
and/or to alter operating modes of the portable computer, 
and/or to control features such as Volume, display brightness, 
etc. 

According to one embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between various modes, including a closed 
mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode, a flat mode and a frame 
mode. The portable computer may comprise a display com 
ponent including a display screen, a base, and a hinge assem 
bly at least partially housed within the base and configured to 
pivotably couple the display component to the base. The 
display component may be rotatable about alongitudinal axis 
running along an interface between the display component 
and the base. In the closed mode, the display screen may be 
disposed Substantially against the base, and rotating the dis 
play component about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
mately 180 degrees from the closed mode may configure the 
portable computer into the laptop mode. Rotating the display 
component about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 
180 degrees axis from the closed mode may configure the 
portable computer into the easel mode. 

In one example of the portable computer, the display com 
ponent is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
mately 320 degrees from the closed mode. In another 
example, the portable computer comprises a display orienta 
tion module that displays content on the display Screen in one 
of a plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal axis. 
The orientation of the displayed content may be dependent on 
the current display mode of the portable computer, or may be 
configurable responsive to a user input. The portable com 
puter may further comprise a mode sensor which detects a 
current display mode of the portable computer, and the dis 
play orientation module may display content on the display 
screen in an orientation dependent on the current display 
mode detected by the mode sensor. Depending on the hinge 
assembly used, the longitudinal axis may comprises multiple 
parallel axes, and the hinge assembly may be configured to 
permit rotation of the display component about any of the 
multiple parallel axes to configure the portable computer 
between the plurality of display modes. 

Another embodiment is directed to a portable computer 
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupled to 
the base, and means for rotating the display component in a 
single direction relative to the base to configure the portable 
computer between a laptop mode and an easel mode. 

In another embodiment of a portable computer config 
urable between multiple modes including a laptop mode and 
an easel mode, the portable computer comprises a display 
component, a base, and a hinge assembly configured to rotat 
ably couple the display component to the base. The hinge 
assembly may be configured to permit rotation of the display 
component about a single axis to configure the portable com 
puter between the laptop mode and the easel mode. In one 
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example, the single axis is a longitudinal axis running along 
an interface between the display component and the base. The 
portable computer may further comprise a scroll wheel dis 
posed at least partially about the longitudinal axis. In one 
example, the display component comprises a display screen, 
and the Scroll wheel is configured to permit a user to manipu 
late content displayed on the display screen. 

Another embodiment is directed to a method of automati 
cally orienting content displayed on a portable computer. The 
method comprises rotating a display component of the por 
table computer about a longitudinal axis running along an 
interface between the display component and a base of the 
portable computer, detecting a degree of rotation of the dis 
play component relative to the base, providing a signal rep 
resentative of the degree of rotation of the display component, 
and automatically configuring an orientation, relative to the 
longitudinal axis, of the content displayed on the portable 
computer responsive to the signal. 

According to another embodiment, a portable computer 
comprises a base unit, a display unit including a display 
screen configured to display content, an orientation sensor 
which detects an orientation of the display unit relative to the 
base unit, and a display orientation module which orients the 
content displayed on the display Screen responsive to the 
orientation detected by the orientation sensor. 

Another embodiment of a portable computer comprises a 
base, a display component rotatably coupled to the base Such 
that the display component and the base are rotatable with 
respect to one another about alongitudinal axis running along 
an interface between the display component and the base, the 
display component including a display screen, and a scroll 
wheel disposed at least partially within the base and rotatable 
about the longitudinal axis, the Scroll wheel configured to 
permit a user to control at least one of operating parameters of 
the portable computer and content displayed on the display 
screen. In one example, the scroll wheel is configured to 
permit the user to adjust a Volume of Sound produced by the 
portable computer. In another example, the screen is config 
ured to display at least one of a plurality of modes of content, 
and the scroll wheel is configured to permit the user to select 
a mode of content for display by the portable computer. The 
portable computer may further comprise one or more navi 
gation buttons that may be used in conjunction with the scroll 
wheel to control aspects of the portable computer and dis 
played content. 

According to another embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between a plurality of display modes including 
a laptop mode and an easel mode, the portable computer 
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupled to 
the base and including a screen which displays content, and a 
scroll wheel accessible in each of the plurality of display 
modes and configured to permit a user to manipulate at least 
one of operating parameters of the portable computer and the 
content displayed on the screen. In one example, the scroll 
wheel is disposed at leas partially about an axis of rotation of 
the display component relative to the base. 

In another embodiment, a portable computer comprises a 
base, a display component including a screen configured to 
display content, a hinge assembly configured to rotatably 
couple the display component to the base and to permit rota 
tion of the display component about a longitudinal axis run 
ning along an interface between the display component and 
the base, and a scroll wheel disposed at least partially about 
the longitudinal axis. 

Still other aspects, embodiments, and advantages of these 
exemplary aspects and embodiments, are discussed in detail 
below. Moreover, it is to be understood that both the foregoing 
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information and the following detailed description are merely 
illustrative examples of various aspects and embodiments, 
and are intended to provide an overview or framework for 
understanding the nature and character of the claimed aspects 
and embodiments. Any embodiment disclosed herein may be 
combined with any other embodiment in any manner consis 
tent with the objects, aims, and needs disclosed herein, and 
references to “an embodiment,” “some embodiments, 
alternate embodiment,” “various embodiments.” “one 
embodiment' or the like are not necessarily mutually exclu 
sive and are intended to indicate that a particular feature, 
structure, or characteristic described in connection with the 
embodiment may be included in at least one embodiment. 
The appearances of Such terms herein are not necessarily all 
referring to the same embodiment. The accompanying draw 
ings are included to provide illustration and a further under 
standing of the various aspects and embodiments, and are 
incorporated in and constitute a part of this specification. The 
drawings, together with the remainder of the specification, 
serve to explain principles and operations of the described 
and claimed aspects and embodiments. 

al 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
below with reference to the accompanying figures, which are 
not intended to be drawn to scale. Where technical features in 
the figures, detailed description or any claim are followed by 
references signs, the reference signs have been included for 
the sole purpose of increasing the intelligibility of the figures, 
detailed description, and claims. Accordingly, neither the ref 
erence signs nor their absence are intended to have any lim 
iting effect on the scope of any claim elements. In the figures, 
each identical or nearly identical component that is illustrated 
in various figures is represented by a like numeral. For pur 
poses of clarity, not every component may be labeled in every 
figure. The figures are provided for the purposes of illustra 
tion and explanation and are not intended as a definition of the 
limits of the invention. In the figures: 

FIG. 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
computer, according to aspects of the invention, in a "laptop' 
configuration; 

FIG. 2 is a view of the portable computer of FIG. 1 in the 
closed position; 

FIG. 3 is a plan view of the exterior of the bottom of the 
portable computer of FIG. 1; 

FIG. 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
FIG. 1 in the easel mode: 

FIG. 5 is a side view of the portable computer of FIG. 4, 
illustrating the adjustable angle of the easel mode; 

FIGS. 6A-C are diagrams illustrating different positions of 
the portable computer of FIG. 4 in easel mode: 

FIG. 7A is an illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the laptop mode, illustrating a hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 7B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the easel mode, illustrating the hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 8 is a diagram of one example of the hinge assembly 
of FIGS. 7A and 7B; 

FIG.9 is a cross-sectional diagram of a portion of the hinge 
assembly of FIG. 8, taken along line 9-9 in FIG. 8: 

FIG. 10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of FIG. 
8: 

FIG. 11 is a block diagram of one example of a portable 
computer user interface architecture, according to aspects of 
the invention; 
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FIG. 12 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
graphical user interface, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 13 is a screen shot illustrating another example of a 
graphical user interface according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 14 is an illustration of a user adjusting the scroll wheel 
on a portable computer in the easel mode, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 15 is an illustration of a user pressing the scroll wheel 
on a portable computer, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 16 is an illustration of a user pressing a navigation 
button on the portable computer, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable 
computer in the laptop mode, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 18 is a view of a portion of the portable computer 
illustrating a wireless signal indicator feature, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 19 is a view of a portion of the portable computer in 
the closed position, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 20 is a plan view of one example of a power adaptor, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 21 is a side view of the power adaptor of FIG. 20; 
FIG.22A is another side view of the power adaptor of FIG. 

20, illustrating the power cord would around a cord spool, 
according to aspects of the invention; 
FIG.22B is a plan view of the power adaptor of FIG.22A 
FIG. 23 is an illustration of the portable computer coupled 

to a docking station, according to aspects of the invention; 
FIG. 24 is an illustration of the portable computer showing 

one example of a docking connector, according to aspects of 
the invention: 

FIG. 25 is an illustration of a hinge assembly coupled to a 
computer frame, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 26 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “frame” mode, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; and 

FIG. 27 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “flat mode, according to aspects of the invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

Aspects and embodiments are directed to a portable com 
puter that is configurable between different operating modes, 
including a laptop mode (in which the portable computer has 
a conventional laptop appearance), a flat mode, a frame mode, 
and an easel mode in which the base of the computer and its 
display component stand vertically forming an inverted “V” 
as discussed further below. The portable computer is capable 
of different display formats and functionality in the different 
modes, and includes a graphical user interface that may work 
seamlessly with the computer hardware to provide a unified, 
comfortable, holistic user experience. In particular, the por 
table computer may provide access to a wide array of func 
tions, both those traditionally provided by computing devices 
and those traditionally provided by other passive information 
devices. For example, the hardware and Software, including 
the graphical user interface, of the portable computer may be 
focused toward providing access to entertainment media, 
Such as audio and video (e.g., playing music, streaming video, 
viewing photographs, etc.), email, and internet, while also 
providing State-of-the-art computer processing capability. 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods and 
apparatuses discussed herein are not limited in application to 
the details of construction and the arrangement of compo 
nents set forth in the following description or illustrated in the 
accompanying drawings. The methods and apparatuses are 
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6 
capable of implementation in other embodiments and of 
being practiced or of being carried out in various ways. 
Examples of specific implementations are provided hereinfor 
illustrative purposes only and are not intended to be limiting. 
In particular, acts, elements and features discussed in connec 
tion with any one or more embodiments are not intended to be 
excluded from a similar role in any other embodiments. Also, 
the phraseology and terminology used herein is for the pur 
pose of description and should not be regarded as limiting. 
Any references to embodiments or elements or acts of the 
systems and methods herein referred to in the singular may 
also embrace embodiments including a plurality of these 
elements, and any references in plural to any embodiment or 
element or act herein may also embrace embodiments includ 
ing only a single element. References in the singular or plural 
form are not intended to limit the presently disclosed systems 
or methods, their components, acts, or elements. The use 
herein of “including.” “comprising.” “having.” “containing.” 
“involving, and variations thereof is meant to encompass the 
items listed thereafter and equivalents thereofas well as addi 
tional items. References to “or may be construed as inclusive 
so that any terms described using 'or' may indicate any of a 
single, more than one, and all of the described terms. 

Referring to FIG. 1, there is illustrated one example of a 
portable computer according to aspects of the invention. In 
FIG.1, the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the “laptop' 
mode, with the display component 102 inclined at a viewing 
angle from the base 104. The display component 102 is piv 
otably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge assembly (not 
shown) that allows the display component to be rotated with 
respect to the base. The hinge assembly may include a single 
or multiple hinges, which may be any of a variety of hinge 
types, including, but not limited, to single-axis hinges, mul 
tiple-axis hinges, geared hinges, etc. In one example, the 
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be 
rotated (or tilted) about alongitudinal axis 101 running along 
an interface between the display component and the base 104, 
as illustrated in FIG. 1 and discussed further below. The base 
104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal electronic compo 
nents (not shown). Such as a central processing unit, memory, 
and other components necessary to operate the portable com 
puter, as known to those skilled in the art. In some embodi 
ments, the base 104 may also include a touch pad 108 or 
trackball (not shown) for receiving user commands, as known 
to those skilled in the art. 

Still referring to FIG. 1, the display component 102 
includes a display Screen 110, and may also include a camera 
112, microphone 114, and infrared receiver 116, as discussed 
further below. It is to be appreciated that the locations of the 
camera 112, microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG. 1, and may be 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 and/ 
or base 104, as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. 
The display component 102 may also include cushions 118 
that provide soft contact points between the base 104 and the 
display component 102 when the portable computer is closed. 
In one example, the cushions 118 are made of rubber. How 
ever, it is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited, 
and the cushions 118 may comprise materials other than 
rubber, including, for example, a polymer, felt, or other Suit 
able materials as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. 

Referring to FIG. 2, there is illustrated a side view of the 
portable computer 100 of FIG. 1 in the closed configuration. 
As is the case for conventional clam-shell type portable com 
puters, when the portable computer 100 is closed, the display 
screen is disposed “face down against the keyboard of the 
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base 104. In the illustrated embodiment, the base 104 
includes a rounded portion 120 that houses the hinge (not 
shown) that pivotably couples the display component 102 to 
the base, as discussed further below. It is to be appreciated that 
the rounded portion 120 is not limited to having a round 
shape, but may instead have another shape, which may be 
dependent on the type of hinge used. In one embodiment, a 
power button 122, configured to turn the portable computer 
ON and OFF, may also be provided on the rounded portion 
120, as illustrated in FIG. 2. However, it is to be appreciated 
that the invention is not so limited, and the power button 122 
may be located elsewhere on the base 104. In one example, 
the power button 122 may be slightly recessed relative to the 
surface of the base 104, so as decrease the potential for the 
power button to be accidentally pressed. 
An exterior view of the bottom of the base 104 (the under 

side of the portable computer 100) is illustrated in FIG. 3. As 
can be seen in FIG. 3, in one embodiment, the base 104 
includes a plurality of feet 124. In one example, the feet 124 
are made of rubber; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
invention is not so limited and the feet may be made of 
another material. Such as, for example, a polymer or felt. A 
ventilation slit 126 may be provided near an interface 
between the base 104 and the display component 102, as 
illustrated, or elsewhere as may be desired, to allow heat to 
dissipate from the internal electronic components in the base. 
The base 104 may also include one or more speakers 128. In 
one example, the base 104 includes two stereo speakers 128, 
positioned at either side of the base, as illustrated in FIG. 3; 
however, it is to be appreciated that the portable computer 100 
may comprise more or fewer speakers which may be placed at 
any location on the base 104. A scroll wheel 132 may be 
provided to allow a user to control certain functionality of the 
portable computer 100. Such as navigating web pages, con 
trolling speaker Volume, selecting programs, etc., as dis 
cussed further below. 

According to one embodiment, the base 104 may comprise 
a cushioning strip 130 disposed along an edge of the base 104 
opposite to the interface between the display component 102 
and the base, as illustrated in FIG. 3. The cushioning strip 
130, which may comprise rubber, a polymer, or another suit 
able material, may serve as a “foot' when the portable com 
puter is configured into the easel mode, as discussed further 
below. In one embodiment, the display component 102 may 
be provided with a similar cushioning strip that may serve as 
a second Supporting foot when the portable computer is con 
figured into the easel mode. 

Referring to FIG. 4, there is illustrated an example of the 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode. To 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode (or 
closed position) into the easel mode, the display component 
102 may be folded away from the base 104, in the same 
direction as to open the computer (i.e., to configure the com 
puter from the closed position into the laptop mode) Such that 
the base 104 and the display component 102 forman inverted 
“V” shape with the bottom of the base and the back of the 
display component face another, as illustrated in FIG. 4. In the 
easel mode, the display screen 110 is visible and accessible on 
one side of the portable computer 100 and the keyboard 106 
(not shown in FIG. 4) is visible and accessible on the other 
side. 
As illustrated in FIG. 4, in one embodiment, the portable 

computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con 
trols, including a Volume control button 204 and a mute 
button 206. In one example, the volume control button 204 
may be a rocker Switch that allows a user to easily increase or 
decrease the Volume of audio played through the speakers 
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8 
128. When the user presses the volume control button 204, a 
Volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display 
screen 110, to provide a visual indication of the amount by 
which the volume is being increased or decreased. Similarly, 
pressing the mute button 206 may cause a visual indication 
that the volume is muted to appear on the display screen 110. 

According to one embodiment, when the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual display 
on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 degrees 
Such that the information appears “right-way-up, even 
through the display Screen is upside-down compared to when 
the portable computer is in the laptop mode. Thus, a user may 
simply “flip' the portable computer 100 into the easel mode 
and immediately be able to comfortably view information on 
the display Screen 110, without having to access display 
screen controls to adjust the orientation of the visual display. 
In one embodiment, the portable computer 100 includes an 
orientation (or mode) sensor that is configured to detect 
whether the portable computer is in the laptop mode or the 
easel mode, and to adjust the display accordingly. The orien 
tation sensor may be incorporated into the base component 
104, for example, underneath the keyboard 106, or into the 
display component. In one example, locating the orientation 
sensor in the display component 102, rather than the base 104, 
may provide more robust detection and therefore, may be 
presently preferred in some embodiments. The orientation 
sensor may be used to determine a precise relative orientation 
of the base component 104 with respect to the display com 
ponent 102, or vice versa, for example, to determine whether 
the device is in the laptop mode, easel mode, or Some point in 
between the two modes. In one example, the orientation sen 
sor includes an accelerometer whose output is fed to the 
computer operating system (or to dedicated logic circuitry) 
which then triggers a display inversion as appropriate. 

Accelerometers have been used in portable devices such as 
cellular phones, media players or computers, as Sudden 
motion sensors, or “drop detectors.” to protect against hard 
drive crashes in the event that the device is dropped. By 
contrast, however, the accelerometer in the portable computer 
according to an embodiment of the invention is not used to 
detect motion of the overall computer, but rather to detect a 
configuration of the portable computer 100 (e.g., laptop mode 
or easel mode), particularly, to detect an orientation of the 
display component 102 relative to the base component 104. In 
one example, information from the accelerometer is provided 
to a display controller in the portable computer and used to 
Switch the display between portrait or landscape mode, as is 
done in Some conventional devices. 

Referring to FIG. 5, when the portable computer 100 is in 
the easel mode, the base 104 is disposed at an angle 134 to the 
display component 102. This angle 134 is adjustable, for 
example, to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display 
screen 110 to be maintained for different positions of a user 
136 and of the portable computer 100, as illustrated in FIGS. 
6A, 6B and 6C. For example, when the user 136 is further 
from the portable computer, the angle 134a (FIG. 6A) may be 
made smaller than the angle 134b when the user is closer to 
the portable computer (FIG. 6B). As discussed above, in one 
example, the orientation sensor (not shown) may be used to 
detect, either approximately or precisely, the angle 134 and to 
provide the information to the computer operating system. 

According to one embodiment, the display component 102 
is pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge that allows the 
display component to be moved relative to the base so as to 
allow the portable computer 100 to be configured into the 
closed position, the laptop mode or the easel mode. As dis 
cussed above, in conventional “clamshell type portable com 
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puters, the hinges that couple the display component to the 
base generally do not permit more than about 180 degrees of 
rotation of the display component. Thus, these conventional 
portable computers can be in a closed position or open, laptop 
configuration, but cannot be configured into an easel mode 
because the conventional hinges do not permit Sufficient 
movement of the display component. Similarly, the tablet 
type portable computers discussed above have displays that 
can be opened, rotated and folded such that they lie flat 
against the keyboard on the base, but cannot be configured 
into an easel mode. Although, as discussed above, U.S. Pat. 
No. 6,266,236 discloses a computer that is configurable into 
a presentation mode, this requires a complex arm assembly. 
By contrast, the portable computer according to embodi 
ments of the present invention may be configured into the 
easel mode by simply continuing to tilt or rotate the display 
component past the "laptop positions' until a desired easel 
angle 134 is reached. 

Referring to FIGS. 7A and 7B, there is illustrated a portion 
of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge assembly 
138 that allows the portable computer to be configured into 
either the laptop mode (FIG. 7A) or the easel mode (FIG.7B), 
according to aspects of the invention. According to one 
embodiment, the hinge assembly 138 accommodates 0-320 
degrees of rotation, allowing a minimum angle 134 (see FIG. 
5) of 40 degrees. However, it is to be appreciated that the 
hinge assembly 138 may allow greater or fewer degrees of 
rotation, provided only that sufficient rotation is allowed so as 
to configure the portable computer 100 into either the laptop 
mode or the easel mode. As discussed above, in one embodi 
ment the portable computer 100 includes an orientation sen 
sor (not shown) that is configured to detect a relative orien 
tation of the display component 102 and the base component 
104. In one example, the orientation sensor may be an accel 
erometer incorporated into the base component 104, as dis 
cussed above. Alternatively, the orientation sensor may be 
incorporated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be used to 
detect movement of the hinge assembly, and to translate that 
movement into an information about the relative orientation 
of the display component 102 and the base component 104 
(for example, a size of the angle 134). It is also to be appre 
ciated that the orientation sensor may include electronic or 
mechanical components, or a combination thereof. For 
example, the hinge assembly may be provide with detents that 
provide an indication of the mode of the portable computer. 
As discussed above, and also illustrated in FIGS. 7A and 

7B, the portable computer may also comprise a scroll wheel 
132 that allows a user to adjust, control and/or select various 
aspects of the portable computer (e.g., wireless capability or 
speaker volume) or items displayed on the display screen 110. 
A housing 160 may contain or Support various mechanical 
and/or electronic components (not shown) that are coupled to 
the scroll wheel 132 and are configured to convert physical 
movement of the scroll wheel into electrical signals. These 
electrical signals may be provided to the central processing 
unit of the portable computer 100 which processes the elec 
trical signals so as to translate movement of the Scroll wheel 
into control of a selected feature, for example, adjusting the 
Volume of the speaker(s) or selecting a particular item dis 
played on the display Screen, as discussed further below. 
One embodiment of the hinge assembly 138 is illustrated in 

FIG.8. The hinge assembly includes a bracket 140 rotatably 
coupled to a housing 142. The housing 142 may include a first 
flange 144 that may be fastened to an internal frame in the 
base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 7A. The first flange 144 may 
include holes 146 to allow the first flange to be fastened to the 
base 104 using fasteners, such as, for example, screws, rivets 
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10 
orbolts. The bracket 140 may include a second flange 148that 
may be similarly coupled to the display component 102 using 
fasteners 150. In one embodiment, the display screen 110 (see 
FIG. 1) may be an LCD screen. As known to those skilled in 
the art, an LCD Screen generally comprises a frame and 
plastic housing. In one example, the second flange 148 may 
be fastened to either or both of the display screen frame and 
the screen's plastic housing. Referring to FIG. 25, there is 
illustrated an example of two hinge assemblies 138 coupled to 
the display frame 208 of the display component, and to the 
base frame 210 of the base component 104. According to one 
embodiment, the bracket 140 and/or housing 142 may be 
formed of cast zinc. However, it is to be appreciated that other 
materials, including other metals, may be used, and the 
bracket 140 and/or housing 142 may be formed using a pro 
cedure other than casting. Such as, for example, machining or 
molding. 

Referring again to FIG. 8, in one embodiment, the hinge 
assembly 138 may also incorporate an area 152 for locating 
the power button (FIG. 2, 122) or a navigation control button 
(FIG. 4, 166), as discussed further below. 

Referring to FIG. 9, there is illustrated a cross-sectional 
view of a portion of the hinge assembly 138 taken along line 
A-A in FIG. 8. As shown in FIG. 9, in one embodiment the 
hinge assembly 138 comprises a shaft 154 located within the 
hinge housing 142. The shaft 154 may be held in position 
within the hinge housing 142, and rotatably coupled to the 
housing, by torsion elements, such as springs 156. In one 
example, the springs 156 may be formed by stamping; how 
ever, it is to be appreciated that other methods of manufacture 
may be used. In one example, the hinge assembly may accom 
modate about 320 degrees of rotation, as discussed above, and 
may provide about 6.5 in-lbs in Symmetric torque. 

FIG.10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of FIGS. 
8 and 9. As shown in FIG. 10, the shaft 154 is coupled to a 
member 158. This member 158 may be integral with or 
coupled to the bracket 140 which is, in turn, fastened to the 
display component, as discussed above. Thus, the shaft 154 
and springs 156 provide a rotatable coupling between the 
fixed elements of the hinge assembly, namely, the hinge hous 
ing 142 and bracket 140 which are fastened to the base 104 
and display component 102 of the portable computer. In this 
manner, the hinge assembly allows the display component 
102 to be moved relative to the base 104, thereby allowing the 
portable computer to be easily and quickly configured into 
any of the closed position, laptop mode or easel mode. For 
example, simply rotating or tilting the display component 
about the longitudinal axis 101 (see FIG. 1) up to approxi 
mately 180 degrees from the closed mode configures the 
portable computer into the laptop mode, and rotating the 
display component about the longitudinal axis 101 beyond 
approximately 180 degrees axis from the closed mode con 
figures the portable computer into the easel mode. 

According to one embodiment, the portable computer may 
include integrated “navigation' hardware that allows a user to 
easily and comfortable control various features and functions 
of the portable computer, and to manipulate content displayed 
on the portable computer. For example, as discussed above, 
the portable computer 100 may comprise a scroll wheel 132 
that allows a user to control, adjust and/or select various 
functionality of the portable computer. According to another 
embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be used to provide 
“hardware navigation' through information, such as menus, 
icons, etc., displayed on the display Screen 110, as discussed 
further below with reference to FIG. 17. A common display 
configuration used in conventional computers is a "desktop' 
view in which multiple icons representing links to various 
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programs or applications are displayed over a background 
image. Navigation is conventionally performed using a 
mouse, touchpad or trackball, as known to those skilled in the 
art. In one embodiment, the portable computer 100 may dis 
play information on the display screen 110 in the conven 
tional desktop configuration, and navigation may be per 
formed using either conventional tools, such as a touchpad 
108, trackball (not shown) or peripheral, for example, a 
mouse, that is connected to the portable computer 100 via a 
port 164, or the scroll wheel 132, or a combination thereof. 
According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 includes a streamlined graphical user interface that sup 
ports 'map' navigation. The map user interface provides a 
clear overview of the entire computing environment and 
searching capability within the environment that may be 
accessed using the Scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, one or 
navigation buttons 166, 168 that may be provided on the base 
104 of the portable computer 100 (button 166) and/or in the 
keyboard 106 (button 168), illustrated in FIG. 17. In one 
embodiment, the map mode of navigation is a hierarchical 
mode that reduces the number of items to select amongst at 
any stage of navigation, thereby facilitating user access with 
the scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation button(s) 
166, 168. Of course, it is to be appreciated that the map user 
interface may also be navigated using conventional tools, 
Such as a trackball, touchpad, mouse or arrow keys. 

Referring to FIG. 11, there is illustrated a block diagram of 
one example of an architecture of the portable computer 
including a map user interface. The user interface “home' 
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172. 
In the illustrated example, the home screen 170 contains five 
modes of content 172; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
home screen may include more or fewer than five modes of 
content and that the modes of content may differ from the 
examples discussed below. According to one example, the 
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170 may 
include “media” 172a, “connect” 172b, “web” 172c, “appli 
cations' 172d, and “channels’ 172e. Using the map user 
interface, information, programs, features and applications 
may be grouped into the various modes of content 172. By 
selecting any mode of content 172, for example, by using the 
scroll wheel 132 and/or navigation buttons 166, 168, as dis 
cussed further below, the user may access the content orga 
nized within that mode. For example, the media mode 172a 
may provide access to a medial player to play, view, search 
and organize media Such as music, video, photos, etc. The 
connect mode 172b may provide access to features such as, 
for example, email, Voice-over-IP instant messaging, etc., 
and the web mode 172c may provide access to internet brows 
ing and searching. The application mode 172d may provide 
access to, for example, computer applications or programs, 
Such as word processor, spreadsheet, calculator, etc. In one 
example, these applications or programs may be provided as 
web-based services rather than programs or applications 
residing on the portable computer 100. The channels mode 
172e may provide access to different functionality of the 
portable computer, with the different functions or features 
defined as different channels. For example, a channel may 
include an alarm clock channel in which the portable com 
puter is configured to display a clock and can be programmed 
to activate an alarm, e.g., a sound, piece of music, etc., at a 
predetermined time. Another example of a channel may 
include a “photo frame' channel in which the portable com 
puter may be configured to display a pre-selected image or set 
of images, etc. Another example of a channel is a “television” 
channel, in which the portable computer is configured to 
stream Internet television. In one example, a user may con 
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12 
figure particular Internet television channels (e.g., a news 
channel, a movie channel, a home and garden channel, etc.) 
into sub-channels within the channels mode of content 172 
(e). Some or all of the modes of content 172 may access, 
retrieve and/or store information on the Internet 174. 

According to one embodiment, the different modes of con 
tent 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the display 
screen 110, as illustrated in FIG.12. The following discussion 
of various features, including hardware navigation through 
the map user interface may refer primarily to the display 
configuration illustrated in FIG. 12. However, it is to be 
appreciated that the invention is not so limited, and the modes 
of content may be displayed in other configurations, includ 
ing, for example, a "desktop' and icon configuration, a "dash 
board' type display, as illustrated in FIG. 13, or another 
configuration, as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. Similarly, navigation is discussed below primarily with 
reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navigation buttons 166, 
168; however, it is to be appreciation that navigation may also 
be accomplished using any of the conventional tools dis 
cussed above or known to those skilled in the art. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation buttons 166, 
168 may be used to navigate the user interface. Referring 
again to FIG. 12, Scrolling the Scroll wheel may sequentially 
highlight different ones of the modes of content 172. In one 
example, the highlighting may be achieved by changing the 
color of the selected mode, and/or by providing a visual 
indicator, such as a colored bar 176. A highlighted mode 172 
may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel, thereby bring 
ing up a new page' or screen on the user interface corre 
sponding to the selected mode. Once within a selected mode 
of content 172, the scroll wheel may similarly be used to 
select particular functions, features or applications within 
that mode. In one embodiment, the default action for the 
scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the portable 
computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel mode. For 
example, in easel mode, the default action for the scroll wheel 
may be channel selection within the channels mode 172(e). 
As discussed above, in one embodiment Volume control for 

the speakers 128 may be provided by the volume control 
button 204 and mute button 206. Alternatively, according to 
another embodiment, Volume control may be provided using 
the scroll wheel 132. Thus, as a user scrolls the scroll wheel 
132, as illustrated in FIG. 14 by arrow 161, a volume indicator 
may appear on the display screen 110. In one example, the 
Volume indicator may comprise a transparent, or partially 
transparent, box 162 containing Volume level indicators that 
may appear directly below the scroll wheel 132 on the display 
screen 110. In this example, as the user scrolls the scroll 
wheel 132, different volume levels in the volume box 162 
may be successively highlighted, to indicate to the user that 
the Volume is increasing or decreasing. 

In one embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be depress 
ible as well as scrollable. Thus, pressing the scroll wheel 132, 
as illustrated in FIG. 15, may allow further control, such as, 
for example, selecting a channel onto which the user has 
scrolled, or “play” and “pause of audio or video being played 
through the portable computer 100. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, one or 

more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with the 
scroll wheel. In particular, in one embodiment, the navigation 
button(s) may be used to change the action of the scroll wheel. 
As discussed above, in one example, the default action of the 
scroll wheel is Volume control. This action may be changed 
by pressing the navigation button 166, as illustrated in FIG. 
16, for example, from Volume control to menu navigation in 
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the user interface, and vice versa. According to one embodi 
ment, the effect of pressing the navigation button 166 may 
vary depending on active the mode of content of the portable 
computer 100. For example, if a user is in the media mode 
using a photo viewing application, pressing the navigation 
button 166 may change the action of the scroll wheel 132 
from mode navigation to slideshow controls for the photos. 
When the navigation button 166 is pressed, an control indi 
cator box (similar to the volume indicator box 162 discussed 
above with reference to FIG. 14) may appear containing 
different actions for the photo slideshow, such as “play.” 
“next.” “back.” “skip,” “full screen view.” etc., and scrolling 
the scroll wheel 132 may allow a user to select one of these 
actions. Pressing the navigation button 166 again may return 
the Scroll wheel action to menu navigation, to allow the user 
to, for example, move to a different feature or application 
within the active mode, or to select a different mode. 
As can be seen in FIG. 16, the navigation button 166 may 

be easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the 
easel mode, providing a convenient navigation tool for this 
configuration. A similar navigation button 168 may be pro 
vided on the keyboard 106, as illustrated in FIG. 17. In one 
example, the functionality of the two navigation buttons 166, 
168 may be the same, with the different locations providing 
easy, comfortable access in the different configuration modes 
(i.e., laptop or easel) of the portable computer 100. Thus, a 
user may use either navigation button 166 or navigation but 
ton 168, depending on personal preference. In another 
example, the two navigation buttons may have different func 
tionality. For example, the navigation button 166 may be used 
to alter the action of the scroll wheel 132, as discussed above, 
while the navigation button 168 is used to navigate 'up' or 
“down a level within the map user interface. For example, 
pressing the navigation button 168 while within a given mode 
of content may allow the user to “backup' to the home screen; 
or pressing the navigation button 168 while within a selected 
channel (in the channel mode of the content 172e) may allow 
the user to “back-up' to the channel mode main page. 

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the 
functionality of the navigation buttons 166, 168 is possible, as 
would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and the above 
examples are given for illustration only and are not intended 
to be limiting. In addition, any functions described with ref 
erence to one navigation button (166 or 168) may be instead 
(or additionally) implemented with the other navigation but 
ton. In one example, the function of the navigation buttons 
166, 168 may vary depending on whether the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the laptop mode or the easel 
mode. For example, only the navigation button 166 may be 
active in the easel mode, and only the navigation button 168 
may be active in the laptop mode. Alternatively, both naviga 
tion buttons 166, 168 may be usable in either the laptop mode 
or the easel mode, but their functionality may vary. For 
example, when the portable computer 100 is in the easel 
mode, the default action for the navigation button 166 may be 
channel selection whereas the default action for the naviga 
tion button 168 is to access the “home' screen. Furthermore, 
the portable computer 100 is not limited to the use of two 
navigation buttons and may instead comprise only a single 
navigation button or more than two navigation buttons, any of 
which may be disposed in the locations described above (e.g., 
on the rounded portion 120 of the base 104 or on the keyboard 
106), or in other locations on the portable computer. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

function or display content and/or display orientation of the 
portable computer may vary when the portable computer is 
configured from the laptop mode into the easel mode, or vice 
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Versa. For example, as discussed above, when the portable 
computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual 
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 
degrees such that the information appears “right-way-up.” 
even through the display screen is upside-down compared to 
when the portable computer is in the laptop mode. In another 
example, for at least some activities within at least some 
modes of content (e.g., viewing a photograph or video), when 
the portable computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, 
the display may automatically adjust to “full screen view’ 
(i.e., the displayed image or video is displayed on the full 
screen size, rather than in a window) to allow for comfortable 
viewing. 

In addition, as discussed above, the ability to configure the 
portable computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the easel 
mode provides enhanced functionality. For example, when 
the portable computer 100 is not being actively used, the user 
may configure the portable computer into the easel mode, and 
program the portable computer to act as a digital photo frame, 
displaying one or more photos of the user's choice. In the 
easel mode, the portable computer 100 may occupy a smaller 
footprint on a surface than in the laptop or closed modes 
because the base 104 and display component 102 are upright, 
as illustrated in FIGS. 4 and 5. In addition, because the por 
table computer can act as a passive information and/or enter 
tainment device, such as a photo frame or clock, as discussed 
above, the portable computer may provide a useful function 
even when not being actively used by the user, and may do so 
(in the easel mode) without taking up much surface area. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 may further comprise a wireless signal indicator 178, as 
illustrated in FIG. 18. The wireless signal indicator 178 may 
indicate the availability and/or strength of a wireless signal to 
which the portable computer 100 is connected, or is attempt 
ing to connect to. In one example, the color of the wireless 
signal indicator 178 may provide information regarding the 
strength of a detected wireless signal. For example, green 
may indicate a 'good” signal, yellow may indicate a “poor” or 
“low” signal; and red may indicate that there is no signal 
available. In one example, the wireless signal indicator 178 
may be ON or active whenever the portable computer 100 is 
powered up. Alternatively, the wireless signal indicator 178 
may be activated by a user action, for example, by pressing 
the navigation button 166 or another button or key provided 
on the portable computer 100, and may remain active for a 
predetermined time period (e.g., for 2 seconds, 10 seconds, 
one minute, etc.). As discussed above, the functionality of the 
navigation button 166 may vary depending on the configura 
tion mode of the portable computer 100. In one example, 
when the portable computer 100 is in the closed position, but 
still powered up, the default action for the navigation button 
166 may be to activate the wireless signal indicator 178. 
According to one embodiment, the portable computer 100 

may be provided with power cord and adapter to allow the 
portable computer to be plugged into a wall Supply. Referring 
to FIG. 19, there is illustrated a view of a portion of the 
portable computer 100, showing a power jack 180 to which 
the power adaptor can be connected. As discussed above, the 
portable computer 100 may also include a port 164 to which 
peripheral devices, such as mouse, external keyboard, por 
table flash drive, memory Stick, etc. may be connected. In one 
example, the port 164 is a USB port; however, it is to be 
appreciated that the port may accommodate protocols other 
than USB. In addition, although only one port 164 is illus 
trated in FIG. 19, the portable computer 100 may comprise 
multiple ports that may accommodate multiple protocols. In 
one example, the portable computer 100 may also comprise a 
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headphonejack 182. It is to be appreciated that the location of 
any or all of the power jack 180, port(s) 164, and headphone 
jack 182 are not limited to the example shown in FIG. 19, but 
may be anywhere convenient or desirable on the portable 
computer 100. 

Referring to FIG. 20, there is illustrated a top down view 
one example of a power adaptor 184that may be used with the 
portable computer 100 and connected via the powerjack 180. 
As known to those skilled in the art, the power adaptor 184 
comprises a transformer (not shown) that converts the wall 
power to a level acceptable for use by the portable computer 
100. In one embodiment, the power adaptor 184 comprises a 
substantially round body 186 that houses the transformer and 
other necessary components. A connector 188 may allow the 
power adaptor 184 to be connected to a wall outlet or exten 
sion cord. In one example, the connector 188 may include 
foldable prongs 190 that can be folded against the connector 
188 for storage, andfolded out for connection, as illustrated in 
FIG. 21. A cord 192 may be slidably accommodated within 
the body 186, such that the cord may be stored within the body 
and flexibly extended (up to its maximum length) by a user. 

According to one embodiment, the cord 192 may be wound 
around a cord spool 194 located within, or partially within, 
the body 186 of the power adaptor 184. As illustrated in FIG. 
21, the cord spool 194 may be configured to slide out from the 
body 186 of the power adaptor 184, such that the cord 192 can 
be wound around the cord spool 194, as illustrated in FIGS. 
22A and 22B. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 may be configured to connect to a docking station 196, as 
illustrated in FIG. 23. In one embodiment, a connector 198 on 
the docking station 196 may be configured to slidably connect 
to connectors 200 on the portable computer 100, as illustrated 
in FIG. 23. In one example, the connectors 200 may include 
power and audio connectors, such that the portable computer 
100 may receive power from the docking station and receive 
and/or provide audio signals from/to the docking station, 
respectively. For example, the docking station may be 
coupled to external speakers, and the portable computer may 
provide audio signals to the docking station to be played 
through the external speakers. In another example, the dock 
ing station 196 may also be coupled to an audio device (not 
shown), such as an MP3 player, which may provide audio 
signals and data to the portable computer 100, for example, to 
update an audio library on the portable computer. It is to be 
appreciated that many other variations of communication 
between the portable computer 100 and devices coupled to 
the docking station 196 are possible, as would be recognized 
by those skilled in the art, and such variations are intended to 
be within the scope of this disclosure. Furthermore, numerous 
variations on the connector(s) 198, 200 that couple the dock 
ing station 196 to the portable computer 100 are also possible, 
as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. For 
example, the portable computer 100 may include a multi-pin 
connector 202 located on the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 
24. Such and other variations are intended to be within the 
Scope of this disclosure and the above-mentioned examples 
are provided for illustration only and are not intended to be 
limiting. 

In addition, it is to be appreciated that although the above 
discussion refers primarily to the portable computer 100 
being in either the laptop mode or easel mode, other modes or 
configurations are also possible. For example, as discussed 
above, because the portable computer 100 can be configured 
from the closed position, through the laptop mode into the 
easel mode by rotating the display component 102, a number 
of configurations are possible in between “true’ laptop mode 
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and “true’ easel mode. In another example, the portable com 
puter 100 may be configured into a “frame” mode, as illus 
trated in FIG. 26, in which the portable computer is placed on 
a surface 212 with the keyboard 106 “face down” on the 
surface 212 and the display 110 facing upward. In the frame 
mode, the display component 102 may be at a similar orien 
tation, and angle 134, with respect to the base component 104 
as in the easel mode. However, rather than the base compo 
nent 104 and display component 102 being oriented vertically 
with respect to the surface 212, as in the easel mode (in which 
the portable computer forms an inverted “V” as discussed 
above), in the frame mode, the base component 104 may lie 
flat on the surface 212, as shown in FIG. 26. In one example, 
software and/or hardware protection may be provided for the 
keyboard to prevent keys from being pressed (or to prevent 
the portable computer from responding to pressed keys) when 
the portable computer is in the frame mode. 

Similarly, referring to FIG. 27, there is illustrated another 
configuration of the portable computer 100, referring to as the 
“flat mode. In the flat mode, the display component 102 may 
be rotated (or opened) to approximately 180 degrees with 
respect to the base component 104, such that the base com 
ponent and display component lay flat on a Surface, with the 
keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed, as shown in 
FIG. 27. Unlike the easel and frame modes, in which the 
keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible, in the 
flat mode, the keyboard is accessible and usable. In addition, 
as discussed above, the visual display on the display Screen 
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort 
able viewing of information by persons located in different 
positions relative to the base component 104 or display com 
ponent 102. The visual display on the display screen 110 may 
also be manually adjusted by a user using, for example, the 
keyboard 106, touch pad 108 or mouse (not shown), scroll 
wheel 132 or navigation buttons (not shown). For example, if 
a user (located at position A) wishes to display information 
for a person located opposite the user (at position B), the 
visual display may be rotated (automatically or manually) 
180 degrees such that the information appears "right-way 
up.' to the person at location B, even through the display 
screen 110 is upside-down for that person. Similarly, in 
another example, the visual display may be rotated (automati 
cally or manually) 90 degrees such that the information 
appears “right-way-up.” for a person at location C. In one 
example, a user can “toggle” the visual display among various 
orientations. For example, a user at location A may have the 
visual display facing themselves while using the keyboard 
106 or other controls to change or access information on the 
display, then toggle the display orientation 180 or 90 degrees 
to display the information for persons at locations B or C. 

In Summary, various aspects and embodiments provide a 
portable computer that is configurable between different 
operating modes, including a laptop mode and an easel mode, 
and that is capable of different display formats and function 
ality in the different modes. The ability to view and operate 
the portable computer in the different laptop and easel modes, 
and to incorporate features and functions such as an alarm 
clock, digital photograph frame, Voice-over-IP, etc., may pro 
vide enhanced flexibility and usefulness. In addition, the por 
table computer may include a graphical user interface that 
may work seamlessly with the computer hardware to provide 
an enjoyable, holistic user experience. 

Having thus described several aspects of at least one 
embodiment, it is to be appreciated various alterations, modi 
fications, and improvements will readily occur to those 
skilled in the art. For example functionality or features that 
have been described herein in connection with hardware may 
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instead be implemented in software, or vice versa. For 
example, the wireless signal indicator discussed above may 
instead (or in addition) be provided as a software application. 
Such alterations, modifications, and improvements are 
intended to be part of this disclosure and are intended to be 
within the scope of the invention. Accordingly, the foregoing 
description and drawings are by way of example only. 

What is claimed is: 
1. A portable computer configurable between a plurality of 

display modes including a closed mode, a laptop mode and an 
easel mode, the portable computer comprising: 

a single display component including a display screen; 
a base including a keyboard; 
a hinge assembly at least partially housed within the base 

and the display component configured to pivotably 
couple the display component to the base, wherein the 
hinge assembly defines a single longitudinal axis run 
ning along an interface between the display component 
and the base, and wherein the display component and the 
base are rotatable about the single longitudinal axis; 

wherein, in the closed mode, the display Screen is disposed 
Substantially against the base; 

wherein rotating either the single display component or the 
base by an operator about the single longitudinal axis up 
to approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode 
configures the portable computer into the laptop mode, 
wherein in the laptop mode the single display compo 
nent is oriented towards the operator and the keyboard is 
oriented to receive input from the operator; 

wherein rotating either the single display component or the 
base by the operator about the single longitudinal axis 
beyond approximately 180 degrees from the closed 
mode configures the portable computer into the easel 
mode; and 

wherein in the easel mode the single display component is 
oriented facing the operator with the keyboard oriented 
away from the operator. 

2. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the single 
display component is rotatable about the single longitudinal 
axis up to approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode. 

3. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising a 
display orientation module that displays content on the dis 
play Screen in one of a plurality of content orientations rela 
tive to the single longitudinal axis. 

4. The portable computer of claim3, further comprising a 
mode sensor which detects a current display mode of the 
portable computer, and 

wherein the display orientation module displays content on 
the display screen in the one of the plurality of content 
orientations dependent on the current display mode 
detected by the mode sensor. 

5. The portable computer of claim 3, wherein the display 
orientation module is configured to display the content in a 
first content orientation relative to the single longitudinal axis 
when the portable computer is configured into the laptop 
mode and in a second content orientation relative to the single 
longitudinal axis when the portable computer is configured 
into the easel mode. 

6. The portable computer of claim 5, wherein the second 
content orientation is 180 degrees relative to the first orienta 
tion. 

7. The portable computer of claim 3, wherein the plurality 
of display modes further comprises a flat mode in which the 
single display component is disposed at an angle of approxi 
mately 180 degrees, measured about the single longitudinal 
axis, relative to the base. 
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8. The portable computer of claim 7, wherein the plurality 

of content orientations comprises a first content orientation 
relative to the single longitudinal axis, a second content ori 
entation relative to the single longitudinal axis, and a third 
contentorientation relative to the single longitudinal axis; and 

wherein, in the flat mode, the content displayed on the 
display Screen is configurable among the first, second 
and third content orientations responsive to a user input. 

9. The portable computer of claim 8, wherein the second 
content orientation is 90 degrees relative to the first content 
orientation; and 

wherein the third content orientation is 180 degrees relative 
to the first content orientation. 

10. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising: 
a foot disposed along at least a portion of the base and 

configured to support the portable computer when in the 
easel mode. 

11. A portable computer comprising: 
a base; 
a display component rotatably coupled to the base; 
means for rotating the display component in a single direc 

tion relative to the base to configure the portable com 
puter between a laptop mode and an easel mode; 

a display orientation module configured to automatically 
orient content displayed on the display component 
responsive to at least a transition between the laptop 
mode and the easel mode, wherein the display orienta 
tion module is further configured to orient the content 
displayed between a first display orientation and a sec 
ond display orientation, the first and second display 
orientations being 180 degrees relative to each other; 
and 

means for detecting an orientation of the base relative to the 
display component, wherein the means for detecting is 
further configured to identify the transition between the 
laptop mode and the easel mode based on a stored 
threshold orientation. 

12. A portable computer configurable between a plurality 
of modes including a laptop mode and an easel mode, the 
portable computer comprising: 

a single display component; 
a base including an integrated keyboard; 
a hinge assembly configured to rotatably couple the single 

display component to the base, wherein the hinge assem 
bly is at least partially housed within the base and the 
single display component, and defines a longitudinal 
axis running along an interface between the single dis 
play component and the base; 

wherein the hinge assembly is configured to permit rota 
tion of the single display component and the base about 
the longitudinal axis to configure the portable computer 
between the laptop mode and the easel mode: 

wherein in the easel mode the single display component is 
oriented facing the operator with the keyboard oriented 
away from the operator, and 

at least one integrated navigation hardware control config 
ured to control features and manipulate content dis 
played on the portable computer, wherein at least one of 
the least one integrated navigation hardware control is 
accessible in each of the plurality of modes including 
when the keyboard is inaccessible or oriented away from 
the user. 

13. The portable computer of claim 12, wherein the single 
display component comprises a display Screen configured to 
display content and a display orientation module configured 
to control an orientation of the content displayed on the dis 
play Screen; 
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wherein the orientation of the content displayed on the 
display Screen is configurable among a plurality of ori 
entations relative to the longitudinal axis. 

14. The portable computer of claim 13, wherein the plural 
ity of orientations comprises a first orientation relative to the 
longitudinal axis and a second orientation relative to the lon 
gitudinal axis; and 

wherein when display orientation module is configured to 
automatically display the content in the first orientation 
when the portable computer is configured into the laptop 
mode and in the second orientation when the portable 
computer is configured into the easel mode. 

15. The portable computer of claim 14, wherein the second 
orientation is 180 degrees relative to the first orientation; and 

wherein the plurality of orientations further comprises a 
third orientation relative to the longitudinal axis, the 
third orientation, wherein the third orientation is 90 
degrees relative to the first orientation. 

16. The portable computer of claim 13, further comprising 
a mode sensor configured to provide information representa 
tive of a degree of rotation of the single display component 
relative to the base; and 

wherein the display orientation module is configured to 
automatically adjust the orientation of the content dis 
played on the display screen responsive to the informa 
tion from the mode sensor. 

17. A method of automatically orienting content in a plu 
rality of display modes displayed on a portable computer 
comprising a body, the body having a single display compo 
nent including a display Screen and a base including an inte 
grated keyboard, the method comprising: 

rotating the single display component of the portable com 
puter about a longitudinal axis running along an inter 
face between the single display component and the base 
of the portable computer; 

detecting a degree of rotation of the single display compo 
nent relative to the base; 

providing a signal representative of the degree of rotation 
of the single display component; 

comparing the degree of rotation with respect to a threshold 
degree of rotation; 

determining a display mode based, at least in part, on the 
act of comparing the degree of rotation with respect to 
the threshold degree of rotation; 

generating a visual display of the content for the display 
Screen; 

orienting the visual display shown on the display screen of 
the single display component towards an operator for 
operation of the portable computer in each of the plural 
ity of display modes, wherein the plurality of display 
modes includes a laptop mode with the integrated key 
board and display oriented towards the operation and an 
easel mode with the display oriented towards the opera 
tor and the keyboard oriented away from the operator; 
and 

automatically configuring a content orientation, relative to 
the longitudinal axis, of the visual display on the display 
Screen of the portable computer responsive to the signal 
and the determined display mode, wherein the act of 
automatically configuring includes acts of 
displaying the visual display in a first content orientation 

of the content for the degree of rotation that is less 
than the threshold degree of rotation and the portable 
computer is determined to be configured in the laptop 
mode, and 

displaying the visual display in a second content orien 
tation of the content for the degree of rotation that is 
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greater than the threshold degree of rotation and the 
portable computer is determined to be configured in 
the easel mode, the second content orientation being 
at 180 degrees relative to the first orientation. 

18. The method of claim 17, wherein automatically con 
figuring the orientation of the content includes: 

displaying the visual display of the content in the first 
content orientation relative to the longitudinal axis 
responsive to the signal indicating that the degree of 
rotation of the single display component is less than the 
threshold degree of rotation of approximately 180 
degrees relative to the base; and 

displaying the visual display of the content in the second 
content orientation relative to the longitudinal axis 
responsive to the signal indicating that the degree of 
rotation of the single display component is greater than 
the threshold degree of rotation of approximately 180 
degrees relative to the base. 

19. A portable computer comprising: 
a base unit comprising an integrated keyboard; 
a single display unit including a single display screen con 

figured to display content; 
an orientation sensor which detects a physical orientation 

of the single display unit relative to the base unit; and 
a display orientation module which orients the content 

displayed on the single display Screen responsive to the 
physical orientation detected by the orientation sensor 
between at least a first content display orientation and a 
second content display orientation, the second content 
display orientation being 180 degrees relative to the first 
content display orientation; 

wherein the display orientation module is further config 
ured to detect a change between a laptop mode, an easel 
mode, and a frame mode based on the detected physical 
orientation of the single display unit relative to the base 
unit, and wherein the display orientation module is fur 
ther configured to: 
trigger a display inversion from one of the first and 

second content display orientations to the other of the 
first and second content display orientations respon 
sive to the orientation sensor detecting the change 
between the laptop mode and the easel mode, 

trigger a display inversion from one of the first and 
second content display orientations to the other of the 
first and second content display orientations respon 
sive to the orientation sensor detecting the change 
between the easel mode and the frame mode. 

20. The portable computer of claim 14, wherein the second 
orientation is 180 degrees relative to the first orientation. 

21. The portable computer of claim 18, wherein the orien 
tation sensor includes an accelerometer. 

22. The portable computer of claim 21, the orientation 
sensor is configured to detect an angle of the base relative to 
the display unit. 

23. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising at 
least one integrated navigation hardware control, wherein at 
least one of the at least one integrated navigation hardware 
control is accessible in at least the laptop and easel modes, and 
wherein the integrated navigation hardware can be operated 
by a user to control features and manipulate content displayed 
on the portable computer, including any mode wherein the 
keyboard is inaccessible or oriented away from the user. 

24. The portable computer of claim 12, wherein the plural 
ity of modes includes a frame mode in which the single 
display component is oriented towards the operator, the base 
contacts a Substantially horizontal Surface, and the keyboard 
is directed towards the substantially horizontal surface. 
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25. The portable computer of claim 13, wherein the plural 
ity of modes includes a frame mode in which the single 
display component is oriented towards the operator, the base 
contacts a Substantially horizontal Surface, and the keyboard 
is directed towards the substantially horizontal surface, and 
wherein the plurality of orientations comprises a first orien 
tation relative to the longitudinal axis and a second orienta 
tion relative to the longitudinal axis; and 

wherein when display orientation module is configured to 
display the content in the first orientation when the por 
table computer is configured into the laptop mode and 
frame mode and in the second orientation when the 
portable computer is configured into the easel mode. 

26. The portable computer of claim 24, further comprising 
a protection module configured to prevent keyboard opera 
tion when the portable computer is configured in the frame 
mode. 

27. The method of claim 17, wherein the plurality of dis 
play modes includes a frame mode wherein in the frame mode 
the display component is oriented towards the operator, the 
base contacts a Substantially horizontal Surface, and the inte 
grated keyboard is directed towards the substantially horizon 
tal Surface and the act of automatically configuring includes 
an act of 

displaying the visual display in the first content orientation 
of the content for the degree of rotation that is greater 
than the threshold degree of rotation and the portable 
computer is determined to be configured in the frame 
mode. 

28. The method of claim 17, further comprising an act of 
deactivating keyboard operation when the portable computer 
is configured in the frame mode. 

29. A method of managing user interaction with content 
displayed on a portable computer having a plurality of display 
modes, the portable computer comprising a body, the body 
having: a single display component including a display 
screen, a base including a keyboard, and a hinge assembly, the 
method comprising: 

manipulating a physical configuration of the single display 
component relative to the base to transition the portable 
computer between a plurality of display modes, wherein 
the act of manipulating includes an act of rotating the 
single display component of the portable computer 

5 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

22 
about a longitudinal axis running along an interface 
between the single display component and the base of 
the body of the portable computer to transition the por 
table computer to transition the portable computer 
between the plurality of display modes, including a lap 
top mode and an easel mode; 

wherein the plurality of modes includes at least the laptop 
mode wherein the single display component and the 
keyboard are oriented towards an operator and the easel 
mode wherein the single display component is oriented 
towards an operator and the keyboard is oriented away 
from the operator; 

determining a display mode responsive to the physical 
configuration of the single display component relative to 
the base; 

configuring a content orientation, relative to the longitudi 
nal axis, of a visual display on the display Screen of the 
single display component responsive to the display 
mode, wherein configuring the content orientation 
includes: 
displaying the visual display in a first content orientation 

of the content for the laptop mode, and 
displaying the visual display in a second content orien 

tation for the easel mode, the second content orienta 
tion being at 180 degrees relative to the first orienta 
tion. 

30. The method of claim 29, wherein the plurality of dis 
play modes includes a frame mode and the act of manipulat 
ing the physical configuration of the single display compo 
nent to transition the portable computer between a plurality of 
display modes includes an act of orienting the single display 
component towards the operator, placing the base against a 
Substantially horizontal Surface, and orienting the keyboard 
towards the substantially horizontal surface to transition the 
portable computer into the frame mode. 

31. The method according to claim 30, wherein the act of 
configuring the content orientation includes an act of display 
ing the visual display in the first content orientation of the 
content for the frame mode. 

32. The method according to claim 30, further comprising 
an act of deactivating keyboard operation when the portable 
computer is configured in the frame mode. 

k k k k k 
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1. 

PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE 
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS 

RELATED APPLICATIONS 

This application claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Patent Application No. 61/041,365 filed Apr. 
1, 2008, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MUL 
TIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS, which is incorpo 
rated herein by reference in its entirety. 

BACKGROUND 

1. Field of Invention 
The present invention relates generally to portable comput 

ers and, more particularly, to a portable computer that is 
configurable into different functional and positional modes. 

2. Discussion of Related Art 
Portable computers, such as laptop computers or notebook 

computers, have become increasingly popular and ubiquitous 
in the home and workplace. Conventional portable computers 
most commonly have a “clam-shell’ configuration, with a 
base including the keyboard, various ports, connectors and/or 
inputs (e.g., for power and connecting peripheral devices), 
and the majority of the electrical components (e.g., the central 
processing unit and memory), and a display component piv 
otably coupled to the base by a hinge. The display component 
is movable about the hinge between a closed position, with 
the display screen positioned adjacent the keyboard, and an 
open position, with the display Screen inclined at a desired 
Viewing angle. 
Some portable computers are able to accept user inputs via 

a touch screen in addition to via conventional tools, such as a 
keyboard or mouse. The use of a touch screen to input data is 
sometimes referred to as operating in “tablet mode” because 
the computer is being used in a manner similar to a tablet of 
paper. U.S. Pat. No. 6,771,494 discloses a hybrid tablet-type 
portable computer that is capable of operating either as a 
normal laptop computer receiving user input via a keyboard 
("laptop mode'), or as a tablet computer receiving user input 
via a touch screen. The 494 patent further discloses that the 
display component of the computer is attached to the base of 
the computer by hinges that allow the display to be tilted 
relative to the base (for laptop mode), and to be rotated and 
folded against the base to configure the computer into tablet 
mode. 

Another variation of a portable computer with a moveable 
display is disclosed in U.S. Pat. No. 6,266,236. The 236 
patent discloses a computer including a base, a display mem 
ber and an arm assembly coupling the display member to the 
base. According to the 236 patent, the arm assembly allows 
pivotable movement of the display member between a plu 
rality of positions, including a notebook mode configuration, 
a tablet mode configuration, a presentation mode configura 
tion, and a closed mode. 

SUMMARY OF INVENTION 

Aspects and embodiments of the present invention are 
directed to a portable computer that is configurable between a 
laptop mode (in which the portable computer has a conven 
tional laptop appearance) and an easel mode in which the base 
of the computer and its display component stand upright 
forming an inverted “V” as discussed further below. The 
display component is pivotably coupled to the base of the 
portable computer by a hinge that allows the display compo 
nent to be rotated or tilted about a longitudinal axis running 
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2 
along an interface between the base and the display compo 
nent. Unlike the computers discussed in U.S. Pat. Nos. 6,266, 
236 and 6,771,494 above, the portable computer according to 
embodiments of the invention does not require an arm assem 
bly, nor multiple, different hinge assemblies to be configured 
into the different modes. Furthermore, the portable computer 
according to embodiments of the invention is capable of 
different display modes and different functionality in the 
different configurations, as discussed below. 

Further aspects and embodiments are directed to a portable 
computer having an embedded scroll wheel that can be con 
figured to allow a user to control various features and func 
tionality of the portable computer. For example, as discussed 
further below the scroll wheel can be used to navigate among 
information displayed on the portable computer's display 
and/or to alter operating modes of the portable computer, 
and/or to control features such as Volume, display brightness, 
etc. 

According to one embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between various modes, including a closed 
mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode, a flat mode and a frame 
mode. The portable computer may comprise a display com 
ponent including a display screen, a base, and a hinge assem 
bly at least partially housed within the base and configured to 
pivotably couple the display component to the base. The 
display component may be rotatable about alongitudinal axis 
running along an interface between the display component 
and the base. In the closed mode, the display screen may be 
disposed Substantially against the base, and rotating the dis 
play component about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
mately 180 degrees from the closed mode may configure the 
portable computer into the laptop mode. Rotating the display 
component about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 
180 degrees axis from the closed mode may configure the 
portable computer into the easel mode. 

In one example of the portable computer, the display com 
ponent is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
mately 320 degrees from the closed mode. In another 
example, the portable computer comprises a display orienta 
tion module that displays content on the display Screen in one 
of a plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal axis. 
The orientation of the displayed content may be dependent on 
the current display mode of the portable computer, or may be 
configurable responsive to a user input. The portable com 
puter may further comprise a mode sensor which detects a 
current display mode of the portable computer, and the dis 
play orientation module may display content on the display 
screen in an orientation dependent on the current display 
mode detected by the mode sensor. Depending on the hinge 
assembly used, the longitudinal axis may comprises multiple 
parallel axes, and the hinge assembly may be configured to 
permit rotation of the display component about any of the 
multiple parallel axes to configure the portable computer 
between the plurality of display modes. 

Another embodiment is directed to a portable computer 
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupled to 
the base, and means for rotating the display component in a 
single direction relative to the base to configure the portable 
computer between a laptop mode and an easel mode. 

In another embodiment of a portable computer config 
urable between multiple modes including a laptop mode and 
an easel mode, the portable computer comprises a display 
component, a base, and a hinge assembly configured to rotat 
ably couple the display component to the base. The hinge 
assembly may be configured to permit rotation of the display 
component about a single axis to configure the portable com 
puter between the laptop mode and the easel mode. In one 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 69 of 521 PageID #: 175



US 8,624,844 B2 
3 

example, the single axis is a longitudinal axis running along 
an interface between the display component and the base. The 
portable computer may further comprise a scroll wheel dis 
posed at least partially about the longitudinal axis. In one 
example, the display component comprises a display screen, 
and the Scroll wheel is configured to permit a user to manipu 
late content displayed on the display screen. 

Another embodiment is directed to a method of automati 
cally orienting content displayed on a portable computer. The 
method comprises rotating a display component of the por 
table computer about a longitudinal axis running along an 
interface between the display component and a base of the 
portable computer, detecting a degree of rotation of the dis 
play component relative to the base, providing a signal rep 
resentative of the degree of rotation of the display component, 
and automatically configuring an orientation, relative to the 
longitudinal axis, of the content displayed on the portable 
computer responsive to the signal. 

According to another embodiment, a portable computer 
comprises a base unit, a display unit including a display 
screen configured to display content, an orientation sensor 
which detects an orientation of the display unit relative to the 
base unit, and a display orientation module which orients the 
content displayed on the display Screen responsive to the 
orientation detected by the orientation sensor. 

Another embodiment of a portable computer comprises a 
base, a display component rotatably coupled to the base Such 
that the display component and the base are rotatable with 
respect to one another about alongitudinal axis running along 
an interface between the display component and the base, the 
display component including a display screen, and a scroll 
wheel disposed at least partially within the base and rotatable 
about the longitudinal axis, the Scroll wheel configured to 
permit a user to control at least one of operating parameters of 
the portable computer and content displayed on the display 
screen. In one example, the scroll wheel is configured to 
permit the user to adjust a Volume of Sound produced by the 
portable computer. In another example, the screen is config 
ured to display at least one of a plurality of modes of content, 
and the scroll wheel is configured to permit the user to select 
a mode of content for display by the portable computer. The 
portable computer may further comprise one or more navi 
gation buttons that may be used in conjunction with the scroll 
wheel to control aspects of the portable computer and dis 
played content. 

According to another embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between a plurality of display modes including 
a laptop mode and an easel mode, the portable computer 
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupled to 
the base and including a screen which displays content, and a 
scroll wheel accessible in each of the plurality of display 
modes and configured to permit a user to manipulate at least 
one of operating parameters of the portable computer and the 
content displayed on the screen. In one example, the scroll 
wheel is disposed at leas partially about an axis of rotation of 
the display component relative to the base. 

In another embodiment, a portable computer comprises a 
base, a display component including a screen configured to 
display content, a hinge assembly configured to rotatably 
couple the display component to the base and to permit rota 
tion of the display component about a longitudinal axis run 
ning along an interface between the display component and 
the base, and a scroll wheel disposed at least partially about 
the longitudinal axis. 

Still other aspects, embodiments, and advantages of these 
exemplary aspects and embodiments, are discussed in detail 
below. Moreover, it is to be understood that both the foregoing 
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information and the following detailed description are merely 
illustrative examples of various aspects and embodiments, 
and are intended to provide an overview or framework for 
understanding the nature and character of the claimed aspects 
and embodiments. Any embodiment disclosed herein may be 
combined with any other embodiment in any manner consis 
tent with the objects, aims, and needs disclosed herein, and 
references to “an embodiment,” “some embodiments, 
alternate embodiment,” “various embodiments.” “one 
embodiment' or the like are not necessarily mutually exclu 
sive and are intended to indicate that a particular feature, 
structure, or characteristic described in connection with the 
embodiment may be included in at least one embodiment. 
The appearances of Such terms herein are not necessarily all 
referring to the same embodiment. The accompanying draw 
ings are included to provide illustration and a further under 
standing of the various aspects and embodiments, and are 
incorporated in and constitute a part of this specification. The 
drawings, together with the remainder of the specification, 
serve to explain principles and operations of the described 
and claimed aspects and embodiments. 

al 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
below with reference to the accompanying figures, which are 
not intended to be drawn to scale. Where technical features in 
the figures, detailed description or any claim are followed by 
references signs, the reference signs have been included for 
the sole purpose of increasing the intelligibility of the figures, 
detailed description, and claims. Accordingly, neither the ref 
erence signs nor their absence are intended to have any lim 
iting effect on the scope of any claim elements. In the figures, 
each identical or nearly identical component that is illustrated 
in various figures is represented by a like numeral. For pur 
poses of clarity, not every component may be labeled in every 
figure. The figures are provided for the purposes of illustra 
tion and explanation and are not intended as a definition of the 
limits of the invention. In the figures: 

FIG. 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
computer, according to aspects of the invention, in a "laptop' 
configuration; 

FIG. 2 is a view of the portable computer of FIG. 1 in the 
closed position; 

FIG. 3 is a plan view of the exterior of the bottom of the 
portable computer of FIG. 1; 

FIG. 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
FIG. 1 in the easel mode: 

FIG. 5 is a side view of the portable computer of FIG. 4, 
illustrating the adjustable angle of the easel mode; 

FIGS. 6A-C are diagrams illustrating different positions of 
the portable computer of FIG. 4 in easel mode: 

FIG. 7A is an illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the laptop mode, illustrating a hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 7B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the easel mode, illustrating the hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 8 is a diagram of one example of the hinge assembly 
of FIGS. 7A and 7B; 

FIG.9 is a cross-sectional diagram of a portion of the hinge 
assembly of FIG. 8, taken along line 9-9 in FIG. 8: 

FIG. 10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of FIG. 
8: 

FIG. 11 is a block diagram of one example of a portable 
computer user interface architecture, according to aspects of 
the invention; 
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FIG. 12 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
graphical user interface, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 13 is a screen shot illustrating another example of a 
graphical user interface according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 14 is an illustration of a user adjusting the scroll wheel 
on a portable computer in the easel mode, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 15 is an illustration of a user pressing the scroll wheel 
on a portable computer, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 16 is an illustration of a user pressing a navigation 
button on the portable computer, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable 
computer in the laptop mode, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 18 is a view of a portion of the portable computer 
illustrating a wireless signal indicator feature, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 19 is a view of a portion of the portable computer in 
the closed position, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 20 is a plan view of one example of a power adaptor, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 21 is a side view of the power adaptor of FIG. 20; 
FIG.22A is another side view of the power adaptor of FIG. 

20, illustrating the power cord would around a cord spool, 
according to aspects of the invention; 
FIG.22B is a plan view of the power adaptor of FIG.22A 
FIG. 23 is an illustration of the portable computer coupled 

to a docking station, according to aspects of the invention; 
FIG. 24 is an illustration of the portable computer showing 

one example of a docking connector, according to aspects of 
the invention: 

FIG. 24 is an illustration of a hinge assembly coupled to a 
computer frame, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 26 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “frame” mode, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; and 

FIG. 27 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “flat mode, according to aspects of the invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

Aspects and embodiments are directed to a portable com 
puter that is configurable between different operating modes, 
including a laptop mode (in which the portable computer has 
a conventional laptop appearance), a flat mode, a frame mode, 
and an easel mode in which the base of the computer and its 
display component stand vertically forming an inverted “V” 
as discussed further below. The portable computer is capable 
of different display formats and functionality in the different 
modes, and includes a graphical user interface that may work 
seamlessly with the computer hardware to provide a unified, 
comfortable, holistic user experience. In particular, the por 
table computer may provide access to a wide array of func 
tions, both those traditionally provided by computing devices 
and those traditionally provided by other passive information 
devices. For example, the hardware and Software, including 
the graphical user interface, of the portable computer may be 
focused toward providing access to entertainment media, 
Such as audio and video (e.g., playing music, streaming video, 
viewing photographs, etc.), email, and internet, while also 
providing State-of-the-art computer processing capability. 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods and 
apparatuses discussed herein are not limited in application to 
the details of construction and the arrangement of compo 
nents set forth in the following description or illustrated in the 
accompanying drawings. The methods and apparatuses are 
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6 
capable of implementation in other embodiments and of 
being practiced or of being carried out in various ways. 
Examples of specific implementations are provided hereinfor 
illustrative purposes only and are not intended to be limiting. 
In particular, acts, elements and features discussed in connec 
tion with any one or more embodiments are not intended to be 
excluded from a similar role in any other embodiments. Also, 
the phraseology and terminology used herein is for the pur 
pose of description and should not be regarded as limiting. 
Any references to embodiments or elements or acts of the 
systems and methods herein referred to in the singular may 
also embrace embodiments including a plurality of these 
elements, and any references in plural to any embodiment or 
element or act herein may also embrace embodiments includ 
ing only a single element. References in the singular or plural 
form are not intended to limit the presently disclosed systems 
or methods, their components, acts, or elements. The use 
herein of “including.” “comprising.” “having.” “containing.” 
“involving, and variations thereof is meant to encompass the 
items listed thereafter and equivalents thereofas well as addi 
tional items. References to “or may be construed as inclusive 
so that any terms described using 'or' may indicate any of a 
single, more than one, and all of the described terms. 

Referring to FIG. 1, there is illustrated one example of a 
portable computer according to aspects of the invention. In 
FIG.1, the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the “laptop' 
mode, with the display component 102 inclined at a viewing 
angle from the base 104. The display component 102 is piv 
otably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge assembly (not 
shown) that allows the display component to be rotated with 
respect to the base. The hinge assembly may include a single 
or multiple hinges, which may be any of a variety of hinge 
types, including, but not limited, to single-axis hinges, mul 
tiple-axis hinges, geared hinges, etc. In one example, the 
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be 
rotated (or tilted) about alongitudinal axis 101 running along 
an interface between the display component and the base 104, 
as illustrated in FIG. 1 and discussed further below. The base 
104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal electronic compo 
nents (not shown). Such as a central processing unit, memory, 
and other components necessary to operate the portable com 
puter, as known to those skilled in the art. In some embodi 
ments, the base 104 may also include a touch pad 108 or 
trackball (not shown) for receiving user commands, as known 
to those skilled in the art. 

Still referring to FIG. 1, the display component 102 
includes a display Screen 110, and may also include a camera 
112, microphone 114, and infrared receiver 116, as discussed 
further below. It is to be appreciated that the locations of the 
camera 112, microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG. 1, and may be 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 and/ 
or base 104, as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. 
The display component 102 may also include cushions 118 
that provide soft contact points between the base 104 and the 
display component 102 when the portable computer is closed. 
In one example, the cushions 118 are made of rubber. How 
ever, it is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited, 
and the cushions 118 may comprise materials other than 
rubber, including, for example, a polymer, felt, or other Suit 
able materials as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. 

Referring to FIG. 2, there is illustrated a side view of the 
portable computer 100 of FIG. 1 in the closed configuration. 
As is the case for conventional clam-shell type portable com 
puters, when the portable computer 100 is closed, the display 
screen is disposed “face down against the keyboard of the 
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base 104. In the illustrated embodiment, the base 104 
includes a rounded portion 120 that houses the hinge (not 
shown) that pivotably couples the display component 102 to 
the base, as discussed further below. It is to be appreciated that 
the rounded portion 120 is not limited to having a round 
shape, but may instead have another shape, which may be 
dependent on the type of hinge used. In one embodiment, a 
power button 122, configured to turn the portable computer 
ON and OFF, may also be provided on the rounded portion 
120, as illustrated in FIG. 2. However, it is to be appreciated 
that the invention is not so limited, and the power button 122 
may be located elsewhere on the base 104. In one example, 
the power button 122 may be slightly recessed relative to the 
surface of the base 104, so as decrease the potential for the 
power button to be accidentally pressed. 
An exterior view of the bottom of the base 104 (the under 

side of the portable computer 100) is illustrated in FIG. 3. As 
can be seen in FIG. 3, in one embodiment, the base 104 
includes a plurality of feet 124. In one example, the feet 124 
are made of rubber; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
invention is not so limited and the feet may be made of 
another material. Such as, for example, a polymer or felt. A 
ventilation slit 126 may be provided near an interface 
between the base 104 and the display component 102, as 
illustrated, or elsewhere as may be desired, to allow heat to 
dissipate from the internal electronic components in the base. 
The base 104 may also include one or more speakers 128. In 
one example, the base 104 includes two stereo speakers 128, 
positioned at either side of the base, as illustrated in FIG. 3; 
however, it is to be appreciated that the portable computer 100 
may comprise more or fewer speakers which may be placed at 
any location on the base 104. A scroll wheel 132 may be 
provided to allow a user to control certain functionality of the 
portable computer 100. Such as navigating web pages, con 
trolling speaker Volume, selecting programs, etc., as dis 
cussed further below. 

According to one embodiment, the base 104 may comprise 
a cushioning strip 130 disposed along an edge of the base 104 
opposite to the interface between the display component 102 
and the base, as illustrated in FIG. 3. The cushioning strip 
130, which may comprise rubber, a polymer, or another suit 
able material, may serve as a “foot' when the portable com 
puter is configured into the easel mode, as discussed further 
below. In one embodiment, the display component 102 may 
be provided with a similar cushioning strip that may serve as 
a second Supporting foot when the portable computer is con 
figured into the easel mode. 

Referring to FIG. 4, there is illustrated an example of the 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode. To 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode (or 
closed position) into the easel mode, the display component 
102 may be folded away from the base 104, in the same 
direction as to open the computer (i.e., to configure the com 
puter from the closed position into the laptop mode) Such that 
the base 104 and the display component 102 forman inverted 
“V” shape with the bottom of the base and the back of the 
display component face another, as illustrated in FIG. 4. In the 
easel mode, the display screen 110 is visible and accessible on 
one side of the portable computer 100 and the keyboard 106 
(not shown in FIG. 4) is visible and accessible on the other 
side. 
As illustrated in FIG. 4, in one embodiment, the portable 

computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con 
trols, including a Volume control button 204 and a mute 
button 206. In one example, the volume control button 204 
may be a rocker Switch that allows a user to easily increase or 
decrease the Volume of audio played through the speakers 
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128. When the user presses the volume control button 204, a 
Volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display 
screen 110, to provide a visual indication of the amount by 
which the volume is being increased or decreased. Similarly, 
pressing the mute button 206 may cause a visual indication 
that the volume is muted to appear on the display screen 110. 

According to one embodiment, when the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual display 
on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 degrees 
Such that the information appears “right-way-up, even 
through the display Screen is upside-down compared to when 
the portable computer is in the laptop mode. Thus, a user may 
simply “flip' the portable computer 100 into the easel mode 
and immediately be able to comfortably view information on 
the display Screen 110, without having to access display 
screen controls to adjust the orientation of the visual display. 
In one embodiment, the portable computer 100 includes an 
orientation (or mode) sensor that is configured to detect 
whether the portable computer is in the laptop mode or the 
easel mode, and to adjust the display accordingly. The orien 
tation sensor may be incorporated into the base component 
104, for example, underneath the keyboard 106, or into the 
display component. In one example, locating the orientation 
sensor in the display component 102, rather than the base 104, 
may provide more robust detection and therefore, may be 
presently preferred in some embodiments. The orientation 
sensor may be used to determine a precise relative orientation 
of the base component 104 with respect to the display com 
ponent 102, or vice versa, for example, to determine whether 
the device is in the laptop mode, easel mode, or Some point in 
between the two modes. In one example, the orientation sen 
sor includes an accelerometer whose output is fed to the 
computer operating system (or to dedicated logic circuitry) 
which then triggers a display inversion as appropriate. 

Accelerometers have been used in portable devices such as 
cellular phones, media players or computers, as Sudden 
motion sensors, or “drop detectors.” to protect against hard 
drive crashes in the event that the device is dropped. By 
contrast, however, the accelerometer in the portable computer 
according to an embodiment of the invention is not used to 
detect motion of the overall computer, but rather to detect a 
configuration of the portable computer 100 (e.g., laptop mode 
or easel mode), particularly, to detect an orientation of the 
display component 102 relative to the base component 104. In 
one example, information from the accelerometer is provided 
to a display controller in the portable computer and used to 
Switch the display between portrait or landscape mode, as is 
done in Some conventional devices. 

Referring to FIG. 5, when the portable computer 100 is in 
the easel mode, the base 104 is disposed at an angle 134 to the 
display component 102. This angle 134 is adjustable, for 
example, to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display 
screen 110 to be maintained for different positions of a user 
136 and of the portable computer 100, as illustrated in FIGS. 
6A, 6B and 6C. For example, when the user 136 is further 
from the portable computer, the angle 134a (FIG. 6A) may be 
made smaller than the angle 134b when the user is closer to 
the portable computer (FIG. 6B). As discussed above, in one 
example, the orientation sensor (not shown) may be used to 
detect, either approximately or precisely, the angle 134 and to 
provide the information to the computer operating system. 

According to one embodiment, the display component 102 
is pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge that allows the 
display component to be moved relative to the base so as to 
allow the portable computer 100 to be configured into the 
closed position, the laptop mode or the easel mode. As dis 
cussed above, in conventional “clamshell type portable com 
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puters, the hinges that couple the display component to the 
base generally do not permit more than about 180 degrees of 
rotation of the display component. Thus, these conventional 
portable computers can be in a closed position or open, laptop 
configuration, but cannot be configured into an easel mode 
because the conventional hinges do not permit Sufficient 
movement of the display component. Similarly, the tablet 
type portable computers discussed above have displays that 
can be opened, rotated and folded such that they lie flat 
against the keyboard on the base, but cannot be configured 
into an easel mode. Although, as discussed above, U.S. Pat. 
No. 6,266,236 discloses a computer that is configurable into 
a presentation mode, this requires a complex arm assembly. 
By contrast, the portable computer according to embodi 
ments of the present invention may be configured into the 
easel mode by simply continuing to tilt or rotate the display 
component past the "laptop positions' until a desired easel 
angle 134 is reached. 

Referring to FIGS. 7A and 7B, there is illustrated a portion 
of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge assembly 
138 that allows the portable computer to be configured into 
either the laptop mode (FIG. 7A) or the easel mode (FIG.7B), 
according to aspects of the invention. According to one 
embodiment, the hinge assembly 138 accommodates 0-320 
degrees of rotation, allowing a minimum angle 134 (see FIG. 
5) of 40 degrees. However, it is to be appreciated that the 
hinge assembly 138 may allow greater or fewer degrees of 
rotation, provided only that sufficient rotation is allowed so as 
to configure the portable computer 100 into either the laptop 
mode or the easel mode. As discussed above, in one embodi 
ment the portable computer 100 includes an orientation sen 
sor (not shown) that is configured to detect a relative orien 
tation of the display component 102 and the base component 
104. In one example, the orientation sensor may be an accel 
erometer incorporated into the base component 104, as dis 
cussed above. Alternatively, the orientation sensor may be 
incorporated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be used to 
detect movement of the hinge assembly, and to translate that 
movement into an information about the relative orientation 
of the display component 102 and the base component 104 
(for example, a size of the angle 134). It is also to be appre 
ciated that the orientation sensor may include electronic or 
mechanical components, or a combination thereof. For 
example, the hinge assembly may be provide with detents that 
provide an indication of the mode of the portable computer. 
As discussed above, and also illustrated in FIGS. 7A and 

7B, the portable computer may also comprise a scroll wheel 
132 that allows a user to adjust, control and/or select various 
aspects of the portable computer (e.g., wireless capability or 
speaker volume) or items displayed on the display screen 110. 
A housing 160 may contain or Support various mechanical 
and/or electronic components (not shown) that are coupled to 
the scroll wheel 132 and are configured to convert physical 
movement of the scroll wheel into electrical signals. These 
electrical signals may be provided to the central processing 
unit of the portable computer 100 which processes the elec 
trical signals so as to translate movement of the Scroll wheel 
into control of a selected feature, for example, adjusting the 
Volume of the speaker(s) or selecting a particular item dis 
played on the display Screen, as discussed further below. 
One embodiment of the hinge assembly 138 is illustrated in 

FIG.8. The hinge assembly includes a bracket 140 rotatably 
coupled to a housing 142. The housing 142 may include a first 
flange 144 that may be fastened to an internal frame in the 
base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 7A. The first flange 144 may 
include holes 146 to allow the first flange to be fastened to the 
base 104 using fasteners, such as, for example, screws, rivets 
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orbolts. The bracket 140 may include a second flange 148that 
may be similarly coupled to the display component 102 using 
fasteners 150. In one embodiment, the display screen 110 (see 
FIG. 1) may be an LCD screen. As known to those skilled in 
the art, an LCD Screen generally comprises a frame and 
plastic housing. In one example, the second flange 148 may 
be fastened to either or both of the display screen frame and 
the screen's plastic housing. Referring to FIG. 25, there is 
illustrated an example of two hinge assemblies 138 coupled to 
the display frame 208 of the display component, and to the 
base frame 210 of the base component 104. According to one 
embodiment, the bracket 140 and/or housing 142 may be 
formed of cast zinc. However, it is to be appreciated that other 
materials, including other metals, may be used, and the 
bracket 140 and/or housing 142 may be formed using a pro 
cedure other than casting. Such as, for example, machining or 
molding. 

Referring again to FIG. 8, in one embodiment, the hinge 
assembly 138 may also incorporate an area 152 for locating 
the power button (FIG. 2, 122) or a navigation control button 
(FIG. 4, 166), as discussed further below. 

Referring to FIG. 9, there is illustrated a cross-sectional 
view of a portion of the hinge assembly 138 taken along line 
A-A in FIG. 8. As shown in FIG. 9, in one embodiment the 
hinge assembly 138 comprises a shaft 154 located within the 
hinge housing 142. The shaft 154 may be held in position 
within the hinge housing 142, and rotatably coupled to the 
housing, by torsion elements, such as springs 156. In one 
example, the springs 156 may be formed by stamping; how 
ever, it is to be appreciated that other methods of manufacture 
may be used. In one example, the hinge assembly may accom 
modate about 320 degrees of rotation, as discussed above, and 
may provide about 6.5 in-lbs in Symmetric torque. 

FIG.10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of FIGS. 
8 and 9. As shown in FIG. 10, the shaft 154 is coupled to a 
member 158. This member 158 may be integral with or 
coupled to the bracket 140 which is, in turn, fastened to the 
display component, as discussed above. Thus, the shaft 154 
and springs 156 provide a rotatable coupling between the 
fixed elements of the hinge assembly, namely, the hinge hous 
ing 142 and bracket 140 which are fastened to the base 104 
and display component 102 of the portable computer. In this 
manner, the hinge assembly allows the display component 
102 to be moved relative to the base 104, thereby allowing the 
portable computer to be easily and quickly configured into 
any of the closed position, laptop mode or easel mode. For 
example, simply rotating or tilting the display component 
about the longitudinal axis 101 (see FIG. 1) up to approxi 
mately 180 degrees from the closed mode configures the 
portable computer into the laptop mode, and rotating the 
display component about the longitudinal axis 101 beyond 
approximately 180 degrees axis from the closed mode con 
figures the portable computer into the easel mode. 

According to one embodiment, the portable computer may 
include integrated “navigation' hardware that allows a user to 
easily and comfortable control various features and functions 
of the portable computer, and to manipulate content displayed 
on the portable computer. For example, as discussed above, 
the portable computer 100 may comprise a scroll wheel 132 
that allows a user to control, adjust and/or select various 
functionality of the portable computer. According to another 
embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be used to provide 
“hardware navigation' through information, such as menus, 
icons, etc., displayed on the display Screen 110, as discussed 
further below with reference to FIG. 17. A common display 
configuration used in conventional computers is a "desktop' 
view in which multiple icons representing links to various 
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programs or applications are displayed over a background 
image. Navigation is conventionally performed using a 
mouse, touchpad or trackball, as known to those skilled in the 
art. In one embodiment, the portable computer 100 may dis 
play information on the display screen 110 in the conven 
tional desktop configuration, and navigation may be per 
formed using either conventional tools, such as a touchpad 
108, trackball (not shown) or peripheral, for example, a 
mouse, that is connected to the portable computer 100 via a 
port 164, or the scroll wheel 132, or a combination thereof. 
According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 includes a streamlined graphical user interface that sup 
ports 'map' navigation. The map user interface provides a 
clear overview of the entire computing environment and 
searching capability within the environment that may be 
accessed using the Scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, one or 
navigation buttons 166, 168 that may be provided on the base 
104 of the portable computer 100 (button 166) and/or in the 
keyboard 106 (button 168), illustrated in FIG. 17. In one 
embodiment, the map mode of navigation is a hierarchical 
mode that reduces the number of items to select amongst at 
any stage of navigation, thereby facilitating user access with 
the scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation button(s) 
166, 168. Of course, it is to be appreciated that the map user 
interface may also be navigated using conventional tools, 
Such as a trackball, touchpad, mouse or arrow keys. 

Referring to FIG. 11, there is illustrated a block diagram of 
one example of an architecture of the portable computer 
including a map user interface. The user interface “home' 
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172. 
In the illustrated example, the home screen 170 contains five 
modes of content 172; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
home screen may include more or fewer than five modes of 
content and that the modes of content may differ from the 
examples discussed below. According to one example, the 
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170 may 
include “media” 172a, “connect” 172b, “web” 172c, “appli 
cations' 172d, and “channels’ 172e. Using the map user 
interface, information, programs, features and applications 
may be grouped into the various modes of content 172. By 
selecting any mode of content 172, for example, by using the 
scroll wheel 132 and/or navigation buttons 166, 168, as dis 
cussed further below, the user may access the content orga 
nized within that mode. For example, the media mode 172a 
may provide access to a medial player to play, view, search 
and organize media Such as music, video, photos, etc. The 
connect mode 172b may provide access to features such as, 
for example, email, Voice-over-IP instant messaging, etc., 
and the web mode 172c may provide access to internet brows 
ing and searching. The application mode 172d may provide 
access to, for example, computer applications or programs, 
Such as word processor, spreadsheet, calculator, etc. In one 
example, these applications or programs may be provided as 
web-based services rather than programs or applications 
residing on the portable computer 100. The channels mode 
172e may provide access to different functionality of the 
portable computer, with the different functions or features 
defined as different channels. For example, a channel may 
include an alarm clock channel in which the portable com 
puter is configured to display a clock and can be programmed 
to activate an alarm, e.g., a sound, piece of music, etc., at a 
predetermined time. Another example of a channel may 
include a “photo frame' channel in which the portable com 
puter may be configured to display a pre-selected image or set 
of images, etc. Another example of a channel is a “television” 
channel, in which the portable computer is configured to 
stream Internet television. In one example, a user may con 
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figure particular Internet television channels (e.g., a news 
channel, a movie channel, a home and garden channel, etc.) 
into Sub-channels within the channels mode of content 
172(e). Some or all of the modes of content 172 may access, 
retrieve and/or store information on the Internet 174. 

According to one embodiment, the different modes of con 
tent 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the display 
screen 110, as illustrated in FIG.12. The following discussion 
of various features, including hardware navigation through 
the map user interface may refer primarily to the display 
configuration illustrated in FIG. 12. However, it is to be 
appreciated that the invention is not so limited, and the modes 
of content may be displayed in other configurations, includ 
ing, for example, a "desktop' and icon configuration, a "dash 
board' type display, as illustrated in FIG. 13, or another 
configuration, as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. Similarly, navigation is discussed below primarily with 
reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navigation buttons 166, 
168; however, it is to be appreciation that navigation may also 
be accomplished using any of the conventional tools dis 
cussed above or known to those skilled in the art. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation buttons 166, 
168 may be used to navigate the user interface. Referring 
again to FIG. 12, Scrolling the Scroll wheel may sequentially 
highlight different ones of the modes of content 172. In one 
example, the highlighting may be achieved by changing the 
color of the selected mode, and/or by providing a visual 
indicator, such as a colored bar 176. A highlighted mode 172 
may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel, thereby bring 
ing up a new page' or screen on the user interface corre 
sponding to the selected mode. Once within a selected mode 
of content 172, the scroll wheel may similarly be used to 
select particular functions, features or applications within 
that mode. In one embodiment, the default action for the 
scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the portable 
computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel mode. For 
example, in easel mode, the default action for the scroll wheel 
may be channel selection within the channels mode 172(e). 
As discussed above, in one embodiment Volume control for 

the speakers 128 may be provided by the volume control 
button 204 and mute button 206. Alternatively, according to 
another embodiment, Volume control may be provided using 
the scroll wheel 132. Thus, as a user scrolls the scroll wheel 
132, as illustrated in FIG. 14 by arrow 161, a volume indicator 
may appear on the display screen 110. In one example, the 
Volume indicator may comprise a transparent, or partially 
transparent, box 162 containing Volume level indicators that 
may appear directly below the scroll wheel 132 on the display 
screen 110. In this example, as the user scrolls the scroll 
wheel 132, different volume levels in the volume box 162 
may be successively highlighted, to indicate to the user that 
the Volume is increasing or decreasing. 

In one embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be depress 
ible as well as scrollable. Thus, pressing the scroll wheel 132, 
as illustrated in FIG. 15, may allow further control, such as, 
for example, selecting a channel onto which the user has 
scrolled, or “play” and “pause of audio or video being played 
through the portable computer 100. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, one or 

more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with the 
scroll wheel. In particular, in one embodiment, the navigation 
button(s) may be used to change the action of the scroll wheel. 
As discussed above, in one example, the default action of the 
scroll wheel is Volume control. This action may be changed 
by pressing the navigation button 166, as illustrated in FIG. 
16, for example, from Volume control to menu navigation in 
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the user interface, and vice versa. According to one embodi 
ment, the effect of pressing the navigation button 166 may 
vary depending on active the mode of content of the portable 
computer 100. For example, if a user is in the media mode 
using a photo viewing application, pressing the navigation 
button 166 may change the action of the scroll wheel 132 
from mode navigation to slideshow controls for the photos. 
When the navigation button 166 is pressed, an control indi 
cator box (similar to the volume indicator box 162 discussed 
above with reference to FIG. 14) may appear containing 
different actions for the photo slideshow, such as “play.” 
“next.” “back.” “skip,” “full screen view.” etc., and scrolling 
the scroll wheel 132 may allow a user to select one of these 
actions. Pressing the navigation button 166 again may return 
the Scroll wheel action to menu navigation, to allow the user 
to, for example, move to a different feature or application 
within the active mode, or to select a different mode. 
As can be seen in FIG. 16, the navigation button 166 may 

be easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the 
easel mode, providing a convenient navigation tool for this 
configuration. A similar navigation button 168 may be pro 
vided on the keyboard 106, as illustrated in FIG. 17. In one 
example, the functionality of the two navigation buttons 166, 
168 may be the same, with the different locations providing 
easy, comfortable access in the different configuration modes 
(i.e., laptop or easel) of the portable computer 100. Thus, a 
user may use either navigation button 166 or navigation but 
ton 168, depending on personal preference. In another 
example, the two navigation buttons may have different func 
tionality. For example, the navigation button 166 may be used 
to alter the action of the scroll wheel 132, as discussed above, 
while the navigation button 168 is used to navigate 'up' or 
“down a level within the map user interface. For example, 
pressing the navigation button 168 while within a given mode 
of content may allow the user to “backup' to the home screen; 
or pressing the navigation button 168 while within a selected 
channel (in the channel mode of the content 172e) may allow 
the user to “back-up' to the channel mode main page. 

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the 
functionality of the navigation buttons 166, 168 is possible, as 
would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and the above 
examples are given for illustration only and are not intended 
to be limiting. In addition, any functions described with ref 
erence to one navigation button (166 or 168) may be instead 
(or additionally) implemented with the other navigation but 
ton. In one example, the function of the navigation buttons 
166, 168 may vary depending on whether the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the laptop mode or the easel 
mode. For example, only the navigation button 166 may be 
active in the easel mode, and only the navigation button 168 
may be active in the laptop mode. Alternatively, both naviga 
tion buttons 166, 168 may be usable in either the laptop mode 
or the easel mode, but their functionality may vary. For 
example, when the portable computer 100 is in the easel 
mode, the default action for the navigation button 166 may be 
channel selection whereas the default action for the naviga 
tion button 168 is to access the “home' screen. Furthermore, 
the portable computer 100 is not limited to the use of two 
navigation buttons and may instead comprise only a single 
navigation button or more than two navigation buttons, any of 
which may be disposed in the locations described above (e.g., 
on the rounded portion 120 of the base 104 or on the keyboard 
106), or in other locations on the portable computer. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

function or display content and/or display orientation of the 
portable computer may vary when the portable computer is 
configured from the laptop mode into the easel mode, or vice 
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Versa. For example, as discussed above, when the portable 
computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual 
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 
degrees such that the information appears “right-way-up.” 
even through the display screen is upside-down compared to 
when the portable computer is in the laptop mode. In another 
example, for at least some activities within at least some 
modes of content (e.g., viewing a photograph or video), when 
the portable computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, 
the display may automatically adjust to “full screen view’ 
(i.e., the displayed image or video is displayed on the full 
screen size, rather than in a window) to allow for comfortable 
viewing. 

In addition, as discussed above, the ability to configure the 
portable computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the easel 
mode provides enhanced functionality. For example, when 
the portable computer 100 is not being actively used, the user 
may configure the portable computer into the easel mode, and 
program the portable computer to act as a digital photo frame, 
displaying one or more photos of the user's choice. In the 
easel mode, the portable computer 100 may occupy a smaller 
footprint on a surface than in the laptop or closed modes 
because the base 104 and display component 102 are upright, 
as illustrated in FIGS. 4 and 5. In addition, because the por 
table computer can act as a passive information and/or enter 
tainment device, such as a photo frame or clock, as discussed 
above, the portable computer may provide a useful function 
even when not being actively used by the user, and may do so 
(in the easel mode) without taking up much surface area. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 may further comprise a wireless signal indicator 178, as 
illustrated in FIG. 18. The wireless signal indicator 178 may 
indicate the availability and/or strength of a wireless signal to 
which the portable computer 100 is connected, or is attempt 
ing to connect to. In one example, the color of the wireless 
signal indicator 178 may provide information regarding the 
strength of a detected wireless signal. For example, green 
may indicate a 'good” signal, yellow may indicate a “poor” or 
“low” signal; and red may indicate that there is no signal 
available. In one example, the wireless signal indicator 178 
may be ON or active whenever the portable computer 100 is 
powered up. Alternatively, the wireless signal indicator 178 
may be activated by a user action, for example, by pressing 
the navigation button 166 or another button or key provided 
on the portable computer 100, and may remain active for a 
predetermined time period (e.g., for 2 seconds, 10 seconds, 
one minute, etc.). As discussed above, the functionality of the 
navigation button 166 may vary depending on the configura 
tion mode of the portable computer 100. In one example, 
when the portable computer 100 is in the closed position, but 
still powered up, the default action for the navigation button 
166 may be to activate the wireless signal indicator 178. 
According to one embodiment, the portable computer 100 

may be provided with power cord and adapter to allow the 
portable computer to be plugged into a wall Supply. Referring 
to FIG. 19, there is illustrated a view of a portion of the 
portable computer 100, showing a power jack 180 to which 
the power adaptor can be connected. As discussed above, the 
portable computer 100 may also include a port 164 to which 
peripheral devices, such as mouse, external keyboard, por 
table flash drive, memory Stick, etc. may be connected. In one 
example, the port 164 is a USB port; however, it is to be 
appreciated that the port may accommodate protocols other 
than USB. In addition, although only one port 164 is illus 
trated in FIG. 19, the portable computer 100 may comprise 
multiple ports that may accommodate multiple protocols. In 
one example, the portable computer 100 may also comprise a 
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headphonejack 182. It is to be appreciated that the location of 
any or all of the power jack 180, port(s) 164, and headphone 
jack 182 are not limited to the example shown in FIG. 19, but 
may be anywhere convenient or desirable on the portable 
computer 100. 

Referring to FIG. 20, there is illustrated a top down view 
one example of a power adaptor 184that may be used with the 
portable computer 100 and connected via the powerjack 180. 
As known to those skilled in the art, the power adaptor 184 
comprises a transformer (not shown) that converts the wall 
power to a level acceptable for use by the portable computer 
100. In one embodiment, the power adaptor 184 comprises a 
substantially round body 186 that houses the transformer and 
other necessary components. A connector 188 may allow the 
power adaptor 184 to be connected to a wall outlet or exten 
sion cord. In one example, the connector 188 may include 
foldable prongs 190 that can be folded against the connector 
188 for storage, andfolded out for connection, as illustrated in 
FIG. 21. A cord 192 may be slidably accommodated within 
the body 186, such that the cord may be stored within the body 
and flexibly extended (up to its maximum length) by a user. 

According to one embodiment, the cord 192 may be wound 
around a cord spool 194 located within, or partially within, 
the body 186 of the power adaptor 184. As illustrated in FIG. 
21, the cord spool 194 may be configured to slide out from the 
body 186 of the power adaptor 184, such that the cord 192 can 
be wound around the cord spool 194, as illustrated in FIGS. 
22A and 22B. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 may be configured to connect to a docking station 196, as 
illustrated in FIG. 23. In one embodiment, a connector 198 on 
the docking station 196 may be configured to slidably connect 
to connectors 200 on the portable computer 100, as illustrated 
in FIG. 23. In one example, the connectors 200 may include 
power and audio connectors, such that the portable computer 
100 may receive power from the docking station and receive 
and/or provide audio signals from/to the docking station, 
respectively. For example, the docking station may be 
coupled to external speakers, and the portable computer may 
provide audio signals to the docking station to be played 
through the external speakers. In another example, the dock 
ing station 196 may also be coupled to an audio device (not 
shown), such as an MP3 player, which may provide audio 
signals and data to the portable computer 100, for example, to 
update an audio library on the portable computer. It is to be 
appreciated that many other variations of communication 
between the portable computer 100 and devices coupled to 
the docking station 196 are possible, as would be recognized 
by those skilled in the art, and such variations are intended to 
be within the scope of this disclosure. Furthermore, numerous 
variations on the connector(s) 198, 200 that couple the dock 
ing station 196 to the portable computer 100 are also possible, 
as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. For 
example, the portable computer 100 may include a multi-pin 
connector 202 located on the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 
24. Such and other variations are intended to be within the 
Scope of this disclosure and the above-mentioned examples 
are provided for illustration only and are not intended to be 
limiting. 

In addition, it is to be appreciated that although the above 
discussion refers primarily to the portable computer 100 
being in either the laptop mode or easel mode, other modes or 
configurations are also possible. For example, as discussed 
above, because the portable computer 100 can be configured 
from the closed position, through the laptop mode into the 
easel mode by rotating the display component 102, a number 
of configurations are possible in between “true’ laptop mode 
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and “true’ easel mode. In another example, the portable com 
puter 100 may be configured into a “frame” mode, as illus 
trated in FIG. 26, in which the portable computer is placed on 
a surface 212 with the keyboard 106 “face down” on the 
surface 212 and the display 110 facing upward. In the frame 
mode, the display component 102 may be at a similar orien 
tation, and angle 134, with respect to the base component 104 
as in the easel mode. However, rather than the base compo 
nent 104 and display component 102 being oriented vertically 
with respect to the surface 212, as in the easel mode (in which 
the portable computer forms an inverted “V” as discussed 
above), in the frame mode, the base component 104 may lie 
flat on the surface 212, as shown in FIG. 26. In one example, 
software and/or hardware protection may be provided for the 
keyboard to prevent keys from being pressed (or to prevent 
the portable computer from responding to pressed keys) when 
the portable computer is in the frame mode. 

Similarly, referring to FIG. 27, there is illustrated another 
configuration of the portable computer 100, referring to as the 
“flat mode. In the flat mode, the display component 102 may 
be rotated (or opened) to approximately 180 degrees with 
respect to the base component 104, such that the base com 
ponent and display component lay flat on a Surface, with the 
keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed, as shown in 
FIG. 27. Unlike the easel and frame modes, in which the 
keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible, in the 
flat mode, the keyboard is accessible and usable. In addition, 
as discussed above, the visual display on the display Screen 
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort 
able viewing of information by persons located in different 
positions relative to the base component 104 or display com 
ponent 102. The visual display on the display screen 110 may 
also be manually adjusted by a user using, for example, the 
keyboard 106, touch pad 108 or mouse (not shown), scroll 
wheel 132 or navigation buttons (not shown). For example, if 
a user (located at position A) wishes to display information 
for a person located opposite the user (at position B), the 
visual display may be rotated (automatically or manually) 
180 degrees such that the information appears "right-way 
up.' to the person at location B, even through the display 
screen 110 is upside-down for that person. Similarly, in 
another example, the visual display may be rotated (automati 
cally or manually) 90 degrees such that the information 
appears “right-way-up.” for a person at location C. In one 
example, a user can “toggle” the visual display among various 
orientations. For example, a user at location A may have the 
visual display facing themselves while using the keyboard 
106 or other controls to change or access information on the 
display, then toggle the display orientation 180 or 90 degrees 
to display the information for persons at locations B or C. 

In Summary, various aspects and embodiments provide a 
portable computer that is configurable between different 
operating modes, including a laptop mode and an easel mode, 
and that is capable of different display formats and function 
ality in the different modes. The ability to view and operate 
the portable computer in the different laptop and easel modes, 
and to incorporate features and functions such as an alarm 
clock, digital photograph frame, Voice-over-IP, etc., may pro 
vide enhanced flexibility and usefulness. In addition, the por 
table computer may include a graphical user interface that 
may work seamlessly with the computer hardware to provide 
an enjoyable, holistic user experience. 

Having thus described several aspects of at least one 
embodiment, it is to be appreciated various alterations, modi 
fications, and improvements will readily occur to those 
skilled in the art. For example functionality or features that 
have been described herein in connection with hardware may 
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instead be implemented in software, or vice versa. For 
example, the wireless signal indicator discussed above may 
instead (or in addition) be provided as a software application. 
Such alterations, modifications, and improvements are 
intended to be part of this disclosure and are intended to be 
within the scope of the invention. Accordingly, the foregoing 
description and drawings are by way of example only. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A portable computer configurable between a plurality of 

display modes including a laptop mode and an easel mode 
wherein transitions between the plurality of display modes 
allows an operator to interact with a single display screen in 
each of the plurality of display modes, the portable computer 
comprising: 

a base including a keyboard; 
a main display component rotatably coupled to the base 

Such that the main display component and the base are 
rotatable with respect to one another about a longitudi 
nal axis running along an interface between the main 
display component and the base to transition between at 
least the laptop mode and the easel mode, the main 
display component including the single display screen, 
wherein the transition between the laptop mode and the 
easel mode allows the operator to operate the portable 
computer while viewing the single display Screen in 
each of the plurality of display modes, wherein 

the laptop mode is configured to display to a user on the 
main display component a first content mode having a 
first content display orientation with the main display 
component oriented towards the user and the keyboard 
oriented to receive input from the user; 

the easel mode is configured to display to the user on the 
main display component a second content mode having 
a second content display orientation with the main dis 
play component oriented towards the user and the key 
board oriented away from the user, wherein the first and 
second content display orientations are 180 degrees rela 
tive to each other, and wherein the portable computer is 
operable in the easel mode to enable the user to interact 
with displayed content without interacting with the key 
board; and 

a navigation control disposed at least partially within the 
base and rotatable about the longitudinal axis, the navi 
gation control configured to permit a user to control at 
least one of operating parameters of the portable com 
puter and content displayed on the single display Screen 
wherein the plurality of modes includes a frame in which 
the main display component is oriented towards the 
operator, the base contacts a Substantially horizontal 
surface, and the keyboard faces the substantially hori 
Zontal Surface. 

2. The portable computer of claim 1, where the navigation 
control includes a scroll wheel configured to permit the user 
to adjust a Volume of Sound produced by the portable com 
puter. 

3. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising a 
first navigation button disposed on one of the base and the 
display component and configured to permit the user to 
manipulate selected content displayed on the screen. 

4. The portable computer of claim 3, wherein the screen is 
configured to display at least one of a plurality of modes of 
content; and 

wherein the navigation button is configured to permit the 
user to select for display one of the plurality of modes of 
COntent. 

5. The portable computer of claim3, further comprising a 
second navigation button; 
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wherein the first navigation button is disposed on a major 

surface of the base; and 
wherein the second navigation button is disposed on a 

minor surface of the base. 
6. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the naviga 

tion control includes a scroll wheel configured to permit the 
user to select a mode of content for display by the portable 
computer. 

7. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein rotating 
either the display component or the base about the longitudi 
nal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from a closed mode 
in which the display screen is disposed Substantially against 
the base configures the portable computer into the laptop 
mode; and 

wherein rotating either the display component or the base 
about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 
degrees from the closed mode configures the portable 
computer into the easel mode. 

8. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the frame 
mode is configured to display to a user on the main display 
component the first content mode having the first content 
display orientation. 

9. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the portable 
computeris configured to prevent the portable computer from 
responding to keyboard input when the portable computer is 
in the frame mode. 

10. A portable computer configurable between a plurality 
of display modes including a laptop mode and an easel mode 
wherein transitions between the plurality of display modes 
permit an operator to interact with a single display screen in 
each of the plurality of display modes, the portable computer 
comprising: 

a base including a keyboard; 
a main display component rotatably coupled to the base 

and including the single display screen which displays 
content; 

a hinge assembly disposed at least partially within the base 
and the main display component that defines an axis of 
rotation about which both the base and the main display 
component are rotatable to transition the portable com 
puter between at least the laptop mode and the easel 
mode, wherein the transition between the laptop mode 
and the easel mode allows the operator to operate the 
portable computer while viewing the single display 
Screen in each of the plurality of display modes, wherein 

the laptop mode is configured to display to a user on the 
main display component a first content mode having a 
first content display orientation with the main display 
component oriented towards the user and the keyboard 
oriented to receive input from the user; 

the easel mode is configured to display to the user on the 
main display component a second content mode having 
a second content display orientation with the main dis 
play component oriented towards the user and the key 
board oriented away from the user, wherein the first and 
second content display orientations are 180 degrees rela 
tive to each other, and wherein the portable computer is 
operable in the easel mode to enable the user to interact 
with displayed content without interacting with the key 
board; and 

a navigation control accessible in each of the plurality of 
display modes and configured to permit a user to 
manipulate at least one of operating parameters of the 
portable computer and the content displayed on the 
single display screen wherein the plurality of modes 
includes a frame mode in which the main display com 
ponent is oriented towards the operator, the base con 
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tacts a substantially horizontal surface, and the keyboard 
faces the substantially horizontal surface. 

11. The portable computer of claim 10, wherein the navi 
gation control includes a scroll wheel disposed at least par 
tially about the axis of rotation of the display component 
relative to the base. 

12. The portable computer of claim 11, wherein the scroll 
wheel provides a default action which effects manipulation of 
the at least one of the operating parameters of the portable 
computer, wherein the default action is defined differently 
responsive to a display mode of the portable computer. 

13. The portable computer of claim 10, further comprising 
a first navigation button user-accessible in each of the laptop 
mode and the easel mode, and configured to permit the user to 
manipulate selected content displayed on the screen. 

14. The portable computer of claim 13, wherein the screen 
is configured to display at least one of a plurality of modes of 
content; and 

wherein the first navigation button is configured to permit 
the user to select for display one of the plurality of modes 
of content. 

15. The portable computer of claim 13, further comprising 
a second navigation button that is not user-accessible when 
the portable computer is in the easel mode. 

16. The portable computer of claim 10, wherein an oper 
ating display mode is selected from the plurality of display 
modes based on a physical orientation of the portable com 
puter. 

17. The portable computer of claim 10, wherein an oper 
ating display mode is selected from the plurality of display 
modes in response to operation of the navigation control. 

18. A portable computer configurable between a plurality 
of display modes including a laptop mode and an easel mode 
wherein transitions between the plurality of display modes 
allow an operator to interact with a single display screen in 
each of the plurality of display modes, the portable computer 
comprising: 

a base including a keyboard; 
a main display component including the single display 

Screen configured to display content; 
a hinge assembly disposed at least partially within the base 

configured to rotatably couple the main display compo 
nent to the base, the hinge assembly defining a longitu 
dinal axis running along an interface between the dis 
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play component and the base about which the display 
component and the base are rotatable to transition the 
portable computer between at least the laptop mode and 
the easel mode, wherein the transition between the lap 
top mode and the easel mode allows the operator to 
operate the portable computer while viewing the single 
display screen in each of the plurality of display modes, 
wherein 

the laptop mode is configured to display to a user on the 
main display component a first content mode having a 
first content display orientation with the main display 
component oriented towards the user and the keyboard 
oriented to receive input from the user; 

the easel mode is configured to display to the user on the 
main display component a second content mode having 
a second content display orientation with the main dis 
play component oriented towards the user and the key 
board oriented away from the user, wherein the first and 
second content display orientations are 180 degrees rela 
tive to each other, and wherein the portable computer is 
operable in the easel mode to enable the user to interact 
with displayed content without interacting with the key 
board; and 

a navigation control disposed at least partially about the 
longitudinal axis wherein the plurality of modes 
includes a frame mode in which the main display com 
ponent is oriented towards the operator, the base con 
tacts a substantially horizontal surface, and the keyboard 
faces the substantially horizontal surface. 

19. The portable computer of claim 18, wherein the navi 
gation control includes a scroll wheel configured to permit a 
user to manipulate the content displayed on the screen. 

20. The portable computer of claim 18, wherein the navi 
gation control includes a scroll wheel configured to permit a 
user to control a volume of sound played by the portable 
computer. 

21. The portable computer of claim 18, wherein the navi 
gation control includes a scroll wheel disposed at least par 
tially within the hinge assembly. 

22. The portable computer of claim 18, further comprising 
at least one navigation button disposed on one of the base and 
the display component. 
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PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE 
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS 

RELATED APPLICATIONS 

This application is a continuation of and claims priority 
under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to U.S. application Ser. No. 12/170, 
939, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MUL 
TIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS, filed Jul. 10, 
2008, which application claims priority under 35 U.S.C. 
S119(e) to U.S. Provisional Patent Application No. 61/041, 
365 filed Apr. 1, 2008, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER 
WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS, 
which are incorporated herein by reference in its entirety. 
This application is also a continuation of and claims priority 
under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to U.S. application Ser. No. 12/170, 
951, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MUL 
TIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS, filed Jul. 10, 
2008, which application claims priority under 35 U.S.C. 
S119(e) to U.S. Provisional Patent Application No. 61/041, 
365 filed Apr. 1, 2008, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER 
WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS. 

BACKGROUND 

Field of Invention 
The present invention relates generally to portable com 

puters and, more particularly, to a portable computer that is 
configurable into different functional and positional modes. 

Discussion of Related Art 
Portable computers, such as laptop computers or note 

book computers, have become increasingly popular and 
ubiquitous in the home and workplace. Conventional por 
table computers most commonly have a “clam-shell” con 
figuration, with a base including the keyboard, various ports, 
connectors and/or inputs (e.g., for power and connecting 
peripheral devices), and the majority of the electrical com 
ponents (e.g., the central processing unit and memory), and 
a display component pivotably coupled to the base by a 
hinge. The display component is movable about the hinge 
between a closed position, with the display screen posi 
tioned adjacent the keyboard, and an open position, with the 
display Screen inclined at a desired viewing angle. 
Some portable computers are able to accept user inputs 

via a touch screen in addition to via conventional tools. Such 
as a keyboard or mouse. The use of a touch screen to input 
data is sometimes referred to as operating in “tablet mode' 
because the computer is being used in a manner similar to a 
tablet of paper. U.S. Pat. No. 6,771,494 discloses a hybrid 
tablet-type portable computer that is capable of operating 
either as a normal laptop computer receiving user input via 
a keyboard (“laptop mode'), or as a tablet computer receiv 
ing user input via a touch screen. The 494 patent further 
discloses that the display component of the computer is 
attached to the base of the computer by hinges that allow the 
display to be tilted relative to the base (for laptop mode), and 
to be rotated and folded against the base to configure the 
computer into tablet mode. 

Another variation of a portable computer with a moveable 
display is disclosed in U.S. Pat. No. 6,266,236. The 236 
patent discloses a computer including a base, a display 
member and an arm assembly coupling the display member 
to the base. According to the 236 patent, the arm assembly 
allows pivotable movement of the display member between 
a plurality of positions, including a notebook mode configu 
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2 
ration, a tablet mode configuration, a presentation mode 
configuration, and a closed mode. 

SUMMARY OF INVENTION 

Aspects and embodiments of the present invention are 
directed to a portable computer that is configurable between 
a laptop mode (in which the portable computer has a 
conventional laptop appearance) and an easel mode in which 
the base of the computer and its display component stand 
upright forming an inverted “V,” as discussed further below. 
The display component is pivotably coupled to the base of 
the portable computer by a hinge that allows the display 
component to be rotated or tilted about a longitudinal axis 
running along an interface between the base and the display 
component. Unlike the computers discussed in U.S. Pat. No. 
6,266,236 and U.S. Pat. No. 6,771,494 above, the portable 
computer according to embodiments of the invention does 
not require an arm assembly, nor multiple, different hinge 
assemblies to be configured into the different modes. Fur 
thermore, the portable computer according to embodiments 
of the invention is capable of different display modes and 
different functionality in the different configurations, as 
discussed below. 

Further aspects and embodiments are directed to a por 
table computer having an embedded scroll wheel that can be 
configured to allow a user to control various features and 
functionality of the portable computer. For example, as 
discussed further below the scroll wheel can be used to 
navigate among information displayed on the portable com 
puter's display and/or to alter operating modes of the 
portable computer, and/or to control features such as vol 
ume, display brightness, etc. 

According to one embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between various modes, including a closed 
mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode, a flat mode and a frame 
mode. The portable computer may comprise a display com 
ponent including a display screen, a base, and a hinge 
assembly at least partially housed within the base and 
configured to pivotably couple the display component to the 
base. The display component may be rotatable about a 
longitudinal axis running along an interface between the 
display component and the base. In the closed mode, the 
display Screen may be disposed substantially against the 
base, and rotating the display component about the longi 
tudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode may configure the portable computer into the 
laptop mode. Rotating the display component about the 
longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees axis 
from the closed mode may configure the portable computer 
into the easel mode. 

In one example of the portable computer, the display 
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to 
approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode. In another 
example, the portable computer comprises a display orien 
tation module that displays content on the display Screen in 
one of a plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal 
axis. The orientation of the displayed content may be 
dependent on the current display mode of the portable 
computer, or may be configurable responsive to a user input. 
The portable computer may further comprise a mode sensor 
which detects a current display mode of the portable com 
puter, and the display orientation module may display con 
tent on the display screen in an orientation dependent on the 
current display mode detected by the mode sensor. Depend 
ing on the hinge assembly used, the longitudinal axis may 
comprises multiple parallel axes, and the hinge assembly 
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may be configured to permit rotation of the display compo 
nent about any of the multiple parallel axes to configure the 
portable computer between the plurality of display modes. 

Another embodiment is directed to a portable computer 
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupled to 
the base, and means for rotating the display component in a 
single direction relative to the base to configure the portable 
computer between a laptop mode and an easel mode. 

In another embodiment of a portable computer configu 
rable between multiple modes including a laptop mode and 
an easel mode, the portable computer comprises a display 
component, a base, and a hinge assembly configured to 
rotatably couple the display component to the base. The 
hinge assembly may be configured to permit rotation of the 
display component about a single axis to configure the 
portable computer between the laptop mode and the easel 
mode. In one example, the single axis is a longitudinal axis 
running along an interface between the display component 
and the base. The portable computer may further comprise 
a scroll wheel disposed at least partially about the longitu 
dinal axis. In one example, the display component comprises 
a display Screen, and the Scroll wheel is configured to permit 
a user to manipulate content displayed on the display screen. 

Another embodiment is directed to a method of automati 
cally orienting content displayed on a portable computer. 
The method comprises rotating a display component of the 
portable computer about a longitudinal axis running along 
an interface between the display component and a base of 
the portable computer, detecting a degree of rotation of the 
display component relative to the base, providing a signal 
representative of the degree of rotation of the display 
component, and automatically configuring an orientation, 
relative to the longitudinal axis, of the content displayed on 
the portable computer responsive to the signal. 

According to another embodiment, a portable computer 
comprises a base unit, a display unit including a display 
screen configured to display content, an orientation sensor 
which detects an orientation of the display unit relative to the 
base unit, and a display orientation module which orients the 
content displayed on the display Screen responsive to the 
orientation detected by the orientation sensor. 

Another embodiment of a portable computer comprises a 
base, a display component rotatably coupled to the base Such 
that the display component and the base are rotatable with 
respect to one another about a longitudinal axis running 
along an interface between the display component and the 
base, the display component including a display Screen, and 
a scroll wheel disposed at least partially within the base and 
rotatable about the longitudinal axis, the scroll wheel con 
figured to permit a user to control at least one of operating 
parameters of the portable computer and content displayed 
on the display Screen. In one example, the scroll wheel is 
configured to permit the user to adjust a volume of Sound 
produced by the portable computer. In another example, the 
screen is configured to display at least one of a plurality of 
modes of content, and the scroll wheel is configured to 
permit the user to select a mode of content for display by the 
portable computer. The portable computer may further com 
prise one or more navigation buttons that may be used in 
conjunction with the scroll wheel to control aspects of the 
portable computer and displayed content. 

According to another embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between a plurality of display modes including 
a laptop mode and an easel mode, the portable computer 
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupled to 
the base and including a screen which displays content, and 
a scroll wheel accessible in each of the plurality of display 
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modes and configured to permit a user to manipulate at least 
one of operating parameters of the portable computer and 
the content displayed on the screen. In one example, the 
scroll wheel is disposed at leas partially about an axis of 
rotation of the display component relative to the base. 

In another embodiment, a portable computer comprises a 
base, a display component including a screen configured to 
display content, a hinge assembly configured to rotatably 
couple the display component to the base and to permit 
rotation of the display component about a longitudinal axis 
running along an interface between the display component 
and the base, and a scroll wheel disposed at least partially 
about the longitudinal axis. 

Still other aspects, embodiments, and advantages of these 
exemplary aspects and embodiments, are discussed in detail 
below. Moreover, it is to be understood that both the 
foregoing information and the following detailed description 
are merely illustrative examples of various aspects and 
embodiments, and are intended to provide an overview or 
framework for understanding the nature and character of the 
claimed aspects and embodiments. Any embodiment dis 
closed herein may be combined with any other embodiment 
in any manner consistent with the objects, aims, and needs 
disclosed herein, and references to “an embodiment,” “some 
embodiments.” “an alternate embodiment,” “various 
embodiments.” “one embodiment” or the like are not nec 
essarily mutually exclusive and are intended to indicate that 
a particular feature, structure, or characteristic described in 
connection with the embodiment may be included in at least 
one embodiment. The appearances of Such terms herein are 
not necessarily all referring to the same embodiment. The 
accompanying drawings are included to provide illustration 
and a further understanding of the various aspects and 
embodiments, and are incorporated in and constitute a part 
of this specification. The drawings, together with the 
remainder of the specification, serve to explain principles 
and operations of the described and claimed aspects and 
embodiments. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
below with reference to the accompanying figures, which are 
not intended to be drawn to scale. Where technical features 
in the figures, detailed description or any claim are followed 
by references signs, the reference signs have been included 
for the sole purpose of increasing the intelligibility of the 
figures, detailed description, and claims. Accordingly, nei 
ther the reference signs nor their absence are intended to 
have any limiting effect on the scope of any claim elements. 
In the figures, each identical or nearly identical component 
that is illustrated in various figures is represented by a like 
numeral. For purposes of clarity, not every component may 
be labeled in every figure. The figures are provided for the 
purposes of illustration and explanation and are not intended 
as a definition of the limits of the invention. In the figures: 

FIG. 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
computer, according to aspects of the invention, in a "lap 
top' configuration; 

FIG. 2 is a view of the portable computer of FIG. 1 in the 
closed position; 

FIG. 3 is a plan view of the exterior of the bottom of the 
portable computer of FIG. 1; 

FIG. 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
FIG. 1 in the easel mode; 

FIG. 5 is a side view of the portable computer of FIG. 4, 
illustrating the adjustable angle of the easel mode; 
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FIGS. 6A-C are diagrams illustrating different positions 
of the portable computer of FIG. 4 in easel mode: 

FIG. 7A is an illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the laptop mode, illustrating a hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 7B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the easel mode, illustrating the hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 8 is a diagram of one example of the hinge assembly 
of FIGS. 7A and 7B; 

FIG. 9 is a cross-sectional diagram of a portion of the 
hinge assembly of FIG. 8, taken along line 9-9 in FIG. 8: 

FIG. 10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of FIG. 
8: 

FIG. 11 is a block diagram of one example of a portable 
computer user interface architecture, according to aspects of 
the invention; 

FIG. 12 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
graphical user interface, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 

FIG. 13 is a screen shot illustrating another example of a 
graphical user interface according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 

FIG. 14 is an illustration of a user adjusting the scroll 
wheel on a portable computer in the easel mode, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 15 is an illustration of a user pressing the scroll 
wheel on a portable computer, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 16 is an illustration of a user pressing a navigation 
button on the portable computer, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable 
computer in the laptop mode, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 18 is a view of a portion of the portable computer 
illustrating a wireless signal indicator feature, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 19 is a view of a portion of the portable computer in 
the closed position, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 20 is a plan view of one example of a power adaptor, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 21 is a side view of the power adaptor of FIG. 20; 
FIG. 22A is another side view of the power adaptor of 

FIG. 20, illustrating the power cord would around a cord 
spool, according to aspects of the invention; 
FIG.22B is a plan view of the power adaptor of FIG.22A 
FIG. 23 is an illustration of the portable computer coupled 

to a docking station, according to aspects of the invention; 
FIG. 24 is an illustration of the portable computer show 

ing one example of a docking connector, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 24 is an illustration of a hinge assembly coupled to 
a computer frame, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 26 is an illustration of the portable computer con 
figured into a "frame” mode, according to aspects of the 
invention; and 

FIG. 27 is an illustration of the portable computer con 
figured into a “flat mode, according to aspects of the 
invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

Aspects and embodiments are directed to a portable 
computer that is configurable between different operating 
modes, including a laptop mode (in which the portable 
computer has a conventional laptop appearance), a flat 
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6 
mode, a frame mode, and an easel mode in which the base 
of the computer and its display component stand vertically 
forming an inverted “V,” as discussed further below. The 
portable computer is capable of different display formats and 
functionality in the different modes, and includes a graphical 
user interface that may work seamlessly with the computer 
hardware to provide a unified, comfortable, holistic user 
experience. In particular, the portable computer may provide 
access to a wide array of functions, both those traditionally 
provided by computing devices and those traditionally pro 
vided by other passive information devices. For example, 
the hardware and Software, including the graphical user 
interface, of the portable computer may be focused toward 
providing access to entertainment media, Such as audio and 
Video (e.g., playing music, streaming video, viewing pho 
tographs, etc.), email, and internet, while also providing 
state-of-the-art computer processing capability. 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods 
and apparatuses discussed herein are not limited in applica 
tion to the details of construction and the arrangement of 
components set forth in the following description or illus 
trated in the accompanying drawings. The methods and 
apparatuses are capable of implementation in other embodi 
ments and of being practiced or of being carried out in 
various ways. Examples of specific implementations are 
provided herein for illustrative purposes only and are not 
intended to be limiting. In particular, acts, elements and 
features discussed in connection with any one or more 
embodiments are not intended to be excluded from a similar 
role in any other embodiments. Also, the phraseology and 
terminology used herein is for the purpose of description and 
should not be regarded as limiting. Any references to 
embodiments or elements or acts of the systems and meth 
ods herein referred to in the singular may also embrace 
embodiments including a plurality of these elements, and 
any references in plural to any embodiment or element or act 
herein may also embrace embodiments including only a 
single element. References in the singular or plural form are 
not intended to limit the presently disclosed systems or 
methods, their components, acts, or elements. The use herein 
of “including.” “comprising.” “having.” “containing.” 
“involving,” and variations thereof is meant to encompass 
the items listed thereafter and equivalents thereofas well as 
additional items. References to “or” may be construed as 
inclusive so that any terms described using 'or' may indi 
cate any of a single, more than one, and all of the described 
terms. 

Referring to FIG. 1, there is illustrated one example of a 
portable computer according to aspects of the invention. In 
FIG. 1, the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the 
“laptop' mode, with the display component 102 inclined at 
a viewing angle from the base 104. The display component 
102 is pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge assembly 
(not shown) that allows the display component to be rotated 
with respect to the base. The hinge assembly may include a 
single or multiple hinges, which may be any of a variety of 
hinge types, including, but not limited, to single-axis hinges, 
multiple-axis hinges, geared hinges, etc. In one example, the 
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be 
rotated (or tilted) about a longitudinal axis 101 running 
along an interface between the display component and the 
base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 1 and discussed further 
below. The base 104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal 
electronic components (not shown). Such as a central pro 
cessing unit, memory, and other components necessary to 
operate the portable computer, as known to those skilled in 
the art. In some embodiments, the base 104 may also include 
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a touch pad 108 or trackball (not shown) for receiving user 
commands, as known to those skilled in the art. 

Still referring to FIG. 1, the display component 102 
includes a display screen 110, and may also include a camera 
112, microphone 114, and infrared receiver 116, as discussed 
further below. It is to be appreciated that the locations of the 
camera 112, microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG. 1, and may be 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 
and/or base 104, as would be recognized by those skilled in 
the art. The display component 102 may also include cush 
ions 118 that provide soft contact points between the base 
104 and the display component 102 when the portable 
computer is closed. In one example, the cushions 118 are 
made of rubber. However, it is to be appreciated that the 
invention is not so limited, and the cushions 118 may 
comprise materials other than rubber, including, for 
example, a polymer, felt, or other Suitable materials as would 
be recognized by those skilled in the art. 

Referring to FIG. 2, there is illustrated a side view of the 
portable computer 100 of FIG. 1 in the closed configuration. 
As is the case for conventional clam-shell type portable 
computers, when the portable computer 100 is closed, the 
display Screen is disposed “face down against the keyboard 
of the base 104. In the illustrated embodiment, the base 104 
includes a rounded portion 120 that houses the hinge (not 
shown) that pivotably couples the display component 102 to 
the base, as discussed further below. It is to be appreciated 
that the rounded portion 120 is not limited to having a round 
shape, but may instead have another shape, which may be 
dependent on the type of hinge used. In one embodiment, a 
power button 122, configured to turn the portable computer 
ON and OFF, may also be provided on the rounded portion 
120, as illustrated in FIG. 2. However, it is to be appreciated 
that the invention is not so limited, and the power button 122 
may be located elsewhere on the base 104. In one example, 
the power button 122 may be slightly recessed relative to the 
surface of the base 104, so as decrease the potential for the 
power button to be accidentally pressed. 
An exterior view of the bottom of the base 104 (the 

underside of the portable computer 100) is illustrated in FIG. 
3. As can be seen in FIG.3, in one embodiment, the base 104 
includes a plurality of feet 124. In one example, the feet 124 
are made of rubber; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
invention is not so limited and the feet may be made of 
another material. Such as, for example, a polymer or felt. A 
ventilation slit 126 may be provided near an interface 
between the base 104 and the display component 102, as 
illustrated, or elsewhere as may be desired, to allow heat to 
dissipate from the internal electronic components in the 
base. The base 104 may also include one or more speakers 
128. In one example, the base 104 includes two stereo 
speakers 128, positioned at either side of the base, as 
illustrated in FIG. 3; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
portable computer 100 may comprise more or fewer speak 
ers which may be placed at any location on the base 104. A 
scroll wheel 132 may be provided to allow a user to control 
certain functionality of the portable computer 100, such as 
navigating web pages, controlling speaker Volume, selecting 
programs, etc., as discussed further below. 

According to one embodiment, the base 104 may com 
prise a cushioning strip 130 disposed along an edge of the 
base 104 opposite to the interface between the display 
component 102 and the base, as illustrated in FIG. 3. The 
cushioning strip 130, which may comprise rubber, a poly 
mer, or another suitable material, may serve as a “foot' when 
the portable computer is configured into the easel mode, as 
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8 
discussed further below. In one embodiment, the display 
component 102 may be provided with a similar cushioning 
strip that may serve as a second Supporting foot when the 
portable computer is configured into the easel mode. 

Referring to FIG. 4, there is illustrated an example of the 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode. To 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode (or 
closed position) into the easel mode, the display component 
102 may be folded away from the base 104, in the same 
direction as to open the computer (i.e., to configure the 
computer from the closed position into the laptop mode) 
such that the base 104 and the display component 102 form 
an inverted “V” shape with the bottom of the base and the 
back of the display component face another, as illustrated in 
FIG. 4. In the easel mode, the display screen 110 is visible 
and accessible on one side of the portable computer 100 and 
the keyboard 106 (not shown in FIG. 4) is visible and 
accessible on the other side. 
As illustrated in FIG. 4, in one embodiment, the portable 

computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con 
trols, including a volume control button 204 and a mute 
button 206. In one example, the volume control button 204 
may be a rocker Switch that allows a user to easily increase 
or decrease the Volume of audio played through the speakers 
128. When the user presses the volume control button 204, 
a volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display 
screen 110, to provide a visual indication of the amount by 
which the volume is being increased or decreased. Similarly, 
pressing the mute button 206 may cause a visual indication 
that the volume is muted to appear on the display screen 110. 

According to one embodiment, when the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual 
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 
180 degrees Such that the information appears "right-way 
up.” even through the display Screen is upside-down com 
pared to when the portable computer is in the laptop mode. 
Thus, a user may simply “flip' the portable computer 100 
into the easel mode and immediately be able to comfortably 
view information on the display screen 110, without having 
to access display screen controls to adjust the orientation of 
the visual display. In one embodiment, the portable com 
puter 100 includes an orientation (or mode) sensor that is 
configured to detect whether the portable computer is in the 
laptop mode or the easel mode, and to adjust the display 
accordingly. The orientation sensor may be incorporated into 
the base component 104, for example, underneath the key 
board 106, or into the display component. In one example, 
locating the orientation sensor in the display component 
102, rather than the base 104, may provide more robust 
detection and therefore, may be presently preferred in some 
embodiments. The orientation sensor may be used to deter 
mine a precise relative orientation of the base component 
104 with respect to the display component 102, or vice 
versa, for example, to determine whether the device is in the 
laptop mode, easel mode, or some point in between the two 
modes. In one example, the orientation sensor includes an 
accelerometer whose output is fed to the computer operating 
system (or to dedicated logic circuitry) which then triggers 
a display inversion as appropriate. 

Accelerometers have been used in portable devices such 
as cellular phones, media players or computers, as Sudden 
motion sensors, or “drop detectors.' to protect against hard 
drive crashes in the event that the device is dropped. By 
contrast, however, the accelerometer in the portable com 
puter according to an embodiment of the invention is not 
used to detect motion of the overall computer, but rather to 
detect a configuration of the portable computer 100 (e.g., 
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laptop mode or easel mode), particularly, to detect an 
orientation of the display component 102 relative to the base 
component 104. In one example, information from the 
accelerometer is provided to a display controller in the 
portable computer and used to switch the display between 
portrait or landscape mode, as is done in some conventional 
devices. 

Referring to FIG. 5, when the portable computer 100 is in 
the easel mode, the base 104 is disposed at an angle 134 to 
the display component 102. This angle 134 is adjustable, for 
example, to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display 
screen 110 to be maintained for different positions of a user 
136 and of the portable computer 100, as illustrated in FIGS. 
6A, 6B and 6C. For example, when the user 136 is further 
from the portable computer, the angle 134a (FIG. 6A) may 
be made smaller than the angle 134b when the user is closer 
to the portable computer (FIG. 6B). As discussed above, in 
one example, the orientation sensor (not shown) may be 
used to detect, either approximately or precisely, the angle 
134 and to provide the information to the computer operat 
ing System. 

According to one embodiment, the display component 
102 is pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge that 
allows the display component to be moved relative to the 
base so as to allow the portable computer 100 to be config 
ured into the closed position, the laptop mode or the easel 
mode. As discussed above, in conventional “clamshell type 
portable computers, the hinges that couple the display com 
ponent to the base generally do not permit more than about 
180 degrees of rotation of the display component. Thus, 
these conventional portable computers can be in a closed 
position or open, laptop configuration, but cannot be con 
figured into an easel mode because the conventional hinges 
do not permit Sufficient movement of the display component. 
Similarly, the tablet-type portable computers discussed 
above have displays that can be opened, rotated and folded 
such that they lie flat against the keyboard on the base, but 
cannot be configured into an easel mode. Although, as 
discussed above, U.S. Pat. No. 6,266,236 discloses a com 
puter that is configurable into a presentation mode, this 
requires a complex arm assembly. By contrast, the portable 
computer according to embodiments of the present invention 
may be configured into the easel mode by simply continuing 
to tilt or rotate the display component past the "laptop 
positions” until a desired easel angle 134 is reached. 

Referring to FIGS. 7A and 7B, there is illustrated a 
portion of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge 
assembly 138 that allows the portable computer to be 
configured into either the laptop mode (FIG. 7A) or the easel 
mode (FIG. 7B), according to aspects of the invention. 
According to one embodiment, the hinge assembly 138 
accommodates 0-320 degrees of rotation, allowing a mini 
mum angle 134 (see FIG. 5) of 40 degrees. However, it is to 
be appreciated that the hinge assembly 138 may allow 
greater or fewer degrees of rotation, provided only that 
sufficient rotation is allowed so as to configure the portable 
computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the easel mode. 
As discussed above, in one embodiment the portable com 
puter 100 includes an orientation sensor (not shown) that is 
configured to detect a relative orientation of the display 
component 102 and the base component 104. In one 
example, the orientation sensor may be an accelerometer 
incorporated into the base component 104, as discussed 
above. Alternatively, the orientation sensor may be incor 
porated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be used to 
detect movement of the hinge assembly, and to translate that 
movement into an information about the relative orientation 
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10 
of the display component 102 and the base component 104 
(for example, a size of the angle 134). It is also to be 
appreciated that the orientation sensor may include elec 
tronic or mechanical components, or a combination thereof. 
For example, the hinge assembly may be provide with 
detents that provide an indication of the mode of the portable 
computer. 
As discussed above, and also illustrated in FIGS. 7A and 

7B, the portable computer may also comprise a scroll wheel 
132 that allows a user to adjust, control and/or select various 
aspects of the portable computer (e.g., wireless capability or 
speaker Volume) or items displayed on the display Screen 
110. A housing 160 may contain or Support various mechani 
cal and/or electronic components (not shown) that are 
coupled to the scroll wheel 132 and are configured to convert 
physical movement of the scroll wheel into electrical sig 
nals. These electrical signals may be provided to the central 
processing unit of the portable computer 100 which pro 
cesses the electrical signals so as to translate movement of 
the scroll wheel into control of a selected feature, for 
example, adjusting the Volume of the speaker(s) or selecting 
a particular item displayed on the display Screen, as dis 
cussed further below. 
One embodiment of the hinge assembly 138 is illustrated 

in FIG. 8. The hinge assembly includes a bracket 140 
rotatably coupled to a housing 142. The housing 142 may 
include a first flange 144 that may be fastened to an internal 
frame in the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 7A. The first 
flange 144 may include holes 146 to allow the first flange to 
be fastened to the base 104 using fasteners, such as, for 
example, screws, rivets or bolts. The bracket 140 may 
include a second flange 148 that may be similarly coupled to 
the display component 102 using fasteners 150. In one 
embodiment, the display screen 110 (see FIG. 1) may be an 
LCD screen. As known to those skilled in the art, an LCD 
screen generally comprises a frame and plastic housing. In 
one example, the second flange 148 may be fastened to 
either or both of the display screen frame and the screen's 
plastic housing. Referring to FIG. 25, there is illustrated an 
example of two hinge assemblies 138 coupled to the display 
frame 208 of the display component, and to the base frame 
210 of the base component 104. According to one embodi 
ment, the bracket 140 and/or housing 142 may be formed of 
cast zinc. However, it is to be appreciated that other mate 
rials, including other metals, may be used, and the bracket 
140 and/or housing 142 may be formed using a procedure 
other than casting, Such as, for example, machining or 
molding. 

Referring again to FIG. 8, in one embodiment, the hinge 
assembly 138 may also incorporate an area 152 for locating 
the power button (FIG. 2, 122) or a navigation control button 
(FIG. 4, 166), as discussed further below. 

Referring to FIG. 9, there is illustrated a cross-sectional 
view of a portion of the hinge assembly 138 taken along line 
A-A in FIG. 8. As shown in FIG. 9, in one embodiment the 
hinge assembly 138 comprises a shaft 154 located within the 
hinge housing 142. The shaft 154 may be held in position 
within the hinge housing 142, and rotatably coupled to the 
housing, by torsion elements, such as springs 156. In one 
example, the springs 156 may be formed by Stamping; 
however, it is to be appreciated that other methods of 
manufacture may be used. In one example, the hinge assem 
bly may accommodate about 320 degrees of rotation, as 
discussed above, and may provide about 6.5 in-lbs in 
symmetric torque. 

FIG. 10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of 
FIGS. 8 and 9. As shown in FIG. 10, the shaft 154 is coupled 
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to a member 158. This member 158 may be integral with or 
coupled to the bracket 140 which is, in turn, fastened to the 
display component, as discussed above. Thus, the shaft 154 
and springs 156 provide a rotatable coupling between the 
fixed elements of the hinge assembly, namely, the hinge 
housing 142 and bracket 140 which are fastened to the base 
104 and display component 102 of the portable computer. In 
this manner, the hinge assembly allows the display compo 
nent 102 to be moved relative to the base 104, thereby 
allowing the portable computer to be easily and quickly 
configured into any of the closed position, laptop mode or 
easel mode. For example, simply rotating or tilting the 
display component about the longitudinal axis 101 (see FIG. 
1) up to approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode 
configures the portable computer into the laptop mode, and 
rotating the display component about the longitudinal axis 
101 beyond approximately 180 degrees axis from the closed 
mode configures the portable computer into the easel mode. 

According to one embodiment, the portable computer 
may include integrated “navigation' hardware that allows a 
user to easily and comfortable control various features and 
functions of the portable computer, and to manipulate con 
tent displayed on the portable computer. For example, as 
discussed above, the portable computer 100 may comprise a 
scroll wheel 132 that allows a user to control, adjust and/or 
select various functionality of the portable computer. 
According to another embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may 
be used to provide “hardware navigation' through informa 
tion, such as menus, icons, etc., displayed on the display 
screen 110, as discussed further below with reference to 
FIG. 17. A common display configuration used in conven 
tional computers is a “desktop' view in which multiple icons 
representing links to various programs or applications are 
displayed over a background image. Navigation is conven 
tionally performed using a mouse, touchpad or trackball, as 
known to those skilled in the art. In one embodiment, the 
portable computer 100 may display information on the 
display Screen 110 in the conventional desktop configura 
tion, and navigation may be performed using either conven 
tional tools, such as a touchpad 108, trackball (not shown) 
or peripheral, for example, a mouse, that is connected to the 
portable computer 100 via a port 164, or the scroll wheel 
132, or a combination thereof. According to another embodi 
ment, the portable computer 100 includes a streamlined 
graphical user interface that Supports 'map' navigation. The 
map user interface provides a clear overview of the entire 
computing environment and searching capability within the 
environment that may be accessed using the scroll wheel 
132 and, optionally, one or navigation buttons 166, 168 that 
may be provided on the base 104 of the portable computer 
100 (button 166) and/or in the keyboard 106 (button 168), 
illustrated in FIG. 17. In one embodiment, the map mode of 
navigation is a hierarchical mode that reduces the number of 
items to select amongst at any stage of navigation, thereby 
facilitating user access with the scroll wheel 132 and, 
optionally, the navigation button(s) 166, 168. Of course, it is 
to be appreciated that the map user interface may also be 
navigated using conventional tools. Such as a trackball, 
touchpad, mouse or arrow keys. 

Referring to FIG. 11, there is illustrated a block diagram 
of one example of an architecture of the portable computer 
including a map user interface. The user interface “home' 
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172. 
In the illustrated example, the home screen 170 contains five 
modes of content 172; however, it is to be appreciated that 
the home screen may include more or fewer than five modes 
of content and that the modes of content may differ from the 
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examples discussed below. According to one example, the 
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170 
may include “media” 172a, “connect” 172b, “web” 172c, 
“applications' 172d, and “channels’ 172e. Using the map 
user interface, information, programs, features and applica 
tions may be grouped into the various modes of content 172. 
By selecting any mode of content 172, for example, by using 
the scroll wheel 132 and/or navigation buttons 166, 168, as 
discussed further below, the user may access the content 
organized within that mode. For example, the media mode 
172a may provide access to a medial player to play, view, 
search and organize media Such as music, video, photos, etc. 
The connect mode 172b may provide access to features such 
as, for example, email, Voice-over-IP instant messaging, 
etc., and the web mode 172c may provide access to internet 
browsing and searching. The application mode 172d may 
provide access to, for example, computer applications or 
programs, such as word processor, spreadsheet, calculator, 
etc. In one example, these applications or programs may be 
provided as web-based services rather than programs or 
applications residing on the portable computer 100. The 
channels mode 172e may provide access to different func 
tionality of the portable computer, with the different func 
tions or features defined as different channels. For example, 
a channel may include an alarm clock channel in which the 
portable computer is configured to display a clock and can 
be programmed to activate an alarm, e.g., a Sound, piece of 
music, etc., at a predetermined time. Another example of a 
channel may include a “photo frame channel in which the 
portable computer may be configured to display a pre 
selected image or set of images, etc. Another example of a 
channel is a “television” channel, in which the portable 
computer is configured to stream Internet television. In one 
example, a user may configure particular Internet television 
channels (e.g., a news channel, a movie channel, a home and 
garden channel, etc.) into Sub-channels within the channels 
mode of content 172(e). Some or all of the modes of content 
172 may access, retrieve and/or store information on the 
Internet 174. 

According to one embodiment, the different modes of 
content 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the 
display screen 110, as illustrated in FIG. 12. The following 
discussion of various features, including hardware naviga 
tion through the map user interface may refer primarily to 
the display configuration illustrated in FIG. 12. However, it 
is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited, and 
the modes of content may be displayed in other configura 
tions, including, for example, a "desktop' and icon configu 
ration, a “dashboard type display, as illustrated in FIG. 13, 
or another configuration, as would be recognized by those 
skilled in the art. Similarly, navigation is discussed below 
primarily with reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navi 
gation buttons 166, 168; however, it is to be appreciation 
that navigation may also be accomplished using any of the 
conventional tools discussed above or known to those 
skilled in the art. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation buttons 166, 
168 may be used to navigate the user interface. Referring 
again to FIG. 12, Scrolling the Scroll wheel may sequentially 
highlight different ones of the modes of content 172. In one 
example, the highlighting may be achieved by changing the 
color of the selected mode, and/or by providing a visual 
indicator, such as a colored bar 176. A highlighted mode 172 
may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel, thereby 
bringing up a new “page' or screen on the user interface 
corresponding to the selected mode. Once within a selected 
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mode of content 172, the scroll wheel may similarly be used 
to select particular functions, features or applications within 
that mode. In one embodiment, the default action for the 
scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the 
portable computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel 
mode. For example, in easel mode, the default action for the 
scroll wheel may be channel selection within the channels 
mode 172(e). 
As discussed above, in one embodiment Volume control 

for the speakers 128 may be provided by the volume control 
button 204 and mute button 206. Alternatively, according to 
another embodiment, Volume control may be provided using 
the scroll wheel 132. Thus, as a user scrolls the scroll wheel 
132, as illustrated in FIG. 14 by arrow 161, a volume 
indicator may appear on the display Screen 110. In one 
example, the Volume indicator may comprise a transparent, 
or partially transparent, box 162 containing volume level 
indicators that may appear directly below the scroll wheel 
132 on the display screen 110. In this example, as the user 
scrolls the scroll wheel 132, different volume levels in the 
volume box 162 may be successively highlighted, to indi 
cate to the user that the Volume is increasing or decreasing. 

In one embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be depress 
ible as well as scrollable. Thus, pressing the scroll wheel 
132, as illustrated in FIG. 15, may allow further control, 
Such as, for example, selecting a channel onto which the user 
has scrolled, or “play” and “pause of audio or video being 
played through the portable computer 100. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, one or 

more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with 
the scroll wheel. In particular, in one embodiment, the 
navigation button(s) may be used to change the action of the 
scroll wheel. As discussed above, in one example, the 
default action of the scroll wheel is volume control. This 
action may be changed by pressing the navigation button 
166, as illustrated in FIG. 16, for example, from volume 
control to menu navigation in the user interface, and vice 
versa. According to one embodiment, the effect of pressing 
the navigation button 166 may vary depending on active the 
mode of content of the portable computer 100. For example, 
if a user is in the media mode using a photo viewing 
application, pressing the navigation button 166 may change 
the action of the scroll wheel 132 from mode navigation to 
slideshow controls for the photos. When the navigation 
button 166 is pressed, an control indicator box (similar to the 
volume indicator box 162 discussed above with reference to 
FIG. 14) may appear containing different actions for the 
photo slideshow, such as “play,” “next,” “back,” “skip. 
“full screen view,” etc., and scrolling the scroll wheel 132 
may allow a user to select one of these actions. Pressing the 
navigation button 166 again may return the Scroll wheel 
action to menu navigation, to allow the user to, for example, 
move to a different feature or application within the active 
mode, or to select a different mode. 
As can be seen in FIG. 16, the navigation button 166 may 

be easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the 
easel mode, providing a convenient navigation tool for this 
configuration. A similar navigation button 168 may be 
provided on the keyboard 106, as illustrated in FIG. 17. In 
one example, the functionality of the two navigation buttons 
166, 168 may be the same, with the different locations 
providing easy, comfortable access in the different configu 
ration modes (i.e., laptop or easel) of the portable computer 
100. Thus, a user may use either navigation button 166 or 
navigation button 168, depending on personal preference. In 
another example, the two navigation buttons may have 
different functionality. For example, the navigation button 
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166 may be used to alter the action of the scroll wheel 132, 
as discussed above, while the navigation button 168 is used 
to navigate “up' or “down a level within the map user 
interface. For example, pressing the navigation button 168 
while within a given mode of content may allow the user to 
“back up' to the home screen; or pressing the navigation 
button 168 while within a selected channel (in the channel 
mode of the content 172e) may allow the user to “back-up” 
to the channel mode main page. 

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the 
functionality of the navigation buttons 166, 168 is possible, 
as would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and the 
above examples are given for illustration only and are not 
intended to be limiting. In addition, any functions described 
with reference to one navigation button (166 or 168) may be 
instead (or additionally) implemented with the other navi 
gation button. In one example, the function of the navigation 
buttons 166, 168 may vary depending on whether the 
portable computer 100 is configured into the laptop mode or 
the easel mode. For example, only the navigation button 166 
may be active in the easel mode, and only the navigation 
button 168 may be active in the laptop mode. Alternatively, 
both navigation buttons 166, 168 may be usable in either the 
laptop mode or the easel mode, but their functionality may 
vary. For example, when the portable computer 100 is in the 
easel mode, the default action for the navigation button 166 
may be channel selection whereas the default action for the 
navigation button 168 is to access the “home' screen. 
Furthermore, the portable computer 100 is not limited to the 
use of two navigation buttons and may instead comprise 
only a single navigation button or more than two navigation 
buttons, any of which may be disposed in the locations 
described above (e.g., on the rounded portion 120 of the base 
104 or on the keyboard 106), or in other locations on the 
portable computer. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

function or display content and/or display orientation of the 
portable computer may vary when the portable computer is 
configured from the laptop mode into the easel mode, or vice 
versa. For example, as discussed above, when the portable 
computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual 
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 
180 degrees Such that the information appears "right-way 
up.” even through the display Screen is upside-down com 
pared to when the portable computer is in the laptop mode. 
In another example, for at least Some activities within at 
least some modes of content (e.g., viewing a photograph or 
video), when the portable computer 100 is configured into 
the easel mode, the display may automatically adjust to “full 
screen view” (i.e., the displayed image or video is displayed 
on the full screen size, rather than in a window) to allow for 
comfortable viewing. 

In addition, as discussed above, the ability to configure 
the portable computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the 
easel mode provides enhanced functionality. For example, 
when the portable computer 100 is not being actively used, 
the user may configure the portable computer into the easel 
mode, and program the portable computer to act as a digital 
photo frame, displaying one or more photos of the user's 
choice. In the easel mode, the portable computer 100 may 
occupy a smaller footprint on a Surface than in the laptop or 
closed modes because the base 104 and display component 
102 are upright, as illustrated in FIGS. 4 and 5. In addition, 
because the portable computer can act as a passive infor 
mation and/or entertainment device. Such as a photo frame 
or clock, as discussed above, the portable computer may 
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provide a useful function even when not being actively used 
by the user, and may do so (in the easel mode) without taking 
up much surface area. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 may further comprise a wireless signal indicator 178, as 
illustrated in FIG. 18. The wireless signal indicator 178 may 
indicate the availability and/or strength of a wireless signal 
to which the portable computer 100 is connected, or is 
attempting to connect to. In one example, the color of the 
wireless signal indicator 178 may provide information 
regarding the strength of a detected wireless signal. For 
example, green may indicate a 'good” signal; yellow may 
indicate a “poor' or “low” signal; and red may indicate that 
there is no signal available. In one example, the wireless 
signal indicator 178 may be ON or active whenever the 
portable computer 100 is powered up. Alternatively, the 
wireless signal indicator 178 may be activated by a user 
action, for example, by pressing the navigation button 166 or 
another button or key provided on the portable computer 
100, and may remain active for a predetermined time period 
(e.g., for 2 seconds, 10 seconds, one minute, etc.). As 
discussed above, the functionality of the navigation button 
166 may vary depending on the configuration mode of the 
portable computer 100. In one example, when the portable 
computer 100 is in the closed position, but still powered up, 
the default action for the navigation button 166 may be to 
activate the wireless signal indicator 178. 

According to one embodiment, the portable computer 100 
may be provided with power cord and adapter to allow the 
portable computer to be plugged into a wall Supply. Refer 
ring to FIG. 19, there is illustrated a view of a portion of the 
portable computer 100, showing a power jack 180 to which 
the power adaptor can be connected. As discussed above, the 
portable computer 100 may also include a port 164 to which 
peripheral devices, such as mouse, external keyboard, por 
table flash drive, memory Stick, etc. may be connected. In 
one example, the port 164 is a USB port; however, it is to 
be appreciated that the port may accommodate protocols 
other than USB. In addition, although only one port 164 is 
illustrated in FIG. 19, the portable computer 100 may 
comprise multiple ports that may accommodate multiple 
protocols. In one example, the portable computer 100 may 
also comprise a headphone jack 182. It is to be appreciated 
that the location of any or all of the power jack 180, port(s) 
164, and headphone jack 182 are not limited to the example 
shown in FIG. 19, but may be anywhere convenient or 
desirable on the portable computer 100. 

Referring to FIG. 20, there is illustrated a top down view 
one example of a power adaptor 184 that may be used with 
the portable computer 100 and connected via the power jack 
180. As known to those skilled in the art, the power adaptor 
184 comprises a transformer (not shown) that converts the 
wall power to a level acceptable for use by the portable 
computer 100. In one embodiment, the power adaptor 184 
comprises a substantially round body 186 that houses the 
transformer and other necessary components. A connector 
188 may allow the power adaptor 184 to be connected to a 
wall outlet or extension cord. In one example, the connector 
188 may include foldable prongs 190 that can be folded 
against the connector 188 for storage, and folded out for 
connection, as illustrated in FIG. 21. A cord 192 may be 
slidably accommodated within the body 186, such that the 
cord may be stored within the body and flexibly extended 
(up to its maximum length) by a user. 

According to one embodiment, the cord 192 may be 
wound around a cord spool 194 located within, or partially 
within, the body 186 of the power adaptor 184. As illustrated 
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in FIG. 21, the cord spool 194 may be configured to slide out 
from the body 186 of the power adaptor 184, such that the 
cord 192 can be wound around the cord spool 194, as 
illustrated in FIGS. 22A and 22B. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 may be configured to connect to a docking station 196, 
as illustrated in FIG. 23. In one embodiment, a connector 
198 on the docking station 196 may be configured to slidably 
connect to connectors 200 on the portable computer 100, as 
illustrated in FIG. 23. In one example, the connectors 200 
may include power and audio connectors. Such that the 
portable computer 100 may receive power from the docking 
station and receive and/or provide audio signals from/to the 
docking station, respectively. For example, the docking 
station may be coupled to external speakers, and the portable 
computer may provide audio signals to the docking station 
to be played through the external speakers. In another 
example, the docking station 196 may also be coupled to an 
audio device (not shown), such as an MP3 player, which 
may provide audio signals and data to the portable computer 
100, for example, to update an audio library on the portable 
computer. It is to be appreciated that many other variations 
of communication between the portable computer 100 and 
devices coupled to the docking station 196 are possible, as 
would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and such 
variations are intended to be within the scope of this 
disclosure. Furthermore, numerous variations on the con 
nector(s) 198, 200 that couple the docking station 196 to the 
portable computer 100 are also possible, as would be rec 
ognized by those skilled in the art. For example, the portable 
computer 100 may include a multi-pin connector 202 
located on the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 24. Such and 
other variations are intended to be within the scope of this 
disclosure and the above-mentioned examples are provided 
for illustration only and are not intended to be limiting. 

In addition, it is to be appreciated that although the above 
discussion refers primarily to the portable computer 100 
being in either the laptop mode or easel mode, other modes 
or configurations are also possible. For example, as dis 
cussed above, because the portable computer 100 can be 
configured from the closed position, through the laptop 
mode into the easel mode by rotating the display component 
102, a number of configurations are possible in between 
“true' laptop mode and “true’ easel mode. In another 
example, the portable computer 100 may be configured into 
a "frame” mode, as illustrated in FIG. 26, in which the 
portable computer is placed on a surface 212 with the 
keyboard 106 “face down” on the surface 212 and the 
display 110 facing upward. In the frame mode, the display 
component 102 may be at a similar orientation, and angle 
134, with respect to the base component 104 as in the easel 
mode. However, rather than the base component 104 and 
display component 102 being oriented vertically with 
respect to the surface 212, as in the easel mode (in which the 
portable computer forms an inverted “V” as discussed 
above), in the frame mode, the base component 104 may lie 
flat on the surface 212, as shown in FIG. 26. In one example, 
software and/or hardware protection may be provided for the 
keyboard to prevent keys from being pressed (or to prevent 
the portable computer from responding to pressed keys) 
when the portable computer is in the frame mode. 

Similarly, referring to FIG. 27, there is illustrated another 
configuration of the portable computer 100, referring to as 
the “flat” mode. In the flat mode, the display component 102 
may be rotated (or opened) to approximately 180 degrees 
with respect to the base component 104, such that the base 
component and display component lay flat on a surface, with 
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the keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed, as shown 
in FIG. 27. Unlike the easel and frame modes, in which the 
keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible, in the 
flat mode, the keyboard is accessible and usable. In addition, 
as discussed above, the visual display on the display Screen 
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort 
able viewing of information by persons located in different 
positions relative to the base component 104 or display 
component 102. The visual display on the display screen 110 
may also be manually adjusted by a user using, for example, 
the keyboard 106, touch pad 108 or mouse (not shown), 
scroll wheel 132 or navigation buttons (not shown). For 
example, if a user (located at position A) wishes to display 
information for a person located opposite the user (at 
position B), the visual display may be rotated (automatically 
or manually) 180 degrees such that the information appears 
"right-way-up.” to the person at location B, even through the 
display screen 110 is upside-down for that person. Similarly, 
in another example, the visual display may be rotated 
(automatically or manually) 90 degrees such that the infor 
mation appears "right-way-up.” for a person at location C. In 
one example, a user can “toggle the visual display among 
various orientations. For example, a user at location A may 
have the visual display facing themselves while using the 
keyboard 106 or other controls to change or access infor 
mation on the display, then toggle the display orientation 
180 or 90 degrees to display the information for persons at 
locations B or C. 

In Summary, various aspects and embodiments provide a 
portable computer that is configurable between different 
operating modes, including a laptop mode and an easel 
mode, and that is capable of different display formats and 
functionality in the different modes. The ability to view and 
operate the portable computer in the different laptop and 
easel modes, and to incorporate features and functions such 
as an alarm clock, digital photograph frame, voice-over-IP. 
etc., may provide enhanced flexibility and usefulness. In 
addition, the portable computer may include a graphical user 
interface that may work seamlessly with the computer 
hardware to provide an enjoyable, holistic user experience. 

Having thus described several aspects of at least one 
embodiment, it is to be appreciated various alterations, 
modifications, and improvements will readily occur to those 
skilled in the art. For example functionality or features that 
have been described herein in connection with hardware 
may instead be implemented in software, or vice versa. For 
example, the wireless signal indicator discussed above may 
instead (or in addition) be provided as a Software applica 
tion. Such alterations, modifications, and improvements are 
intended to be part of this disclosure and are intended to be 
within the scope of the invention. Accordingly, the foregoing 
description and drawings are by way of example only. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A portable computer configurable between a plurality 

of display modes including at least a laptop mode, a frame 
mode, and an easel mode, the portable computer comprising: 

a display component; 
a base; 
an accelerometer configured to generate orientation infor 

mation indicative of a current display mode among the 
plurality of display modes of the portable computer; 

a display manager configured to display computer content 
on the display component and vary the computer con 
tent displayed responsive to the orientation information 
indicating a transition between at least the laptop and 
easel modes, wherein the display manager is further 
configured to enlarge the computer content displayed 
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on the display component responsive to a transition 
from the laptop mode to the easel mode; 

an interface between the display component and the base 
defining a longitudinal axis running along the display 
component and the base about which the display com 
ponent and the base are rotatable; 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged Such 
that rotating either the display component or the base 
about the longitudinal axis up to approximately 180 
degrees from a closed mode configures the portable 
computer into the laptop mode, wherein in the laptop 
mode the display component is oriented towards an 
operator and a keyboard disposed within the base is 
oriented to receive input from the operator; 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged Such 
that rotating either the display component or the base 
about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 270 
degrees from the closed mode transitions the portable 
computer for viewing in the frame mode or the easel 
mode, wherein during operation in the frame mode the 
display component is positioned toward the operator, 
the base contacts a Substantially horizontal Surface, and 
the keyboard is directed towards the substantially hori 
Zontal Surface, and wherein during operation in the 
easel mode the display component is oriented facing 
the operator with the keyboard oriented away from the 
operator, and 

wherein the portable computer is configured to detect a 
transition to at least the easel mode and the frame mode 
based on the orientation information, automatically 
determine a display orientation of content, and disable 
the keyboard when the portable computer is in the 
frame mode. 

2. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the display 
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to 
approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode. 

3. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising: 
a display orientation module that displays content on the 

display screen in one of a plurality of content orienta 
tions relative to the longitudinal axis; 

a mode sensor which incorporates the accelerometer and 
detects the current display mode of the portable com 
puter based on the orientation information; and 

wherein the display orientation module displays content 
on the display screen in the one of the plurality of 
content orientations dependent on the current display 
mode detected by the mode sensor. 

4. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the base and 
the display are only rotatable with respect to each other at 
the interface. 

5. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the interface 
further comprises a multiple axis hinge. 

6. The portable computer of claim 5, wherein the interface 
further comprises multiple hinges. 

7. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the interface 
defines a single longitudinal axis. 

8. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the interface 
includes a hinge assembly, wherein the hinge assembly is at 
least partially housed within one of the base and the display 
component. 

9. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the interface 
comprises means for rotating the display component along 
the longitudinal axis relative to the base to transition the 
portable computer for viewing in the frame mode. 

10. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the inter 
face comprises a plurality of axles. 
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11. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising 
at least one integrated navigation hardware control, wherein 
at least one of the at least one integrated navigation hardware 
control is accessible in at least the laptop and frame modes, 
and wherein the integrated navigation hardware can be 
operated by a user to control features and manipulate content 
displayed on the portable computer, including in any mode 
wherein the keyboard is inaccessible or oriented away from 
the user. 

12. A portable computer configurable between a plurality 
of operating display modes, the portable computer compris 
1ng: 

a display component including a single display Screen for 
viewing content; 

a base; 
an accelerometer configured to generate orientation infor 

mation indicative of a current display mode among the 
plurality of display modes of the portable computer; 

a display manager configured to display computer content 
on the display component and vary the computer con 
tent displayed responsive to the orientation information 
indicating a transition between at least two operating 
display modes of the plurality of operating display 
modes, wherein the display manager is further config 
ured to enlarge the computer content displayed on the 
display component responsive to a transition from a 
first operating display mode of the plurality of operat 
ing display modes to a second operating display mode 
of the plurality of operating display modes; 

an interface connecting the display component and the 
base, defining a longitudinal axis running along the 
display component and the base about which the dis 
play component and the base are rotatable; 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged so that 
the display component and the base are rotatable with 
respect to each other about the longitudinal axis; 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged so that 
rotating either the display component or the base about 
the longitudinal axis from a closed mode to a first 
position configures the portable computer into the first 
operating display mode of the plurality of operating 
display modes, wherein in the first operating display 
mode the display component is oriented towards an 
operator of the portable computer, and the base is 
disposed on an opposite side of the display, wherein at 
least a portion of the base is configured to Support the 
display in position when in the first operating display 
mode; 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged so that 
reorienting the portable computer while the display 
component and the base are in the first position con 
figures the portable computer into the second operating 
display mode of the plurality of operating display 
modes, wherein in the second operating display mode 
the display component is oriented towards an operator 
of the portable computer, the base lies flat on a sub 
stantially horizontal surface, and a keyboard of the base 
is disabled and disposed towards the substantially hori 
Zontal Surface, wherein at least a portion of the base is 
configured to Support the portable computer in position 
when in the second operating display mode, a display 
orientation of content is automatically changed when 
transitioning between the first and second operating 
display modes. 

13. The portable computer of claim 12, wherein the first 
operating display mode is configured so that at least a 
portion of display component and at least a portion of the 
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20 
base define an inverted V configuration and wherein the 
second operating display mode is configured so that at least 
a portion of the display component and at least a portion of 
the base define a sideways V configuration. 

14. The portable computer of claim 12, wherein the 
interface comprises means for rotating the display compo 
nent relative to the base. 

15. The portable computer of claim 13, wherein the 
interface is constructed and arranged to enable rotation of 
the base and the display component from a second position 
where the base and display component are disposed against 
each other to the first position where at least a portion of the 
base and the at least a portion of the display component are 
in a V configuration. 

16. A method of managing user interaction with content 
displayed on a portable computer having a plurality of 
display modes, the portable computer comprising a display 
component including a display screen, a base including a 
keyboard, and an interface connecting the display compo 
nent and the base defining a longitudinal axis, the method 
comprising: 

rotating at least one of the display component and the base 
of the portable computer about the longitudinal axis to 
configure the portable computer in at least one of the 
plurality of display modes, wherein the longitudinal 
axis is configured to run along the connection between 
the display component and the base of the portable 
computer; 

positioning at least a portion of the portable computer in 
a sideways V configuration for operation by a user, 
responsive to the act of rotating, wherein the act of 
positioning includes acts of: 
positioning the display component in an orientation 

directed towards the user; and 
positioning the base to lie flat on a Surface and Support 

the portable computer in the sideways V configura 
tion; 

generating, by an accelerometer, orientation information 
indicative of an orientation of the device; 

determining a current display mode of the plurality of 
display modes based on the orientation of the device, 
including distinguishing between a first display mode 
and a second display mode of the plurality of display 
modes where either the display component or the base 
is rotated about the longitudinal axis beyond approxi 
mately 270 degrees from a closed state; 

executing software protection configured to disable the 
keyboard when the portable computer is in the side 
ways V configuration; and 

displaying computer content and varying the computer 
content displayed responsive to the orientation infor 
mation indicating a transition between at least two 
display modes of the plurality of display modes, 
wherein the act of varying the computer content 
includes: 
enlarging the computer content displayed on the dis 

play component responsive to detecting a transition 
from the first display mode to the second display 
mode. 

17. The method of claim 16, wherein the base includes a 
keyboard and the act of positioning the base on the opposite 
side of the display component includes positioning the 
keyboard such that the keyboard towards the surface. 

18. A portable computer configurable between a plurality 
of display modes including at least a laptop mode, a frame 
mode, and an easel mode, the portable computer comprising: 
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a display component; 
a base; 
an accelerometer configured to generate orientation infor 

mation indicative of a current mode of operation; 
a display manager configured to display computer content 
on the display component and vary the computer con 
tent displayed responsive to the orientation information 
indicating a transition between at least the laptop and 
easel modes, wherein the display manager is further 
configured to enlarge the computer content displayed 
on the display component responsive to a transition 
from the laptop mode to the easel mode: 

an interface between the display component and the base 
defining a longitudinal axis running along the display 
component and the base about which the display com 
ponent and the base are rotatable: 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged such 
that rotating either the display component or the base 
about the longitudinal axis up to approximately 180 
degrees from a closed mode configures the portable 
computer into a laptop mode, wherein in the laptop 
mode the display component is oriented towards an 
operator and a keyboard disposed within the base is 
oriented to receive input from the operator; 

wherein the interface is constructed and arranged such 
that rotating either the display component or the base 
about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 270 
degrees from the closed mode transitions the portable 
computer for viewing in the frame mode or the easel 
mode, wherein during operation in the frame mode the 
display component is positioned toward the operator, 
the base contacts a substantially horizontal surface, and 
the keyboard is directed towards the substantially hori 
Zontal surface, and wherein during operation in the 
easel mode the display component is oriented facing 
the operator with the keyboard oriented away from the 
operator; and 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

22 
wherein the portable computer is configured to detect a 

transition to at least one of the easel mode and the 
frame mode based on the orientation information, auto 
matically determine a display orientation of content, 
and disable the keyboard in response to detecting the 
portable computer is in the frame mode. 

19. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the por 
table computer further disables the keyboard in response to 
an orientation of the portable computer. 

20. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the por 
table computer is further configured to connect to a docking 
station in the plurality of display modes, including the laptop 
mode and the frame mode. 

21. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising 
a cushioning strip configured to stabilize the portable com 
puter in a plurality of modes. 

22. The portable computer of claim 11, wherein the at 
least one integrated navigation hardware control includes a 
clickable scroll wheel configured to scroll along the longi 
tudinal axis to select an item displayed by the display screen. 

23. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the display 
component is further configured to display a segmented user 
interface comprising a plurality of modes of content. 

24. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the display 
component and base include an overlapping portion such 
that responsive to rotation of display component and base, 
the display component contacts the base preventing further 
rotation, and the base directly supports the display in the 
frame mode configuration. 

25. The portable computer of claim3, wherein the display 
module is configured to display content in a first orientation 
during the frame and laptop display modes of operation and 
display content in a second orientation during the easel 
display mode, the second orientation being rotated 180 
degrees relative to the first orientation. 

ck ck ck ck ck 
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PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE

DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS

RELATED APPLICATIONS

This application is a continuation of and claims priority
under 35 U.S.C. § 120 to U.S. application Ser. No. 15/394,
492, titled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS,” filed Dec. 29, 2016,

which is a continuation of and claims priority under 35
U.S.C. § 120 to U.S. application Ser. No. 13/651,636, titled
“PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY

CONFIGURATIONS,” filed Oct. 15, 2012, which is a

continuation of and claims priority under 35 U.S.C. § 120 to
U.S. application Ser. No. 12/170,939, titled “PORTABLE
COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA-

TIONS,” filed Jul. 10, 2008, which claims priority under 35
U.S.C. § 119(e) to U.S. Provisional Patent Application No.
61/041 ,365, titled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MUL-

TIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS,”filed Apr. 1, 2008,
each of which is incorporated herein by reference in its
entirety. U.S. application Ser. No. 13/651,636, titled “POR-
TABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CON-

FIGURATIONS,”filed Oct. 15, 2012, is also a continuation
of and claims priority under 35 U.S.C. § 120 to USS.
application Ser. No. 12/170,951, titled “PORTABLE COM-
PUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA-

TIONS,” filed Jul. 10, 2008, which claims priority under 35
U.S.C. § 119(e) to U.S. Provisional Patent Application No.
61/041 ,365, titled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MUL-
TIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS,”filed Apr. 1, 2008,
each of which is incorporated herein by reference in its
entirety.

BACKGROUND

Field of Invention

The present invention relates generally to portable com-
puters and, more particularly, to a portable computerthat 1s
configurable into different functional and positional modes.

Discussion of Related Art

Portable computers, such as laptop computers or note-
book computers, have become increasingly popular and
ubiquitous in the home and workplace. Conventional por-
table computers most commonly have a “clam-shell” con-
figuration, with a base including the keyboard, variousports,
connectors and/or inputs (e.g., for power and connecting
peripheral devices), and the majority of the electrical com-
ponents (e.g., the central processing unit and memory), and
a display component pivotably coupled to the base by a
hinge. The display component is movable about the hinge
between a closed position, with the display screen posi-
tioned adjacent the keyboard, and an open position, with the
display screen inclined at a desired viewing angle.

Some portable computers are able to accept user inputs
via a touch screen in addition to via conventional tools, such
as a keyboard or mouse. The use of a touch screen to input
data is sometimes referred to as operating in “tablet mode”
because the computeris being used 1n a manner similar to a
tablet of paper. U.S. Pat. No. 6,771,494 discloses a hybrid
tablet-type portable computer that is capable of operating
either as a normal laptop computer receiving user input via
a keyboard (“laptop mode’’), or as a tablet computerreceiv-
ing user input via a touch screen. The *494 patent further
discloses that the display component of the computer is
attached to the base of the computer by hinges that allow the
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display to betilted relative to the base (for laptop mode), and
to be rotated and folded against the base to configure the
computer into tablet mode.

Anothervariation of a portable computer with a moveable
display is disclosed in U.S. Pat. No. 6,266,236. The °236
patent discloses a computer including a base, a display
member and an arm assembly coupling the display member
to the base. According to the ’236 patent, the arm assembly
allows pivotable movementof the display member between
a plurality of positions, including a notebook mode configu-
ration, a tablet mode configuration, a presentation mode
configuration, and a closed mode.

SUMMARY OF INVENTION

Aspects and embodiments of the present invention are
directed to a portable computerthat is configurable between
a laptop mode (in which the portable computer has a
conventional laptop appearance) and an easel mode in which
the base of the computer and its display component stand
upright forming an inverted “V,” as discussed further below.
The display component is pivotably coupled to the base of
the portable computer by a hinge that allows the display
component to be rotated or tilted about a longitudinal axis
running along an interface between the base andthe display
component. Unlike the computers discussed in U.S. Pat.
Nos. 6,266,236 and 6,771,494 above, the portable computer
according to embodiments of the invention does not require
an arm assembly, nor multiple, different hinge assemblies to
be configured into the different modes. Furthermore, the
portable computer according to embodiments of the inven-
tion 1s capable of different display modes and different
functionality in the different configurations, as discussed
below.

Further aspects and embodiments are directed to a por-
table computer having an embeddedscroll wheel that can be
configured to allow a user to control various features and
functionality of the portable computer. For example, as
discussed further below the scroll wheel can be used to

navigate among information displayed on the portable com-
puter’s display and/or to alter operating modes of the
portable computer, and/or to control features such as vol-
ume, display brightness, etc.

According to one embodiment, a portable computer is
configurable between various modes, including a closed
mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode,a flat mode and a frame
mode. The portable computer may comprise a display com-
ponent including a display screen, a base, and a hinge
assembly at least partially housed within the base and
configured to pivotably couple the display componentto the
base. The display component may be rotatable about a
longitudinal axis running along an interface between the
display component and the base. In the closed mode, the
display screen may be disposed substantially against the
base, and rotating the display component about the longi-
tudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the
closed mode may configure the portable computer into the
laptop mode. Rotating the display component about the
longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees axis
from the closed mode may configure the portable computer
into the easel mode.

In one example of the portable computer, the display
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to
approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode. In another
example, the portable computer comprises a display orien-
tation module that displays content on the display screen in
one of a plurality of orientationsrelative to the longitudinal



Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 150 of 521 PageID #: 256

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA Documenti1-1 Filed 02/01/23 Page 150 of 521 PagelD #: 256

US 10,289,154 B2
3

axis. The orientation of the displayed content may be
dependent on the current display mode of the portable
computer, or may be configurable responsive to a user input.
The portable computer may further comprise a mode sensor
which detects a current display mode of the portable com-
puter, and the display orientation module may display con-
tent on the display screen in an orientation dependent on the
current display mode detected by the mode sensor. Depend-
ing on the hinge assembly used, the longitudinal axis may
comprises multiple parallel axes, and the hinge assembly
may be configured to permit rotation of the display compo-
nent about any of the multiple parallel axes to configure the
portable computer between the plurality of display modes.

Another embodiment is directed to a portable computer
comprising a base, a display componentrotatably coupled to
the base, and meansfor rotating the display component in a
single direction relative to the base to configure the portable
computer between a laptop mode and an easel mode.

In another embodiment of a portable computer configu-
rable between multiple modes including a laptop mode and
an easel mode, the portable computer comprises a display
component, a base, and a hinge assembly configured to
rotatably couple the display component to the base. The
hinge assembly may be configured to permit rotation of the
display component about a single axis to configure the
portable computer between the laptop mode and the easel
mode. In one example, the single axis is a longitudinal axis
running along an interface between the display component
and the base. The portable computer may further comprise
a scroll wheel disposed at least partially about the longitu-
dinal axis. In one example, the display component comprises
a display screen, and the scroll wheel is configured to permit
a user to manipulate content displayed on the display screen.

Another embodiment is directed to a method of automati-

cally orienting content displayed on a portable computer.
The method comprises rotating a display component of the
portable computer about a longitudinal axis running along
an interface between the display component and a base of
the portable computer, detecting a degree of rotation of the
display componentrelative to the base, providing a signal
representative of the degree of rotation of the display
component, and automatically configuring an orientation,
relative to the longitudinal axis, of the content displayed on
the portable computer responsive to the signal.

According to another embodiment, a portable computer
comprises a base unit, a display unit including a display
screen configured to display content, an orientation sensor
which detects an orientation of the display unit relative to the
base unit, and a display orientation module which orients the
content displayed on the display screen responsive to the
orientation detected by the orientation sensor.

Another embodiment of a portable computer comprises a
base, a display componentrotatably coupled to the base such
that the display component and the base are rotatable with
respect to one another about a longitudinal axis running
along an interface between the display component and the
base, the display componentincluding a display screen, and
a scroll wheel disposedat least partially within the base and
rotatable about the longitudinal axis, the scroll wheel con-
figured to permit a user to control at least one of operating
parameters of the portable computer and content displayed
on the display screen. In one example, the scroll wheel is
configured to permit the user to adjust a volume of sound
produced by the portable computer. In another example, the
screen 1s configured to display at least one of a plurality of
modes of content, and the scroll wheel is configured to
permit the user to select a mode of content for display by the
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portable computer. The portable computer may further com-
prise one or more navigation buttons that may be used in
conjunction with the scroll wheel to control aspects of the
portable computer and displayed content.

According to another embodiment, a portable computer is
configurable between a plurality of display modes including
a laptop mode and an easel mode, the portable computer
comprising a base, a display component rotatably coupledto
the base and including a screen which displays content, and
a scroll wheel accessible in each of the plurality of display
modes and configured to permit a user to manipulate at least
one of operating parameters of the portable computer and
the content displayed on the screen. In one example, the
scroll wheel is disposed at least partially about an axis of
rotation of the display component relative to the base.

In another embodiment, a portable computer comprises a
base, a display component including a screen configured to
display content, a hinge assembly configured to rotatably
couple the display component to the base and to permit
rotation of the display component about a longitudinal axis
running along an interface between the display component
and the base, and a scroll wheel disposed at least partially
about the longitudinal axis.

Still other aspects, embodiments, and advantages of these
exemplary aspects and embodiments, are discussed in detail
below. Moreover, it is to be understood that both the
foregoing information and the following detailed description
are merely illustrative examples of various aspects and
embodiments, and are intended to provide an overview or
framework for understanding the nature and characterof the
claimed aspects and embodiments. Any embodiment dis-
closed herein may be combined with any other embodiment
in any manner consistent with the objects, aims, and needs
disclosed herein, and references to “‘an embodiment,” “some
embodiments,” “an alternate embodiment,” “various
embodiments,” “one embodiment” or the like are not nec-
essarily mutually exclusive and are intendedto indicate that
a particular feature, structure, or characteristic described in
connection with the embodiment may be included inat least
one embodiment. The appearances of such terms herein are
not necessarily all referring to the same embodiment. The
accompanying drawings are included to provide illustration
and a further understanding of the various aspects and
embodiments, and are incorporated in and constitute a part
of this specification. The drawings, together with the
remainder of the specification, serve to explain principles
and operations of the described and claimed aspects and
embodiments.

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS

Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed
below with reference to the accompanying figures, which are
not intended to be drawn to scale. Where technical features

in the figures, detailed description or any claim are followed
by references signs, the reference signs have been included
for the sole purpose of increasing the intelligibility of the
figures, detailed description, and claims. Accordingly, nei-
ther the reference signs nor their absence are intended to
have any limiting effect on the scope of any claim elements.
In the figures, each identical or nearly identical component
that is illustrated in various figures is represented byalike
numeral. For purposesofclarity, not every component may
be labeled in every figure. The figures are provided for the
purposesofillustration and explanation and are not intended
as a definition of the limits of the invention. In the figures:



Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 151 of 521 PageID #: 257

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA Documenti1-1 Filed 02/01/23 Page 151 of 521 PagelD #: 257

US 10,289,154 B2
5

FIG. 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable
computer, according to aspects of the invention, in a “lap-
top” configuration;

FIG. 2 is a view of the portable computer of FIG. 1 in the
closed position;

FIG. 3 1s a plan view of the exterior of the bottom of the
portable computer of FIG. 1;

FIG. 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of
FIG. 1 in the easel mode;

FIG. 5 is a side view of the portable computer of FIG.4,
illustrating the adjustable angle of the easel mode;

FIGS. 6A-C are diagrams illustrating different positions
of the portable computer of FIG. 4 in easel mode;

FIG. 7A is an illustration of a portion of the portable
computer of FIG. 1 in the laptop mode, illustrating a hinge
assembly according to aspects of the invention:

FIG. 7B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable
computer of FIG. 1 in the easel mode, illustrating the hinge
assembly according to aspects of the invention;

FIG. 8 is a diagram of one example of the hinge assembly
of FIGS. 7A and 7B;

FIG. 9 1s a cross-sectional diagram of a portion of the
hinge assembly of FIG. 8, taken along line 9-9 in FIG.8;

FIG. 10 is an exploded view ofthe hinge assembly of FIG.
8;

FIG. 11 1s a block diagram of one example of a portable
computeruser interface architecture, according to aspects of
the invention;

FIG. 12 1s a screen shot illustrating one example of a
graphical user interface, according to aspects of the inven-
tion;

FIG. 13 1s a screen shot illustrating another example of a
graphical user interface according to aspects of the inven-
tion;

FIG. 14 is an illustration of a user adjusting the scroll
Wheel on a portable computer in the easel mode, according
to aspects of the invention;

FIG. 15 is an illustration of a user pressing the scroll
Wheel on a portable computer, according to aspects of the
invention:

FIG. 16 is an illustration of a user pressing a navigation
button on the portable computer, according to aspects of the
invention;

FIG. 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable
computer in the laptop mode, according to aspects of the
invention:

FIG. 18 is a view of a portion of the portable computer
illustrating a wireless signal indicator feature, according to
aspects of the invention;

FIG. 19 is a view of a portion of the portable computerin
the closed position, according to aspects of the invention;

FIG. 20 is a plan view of one example of a power adaptor,
according to aspects of the invention;

FIG. 21 is a side view of the power adaptor of FIG. 20;
FIG. 22A is another side view of the power adaptor of

FIG. 20, illustrating the power cord would around a cord
spool, according to aspects of the invention;

FIG. 22B is a plan view ofthe poweradaptor of FIG. 22.A;
FIG. 23 is an illustration of the portable computer coupled

to a docking station, according to aspects of the invention;
FIG. 24 is an illustration of the portable computer show-

ing one example of a docking connector, according to
aspects of the invention;

FIG. 25 is an illustration of a hinge assembly coupled to
a computer frame, according to aspects of the invention;
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FIG. 26 is an illustration of the portable computer con-
figured into a “frame” mode, according to aspects of the
invention; and

FIG. 27 is an illustration of the portable computer con-
figured into a “flat” mode, according to aspects of the
invention.

DETAILED DESCRIPTION

Aspects and embodiments are directed to a portable
computer that is configurable between different operating
modes, including a laptop mode (Gn which the portable
computer has a conventional laptop appearance), a flat
mode, a frame mode, and an easel mode in which the base
of the computer and its display component stand vertically
forming an inverted “V,” as discussed further below. The
portable computer1s capable of different display formats and
functionality in the different modes, and includes a graphical
user interface that may work seamlessly with the computer
hardware to provide a unified, comfortable, holistic user
experience.In particular, the portable computer may provide
access to a wide array of functions, both those traditionally
provided by computing devices and those traditionally pro-
vided by other passive information devices. For example,
the hardware and software, including the graphical user
interface, of the portable computer may be focused toward
providing access to entertainment media, such as audio and
video (e.g., playing music, streaming video, viewing pho-
tographs, etc.), email, and internet, while also providing
state-of-the-art computer processing capability.

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods
and apparatuses discussed herein are not limited in applica-
tion to the details of construction and the arrangement of
components set forth in the following description or illus-
trated in the accompanying drawings. The methods and
apparatuses are capable of implementation in other embodi-
ments and of being practiced or of being carried out in
various ways. Examples of specific implementations are
provided herein for illustrative purposes only and are not
intended to be limiting. In particular, acts, elements and
features discussed in connection with any one or more
embodiments are not intended to be excluded from a similar

role in any other embodiments. Also, the phraseology and
terminology used herein 1s for the purpose of description and
should not be regarded as limiting. Any references to
embodiments or elements or acts of the systems and meth-
ods herein referred to in the singular may also embrace
embodiments including a plurality of these elements, and
any referencesin plural to any embodimentor elementor act
herein may also embrace embodiments including only a
single element. References in the singular or plural form are
not intended to limit the presently disclosed systems or
methods, their components, acts, or elements. The use herein
of “including,” “comprising,” “having,” “containing,”
“involving,” and variations thereof is meant to encompass
the items listed thereafter and equivalents thereof as well as
additional items. References to “or” may be construed as
inclusive so that any terms described using “or” may indi-
cate any of a single, more than one, andall of the described
terms.

Referring to FIG. 1, there is illustrated one example of a
portable computer according to aspects of the invention. In
FIG. 1, the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the
“laptop” mode, with the display component 102 inclined at
a viewing angle from the base 104. The display component
102 is pivotably coupledto the base 104 by a hinge assembly
(not shown) that allows the display componentto be rotated
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with respect to the base. The hinge assembly may include a
single or multiple hinges, which may be any of a variety of
hinge types, including, but not limited, to single-axis hinges,
multiple-axis hinges, geared hinges, etc. In one example, the
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be
rotated (or tilted) about a longitudinal axis 101 running
along an interface between the display component and the
base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 1 and discussed further
below. The base 104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal
electronic components (not shown), such as a central pro-
cessing unit, memory, and other components necessary to
operate the portable computer, as known to those skilled in
the art. In some embodiments, the base 104 may also include
a touch pad 108 or trackball (not shown) for receiving user
commands, as known to those skilled in the art.

Still referring to FIG. 1, the display component 102
includes a display screen 110, and may also include a camera
112, microphone 114,and infrared receiver 116, as discussed
further below.It 1s to be appreciated that the locations of the
camera 112, microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG. 1, and may be
placed in other locations on the display component 102
and/or base 104, as would be recognized by those skilled in
the art. The display component 102 may also include cush-
ions 118 that provide soft contact points between the base
104 and the display component 102 when the portable
computer is closed. In one example, the cushions 118 are
made of rubber. However, it 1s to be appreciated that the
invention is not so limited, and the cushions 118 may
comprise materials other than rubber, including, for
example, a polymer, felt, or other suitable materials as would
be recognized by those skilled in the art.

Referring to FIG. 2, there is illustrated a side view of the
portable computer 100 of FIG. 1 in the closed configuration.
As is the case for conventional clam-shell type portable
computers, when the portable computer 100 is closed, the
display screen is disposed “face down”against the keyboard
of the base 104. In the illustrated embodiment, the base 104
includes a rounded portion 120 that houses the hinge (not
shown) that pivotably couples the display component 102 to
the base, as discussed further below.It is to be appreciated
that the rounded portion 120 1s not limited to having a round
shape, but may instead have another shape, which may be
dependent on the type of hinge used. In one embodiment, a
power button 122, configured to turn the portable computer
ON and OFF, may also be provided on the rounded portion
120, as illustrated in FIG. 2. However,it is to be appreciated
that the invention 1s not so limited, and the power button 122
may be located elsewhere on the base 104. In one example,
the power button 122 may be slightly recessed relative to the
surface of the base 104, so as decrease the potential for the
power button to be accidentally pressed.

An exterior view of the bottom of the base 104 (the
underside of the portable computer 100) is illustrated in FIG.
3. As can be seen in FIG. 3, in one embodiment, the base 104
includes a plurality of feet 124. In one example, the feet 124
are made of rubber; however, it 1s to be appreciated that the
invention is not so limited and the feet may be made of
another material, such as, for example, a polymeror felt. A
ventilation slit 126 may be provided near an interface
between the base 104 and the display component 102, as
illustrated, or elsewhere as may be desired, to allow heat to
dissipate from the internal electronic components in the
base. The base 104 may also include one or more speakers
128. In one example, the base 104 includes two stereo
speakers 128, positioned at either side of the base, as
illustrated in FIG. 3; however, it is to be appreciated that the
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portable computer 100 may comprise more or fewer speak-
ers which may be placed at any location on the base 104. A
scroll wheel 132 may be provided to allow a user to control
certain functionality of the portable computer 100, such as
navigating web pages, controlling speaker volume, selecting
programs, etc., as discussed further below.

According to one embodiment, the base 104 may com-
prise a cushioning strip 130 disposed along an edge of the
base 104 opposite to the interface between the display
component 102 and the base, as illustrated in FIG. 3. The
cushioning strip 130, which may comprise rubber, a poly-
mer, or another suitable material, may serve as a “foot” when
the portable computer is configured into the easel mode, as
discussed further below. In one embodiment, the display
component 102 may be provided with a similar cushioning
strip that may serve as a second supporting foot when the
portable computer is configured into the easel mode.

Referring to FIG. 4, there is illustrated an example of the
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode. To
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode (or
closed position) into the easel mode, the display component
102 may be folded away from the base 104, in the same
direction as to open the computer G.e., to configure the
computer from the closed position into the laptop mode)
such that the base 104 and the display component 102 form
an inverted “V” shape with the bottom of the base and the
back of the display component face another, as illustrated in
FIG. 4. In the easel mode, the display screen 110 is visible
and accessible on one side of the portable computer 100 and
the keyboard 106 (not shown in FIG. 4) 1s visible and
accessible on the other side.

Asillustrated in FIG. 4, in one embodiment, the portable
computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con-
trols, including a volume control button 204 and a mute
button 206. In one example, the volume control button 204
may be a rocker switch that allows a user to easily increase
or decrease the volume of audio played through the speakers
128. When the user presses the volume control button 204,
a volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display
screen 110, to provide a visual indication of the amount by
which the volumeis being increased or decreased. Similarly,
pressing the mute button 206 may cause a visual indication
that the volumeis muted to appear on the display screen 110.

According to one embodiment, when the portable com-
puter 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated
180 degrees such that the information appears “right-way-
up,” even through the display screen is upside-down com-
pared to when the portable computer 1s in the laptop mode.
Thus, a user may simply “flip” the portable computer 100
into the easel mode and immediately be able to comfortably
view information on the display screen 110, without having
to access display screen controls to adjust the orientation of
the visual display. In one embodiment, the portable com-
puter 100 includes an orientation (or mode) sensor that 1s
configured to detect whether the portable computer is in the
laptop mode or the easel mode, and to adjust the display
accordingly. The orientation sensor may be incorporated into
the base component 104, for example, underneath the key-
board 106, or into the display component. In one example,
locating the orientation sensor in the display component
102, rather than the base 104, may provide more robust
detection and therefore, may be presently preferred in some
embodiments. The orientation sensor may be usedto deter-
mine a precise relative orientation of the base component
104 with respect to the display component 102, or vice
versa, for example, to determine whetherthe device is in the
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laptop mode, easel mode, or some point in between the two
modes. In one example, the orientation sensor includes an
accelerometer whose output is fed to the computer operating
system (or to dedicated logic circuitry) which then triggers
a display inversion as appropriate.

Accelerometers have been used in portable devices such
as cellular phones, media players or computers, as sudden
motion sensors, or “drop detectors,” to protect against hard
drive crashes in the event that the device is dropped. By
contrast, however, the accelerometer in the portable com-
puter according to an embodiment of the invention is not
used to detect motion of the overall computer, but rather to
detect a configuration of the portable computer 100 (e.g..,
laptop mode or easel mode), particularly, to detect an
orientation of the display component 102 relative to the base
component 104. In one example, information from the
accelerometer 1s provided to a display controller in the
portable computer and used to switch the display between
portrait or landscape mode, as is done in some conventional
devices.

Referring to FIG. 5, when the portable computer 100 is in
the easel mode, the base 104 is disposed at an angle 134 to
the display component 102. This angle 134 1s adjustable, for
example, to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display
screen 110 to be maintained for different positions of a user
136 and of the portable computer 100, as illustrated in FIGS.
6A, 6B and 6C. For example, when the user 136 is further
from the portable computer, the angle 134a (FIG. 6A) may
be made smaller than the angle 1344 whenthe user1s closer
to the portable computer (FIG. 6B). As discussed above, in
one example, the orientation sensor (not shown) may be
used to detect, either approximately or precisely, the angle
134 and to provide the information to the computer operat-
ing system.

According to one embodiment, the display component
102 1s pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge that
allows the display component to be movedrelative to the
base so as to allow the portable computer 100 to be config-
ured into the closed position, the laptop mode orthe easel
mode. As discussed above, in conventional “clamshell” type
portable computers, the hinges that couple the display com-
ponent to the base generally do not permit more than about
180 degrees of rotation of the display component. Thus,
these conventional portable computers can be in a closed
position or open, laptop configuration, but cannot be con-
figured into an easel mode because the conventional hinges
do not permit sufficient movementofthe display component.
Similarly, the tablet-type portable computers discussed
above have displays that can be opened, rotated and folded
such that they lie flat against the keyboard on the base, but
cannot be configured into an easel mode. Although, as
discussed above, U.S. Pat. No. 6,266,236 discloses a com-
puter that is configurable into a presentation mode, this
requires a complex arm assembly. By contrast, the portable
computer according to embodiments of the present invention
may be configured into the easel mode by simply continuing
to tilt or rotate the display component past the “laptop
positions” until a desired easel angle 134 1s reached.

Referring to FIGS. 7A and 7B, there is illustrated a
portion of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge
assembly 138 that allows the portable computer to be
configured into either the laptop mode (FIG. 7A) or the easel
mode (FIG. 7B), according to aspects of the invention.
According to one embodiment, the hinge assembly 138
accommodates 0-320 degrees of rotation, allowing a mini-
mum angle 134 (see FIG. 5) of 40 degrees. However, it is to
be appreciated that the hinge assembly 138 may allow
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greater or fewer degrees of rotation, provided only that
sufhicient rotation is allowed so as to configure the portable
computer 100 into either the laptop modeor the easel mode.
As discussed above, in one embodiment the portable com-
puter 100 includes an orientation sensor (not shown) that 1s
configured to detect a relative orientation of the display
component 102 and the base component 104. In one
example, the orientation sensor may be an accelerometer
incorporated into the base component 104, as discussed
above. Alternatively, the orientation sensor may be incor-
porated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be used to
detect movementof the hinge assembly, and to translate that
movement into an information about the relative orientation

of the display component 102 and the base component 104
(for example, a size of the angle 134). It is also to be
appreciated that the orientation sensor may include elec-
tronic or mechanical components, or a combination thereof.
For example, the hinge assembly may be provide with
detents that provide an indication of the modeofthe portable
computer.

As discussed above, and also illustrated in FIGS. 7A and
7B, the portable computer may also comprise a scroll wheel
132 that allowsa user to adjust, control and/or select various
aspects of the portable computer(e.g., wireless capability or
speaker volume) or items displayed on the display screen
110. A housing 160 may contain or support various mechani-
cal and/or electronic components (not shown) that are
coupled to the scroll wheel 132 and are configured to convert
physical movement of the scroll wheel into electrical sig-
nals. These electrical signals may be provided to the central
processing unit of the portable computer 100 which pro-
cesses the electrical signals so as to translate movement of
the scroll wheel into control of a selected feature, for
example, adjusting the volumeofthe speaker(s) or selecting
a particular item displayed on the display screen, as dis-
cussed further below.

One embodimentof the hinge assembly 138 1s illustrated
in FIG. 8. The hinge assembly includes a bracket 140
rotatably coupled to a housing 142. The housing 142 may
includeafirst flange 144 that may be fastened to an internal
frame in the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 7A. The first
flange 144 may include holes 146 to allow thefirst flange to
be fastened to the base 104 using fasteners, such as, for
example, screws, rivets or bolts. The bracket 140 may
include a second flange 148 that may be similarly coupledto
the display component 102 using fasteners 150. In one
embodiment, the display screen 110 (see FIG. 1) may be an
LCD screen. As known to those skilled in the art, an LCD
screen generally comprises a frame and plastic housing. In
one example, the second flange 148 may be fastened to
either or both of the display screen frame and the screen’s
plastic housing. Referring to FIG. 25, there 1s illustrated an
example of two hinge assemblies 138 coupled to the display
frame 208 of the display component, and to the base frame
210 of the base component 104. According to one embodi-
ment, the bracket 140 and/or housing 142 may be formed of
cast zinc. However, it is to be appreciated that other mate-
rials, including other metals, may be used, and the bracket
140 and/or housing 142 may be formed using a procedure
other than casting, such as, for example, machining or
molding.

Referring again to FIG. 8, in one embodiment, the hinge
assembly 138 may also incorporate an area 152 for locating
the power button (FIG. 2, 122) or a navigation control button
(FIG. 4, 166), as discussed further below.

Referring to FIG. 9, there is illustrated a cross-sectional
view of a portion of the hinge assembly 138 taken along line
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A-A in FIG. 8. As shown in FIG. 9, in one embodiment the
hinge assembly 138 comprises a shaft 154 located within the
hinge housing 142. The shaft 154 may be held in position
within the hinge housing 142, and rotatably coupled to the
housing, by torsion elements, such as springs 156. In one
example, the springs 156 may be formed by stamping;
however, it is to be appreciated that other methods of
manufacture may be used. In one example, the hinge assem-
bly may accommodate about 320 degrees of rotation, as
discussed above, and may provide about 6.5 in-lbs in
symmetric torque.

FIG. 10 is an exploded view of the hinge assembly of
FIGS. 8 and 9. As shown in FIG. 10, the shaft 154 1s coupled
to amember 158. This member 158 may be integral with or
coupled to the bracket 140 which 1s, in turn, fastened to the
display component, as discussed above. Thus, the shaft 154
and springs 156 provide a rotatable coupling between the
fixed elements of the hinge assembly, namely, the hinge
housing 142 and bracket 140 which are fastened to the base
104 and display component 102 of the portable computer. In
this manner, the hinge assembly allows the display compo-
nent 102 to be moved relative to the base 104, thereby
allowing the portable computer to be easily and quickly
configured into any of the closed position, laptop mode or
easel mode. For example, simply rotating or tilting the
display component aboutthe longitudinal axis 101 (see FIG.
1) up to approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode
configures the portable computer into the laptop mode, and
rotating the display component about the longitudinal axis
101 beyond approximately 180 degrees axis from the closed
mode configures the portable computer into the easel mode.

According to one embodiment, the portable computer
may include integrated “navigation” hardware that allows a
user to easily and comfortable control various features and
functions of the portable computer, and to manipulate con-
tent displayed on the portable computer. For example, as
discussed above, the portable computer 100 may comprise a
scroll wheel 132 that allows a user to control, adjust and/or
select various functionality of the portable computer.
According to another embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may
be used to provide “hardware navigation” through informa-
tion, such as menus, icons, etc., displayed on the display
screen 110, as discussed further below with reference to
FIG. 17. A common display configuration used in conven-
tional computers 1s a “desktop” view in which multiple icons
representing links to various programs or applications are
displayed over a background image. Navigation 1s conven-
tionally performed using a mouse, touch pad ortrackball, as
known to those skilled in the art. In one embodiment, the
portable computer 100 may display information on the
display screen 110 in the conventional desktop configura-
tion, and navigation may be performed using either conven-
tional tools, such as a touchpad 108, trackball (not shown)
or peripheral, for example, a mouse, that is connected to the
portable computer 100 via a port 164, or the scroll wheel
132, or acombination thereof. According to another embodi-
ment, the portable computer 100 includes a streamlined
graphical user interface that supports “map”navigation. The
map user interface provides a clear overview of the entire
computing environment and searching capability within the
environment that may be accessed using the scroll wheel
132 and, optionally, one or navigation buttons 166, 168 that
may be provided on the base 104 of the portable computer
100 (button 166) and/or in the keyboard 106 (button 168),
illustrated in FIG. 17. In one embodiment, the map mode of
navigation 1s a hierarchical modethat reduces the number of
items to select amongst at any stage of navigation, thereby
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facilitating user access with the scroll wheel 132 and,
optionally, the navigation button(s) 166, 168. Of course, it is
to be appreciated that the map user interface may also be
navigated using conventional tools, such as a trackball,
touchpad, mouse or arrow keys.

Referring to FIG. 11, there is illustrated a block diagram
of one example of an architecture of the portable computer
including a map user interface. The user interface “home”
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172.
In the illustrated example, the home screen 170 containsfive
modes of content 172; however, it is to be appreciated that
the home screen may include more or fewer than five modes
of content and that the modes of content may differ from the
examples discussed below. According to one example, the
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170

may include “media” 172a, “connect” 1725, “web” 172c,
“applications” 172d, and “channels” 172e. Using the map
user interface, information, programs, features and applica-
tions may be groupedinto the various modes of content 172.
By selecting any mode of content 172, for example, by using
the scroll wheel 132 and/or navigation buttons 166, 168, as
discussed further below, the user may access the content
organized within that mode. For example, the media mode
172a may provide access to a medial player to play, view,
search and organize media such as music, video, photos,etc.
The connect mode 1725 may provide access to features such
as, for example, email, voice-over-IP, instant messaging,
etc., and the web mode 172c may provide access to internet
browsing and searching. The application mode 172d may
provide access to, for example, computer applications or
programs, such as word processor, spreadsheet, calculator,
etc. In one example, these applications or programs may be
provided as web-based services rather than programs or
applications residing on the portable computer 100. The
channels mode 172e may provide access to different func-
tionality of the portable computer, with the different func-
tions or features defined as different channels. For example,
a channel may include an alarm clock channel in which the
portable computer is configured to display a clock and can
be programmedto activate an alarm, e.g., a sound, piece of
music, etc., at a predetermined time. Another example of a
channel may include a “photo frame” channel in which the
portable computer may be configured to display a pre-
selected image or set of images, etc. Another example of a
channel is a “television” channel, in which the portable
computer is configured to stream Internet television. In one
example, a user may configure particular Internet television
channels (e.g., a news channel, a movie channel, a home and
garden channel, etc.) into sub-channels within the channels
mode of content 172(e). Someor all of the modes of content
172 may access, retrieve and/or store information on the
Internet 174.

According to one embodiment, the different modes of
content 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the
display screen 110, as illustrated in FIG. 12. The following
discussion of various features, including hardware naviga-
tion through the map user interface may refer primarily to
the display configuration illustrated in FIG. 12. However, it
is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited, and
the modes of content may be displayed in other configura-
tions, including, for example, a “desktop” and icon configu-
ration, a “dashboard”typedisplay, as illustrated in FIG. 13,
or another configuration, as would be recognized by those
skilled in the art. Similarly, navigation is discussed below
primarily with reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navi-
gation buttons 166, 168; however, it 1s to be appreciation
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that navigation may also be accomplished using any of the
conventional tools discussed above or known to those

skilled in the art.

As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the
scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation buttons 166,
168 may be used to navigate the user interface. Referring
again to FIG. 12, scrolling the scroll wheel may sequentially
highlight different ones of the modes of content 172. In one
example, the highlighting may be achieved by changing the
color of the selected mode, and/or by providing a visual
indicator, such as a colored bar 176. A highlighted mode 172
may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel, thereby
bringing up a new “page” or screen on the user interface
corresponding to the selected mode. Once within a selected
mode of content 172, the scroll wheel may similarly be used
to select particular functions, features or applications within
that mode. In one embodiment, the default action for the

scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the
portable computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel
mode. For example, in easel mode, the default action for the
scroll wheel may be channel selection within the channels
mode 172(e).

As discussed above, in one embodiment volume control
for the speakers 128 may be provided by the volumecontrol
button 204 and mute button 206. Alternatively, according to
another embodiment, volume control may be provided using
the scroll wheel 132. Thus, as a user scrolls the scroll wheel
132, as illustrated in FIG. 14 by arrow 161, a volume
indicator may appear on the display screen 110. In one
example, the volume indicator may comprise a transparent,
or partially transparent, box 162 containing volume level
indicators that may appear directly below the scroll wheel
132 on the display screen 110. In this example, as the user
scrolls the scroll wheel 132, different volume levels in the
volume box 162 may be successively highlighted, to indi-
cate to the user that the volume is increasing or decreasing.

In one embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be depress-
ible as well as scrollable. Thus, pressing the scroll wheel
132, as illustrated in FIG. 15, may allow further control,
such as, for example, selecting a channel onto which the user
has scrolled, or “play” and “pause” of audio or video being
played through the portable computer 100.

As discussed above, according to one embodiment, one or
more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with
the scroll wheel. In particular, in one embodiment, the
navigation button(s) may be used to changethe action of the
scroll wheel. As discussed above, in one example, the
default action of the scroll wheel is volume control. This

action may be changed by pressing the navigation button
166, as illustrated in FIG. 16, for example, from volume
control to menu navigation in the user interface, and vice
versa. According to one embodiment, the effect of pressing
the navigation button 166 may vary depending on active the
mode of content of the portable computer 100. For example,
if a user is in the media mode using a photo viewing
application, pressing the navigation button 166 may change
the action of the scroll wheel 132 from mode navigation to
slideshow controls for the photos. When the navigation
button 166 1s pressed, an control indicator box (similar to the
volumeindicator box 162 discussed above with reference to

FIG. 14) may appear containing different actions for the
photo slideshow, such as “play,” “next,” “back,” “skip,”
“full screen view,” etc., and scrolling the scroll wheel 132
may allow a userto select one of these actions. Pressing the
navigation button 166 again may return the scroll wheel
action to menu navigation, to allow the user to, for example,
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move to a different feature or application within the active
mode, or to select a different mode.

As can be seen in FIG. 16, the navigation button 166 may
be easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the
easel mode, providing a convenient navigation tool for this
configuration. A similar navigation button 168 may be
provided on the keyboard 106, as illustrated in FIG. 17. In
one example, the functionality of the two navigation buttons
166, 168 may be the same, with the different locations
providing easy, comfortable access in the different configu-
ration modes (1.e., laptop or easel) of the portable computer
100. Thus, a user may use either navigation button 166 or
navigation button 168, depending on personal preference. In
another example, the two navigation buttons may have
different functionality. For example, the navigation button
166 may be used to alter the action of the scroll wheel 132,
as discussed above, while the navigation button 168 1s used
to navigate “up” or “down” a level within the map user
interface. For example, pressing the navigation button 168
while within a given mode of content may allow the user to
“back up” to the home screen; or pressing the navigation
button 168 while within a selected channel (in the channel
mode of the content 172e) may allow the user to “back-up”
to the channel mode main page.

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the
functionality of the navigation buttons 166, 168 is possible,
as would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and the
above examples are given for illustration only and are not
intended to be limiting. In addition, any functions described
with reference to one navigation button (166 or 168) may be
instead (or additionally) implemented with the other navi-
gation button. In one example, the function of the navigation
buttons 166, 168 may vary depending on whether the
portable computer 100 is configured into the laptop mode or
the easel mode. For example, only the navigation button 166
may be active in the easel mode, and only the navigation
button 168 may be active in the laptop mode. Alternatively,
both navigation buttons 166, 168 may be usable in either the
laptop mode or the easel mode, but their functionality may
vary. For example, when the portable computer 100 1s in the
easel mode, the default action for the navigation button 166
may be channel selection whereas the default action for the
navigation button 168 is to access the “home” screen.
Furthermore, the portable computer 100 is not limited to the
use of two navigation buttons and may instead comprise
only a single navigation button or more than two navigation
buttons, any of which may be disposed in the locations
described above (e.g., on the rounded portion 120 of the base
104 or on the keyboard 106), or in other locations on the
portable computer.

As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the
function or display content and/or display orientation of the
portable computer may vary when the portable computer1s
configured from the laptop modeinto the easel mode,or vice
versa. For example, as discussed above, when the portable
computer 100 1s configured into the easel mode, the visual
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated
180 degrees such that the information appears “right-way-
up,” even through the display screen is upside-down com-
pared to when the portable computeris in the laptop mode.
In another example, for at least some activities within at
least some modesof content (e.g., viewing a photograph or
video), when the portable computer 100 is configured into
the easel mode,the display may automatically adjust to “full
screen view”(1.e., the displayed image or video1s displayed
on the full screen size, rather than in a window)to allow for
comfortable viewing.
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In addition, as discussed above, the ability to configure
the portable computer 100 into either the laptop modeor the
easel mode provides enhanced functionality. For example,
when the portable computer 100 is not being actively used,
the user may configure the portable computer into the easel
mode, and program the portable computerto act as a digital
photo frame, displaying one or more photos of the user’s
choice. In the easel mode, the portable computer 100 may
occupy a smaller footprint on a surface than in the laptop or
closed modes because the base 104 and display component
102 are upright, as illustrated in FIGS. 4 and 5. In addition,
because the portable computer can act as a passive infor-
mation and/or entertainment device, such as a photo frame
or clock, as discussed above, the portable computer may
provide a useful function even when not being actively used
by the user, and may do so (in the easel mode) without taking
up much surface area.

According to another embodiment, the portable computer
100 may further comprise a wireless signal indicator 178, as
illustrated in FIG. 18. The wireless signal indicator 178 may
indicate the availability and/or strength of a wireless signal
to which the portable computer 100 is connected, or 1s
attempting to connect to. In one example, the color of the
wireless signal indicator 178 may provide information
regarding the strength of a detected wireless signal. For
example, green may indicate a “good” signal; yellow may
indicate a “poor” or “low”signal; and red may indicate that
there 1s no signal available. In one example, the wireless
signal indicator 178 may be ON or active whenever the
portable computer 100 1s powered up. Alternatively, the
wireless signal indicator 178 may be activated by a user
action, for example, by pressing the navigation button 166 or
another button or key provided on the portable computer
100, and may remain active for a predetermined time period
(e.g., for 2 seconds, 10 seconds, one minute, etc.). As
discussed above, the functionality of the navigation button
166 may vary depending on the configuration mode of the
portable computer 100. In one example, when the portable
computer 100 is in the closed position, but still powered up,
the default action for the navigation button 166 may beto
activate the wireless signal indicator 178.

According to one embodiment, the portable computer 100
may be provided with power cord and adapter to allow the
portable computer to be plugged into a wall supply. Refer-
ring to FIG. 19, there 1s illustrated a view of a portion of the
portable computer 100, showing a power jack 180 to which
the power adaptor can be connected. As discussed above,the
portable computer 100 may also include a port 164 to which
peripheral devices, such as mouse, external keyboard, por-
table flash drive, memory stick, etc. may be connected. In
one example, the port 164 1s a USB port; however, it 1s to
be appreciated that the port may accommodate protocols
other than USB.In addition, although only one port 164 is
illustrated in FIG. 19, the portable computer 100 may
comprise multiple ports that may accommodate multiple
protocols. In one example, the portable computer 100 may
also comprise a headphone jack 182. It is to be appreciated
that the location of any orall of the power jack 180, port(s)
164, and headphone jack 182 are not limited to the example
shown in FIG. 19, but may be anywhere convenient or
desirable on the portable computer 100.

Referring to FIG. 20, there is illustrated a top down view
one example of a power adaptor 184 that may be used with
the portable computer 100 and connected via the power jack
180. As knownto those skilled in the art, the power adaptor
184 comprises a transformer (not shown) that converts the
wall power to a level acceptable for use by the portable
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computer 100. In one embodiment, the power adaptor 184
comprises a substantially round body 186 that houses the
transformer and other necessary components. A connector
188 may allow the power adaptor 184 to be connected to a
wall outlet or extension cord. In one example, the connector
188 may include foldable prongs 190 that can be folded
against the connector 188 for storage, and folded out for
connection, as illustrated in FIG. 21. A cord 192 may be
slidably accommodated within the body 186, such that the
cord may be stored within the body and flexibly extended
(up to its maximum length) by a user.

According to one embodiment, the cord 192 may be
wound around a cord spool 194 located within, or partially
within, the body 186 of the power adaptor 184. Asillustrated
in FIG. 21, the cord spool 194 may be configured to slide out
from the body 186 of the power adaptor 184, such that the
cord 192 can be wound around the cord spool 194, as
illustrated in FIGS. 22A and 22B.

According to another embodiment, the portable computer
100 may be configured to connect to a docking station 196,
as illustrated in FIG. 23. In one embodiment, a connector
198 on the docking station 196 may be configured to slidably
connect to connectors 200 on the portable computer 100, as
illustrated in FIG. 23. In one example, the connectors 200
may include power and audio connectors, such that the
portable computer 100 may receive power from the docking
station and receive and/or provide audio signals from/to the
docking station, respectively. For example, the docking
station may be coupled to external speakers, and the portable
computer may provide audio signals to the docking station
to be played through the external speakers. In another
example, the docking station 196 may also be coupled to an
audio device (not shown), such as an MP3 player, which
may provide audio signals and data to the portable computer
100, for example, to update an audio library on the portable
computer. It is to be appreciated that many other variations
of communication between the portable computer 100 and
devices coupled to the docking station 196 are possible, as
would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and such
variations are intended to be within the scope of this
disclosure. Furthermore, numerous variations on the con-
nector(s) 198, 200 that couple the docking station 196 to the
portable computer 100 are also possible, as would be rec-
ognized by those skilled in the art. For example, the portable
computer 100 may include a multi-pin connector 202
located on the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 24. Such and
other variations are intended to be within the scope of this
disclosure and the above-mentioned examples are provided
for illustration only and are not intended to be limiting.

In addition, it is to be appreciated that although the above
discussion refers primarily to the portable computer 100
being in either the laptop mode or easel mode, other modes
or configurations are also possible. For example, as dis-
cussed above, because the portable computer 100 can be
configured from the closed position, through the laptop
mode into the easel mode by rotating the display component
102, a number of configurations are possible in between
“true” laptop mode and “true” easel mode. In another
example, the portable computer 100 may be configured into
a “frame”? mode, as illustrated in FIG. 26, in which the
portable computer is placed on a surface 212 with the
keyboard 106 “face down” on the surface 212 and the
display 110 facing upward. In the frame mode, the display
component 102 may be at a similar orientation, and angle
134, with respect to the base component 104 as in the easel
mode. However, rather than the base component 104 and
display component 102 being oriented vertically with
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respect to the surface 212, as in the easel mode (in which the
portable computer forms an inverted “V” as discussed
above), in the frame mode, the base component 104 may lie
flat on the surface 212, as shown in FIG. 26. In one example,
software and/or hardware protection may be provided for the
keyboard to prevent keys from being pressed (or to prevent
the portable computer from responding to pressed keys)
when the portable computer is in the frame mode.

Similarly, referring to FIG. 27, there is illustrated another
configuration of the portable computer 100, referring to as
the “flat” mode. In the flat mode, the display component 102
may be rotated (or opened) to approximately 180 degrees
with respect to the base component 104, such that the base
component and display componentlay flat on a surface, with
the keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed, as shown
in FIG. 27. Unlike the easel and frame modes, in which the

keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible, in the
flat mode, the keyboard1s accessible and usable. In addition,
as discussed above, the visual display on the display screen
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort-
able viewing of information by persons located in different
positions relative to the base component 104 or display
component 102. The visual display on the display screen 110
may also be manually adjusted by a user using, for example,
the keyboard 106, touch pad 108 or mouse (not shown),
scroll wheel 132 or navigation buttons (not shown). For
example, if a user (located at position A) wishes to display
information for a person located opposite the user (at
position B), the visual display may be rotated (automatically
or manually) 180 degrees such that the information appears
“right-way-up,” to the person at location B, even through the
display screen 110 1s upside-downfor that person. Similarly,
in another example, the visual display may be rotated
(automatically or manually) 90 degrees such that the infor-
mation appears “right-way-up,” for a person at location C.In
one example, a user can “toggle” the visual display among
various orientations. For example, a user at location A may
have the visual display facing themselves while using the
keyboard 106 or other controls to change or access infor-
mation on the display, then toggle the display orientation
180 or 90 degrees to display the information for personsat
locations B or C.

In summary, various aspects and embodiments provide a
portable computer that 1s configurable between different
operating modes, including a laptop mode and an easel
mode, and that is capable of different display formats and
functionality in the different modes. The ability to view and
operate the portable computer in the different laptop and
easel modes, and to incorporate features and functions such
as an alarm clock, digital photograph frame, voice-over-IP,
etc, may provide enhanced flexibility and usefulness. In
addition, the portable computer may include a graphical user
interface that may work seamlessly with the computer
hardware to provide an enjoyable, holistic user experience.

Having thus described several aspects of at least one
embodiment, it 1s to be appreciated various alterations,
modifications, and improvements will readily occur to those
skilled in the art. For example functionality or features that
have been described herein in connection with hardware

may instead be implemented in software, or vice versa. For
example, the wireless signal indicator discussed above may
instead (or in addition) be provided as a software applica-
tion. Such alterations, modifications, and improvements are
intended to be part of this disclosure and are intended to be
within the scope of the invention. Accordingly, the foregoing
description and drawings are by way of example only.
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What is claimed 1s:

1. A portable computer configurable between a plurality
of display modes comprising a first mode and a second
mode, the portable computer comprising:

a display component comprising a display screen; a base
comprising a keyboard and a touchpad;

hinge assembly that rotatably couples the base to the
display component, the hinge assembly being config-
ured to permit the display component to rotate relative
to the base up to at least 270 degrees from a closed
position where the display screen faces the keyboard;

an orientation sensor configured to generate orientation
information indicative of an orientation of at least part
of the portable computer; and

a display manager configured to detect a current display
mode from amongthe plurality of display modes based
at least in part on the orientation information and
enlarge at least some computer content displayed on the
display screen when the current display modetransi-
tions from the first mode to the second mode;

Wherein the display component is in a first position
relative to the base in the first mode; and wherein the
display component is in a second position relative to
the base that is different from the first position in the
second mode.

2. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the display
componentin the first position 1s rotated relative to the base
no more than 180 degrees from the closed position and
Wherein the display component in the second position 1s
rotated relative to the base beyond 180 degrees from the
closed position.

3. The portable computer of claim 2, wherein the display
manageris configured to display contentin a first orientation
when the current display mode1s the first mode and display
content in a second orientation that is rotated 180 degrees
relative to the first orientation when the current display
mode is the second mode.

4. The portable computer of claim 3, wherein the first
mode is a laptop mode and the second mode is an easel
mode, wherein the plurality of display modes comprises a
frame mode, and wherein the display manageris configured
to display content in the first orientation when the current
display mode is the frame mode.

5. The portable computer of claim 4, wherein the orien-
tation sensor comprises an accelerometer.

6. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the at least
some computer content includes at least one member
selected from the group consisting of: an icon, a menu, an
image, and a video.

7. The portable computer of claim 1, wherein the portable
computer is configured to disable the keyboard when the
current display mode is the second mode.

8. The portable computer of claim 1, further comprising
at least one navigation element that is accessible in thefirst
and second modes.

9. The portable computer of claim 8, wherein the display
manager is configured to transition to a home screen when
the navigation element1s activated.

10. The portable computer of claim 9, wherein the navi-
gation element comprises a navigation button disposed on a
side of the base.

11. A portable computer configurable between a plurality
of display modes comprising a first mode, a second mode,
and a third mode, the portable computer comprising:

a display component comprising a surface;
a display screen disposed in the surface of the display

component; a camera disposed in the surface of the
display component; a base comprising a first surface
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and a second surface; a keyboard disposed in the first
surface of the base; a touchpad disposed in the first
surface of the base; a power button disposed in the
second surface of the base; a central processing unit
disposed in the base;

hinge assembly that rotatably couples the base to the
display component, the hinge assembly being config-
ured to permit the display componentto rotate relative
to the base up to at least 270 degrees from a closed
position where the surface of the display component
faces the first surface of the base;

an orientation sensor configured to generate orientation
information indicative of an orientation ofat least part
of the portable computer; and

a display manager configured to detect a current display
mode from amongthe plurality of display modes based
at least in part on the orientation information, display
content in a first orientation when the current display
mode is the first mode or the third mode, display
content in a second orientation that 1s rotated 180

degreesrelative to the first orientation when the current
display mode is the second mode, and enlarge at least
some computer content displayed on the display screen
when the current display modetransitions from thefirst
mode to the second mode.

12. The portable computer of claim 11, wherein thefirst
modeis a laptop mode, the second modeis easel mode, and
the third mode is frame mode.

13. The portable computer of claim 12, wherein the
orientation sensor comprises an accelerometer.

14. The portable computer of claim 13, wherein the
portable computer is configured to disable the keyboard
when the current display mode is the third mode.

15. The portable computer of claim 11, wherein the
computer content includes at least one member selected
from the group consisting of: an icon, a menu, an image, and
a video.

16. The portable computer of claim 11, further comprising
at least one navigation element disposed in the second
surface of the base.

17. The portable computer of claim 16, wherein the
display manager is configured to transition to a first home
screen when the navigation element is activated and the
current display modeis the first mode.

18. The portable computer of claim 17, wherein the
display manager1s configured to transition to a second home
screen when the navigation element is activated and the
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current display mode is the second mode, wherein the first
home screen is different from the second homescreen.

19. The portable computer of claim 16, further comprising
a speaker disposed in the base and a volume control button
disposed in the second surface of the base.

20. A portable computer configurable between a plurality
of display modes comprising a laptop mode, an easel mode,
and a frame mode, the portable computer comprising:

a display component comprising a surface;
a display screen disposed in the surface of the display

component; a camera disposed in the surface of the
display component;

a base comprising a top surface, a bottom surface that is
opposite the top surface, and a lateral surface that is
between the top surface and the bottom surface; a
keyboard disposed in the top surface of the base; a
touchpad disposed in the top surface of the base; a
power button disposed in the lateral surface of the base;
a central processing unit disposed in the base; a speaker
disposed in the base;

a volume control button disposed in the lateral surface of
the base;

hinge assembly that rotatably couples the base to the
display component and comprises a multi-axis hinge,
the hinge assembly being configured to permit the
display componentto rotate relative to the base uptoat
least 270 degrees from a closed position where the
surface of the display component faces the top surface
of the base;

an accelerometer configured to generate orientation infor-
mation indicative of an orientation ofat least part of the
portable computer; and

a display manager configured to detect a current display
mode from amongthe plurality of display modes based
at least in part on the orientation information, display
content in a first orientation when the current display
mode is the laptop mode or the frame mode, display
content in a second orientation that is rotated 180

degrees relative to the first orientation when the current
display mode is the easel mode, and enlarge at least
some computer content displayed on the display screen
when the current display mode transitions from the
laptop mode to the easel mode; and

wherein the at least some computer content includes at
least one member selected from the group consisting
of: an image and a video.

*K * “*K *K *
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computer content for presentation to a user. Different views of 
are used to provide an interface that is responsive to configu 
rations of the device and responsive to activity being per 
formed by the user. Aspects include permitting the user to 
transition the device from one configuration to another during 
its use, for example from easel to laptop modes. Further the 
elements that comprise the graphical user interface are con 
figured to presenta Summarized view of available actions and 
content, in order to simplify user interaction. The different 
views present different organizations of the interface ele 
ments and in some example display only certain ones of the 
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user must navigate to accomplish an objective. According to 
another aspect, methods and systems for streamlining user 
interaction with computer content are provided. In some 
embodiments, streamlining includes pre-configuring a user 
device based on received information. Other embodiments 
include presenting consistent visual representations used to 
navigated to views that present computer content. 
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SYSTEMAND METHOD FOR 
STREAMLINING USER INTERACTION WITH 

ELECTRONIC CONTENT 

RELATED APPLICATIONS 

This application is a continuation-in-part of, and claims 
priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to, U.S. patent application Ser. 
No. 12/170,951 entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed on Jul. 
10, 2008; which claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 61/041,365, entitled 
“PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY 
CONFIGURATIONS filed Apr. 1, 2008, both of which are 
herein incorporated by reference in their entirety. Further 
more, this application is a continuation-in-part of, and claims 
priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to U.S. patent application Ser. 
No. 12/170,939, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed on Jul. 
10, 2008; which claims priority under 35 U.S.C. 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 61/041,365, entitled 
“PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY 
CONFIGURATIONS filed Apr. 1, 2008, each of which 
applications are herein incorporated by reference in their 
entirety. This application also claims priority under 35 U.S.C. 
119(e) to U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 61/041,365, 
entitled PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE 
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed Apr. 1, 2008 which 
application is incorporated herein by reference in its entirety. 

BACKGROUND 

Much of the advancement in contemporary computer sys 
tems and services stems from the significant increases in 
computing power. Hand in hand with those increases, 
enhanced features sets have developed designed to utilize that 
computing power. Conventional wisdom Suggests that the 
more features that can be provided to a particular computer 
user, the better the user's experience will be. 
As computers have become more powerful and capable of 

providing more and more features, ordinary/typical computer 
users has not been able to keep up with availability of features 
and services. User may become frustrated by the inability to 
navigate the myriad (sometime unending) configurations and 
options provided in order to achieve Something useful and/or 
workable to their ordinary use. Many users simply don't take 
advantage of provided features. Some outright ignore options 
and features that would simplify the use of their computer 
system. This may occur because of user ignorance or even 
fear and in Some instances because the user lacks experience 
with new features—so the user doesn't know the feature can 
be useful. 

User frustration is felt not only with respect to the newer 
more powerful computer systems being offered today, but 
also frustration abounds with respect to their computers 
interaction with the Internet. The present movement on the 
Internet, often referred to as Web 2.0, also subscribes to 
conventional thinking in that more and more features are 
being packed into each and every aspect of the web experi 
ence. Third party service providers can be found for almost 
any service virtually no limitations have been found for the 
services that can be provided. 
More typically, these on-line services provide very useful 

opportunities for the users who know how to take advantage 
of them—online photo management/sharing, online financial 
services, online marketplaces, online exchanges, web host 
ing, web development, dating services, social networking to 
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name only a few. Very often these on-line services can be 
found for free or minimal costs. Typically, registration is the 
only requirement for participating in what is offered as free 
services. In other words, all that is required is the creation of 
a user name and password. Each service often attempts to 
outdo competitors by offering more and more options/fea 
tures than their competitors. 

SUMMARY 

It is realized that the conventional wisdom with respect to 
Such “feature packing as discussed above Suffers from sig 
nificant flaws. Typical computer users simply can't take 
advantage of all the functionality offered, either the services 
and features offered by their own computer, or the services 
and features offered by online providers. The complexity of 
the interface (both hardware and software)hampers adoption, 
as does the volume of features offered. For example, third 
party service provides often find difficulty in subscribing new 
users, educating existing users, and providing integration of 
feature sets for the features they provide as well as those 
offered by other service providers. 

Further complicating the users interaction with computer 
devices and provided services is the inflexibility of the 
devices being used and their accompanying interfaces. It is 
realized that a device that can provide a user with a flexible 
portal into electronic content, that is, one that can be config 
ured dynamically improves the user experience. For example, 
permitting transitions from a “lean back mode of viewing 
(imagine, for example, a person watching television from 
their couch) to a “lean forward” mode of viewing (picture, for 
example, a laptop user typing away in a word processing 
application) on a computer device improves the user experi 
ence. Further, user interfaces that are responsive to the user's 
dynamic configurations improve the user's ability to interact 
with the electronic content, from the machine itself, the inter 
net, and even from both sources. 

Accordingly, aspects and embodiments are directed to a 
graphical user interface that organizes interface elements into 
modes of content for presentation to a user. Different views of 
the modes of content are used to present the user with an 
interface that is responsive to configurations of the device and 
responsive to activity being performed by the user. Further the 
elements that comprise the graphical user interface are con 
figured to presenta Summarized view of available actions and 
content, in order to simplify user interaction. The different 
views present different organizations of the interface ele 
ments and in some example display only certain ones of the 
modes of content in order to reduce the number of options a 
user must navigate to accomplish an objective. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, a cus 
tomized user interface for a computer system with a plurality 
selectable I/O profiles configured to present computer opera 
tions to a user in a format configured to a selected I/O profile 
is provided. The user interface comprises a map based graphi 
cal user interface displayed on the computer system, the map 
based user interface comprising a plurality of views of a 
plurality of visual representations of computer content, 
wherein the computer content includes at least one of select 
able digital content, selectable computer operations and pas 
sive digital content, and the plurality of visual representations 
of computer content rendered on the computer display, 
wherein the plurality of visual representations of computer 
content include an association to a first view of the plurality of 
views, the first view including the computer content, and 
wherein the each of the plurality of visual representations is 
responsive to focus and execution, wherein execution 
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includes clicking on the visual representation, and an execu 
tion component comprising at least one computer hardware 
element configured to transition the computer system display 
between the plurality of views, wherein the execution com 
ponent further comprises a view selector component config 
ured to select one of the plurality of views for display on a 
computer system in response to a computer system configu 
ration. According to one embodiment of the present inven 
tion, the execution component is further configured to transi 
tion between the plurality of views in response to execution of 
at least one of a computer system operation, a visual repre 
sentation, a computer system configuration, and a change in 
computer system configuration. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the user interface further com 
prises a plurality of modes of content for the computer content 
rendered on the computer display. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, the plu 
rality of views are configured to organize modes of content 
into different views. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the plurality of modes of content comprise at least 
one of a web content mode, a channel content mode, a media 
content mode, an application content mode, a communication 
content mode, and a passive content mode. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the plurality of modes 
of content include a web content mode, wherein the web 
content mode is configured to display web based content for 
proximal viewing by a user. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the plurality of modes of content 
include a channel content mode, wherein the channel content 
mode is configured to display web based content for non 
proximal viewing by a user. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the plurality of modes of content 
include a media content mode, wherein the media content 
mode is configured to display media based content for non 
proximal viewing by a user mode. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the plurality of modes of con 
tent include a web content mode, wherein the web content 
mode is optimized to display web based content for proximal 
viewing by a user. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the plurality of modes of content include a channel 
content mode, wherein the channel content mode is optimized 
to display web based content for non-proximal viewing by a 
user. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
plurality of modes of content include a media content mode, 
wherein the media content mode is optimized to display 
media based content for non-proximal viewing by a user 
mode. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
media based content includes at least one of digital photos, 
digital audio files, and digital video files. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the media based con 
tent is accessed through a remote service. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the plurality of modes 
of content include a connect content mode, wherein the con 
nect content mode is configured to display computer configu 
ration operations for viewing by a user. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the plurality of modes of con 
tent include an application content mode, wherein the appli 
cation content mode is configured to display computer appli 
cations for use by a user. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, in the plurality of views includes a home view 
configured to organize a plurality of content modes. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the invention, the plurality of 
views includes a channel view configured to organize a single 
content mode. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the plurality of views includes a channel view 
configured to organize dual content modes. According to 
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4 
another embodiment of the invention, the plurality of modes 
of content include a passive content mode, wherein the pas 
sive content mode is configured to display web based content 
for non-proximal viewing without user interaction. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
plurality of modes of content include a passive content mode, 
wherein the passive content mode is optimized to display web 
based content for non-proximal viewing without user inter 
action. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the plurality of views includes a screen saver view configured 
to organize selected content modes for passive viewing. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the plu 
rality of views further comprise a first layer, wherein the first 
layer organizes computer operations, including navigation 
operations, into groups based on similar functional operation. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the first 
layer maps to groupings of lower level functionality. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the invention, the first layer 
include navigation operations maps to a seconding layer com 
prising computer operations for interacting with computer 
content. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
levels of computer functions are segregated based on proX 
imity of the operation to a source of digital content, higher 
levels including operations that navigate to lower levelopera 
tions that permit interaction with computer content. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
first layer comprises a home view and a channel view, and the 
first layer is further configured to organize and simplify 
access to lower level functions. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the visual representations comprise a 
lower layer relative to the first layer and include lower level 
functions. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the plurality of views includes a home view organizing a 
plurality of visual representations of digital content, wherein 
the home view is displayed responsive to a computer system 
configuration. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the computer system configuration comprises a 
physical positioning of the computer system about a longitu 
dinal axis of rotation. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the computer system configuration further 
comprises a physical positioning of a computer system dis 
play relative to a base of the computer system. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the home view com 
prises a header display and a body display. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the header display 
comprises a lateral bar extending from the left of the com 
puter display screen to the right of the computer display 
screen. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the user interface further comprises a search tool displayed in 
the header display, wherein the search tool is configured to 
accept search terms entered by a user and in response to 
execution, causes the computer system to navigate to a view 
of a first visual representation of digital content, wherein the 
digital content includes a search engine, and the search engine 
presents results for the search terms. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
user interface further comprises a storage component config 
ured to retain a previous view state. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the execution component is 
further configured to cause the computer system to transition 
to a previous view in response to execution of a navigation 
element by a user. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the user interface further comprises a navigation 
element disposed in the header display. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the body display is rendered 
below the header display in the display screen of the computer 
system. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
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the body comprises an organization of the plurality of visual 
representations of computer content rendered on the com 
puter display. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the user interface further comprises a display threshold 
for a screen rendered in the computer display. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the home view is con 
figured into pages based on the display of the computer sys 
tem and the display threshold. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the display threshold establishes a 
maximum number of visual representations display per page 
of the home view. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the user interface further comprises an indication 
of visual representations displayed on adjacent pages of the 
home view, wherein the indication is display within the body 
of the home view. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
user interface further comprises a nascent card displayed in 
the body of the home view, wherein the nascent card is con 
figured to permit generation of additional visual representa 
tions of digital content. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the execution component is further configured 
to execute a process for creating a visual representation in 
response to execution of the nascent card, wherein the process 
for creating a visual representation includes acts of transition 
ing to a quick access view, generating a mapping to online 
digital content, executing the mapping, and displaying a first 
view of the mapped digital content. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the user interface further com 
prises a quick access view, wherein the quick access view is 
configured to permit user generation of a mapping between 
digital content and a visual representation. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the quick access view 
permits a user to select from a display of frequently accessed 
web content to generate the mapping. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the quick access view permits a 
user to select from a display of stored bookmarks to generate 
the mapping. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the quick access view permits a user to enter a url to 
generate the mapping. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the plurality of views includes a channel view, 
and the view selector component is further responsive to an 
integrated Scroll wheel on the computer system. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the view selector com 
ponent is further configured to transition the computer system 
to the channel view in response to manipulation of the inte 
grated scroll wheel. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
channel view further comprises a channel selector. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the channel selector 
comprises a display of a sequence of visual representations 
presenting a channel content mode. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the display of the sequence of 
visual representations is responsive to manipulation of the 
integrated Scroll wheel, and manipulation of the integrated 
scroll wheel causes the computer system to render a next 
visual representation in the display of the sequence of visual 
representations. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the visual representations are responsive to execu 
tion by a selector, including a button. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the button is available in a 
plurality of computer system configurations. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the execution compo 
nent is further configured to cause the computer system to 
transition to the first view including the digital content in 
response to execution of the selector by a user. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the user interface fur 
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ther comprises a storage component configured to retain a 
current computer system configuration State. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
storage component is further configured to retain a current 
view state. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the execution component is further configured to transi 
tion the computer system display between the plurality of 
views, responsive to at least one of the current computer 
system configuration state and the current view state. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the invention, the execution 
component is configured to transition to a channel view in 
response to manipulation of an integrated Scroll wheel, when 
the computer system is in a laptop and an easel configuration. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the user 
interface further comprises a scroll wheel threshold config 
ured to require additional manipulations of the integrated 
scroll in order to cause the transition to the channel view, 
when the current computer system configuration state indi 
cates the computer system is in a laptop configuration. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
execution component is further configured to transition from 
the first view and a home view to a channel view in response 
to a change in computer system configuration state from 
laptop to easel. 

According to another embodiment, the interface discussed 
above is displayed on a portable computer configurable 
between a plurality of display modes including a closed 
mode, a laptop mode and an easel mode. The portable com 
puter further comprises a display component including a dis 
play screen, a base, a hinge assembly at least partially housed 
within the base and configured to pivotably couple the display 
component to the base, wherein the display component is 
rotatable about a longitudinal axis running along an interface 
between the display component and the base, wherein, in the 
closed mode, the display Screen is disposed Substantially 
against the base, wherein rotating the display component 
about the longitudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees 
from the closed mode configures the portable computer into 
the laptop mode, and wherein rotating the display component 
about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 
degrees from the closed mode configures the portable com 
puter into the easel mode. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, a method 
for presenting a customized user interface for a computer 
system with a plurality selectable I/O profiles to a user is 
provided. The method comprises displaying a a map based 
graphical user interface on the computer system, the act of 
displaying the map based user interface includes acts of dis 
playing a plurality of views of a plurality of visual represen 
tations of computer content, wherein the computer content 
includes at least one of selectable digital content, selectable 
computer operations and passive digital content, and display 
ing the plurality of visual representations of computer content 
rendered on the computer display, wherein the plurality of 
visual representations of computer content include an asso 
ciation to a first view of the plurality of views, the first view 
including the computer content, and wherein the each of the 
plurality of visual representations is responsive to focus and 
execution, wherein execution includes clicking on the visual 
representation, and executing, by a computer processor, a 
transition in the computer system display between the plural 
ity of views, wherein the act of executing includes an act of 
selecting one of the plurality of views for display on a com 
puter system in response to a computer system configuration. 
According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
act of executing occurs in response to an act of permitting 
execution of at least one of a computer system operation, a 
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visual representation, a computer system configuration, and a 
change in computer system configuration. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an act of displaying a plurality of modes of content 
for the computer content on the computer display, wherein the 
plurality of modes of content comprise at least one of a web 
content mode, a channel content mode, a media content 
mode, an application content mode, a communication content 
mode, and a passive content mode. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
plurality of views are configured to organize modes of content 
into different views. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the web content mode is configured to display web 
based content for proximal viewing by a user, wherein the 
channel content mode is configured to display web based 
content for non-proximal viewing by a user, wherein the 
media content mode is configured to display media based 
content for non-proximal viewing by a user mode, wherein 
the application content mode is configured to display com 
puter applications for use by a user, wherein the communica 
tion content mode is configured to display computer configu 
ration operations for viewing by a user, and wherein the 
passive content mode is configured to display web based 
content for non-proximal viewing without user interaction. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, in the 
plurality of views includes a home view and a channel view, 
and the method further comprises acts of organizing a plural 
ity of content modes into the home view; and organizing at 
least one of a single content mode and a two content modes 
into the channel view. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the plurality of views includes a screen saver 
view, and the method further comprises an act of organizing 
selected content modes for passive viewing in the screen 
saver view. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
plurality of views includes a home view, and the method 
further comprises organizing a plurality of visual representa 
tions of digital content into the home view, wherein the home 
view is displayed responsive to a computer system configu 
ration, displaying the home view in response to a compute 
system configuration, wherein the act of displaying the home 
view includes an act of displaying aheader display and abody 
display in the home view, wherein the header display com 
prises a lateral frame extending from the left of the computer 
display Screen to the right of the computer display screen, and 
wherein the body display is rendered below the header dis 
play in the display Screen of the computer system. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the computer system 
configuration comprises a physical positioning of the com 
puter system display relative to a base of the computer system 
about a longitudinal axis of rotation. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the method further comprises 
displaying a search tool in the header display, accepting entry 
of search terms through an I/O device, navigating to a view of 
a first visual representation of computer content, wherein the 
computer content includes a search engine, and the search 
engine presents results for the search terms, in response to an 
act of executing the search tool. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the method further comprises 
an act of storing in a computer memory a previous view state. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises acts of displaying a navigation 
element in the header display, permitting execution of the 
navigation element by a user, and transitioning the computer 
system display to a previous view, in response to the act of 
permitting. 
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According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 

home view further comprises at least one display page and the 
method further comprising acts of displaying the plurality of 
visual representations of computer content rendered on the 
computer display in the body display, and displaying a maxi 
mal number of visual representations in a display page of the 
home view. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the method further comprises displaying an indication of 
visual representations displayed on adjacent display pages in 
the home view, wherein the indication is displayed within the 
body of the home view. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the method further comprises acts of displaying 
a nascent card in the body of the home view, permitting 
execution functionality associated with the nascent card, and 
generating an additional visual representations of digital con 
tent in response to execution of the functionality associated 
with the nascent card. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the method further comprising act of executing 
a process for creating a visual representation in response to 
execution of the functionality associated with nascent card, 
wherein the process for creating a visual representation 
includes acts of transitioning to a quick access view, gener 
ating a mapping to online digital content, executing the map 
ping, and displaying a first view of the mapped digital con 
tent. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
method further comprises acts of displaying a quick access 
view, permitting a user to select a source of digital content in 
the quick access view, and generating a mapping between the 
Source of digital content and a visual representation in 
response to an act of selecting a source of digital content. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the plu 
rality of views includes a channel view, and the act of execut 
ing a transition occurs in response an act of activating an 
integrated Scroll wheel on the computer system. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an act of displaying a channel selector including an 
act of displaying a sequence of visual representations. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the act of 
displaying the sequence of visual representations is respon 
sive to manipulation of the integrated Scroll wheel, and the 
method further comprises and act of displaying a next visual 
representation from the sequence of visual representations, in 
response to manipulation of the integrated Scroll wheel. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises an act of storing in a computer 
memory a current computer system configuration state and a 
current view state. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the act of executing, by a computer processor, a 
transition in the computer system display the execution com 
ponent, includes an act of transitioning the computer system 
display between the plurality of views, responsive to at least 
one of the current computer system configuration state and 
the current view state. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
transition occurs to a channel view in response to manipula 
tion of an integrated Scroll wheel, when the computer system 
is in a laptop and an easel configuration. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the transition occurs from at 
least one of the first view and a home view to a channel view 
in response to a change in computer system configuration 
state from laptop to easel. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, a com 
puter-readable medium having computer-readable signals 
stored thereon that define instructions that, as a result of being 
executed by a computer, instruct the computer to perform the 
method for presenting a customized user interface for a com 
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puter system with a plurality selectable I/O profiles to a user 
as described above is provided. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, a system 
for presenting a customized user interface for a system with a 
plurality selectable I/O profiles is provided. The system com 
prises a first user interface component configured to display a 
plurality of views of a plurality of visual representations of 
computer content, wherein the computer content includes at 
least one of selectable digital content, selectable computer 
operations and passive digital content, a second user interface 
component configured to display the plurality of visual rep 
resentations of computer content on the computer display, 
wherein the plurality of visual representations of computer 
content include an association to a first view of the plurality of 
views, the first view including the computer content, and 
wherein the each of the plurality of visual representations is 
responsive to focus and execution, wherein execution 
includes clicking on the visual representation, and an execu 
tion component configured to execute a transition in the com 
puter system display between the plurality of views, wherein 
the execution component further comprises a view selector 
component act configured to select one of the plurality of 
views for display on a computer system in response to a 
computer system configuration. According to one embodi 
ment of the present invention, the execution component is 
further configured to transition between the plurality of views 
in response to execution of at least one of a computer system 
operation, a visual representation, a computer system con 
figuration, and a change in computer system configuration. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the sec 
ond user interface component is further configured to display 
a plurality of modes of content for the computer content 
rendered on the computer display, wherein the plurality of 
modes of content comprise at least one of a web content 
mode, a channel content mode, a media content mode, an 
application content mode, a communication content mode, 
and a passive content mode. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the plurality of views are configured to 
organize modes of content into different views. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the web content mode 
is configured to display web based content for proximal view 
ing by a user, wherein the channel content mode is configured 
to display web based content for non-proximal viewing by a 
user, wherein the media content mode is configured to display 
media based content for non-proximal viewing by a user 
mode, wherein the application content mode is configured to 
display computer applications for use by a user, wherein the 
communication content mode is configured to display com 
puter configuration operations for viewing by a user, and 
wherein the passive content mode is configured to display 
web based content for non-proximal viewing without user 
interaction. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
first user interface component is further configured to display 
a home view configured to organize a plurality of content 
modes, and a channel view configured to organize at least one 
of a single content mode and two content modes. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the plurality of views 
includes a screen Saver view configured to organize selected 
content modes for passive viewing. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the first user interface compo 
nent is further configured to display a home view organizing 
a plurality of visual representations of digital content, 
wherein the home view comprises a header display and a 
body display, and wherein the header display comprises a 
lateral frame extending from the left of the computer display 
screen to the right of the computer display screen, wherein the 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

45 

50 

55 

60 

65 

10 
body display is rendered below the header display in the 
display screen of the computer system. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the system is configured to 
permit selection of a computer system configuration, and the 
computer system configuration comprises a physical posi 
tioning of the computer system display relative to a base of the 
computer system about a longitudinal axis of rotation. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the first 
user interface component is further configured to display a 
search tool in the header display, wherein the search tool is 
configured to accept search terms entered by a user, and 
wherein the execution component is further configured to 
causes the computer system to navigate to a view of a first 
visual representation of digital content, wherein the digital 
content includes a search engine, and the search engine pre 
sents results for the search terms in response to execution of 
the search tool. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
system further comprises a storage component configured to 
retain a previous view state. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the execution component is further 
configured to cause the computer system to transition to a 
previous view in response to execution of a navigation ele 
ment by a user. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the first user interface component further com 
prises a display of the navigation element in the header dis 
play. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
body display comprises an organization of the plurality of 
visual representations of computer content rendered on the 
computer display, and the home view further comprises dis 
play pages in response to a display threshold establishing a 
maximal number of visual representations displayed per dis 
play page. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the home view further comprises an indication of visual 
representations displayed on adjacent display pages of the 
home view, wherein the indication is displayed within the 
body of the home view. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the second user interface component further 
comprises a nascent card displayed in the body of the home 
view, wherein the nascent card is configured to permit gen 
eration of additional visual representations of digital content. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
execution component is further configured to execute a pro 
cess for creating a visual representation in response to execu 
tion of the nascent card, wherein the process for creating a 
visual representation includes acts of transitioning to a quick 
access view, generating a mapping to online digital content, 
executing the mapping, and displaying a first view of the 
mapped digital content. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
first user interface component further comprises a quick 
access view, wherein the quick access view is configured to 
permit user generation of a mapping between digital content 
and a visual representation. According to another embodi 
ment of the invention, the plurality of views includes a chan 
nel view, and the view selector component is further respon 
sive to an integrated Scroll wheel on the computer system. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the view 
selector component is further configured to transition the 
computer system to the channel view in response to manipu 
lation of the integrated Scroll wheel. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the channel view further com 
prises a channel selector comprising a display of a sequence 
of visual representations presenting a channel content mode. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the dis 
play of the sequence of visual representations is responsive to 
manipulation of the integrated Scroll wheel, and manipulation 
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of the integrated Scroll wheel causes the computer system to 
render a next visual representation in the display of the 
sequence of visual representations. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the system further comprises a 
storage component configured to retain a current computer 
system configuration state and a current view state. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the invention, the execution 
component is further configured to transition the computer 
system display between the plurality of views, responsive to 
at least one of the current computer system configuration state 
and the current view state. According to another embodiment 
of the invention, the execution component is configured to 
transition to a channel view in response to manipulation of an 
integrated Scroll wheel, when the computer system is in a 
laptop and an easel configuration. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the execution component is 
further configured to transition from the first view and a home 
view to a channel view in response to a change in computer 
system configuration state from laptop to easel. 

According to one embodiment, a portable computer is 
configurable between various modes, including a closed 
mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode, a flat mode and a frame 
mode. The portable computer may comprise a display com 
ponent including a display screen, a base, and a hinge assem 
bly at least partially housed within the base and configured to 
pivotably couple the display component to the base. The 
display component may be rotatable about a longitudinal axis 
running along an interface between the display component 
and the base. In the closed mode, the display screen may be 
disposed Substantially against the base, and rotating the dis 
play component about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
mately 180 degrees from the closed mode may configure the 
portable computer into the laptop mode. Rotating the display 
component about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 
180 degrees axis from the closed mode may configure the 
portable computer into the easel mode. 

In one example of the portable computer, the display com 
ponent is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
mately 320 degrees from the closed mode. In another 
example, the portable computer comprises a display orienta 
tion module that displays content on the display Screen in one 
of a plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal axis. 
The orientation of the displayed content may be dependent on 
the current display mode of the portable computer, or may be 
configurable responsive to a user input. The portable com 
puter may further comprise a mode sensor which detects a 
current display mode of the portable computer, and the dis 
play orientation module may display content on the display 
screen in an orientation dependent on the current display 
mode detected by the mode sensor. Depending on the hinge 
assembly used, the longitudinal axis may comprises multiple 
parallel axes, and the hinge assembly may be configured to 
permit rotation of the display component about any of the 
multiple parallel axes to configure the portable computer 
between the plurality of display modes. 

Still other aspects, embodiments, and advantages of these 
exemplary aspects and embodiments, are discussed in detail 
below. Moreover, it is to be understood that both the foregoing 
information and the following detailed description are merely 
illustrative examples of various aspects and embodiments, 
and are intended to provide an overview or framework for 
understanding the nature and character of the claimed aspects 
and embodiments. Any embodiment disclosed herein may be 
combined with any other embodiment in any manner consis 
tent with the objects, aims, and needs disclosed herein, and 
references to “an embodiment,” “ 99 &g some embodiments.” “an 
alternate embodiment.” “various embodiments.” “one 
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embodiment' or the like are not necessarily mutually exclu 
sive and are intended to indicate that a particular feature, 
structure, or characteristic described in connection with the 
embodiment may be included in at least one embodiment. 
The appearances of Such terms herein are not necessarily all 
referring to the same embodiment. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
below with reference to the accompanying figures, which are 
not intended to be drawn to scale. The figures are included to 
provide illustration and a further understanding of the various 
aspects and embodiments, and are incorporated in and con 
stitute a part of this specification, but are not intended as a 
definition of the limits of the invention. Where technical 
features in the figures, detailed description or any claim are 
followed by references signs, the reference signs have been 
included for the sole purpose of increasing the intelligibility 
of the figures, detailed description, and/or claims. Accord 
ingly, neither the reference signs nor their absence are 
intended to have any limiting effect on the scope of any claim 
elements. In the figures, each identical or nearly identical 
component that is illustrated in various figures is represented 
by a like numeral. For purposes of clarity, not every compo 
nent may be labeled in every figure. In the figures: 

FIG. 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
computer, according to aspects of the invention, in a "laptop' 
configuration; 

FIG. 2 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a graphi 
cal user interface showing a home view, according to aspects 
of the invention; 

FIG. 3A-C are screen shots illustrating examples of a 
graphical user interface showing web page views, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
FIG. 1 in the easel mode: 

FIG. 5 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a graphi 
cal user interface showing a quick access view, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 6 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a graphi 
cal user interface showing a bookmark view, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 7A-B are screen shots illustrating examples of a 
graphical user interface showing a web page view, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 8 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a graphi 
cal user interface showing a home view, according to aspects 
of the invention; 

FIG.9 is an illustration of an example conceptual model of 
a graphical user interface, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 

FIG. 10 illustrates an example process for generating a 
visual representation of computer content, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 11 is a block diagram of one example of a portable 
computer user interface architecture, according to aspects of 
the invention; 

FIG. 12 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
graphical user interface, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 13 is a screen shot illustrating another example of a 
graphical user interface according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 14 illustrates an example of a behavior model for 
display of cards responsive to computer focus, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 15A is a screen shot of an example web card in a 
non-hover state, according to aspects of the invention; 
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FIG.15B is a screenshot of an example web cardina hover 
state, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 16 is a screen shot of examples of option views of 
cards, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable 5 
computer in the laptop mode, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 18A-E illustrate examples of a header display respon 
sive to focus and user activity, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 19 is a screen shot of a web page view including a 
toolbar, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 20A-B are screen shots illustrating examples of a 
graphical user interface showing a channel page view, accord 
ing to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 21 is a screen shot illustrating examples of a graphical 
user interface showing a channel full view, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 22 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 20 
graphical user interface showing a bookmark view, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 23 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
graphical user interface showing a channel view, according to 
aspects of the invention; 25 

FIG. 24 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
graphical user interface showing a channel page view, accord 
ing to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 25A-B are illustrations of example logical diagrams 
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15 

of the behavior for the channel view, according to aspects of 30 
the invention; 

FIG. 26 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “frame” mode, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 35 

FIG. 27 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “flat mode, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 28 is an illustration of an example logical diagram of 
the behavior for the channel view, according to aspects of the 
invention; 40 

FIG.29A-B are screen shots illustrating example graphical 
user interfaces showing a web page view with a share inter 
face, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 30 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
user interface showing a shared card, according to aspects of 45 
the invention; 

FIG. 31 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
user interface showing a shared card notification, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 32 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 50 
user interface showing a notification messages, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG.33 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
user interface showing a notification, according to aspects of 
the invention; 55 

FIG. 34 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
user interface showing a notification, according to aspects of 
the invention; 

FIG. 35 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
user interface showing a web page view with a download 60 
interface, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 36 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
interpreting executable operations into streamlined opera 
tions according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 37 is a flow diagram of one example process for 65 
permitting selection of executable operations in content 
according to aspects of the invention; 
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FIG. 38 is a flow diagram of one example process for 

transforming executable operations into remote storage 
operations according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 39 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
obtaining service access information, according to aspects of 
the invention; 

FIG. 40 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
pre-configuring a streamlined device, according to aspects of 
the invention; 

FIG. 41A is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
user interface showing a web page view with a print interface, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 41B are screen shots illustrating examples of print and 
download interfaces, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 42 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
streamlining user interactions with digital content, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 43 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
streamlining user interactions with computer content, accord 
ing to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 44 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
permitting a user to interact with computer content, according 
to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 45 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
providing consistent accessibility to computer content, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 46 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
providing consistent navigation operations to a user, accord 
ing to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 47A-B are flow diagrams of example processes for 
generating a user interface element, according to aspects of 
the invention: 

FIG. 48 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
permitting a user to select a viewing mode for a streamlined 
device, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 49A is a flow diagram of one example process for 
transitioning between a lean forward view to a lean backward 
view, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 49B is a flow diagram of one example process for 
transitioning between user views, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 50 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
organizing a plurality of views and GUI elements into a 
consistent presentation, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 51 is a block diagram of a computer system for 
streamlining user interactions with computer content accord 
ing to aspects of the invention; and 

FIGS. 52A-C are diagrams illustrating different positions 
of the portable computer of FIG. 4 in easel mode: 

FIG. 53A is an illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the laptop mode, illustrating a hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention; and 

FIG. 53B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable 
computer of FIG. 1 in the easel mode, illustrating the hinge 
assembly according to aspects of the invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

It is realized that the conventional wisdom with respect to 
Such “feature packing as discussed above Suffers from sig 
nificant flaws. Typical computer users simply can't take 
advantage of all the functionality offered, either the services 
and features offered by their own computer, or the services 
and features offered by online providers. The complexity of 
the interface (both hardware and software)hampers adoption, 
as does the volume of features offered. For example, third 
party service provides often find difficulty in subscribing new 
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users, educating existing users, and providing integration of 
feature sets for the features they provide as well as those 
offered by other service providers. 

Synergy between services providers can be found and 
exploited by even the most novice user through streamlined 
computer systems and user interface presentation. According 
to one aspect, the interplay between various third party Ser 
vices and computer features can be readily appreciated by 
even the most novice user because the various functionality 
and features sets are easily accessible through the streamlined 
access controls and consistent user interfaces. As discussed 
further below, in one example, the graphical user interface 
improves transitions from one service to another, through a 
consistent view of available content. A user is able to navigate 
easily and quickly from one content provider to another using 
the organized view. The elements that comprise the view 
further facilitate navigation and transition by, for example, 
retaining state information and in another example by 
remaining persistent to the view. 

According to another aspect, streamlining the computer 
system/device the user interacts with includes establishing a 
first set of I/O devices that a user needs to operate and pro 
viding that first set of I/O devices as a physical configuration 
of the device. Additionally, providing the user the ability to 
change from the first set of I/O devices, a first I/O profile, to 
another at will improves the user experience and permits the 
user to dynamically select a preferred I/O profile best suited to 
the user's present need. According to one embodiment, user 
selection includes transitioning from a lean back mode to a 
lean forward mode and vice versa. In one embodiment, the 
user's computer device is configured to have multiple I/O 
profiles that can be selected by physically manipulating the 
orientation of the computer device itself. 

According to another aspect, streamlining user interactions 
with the computer system/device includes representing com 
puter based content in visual representations that render com 
puter operations/behavior in a consistent manner. The visual 
representations are adapted to permit easy user interaction 
even upon selection of a first I/O profile or the change in 
selection of an I/O profile. According to one embodiment, the 
visual representations are rendered as cards, as discussed in 
more detail below. Different types of cards may be employed 
to render different types of available content. For example, 
web based content, may be rendered as a web card (e.g. FIG. 
2, 206) that is associated with a mapping to web content. 
Some web cards map directly to web pages and in response to 
selection of the web card the computer device executes the 
mapping and displays a web view of the content. Other cards 
may be used to provide interactive displays selectable by a 
user. In another example, system operations are displayed as 
system cards (e.g. FIG. 2, 212), which are associated with 
mappings to system operations, for example communications 
configurations, and may comprise a settings card, among 
other system options. Another type of card includes a channel 
card (e.g. FIG. 2, 204 configured to stream web based content 
in a manner that allows for Summarization of content, while 
still providing the ability to fully appreciate the summarized 
COntent. 

Those skilled in the art will appreciate that previous 
attempts have been made to present Summary views of avail 
able content. However, known Summarized content typically 
Suffers from significant flaws. For example Summarization of 
web based content simply reduces the display size of the 
information in the content. With respect to news headlines, 
for example, this often prevents a user from being able to 
appreciate the Summarize content. Quite simply truncating a 
headline prevents the user from understanding the context of 
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the portion of the headline s/he is able to read. In other 
examples, headlines are displayed to Such a reduce size that 
an average computer user simply cannot read or appreciate 
them. Using channel cards according to aspects and embodi 
ments, Summarized content may be presented in a manner 
that permits appreciation and interaction with the Summa 
rized content itself. In another example, channel cards are 
configured to present a streamlined view that cannot only be 
appreciated and interacted, but may be transitioned from one 
mode of viewing to another without loss of the ability to 
appreciate and interact with the streamlined view. 

According to one aspect, streamlining of the user device 
and streamlining of the user interface provided in Such 
devices leads to simplified interaction between a user and 
features. The streamlining may impact not only features of 
the system, but features provided by services accessed by the 
system. Streamlined activity leads directly to better adoption, 
understanding and integration of both new and old features 
available to users. The consistency of user experience even 
with third party service providers, for example, fosters famil 
iarity not only with a particular user and his/her interactions 
with a particular device, but also with other users of the 
same/similar device. A common experience may be created 
for multiple users, fostering a community experience. 
According to one example, providing a common experience 
includes establishing a global profile for a user of a stream 
lined device. The global profile, in some examples, is retained 
in remote storage, and accessed upon start up of any stream 
lined device. The global profile permits the user's experience 
to be consistent even across multiple streamlined devices. In 
one example, configurations and customizations are retained 
in remote storage; changes on one device may be written to 
remote storage, propagating changes across multiple stream 
lined devices that access the remote storage. Thus a common 
experience is also provided across multiple devices. 

According to another aspect, the common experience may 
also include a community aspect. The community aspect 
includes sharing of content between users, sharing of content 
and configurations, sharing of content, configurations, and 
customizations, among many options. In particular, sharing 
may involve the transmission of user interface elements to 
other users. In one example, a user may share a card and any 
of its configurations with another user. Access to the shared 
user interface elements, in some embodiments, facilitates 
communal computer usage. In one example, a first user may 
be watching media on their streamlined device, another user 
known to the first user, may receive a user interface element 
that retains information related to the accessed content and 
information related to the present context. That is for the first 
user watching a movie, the first user may share the user 
interface element through which S/he is accessing the movie, 
and permit the another user not only to watch the movie, but 
to take up the movie at the same point in time, so in essence, 
they get to enjoy the movie together. Content and context 
retention by user interface elements that can be shared pro 
vides unique advantages to the users of the streamlined 
devices. 

According to another aspect, various operations provided 
on conventional systems are adapted for streamlined process 
ing. In one example, operations that require large amounts of 
computer storage are transformed in remote storage requests. 
In one embodiment, a streamlined device is configured to 
identify local storage request and transform them into a stor 
age request to an on-line service provider identified in a user 
and/or device profile. In another embodiment, the system 
prompts a user to identify a service provider in response to a 
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local request. Various operations may be transformed, includ 
ing download and print operations, among others. 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods and 
apparatus discussed herein are not limited in application to 
the details of construction and the arrangement of compo 
nents set forth in the following description or illustrated in the 
accompanying figures. The methods and apparatus are 
capable of implementation in other embodiments and of 
being practiced or of being carried out in various ways. 
Examples of specific implementations are provided hereinfor 
illustrative purposes only and are not intended to be limiting. 
In particular, acts, elements and features discussed in connec 
tion with any one or more embodiments are not intended to be 
excluded from a similar role in any other embodiments. 

Also, the phraseology and terminology used herein is for 
the purpose of description and should not be regarded as 
limiting. Any references to embodiments or elements or acts 
of the systems and methods herein referred to in the singular 
may also embrace embodiments including a plurality of these 
elements, and any references in plural to any embodiment or 
element or act herein may also embrace embodiments includ 
ing only a single element. References in the singular or plural 
form are not intended to limit the presently disclosed systems 
or methods, their components, acts, or elements. The use 
herein of “including.” “comprising.” “having.” “containing.” 
“involving, and variations thereof is meant to encompass the 
items listed thereafter and equivalents thereofas well as addi 
tional items. References to "or may be construed as inclusive 
so that any terms described using "or may indicate any of a 
single, more than one, and all of the described terms. Any 
references to front and back, left and right, top and bottom, 
and upper and lower are intended for convenience of descrip 
tion, not to limit the present systems and methods or their 
components to any one positional or spatial orientation. 
Device Examples and Configuration Options 

Various aspects, including the integration between the user 
interface, its views, and navigation options are further illus 
trated in the user device itself. According to one embodiment, 
the user interface and the visual representations that comprise 
the interface are configured to be responsive to the physical 
configuration of the user device. In one example, the view 
presented to user is configured to be responsive to the mode/ 
configuration of the device. 

According to one aspect, Systems and methods are pro 
vided for simplifying the presentation of multi-media fea 
tures and options into an integrated and streamlined presen 
tation format. Streamlining presentation includes reducing 
the number of options that a user must navigate/configure in 
order to take advantage of new systems and features, simpli 
fying the process of adoption and education. In one embodi 
ment a system is provided with only the physical components 
necessary to achieve streamlined presentation of both oper 
ating system features and integration of third party services. 
For example, a streamlined hardware device provides for (in 
comparison to typical desktop and laptop systems) a reduced 
user input platform as a first I/O profile, comprising in one 
configuration a scroll wheel and a button interface. Other I/O 
profiles are available for user selection by manipulation of the 
device itself. In one embodiment, an easel mode presents the 
user with the first I/O profile and by rotating the computer 
device about a longitudinal axis; the user may select a second 
I/O profile, including a keyboard. The transition from one I/O 
profile to another may also cause the computer device to alter 
its display. In one example, the user interface provided to the 
user is responsive to selection of device mode and/or selection 
of I/O profile. 
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It is to be appreciated that reducing the number of I/O 

devices achieves simplicity of design and ease of operation by 
the user, and at the same time may increase the complexity of 
the graphical user interfaces needed to Support interaction 
with systems and third parties that anticipate, rely on, or 
expect additional I/O devices. Streamlining device operation 
by the user is balanced against Sophistication of user the 
interface required to enable user interaction with the same 
features used with additional I/O devices. According to one 
embodiment, the user interface layer provides simplified 
accessibility based on the device's I/O platform, and for some 
embodiments, the user interface layer is responsive to device 
configurations that change the device's I/O capabilities. In 
other embodiments, the user interface is responsive to 
changes in the device's mode. In some examples, changes in 
device mode and changes I/O profile will occur together, 
however, in other examples a change in mode or a change in 
I/O profile will not require a corresponding change in profile 
or mode respectively. 
One example of a streamlined device includes a portable 

computer that is configurable between a laptop mode (in 
which the portable computer has a conventional laptop 
appearance) and an easel mode in which the base of the 
computer and its display component stand uprightforming an 
inverted “V” as discussed further herein. Certain aspects and 
embodiments are directed to a portable computer that is con 
figurable between different operating modes, including a lap 
top mode (in which the portable computer has a conventional 
laptop appearance), a flat mode, a frame mode, and an easel 
mode in which the base of the computer and its display 
component stand vertically forming an inverted “V” as dis 
cussed further herein. Reference to modes of the computer, 
modes of the device are intended to include the physical 
configuration of the portable computer/device. 
The portable computer is capable of different display for 

mats and functionality in the different modes, and includes a 
graphical user interface that may work seamlessly with the 
computer hardware to provide a unified, comfortable, holistic 
user experience. In particular, the portable computer may 
provide access to a wide array of functions, both those tradi 
tionally provided by computing devices and those tradition 
ally provided by other passive information devices. For 
example, the hardware and Software, including the graphical 
user interface, of the portable computer may be focused 
toward providing access to entertainment media, such as 
audio and video (e.g., playing music, streaming video, View 
ing photographs, etc.), email, and internet, while also provid 
ing state-of-the-art computer processing capability. 

Referring to FIG. 1, there is illustrated one example of a 
portable computer according to aspects of the invention. In 
FIG.1, the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the “laptop' 
mode, with the display component 102 inclined at a viewing 
angle from the base 104. The display component 102 is piv 
otably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge assembly (not 
shown) that allows the display component to be rotated with 
respect to the base. The hinge assembly may include a single 
or multiple hinges, which may be any of a variety of hinge 
types, including, but not limited, to single-axis hinges, mul 
tiple-axis hinges, geared hinges, etc. In one example, the 
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be 
rotated (or tilted) about alongitudinal axis 101 running along 
an interface between the display component and the base 104, 
as illustrated in FIG. 1 and discussed further below. The base 
104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal electronic compo 
nents (not shown). Such as a central processing unit, memory, 
and other components necessary to operate the portable com 
puter, as known to those skilled in the art. In some embodi 
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ments, the base 104 may also include a touch pad 108 or 
trackball (not shown) for receiving user commands, as known 
to those skilled in the art. 

Still referring to FIG. 1, the display component 102 
includes a display Screen 110, and may also include a camera 
112, microphone 114, and infrared receiver 116, as discussed 
further below. It is to be appreciated that the locations of the 
camera 112, microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG. 1, and may be 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 and/ 
or base 104, as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. 
The display component 102 may also include cushions 118 
that provide soft contact points between the base 104 and the 
display component 102 when the portable computer is closed. 
In one example, the cushions 118 are made of rubber. How 
ever, it is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited, 
and the cushions 118 may comprise materials other than 
rubber, including, for example, a polymer, felt, or other Suit 
able materials as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. 

Referring to FIG. 4, there is illustrated an example of the 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode. To 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode (or 
closed position) into the easel mode, the display component 
102 may be folded away from the base 104, in the same 
direction as to open the computer (i.e., to configure the com 
puter from the closed position into the laptop mode) Such that 
the base 104 and the display component 102 forman inverted 
“V” shape with the bottom of the base and the back of the 
display component face another, as illustrated in FIG. 4. In the 
easel mode, the display screen 110 is visible and accessible on 
one side of the portable computer 100 and the keyboard 106 
(not shown in FIG. 4) is visible and accessible on the other 
side. 
As illustrated in FIG. 4, in one embodiment, the portable 

computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con 
trols, including a volume control button 294 and a mute 
button 296. In one example, the volume control button 294 
may be a rocker Switch that allows a user to easily increase or 
decrease the Volume of audio played through the speakers 
128. When the user presses the Volume control button 294, a 
Volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display 
screen 110, to provide a visual indication of the amount by 
which the volume is being increased or decreased. Similarly, 
pressing the mute button 296 may cause a visual indication 
that the volume is muted to appear on the display screen 110. 

According to one embodiment, when the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual display 
on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 degrees 
Such that the information appears “right-way-up, even 
through the display Screen is upside-down compared to when 
the portable computer is in the laptop mode. Thus, a user may 
simply “flip' the portable computer 100 into the easel mode 
and immediately be able to comfortably view information on 
the display Screen 110, without having to access display 
screen controls to adjust the orientation of the visual display. 
In one embodiment, the portable computer 100 includes an 
orientation (or mode) sensor that is configured to detect 
whether the portable computer is in the laptop mode or the 
easel mode, and to adjust the display accordingly. The orien 
tation sensor may be incorporated into the base component 
104, for example, underneath the keyboard 106, or into the 
display component. In one example, locating the orientation 
sensor in the display component 102, rather than the base 104, 
may provide more robust detection and therefore, may be 
presently preferred in some embodiments. The orientation 
sensor may be used to determine a precise relative orientation 
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of the base component 104 with respect to the display com 
ponent 102, or vice versa, for example, to determine whether 
the device is in the laptop mode, easel mode, or Some point in 
between the two modes. In one example, the orientation sen 
sor includes an accelerometer whose output is fed to the 
computer operating system (or to dedicated logic circuitry) 
which then triggers a display inversion as appropriate. 

According to one embodiment an accelerometer is used to 
detect a configuration of the portable computer, although, it is 
to be appreciated that other sensors and devices may be used 
to determine a configuration. According to another embodi 
ment, the portable computer may include integrated “naviga 
tion' hardware that allows a user to easily and comfortably 
control various features and functions of the portable com 
puter, to manipulate content displayed on the portable com 
puter, and to interact with visual representations of content 
display in a user interface. For example, as discussed above, 
the portable computer 100 may comprise a scroll wheel 132 
that allows a user to control, adjust and/or select various 
functionality of the portable computer. According to another 
embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be used to provide 
“hardware navigation' through information, such as menus, 
icons, etc., displayed on the display Screen 110, as discussed 
further below with reference to FIG. 17. A common display 
configuration used in conventional computers is a "desktop' 
view in which multiple icons representing links to various 
programs or applications are displayed over a background 
image. Navigation may be conventionally performed using a 
mouse, touchpad or trackball, as known to those skilled in the 
art. 

According to another embodiment, the portable computer 
100 includes a streamlined graphical user interface that Sup 
ports 'map' navigation. The map user interface provides a 
clear overview of the entire computing environment and 
searching capability within the environment that may be 
accessed using the Scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, one or 
navigation buttons 166, 168 that may be provided on the base 
104 of the portable computer 100 (button 166) and/or in the 
keyboard 106 (button 168), illustrated in FIG. 17. In one 
embodiment, the map mode of navigation is a hierarchical 
mode that reduces the number of items to select amongst at 
any stage of navigation, thereby facilitating user access with 
the scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation button(s) 
166, 168. Of course, it is to be appreciated that the map user 
interface may also be navigated using conventional tools, 
Such as a trackball, touchpad, mouse or arrow keys. 

Referring to FIG. 11, there is illustrated a block diagram of 
one example of an architecture of the portable computer 
including a map user interface. The user interface “home' 
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172. 
In the illustrated example, the home screen 170 contains five 
modes of content 172; however, it is to be appreciated that the 
home screen may include more or fewer than five modes of 
content and that the modes of content may differ from the 
examples discussed below. According to one example, the 
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170 may 
include “media” 172a, “connect” 172b, “web” 172c, “appli 
cations’ 172d, and “channels’ 172e. Using the map user 
interface, information, programs, features and applications 
may be grouped into the various modes of content 172. By 
selecting any mode of content 172, for example, by using the 
scroll wheel 132 and/or navigation buttons 166, 168, as dis 
cussed further below, the user may access the content orga 
nized within that mode. 

For example, the media mode 172a may provide access to 
a media player to play, view, search and organize media Such 
as music, video, photos, etc. The connect mode 172b may 
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provide access to features such as, for example, email, Voice 
over-IP instant messaging, etc., and the web mode 172c may 
provide access to internet browsing and searching. The appli 
cation mode 172d may provide access to, for example, com 
puter applications or programs. Such as word processor, 
spreadsheet, calculator, etc. In one example, these applica 
tions or programs may be provided as web-based services 
rather than programs or applications residing on the portable 
computer 100. The channels mode 172e may provide access 
to different functionality of the portable computer, with the 
different functions or features defined as different channels. 
For example, a channel may include an alarm clock channel in 
which the portable computer is configured to display a clock 
and can be programmed to activate an alarm, e.g., a Sound, 
piece of music, etc., at a predetermined time. Another 
example of a channel may include a “photo frame channel in 
which the portable computer may be configured to display a 
pre-selected image or set of images, etc. Another example of 
a channel is a “television' channel, in which the portable 
computer is configured to stream Internet television. In one 
example, a user may configure particular Internet television 
channels (e.g., a news channel, a movie channel, a home and 
garden channel, etc.) into Sub-channels within the channels 
mode of content 172(e). Some or all of the modes of content 
172 may access, retrieve and/or store information on the 
Internet 174. 

Typically streamlined devices are integrated with remote 
content storage and/or access, shown at 174. The integration 
may be provided through third party service providers, in one 
example photo service FLICKR is integrated with various 
aspects of the device and/or the device's user interface to 
provide seamless access to photo content stored by the third 
party provider. The integration with remote storage services 
permits reduced storage capacity on the user device, for 
example, a portable computer. Other services may be inte 
grated including for example GOGGLE DOCS, for word 
processing and other office related applications provided on 
line. Reducing and/or eliminating the need for non Volatile 
memory in the computer system is advantageous in that the 
device itself may be reduced in complexity and any associ 
ated cost. In some embodiments, a streamlined device does 
not incorporate a hard disk drive for storage, providing for 
any local storage requirement through RAM and Flash 
memory. 

According to one embodiment, the different modes of con 
tent 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the display 
screen 110, as illustrated in FIG.12. The following discussion 
of various features, including hardware navigation through 
the map user interface may refer primarily to the display 
configuration illustrated in FIG. 12. However, it is to be 
appreciated that the invention is not so limited, and the modes 
of content may be displayed in other configurations, includ 
ing, for example, a “desktop' and icon configuration, a "dash 
board' type display, as illustrated in FIG. 13, or another 
configuration, as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. Similarly, navigation is discussed below primarily with 
reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navigation buttons 166, 
168; however, it is to be appreciated that navigation may also 
be accomplished using any of the conventional tools dis 
cussed above or known to those skilled in the art. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

scroll wheel 132 and, optionally, the navigation buttons 166, 
168 may be used to navigate the user interface. Referring 
again to FIG. 12, Scrolling the Scroll wheel may sequentially 
highlight different ones of the modes of content 172. In one 
example, the highlighting may be achieved by changing the 
color of the selected mode, and/or by providing a visual 
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indicator, such as a colored bar 176. A highlighted mode 172 
may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel, thereby bring 
ing up a new page' or screen on the user interface corre 
sponding to the selected mode. Once within a selected mode 
of content 172, the scroll wheel may similarly be used to 
select particular functions, features or applications within 
that mode. In one embodiment, the default action for the 
scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the portable 
computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel mode. For 
example, in easel mode, the default action for the scroll wheel 
may be channel selection within the channels mode 172(e). In 
one embodiment, the scroll wheel 132 may be depressible as 
well as scrollable. Thus, pressing the scroll wheel 132, as 
illustrated in FIG. 4, may allow further control, such as, for 
example, selecting a channel onto which the user has scrolled, 
or “play” and “pause of audio or video being played through 
the portable computer 100. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, one or 

more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with the 
scroll wheel. In particular, in one embodiment, the navigation 
button(s) may be used to change the action of the scroll wheel. 
As discussed above, in one example, the default action of the 
scroll wheel is Volume control. This action may be changed 
by pressing the navigation button 166, as illustrated in FIG.4, 
for example, from Volume control to menu navigation in the 
user interface, and vice versa. 

According to one embodiment, the effect of pressing the 
navigation button 166 may vary depending on active the 
mode of content of the portable computer 100. For example, 
if a user is in the media mode using a photo viewing applica 
tion, pressing the navigation button 166 may change the 
action of the scroll wheel 132 from mode navigation to slide 
show controls for the photos. When the navigation button 166 
is pressed, an control indicator box (similar to the Volume 
indicator box 162 discussed above with reference to FIG. 14) 
may appear containing different actions for the photo slide 
show, such as “play.” “next,” “back.” “skip,” “full screen 
view.” etc., and scrolling the scroll wheel 132 may allow a 
user to select one of these actions. Pressing the navigation 
button 166 again may return the scroll wheel action to menu 
navigation, to allow the user to, for example, move to a 
different feature or application within the active mode, or to 
select a different mode. 
As can be seen in FIG.4, the navigation button 166 may be 

easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the easel 
mode, providing a convenient navigation tool for this con 
figuration. A similar navigation button 168 may be provided 
on the keyboard 106, as illustrated in FIG. 17. In one example, 
the functionality of the two navigation buttons 166, 168 may 
be the same, with the different locations providing easy, com 
fortable access in the different configuration modes (i.e., lap 
top or easel) of the portable computer 100. Thus, a user may 
use either navigation button 166 or navigation button 168, 
depending on personal preference. In another example, the 
two navigation buttons may have different functionality. For 
example, the navigation button 166 may be used to alter the 
action of the scroll wheel 132, as discussed above, while the 
navigation button 168 is used to navigate “up’ or “down' a 
level within the map user interface. For example, pressing the 
navigation button 168 while within a given mode of content 
may allow the user to “back up' to the home screen; or 
pressing the navigation button 168 while within a selected 
channel (in the channel mode of the content 172e) may allow 
the user to “back-up' to the channel mode main page. 

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the 
functionality of the navigation buttons 166, 168 is possible, as 
would be recognized by those skilled in the art, and the above 
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examples are given for illustration only and are not intended 
to be limiting. In addition, any functions described with ref 
erence to one navigation button (166 or 168) may be instead 
(or additionally) implemented with the other navigation but 
ton. In one example, the function of the navigation buttons 
166, 168 may vary depending on whether the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the laptop mode or the easel 
mode. For example, only the navigation button 166 may be 
active in the easel mode, and only the navigation button 168 
may be active in the laptop mode. Alternatively, both naviga 
tion buttons 166, 168 may be usable in either the laptop mode 
or the easel mode, but their functionality may vary. For 
example, when the portable computer 100 is in the easel 
mode, the default action for the navigation button 166 may be 
channel selection whereas the default action for the naviga 
tion button 168 is to access the “home' screen. Furthermore, 
the portable computer 100 is not limited to the use of two 
navigation buttons and may instead comprise only a single 
navigation button or more than two navigation buttons, any of 
which may be disposed in the locations described above (e.g., 
on the rounded portion 120 of the base 104 or on the keyboard 
106), or in other locations on the portable computer. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, the 

function or display content and/or display orientation of the 
portable computer may vary when the portable computer is 
configured from the laptop mode into the easel mode, or vice 
Versa. For example, as discussed above, when the portable 
computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual 
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 
degrees Such that the information appears “right-way-up.” 
even through the display screen is upside-down compared to 
when the portable computer is in the laptop mode. In another 
example, for at least some activities within at least some 
modes of content (e.g., viewing a photograph or video), when 
the portable computer 100 is configured into the easel mode, 
the display may automatically adjust to “full screen view’ 
(i.e., the displayed image or video is displayed on the full 
screen size, rather than in a window) to allow for comfortable 
viewing. 

In addition, as discussed above, the ability to configure the 
portable computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the easel 
mode provides enhanced functionality. For example, when 
the portable computer 100 is not being actively used, the user 
may configure the portable computer into the easel mode, and 
program the portable computer to act as a digital photo frame, 
displaying one or more photos of the user's choice. In the 
easel mode, the portable computer 100 may occupy a smaller 
footprint on a Surface than in the laptop or closed modes 
because the base 104 and display component 102 are upright, 
as illustrated in FIGS. 4 and 5. In addition, because the por 
table computer can act as a passive information and/or enter 
tainment device, such as a photo frame or clock, as discussed 
above, the portable computer may provide a useful function 
even when not being actively used by the user, and may do so 
(in the easel mode) without taking up much surface area. 

It is to be appreciated that although the portable computer 
100 is often referred to as being in either the laptop mode or 
easel mode, other modes or configurations are also possible. 
For example, as discussed above, because the portable com 
puter 100 can be configured from the closed position, through 
the laptop mode into the easel mode by rotating the display 
component 102, a number of configurations are possible in 
between “true laptop mode and “true’ easel mode. Each 
different configuration may invoke different functionality 
and provide a user with a different aspect of a graphical user 
interface. 
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In another example, the portable computer 100 may be 

configured into a “frame” mode, as illustrated in FIG. 26, in 
which the portable computer is placed on a surface 212 with 
the keyboard 106 “face down' on the surface 212 and the 
display 110 facing upward. In the frame mode, the display 
component 102 may beata similar orientation, and angle 134, 
with respect to the base component 104 as in the easel mode. 
However, rather than the base component 104 and display 
component 102 being oriented vertically with respect to the 
surface 212, as in the easel mode (in which the portable 
computer forms an inverted “V” as discussed above), in the 
frame mode, the base component 104 may lie flat on the 
surface 212, as shown in FIG. 26. In one example, software 
and/or hardware protection may be provided for the keyboard 
to prevent keys from being pressed (or to prevent the portable 
computer from responding to pressed keys) when the portable 
computer is in the frame mode. 

Similarly, referring to FIG. 27, there is illustrated another 
configuration of the portable computer 100, referred to as the 
“flat mode. In the flat mode, the display component 102 may 
be rotated (or opened) to approximately 180 degrees with 
respect to the base component 104, such that the base com 
ponent and display component lay flat on a Surface, with the 
keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed, as shown in 
FIG. 27. Unlike the easel and frame modes, in which the 
keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible, in the 
flat mode, the keyboard is accessible and usable. In addition, 
as discussed above, the visual display on the display Screen 
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort 
able viewing of information by persons located in different 
positions relative to the base component 104 or display com 
ponent 102. The visual display on the display screen 110 may 
also be manually adjusted by a user using, for example, the 
keyboard 106, touch pad 108 or mouse (not shown), scroll 
wheel 132 or navigation buttons (not shown). For example, if 
a user (located at position A) wishes to display information 
for a person located opposite the user (at position B), the 
visual display may be rotated (automatically or manually) 180 
degrees such that the information appears "right-way-up.” to 
the person at location B, even through the display screen 110 
is upside-down for that person. Similarly, in another example, 
the visual display may be rotated (automatically or manually) 
90 degrees Such that the information appears “right-way-up.” 
for a person at location C. In one example, a user can “toggle 
the visual display among various orientations. For example, a 
user at location A may have the visual display facing them 
selves while using the keyboard 106 or other controls to 
change or access information on the display, then toggle the 
display orientation 180 or 90 degrees to display the informa 
tion for persons at locations B or C. 

According to another aspect, System and interface stream 
lining may be employed with devices of multiple configura 
tions. In some embodiments, multiple configurations include 
a traditional configuration, for example, a configuration simi 
lar to a laptop device, and also include new configurations, for 
example, an easel mode. Some examples of streamlined 
devices have the ability to change between traditional con 
figurations and other configurations. The change between 
configurations may change the I/O profile of the device and 
hence impact the user's interaction with the device itself and 
any content displayed on the device. In one embodiment, the 
user interface is responsive to changes in configuration. In 
another embodiment, the user interface is responsive to 
changes in I/O profile. 

According to another aspect, the streamlining of the user's 
multi-media experience incorporates the device the user uses 
to interact with multi-media Sources, whether the Sources are 
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on-line or provided by the device itself. Streamlining of the 
device includes developing consistent user interfaces for the 
user to access all features presented. The device's graphical 
user interface layer is customized to the I/O interfaces pro 
vided. In one example a device is provided in the form of a 
portable computer configurable between a laptop mode (in 
which the portable computer has a conventional laptop 
appearance) and an easel mode in which the base of the 
computer and its display component stand uprightforming an 
inverted “V” a closed mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode, a 
flat mode and a frame mode. According to one embodiment, 
each of the display modes may employ different I/O profiles. 
Some of the aspects may be better understood through the 

use of examples demonstrating the interactions between a 
system, the system user, the interfaces provided, and the 
accessed content. The user experience is improved through 
simplification of the interactions with the user device—de 
pending on the device's configuration the only activity 
required by the user may be to use a scroll wheel to identify 
selection and abutton to execute the selection. Moreover, the 
user experience is enhanced by permitting the user to select 
the I/O profile S/he is most comfortable with and even select 
multiple I/O profiles or device configurations depending 
upon the context presented to the user. It is to be appreciated 
that adaptations to the user interface layer that maintain con 
sistency while permitting different I/O profiles should be 
viewed as part of the invention. 
The examples of user interactions are provided for the 

purposes of illustration and should not be viewed as limiting 
the invention to the interactions described, nor the specific 
presentations discussed, and it is to be appreciated that other 
interactions are appropriate and even desired in different cir 
cumstances. Additionally, different configurations of the 
device itself will provide for different user interactions, for 
example, based on additional hardware not available in 
another configuration. 
Examples of User Experience 

In one example, some typical user interactions with elec 
tronic content are illustrated. The user interactions occur in 
accordance with various aspects of the systems and methods 
for streamlining user interaction with electronic content. In 
Some embodiments, the streamlined device is adapted to 
accommodate multiple users. In one embodiment, the user 
identifies him/herself to the device by entering a user name 
and password. Once the user name and password is accepted 
the user may begin interacting with the device, and if desired 
through the device to other content. According to another 
embodiment, the device may display a “users' screen, incor 
porating a visual representation for each user. In response to 
selection by the user of the visual representation the user is 
identified. Identification may optionally include a password 
challenge/response after selection of the visual representa 
tion. In some embodiments, a camera is available through the 
user device, and the user's visual representation may be gen 
erated by taking a Snapshot of the user. 

In one embodiment, that act of identifying includes access 
to remote storage associated with the device and/or the user. 
Remote storage is accessed to retrieve any global profiles that 
may exist for the user, and more specifically, any changes that 
may have been made to the user's global profile. In some 
embodiments, a local copy of any profile is stored on the 
device, and the remotely stored profile is used to identify any 
changes. Changes to profiles may be copied to the remote 
location or changes in the profile may be retrieved from the 
remote location. In one example, the local and remote profiles 
are associated with a revision date. The most recently revised 
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profile may be used as the most up to date profile, with a 
different version receiving modification as necessary to cor 
respond. 

In one alternative, a remote profile may be maintained for 
the device itself. In another, the device profile may contain 
information on a number of users. In some embodiments, 
remote access is used to retrieve configurations and/or set 
tings maintained for any of the device, the user, and groups of 
users, alone or in combination. According to one aspect, 
remote storage and/or remote access to user configuration 
comprises one element of an example system for streamlining 
user interaction with electronic content. 
Once a user is identified (identification may occur by 

default if only one user has accessed a particular device) the 
graphical user interface presents a default view of the elec 
tronic content available on the device. In one embodiment, the 
view presented is responsive to the configuration of the 
device. According to some embodiments, device configura 
tions may be determined using a sensor embedded in the 
device. In one example, a sensor is used to provide a signal 
and from the signal the device's orientation is determined. 
Alternative methodologies are employed in other embodi 
ments for detecting and determining a device's configuration. 
In one alternative example I/O devices may be enabled/dis 
abled based on the physical configuration of the device. For 
example, during a transition from laptop mode to easel mode, 
various I/O devices that become inaccessible may be deacti 
vated. Determining what I/O devices are still active and/or 
available permits identification of the device's configuration. 
In other embodiments, an accelerometer may be used to 
detect a device configuration. In one example, a device may 
be a portable laptop computer. The portable laptop computer 
may have multiple configurations, including a laptop mode, 
an easel mode, a frame mode, a flat mode and a closed mode. 

In the illustrated example, FIG. 1, the user device is con 
figured in a laptop mode, and has an I/O profile (a set of 110 
devices) that one would normally associate with a laptop 
computer. In this example, the 110 profile includes, in some 
embodiments, a keyboard, a touchpad, buttons, webcam, and 
a scroll wheel. The graphical user interface is configured to 
present a default view that provides the user with contextual 
options. n this example the present context for the user 
includes “lean forward’ viewing and the computer operations 
one would typically associate with user of a laptop. Other 
contexts arise based on configuration of the device (for 
example in Easel mode) and the computer tasks the user 
wishes to perform. For an identified context a default is pro 
vided for the user eliminating the requirement of making 
configuration choices, however, the user is still permitted to 
access the configuration directly to customize it. 
Shown in FIG. 2 is an example of a page of the devices 

home view (200). The home view organizes user interface 
elements into a mapped based presentation and separates the 
presentation into logical units based on a single displayed 
screen, i.e. a page. One function provided by the home view 
is to serve as an organization of interface elements and/or 
navigation tools that maps visual representations of available 
content into a plurality of views of the available content. The 
home view is also configured to present Summarized views of 
information to the user, so as to reduce the volume of infor 
mation that a user needs to process in order to access content. 
In some embodiments, the mapped based interface is also 
configured to group like computer operations into a section of 
the map. Typically, grouped selectable computer content 
includes mappings to other groupings of lower level function 
ality. For example, high level navigation options are, typi 
cally, first presented to the user. The high level navigation 
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options provide a Summarized view of the available content, 
making content based selections easy to appreciate and 
accomplish. A user selects a high level navigation operation 
to navigate to more detailed operations. In some embodi 
ments, the more detailed operations are grouped based on a 
mode of content. Modes of content may include for example, 
media, channel, connection, application, and web, among 
other options. 

According to one embodiment, high level functions and 
low level functions are segregated based on proximity to 
displays of Sources of digital content. For example, a visual 
representation that maps to the Source of digital content is 
included in a lower level of functionality than the view that 
organizes the presentation of the visual representation. A 
view that presents the digital content source itself, is grouped 
at a lower level than the visual representation that maps to the 
digital content Source. In another embodiment, interfaces that 
provide navigation operations to digital content form a layer 
of the graphical user interface, and interfaces that provide 
interaction options to digital content form a lower layer. In 
one embodiment, the home view includes maximal display 
thresholds configured to improve the ability of the user to 
absorb the information presented. In some embodiments, a 
maximal number of visual representations per screen is set. In 
one example, the maximal number of visual representations is 
used to define a GUI page. In another example, the maximal 
number of visual representations is associated with a maxi 
mal number of full view visual representations, and the page 
is configured to include portions of views of other visual 
representations available on adjacent pages. A computer 
operation that would cause the computer device to exceed the 
maximal number results in the creation of a new display page. 
The home view is organized into as many pages are required 
in order to maintain the maximal threshold of display items. 

Typically, the home view is configurable by the user. New 
items may be added, existing items may be moved and/or 
removed based on user selection. The home view further 
comprises some visual representations that can not be 
removed. Commonly requested system operations have 
visual representation displayed on the home view that can not 
be deleted. According to one embodiment, a user may reor 
ganize the display but not remove system operations. For 
example, visual representations that map to system opera 
tions (e.g. communication configuration and hardware con 
figuration) cannot be removed from the home view. Addition 
ally, some system operations will always be displayed 
through the home view regardless of frequency of use. Posi 
tioning of a visual representation is also organized and man 
aged in the home view. Preferably, organization and/or man 
agement occurs automatically based on default settings 
selected for the user. Alternatively, organization and/or man 
agement may occur dynamically. For example, a user may 
make changes to organization and/or management settings on 
the fly. In another embodiment, default settings control orga 
nization and/or management, and an interface is provided to 
permit a user to make any changes to the default settings, And 
in another embodiment, a user may be queried on prefer 
ences, the responses are used to establish defaults for opera 
tion. 

In some embodiments, frequency of use of the visual rep 
resentations is used to sort the presentation of visual repre 
sentations on the home view. More frequently accessed visual 
representations are displayed at a higher position on a page 
and less frequently accessed representations are displayed at 
a lower position on the page, and may cause the computer 
device to display the visual representation on another page. 
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In a typically configuration, visual representations are 

organized based upon creation time, although certain visual 
representations take precedence in the display. According to 
one aspect, display precedence is established from left to right 
and from top to bottom. In one embodiment, the visual rep 
resentation displayed in the upper left portion of the display 
screen is associated with the highest precedence. Precedence 
in the display may be influenced and even ignored with 
respect to certain system operations and the visual represen 
tations that map to them. For example, a visual representation 
mapping to display for a user's bookmarks may appear in the 
upper left corner. According to one embodiment, the posi 
tioning of the familiar option relating to bookmarks as the 
visual representation of the highest precedence provides 
users with an option familiar to traditional use of computer 
systems. Although presented as a streamlined interface ele 
ment, the bookmark visual representation is configured to 
evoke familiarity in the typical computer user. 

According to another embodiment, the visual representa 
tion that maps to the computer functionality for creating 
interacting with a new web page is the only representation 
that has a fixed position, relative to the display precedence. In 
one example, the element for triggering interaction with a 
new web page is always display in the bottom right corner. 
The other visual representation may be reshuffled based on 
frequency of use, and in other embodiments a user may also 
reshuffle the visual representation by drag and drop proce 
dures, however the element for triggering interaction with a 
new web page remains in the bottom right corner, and in one 
example, will move to a new page in response to a request to 
displayan new web page element when the element is already 
displayed in the bottom right corner of a page. Drag and drop 
operations may be associated with a drag threshold. In one 
example, a drag threshold is applied to require a small move 
ment of the identified card before the device executes the drag 
operation. The drag threshold may be measure on the order of 
pixels, and may be any number of pixels that prevent acci 
dental dragging in response to the user attempting to click on 
a card. In one embodiment, the drag threshold is set to 5 
pixels. Other thresholds may be used, 2, 3, 4, 6,... pixels as 
examples. 

Other display precedence may be employed. For example, 
display precedence may be configured based on user location 
and language convention for the user location. The written 
English language is read from left to right and from top to 
bottom; however, other languages are not. According to some 
embodiments, display precedence and any corresponding 
animations are configured to correspond with the conventions 
of the local language, for example displaying from right to 
left. 

Referring again to FIG. 2, shown is an example of a page of 
the home view, with user interface elements organized to 
present the user with Summary information of available con 
tent. Shown in FIG.2, at 202, is a representation of picture and 
video content available to the user. At 204, a visual represen 
tation of customized content is available. The customized 
content (discussed further herein) comprises rSS items from a 
web location distributing via an rSS feed. In example shown, 
204, comprises a channel card. The channel card is configured 
to allow easy interaction with a plurality of rss items, and 
further configured to be responsive to both lean forward inter 
actions and lean backward modes of interaction. The other 
user interface elements include, for example, visual represen 
tations of web based content, specialized user interface ele 
ments for providing customized interaction with web based 
content in the form of channels, and system elements. 
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A typical activity for any user includes reading his/her 
email. The user may observe an e-mail from for example, the 
user's credit card company, Chase. The home view (200) is 
the default vehicle through which a user interacts with the 
device and with electronic content displayed on the device. 
The home view presents an organization of other interactive 
elements (202-216). Accessing e-mail occurs in response to 
selecting the visual representation (208) that maps to 
YAHOO! MAIL content. Upon selecting (208) the device 
executes a mapping from the visual representation to the 
content and in response the device presents a first view of the 
mapped content. According to one embodiment, in response 
to selection of a visual representation mapping to content of 
web page a web page view is displayed. The web page view is 
a Zoomed in expression of the web based content mapped by 
the visual representation. 
Once a user aches the web page view (300) FIG. 3A, the 

user may interact with the content shown. Although it is to be 
appreciated that other representations may mapped to differ 
ent views, and different views may be used to map to further 
views. (302) shows an e-mail being reviewed by the user, and 
more specifically an e-mail from Chase Bank indicating that 
the user's credit card statement has issued. The body of the 
e-mail (304) includes a link (306) for accessing Chase's web 
site. Selecting the link invokes an open new page view opera 
tion by default, and in response to selection of (306) the user 
sees an animation returning the user to the home view (200). 
The visual representation for “Browse the web' (214) reveals 
the creation of a new visual representation for accessing web 
content (216) by sliding away from a new visual representa 
tion takes the former place of (214). The computer system 
displays an animation that shows the computer display Zoom 
ing into the page view (300) of element (214), shown in FIG. 
3B. The user logs in and reviews his/her balance, shown in 
FIG.3C at (350). The web page view further comprises navi 
gation element (352). The user selects (352) to return the 
home view (200), selects (216) to access a new web page and 
in response a new web content visual representation is cre 
ated, further the device shows the display Zooming into the 
neW COntent. 

FIG. 5 displays a quick access view (500). As the new card 
has not yet been mapped to content, the device displays con 
tent options in order to generate a mapping. In one example, 
the content options may be based on frequency of access. 
Shown at (502) are visual representations generated from the 
most frequently visited content. Selecting any of the visual 
representations in the body (502) causes the device to asso 
ciate the mapping with the new card and Zoom into the 
selected content display. At (504) provided as an element of 
the view’s header (506) is a bookmarks control. Through 
(504) bookmarks control a user may access content not dis 
play in the frequency list (although a user may also enter a 
uniform resource identifier at (508). 

In response to the selection of bookmarks a list of book 
marked content is displayed for selection, FIG. 6,600. Upon 
selecting (602) a mapping to the bookmarked content is asso 
ciated with the new visual representation. In one alternative, 
a user may enter auri for a online source to associated with a 
new visual representation. The computer Zooms into the 
selected content and in this example, displays the web page 
view for (602), Bank of Anmerica's (BOA) web site, shown in 
FIG. 7A at (700). The user logs in at (702) and is able to pay 
the Chase bill just reviewed, shown at FIG. 7B, (700). Having 
visual representations mapped to content available, improves 
the user's ability to transition between content views. By 
selecting the navigation element (752) the user is returned to 
the home view, FIG. 8, (800), showing the visual representa 
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tion (802) mapped to Chase's web page content and the newly 
created visual representation (804) mapped to Bank of 
America's web site content. Selecting (802) returns the user 
to the Chase content with the user's state preserved from the 
last visit, FIG. 3C, (350). The user is able to immediately 
review the statement balance, and by selecting navigation 
element (352) return to the home view (800) select (804) and 
enter the amount due for the Chase credit card at (754). 

It is to be appreciated that visual representations mapped to 
computer content facilitate transitions between content, and 
further by providing state preserving representations a user is 
able to quickly retrieve and employ information learned from 
COntent. 

According to another aspect, the selection of a new visual 
representation is configured to employ a timer. According to 
Some embodiments, the timer is configurable based on user 
selection, so that the animation may take longer, shorter, and 
in some embodiments the user is permitted to disable the 
animation entirely—in one example this is accomplished by 
setting the timer to allow 0 seconds for the animation, in 
another example the animation is simply disabled. In some 
embodiments, the timer is configurable by the system. Over 
the course of use, the allotted time may be reduced by the 
system automatically. Once a user has reached a certain time 
on the streamlined device, the animation may be automati 
cally disabled by the system. For some embodiments where 
the timer may be configured based on time of use, different 
timers may be employed for different user profiles. Thus an 
experienced user may no longer see the animation, whereas a 
novice user on the same device would see an extended version 
of the animation. 
Graphical User Interface 

Referring again to FIG. 11, there is illustrated a block 
diagram of one example of an architecture of the portable 
computer including a map user interface. The user interface 
“home' screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of 
content 172. In the illustrated example, the home screen 170 
contains five modes of content 172; however, it is to be 
appreciated that the home screen may include more or fewer 
than five modes of content and that the modes of content may 
differ from the examples discussed. It should also be appre 
ciated that differentarchitectures may be invoked in response 
to different device modes. For example, a portable computer 
in laptop mode may display a home view as discussed with 
respect to FIG. 11, when configured in Easel mode, user is 
presented with a Channel View. Shown with respect to FIG. 
23 is an example of a portable computer set in Easel mode, 
displaying a channel view. The Channel view may also dis 
play a plurality of modes of content. In FIG. 23 shown are 
visual representations of content (2304-2308) with associated 
mappings. 

According to another aspect, streamlining the presentation 
and integration of features and services includes simplifying 
the I/O devices that a user needs to operate in order to access 
features of the computer system and the features of any avail 
able service. According to another aspect, streamlining 
includes developing consistent visual representations of 
available content (whether on the computer system itself or 
from service providers). In another aspect, the organization of 
interactive elements and responsiveness of the organization to 
navigation options, device configurations, and user prefer 
ences improves the user's ability to interact with the computer 
system and its content. In one embodiment, system features 
and web features are consistently presented as cards for the 
user to interact with to achieve their computer objectives. In 
Some embodiments, cards comprise part of an interface layer 
between a computer user and a user's computer based objec 
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tive and/or computer operation. In some embodiments, the 
number and type of cards are presented in as few as three 
classes and/or types. Each card for example may be similar in 
aspect to the other, but each performing a different class of 
function on the computer system. 

Referring to FIG.9, shown is a conceptual model 900 of an 
example graphical user interface. As shown, in FIG. 9. 
through a streamlined device 901 a user will interact will a 
number of views of computer based content. In example 
model 900, depending on the device's configuration a user 
will be presented a home view 912 or a channel card view 914. 
Conceptually 910 forms a layer of the mapped based user 
interface, wherein the layer is configured to organize, manage 
and display streamlined views to the devices user. Layer 910 
organizes, manages and displays objects of layer 920. Layer 
920, according to some embodiments includes cards 921 
which are selectable visual representations that are mapped 
either to computer functions or available computer content. 
Cards further comprise web cards 922, that map to views of 
web content including web pages; channel cards 924 that map 
to customized views of content including web based content 
and picture and video content; nascent cards 926 that map to 
system functionality; System cards 928 that map to system 
functionality; and shared cards 929 that can be any of the 
former discussed cards shared from another user and/or 
streamlined device. The card layer 920 maps either to com 
puter functionality executed upon selection or additional 
views to provide interactive displays to the device user, for 
example, the views illustrated in layer 930. Page view 932, 
according to one example, is a Zoomed in expression of a web 
page. At 940 shown is another layer which includes a screen 
saver view,942. In one embodiment, the screen saver view is 
a passive view. In one example, the screen saver view may be 
activated by the computer system remaining idle for a period 
of time. In one embodiment, the screen saver view displays 
content from channel cards designated by a user in an options 
menu. In another embodiment, the screen saver view displays 
content from a pictures and video card. In another embodi 
ment, the screen saver view displays content from a shared 
card. 

According to one embodiment, channel card view 914 
comprises a view of the channel cards that are available to a 
user, and in another embodiment includes a channel selector 
(not shown). The channel selector is a selectable display 
configured to be responsive to manipulation of a scroll wheel. 
In one example, the channel selector is configured to display 
a rolodex of available channel cards and manipulation of a 
scroll wheel flips through the visual rolodex. Selection of one 
of the channel cards invokes any of a channel page view 934, 
content menu, and a channel card full view, depending upon 
the device's configuration, and in Some examples the result is 
responsive to where on the carda selection was made. Various 
cards, depending on the content mapped to, may also provide 
other views for rendering and providing for user interaction 
with content, for example, time, 939, album, 936, and lens, 
938 views. It is to be appreciated that the conceptual model 
illustrated in FIG. 9 is only one example of a conceptual 
model of the graphical user interface for streamlining user 
interaction with electronic content. Other conceptual models 
may be employed, for example only some of the layers may 
be employed, additional layers may be used, and different 
segmentations of the layers may be provided. 

According to one embodiment, a method of presenting a 
streamlined graphical user interface for a streamlined device 
includes an example process 5000, FIG. 50. Process 5000 
provides for organizing a plurality of views and GUI elements 
into a consistent presentation for user interaction. At 5002 
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provided is a first visual representation for displaying mul 
tiple content modes mapped to a view of computer content. At 
5004, a plurality of visual representations are organized by 
type of computer operation. At 5006, the graphical user inter 
face presents higher leveloperations to users as a view includ 
ing a group of visual representations. AT 5008, a user is 
permitted to select from the group of visual representations to 
navigate to lower level functions provided by different views 
of computer content. At optional step 5010, a user may be 
permitted to select from within different groups of visual 
representations to navigate to further lower level views of 
computer content. 

According to another aspect, layers of the conceptual 
model are configured to respond to device configurations by 
defaulting and/or transitioning to different views based on 
device configuration. Typically a device configured in a lap 
top mode displays a home view, 912, to a user as the default 
view. In response to a transition in mode between laptop and 
easel the computer transitions the computer display from the 
home view, 912, to the channel view, 914, as the default. A 
user may elect to change the default view, for example by 
selecting a navigation button that executes a return to the 
home view. In one example, 168, FIG. 17, is configured to 
return a user to a home view in response to selection of 168, 
when the computer display is not on the home view. In the 
home view, a user may invoke a channel card view, 914, by 
manipulating scroll wheel, 132. 
Home View Embodiments 

Referring again to FIG. 2, shown is an example page of a 
home view, 200. Home views according to various embodi 
ments are configured to render consistent organization of 
elements of the graphical user interface. Each page rendered 
in home view comprises a home navigation tool 250, aheader 
252, and a web search box 254. For home views which 
include multiple pages, a hint or cut out of adjacent displays 
are rendered at 256, for example. Hint or cut outs of adjacent 
displays may also occur at the bottom of the display screen, 
the top of the display screen, and both top and bottom, where 
multiple adjacent pages are present. 250, home navigation 
tool is responsive to the context in which it is executed. For 
example, the home navigation tool, 250, when selected 
causes the computer to display the last accessed view before 
the computer displayed the home view. Where a user navi 
gates to the home view, 200, from a web page view, the 
selection of the home navigation tool 250 caused the com 
puter to display the previous web page view. In other 
examples, the home navigation tool permits, toggling 
between other views and the home view, as illustrated in FIG. 
9, at 932-939 and/or 914. 

According to some embodiments, the web page view 
includes a navigation tool, 350, FIG. 3C, and in response to 
selection, causes the computer to display the home view, 200. 
Other elements included in the home view, for example, 
header 252 are configured to provide consistency in the home 
view across pages and in some embodiments across the user 
interface. Each page of the home view, 200, further comprises 
a body, 258, in which cards 202-216 are displayed. The body 
is associated with a maximal display threshold. The maximal 
display threshold governs the number of GUI elements dis 
played per home view page. In one embodiment, the dis 
played elements may comprise cards, and the maximal dis 
play threshold is set to display twelve cards. In addition to the 
maximal number of displayed elements, the home view may 
also comprise indicators of adjacent content at 256. The 
device generates a new page display for the home view, 2000, 
in response to exceeding the maximal display threshold. 
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Home view 200 is the default view in laptop mode, and may 
be implemented as the default view in other device modes 
(e.g. frame, easel, flat modes). According to Some embodi 
ments, the home view is the primary mechanism for permit 
ting users to access cards and navigation through content 
viewed on the device. In the home view a user can access open 
web sessions, view and manage their channels, initiate new 
web sessions, and launch other activities. 

Cards, e.g. 202-216, form a plurality of types. Some card 
types are organized by function, Some by content. The home 
view is comprised of various cards, each card providing 
access to computer based content. According to one aspect, 
cards can be thought of as the building blocks of the user 
interface, providing access to a plurality of views and/or 
content. Indeed, cards as elements of the GUI, are configured 
to be shared across users and across other streamlined 
devices. The ability to employ the features and functions of 
card based elements may be limited to streamlined devices, 
although cards and settings may be shared with traditional 
devices. 
Shown in home view 200, are web cards 206, 208, and 216, 

channel cards 204, and 210, further shown in home view 200 
are special system cards that map to content and system 
operations, for example bookmark card 212. The bookmark 
card 212 is configured to provide traditional computer opera 
tions associated with conventional systems and browsing 
methods. The bookmark card serves as learning tool, to pro 
vide features with which user are familiar in a new format that 
encourages further integration of card based interactions. 
According to one aspect, card interfaces are generated by a 
user for each web based interaction, eliminating the need for 
convention navigation in the form of bookmarks. Another 
example of a system card appears at 214. 214 maps to func 
tionality that when selected causes the computer system to 
execute a web card generation process. FIG. 10 illustrates an 
example generation process, 1000. Example processes, 1000, 
begins at 1002, in response to selection of a card or embedded 
web link (e.g. 214 of FIG. 2) that is associated with a mapping 
to functionality that generates a new web card. For example 
process 1000, may be initiated from a page view of a web card 
in response to selection of link. According to one embodi 
ment, the behavior of the streamlined device depends on 
instruction embedded within a selected link. In particular, the 
device in response to selection of a navigation link navigates 
to the identified location in the same page view. If the link 
encodes an instruction for openin new window and/or openin 
new tab, the device in response to selection generates a new 
card and displays the page view of the new card. Alternatively, 
defaults may be established for link handling, including a 
default for selection of a link contained inside an e-mail, 
which may default to a “new card mapping, whereas in some 
embodiments, links directed to the same domain as the cur 
rent view default to navigation functionality within the same 
window. In other words, in response to a selection of a link 
within a certain web-page, directing navigation to another 
location with in the same web page, the default functionality 
executed, caused the device to navigate to the selected loca 
tion within the same window. 

According to another embodiment, handling of web links 
may also be governed entirely by the settings contained in the 
selected link. For example, the device may execute process 
1000 in response to execution of a link including the instruc 
tion to open in new window. The device may also execute 
process 1000 in response to execution of a link including an 
instruction to open in a new tab. In one embodiment, links 
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without such references are processed by the web page view 
navigating to the linked location without invoking process 
1000, for example. 
At 1002, the mapping is executed and the computer device 

determines its state at 1004. The state determination is con 
figured to identify a current view setting for the device. Cur 
rent view setting may be limited to an indication that the 
device is current showing the home view. At 1006 Yes, the 
device is currently showing the home view, and the device 
executes a card generation animation, at 1008. In one 
example, the animation causes the device to display a browse 
the web card 214, FIG. 2, sliding away from a new visual 
representation the takes the former place of 214. One the new 
card image is shown the computer display renders an anima 
tion the causes the user to perceive Zooming into the newly 
created card at 1010. Alternatively, it is determined that the 
device's current display is not the home view at 1006 NO. At 
1012, apparent motion relative to the user is rendered by the 
device to provide the appearing of Zooming to the home 
display. Other animations may be employed to establish for 
the user the perception of motion to the home view. Once at 
the home view, process 1000, proceeds as before. 

According to one embodiment, the home view, FIG. 2.200, 
is configured to manage and organize cards. The home view 
provides a simple and convenient mode of navigating through 
the features and content accessible through the device by 
organizing and managing cards. 

Card Examples 
According to some embodiments of systems and methods 

for streamlining user interaction with electronic content, 
visual representation that render computer operation and/or 
content in a consistent manner further comprise cards. 
According to one embodiment, cards may further comprise 
types, including web cards, which map to active web pages. In 
Some embodiments, device configuration sensitive displays 
are provided through a graphical user interface. In some 
embodiments the device configuration sensitive displays 
include cards. Cards may come in a number of forms. In some 
embodiments cards may be classified according to the func 
tionality that they provide to a particular user. For example, 
system cards provide and display computer system function 
ality that maybe frequently accessed during ordinary com 
puter user and/or may be required for computer use. In some 
embodiments, web cards provide a user interface for web 
based content and/or web based activity. In some embodi 
ments, channel cards provide additional features that enable a 
user to better interact with web based content, and in another 
example, channel cards provide interactive views by utilizing 
different content presentations provided by a web source. 
Consistent user interfaces provide an access layer to system 
and web based content. Consistent user interfaces are used to 
access web based content, and even content and applications 
provided by third parties. 

In one example, a web card presents a thumbnail view of 
the current state of the web page. In another example, the web 
page card presents a cut out view of the web page based on 
computer focus within the page at the time the web page view 
was exited. FIG. 14 illustrates, according to one embodiment, 
the behavior and rendered display of certain cards responsive 
to computer focus and selection by a user. A card may be in a 
number of States based on computer focus. One example of 
computer focus would include “hover 1404 hover indi 
cates the movement of a pointer, typically represented by a 
white arrow on the computer system display, over a card. A 
card may be in a normal state 1402 when not in focus. 

Focus is intended to include any identification by the com 
puter system of the card, short of execution of the mapping 
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associated with it. For example, focus should include identi 
fication by tabbing through available cards, identification by 
using hotkeys, among other options that result in computer 
focus resolving on the card. The terms computer focus and 
focus should be read to include hovering over a screen ele 
ment, tool, or other visual representation displayed on a com 
puter system display. In one example, focus follows a dis 
played pointer, and movement of the pointer with, for 
example, a mouse causes the computer system to resolve 
computer focus on the visual object under the pointer display. 
Selection by a user or a computer system may include focus 
and visual objects displayed on a computer system display 
may be selected by moving a displayed pointer. In some 
embodiments, selection may be accomplished by clicking on 
a visual object using a pointer displayed on the computer 
screen. A second "click may then cause the computer system 
to execute functionality associated with the visual object. 
Execution should be read to include initiating an operation 
associated with a visual object, in one example execution will 
include clicking on a visual object (single or multiple 
"clicks”), by positioning a pointer display over the visual 
object and depressing a button to initiate the operation. 

Focus may be resolved on a computer system by analyzing 
content intended to be displayed before its display on the 
computer system, additionally focus may be responsive to 
actions taken on the display through for example pointing 
devices. 

According to one embodiment, when a web card orchannel 
card appears is in a hover state 1404, additional options are 
displayed in the card header, for example at 1450. The addi 
tional tools displayed in the cardheader permita user to select 
the options associated with the card. The options view for a 
card 1406, displays available selections contained in the 
options. For a web card 1410, the options include make a 
channel 1452. The selection of make a channel at 1452 causes 
the device to execute functionality that transforms the web 
card into a channel card. The transformation from web card to 
channel card includes transforming the display image of the 
card element on any corresponding view. 

Typically the transformation may only be made for a web 
card that references a content including a rSS feed. The items 
in the rSS feed are configured into a customized presenta 
tion—as for example a channel card 1412 (discussed further 
herein). For a channel card 1412, additional options include 
show in screensaver, for example. Other states may impact the 
display of web card including a drag and drop state. Upon 
focus, the additional tools will resolve in the headersection of 
the card, the additional tools may be displayed as icons, as 
shown in FIG. 14, and may also be rendered as selectable text 
options include “bookmark.” “share.” “options, and “close.” 
If a user depresses the button control and does not release, the 
user may user drag and drop the card within the home view. 
The card may be dragged across pages of the home view, and 
the user may reorder the presentation of cards in the home 
view using multiple drag and drop operations. According to 
one embodiment, as a card is dragged across the home view, 
all displaced cards will appear to move into new places. 

According to another aspect, computer content and inter 
active functionality is recast into cards. In one embodiment, 
the card comprises a visual representation of web content that 
simplify the user's interaction with even the most sophisti 
cated on-line tools. Cards are configured to presenta Summa 
rized view of available content and/or present a visual indi 
cation of available functions. According to one embodiment, 
cards form a part of the structure of the graphical user inter 
face between the system and the user. In various embodi 
ments, cards are configured to be context and/or content sen 
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sitive. Some cards are configured to be persistent. Persistent 
card may be removed by an affirmative act of the user. 

With cards, content can be easily and visually absorbed by 
a user. In some embodiments, cards serve to maintain a cur 
rent state of the user's activity. And in some embodiments, 
cards also serve to focus the displayed content on contextual 
information. Cards may be configurable by the users. Con 
figurations options are presented to the user consistently. In 
Some examples, this includes displaying consistent anima 
tions designed to draw the users focus to the particular activ 
ity and to provide comfort level for the activity being dis 
played. 
Shown in FIG. 43 is an example process 4300 for stream 

lining user interactions with computer content. The process 
includes presenting a consistent look and feel for user access 
to computer operations and computer content for user inter 
face elements that also provide for a reduction in decision 
making requirements imposed on a user during conventional 
computer use. At 4302, a user is presented with a first visual 
representation in a computer display, the visual representa 
tion is responsive to computer focus and at 4304, and the user 
is permitted to resolve computer focus by selecting the visual 
representation. Selection and focus can be thought of interms 
of a visual pointer display on the computer system display, by 
moving the pointer over an object displayed on the computer 
display, computer focus may be resolved on the visual object. 
Alternatively, a user may have to indicate a selection of the 
object by clicking on a mouse button for example. 

According to one embodiment clicking is not required. In 
another embodiment, the pointer being displayed above a 
visual object activates a “hover state. In response to hover 
ing, computer focus is resolved on the visual object. At 4306, 
a focus visual representation is displayed to the user. Accord 
ing to one embodiment, the visual representation and the 
focus representation are configured to have common ele 
ments, and in particular, a header and body display for ren 
dering computer content associated with the visual represen 
tations. The focus visual representation including a header 
and body display Summarizing at least one of computer con 
tent and computer operations are shown at 4308. The visual 
representations present a multitude of computer content in a 
streamlined form, in other words, the visual representation 
forms an indirection layer of functionality that provides a 
window into digital content, and/or computer operations 
linked to the visual representation. In particular, a visual 
representation mapped to a web page for example, provides a 
view of the web page in the body of the visual representation 
and provides additional information about the web page in the 
header display. The header display may also include tools for 
providing easy access to computer functionality associated 
with the web page and/or its content. In one example the 
header display only displays the tools in the focus visual 
representation so the initial view of the content is not cluttered 
with tools that are not needed. Further, in one embodiment, 
the tools only display in response to focus, in other words, 
only when a user indicates they are necessary by moving a 
display pointer over the visual representation. Further com 
puter logic may be embodied in process 4300, responsive to a 
display position of a pointer displayed on the computer 
screen. In response to the display position of the pointer 
occupying the same location as another visual object, com 
puter focus is resolved on that object, causing the computer 
system to determine functionality associated with the object. 

In one example, the object is a visual representation, and in 
response to moving the pointer over the visual representation, 
the computer is caused to display a focus visual representa 
tion associated with the visual representation. In one 
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example, computer focus remains with the focus representa 
tion and functionality associated with the focus representa 
tion is made available for execution. Other operations includ 
ing display of a header responsive to focus may be executed. 
At 4310, a mapping associated with at least one of the focus 
visual representation and the visual representation is 
executed causing the computer system to navigate to a con 
tent view. The content view may include a display of com 
puter operations. In one alternative, the content view provides 
an interactive view of computer content. In one example the 
computer content, comprises online content viewed through a 
web browser. In another example, the content view is pre 
sented in a similar format as the visual representation used to 
navigate to the content. In one particular example, the content 
view includes a header display and a body display, and the 
content is displayed in the body portion. The header portion 
provides additional information on the content, for example a 
title, and may further provide additional tools that are respon 
sive to focus. Again providing tools that resolve when needed 
and disappear when not reduces the amount of information a 
computer user needs to assimilate in order to use a computer 
system. 

All computer content and operations can be configured to 
display in visual representations and respective focus visual 
representations, providing a user with a streamlined presen 
tation of computer content and operations. According to 
another example, different content types are presented 
through visual representation of a similar format. In one 
embodiment, the visual representations comprise cards as 
discussed herein. 
A process 4400 may be invoked by streamlined computer 

system as part of process 4300. Additionally, process 4400 
may operate independently or be called from other processes. 
Shown in FIG. 44 is a process 4400, for permitting a user to 
interact with computer content. At 4402, a computer system 
displays a first content view. The first content view is config 
ured to display in a similar format as a visual representation 
selected by the user to navigate to the content view. In one 
embodiment, the first content view includes a header and 
body display. In another embodiment the content view is a 
Zoomed in view of the visual representation used to navigate 
to the content view. At 4404, an enlarged view of the first 
visual representation is displayed. In one example, the con 
tent view comprises a web browser view of a web page 
displayed in the body of the content view. The visual repre 
sentation used to navigate to the content view displays a 
portion of the web browser in the body of the visual repre 
sentation. At 4406, a user is permitted to interact with the 
content displayed in the body of the content view. The user is 
further permitting to access options associated with the con 
tent through the header display. Optionally, further computer 
logic may be included in process 4400 for presenting focus 
and unfocused views of the header in the content view. 

According to another aspect, cards types should be clearly 
defined by color scheme and appearance, while at the same 
time maintaining a similar format. For example the similar 
format should include header placement and sizing, display 
of tools, title and frame size. In one embodiment, a color 
scheme configured to differentiate card types provides for 
web cards with white headers with the content displayed on 
the web card showing as a thumbnail of the current state of the 
page. Channel cards are configured with black headers, and 
the content presented in the channel card comprises a simpli 
fied representation of web content based on RSS feeds or 
custom visualizations of some non-RSS websites. Custom 
ized visualizations may be pre-loaded on the device for spe 
cific websites, or may be provided as part of a remotely stored 
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device profile and/or global profile. Updates to the device 
profile and/or a global profile would include development of 
customized visualizations of non-RSS websites, and access 
to remote storage trigger delivery of the customized visual 
izations. According to one embodiment, only sites for which 
RSS or custom visualizations are available can be displayed 
as channel cards. 

System cards are shown either with blue headers or grey 
headers. System cards may be further classified to include 
nascent cards. "Browse the Web' card, FIG. 2, 214 is an 
example of a nascent card. The nascent card may be config 
ured so it position is not configurable, nor is a user able to 
remove the card from the home view, or any view. The nascent 
card maps to functionality necessary to operation of the 
streamlined device, and thus no option to close and/or remove 
it is available. Other system cards are configured to represent 
activities that have been specifically designed Such as for 
example, photos & Video card(s). The other system cards map 
to functionality also regarded as necessary so that the other 
system cards can not be deleted, however, the other system 
cards can be reorganized in for example the home view. 
Functionality mapped to by the other system cards include 
communications card, for configuring wireless access of the 
device, bookmarks for presenting conventional styled web 
page bookmarks, camera for providing for configuration and 
operation of a camera, either embedded in the device upon 
construction, or incorporated through for example a USB 
port. 

In one embodiment, a system card is mapped to function 
ality to provide a user with streamlined access to web book 
marks. In one example, a bookmark card is provided that is 
always accessible from the home view. As with other system 
cards, the bookmark card comprises a header and a body. 
According to one embodiment, the body display for the book 
mark card is unique to the bookmark card. Bookmarks are 
retrieved and displayed in the bookmark card one at a time. In 
one example, the bookmark card indicates in the body display 
the number of the bookmark in the list and the total number of 
bookmarks available. 

According to some embodiments, the interactivity of indi 
vidual cards is limited to navigation to a page view. For 
example, a user can not change the content of a card by 
interacting only with the card. In other embodiments, channel 
cards, for example, provide a user with the option of interact 
ing directly with the card. Upon hover, channel cards present 
ing news feeds may resolve navigation tools configured to 
step through individual rSS items displayed in the channel 
card. Additionally, selection within a channel card presenting 
a news feed causes the device to execute different mappings 
depending on what part of the channel card was selected for 
execution. Clicking directly on an rss feed headline for 
example, caused the device to execute a mapping to the web 
page view for that article. Selecting the body of the channel 
card causes the device to execute a mapping to the channel 
full view. Selection within the channel full view causes the 
device to display a content menu, responsive to manipulation 
of a scroll wheel. 

In an embodiment employing a three card presentation, the 
cards that are presented provide the user with the ability to 
interact with system specific features. System features may be 
invoked and display using consistent presentation and/orani 
mation. Consistent presentation of like features may engen 
der a comfort level in the user for new features that appear 
using the same and/or similar presentation. Additionally, 
where a user invokes features in a similar or consistent man 
ner, access of new features is facilitated and user comfort 
level may be increased. For example, a nascent card, is a 
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system card that provides for consistent implementation of 
user activity and/or a computer objective desired by the user. 
In one embodiment, the “new card card is a visual represen 
tation of a system placeholder for generation and presentation 
of new card that a user may create during the course of 
ordinary activity. By selecting the new card (for example, 
creating a web card used to interact with web content) a 
consistent animation may be employed to display to the user 
the creation of the new web card utilizing the nascent “new 
card card. Other system features may be presented through 
system cards. Typically, system cards will represent function 
ality used most frequently and/or functionality that should 
always be available and not subject to removal by a user. 
Other card types, include web cards that are used to present 
web content, and channel cards that are used to provide to a 
user easy and/or consistent access to additional features. 

According to another aspect, features of cards may include 
consistent navigation tools, consistent content display—in 
cluding limiting the ability to alter content of a card through 
user interaction with the card, state representative images of 
content, state and context representative images of content, 
customized visualization of content, and in Some examples 
customized visualizations include information derived from 
rSS content. In one embodiment, user interactions with cards 
are also streamlined. In another embodiment, when card con 
figurations and/or card options are selected by a user (if 
available) a consistent animation is presented to the user. For 
example, selection of a cards options may cause an anima 
tion displaying the flipping of the card and the revelation of 
user selectable options. Options, for example, may include 
permitting the content reflected in the card to be displayed as 
a screen saver. Certain features may only be available for 
certain cards types. In one embodiment for example only 
channel cards (discussed in greater detail herein) may be 
displayed in the screensaver mode, thus only channel cards 
will display the option to permit display in screensaver. In 
another embodiment, certain card types may be converted 
through user selection. In one embodiment, web cards may be 
converted into channel cards. It is realized that the segregation 
of functions between the card types may improve user inter 
action and adoption of the different feature sets available to 
each. 

According to another embodiment, systems and methods 
for streamlining user interaction with electronic content may 
include a process for generating new visual representations 
mapped to computer content. Shown in FIG. 47A is an 
example process 4700, for generating a user interface ele 
ment. At 4702, a visual representation associated with a com 
puter operation for creating a new visual representation is 
displayed on a computer system display. The visual represen 
tation may comprise a nascent card. Nascent cards are con 
figured to always be available to a user, that is, they are 
configured so a user can not remove them. In some embodi 
ments, the position of the display of nascent cards cannot be 
changed by the user. In one embodiment, the nascent card is 
always displayed in a home view, at the bottom right corner of 
a home view page. For a new page this may include the 
nascent card appearing in the upper left corner of the page, 
when no other cards are displayed on the same page. At 4704. 
execution of the functionality associated with the visual rep 
resentation occurs. At 4706, a first animation is displayed to 
the computer system user showing the visual representation 
sliding away from its present location to reveal a new visual 
representation. At 4708, a second animation is displayed to a 
user showing the computer system Zoom into the new visual 
representation to present a quick access view at 4710. 
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The quick access view is configured to permit a user to 

select computer content to associate with the new visual 
representation. In one example, this includes presenting a 
display of frequently accessed web content (e.g. web pages) 
to the user in the quick access display. It is likely that the user 
will intend to return to a page frequently accessed, in which 
case, the display will meet the users needs, however, the quick 
access view is further configured to permit entry of a uniform 
resource indicator (e.g. a url), and further configured to allow 
a user to request display of bookmarked locations. At 4712, a 
user is permitted to select computer content to associate with 
the new visual representation, and in response to selection of 
the computer content, the computer system displays an ani 
mation to the user depicting the computer system Zooming 
into a first view of the selected content at 4714. 

In one alternative, new visual representation may be gen 
erated without selecting a nascent card, in process 4750, FIG. 
47B. For example, a web card may include a hyperlink direct 
ing a computer system to display the linked web page in a new 
window. At 4752, a user selects an open in new window link. 
In one alternative, the link may include instruction to open an 
new tab. In response to a request to display a web page in a 
new window, a new visual representation is generated and 
associated with a mapping to the web page. The computer 
system displays a transition from the current web card view to 
the home view, 4754, displaying the nascent card. In an 
optional step, the process Zooms out the home view so that the 
nascent card is rendered on one page. The system presents an 
animation to the user, 4756, similar to step 4706, showing the 
nascent card sliding away from its position, revealing a new 
visual representation. The system then Zooms in on the new 
representation, 4758, displaying a first view of the mapped 
content, 4760. 
Common Card Configurations 
According to one aspect, cards should have common fea 

tures to promote user acceptance and improve adoption of 
different cards, while providing familiara form. According to 
Some embodiments, most cards are configured with a similar 
anatomy. According to some embodiments, cards comprise 
certain common elements described with reference to illus 
trated examples. 

With reference to FIG. 15A shown is an example of a web 
card when not in focus, however, the common features among 
the cards are discussed in greater detail. Header 1502 run 
along the top of the card. The color depends on the color 
scheme employed to differentiation the type of card: in one 
example white is used for web cards, black for channel cards, 
and blue and grey for system cards. Optionally the header 
includes a favicon 1504 (the favicon may be retrieved from 
the site being view in the case of web and channel cards and 
a custom favicon is employed for system cards). The header 
further comprises a title 1506 for the site or activity con 
ducted, and a body 1508. In response to focus on a card the 
display of the card becomes a little larger relative to its display 
when out of focus and the card controls 1552-1556, FIG.15B, 
are revealed on the header, when in a focused state. 

Card options 1552, reveals the card options, and may in 
Some embodiments invoke an animation of the card flipping 
to reveal selectable options. Share, 1554, is configured to 
permit a user to share the card with other user. Delete, 1556, 
removes the card from the home view. Card controls, such as 
1552-1556 are typically not available for system cards, which 
typically can not be shared or deleted. According to one 
embodiment, the photos & Video system card is configured to 
display the card options (in one example the photo & video 
system card permits selection of “Show in screensaver'). 
1508, FIG. 15A, card body varies by the type of card dis 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 239 of 521 PageID #: 345



US 9,003,315 B2 
41 

played. In one embodiment, a web cardbody 1508 comprises 
a thumbnail of the current state of the web page. The current 
state thumbnail may be updated. Updates may occur in con 
junction with a timer. Typically the timer is set for default 
operation, and is not configurable by a user, although in some 
embodiments a user may access and modify an update inter 
Val for web cards through system configurations. 
The body of a channel card (not shown) comprises a visu 

alization of the rss feed from the web site source. Sites that do 
not have rss feeds, typically, will not be able to be displayed 
as channel cards. However, customized visualizations for 
Some static sites are preloaded and for the preloaded Static 
sites an rSS feed is not used to display the web site content in 
a channel card. System card body (not shown) comprises a 
custom image configured to represent the system activity 
mapped to by the system card. 

Options and Information Associated with Various Card 
Embodiments 

According to one embodiment, selection of the card 
options icon causes the device to display a visualization of the 
card turning over. The “back side of the card, FIG.16 (show 
ing a plurality of examples of the backs of various card types) 
comprises the following options: Show as channel 1602, 
which transforms a web card into a channel card, and Vice 
versa, based either upon checking or unchecking box 1604. If 
the channel is a photo and video channel, this control reads 
"Show as channel using lens.’ A lens is a customized visu 
alization for computer content. Shown in FIG. 16 is an 
example lens “Slideshow” at 1606. 

According to another embodiment, the option for show as 
channel is either shown as permanently checked for system 
cards that are always available as a channel (e.g. the photos 
and video card), or as absent for system cards that are not 
available as a channel (e.g. a system settings card or commu 
nications card). Show in screensaver, 1608, is an available 
option for channel cards. Typically 1608 is not an available 
option for other card types, however, the photo and video 
system card does permit its content to be displayed in the 
screensaver. According to one example, new channel cards 
are configured to not display in screensaver mode by default 
and this option is not checked for new channel cards. Shared 
from, 1610, provides information on the user or device from 
which the card was shared. According to one embodiment, 
system cards cannot be shared, and do not display “shared 
from information. Additionally, shared from 1610, does not 
display for card generated by a present user. In one example, 
shared from 1610 is responsive to computer focus (e.g. 
hover). Hovering over the Shared From line, 1610, causes the 
device to display an informational bubble with a list of people 
to whom the card was shared. Other options may be employed 
for displaying shared from information. Other options may 
include linking to a display list for share from information, 
and in some embodiments may include displaying the shared 
entities on the back of the card without selecting 1610, Shared 
From. In such embodiments a maximum number of shared 
entities may be displayed before requiring selection of a more 
control. The more control expands on the list of shared enti 
ties to provide for listings that do not fit within the space 
provided on the back of a card. 

Shared to, 1612, provides information about whether and 
to whom the card has been shared. According to one embodi 
ment, System cards can not be shared, thus no shared to 
information is displayed. By default shared to, 1612, does not 
display until a card has been shared. According to some 
embodiments, the “shared to field is responsive to focus. In 
one example, hovering over the shared to line causes the 
device to display an informational bubble with the list of 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

45 

50 

55 

60 

65 

42 
people to whom the card has been shared. Other options may 
be employed for displaying shared to information. Other 
options may include linking to a display list for share to 
information, and in Some embodiments may include display 
ing the shared entities on the back of the card without select 
ing 1612, shared to. In Such embodiments a maximum num 
ber of shared entities may be displayed before requiring 
selection of a more control (not shown). The more control 
expands on the list of shared entities to provide for listings 
that do not fit within the space provided on the back of a card. 
Optionally the more control may cause the device to display 
an information bubble containing the remaining shared enti 
ties and/or all the shared entities. 

Organization of the Home View 
Typically, the home view is configurable by the user. New 

items may be added, existing items may be moved and/or 
removed based on user selection. The home view further 
comprises some visual representations that can not be 
removed. Commonly requested system operations have 
visual representation displayed on the home view that can not 
be deleted. According to one embodiment, a user may reor 
ganize the display but not remove representations for system 
operations. For example, visual representations that map to 
system operations (e.g. a communication card and a camera 
card) cannot be remove from the home view. Nascent cards, 
for example, the Browse the web card, can not be removed 
from the home view. According to some embodiments, the 
Browse the web card is further limited in configurability, in 
that, the positioning of the card will not change relative to the 
other cards. For example, the Browse the web card will 
always be displayed last. In other examples, nascent cards 
may have other positions that do not change, first to be dis 
played, last displayed on first page of the home view, etc. In 
Some embodiments, even nascent cards may be reorganized 
in the home view display. 
The user interface may include default settings for organi 

Zation. For example, a default organization for the home view 
comprises an arrangement roughly based on order of creation, 
from left to right, top to bottom. Other organization may be 
employed right to left, top to bottom. In one example, the user 
of the streamline device is located in China, and the default 
organization is presented from right to left. 
One example default setting for the home view establishes 

a number of cards to display perpage of the home view. In one 
example the default causes the computer to render twelve 
cards on a page. In another example, the display of the twelve 
cards further comprises the tops of the cards on the next page 
or the bottoms of the cards on the previous page, as appropri 
ate. In one embodiment, the home view includes maximal 
display thresholds configured to improve the ability of the 
user to absorb the information presented. In some embodi 
ments, a maximal number of visual representations per Screen 
is set. in one example, the maximal number of visual repre 
sentations is used to define a GUI page. In another example, 
the maximal number of visual representations is associated 
with a maximal number of full view visual representations, 
and the page is configured to include portions of views of 
other visual representations available on adjacent pages. A 
computer operation that would cause the computer device to 
exceed the maximal number results in the creation of a new 
display page. The home view is organized into as many pages 
that are required in order to maintain the maximal threshold of 
display items. 

It is to be appreciated the different organization options 
may be employed for the home view. In one alternative, 
frequency of use may be employed to organize the cards 
displayed in a home view. The most frequently accessed 
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content may be display first with the least frequently accessed 
content being display last. Another option includes the use of 
last accessed information associated with a particular card. 
The most recently accessed card may be displayed first and 
the card with oldest use would be displayed last. 

Creating New Cards 
An example process 1040, FIG. 10B may be executed to 

generate a new card. Process 1040 is executed in response to 
a user clicking the Browse the Web card on the home view at 
step 1042. In response to the execution of the Browse the Web 
card, the devices displays the card sliding to the right (or 
down to the far left on the next row if it is already on the far 
right) as a new web card is created in its place at 1044. At 1046 
the system renders apparent motion in the display, showing 
the system Zooming into the new web card. At 1048, the 
system displays a quick access view configured to generate a 
mapping between the new card and web based content. 
According to some embodiments, newly added cards 
(whether created by the user or received as a shared card from 
another user) always appear at the bottom of the home view 
next to the Browse the Web card. In other embodiments, the 
Browser the Web card may display a different title, for 
example, “New Card. It is to be appreciated that the title is 
not particularly relevant to the nascent card, but rather, the 
functionality for generating new card is. 
New cards may also be created on the fly during a browsing 

session as part of process 1080, FIG. 10C. Process 1080 
begins at 1082 in response to either a user clicking an “open 
in new window' link on a web page, or in response to a user 
executing a keyboard shortcut (e.g. Shift-click) to perform the 
same function. Additionally links that contain computer 
instructions to open link in new tab will invoke the same 
functionality at 1082. In these cases, the system shows an 
animation Zooming out of the current card to the home view 
at 1084, optional step 1086 cause the system to display move 
ment to the last page of the home view (if not there already), 
at 1088 the Browse the Web card slides out of the way, 
revealing the new card in its place at 1090, and finally Zoom 
ing into the new card, 1092. Process 1080, may be implement 
in association with a timer to govern the overall execution 
time of process 1080. In one example, the process and ani 
mations should take no more than about half a second. 

According to one embodiment, selection of the Browse the 
Web System card causes the system to execute a process for 
generating a new web card. As part of the process for gener 
ating a new card, the system presents a quick access view to 
the user. Referring again to FIG. 5, shown is an example of a 
quick access view. As discussed earlier, the body 502 of the 
quick access view may display a frequently accessed list of 
content. A user may select from the displayed content to 
generate a mapping for the new cards, and enter the web page 
view for that content. Additionally at 510, the quick access 
view presents news from, for example, the device manufac 
turer. At 510, news regarding operation of a streamlined 
device may be shared with the streamlined device user com 
munity. Advice on new features may be provided, 512 and 
awareness drawn to new features. Hints and Suggestions may 
also be displayed, for example, 514, referring users to 
GOOGLE DOCS, an on-line word processing/office suite 
Solution. 

According to another embodiment, creation of a channel 
card is available for sites with rss feeds or sites for which 
customized visualizations are available. From the home view 
any web card with rss feeds or with customized visualizations 
can be used to generate a channel card. From a web page view, 
hovering over the option add channel caused the system to 
display a preview of the channel card. In one embodiment a 
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channel card includes features not observed in web or system 
card. For example, channel card 204, includes a display, 280, 
for an individual rss item received from the online source. In 
this case the rss item is a headline that permits direct access to 
an article (typically through a web card). Channel card, 204, 
will display a plurality of rSS items one at a time through the 
channel card, thus the content in a channel card periodically 
changes, until all content items have been displayed. At that 
time the channel cards starts again from the beginning dis 
playing each one of the plurality of Source items. 
Removing Cards 
According to one embodiment, the home view may be 

configured by a user. A user may remove visual representa 
tions from the home view. In a card example, a user may 
access card option by providing focus on the card. As dis 
cussed above, card options are revealed in response to focus. 
Options may comprise a delete option. In one example, a 
delete option is display as an “X” in the upper right corner of 
a hover view of a card. To delete a card from the home view, 
a user executes the delete option by clicking on the “X” In 
response to removal of a card from the home the view, the 
remaining cards on the home view are reordered by the 
device. In one example, the reordering comprises shifting of 
the displayed cards to rearrange them into the organizational 
schemes discussed above. In order to ensure a close? delete 
selection was intended and to provide the user with the ability 
to change their mind, an information display bubble may be 
generated in response to the delete execution. The informa 
tion display bubble maps to functionality that causes the 
device to undo the delete operation in response to selection by 
the user. 

According to one embodiment, a dialog bubble is dis 
played off of the header of the home view. The dialogue 
bubble displays a message confirming the delete operation 
and further comprising a mapping to functionality provided, 
the causes the device to undo the delete operation in response 
to selection. According to another embodiment, hot-key func 
tionality is provided that cause the device to undo that last 
activity performed by the device. In one example, ctrl-Z, is 
mapped to functionality that permits the last activity to be 
undone. 
Home View Navigation 
According to one embodiment, the home view is config 

ured to display a maximum number of visual representations. 
For embodiments employing cards that map to computer 
content and/or operations the maximal number of visual rep 
resentations will restrict the number of cards displayed per 
page of the home view. In one example the display number is 
set to twelve. In response to exceeding the display number, 
the device executes operations designed to render a new page 
for the excess. In response to multiple pages, the device is 
configured to display indications of content (e.g. cards) on 
adjacent pages. In response to movement of a pointer, visual 
representation displayed on the screen tracking computer 
focus, new pages may be displayed. In one example, multiple 
pages are provided by the view. The display rendered by the 
device gives a user the impression that adjacent pages appear 
above and below the current page view. For example, indica 
tions of adjacent card content appear at the top and bottom of 
the home view body. By scrolling the pointer towards the 
bottom of the screen the user causes the device to display the 
next page of the home view, further by scrolling the pointer 
towards the top of the screen the user causes the device to 
display the previous page of the home view. Additionally, 
according to one embodiment, arrow keys provided on the 
device's keyboard may be used to navigate pages of the home 
view. In one alternative, keyboard shortcuts mapped to navi 
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gation functionality. In one example, keys with mapped navi 
gation functionality include shift-arrow, crt1-arrow, alt-arrow 
to provide further navigation options. 
One may navigate away from the home view at any time by 

selecting a visual representation and causing the device to 
execute the mapping associated with the representation. In 
one embodiment, a user selects a card and in response the 
device renders a page view appropriate for the selected card 
(e.g. web page view for a web card). In one embodiment, an 
integrated Scroll wheel provides navigation functionality 
from the home view. Scroll wheel functionality may be 
dependent on State of the device, and may also be dependent 
on configuration of the device. In one example, the device's 
present state is its home view and manipulation of the scroll 
wheel causes the device to display the channel card view. 
According to one embodiment, returning to the home view is 
streamlined for the user. This may be accomplished through 
navigation buttons on the keyboard, for example 168, FIG. 
17. The navigation button operates as a toggle between 
present view and home view, returning a user to the home 
view when the present view is elsewhere, and returning the 
user to the previous view when the present view is the home 
view. A navigation element provided in visual representation 
of computer content may also provide the same functionality. 
For example, navigation button 250, in home view 200. In 
another example, a navigation button, 352, FIG. 3C is pro 
vided in a web page view. 

Reorganization of visual elements in the home view may 
implicate navigation with the home view. In one example 
where the home view presents cards to a user through mul 
tiple pages, moving cards across the pages requires naviga 
tion within the home view. According to one embodiment, 
specialized navigation options are provide to render Sufficient 
context for the relocation across pages. In one example, a user 
drags a card across pages within a home view. The device in 
response to the drag across pages modifies the display of the 
home view to show a Zoomed out display of the home view. 
The Zoomed out display is permitted to violate any associated 
threshold with respect to number of displayed items on a page 
of the home view. The Zoomed out display in a view of 
multiple pages with each element of the pages being reduced 
in size to allow them to be displayed in one screen. For long 
lists of cards, or other visual representations, this may result 
in extremely small visual representations or cards. It is real 
ized that eventhought the result may be visual representations 
So Small that they cannot be fully appreciated, the user goal is 
to relocate a card, and the temporary loss of interactivity to the 
user will not impact the user operation. Once a card is relo 
cated, the device caused the display to “Zoom’ back out to 
conform to management and organization scheme discussed, 
including maximal display thresholds, for example. 

Navigation away from the home view may also occur 
through selection of the visual representations that map to 
computer content and/or functionality. In one embodiment, 
clicking on a card will Zoom into that card, revealing the page 
view for that card. In one example, clicking on a web card 
caused the device to display the web page view for that cards 
content. In another, clicking on a channel card may invoke 
different behavior. In a channel card example, the navigation 
behavior depends on the location within the card that is 
clicked. 
Some channel card embodiments, display items from rSS 

feeds one at a time, Scrolling through the rSS items based on a 
timer, and in one embodiment, based on selection of naviga 
tion tools within the card. If a user clicks on the body of the 
channel card for example, the device causes the channel page 
view to be displayed for that card. If a user clicks on an rss 
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item displayed in the channel card, the device causes a web 
page view for the specific content to be displayed. In one 
embodiment, a channel card maps to a content feed from the 
NEW YORKTIMES. Clicking on an article title in the chan 
nel cards causes the system to execute a mapping to the 
content by opening a new web card and Zooming into the new 
cards web page view of the selected article. Clicking else 
where the channel card causes the system to Zoom in to the 
channel page view for that card. 

According to one embodiment, searching from the home 
view causes the user interface to navigate away from the 
home view. For example, entering search terms into search 
box 254, FIG. 2, causes the device to execute a process for 
generating a new web card and navigating to the page view of 
the newly created web card. The device in creating the new 
web card automatically creates a mapping to web content 
based on default settings. In one example, the default settings 
provide for searching to occur through the well known search 
tool GOOGLE. Other search tools may be established as the 
default. By accessing a system card for settings, in one 
example, displayed as a Settings card, a user may change the 
default for the search tool. Further default operations are 
provided by the user interface. While in the home view, any 
typing that occurs on the keyboard (except for hotkeys and 
keyboard shortcuts) will by default populate the searchbox of 
the home view. Pressing return or clinking on the search tool 
255, will execute the process for a new card and pass the 
search terms to the default search tools, and the device dis 
plays the web page view of the default search tool and its 
response to the search terms. 
Example Page Views 
According to one aspect a streamlined user interface is 

provided, that permits a user to access electronic content on a 
device responsive to context and responsive to device con 
figuration. According to one embodiment, an element of a 
graphical user interface that provides streamlined access 
includes a plurality of views of computer content. Another 
element of the GUI, includes visual representations of com 
puter functionality and/or content that are associated with a 
mapping to at least one of the plurality of views. In one 
example, the visual representations comprise cards, as dis 
cussed above. The various types of cards can each be associ 
ated with one of the plurality of views, and may also be 
associated with multiple views. A high level view may be 
provided to manage and organize the (for example in a home 
view). The card may be associated with a lower level view 
which permits more direct interaction with the viewed con 
tent. In one example, a web page view permits a user to 
interact with displayed web content for a web page. Other 
views including a channel page view, provide lower level 
views that permit interaction with content specific to channel 
cards, and system page views provide, for example, a lower 
level view of system functions mapped to by the system cards. 
System cards may be further classified into nascent cards, and 
different page view provided according to classification. 

According to one aspect, methods and systems for stream 
lining user interaction with computer content and operations 
may include a process for providing consistent feature acces 
sibility across a plurality of views and a plurality of visual 
representations of computer content. FIG. 45 illustrates one 
example process, 4500, for providing consistent accessibility 
to computer content across a plurality of views and a plurality 
of visual representations of computer content and/or opera 
tions. At 4502, a view of computer content is provided. The 
view is configured to include visual elements responsive to 
computer focus, however achieved. The view of computer 
content includes a header display further comprising a focus 
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header display and an unfocused header display. In response 
to focus, the focus header display reveals additional controls 
associated with the computer content, 4504. At 4506, focus is 
removed from the focus header display and the computer 
system transitions the view of content to an unfocused header 
display, concealing the additional controls at 4506. In one 
embodiment, responsiveness to focus provides for user con 
sistency in accessing a plurality of views and with respect to 
visual representations of computer content, and at 4508 a 
plurality of representations and views provide additional 
focus responsive displays, which are configured to include 
focused and unfocused presentations. 

According to another aspect, methods and systems for 
streamlining user interaction with computer content and 
operations may include a process for providing consistent 
feature accessibility by providing a primary means for navi 
gation to computer content and computer operations to occur 
through a consistent view. FIG. 46, shows an example pro 
cess, 4600, for providing consistent navigation operations to 
a user. At 4602, a home view is presented to a computer user. 
The home view presents an organization of a plurality of 
visual representations of computer content, 4604. The visual 
representations form the building blocks of the home view. 
Each visual representation is mapped to computer content 
and/or operations that a user may select by, for example, 
hovering on the visual representation, by clicking on it, and 
by using hot keys—among other options. At 4606, a user 
executes the mapping to the computer content and/or opera 
tions. In one example, execution of the mapping causes the 
computer to navigate to a first view of the content. In some 
embodiments, process 4600, comprises further computer 
logic executed by a processor to access a stored mapping, and 
to generate the rendered presentation on the computer display 
of the first view. 

Typically the first view comprises a navigational elements 
displayed in a portion of the first view. The navigational 
element is mapped to the home view. In one example, the 
home view also comprises a navigational element, and a user 
may toggle between the first view and the home view by 
executing the navigational element. In process 4600, a user 
executes the navigational element to return to the home view 
at 4608. In one alternative, a button, a sequence of keyboard 
keys, a hotkey may also cause a computer system to execute 
a transition to a home view. In another alternative, the same 
button, sequence, of keyboard keys, and hot key may cause 
the computer to return to the first view upon a Subsequent 
execution. Returning to the home view at 4608, presents the 
user with a consistent view of content options, and the user 
may select a new first visual representation mapped to other 
computer content at 4610. Execution of the new first visual 
representation caused the computer to navigate to a first view 
of the mapped computer content, returning process 4600, to 
step 4606. Again the user may select a navigational element to 
return the home view at 4608 to select yet another first visual 
representation. In some embodiments, process 4600, repre 
sents a resident process that runs in the background through 
out operation of a computer device. In other examples, pro 
cess 4600 may be exited by powering down the computer 
system (not shown). And in one alternative, a user may exit 
process 4600 by selecting different navigational tools that 
execute mappings to other views. In another alternative, (not 
shown) a view selector may be invoked by changing a con 
figuration of a streamlined device. Invoking the view selector 
can cause the computer system to execute a transition to a 
different view without a return the home view. In one 
example, invocation of the view selector by changing the 
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device configuration from laptop to easel, causes the com 
puter system to transition from a home view to a channel view. 
Example Web Page View 
According to one embodiment, a web page view is the 

computer implemented expression of a selected web card. 
The web page view is configured to present a consistent view 
of web based content to a user. The web page view comprise 
a number of elements that are maintained across the web page 
view of different content, although in Some examples addi 
tional features may be provided to address unique aspects of 
the content being viewed. In one embodiment, the web page 
view includes aheader, 354, FIG. 3C, a body, 356, optionally 
a scroll bar 358, and a navigation element, 352. It is to be 
appreciated that individual web page views may comprise 
additional elements, and should not be read as limited to 
elements discussed with respect to this example. The Header 
354, is responsive to focus of the device. In another embodi 
ment, the header is responsive to the type of content being 
displayed. In one example, the header is further responsive to 
the communication protocol used to access the web based 
content. The header portion may also be responsive to the 
state of the device, and State of the computer operation being 
performed (e.g. loading content). 

Accordingly, in one embodiment the header 354 element of 
the display appears differently based on focus, content, and 
context of the web site being viewed. When the header is out 
of focus, for example, the header may be rendered in an out of 
focus display, shown by example in FIG. 18A. The header 
display comprises navigation element, 1802, page title 1804, 
optionally a visual element associated with the web page is 
displayed 1806, the visual element may be a favicon (reduced 
scale image associated with a website), and where appropri 
ate the header displays a lock symbol 1808 to indicate a 
secure site. For secure sites, hovering over the security sym 
bol 1808, caused the device to display additional information 
regarding the security of the site. In one example, a dialogue 
box appears including information on the security signature 
for the site. 

Page title provides the user the name of the page S/he is on 
in human-readable form. In some embodiments, when the 
header is out of focus, the title of the page extends to the right 
as far as possible. How far the title is display is dependent on 
what other elements are included in the header. For example, 
when the header is out of focus the title has the most room in 
the display. Upon focus, the device causes the header display 
to change. In one example, FIG. 18B illustrates a header, 
1850, in focus, and device now displays additional tools in the 
header. Additional tools may comprise a share tool, 1852 (for 
sharing the web card mapping to the view), bookmark tool, 
1854 (adds web page to bookmark list), more tool, 1856 
(permits revelation of additional tools), search tool, 1858, and 
close tool, 1860. Additional tools may be displayed in the 
header on focus, including, for example, back and forward 
buttons, 1864 that may be used to access other pages in 
browsing history. Additionally, the title display from unfo 
cused view, 1804, FIG. 18A, may be transformed into a web 
addressbox 1862, FIG. 18B. In one embodiment, focus on the 
header display 1850, causes the device to transform the title 
display into an address box, 1862. The address box maintains 
the title of the web site, until a user interacts with the address 
box, by for example typing into it. Once the system detects 
interaction with the address box, the display in the address 
box will indicate a url and/or uri for the current site (or 
whatever the user is typing). Other options may be made 
available through the header by display and selection of a 
more tool, 1856. For example, the device displays a toolbar, 
1904, in response to user selection of the more tool 1902, FIG. 
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19. The toolbar supports operations, 1906, provided by con 
ventional browser of other known systems. The toolbar 1904 
may also be revealed in response to keyboard short-cuts, for 
example, crt1-fopens a search box, 1908, permitting the user 
to specify terms to find within the web page view. The toolbar 
display may be responsive to the content appearing in the web 
page view. For example, the device will display Zoom tools 
instead of-text size and +text size in response to .pdf content. 

Other standard operations and options may be supported in 
the toolbar. In one embodiment, the toolbar supports, find in 
page, find in page Next/Prev, for Scrolling through hits within 
the page, save photos, -text size/+text size, to increase or 
decrease the size of the text (text sizing may be implemented 
globally so that changes in text size for one web page view 
will affect all web page views—alternatively the setting may 
be local to the present web page view), refresh, cut, paste 
copy, and print. Print and save behavior for a streamlined 
device does depart from conventional operation. 

According to one embodiment, the header may also display 
additional tools whether the header is in focus or out of focus, 
responsive to the content of the page. In one embodiment, the 
header, 1890-1891, FIG. 18C, displays an add a channel tool, 
1892, regardless of focus (1890 out of focus, 1891 in focus). 
In one example, the device determines that the accessed con 
tent has either a rss feed, or a custom view for the static 
web-page, and in response reveals the add a channel feature in 
the header. Selecting the add a channel causes the device to 
execute a process for generating a new channel card as dis 
cussed further herein. 

According to another embodiment, the state of the content 
in the view may impact the tools displayed. For example, 
when a user is interacting with the address box (e.g. to enter 
a URL or URI) or when a page is not fully loaded, possible 
actions are limited. The device causes the header display to 
adjust to remove options that are unavailable (e.g. namely 
Share. Add channel, Bookmarks, and More), and adds the 
following elements Go/Stop tool 1895, FIG. 18D, and a status 
indicator 1896. Selecting Go causes the device to initiate 
navigation and start loading a URL or URI listed in the 
address box. The stop button appears while a page is load 
ing—clicking the button will stop the page from loading. The 
Go/Stop tool toggles between a presentation of Go when a 
pageahs not yet been loaded and Stop when a content is being 
accessed, for example. The status indicator may include a 
customized visualization. The customized visualization may 
be configured to tie various functions and features together. In 
one example, the status indicator is configured to display as a 
“loading spring,” 1896. 1896, is animated to show that the 
device is actively downloading content. It is to be appreciated 
that although the Go/Stop tool is display in the same space on 
the header in the described example, the display for either 
function may also be rendered separately, or display above 
and below, among other options. 
The header display may be further responsive to focus and 

selection. In FIG. 18E, shown is a header after selection of the 
search tool 1858. In response to selection of the search tool, 
the device alters the heading display to includean search box 
1898, for entry of search terms. Once the search is initiated 
the device alters the header to eliminate search box 1898. 

Navigation within Web Page View 
According to one aspect, navigating web pages within the 

web page view is similar to existing browsers on other sys 
tems. For most links, when a user clicks the link, the device 
executes a process to load a new web page into the body of the 
current web page view, replacing the contents of the current 
page. The device operates different in response to links that 
request a new window. For new window links or new tablinks 
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the device executes a process to generate a new web card, and 
further the new card is mapped to the link destination. The 
device executes functionality that causes the display to 
“Zoom’ into the new card and present the content from the 
link destination. 

According to one aspect, transitions between active web 
page views occurs through the home view. The user selects a 
navigation element (e.g. 352 FIG. 3C) to return to the home 
view, alternatively, a navigation button (e.g. 168, FIG. 17) 
will return the user to the home view. In another embodiment, 
hotkeys and/or shortcut keys may be employed to cause the 
system to return to a home view. In response to selection of 
the shortcut and/or hotkeys, the device executes a transition 
to the home view. From the home view a user may select any 
other card or generate new cards, as discussed above. 

Creation of channel cards occurs differently from a web 
page view, than when done in a home view. In one embodi 
ment, in response to selection of add channel in a web page 
view, the system returns to the home view, displays the cre 
ation of the new card, and presents the creation of the new 
card so that both the new card and the web card from which 
add channel was selected is displayed. In this example pro 
cess any maximal display threshold may be ignored in order 
to display both the originating card and the new channel card. 
Once the card generation is complete the system Zooms back 
into the original web page view for continued browsing. 
Alternatively, a system may enter a channel view of the newly 
created channel creation. In one embodiment, the behavior of 
the system may be altered according to settings accessed 
through a system card, and in one example a settings card. 

Channel Page View 
According to one embodiment, the channel page view is 

the Zoomed-in computer implemented expression of a chan 
nel card. A channel page view presents a unique view into 
content made available through a website. The channel page 
view employs visualizations similar to corresponding visual 
ization on channel cards but the large format of the view 
allows for a better display of content, and provides for 
increased interaction with users. The channel page view also 
comprises a mapping from the display content to the Source 
from which the content is derived. Typically, content dis 
played in the channel page view is derived from an rSS feed 
associated with a web-site. Additionally, some non-rSS sites 
have customized visualizations that can be accessed through 
a channel page view. 

According to one embodiment, the channel page view con 
figured to present a consistent framework for user interaction 
with rSS style content. The channel page view comprises a 
number of elements that are maintained across the channel 
page views of different content, although in Some examples 
additional features may be provided to address unique aspects 
of the content being viewed. An example channel page view 
is illustrated in FIG. 20A, 2000. The channel page view 
shown includes a header 2002, which includes a display for 
the title of the channel page view, 2006, a share tool, 2006, 
web link 2008, and status indicator 2010. The header may 
also include navigation element 2012 for returning to a home 
view among other functionality. The channel page view also 
includes abody 2014, for displaying available rss items 2016 
2022. Selection of the displayed rss items 2016-2022, caused 
the system to display the web page view of the selected 
article, web link 2008, shown as “go to web page' in FIG. 20. 
creates a new web card for the page from which the channel 
was created. 

Other channel page views may also be employed. FIG. 
20B, illustrates another example of a channel page view, 
2050. Shown in 2050 is a specialized channel view for a news 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 244 of 521 PageID #: 350



US 9,003,315 B2 
51 

channel. Example view 2050 is separated into two scrollable 
columns, providing a headline column 2052, for displaying 
individual rSS items and a content column. Content column, 
2054, presents the details of rss items (if the content does not 
require additional space other than the displayed screen a 
scroll bard will not be displayed). The content column shows 
the headline, 2056, includes the time the item was posted 
2058 (in one example relative to current time), the author, 
2060, and the items description, 2061, in its entirety. Accord 
ing to one embodiment, images and/or script (html, Xml, etc.) 
may also be displayed in the content column (not shown). The 
content column may also comprise a navigation element, 
2062. In one example the navigation element is labeled “full 
story.” The system launches the item's url as a new web card, 
and transitions to a web page view of that url in response to 
selection of 2062. Optionally, focus and/or hovering over the 
full story button causes the system to generate a preview view 
of the new card that would be created in response to selection 
of full story. 

Selection of one of the content items, e.g. 2070-2076, 
causes the system to display the headline, author, posting 
time, and full description for the selected rss item. Scroll bar, 
2080, is displayed if the number of items in the headline 
column, 2052, require additional pages of display. A scroll 
bar may be display in the content column as well, if the 
content display requires additional pages. According to one 
embodiment, channel page views are configured to retain 
current state. The system accesses retained state when revis 
iting a channel view. According to one embodiment, a process 
for accessing a channel page view determines if any state 
information is retained for the channel page view. In response 
to a determination that state information exists, the system 
presents the last accessed content item in the content column. 
If the last content item is no longer available, the system 
selects the first content item by default. 
An alternative view of channel content comprises a full 

screen view of rSS items. In one example a channel full view 
comprises a headline display center in the screen. According 
to another embodiment, preview text is displayed in conjunc 
tion with the rss item. In one example, the channel full view 
includes displays configured to identify the source of the rSS 
feed. In another example, a logo for the Source feed is cap 
tured and displayed as part of the channel full view. In 
response to selection within the channel full view, the system 
displays a content menu permitting selection of any of the rSS 
items for the content source. In one embodiment, the content 
menu appears as a list of rSS items displayed at the lower 
portion of the channel full view. The content menu is config 
ured to be responsive to manipulation of the embedded scroll 
wheel. Manipulation of the scroll wheel progresses through 
the displayed content menu, and in response the system dis 
plays the selected content in the full view with preview text 
appearing below. Shown in FIG.21 is an example of a channel 
full view 2100, with content menu 2102 activated by selec 
tion. Manipulation of the scroll wheel causes the system to 
scroll through the items in the content menu. In one embodi 
ment, the content menu transitions between selections by 
rendering the apparent movement of the entire content menu 
either to the left of the right depending upon the orientation of 
the manipulation of the scroll wheel. Alternatively, the con 
tent menu is also responsive to arrow keys on the keyboard. 
Depressing an arrow key causes the system to display the 
apparent movement of the content menu to the next item. 

According to some embodiments, the various channel 
views, for example, page and full view may also include 
animations of transitions between available rss feed items. 
Default operation of the streamlined computer system and 
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streamlined user interfaces cause the system to display tran 
sitions from one rSS item to the next in association with a time 
period. Transitions may include animations that cause the 
system to display new rSS items sliding into position as the 
previous rSS item slides out of view. In one example, an rSS 
headline item slides out of view in response to the next head 
line item sliding into view. The device and user interfaces may 
also be responsive to manipulation of the scroll wheel. For 
example, manipulation of the scroll may by default invoke a 
transition to a channel card view. 

System Page View 
According to one embodiment, the system page view is the 

Zoomed-in computer implemented expression of a system 
card. The system cards provide a user with the ability to 
interact with the device's settings and other computer opera 
tions. System cards also enable a user to access customized 
functionality, for example, photo and video interactions. 
According to one aspect, certain interactions with computer 
content are identified as special. The identification of special 
interactions is reflected in rendering those operations as sys 
tem cards. System cards have the property, that they cannot be 
removed by a user. This insures that identified functionality 
remains available regardless of user intention. Additionally, 
the number of system cards can be limited, providing a dis 
tinctive interface element for system operation and important 
interactions even within the streamlined GUI. In one embodi 
ment, system cards are limited to a photo and video card 
(controlling photo and video operations), a settings card (per 
mitting access to device settings), a bookmark card (dis 
cussed herein), a camera card (permitting set and interaction 
with a camera), and a browse the web card (discussed herein). 
Although it is to be appreciated that other system cards may 
be implemented and the invention is not limited to the system 
cards provide as example above. 
The anatomy of the system card is similar to the anatomy of 

other cards. For example, an embodiment of the system card 
includes aheader, 2202, FIG.22, a navigation element, 2204. 
a title 2206, and a body 2208. As discussed herein, nascent 
cards may be categorized as a type of system card. Alterna 
tively, nascent cards may comprise their own category. While 
nascent cards share a similar format as the other cards, 
nascent cards do not have a page view. Nascent cards map 
directly to system functionality, that is executed upon selec 
tion or as part of a call from another process. 

Channel Card View 
According to one aspect, a channel card view is provided to 

display high level navigation options to a user, to enable 
streamlines selection of content and operations by making 
selections within a streamlines view. Similar to the home 
view the channel card view is configured to render a consis 
tent organization of navigational elements of a streamlined 
graphical user interface. Unlike the home view, the channel 
card view is not based on pages of display, rather the channel 
card view is organized to display only one type of content, 
that is content that may be rendered in a channel (i.e. having 
an rSS feed or customized visualization, and for special sys 
tem cards). The channel card view is available in both laptop 
and easel modes of the streamlined device. In response to 
configuration of the device into easel mode, the channel card 
view is rendered by default. The content displayed in the 
channel card view is dependent on the channel cards dis 
played in the home view. Alternatively the channel card view 
may be invoked by operating the scroll wheel embedded in 
the device. 

In response to operation of the Scroll wheel, the system 
displays the channel card view, FIG. 23, illustrates an 
example of a channel card view, 2300. According to one 
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embodiment, the channel card view comprises selector dis 
play 2302. In another embodiment, the channel card view 
includes a selector display, 2302. The selector view is invoked 
upon the first click of the scroll wheel while in easel mode, in 
laptop mode, additional clicks may be required to invoke the 
channel card view and selector. In one example, the three 
clicks are necessary to invoke the channel card view while the 
device is in a laptop mode. In another example two clicks are 
required. Upon invocation the channel card view comprises a 
visualization of the channel cards available for selection. In 
one example, the visualization resembles and behaves like a 
rolodex. As the user moves the scroll wheel individual chan 
nels 2304-2310 appear to flip around the hinge of the device. 
In response to selection, the foremost channel card displayed 
is selected and displayed full screen. In one example, selec 
tion includes activation of button 168, FIG. 17, from the easel 
mode of the device, although in laptop mode selection can 
occur in a number of ways including by operation of button 
168. In another example, a different button may be selected or 
short cut keys, among other options. 

In response to selection from the channel selector view, the 
system displays a channel page view. On example of a chan 
nel page view for photo content is shown in FIG. 24. Accord 
ing to one embodiment, the channel page view of the photo 
content automatically scans though each photo by default in 
the channel page view. The photo display restarts again at the 
begin when the end of the photo content is reached. In another 
embodiment, the default operation is to display only the 
selected content item (e.g. photo). FIG. 25A, illustrates an 
example logical diagram of the behavior for the channel view. 
From channel page view 2502, selection of the menu button 
(e.g. FIG. 4, 166), caused the device to display the content 
menu, 2504, over the present channel page view. Selection of 
the menu button from the content menu, causes the device to 
display the selected content item in a channel page view 2502. 
From channel page view 2502, operation of the scroll wheel 
(e.g. FIG. 4, 132), causes the device to display channel selec 
tor view 2506. 

According to one embodiment, photo content displayed as 
a channel in the user interface, can be accessed similarly. 
Shown is an example of channel functionality, in logical 
diagram 2550, FIG. 25B. From channel page view 2552, of 
the photo channel, selection of the menu button (e.g. FIG. 4, 
166), causes the device to display the content menu, 2554, 
over the present channel page view. Selection of the menu 
button from the content menu, causes the device to display the 
selected content item in a channel page view 2552. From 
channel page view 2552, operation of the scroll wheel (e.g. 
FIG. 4, 132), causes the device to display channel selector 
View 2556. 

According to one embodiment, channels for displaying 
video content and/or audio content operate with a different 
logical flow. In one example, additional interactivity is 
required to allow a user to, for example, stop a video, start a 
Video from the middle, among other options. According to 
one embodiment, the streamlined device must be able to 
accommodate routine operations through manipulation of 
only a scroll wheel and a mouse, for example when the device 
is in an easel mode. It is to be appreciated that in other 
configurations the logical flow for the behavior of the channel 
view may be different, and may take advantage of addition 
input/output devices available in other device modes. Shown 
in FIG. 28, is an example of a logical flow for device/UI 
functionality, during the normal operation of a channel view 
of video content. At 2802 shown is a channel page view of 
video content, select of button (e.g. FIG. 4, 132), causes the 
device to display contextual menu 2804. Contextual menu, 
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includes a visual representation of selectable options, 2806. 
The selectable options rendered include at least a rewind/fast 
forward selector, resume selection, other episodes. Selection 
of rewind/fast forward selector invokes a timeline controller 
2809 shown in the content page view, 2808. The time line 
controller is responsive to rotation of the scroll wheel, pro 
viding fast forward in one direction and rewind in the other. 
From 2808, selection ofbutton 132 causes the device to return 
the view to channel page view 2802. Selection of resume form 
2804, also causes the device to return the view to channel 
page view 2802. Selection of other episodes from 2804 
causes the device to invoke content menu 2810, which pro 
vides a selector view of available content for the channel. 
Selection of content, 2811, from the selector view causes the 
system to play the selected content in channel page view 
2802. From channel page view 2802, the devices displays 
channel selector 2812, in response to operation of the scroll 
wheel. The logical flow illustrated may be used for interac 
tions with audio content as well, for example, to control 
playing of .mp3 or other audio file. 

Selecting Device Configurations 
According to one aspect, Systems and method for stream 

lining user interaction with electronic content include a plu 
rality of physical configurations for a streamlined device, the 
streamlined device may be, for example, a portable computer. 
As discussed above the plurality of configurations may rep 
resent modes of operation of the device, and include for 
example laptop mode, easel mode, among others. According 
to another aspect the user interface that governs interactions 
between the user the device and accessed content is respon 
sive the selected mode and/or configuration of the stream 
lined device. 

According to one embodiment, the streamlined device 
retains information on device configuration and/or mode. In 
on example, information is maintained as a state variable in a 
systems register. In another example, the system may obtain 
state from signals provide by an embedded sensor, as dis 
cussed above. The state information may be used to generate 
a system response, when the device detects a change in con 
figuration and/or mode. 

In a typical setting a user interacts with a streamlined 
device in one of two viewing modes. The two viewing modes 
reflect a level of interactivity with the device being viewed. A 
lean forward view encompasses interactions between a user 
and conventional computer systems. One example includes a 
user typing at the keyboard of their laptop computer, in 
essence, the userleans into the computer device and display to 
perform interactions and view content. Similarly a user's 
interaction with desktop computers are conducted through a 
forward mode of interaction. It is realized that traditional 
computer devices and systems are notorious bad at permitting 
interaction with content and the device from greater dis 
tances. 

Interactions with content and other device for example a 
television are included in the second type of viewing mode. A 
lean back mode of viewing is meant to encompass ordinary 
television viewing, and the interactions a viewer has with 
their DVR for example. Television and their associated 
devices are configured to provide for lean back styled inter 
actions. It is realized that conventional system and methods 
fail to provide for the transition from lean forward to lean 
back interactions. As discussed above, streamlined devices 
can accommodate a plurality of configurations, and indi 
vidual configurations may be designed to accommodate the 
different viewing modes. Additionally, the streamlined user 
interface is configured to be responsive to the configurations. 
For example, transitions from a laptop mode of the device 
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may trigger changes in the user interface. According to one 
embodiment, a transition from laptop mode to easel mode, 
causes the device to transition from either a home view or web 
page view to a channel selector view. The transition from 
laptop to easel, may also trigger a transition from a channel 
page view to channel selector view. In one alternative, the 
transition causes the device to display a channel full view for 
that channel card. The transition from easel to laptop may also 
cause the device to alter the view displayed to a user. In one 
example, if a new card has been shared, the device causes the 
home view to be displayed. The last page of the home view is 
displayed where the new card is rendered. 

According to another embodiment, methods and systems 
for streamlining user interactions may include a process for 
transitioning between different user viewing positions. 
Shown in FIG. 48, is an example process 4800, for permitting 
a user to select a viewing mode for a streamlined device, and 
in response displaying a user interface view configured for the 
selected viewing mode. At 4802, a streamline computer sys 
tem presents computer content using visual representation 
optimized for different viewing modes. In particular, ones of 
the visual representations are configured to display in a “lean 
forward user viewing mode and a “lean backward’ viewing 
mode. In one example, a lean forward user viewing mode 
includes a user typing at a keyboard of a laptop computer. In 
another example, a lean backward user viewing mode 
includes a user viewing a television from a distance. One 
should appreciate that the examples provided are illustrative 
and are not intended to be limiting. A streamlined device 
permits a user to select a device configuration most Suited to 
a particular user viewing mode. For example, a user may 
rotate a streamlined device's display relative to its based 
about an longitudinal axis, transitioning the device from a 
laptop mode to an easel mode. According to one embodiment, 
the easel mode of the device permits improved “lean back” 
interactions with computer content. In other words, the easel 
mode makes it easier to view the streamlined device's display 
from distances greater than conventionally used with laptop 
computers. Selection of a lean backward user viewing mode 
at 4804, triggers the streamlined device to transition to a 
content display that improves user interaction. On one 
example, in response to the user selection at 4804, the com 
puter system display transitions to a channel viewing mode at 
4806. The channel viewing mode is configured to present 
computer content, in large footprint displays, and further is 
designed to streamline user interaction with the streamlined 
device by permitting access through a first I/O profile asso 
ciated with the streamlined device in easel mode. The first I/O 
profile in easel mode may consist of a scroll wheel and a 
selector button. In some embodiments, the first I/O profile 
may include a Volume control. 

Other processes may be invoked to cause a user interface to 
transition between views in response to changes in device 
configuration. Shown in FIG. 49A, is an example process 
4900, for transitioning between a lean forward view to a lean 
backward view. At 4902, a user changes the streamlined 
device configuration from laptop to easel mode. In response 
the computer system switches view from its current view to a 
channel view. In some examples, the computer system is 
already in a channel view, and no transition is implemented. 
The easel mode of the streamlined device is associated with a 
first I/O profile including an integrated scroll wheel and a 
selector button. Upon manipulation of the scroll wheel, a 
view selector causes the computer system to display a pro 
gression through a sequence of channel cards as the scroll 
wheel is rotated, at 4906. Optionally the sequence may 
include other customized cards (in one example a photo and 
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Video card). Upon selection of a displayed channel card, a 
channel full view is invoked at 4908. The channel full view 
displays the content of the selected channel card in the 
entirety of the computer system display screen. The system 
returns to the channel view in response to further rotation of 
the scroll wheel. 
Shown in FIG. 49B, is another example process, 4950, for 

transitioning between user views. At 4952, a user changes a 
device configuration from an easel mode to a laptop mode. In 
response to the change in mode, the device displays a home 
view of available content, at 4954. In some examples, the 
system may already be in a home view and no transition 
occurs. The user may interact with the streamlined device 
through a second I/O profile at 4956. In some embodiments, 
the second I/O profile includes a keyboard, a touch pad, 
buttons, webcam, and a scroll wheel. 

Streamlined Device Community 
According to one aspect, a common experience may be 

created formultiple users, fostering a community experience. 
According to another aspect, the common experience may 
also include a community aspect. The community aspect 
includes sharing of content between users, sharing of content 
and configurations, sharing of content, configurations, and 
customizations, among many other options. In particular, 
sharing may involve the transmission of user interface ele 
ments to other users. The visual representations that map to 
content and/or computer operations on one device may be 
transmitted to another device or another user. In one example, 
a user may share a card and any of its configurations with 
another user. Access to the shared user interface elements, in 
Some embodiments, facilitates communal computerusage. In 
one example, a first user may be watching media on their 
streamlined device, another user known to the first user, may 
receive a user interface element that retains information 
related to the accessed content and information related to the 
present context. That is for the first user watching a movie, the 
first user may share the user interface element (e.g. a channel 
card mapped to video content) through which S/he is access 
ing the movie, and permit the another user not only to watch 
the movie, but to take up the movie at the same point in time, 
so in essence, they get to enjoy the movie together. Content 
and context retention by user interface elements that can be 
shared provides unique advantages to the users of the stream 
lined devices. 

In some embodiments, the community aspect incorporates 
formation of groups. In one example, groups are formed 
based on at least one of a social relationship, familial rela 
tions, work relationship, etc. Different groups may share dif 
ferent content and even different context for the same content 
through for example, shared user interface elements. Groups 
may be further organized into nodes or a node may comprise 
the group. In some examples, a family forms a node regard 
less of the family's location relative to each other. As part of 
the configurations that may also occur as part of the device's 
purchase, at least one of the users identifies his/her family 
members. The family members are configured into a node. 
The node may be used to permit sharing of content. The node 
may be used to permit sharing of cards. Further updates to 
configurations on device in the node may be propagated auto 
matically to other devices in the node. 
Communication between groups members may take place 

over the internet. In one embodiment, a sub-network utilizes 
the internet or other communication network to communicate 
between streamlined device users. In another embodiment, a 
service is hosted for streamlined device users to facilitate 
communication. The service may also be connected to the 
internet and in one example functions as a gateway between 
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users, their devices, content, sharing, and communicating. 
The service facilitates real time sharing, in one example a user 
may share a movie S/he is viewing with another. Not only may 
the user share the information that S/he is watching a movie, 
but the user may allow another to watch the movie starting at 
the same place, allowing the users to perceive they are watch 
ing the movie together. 

FIG. 29A, illustrates an example interaction between a 
user, the device, and the user interface, where the device 
causes a web card to be shared to other users. Shown is web 
page view, 2900, in response to user selection of share 2902, 
the device displays a share interface 2904. The device 
accesses the user profile to determine any groups or nodes that 
the user has created. In example view, 2900, the user has only 
one group, family members 2906. Each entry listed in family 
members represents another streamlined device/user. Box 
2908 permits sharing of the card with other users of conven 
tional systems. Comment may be included. For example, a 
user may type any comment on the card being share into box 
2910. Comments entered on a shared card are displayed with 
the card on receipt by another streamlined device user. The 
user selects any one or more of the listed members 2914 
2920, or the user selects 2912 to share the card with all the 
listed members. Once the selections have been made and any 
comments entered the user selects 2924 Share! And the card 
is transmitted. By selecting Never Mind 2924, the device 
closes the share interface. In FIG. 29B, shown is an example 
of a web page view after a share operation has been com 
pleted. At 2950, the device notifies the user that the selected 
item has been shared. For other streamlined device users 
share content is received by their streamlined device as a web 
card. For other users, an e-mail with a link to the content is 
delivered. It is to be appreciated that FIG. 29A, illustrates a 
user with one group or node. In other embodiments, a user 
may be permitted to generate a plurality of groups or nodes. 
Box 2926 may first display a list of groups, that a user may 
select from, in order to show the members of the selected 
groups. In one embodiment, box 2926 lists more members 
that can be accommodated in the space provide by the inter 
face. An optional Scroll bar may be displayed into to permit 
ting display of additional group members. 

FIG. 30 illustrates an example of a received shared card, 
3000. The state of the streamlined device may impact behav 
ior of the device in response to receipt of a shared card. In 
screensaver mode, a streamlined device presents received 
shared cards as part of the screen saver view,3000. Comments 
included with the shared card, are presented in an overlay box 
3002, and any text that does not display is a first screen is 
scrolled into view 3004, while the content of the shared card 
is displayed. The overlay box 3002, may include an image of 
the user who shared the card and/or content, at 3006. Shared 
display 3000, may also include an indicator regarding the 
number of content items in the shared card. For example at 
3008, the number of content items in the photo set being 
displayed indicates 1 of 4. Other information associated with 
individual content items may also be displayed at 3010. In the 
screen saver mode, the shared content items are each display, 
a timer controls the length of time each item is display before 
continuing on to the next item. The device then returns to any 
screen saver content that was being displayed when the 
shared card came in. 

For users receiving shared content while in an active view 
(e.g. non-screensaver views), the system may provide a noti 
fication message to indicate shared content. From the home 
view, for example, the system generates notification message 
to display in a message bubble. An visual indicator is 
employed to notify the user that a system message is present. 
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In one example, the navigation item displayed in the home 
view (e.g. FIG. 2,250), is animated to indicate a message. An 
example notification is illustrated in FIG. 31. Navigation 
element 3102 may be animated, the device displays message 
bubble 3104 upon focus resolving on element 3102. The user 
may select 3106 or 3108. Upon selection the device displays 
the shared card of 3106, or the device returns to the home view 
3108. 

Similar notifications may be employed in conjunction with 
other views. Further similar notifications may be used for 
other contexts. In response to displaying a web page view of 
a web page with stored user name information, a device may 
present a notification message regarding the availability of 
account information. FIG. 32 illustrates an example message 
for a site with two stored accounts. By default the system 
displays the content without using the stored account infor 
mation. The device causes the message to disappear if a 
selection is not made, or if browsing activity continues with 
out selection of an account. According to Some embodiment, 
notifications can either require a response/action or the noti 
fication may disappear if no action is taken. Typically, noti 
fications that do not require an action are used to convey 
information. 

In one embodiment, from channel view in laptop mode, the 
notification of the arrival of new cards is the same as in home 
or page view. Typically navigation element 3302, FIG. 33. 
does not appearin the channel view. In response to a new card, 
the device displays 3302 and may animate its display. In 
response to focus on the 3302, a notification bubble 3304 
appears. The system displays the home view for the page 
containing the first new card in response to selection of 3302 
or 33.06. 
When a notification is available in channel view, moving 

the scroll wheel invokes the Channel Selector view, but the 
system displays the first new card by default (instead of the 
current channel). When in channel view in easel mode, the 
notification of the arrival of new cards is similar as above, 
except that both the navigation element and the notification 
bubble may appear at once. Shown in FIG. 34, is an example 
of a notification message from a channel view while in easel 
mode. The system displays both 3302 navigation element and 
3404 message bubble together in response to shared content. 

In one embodiment of a streamlined device, the user inter 
face is configured to provide for passive viewing of selected 
content through a screensaver mode. The device enters 
screensaver mode in response to the expiration of aidle timer 
expiring. Any interaction with the device causes the device to 
exit screensaver mode. In Screensaver mode, channel cards 
and content are display in order. An idle time out period may 
be established to force a transition to a new channel in the 
event the idle time out period is exceeded before all the 
content of the channel is displayed. 

According to some embodiments, the community experi 
ence is enhanced through particular features and functions 
facilitated by the device, the user interface layer, and/or con 
figurations designed to facilitate interaction among users (ei 
ther with the device features themselves or also with third 
party services). According to another aspect, community 
experience and/or community learning furthers adoption and/ 
or integration of new computer features into a particular 
user's routine. It is realized that facilitation of communication 
and/or content sharing across users improves introduction of 
features and increases the likelihood of their adoption. Con 
text and content sharing are provided for and through stream 
lined interfaces. The sharing opportunities may be device 
sensitive, that is, a user with a same/similar device can be 
identified by a specific user. The users with identical devices 
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may have the most options for how to share, what content to 
share, context settings, and may also include the ability to 
share features associated with the content. In one embodi 
ment, a user may enable features associated with a card based 
interface and through sharing the card make another user 
aware of features of the card interface that the receiving user 
was unaware of. In another embodiment, the shared card 
provides all of the configurations established for the originat 
ing card. In one alternative, security features may be invoke to 
clear certain settings of a card to insure that for example, 
banking information is not shared to another user. In another 
alternative, the user selecting share is prompted to confirm the 
share request. In response to a security identifier, the prompt 
to confirm includes a warning banner regarding the identified 
security issue. In one example, a user receives a warning that 
sharing a card including banking content may compromise 
the bank accounts referenced. In another embodiment, a share 
request with an identified security issue is denied. 

In some embodiments, the community aspect incorporates 
formation of groups. In one example, groups are formed 
based on Social relationship, familial relations, work relation 
ship, etc. Different groups may share different content and 
even different context for the same content through for 
example, shared user interface elements. Groups may be fur 
ther organized into nodes or a node may comprise the group. 
In some examples, a family forms a node regardless of the 
family's location relative to each other. As part of the con 
figurations that may also occur as part of the device's pur 
chase, at least one of the users identifies his/her family mem 
bers. The family members are configured into a node. The 
node may be used to permit sharing of content. The node may 
be used to permit sharing of cards. Further updates to con 
figurations on device in the node may be propagated auto 
matically to other devices in the node. 

According to another embodiment, sharing options may 
also be adapted to different devices being operated by sharing 
users. For example, certain features may be disabled when a 
card or content is shared outside of a streamlined device 
community. In some embodiments, communities may be 
based on the device being employed, membership in a group, 
and/or membership in a node. Additionally communities may 
be based on Social interactions, familial relationships, etc. 
Examples of communities include name lists of user identi 
fied by the device operator. In one example, community lists 
and/or community groups are pre-generated in response to 
questions asked of a potential purchaser. User names may 
also be added and maintained by the user. Additionally, the 
system may create community lists on behalf of a user based 
on the user's activity. 

For example, when composing and sending an e-mail, the 
system may query the user to determine if the recipient should 
be within the user's community. In one alternative, the system 
may add the recipient to a potential community and make the 
addition Subject to a later confirmation. In another option, the 
e-mail recipient is added by default to a group with minimal 
sharing options. The user is provided the option of changing 
the group associated with the recipient. Additions to commu 
nity list may require additional configurations to become 
effective. For example, the device user may be required to 
accept additions, a device user may be required to identify if 
the added name corresponds to another user of a similar same 
type of device, among other configurations options. 

Specialized Operations 
According to another aspect, certain features of convention 

computer interactions have been specially configured to 
present streamlined interaction between a device, a user, and 
content. In one embodiment, the device does not incorporate 
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mass storage (i.e. a hard drives), instead the system is config 
ured to employ RAM and Flash memory storage. The capac 
ity of the flash memory is significantly less than traditional 
mass storage options. Thus in some embodiments, traditional 
features such a download, have been configured to operate 
differently for a streamlined device. 

In one example, download links do not cause a streamlined 
device to download content. Instead, a download link is inter 
preted by the device, which initiates a process for handling 
download links. An example process includes accessing a 
third party provider of remote storage to retain the content 
identified in the download link. According to one embodi 
ment, the purchase of a streamlined device, includes creation 
of an account with access to on-line storage. In one example, 
remote storage for a device is provided in conjunction with 
user information stored to customize the device and configure 
its operation to the particular user. 

In one embodiment, customized configuration files Supply 
information required for integration for known third party 
providers. In some embodiments, customized configuration 
files are used to establish default interactions with for 
example, Shutterfly, an on-line third party photo management 
and sharing service. In other examples, customized configu 
ration files are used with other third party on-line service 
providers. Other third party providers include GMAIL, HOT 
MAIL, YAHOO! MAIL to provide examples of e-mail ser 
vice providers. Other providers include, for example, online 
banking providers, financial system providers, university sys 
tems, web site development providers, dating services, and 
Social networking sites. One should appreciate that the inte 
gration of an on-line service need not depend on a predeter 
mined configuration file or settings, rather, various embodi 
ments of the systems and methods are adapted to learn from 
user interaction and develop appropriate configurations. Cer 
tain embodiments are further configured to take advantage of 
configurations developed by other users of Such systems and 
methods, permitting sharing of content, sharing of configu 
rations, etc. According to one aspect, by using input from the 
users, learning from user interactions, permitting content 
sharing, permitting sharing of configurations, and by provid 
ing default configurations for more popular services almost 
any on-line service can be integrated. 

Still other embodiments, may query the user upon entry/ 
access into a new service for any information necessary to 
configure the device to provide streamlined presentation and 
integration of the third party service. In some embodiments, 
the process of streamlining user interactions with electronic 
content includes querying the user regarding Subscribed ser 
vices and/or functions the user would like to use on their 
computer. For example, during processing of a purchase of a 
streamlined device a prospective purchaser receives a query 
form, or the user may receive individual questions regarding 
the purchaser's present computer use. In one example, the 
questions will generate a profile of Subscribed services, 
whether pay or free, and customize the user interface to per 
mit streamlined interaction with those services out of the box. 
In one example, default configurations and/or questions 
designed to elicit required configurations, allow the user to 
interact with GUI elements customized to his/her current use 
and preferences. 
A process for handling download links may be responsive 

to the particular content selected for download. In one 
example, the system analyzes the selected download link to 
determine the type of content selected for downloading. In 
response, the system identifies accounts held by the user for 
processing the selected content. If multiple accounts exists 
that handle the selected content, the account first created is 
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used by default. A user may alter default operation through 
use of system settings. For photo content, as one example, the 
system identifies the content as a picture (.jpg, gif...tif, etc.). 
The user's profile contains information for accessing 
FLICKR, a third party provider of photo access and manage 
ment services. The download link is interpreted into an opera 
tion to transfer the file into the user's FLICKR gallery. Other 
services may be used to host the content, for example, the 
download link may be interpreted to cause the system to 
upload the photo to the well known MYSPACE or FACE 
BOOK services. For content that cannot be identified, the 
streamlined device causes the download request to be inter 
preted as a delivery request to a generic remote storage ser 
vice. The remote storage service may be one provided 
through a third party provider, or may be the remote storage 
space provided by a seller of the streamlined device. 
An example process, 4200, is shown in FIG. 42 for stream 

lining user interactions with digital content. The user interac 
tion with digital content is streamlined by enhancing features 
for simplifying user decisions by providing access informa 
tion associated with multiple user accounts for a particular 
online source. Multiple account profiles can be retained and 
presented to a user of a streamlined device. Example process 
4200 begins at step 4202, permitting a user to access elec 
tronic content through the streamlined device. At 4204 the 
Source of the electronic content is determined and matched 
against available access information. Access information 
may be stored in a device profile or in another example in a 
user profile. These profiles may be loaded at startup of the 
device or may be accessed in real time when a content Source 
is determined. At 4204(NO) no access information is avail 
able for the content source, and the electronic content is 
display at 4206. Example electronic content includes web 
pages and other online resources. At 4204(YES) the content 
Source is matched against available access information. At 
4208, access information is displayed to a user in a user 
interface. The access information typically identifies a user 
account available to access the content source. In one 
example, for an e-mail service this will include the e-mail 
address displayed in the interface. A plurality of access 
accounts may be available for a given service. The stream 
lined device is configured to handle multiple users with mul 
tiple accounts to any given services. The user interface per 
mits the user to identify which access account is desired. At 
4210(NO) the user does not identify an access account, and at 
4212 a default access account is used. The default access 
account does not provide any account information, and the 
content source page is display, at 4216, not including any 
sign-on information. At 4210(YES) a user selects an access 
account and at 4214 the access information is passed to the 
content source, and the displayed content at 4216 will return 
content after the sign-on process has been completed. 

In another embodiment, a process for handling download 
operations is provided. The process includes causing the 
device to display a download interface, for example interface, 
3500, FIG.35. The interface presents the user with options for 
processing the download request. Box3502, lists members of 
the user's group to whom the user may send the file. Box 
3504, permits a user to enter e-mail addresses to send the file 
as an attachment or as a link if a size threshold is exceeded. 
For a user who has configured third party service capable of 
handling the file content, Box, 3506, displays the configured 
providers (e.g. Shutterfly 3508, Flickr 3510, DropBox,3512). 
Each configured service displays with the account name con 
figured for the service, for example at 3514. 

In one example, process, for interpreting download opera 
tions also includes displaying the interface in response to 
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computer focus on the download link. In another example, 
hovering over the link causes the system to display a down 
load interface. For files sent by e-mail the system may be 
configured with a maximal file size for particular e-mail Ser 
vices. Typically files sizes of less than 5MB are not filtered, 
thus if the e-mail domain address is not recognized, a default 
threshold of 5MB may be used. For services with known size 
constraints the system will transmit the file to the e-mail 
address. If the constraint is exceed, the system transmits a link 
to the file instead of the actual file. 

Another to another embodiment, selection of print opera 
tions may be handled in a similar fashion as to downloads. 
When a printing device is attached to a streamlined device, 
printing proceed as known conventionally. When a printer is 
not attached, a process for interpreting print operations may 
be invoked. The process for interpreting print operations, 
includes causing the device to display a print interface 4102. 
FIG. 41A. The print interface provides box 4104 listing group 
members, 4106 listing configured services, and box 4108, for 
entering destination e-mail addresses. Selection of 4110 
sends the item in a print format, in this example a pdf file. In 
other examples, different file formats will be displayed as part 
of 4110 (e.g. word, doc, txt, wpd, Xls, etc.). in some embodi 
ments, file size limitations will be employed on delivery of 
print format files. FIG. 41B illustrates in greater detail 
examples of print 4150 and download interfaces 4152. Print 
and download operations may invoke a progress bar dis 
played over the current view, with the option of canceling 
transmission. 

In another embodiment, a streamlined system includes the 
following features: 

Employs remote mechanisms to access and/or deliver files 
Mechanisms include identifying a remote action in 

response to file type 
Web Content Support for system that does not utilize local 
memory for storage 

In response to download selection (i.e. request to locally 
store content) display message regarding new function 
ality (transfer or remote store) 

Maintain user profile—associate web service providers for 
a particular user 

web services—remote storage, email, photo sharing, cus 
tom web page info, storage acts (e.g. Drop Box and 
Google Docs) 

In response to mouse over/selection/hover/indication of 
selection display interface to enable remote delivery of 
content/file 

Providing for selection of remote delivery to a domain 
(including home network) including an act of Verifying 
the content/file's size does not exceed a threshold value 

In response to passing site check deliver content/file as 
attachment 

In response to fail, store in provided remote storage, gen 
erate link, and deliver link to content/file 

According to one embodiment, a method for streamlining 
user interaction with electronic content includes a process for 
interpreting online executable operations into streamlined 
operations. One example process, 3600, FIG. 36, for inter 
preting online executable operations into streamlined opera 
tions includes the step of permitting a user to access digital 
content online, at 3602. The online digital content is pre 
sented to a user through a graphical user interface at 3604. 
The GUI permits a user to select executable operations in the 
presentation of the online digital content, at 3606. In response 
to selection of the executable operation, the computer system 
determines if the executable operation requires local access. 
In one example, the executable operation includes a down 
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load operation that would cause a conventional computer 
system to store a file on a local mass storage device Such as a 
hard drive. In response to the determination that the execut 
able operation requires local storage, a streamlined computer 
device transforms the executable operation's local access 
request into a remote access operation, at 3608. 

In one example, the remote access operation includes a 
storage request to a online service provider. Various online 
service providers permits remote storage of various computer 
files. Certain service providers optimize the provided service 
for specific file types, such photo management and sharing 
services. Other examples include e-mail access providers, 
Video and audio media management and presentation Ser 
vices. In other examples, a service provider may offer generic 
data storage not specific to any file type. In one embodiment, 
step 3608 includes transforming a download request to a local 
mass storage device into a storage request to a remote service. 
The example process can include acts of identifying the file 
type associated with the download request, and selecting a 
service provider based on the identified file type. 

In another example, the executable operation that requests 
local access to storage on the streamlined device may include 
a print operation, a save operation, a copy operation, a paste 
operation. Typically the streamlined device is configured to 
transform save, download, and print operations into remote 
storage operations. According to one embodiment, a print 
operation may be streamlined to permit the print operation 
without an attached printer. According to one embodiment, in 
the absence of an attached printer, a print request generates a 
print file in response to execution. Conventionally the print 
file would be stored locally on a computer hard drive. In some 
embodiments, a streamlined device does not employ local 
mass storage devices Such as hard drives. Such streamlined 
devices are configured to transform local storage request into 
remote storage operations. In one example the print file may 
be directed to a generic storage provider, and the file stored in 
the remote memory associated with the generic storage pro 
vider. In another embodiment, the system checks the resulting 
file size for the print file. If the size of the file exceeds a 
threshold, then the system may further streamline the opera 
tion. For example, by providing a link to the file and trans 
mitting the link to a destination. A link may be transmitted 
through an e-mail instead of transmitting the file itself, for 
example. 

Another example process may be used in conjunction with 
3600. In one example, a sub-process, 3700, FIG. 37, for 
permitting selection of executable operations in online con 
tent can be employed. At 3702, computer focus is resolved on 
an executable operation embedded in online content. Execut 
able operations can include download, print, save, transfer, 
retrieve, get, fget, and generally comprise operations that 
require a large memory block of nonvolatile storage, and in 
particular hard drive space. A streamlined computer device 
includes logic stored in memory and executed by a processor 
to analyze a focused executable operation, and at 3704, the 
executable operation is analyzed. The logic may include pro 
gramming to trap download request for example. Once a 
request is trapped the streamlined device can determine what 
action is appropriate based on the type of request. At 3706, it 
is determined whether the executable operation requires local 
storage. At 3706 (No) local storage is not required and the 
executable operation is performed at 3708. At 3706 (Yes) it is 
determined that local storage is required and the operation is 
transformed into a remote access operation at 3710. 

Example process 3600 may include additional sub-pro 
cesses and/or individual steps performed in process 3600 may 
also comprise other processes. In one example Sub-process 
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3800, FIG.38, for transforming online executable operations 
associated with local storage into remote storage operations 
may be employed as part of a larger process, for example, 
process 3600. At 3802, a streamlined computer system iden 
tifies a result of an executable operation identified in a web 
browser displayed on the system. At 3804, a file type associ 
ated with the operation is identified. At 3806, at least one of a 
device profile and a user profile is accessed, to retrieve avail 
able services, 3808, that may be appropriate for the particular 
file type. Various services for a particular user may be asso 
ciated with the device itself, and a plurality of users may have 
access to multiple services or even more than one account for 
an individual service. Logic stored in memory and executed 
by a processor may determine matched services at 3810 by 
accessing information stored in at least one of a device profile 
and a user profile. The access information may contain 
records on available services, their access information, and 
the access information may include a file type designation for 
a particular service. 

In one example, executed logic matches a file type associ 
ated with the executable operation to a file type associated 
with a remote service 3810 (YES), and in response the com 
puter system retrieves access information for that remote 
service at 3812, the local access operation can be redirected 
into a remote service operation at 3814. For example, the 
computer system may access the remote service using the 
obtained access information, and provide an interface to 
transmit the object (data) of the local access to a location 
within the remote service. In one embodiment, a default ser 
Vice may be configured for any streamlined device. In the 
absence of matched services at 3810 (NO), the computer 
system may invoke a default remote service at 3816, obtain 
the default service access information at 3812 and redirect the 
local access operation into a remote service operation at 3814. 

In another example, process 3800 may be coupled with an 
interface display presented to a user of the streamlined device. 
And step 3812 may be used to populate a user interface with 
a plurality of matched services. The interface may also dis 
play additional information associated with the service, for 
example an account name may be display to permit a user to 
distinguish between an account S/he set up as opposed to 
another user. The system may permit the user to designate the 
remote service appropriate for use in the interface and step 
3814 occurs to redirect the local access operation into the user 
selected remote service. 

In another embodiment, an example sub-process, 3900, 
FIG. 39, for obtaining service access information may be 
employed to retrieve remote service information. Example 
process 3900, includes an act of accessing at least one of a 
device profile and user profile to obtain matched services at 
3904. Obtaining matched services may include filtering from 
the available services, or it may include retrieving all avail 
able services listed in the at least one of a device and user 
profile. In one example, filtering is performed based on a file 
type that is the Subject of a local access operation, in another 
example, filtering may be performed to return only remote 
services of the current system user, although it is to be appre 
ciated that other filtering operations may be performed. Once 
available services are matched3904, with or without filtering, 
the matched services are displayed to a system user at 3906 in 
a user interface. The user interface permits the user to select 
from the remote services at 3908. Selection may include 
clicking on a visual indicator shown in a computer display 
(e.g. a check box), other options include links to the service, 
other visual indicators may be used, including drop down 
boxes and other html, Xml, and human readable computer 
displayed forms. In one alternative (not shown), if the user 
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does not select a service within a predetermined period of 
time, the system may cancel the operation entirely, or alter 
natively select a default remote service automatically. At 
3910, the object of the local access operation is delivered to 
the remote service. 

Configuring Streamlined Devices 
According to one aspect, streamlining user interaction with 

computer content includes improving user interfaces display, 
permitting configuration of streamlined device during opera 
tions. Streamlining user interaction may also include provid 
ing for the pre-configuration of a streamlined device with 
content customized to a particular user. 

In one embodiment, a potential user may purchase a 
streamlined device on-line. During an order process, the user 
may establish an interactive session with an order manage 
ment system. The order management system may be opera 
tively connected to device management systems, including 
for example remote storage space, remote profiles, among 
other information. The order management system is config 
ured to retrieve information on the potential user during a 
purchase session. The potential user is asked for permission 
to retrieve information from the computer system on which 
they are ordering from. The interactive session may also 
inquire if the user is ordering from home (and thus their home 
computer), or from another location. In response to granting 
permission, an executable object is downloaded to the poten 
tial user's home computer. The executable object may be 
encoded use any language, the specific coding language/en 
Vironment is not important rather the operations performed 
by execution of the object on computer hardware is. 

The executable object mines the home computer of the 
potential user for web usage information. Web usage infor 
mation may include for example, browser history (IE and 
FireFox), favorites, stored accounts, bookmarks, access fre 
quency information. The web usage information is retrieved 
from the home computer and processed either by the order 
management system or a streamlined device management 
system to generate visual representations associated with 
mappings to computer content. The content that is mapped to, 
is determined for example, be determined the most frequently 
accessed site for the potential user. In one embodiment, web 
cards are generated for the potential user. Each web card is 
pre-loaded on the device that will be shipped upon comple 
tion of the order. Further, for the web cards capable of being 
display as a channel card both types may be pre-loaded. 
Other specialized cards may be generated and pre-loaded for 
the user based off of information obtained from their home 
computer. For example a bookmark card is generated from 
the retrieved bookmarks. The retrieved bookmarks may be 
passed through a filter to remove bookmarks that have not 
been accessed in for example 6 months. Although other time 
periods may be used to filter bookmark information. Web 
cards may also be created from the most frequently access 
bookmarks. 

Additional information may be mined from the potential 
user's computer. In particular, communication settings for the 
home computer may be detected. Any wireless communica 
tion setting may be retrieved and preconfigured. After pre 
configuration the streamlined device may be considered fully 
operational out-of-the-box. 
The interactive session may also be used to Supplement any 

retrieved data, for example, if the executable object detects 
frequent access to third party providers—Flickr and Google 
Docs for example but cannot detect account name and other 
access information, the interactive session may query the user 
to provide the required information. 
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In other embodiments, the user may be sent executable 

code via an e-mail during or after a purchase. For example, a 
user not on his/her own computer during the ordering process 
may be sent an e-mail containing an executable file, to be run 
when the user is on their home computer. In another example, 
a party may purchase a streamlined device for another. The 
purchaser may provide an e-mail address for the intended 
recipient, who may execute the file to transmit customization 
information for the streamlined device. 

According to one embodiment an example process, 4000, 
FIG. 40, for pre-configuring a streamlined device is shown. 
Process 4000, beings at 4002 in response to a request to 
purchase a streamlined device. The request is accepted at 
4002, and in response a management system requests permis 
sion to perform a data mining operation on a recipients recipi 
ent's computer. Typically the person/entity ordering the 
streamlined device is the same as the recipient, in which case 
an executable file can be transmitted at the same time a online 
request to purchase a streamlined device occurs. In one alter 
native, the request may be entered offline. During an offline 
request an e-mail address may be requested and the execut 
able file delivered to the recipient’s email, notifying him/her 
of the file and its use to pre-configure their computer. In 
another alternative, the party ordering the streamlined device 
intends it for another. When the purchaser and recipient are 
different, the e-mail address is requested for the intended 
recipient. At 4006 (YES), permission is obtained and the 
executable file retrieves information associated with online 
use of the recipient’s computer at 4008. Additional informa 
tion may be collected including configuration options on the 
recipient’s computer. System settings such as network com 
munication configurations may also be retrieved. In one 
example, wireless network data is retrieved to permit the 
streamlined device to connect immediately to a recipients 
home network. 

During an order for a streamlined device, demographic 
information is collected on the recipient at 4010. This often 
includes at a minimum a name and destination address for a 
recipient of a streamlined device. Thus even if permission is 
not granted 4006(NO) information can be collected to pre 
configure a streamlined device at 4010, in this case the infor 
mation is constrained to what is provided by the purchaser 
during the transaction. At 4012, accumulated information is 
used to pre-configure the streamlined device. Pre-configura 
tion includes establishing wireless network settings for the 
streamlined device, and may include generating visual repre 
sentations of online content that are mapped to for example 
the most frequently accessed sites on the recipient’s home 
computer. Other configuration can include generating visual 
representations that map to services configured on the recipi 
ent's computer (online banking, photo management services, 
file sharing services, media management services, e-mail pro 
viders, etc.). The visual representations may be configured 
with access information including user names and passwords 
so that a recipient can Switch over the streamlined device 
seamlessly. 

Special Purpose Computer 
FIG. 51 shows a block diagram of a computer system 5100 

in which various aspects of the present invention may be 
practiced. For example, various aspects of the invention may 
be implemented as specialized software executing in one or 
more computer systems including multiple computer systems 
communicating over network. Computer system 5100 may 
include a processor 5106 connected to one or more memory 
devices 5110, for storing data. Typically computer system 
5100 is implemented without hard drive devices. Memory 
5110 is typically used for storing programs and data during 
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operation of the computer system 5100, and typically com 
prises Flash memory. Components of computer system 5100 
may be coupled by an interconnection mechanism 5108, 
which may include one or more busses (e.g., between com 
ponents that are integrated within a same machine) and/or a 
network (e.g., between components that reside on separate 
discrete machines). The interconnection mechanism enables 
communications (e.g., data, instructions) to be exchanged 
between system components of system 5100. 

Computer system 5100 may also include one or more input 
5104/output (I/O) devices 5102, for example, a keyboard, 
mouse, trackball, microphone, touch screen, a printing 
device, display Screen, speaker, etc. Output devices may 
include video cards and separate video memory for improved 
processing performance. Storage 5112, typically includes a 
computer readable and writeable nonvolatile recording 
medium in which signals are stored that define a program to 
be executed by the processor or information stored on or in the 
medium to be processed by the program. The medium may, 
for example, be a flash memory. Typically, in operation, the 
processor causes data to be read from the nonvolatile record 
ing medium into another memory that allows for faster access 
to the information by the processor than does the medium. 
This memory is typically a volatile, random access memory 
Such as a dynamic random access memory (DRAM) or static 
memory (SRAM). 

Referring again to FIG. 51, the memory may be located in 
storage 5112 as shown, or in memory system 5110. The 
processor 5106 generally manipulates the data within the 
memory 5110, and then copies the data to the medium asso 
ciated with storage 5112 after processing is completed. A 
variety of mechanisms are known for managing data move 
ment between the medium and integrated circuit memory 
element and the invention is not limited thereto. The invention 
is not limited to a particular memory system or storage sys 
tem. 

The computer system may include specially-programmed, 
special-purpose hardware, for example, an application-spe 
cific integrated circuit (ASIC). Aspects of the invention may 
be implemented in Software executing on hardware, hardware 
or firmware, or any combination thereof. Further, such meth 
ods, acts, systems, system elements and components thereof 
may be implemented as part of the computer system 
described above or as an independent component. 

Although computer system 5100 is shown by way of 
example as one type of computer system upon which various 
aspects of the invention may be practiced, it should be appre 
ciated that aspects of the invention are not limited to being 
implemented on the computer system as shown in FIG. 51. 
Various aspects of the invention may be practiced on one or 
more computers having a different architectures or compo 
nents that that shown in FIG. 51. 
Computer system 5100 may programmable using a high 

level computer programming language. Computer system 
5100 may be also implemented using specially programmed, 
special purpose hardware. In computer system 5100, proces 
sor 5106 is typically a commercially available processor such 
as the well-known Pentium class processor available from the 
Intel Corporation. Many other processors are available, 
including multi-core processors. Such a processor usually 
executes an operating system which may be, for example, the 
Windows-based operating systems (e.g., Windows Vista, 
Windows NT, Windows 2000 (Windows ME), Windows XP 
operating systems) available from the Microsoft Corporation, 
MAC OS System X operating system available from Apple 
Computer, one or more of the Linux-based operating system 
distributions (e.g., the Enterprise Linux operating system 
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available from Red Hat Inc.), the Solaris operating system 
available from Sun Microsystems, or UNIX operating sys 
tems available from various sources. Many other operating 
systems may be used, and the invention is not limited to any 
particular operating system. 
The processor and operating system together define a com 

puter platform for which application programs in high-level 
programming languages are written. It should be understood 
that the invention is not limited to a particular computer 
system platform, processor, operating system, or network. 
Also, it should be apparent to those skilled in the art that the 
present invention is not limited to a specific programming 
language or computer system. Further, it should be appreci 
ated that other appropriate programming languages and other 
appropriate computer systems could also be used. 
One or more portions of the computer system may be 

distributed across one or more computer systems coupled to a 
communications network. For example, various aspects of 
the invention may be distributed among one or more com 
puter systems (e.g., servers) configured to provide a service to 
one or more client computers, or to performan overall task as 
part of a distributed System. For example, various aspects of 
the invention may be performed on a client-server or multi 
tier system that includes components distributed among one 
or more server systems that perform various functions 
according to various embodiments of the invention. In one 
embodiment, the Litl cloud is maintained on server systems 
accessible from a plurality of devices. These components 
may be executable, intermediate (e.g., IL) or interpreted (e.g., 
Java) code which communicate over a communication net 
work (e.g., the Internet) using a communication protocol 
(e.g., TCP/IP). 

It should be appreciated that the invention is not limited to 
executing on any particular system or group of systems. Also, 
it should be appreciated that the invention is not limited to any 
particular distributed architecture, network, or communica 
tion protocol. 

Physical Configurations 
Referring to FIG. 52C, when the portable computer 100 is 

in the easel mode, the base is disposed at an angle 134 to the 
display component. This angle 134 is adjustable, for example, 
to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display screen to 
be maintained for different positions of a user 136 and of the 
portable computer 100, as illustrated in FIGS. 52A, 52B and 
52C. For example, when the user 136 is further from the 
portable computer, the angle 134a (FIG. 52A) may be made 
smaller than the angle 134b when the user is closer to the 
portable computer (FIG. 52B). As discussed above, in one 
example, the orientation sensor (not shown) may be used to 
detect, either approximately or precisely, the angle 134 and to 
provide the information to the computer operating system. 

Referring to FIGS. 53A and 53B, there is illustrated a 
portion of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge 
assembly 138 that allows the portable computer to be config 
ured into either the laptop mode (FIG.53A) or the easel mode 
(FIG. 53B), according to aspects of the invention. According 
to one embodiment, the hinge assembly 138 accommodates 
0-320 degrees of rotation, allowing a minimum angle 134 (see 
e.g. FIG. 52C) of 40 degrees. However, it is to be appreciated 
that the hinge assembly 138 may allow greater or fewer 
degrees of rotation, provided only that sufficient rotation is 
allowed so as to configure the portable computer 100 into 
either the laptop mode or the easel mode. As discussed above, 
in one embodiment the portable computer 100 includes an 
orientation sensor (not shown) that is configured to detect a 
relative orientation of the display component 102 and the base 
component 104. In one example, the orientation sensor may 
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be an accelerometer incorporated into the base component 
104, as discussed above. Alternatively, the orientation sensor 
may be incorporated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be 
used to detect movement of the hinge assembly, and to trans 
late that movement into an information about the relative 
orientation of the display component 102 and the base com 
ponent 104 (for example, a size of the angle 134). It is also to 
be appreciated that the orientation sensor may include elec 
tronic or mechanical components, or a combination thereof. 
For example, the hinge assembly may be provide with detents 
that provide an indication of the mode of the portable com 
puter. 
As discussed above, and also illustrated in FIGS. 53A and 

53B, the portable computer may also comprise a scroll wheel 
132 that allows a user to adjust, control and/or select various 
aspects of the portable computer (e.g., wireless capability or 
speaker volume) or items displayed on the display screen 110. 
A housing 160 may contain or Support various mechanical 
and/or electronic components (not shown) that are coupled to 
the scroll wheel 132 and are configured to convert physical 
movement of the scroll wheel into electrical signals. These 
electrical signals may be provided to the central processing 
unit of the portable computer 100 which processes the elec 
trical signals so as to translate movement of the Scroll wheel 
into control of a selected feature, for example, adjusting the 
Volume of the speaker(s) or selecting a particular item dis 
played on the display Screen. 

Having thus described several aspects of at least one 
embodiment, it is to be appreciated various alterations, modi 
fications, and improvements will readily occur to those 
skilled in the art. Such alterations, modifications, and 
improvements are intended to be part of this disclosure and 
are intended to be within the scope of the invention. Accord 
ingly, the foregoing description and drawings are by way of 
example only, and the scope of the invention should be deter 
mined from proper construction of the appended claims, and 
their equivalents. 

The invention claimed is: 
1. A customized user interface for a computer system with 

a plurality selectable I/O profiles configured to present com 
puter operations to a user in a format configured to a selected 
I/O profile on a display component of the computer system, 
the user interface comprising: 

at least one processor; 
a map based graphical user interface, executing on the at 

least one processor operatively connected to a memory 
of the computer system, the map based graphical user 
interface, when executing, is configured to display infor 
mation on the display component of the computer sys 
tem, wherein the map based user interface is further 
configured to: 
display a plurality of views of a plurality of visual rep 

resentations of computer content on the computer 
system, wherein the computer content includes at 
least one of selectable digital content, executable 
computer applications, configurable computer set 
tings, selectable computer operations and passive 
digital content; 

display the plurality of visual representations of com 
puter content rendered on the display component, 
wherein the plurality of visual representations of 
computer content include an association to a first 
home view of the plurality of views, the first home 
view including a display of the computer content, and 
wherein the each of the plurality of visual represen 
tations is responsive to focus and execution, wherein 
execution includes selecting the visual representa 
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tion, and wherein the first home view is a first orga 
nizational view of at least one application and com 
puter content displayed responsive to activation of the 
system; and 

an execution component, executing on the at least one 
processor, configured to: 
identify at least a first and a second computer system 

configuration based on sensor input indicating a posi 
tion of the display component relative to a base com 
ponent; 

Select, responsive to the sensor input, a first home view 
from the plurality of views for the first computer 
system configuration, wherein the first home view is 
configured to organize a first set of the plurality of 
visual representations; 

filter the first set of visual representations to present 
content that is optimized for viewing in the second 
system configuration at least in part by identifying 
content to filter, removing the identified content from 
the first set of visual representations, and generating a 
second set of visual representations based on the fil 
tered first set of visual representations, wherein the 
second set of visual representations includes at least 
one different member than the first set of visual rep 
resentations; and 

transition, automatically in response to the sensor input, 
the display component between at least the first home 
view of the plurality of views and a second default 
content view of the plurality of views, wherein the 
second default content view is configured to organize 
the second set of visual representations, wherein the 
second default content view is a second organiza 
tional view of at least one application and computer 
content, and wherein the sensor input indicates a tran 
sition to the second computer system configuration. 

2. The user interface of claim 1, wherein the execution 
component is further configured to transition between the 
plurality of views in response to execution of at least one of a 
computer system operation, a visual representation, a com 
puter system configuration, and a change in computer system 
configuration. 

3. The user interface of claim 1, further comprising a plu 
rality of modes of content for the computer content rendered 
on the computer display, wherein the plurality of modes of 
content comprise at least one of a web content mode, a chan 
nel content mode, a media content mode, an application con 
tent mode, a communication content mode, and a passive 
content mode. 

4. The user interface of claim 3, wherein the plurality of 
views are configured to organize modes of content into dif 
ferent views. 

5. The user interface of claim 3, wherein the web content 
mode is configured to display web based content for proximal 
viewing by a user on the display component of the computer 
system, wherein the channel content mode is configured to 
display web based content for non-proximal viewing by a 
user on the display component, wherein the media content 
mode is configured to display media based content for non 
proximal viewing by a user on the display component, 
wherein the application content mode is configured to display 
computer applications for use by a user on the display com 
ponent, wherein the communication content mode is config 
ured to display computer configuration operations for view 
ing by a user on the display component, and wherein the 
passive content mode is configured to display web based 
content for non-proximal viewing without user interaction on 
the display component. 
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6. The user interface of claim 3, wherein the plurality of 
views includes a home view configured to organize a plurality 
of content modes and a channel view configured to organize 
at least one content mode including the at least some of the 
plurality of visual representations having the view state of the 
respective computer content. 

7. The user interface of claim 3, wherein the plurality of 
views includes a screen saver view configured to organize 
selected content modes for passive viewing. 

8. The user interface of claim 1, wherein the plurality of 
views includes the home view organizing a plurality of visual 
representations of digital content, wherein the first home view 
is displayed responsive to system activation, and wherein the 
first home view is displayed responsive to a computer system 
configuration. 

9. The user interface of claim 8, wherein the computer 
system configuration comprises a physical positioning of the 
display component relative to a base of the computer system 
about a longitudinal axis of rotation. 

10. The user interface of claim 8, further comprising a 
search tool displayed in the header display, wherein the 
search tool is configured to accept search terms entered by a 
user and in response to execution, causes the computer sys 
tem to navigate to a view of a first visual representation of 
digital content, wherein the digital content includes a search 
engine, and the search engine presents results for the search 
terms. 

11. The user interface of claim 1, further comprising a 
storage component configured to retain a previous view state. 

12. The user interface of claim 11, wherein the execution 
component is further configured to cause the computer sys 
tem to transition to a previous view in response to execution 
of a navigation element by a user. 

13. The user interface of claim 11, further comprising the 
navigation element displayed in the header display. 

14. The user interface of claim8, wherein the body display 
comprises an organization of the plurality of visual represen 
tations of computer content rendered on the computer display, 
and the home view further comprises display pages in 
response to a display threshold establishing a maximal num 
ber of visual representations displayed per display page. 

15. The user interface of claim 14, wherein the first home 
view further comprises an indication of visual representations 
displayed on adjacent display pages of the home view, 
wherein the indication is displayed within the body of the 
home view. 

16. The user interface of claim 8, further comprising a 
nascent card displayed in the body of the first home view, 
wherein the nascent card is configured to permit generation of 
additional visual representations of digital content. 

17. The user interface of claim 16, wherein the execution 
component is further configured to execute a process for 
creating a visual representation in response to execution of 
the nascent card, wherein the process for creating a visual 
representation includes acts of 

transitioning to a quick access view: 
generating a mapping to online digital content; 
executing the mapping; and 
displaying a first view of the mapped digital content. 
18. The user interface of claim 1, further comprising a 

quick access view, wherein the quick access view is config 
ured to permit user generation of a mapping between digital 
content and a visual representation. 

19. The user interface of claim 3, wherein the plurality of 
views includes a channel view, and the view selector compo 
nent is further responsive to an integrated scroll wheel on the 
computer system. 
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20. The user interface of claim 19, wherein the view selec 

tor component is further configured to transition the computer 
system to the channel view in response to manipulation of the 
integrated scroll wheel. 

21. The user interface of claim 19, wherein the channel 
view further comprises a channel selector comprising a dis 
play of a sequence of visual representations presenting a 
channel content mode. 

22. The user interface of claim 21, wherein the display of 
the sequence of visual representations is responsive to 
manipulation of the integrated Scroll wheel, and manipulation 
of the integrated Scroll wheel causes the computer system to 
render a next visual representation in the display of the 
sequence of visual representations. 

23. The user interface of claim 1, further comprising a 
storage component configured to retain a current computer 
system configuration state and a current view state. 

24. The user interface of claim 23, wherein the execution 
component is further configured to transition the display 
component between the plurality of views, responsive to at 
least one of the current computer system configuration state 
and the current view state. 

25. The user interface of claim 24, wherein the execution 
component is configured to transition to a channel view in 
response to manipulation of an integrated Scroll wheel, when 
the computer system is in a laptop and an easel configuration. 

26. The user interface of claim 24, wherein the execution 
component is further configured to transition from the first 
view and a home view to a channel view in response to a 
change in computer system configuration state from a laptop 
to an easel configuration. 

27. A method for presenting a customized user interface for 
a computer system with a plurality selectable I/O profiles to a 
user, the method comprising: 

displaying a map based graphical user interface on a dis 
play component of the computer system, the act of dis 
playing the map based user interface includes acts of 
displaying a plurality of views of a plurality of visual 

representations of computer content on the display 
component, wherein the computer content includes at 
least one of selectable digital content, executable 
computer applications, configurable computer set 
tings, selectable computer operations and passive 
digital content; and 

displaying the plurality of visual representations of com 
puter content rendered on the display component, 
wherein the plurality of visual representations of 
computer content include an association to a first 
home view of the plurality of views, the first home 
view including the computer content, and wherein the 
each of the plurality of visual representations is 
responsive to focus and execution, wherein execution 
includes selecting the visual representation, and 
wherein the first home view is a first organizational 
view of at least one application and computer content 
displayed responsive to activation of the system; iden 
tifying, by a processor, at least a first and a second 
computer system configuration based on sensor input 
indicating a position of the display component rela 
tive to a base component; 

selecting, by the processor, responsive to the sensor input, 
the first home view from the plurality of views for the 
first computer system configuration, wherein the first 
home view is configured to organize a first set of the 
plurality of visual representations; 

filtering, by the processor, the first set of visual represen 
tations to present content that is optimized for viewing in 
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the second system configuration at least in part by iden 
tifying content to filter, removing the identified content 
from the first set of visual representations, and generat 
ing a second set of visual representations based on the 
filtered first set of visual representations, wherein the 
second set of visual representations includes at least one 
different member than the first set of visual representa 
tions; and 

executing, automatically by the processor, in response to 
sensor input a transition in the display component 
between at least the first home view of the plurality of 
views and a second default content view of the plurality 
of views, wherein the second default content view is 
configured to organize the second set of visual represen 
tations, wherein the second default content view is a 
second organizational view of at least one application 
and computer content, wherein the sensor input indi 
cates a transition to the second computer system con 
figuration. 

28. A system for presenting a customized user interface for 
a portable computer with a plurality selectable I/O profiles, 
the system comprising: 

at least one processor operatively connected to a memory, 
the processor configured to execute a plurality of system 
components, the plurality of system components com 
prising: 
a first user interface component configured to display a 

plurality of views of a plurality of visual representa 
tions of computer content, wherein the computer con 
tent includes at least one of selectable digital content, 
executable computer applications, configurable com 
puter settings, selectable computer operations and 
passive digital content; 

a second user interface component configured to display 
the plurality of visual representations of computer 
content on a computer display, wherein the plurality 
of visual representations of computer content include 
an association to a first home view of the plurality of 
views, the first home view including the computer 
content, and wherein the each of the plurality of visual 
representations is responsive to focus and execution, 
wherein execution includes selecting the visual rep 
resentation, and wherein the first home view is a first 
organizational view of at least one application and 
computer content displayed responsive to activation 
of the system; and 

an execution component configured to: 
identify at least a first and a second computer system 

configuration based on sensor input indicating a 
position of the display component relative to a base 
component; 

select, responsive to sensor input, a first home view 
from the plurality of views for the first computer 
system configuration, wherein the first home view 
is configured to organize a first set of the plurality 
of visual representations; 

filter the first set of visual representations to present 
content that is optimized for viewing in the second 
system configuration at least in part by identifying 
content to filter, removing the identified content 
from the first set of visual representations, and gen 
erating a second set of visual representations based 
on the filtered first set of visual representations, 
wherein the second set of visual representations 
includes at least one different member than the first 
set of visual representations; 
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execute, automatically, in response to sensor input, a 

transition in the computer system display between 
at least the first home view of the plurality of views 
and a second default content view of the plurality of 
views, wherein the second default content view is a 
second organizational view of at least one applica 
tion and computer content, wherein the second 
default content view is configured to organize the 
second set of visual representations, wherein the 
sensor input indicates a transition to the second 
computer system configuration. 

29. The system of claim 28, wherein the system further 
comprises a portable computer configurable between a plu 
rality of display modes including a closed mode, a laptop 
mode and an easel mode, wherein the portable computer 
comprises: 

a display component including a display Screen; 
a base; 
a hinge assembly at least partially housed within the base 

and configured to pivotably couple the display compo 
nent to the base; 

wherein the display component is rotatable about a longi 
tudinal axis running along an interface between the dis 
play component and the base; 

wherein, in the closed mode, the display Screen is disposed 
Substantially against the base; 

wherein rotating the display component about the longitu 
dinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into the 
laptop mode; and 

wherein rotating the display component about the longitu 
dinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into the 
easel mode. 

30. The portable computer of claim 29, wherein the single 
axis is a longitudinal axis running along an interface between 
the display component and the base; and wherein the display 
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis. 

31. The portable computer of claim 30, further comprising 
a display orientation module configured to control an orien 
tation of the content displayed on the display Screen; 

wherein the orientation of the content displayed on the 
display Screen is configurable among a plurality of ori 
entations relative to the longitudinal axis. 

32. The portable computer of claim 31, wherein the plural 
ity of orientations comprises a first orientation relative to the 
longitudinal axis and a second orientation relative to the lon 
gitudinal axis; and 

wherein when display orientation module is configured to 
automatically display the content in the first orientation 
when the portable computer is configured into the laptop 
mode and in the second orientation when the portable 
computer is configured into the easel mode. 

33. The portable computer of claim 31, wherein the plural 
ity of display modes further comprises a flat mode in which 
the display component is disposed at an angle of approxi 
mately 180 degrees, measured about the longitudinal axis, 
relative to the base. 

34. The portable computer of claim 33, wherein the plural 
ity of orientations comprises a first orientation relative to the 
longitudinal axis, a second orientation relative to the longitu 
dinal axis, and a third orientation relative to the longitudinal 
axis; and 

wherein, in the flat mode, the orientation of the content 
displayed on the display Screen is configurable among 
the first, second and third orientations responsive to a 
user input. 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 256 of 521 PageID #: 362



US 9,003,315 B2 
75 

35. The portable computer of claim 34, wherein the second 
orientation is 90 degrees relative to the first orientation; and 

wherein the third orientation is 180 degrees relative to the 
first orientation. 

36. The portable computer of claim 31, further comprising 5 
a mode sensor configured to detect a degree of rotation of the 
display component relative to the base and to provide infor 
mation representative of the degree of rotation; and 

wherein the display orientation module is configured to 
automatically adjust the orientation of the content dis 
played on the display screen responsive to the informa 
tion from the mode sensor. 

37. The portable computer of claim36, wherein the display 
orientation module is configured to: 

automatically display the content in a first orientation rela 
tive to the longitudinal axis responsive to the informa 
tion indicating that the degree of rotation of the display 
component is less than approximately 180 degrees rela 
tive to the base; and 

automatically display the content in a second orientation 
relative to the longitudinal axis responsive to the infor 
mation indicating that the degree of rotation of the dis 
play component is greater than approximately 180 
degrees relative to the base: 

wherein the second orientation is at approximately 180 
degrees relative to the first orientation. 

38. The portable computer of claim 31, further comprising 
a mode sensor configured to detect a current display mode of 
the portable computer; and 

wherein the display orientation module selects the orien 
tation of the content displayed on the display screen 
from one of the plurality of orientations relative to the 
longitudinal axis responsive to the current display mode 
detected by the mode sensor. 

39. The portable computerofclaim30, wherein plurality of 
display modes further comprises a closed mode; and 

wherein, in the closed mode, the display screen is disposed 
substantially against the base. 

40. The portable computer of claim 39, wherein rotating 
the display component about the longitudinal axis up to 
approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode configures 
the portable computer into the laptop mode; and 

wherein rotating the display component about the longitu 
dinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into the 
easel mode. 

41. The portable computer of claim 40, wherein the display 
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to 
approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode. 

42. The portable computer of claim 30, wherein the longi 
tudinal axis comprises multiple parallel axes; and 

wherein the hinge assembly is configured to permit rota 
tion of the display component about any of the multiple 
parallel axes to configure the portable computer between 
the plurality of display modes. 

43. The portable computer of claim 30, further comprising 
a scroll wheel disposed at least partially within the base and 
rotatable about the longitudinal axis, the scroll wheel config 
ured to permit a user to control at least one of operating 
parameters of the portable computer and the content dis 
played on the display screen. 
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44. The portable computer of claim 43, further comprising 

a first navigation button disposed on one of the base and the 
display component and configured to permit the user to 
manipulate selected content displayed on the display screen. 

45. The portable computer of claim 44, wherein the display 
Screen is configured to display at least one of a plurality of 
modes of content; and 

wherein the navigation button is configured to permit the 
user to select for display one of the plurality of modes of 
content. 

46. The portable computer of claim 44, wherein the first 
navigation button is user-accessible in each of the laptop 
mode and the easel mode. 

47. The portable computer of claim 44, further comprising 
a second navigation button; 

wherein the first navigation button is disposed on a major 
surface of the base; and 

wherein the second navigation button is disposed on a 
minor surface of the base. 

48. The portable computer of claim 43, wherein the scroll 
wheel is configured to permit the user to select a mode of 
content for display on the display screen. 

49. The portable computer of claim 43, wherein the scroll 
wheel is configured to permit the user to control a volume of 
sound played by the portable computer. 

50. The portable computer of claim 43, further comprising 
a hinge assembly at least partially housed within the base and 
configured to rotatably couple the display component to the 
base. 

51. The portable computer of claim 50, wherein the scroll 
wheel is disposed at least partially within the hinge assembly. 

52. The portable computer of claim29, further comprising: 
a foot disposed along at least a portion of the base and 

configured to support the portable computer when in the 
easel mode. 

53. The user interface of claim 1, wherein the map based 
graphical user interface is further configured to organize com 
puter operations and computer content into the plurality of 
Visual representations having consistent appearance, the con 
sistent appearance of the plurality of visual representations 
including a header portion and a body portion of a display. 

54. The user interface of claim 53, wherein the map based 
graphical user interface is further configured to organize at 
least some of the plurality of visual representations into dis 
played pages of at least one of the plurality of views of the 
map based user interface, wherein each display page is asso 
ciated with a display limit for the visual representations. 

55. The user interface of claim 1, wherein a display of at 
least some of the visual representations is configured to 
increase in display size responsive to focus, relative to an 
unfocused display. 

56. The user interface of claim 55, wherein the display is 
further configured to render computer controls in a header 
portion in response to focus upon the header portion of the 
display. 

57. The user interface of claim 8, wherein the plurality of 
Views includes the second default content view organizing a 
plurality of visual representations of digital content, wherein 
the second default content view is displayed responsive to 
System activation and responsive to the computer system 
configuration. 
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SYSTEM AND METHOD FOR any service — virtually no limitations have been found for 
STREAMLINING USER INTERACTION the services that can be provided . 

WITH ELECTRONIC CONTENT More typically , these on - line services provide very useful 
opportunities for the users who know how to take advantage 

RELATED APPLICATIONS 5 of them online photo management / sharing , online finan 
cial services , online marketplaces , online exchanges , web 

This application is a continuation of , and claims priority hosting , web development , dating services , social network 
under 35 U . S . C . § 120 to , U . S . patent application Ser . No . ing to name only a few . Very often these on - line services can 
12 / 416 , 496 entitled “ SYSTEM AND METHOD FOR be found for free or minimal costs . Typically , registration is 
STREAMLINING USER INTERACTION WITH ELEC - 10 the only requirement for participating in what is offered as 
TRONIC CONTENT , ” filed on Apr . 1 , 2009 , which is a free services . In other words , all that is required is the 
continuation - in - part of , and claims priority under 35 U . S . C . creation of a user name and password . Each service often 
$ 120 to , U . S . patent application Ser . No . 12 / 170 , 951 attempts to outdo competitors by offering more and more 
entitled “ PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE options / features than their competitors . 
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS , ” filed on Jul . 10 , 2008 , 15 
which claims priority under 35 U . S . C . $ 119 ( e ) to U . S . SUMMARY 
Provisional Application Ser . No . 61 / 041 , 365 , entitled “ POR 
TABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CON - It is realized that the conventional wisdom with respect to 
FIGURATIONS , " filed Apr . 1 , 2008 , each of which is such " feature packing ” as discussed above suffers from 
hereby incorporated herein by reference in its entirety . U . S . 20 significant flaws . Typical computer users simply can ' t take 
patent application Ser . No . 12 / 416 , 496 is a continuation - in advantage of all the functionality offered , either the services 
part of , and claims priority under 35 U . S . C . § 120 to U . S . and features offered by their own computer , or the services 
patent application Ser . No . 12 / 170 , 939 , entitled “ POR and features offered by online providers . The complexity of 
TABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CON the interface ( both hardware and software ) hampers adop 
FIGURATIONS , " filed on Jul . 10 , 2008 , which claims 25 tion , as does the volume of features offered . For example , 
priority under 35 U . S . C . 119 ( e ) to U . S . Provisional Appli third party service provides often find difficulty in subscrib 
cation Ser . No . 61 / 041 , 365 , entitled “ PORTABLE COM - ing new users , educating existing users , and providing 
PUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA - integration of feature sets for the features they provide as 
TIONS , ” filed Apr . 1 , 2008 , each of which is hereby well as those offered by other service providers . 
incorporated herein by reference in its entirety . In addition , 30 Further complicating the user ' s interaction with computer 
U . S . patent application Ser . No . 12 / 416 , 496 claims priority devices and provided services is the inflexibility of the 
under 35 U . S . C . 119 ( e ) to U . S . Provisional Application Ser . devices being used and their accompanying interfaces . It is 
No . 61 / 041 , 365 , entitled “ PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH realized that a device that can provide a user with a flexible 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS , ” filed Apr . 1 , portal into electronic content , that is , one that can be 
2008 , which is hereby incorporated herein by reference in its 35 configured dynamically improves the user experience . For 
entirety . example , permitting transitions from a “ lean back ” mode of 

viewing ( imagine , for example , a person watching television 
BACKGROUND from their couch ) to a “ lean forward ” mode of viewing 

( picture , for example , a laptop user typing away in a word 
Much of the advancement in contemporary computer 40 processing application ) to on a computer device improves 

systems and services stems from the significant increases in the user experience . Further , user interfaces that are respon 
computing power . Hand in hand with those increases , sive to the user ' s dynamic configurations improve the user ' s 
enhanced features sets have developed designed to utilize ability to interact with the electronic content , from the 
that computing power . Conventional wisdom suggests that machine itself , the internet , and even from both sources . 
the more features that can be provided to a particular 45 Accordingly , aspects and embodiments are directed to a 
computer user , the better the user ' s experience will be . graphical user interface that organizes interface elements 
As computers have become more powerful and capable of into modes of content for presentation to a user . Different 

providing more and more features , ordinary / typical com - views of the modes of content are used to present the user 
puter users has not been able to keep up with availability of with an interface that is responsive to configurations of the 
features and services . User may become frustrated by the 50 device and responsive to activity being performed by the 
inability to navigate the myriad ( sometime unending ) con - user . Further the elements that comprise the graphical user 
figurations and options provided in order to achieve some interface are configured to present a summarized view of 
thing useful and / or workable to their ordinary use . Many available actions and content , in order to simplify user 
users simply don ' t take advantage of provided features . interaction . The different views present different organiza 
Some outright ignore options and features that would sim - 55 tions of the interface elements and in some example display 
plify the use of their computer system . This may occur only certain ones of the modes of content in order to reduce 
because of user ignorance or even fear and in some instances the number of options a user must navigate to accomplish an 
because the user lacks experience with new features so the objective . 
user doesn ' t know the feature can be useful . According to one aspect of the present invention , a 

User frustration is felt not only with respect to the newer 60 customized user interface for a computer system with a 
more powerful computer systems being offered today , but plurality selectable I / O profiles configured to present com 
also frustration abounds with respect to their computer ' s puter operations to a user in a format configured to a selected 
interaction with the Internet . The present movement on the I / O profile is provided . The user interface comprises a map 
Internet , often referred to as Web 2 . 0 , also subscribes to based graphical user interface displayed on the computer 
conventional thinking in that more and more features are 65 system , the map based user interface comprising a plurality 
being packed into each and every aspect of the web expe - of views of a plurality of visual representations of computer 
rience . Third party service providers can be found for almost content , wherein the computer content includes at least one 
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of selectable digital content , selectable computer operations application content mode is configured to display computer 
and passive digital content , and the plurality of visual applications for use by a user . According to another embodi 
representations of computer content rendered on the com - ment of the invention , in the plurality of views includes a 
puter display , wherein the plurality of visual representations home view configured to organize a plurality of content 
of computer content include an association to a first view of 5 modes . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
the plurality of views , the first view including the computer the plurality of views includes a channel view configured to 
content , and wherein the each of the plurality of visual organize a single content mode . According to another 
representations is responsive to focus and execution , embodiment of the invention , the plurality of views includes 
wherein execution includes clicking on the visual represen a channel view configured to organize dual content modes . 
tation , and an execution component comprising at least one 10 According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
computer hardware element configured to transition the plurality of modes of content include a passive content 
computer system display between the plurality of views , mode , wherein the passive content mode is configured to 
wherein the execution component further comprises a view display web based content for non - proximal viewing with 
selector component configured to select one of the plurality out user interaction . 
of views for display on a computer system in response to a 15 According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
computer system configuration . According to one embodi - the plurality of modes of content include a passive content 
ment of the present invention , the execution component is mode , wherein the passive content mode is optimized to 
further configured to transition between the plurality of display web based content for non - proximal viewing with 
views in response to execution of at least one of a computer out user interaction . According to another embodiment of 
system operation , a visual representation , a computer system 20 the invention , the plurality of views includes a screen saver 
configuration , and a change in computer to system configu - view configured to organize selected content modes for 
ration . According to another embodiment of the invention , passive viewing . According to another embodiment of the 
the user interface further comprises a plurality of modes of invention , the plurality of views further comprise a first 
content for the computer content rendered on the computer layer , wherein the first layer organizes computer operations , 
display . 25 including navigation operations , into groups based on simi 

According to one aspect of the present invention , the lar functional operation . According to another embodiment 
plurality of views are configured to organize modes of of the invention , the first layer maps to groupings of lower 
content into different views . According to another embodi - level functionality . According to another embodiment of the 
ment of the invention , the plurality of modes of content invention , the first layer include navigation operations maps 
comprise at least one of a web content mode , a channel 30 to a seconding layer comprising computer operations for 
content mode , a media content mode , an application content interacting with computer content . According to another 
mode , a communication content mode , and a passive content embodiment of the invention , levels of computer functions 
mode . According to another embodiment of the invention , are segregated based on proximity of the operation to a 
the plurality of modes of content include a web content source of digital content , higher levels including operations 
mode , wherein the web content mode is configured to 35 that navigate to lower level operations that permit interac 
display web based content for proximal viewing by a user . tion with computer content . 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
plurality of modes of content include a channel content the first layer comprises a home view and a channel view , 
mode , wherein the channel content mode is configured to and the first layer is further configured to organize and 
display web based content for non - proximal viewing by a 40 simplify access to lower level functions . According to 
user . According to another embodiment of the invention , the another embodiment of the invention , the visual represen 
plurality of modes of content include a media content mode , tations comprise a lower layer relative to the first layer and 
wherein the media content mode is configured to display include lower level functions . According to another embodi 
media based content for non - proximal viewing by a userm ent of the invention , the plurality of views includes a home 
mode . According to another embodiment of the invention , 45 view organizing a plurality of visual representations of 
the plurality of modes of content include a web content digital content , wherein the home view is displayed respon 
mode , wherein the web content mode is optimized to display sive to a computer system configuration . According to 
web based content for proximal viewing by a user . Accord - another embodiment of the invention , the computer system 
ing to another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of configuration comprises a physical positioning of the com 
modes of content include a channel content mode , wherein 50 puter system about a longitudinal axis of rotation . According 
the channel content mode is optimized to display web based to another embodiment of the invention , the computer 
content for non - proximal viewing by a user . According to system configuration further comprises a physical position 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of modes ing of a computer system display relative to a base of the 
of content include a media content mode , wherein the media computer system . According to another embodiment of the 
content mode is optimized to display media based content 55 invention , the home view comprises a header display and a 
for non - proximal viewing by a user mode . body display . According to another embodiment of the 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , invention , the header display comprises a lateral bar extend 
the media based content includes at least one of digital ing from the left of the computer display screen to the right 
photos , digital audio files , and digital video files . According of the computer display screen . According to another 
to another embodiment of the invention , the media based 60 embodiment of the invention , the user interface further 
content is accessed through a remote service . According to comprises a search tool displayed in the header display , 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of modes wherein the search tool is configured to accept search terms 
of content include a connect content mode , wherein the entered by a user and in response to execution , causes the 
connect content mode is configured to display computer computer system to navigate to a view of a first visual 
configuration operations for viewing by a user . According to 65 representation of digital content , wherein the digital content 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of modes includes a search engine , and the search engine presents 
of content include an application content mode , wherein the results for the search terms . 
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According to one embodiment of the present invention , manipulation of the integrated scroll wheel , and manipula 
the user interface further comprises a storage component tion of the integrated scroll wheel causes the computer 
configured to retain a previous view state . According to system to render a next visual representation in the display 
another embodiment of the invention , the execution com of the sequence of visual representations . According to 
ponent is further configured to cause the computer system to 5 another embodiment of the invention , the visual represen 
transition to a previous view in response to execution of a tations are responsive to execution by a selector , including 
navigation element by a user . According to another embodi - a button . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
ment of the invention , the user interface further comprises a the button is available in a plurality of computer system 
navigation element disposed in the header display . Accord configurations . According to another embodiment of the 
ing to another embodiment of the invention , the body 10 invention , the execution component is further configured to 
display is rendered below the header display in the display cause the computer system to transition to the first view 
screen of the computer system . According to another including the digital content in response to execution of the 
embodiment of the invention , the body comprises an orga - selector by a user . According to another embodiment of the 
nization of the plurality of visual representations of com - invention , the user interface further comprises a storage 
puter content rendered on the computer display . According 15 component configured to retain a current computer system 
to another embodiment of the invention , the user interface configuration state . 
further comprises a display threshold for a screen rendered According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
in the computer display . According to another embodiment the storage component is further configured to retain a 
of the invention , the home view is configured into pages current view state . According to another embodiment of the 
based on the display of the computer system and the display 20 invention , the execution component is further configured to 
threshold . According to another embodiment of the inven transition the computer system display between the plurality 
tion , the display threshold establishes a maximum number of of views , responsive to at least one of the current computer 
visual representations display per page of the home view . system configuration state and the current view state . 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the user According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
interface further comprises an indication of visual represen - 25 execution component is configured to transition to a channel 
tations displayed on adjacent pages of the home view , view in response to manipulation of an integrated scroll 
wherein the indication is display within the body of the wheel , when the computer system is in a laptop and an easel 
home view . configuration . According to another embodiment of the 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , invention , the user interface further comprises a scroll wheel 
the user interface further comprises a nascent card displayed 30 threshold configured to require additional manipulations of 
in the body of the home view , wherein the nascent card is the integrated scroll in order to cause the transition to the 
configured to permit generation of additional visual repre - channel view , when the current computer system configu 
sentations of digital content . According to another embodi - ration state indicates the computer system is in a laptop 
ment of the invention , the execution component is further configuration . According to another embodiment of the 
configured to execute a process for creating a visual repre - 35 invention , the execution component is further configured to 
sentation in response to execution of the nascent card , transition from the first view and a home view to a channel 
wherein the process for creating a visual representation view in response to a change in computer system configu 
includes acts of transitioning to a quick access view , gen ration state from laptop to easel . 
erating a mapping to online digital content , executing the According to another embodiment , the interface discussed 
mapping , and displaying a first view of the mapped digital 40 above is displayed on a portable computer configurable 
content . According to another embodiment of the invention , between a plurality of display modes including a closed 
the user interface further comprises a quick access view , mode , a laptop mode and an easel mode . The portable 
wherein the quick access view is configured to permit user computer further comprises a display component including 
generation of a mapping between digital content and a visual a display screen , a base , a hinge assembly at least partially 
representation . According to another embodiment of the 45 housed within the base and configured to pivotably couple 
invention , the quick access view permits a user to select the display component to the base , wherein the display 
from a display of frequently accessed web content to gen - component is rotatable about a longitudinal axis running 
erate the mapping . According to another embodiment of the along an interface between the display component and the 
invention , the quick access view permits a user to select base , wherein , in the closed mode , the display screen is 
from a display of stored bookmarks to generate the mapping . 50 disposed substantially against the base , wherein rotating the 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the display component about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
quick access view permits a user to enter a url to generate the mately 180 degrees from the closed mode configures the 
mapping . According to another embodiment of the inven - portable computer into the laptop mode , and wherein rotat 
tion , the plurality of views includes a channel view , and the ing the display component about the longitudinal axis 
view selector component is further responsive to an inte - 55 beyond approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode 
grated scroll wheel on the computer system . According to configures the portable computer into the easel mode . 
another embodiment of the invention , the view selector According to one aspect of the present invention , a 
component is further configured to transition the computer method for presenting a customized user interface for a 
system to the channel view in response to manipulation of computer system with a plurality selectable I / O profiles to a 
the integrated scroll wheel . 60 user is provided . The method comprises displaying a a map 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , based graphical user interface on the computer system , the 
the channel view further comprises a channel selector . act of displaying the map based user interface includes acts 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the of displaying a plurality of views of a plurality of visual 
channel selector comprises a display of a sequence of visual representations of computer content , wherein the computer 
representations presenting a channel content mode . Accord - 65 content includes at least one of selectable digital content , 
ing to another embodiment of the invention , the display of selectable computer operations and passive digital content , 
the sequence of visual representations is responsive to and displaying the plurality of visual representations of 
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computer content rendered on the computer display , wherein tion , the method further comprises displaying a search tool 
the plurality of visual representations of computer content in the header display , accepting entry of search terms 
include an association to a first view of the plurality of through an I / O device , navigating to a view of a first visual 
views , the first view including the computer content , and representation of computer content , wherein the computer 
wherein the each of the plurality of visual representations is 5 content includes a search engine , and the search engine 
responsive to focus and execution , wherein execution presents results for the search terms , in response to an act of 
includes clicking on the visual representation , and execut - executing the search tool . According to another embodiment 
ing , by a computer processor , a transition in the computer of the invention , the method further comprises an act of 
system display between the plurality of views , wherein the storing in a computer memory a previous view state . 
act of executing includes an act of selecting one of the 10 According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
plurality of views for display on a computer system in method further comprises acts of displaying a navigation 
response to a computer system configuration . According to element in the header display , permitting execution of the 
one embodiment of the present invention , the act of execut - navigation element by a user , and transitioning the computer 
ing occurs in response to an act of permitting execution of system display to a previous view , in response to the act of 
at least one of a computer system operation , a visual 15 permitting . 
representation , a computer system configuration , and a According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
change in computer system configuration . According to the home view further comprises at least one display page 
another embodiment of the invention , the method further and the method further comprising acts of displaying the 
comprises an act of displaying a plurality of modes of plurality of visual representations of computer content ren 
content for the computer content on the computer display , 20 dered on the computer display in the body display , and 
wherein the plurality of modes of content comprise at least displaying a maximal number of visual representations in a 
one of a web content mode , a channel content mode , a media display page of the home view . According to another 
content mode , an application content mode , a communica embodiment of the invention , the method further comprises 
tion content mode , and a passive content mode . displaying an indication of visual representations displayed 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , 25 on adjacent display pages in the home view , wherein the 
the plurality of views are configured to organize modes of indication is displayed within the body of the home view . 
content into different views . According to another embodi - According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
ment of the invention , the web content mode is configured method further comprises acts of displaying a nascent card 
to display web based content for proximal viewing by a user , in the body of the home view , permitting execution func 
wherein the channel content mode is configured to display 30 tionality associated with the nascent card , and generating an 
web based content for non - proximal viewing by a user , additional visual representations of digital content in 
wherein the media content mode is configured to display response to execution of the functionality associated with 
media based content for non - proximal viewing by a user the nascent card . According to another embodiment of the 
mode , wherein the application content mode is configured to invention , the method further comprising act of executing a 
display computer applications for use by a user , wherein the 35 process for creating a visual representation in response to 
communication content mode is configured to display com - execution of the functionality associated with nascent card , 
puter configuration operations for viewing by a user , and wherein the process for creating a visual representation 
wherein the passive content mode is configured to display includes acts of transitioning to a quick access view , gen 
web based content for non - proximal viewing without user erating a mapping to online digital content , executing the 
interaction . According to another embodiment of the inven - 40 mapping , and displaying a first view of the mapped digital 
tion , in the plurality of views includes a home view and a content . 
channel view , and the method further comprises acts of According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
organizing a plurality of content modes into the home view ; the method further comprises acts of displaying a quick 
and organizing at least one of a single content mode and a access view , permitting a user to select a source of digital 
two content modes into the channel view . According to 45 content in the quick access view , and generating a mapping 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of views between the source of digital content and a visual represen 
includes a screen saver view , and the method further com - tation in response to an act of selecting a source of digital 
prises an act of organizing selected content modes for content . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
passive viewing in the screen saver view . the plurality of views includes a channel view , and the act of 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , 50 executing a transition occurs in response an act of activating 
the plurality of views includes a home view , and the method an integrated scroll wheel on the computer system . Accord 
further comprises organizing a plurality of visual represen - ing to another embodiment of the invention , the method 
tations of digital content into the home view , wherein the further comprises an act of displaying a channel selector 
home view is displayed responsive to a computer system including an act of displaying a sequence of visual repre 
configuration , displaying the home view in response to a 55 sentations . According to another embodiment of the inven 
compute system configuration , wherein the act of displaying tion , the act of displaying the sequence of visual represen 
the home view includes an act of displaying a header display tations is responsive to manipulation of the integrated scroll 
and a body display in the home view , wherein the header wheel , and the method further comprises and act of display 
display comprises a lateral frame extending from the left of ing a next visual representation from the sequence of visual 
the computer display screen to the right of the computer 60 representations , in response to manipulation of the inte 
display screen , and wherein the body display is rendered grated scroll wheel . According to another embodiment of the 
below the header display in the display screen of the invention , the method further comprises an act of storing in 
computer system . According to another embodiment of the a computer memory a current computer system configura 
invention , the computer system configuration comprises a tion state and a current view state . According to another 
physical positioning of the computer system display relative 65 embodiment of the invention , the act of executing , by a 
to a base of the computer system about a longitudinal axis computer processor , a transition in the computer system 
of rotation . According to another embodiment of the inven - display the execution component , includes an act of transi 
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tioning the computer system display between the plurality of wherein the passive content mode is configured to display 
views , responsive to at least one of the current computer web based content for non - proximal viewing without user 
system configuration state and the current view state . interaction . 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
the transition occurs to a channel view in response to 5 the first user interface component is further configured to 
manipulation of an integrated scroll wheel , when the com display a home view configured to organize a plurality of 
puter system is in a laptop and an easel configuration . content modes , and a channel view configured to organize at 

According to another embodiment of the invention , the least one of a single content mode and two content modes . 
transition occurs from at least one of the first view and a According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
home view to a channel view in response to a change in in 10 plurality of views includes a screen saver view configured to 

organize selected content modes for passive viewing . computer system configuration state from laptop to easel . According to another embodiment of the invention , the first According to one aspect of the present invention , a user interface component is further configured to display a computer - readable medium having computer - readable sig home view organizing a plurality of visual representations of 
nals stored thereon that define instructions that , as a result of 15 11 01 15 digital content , wherein the home view comprises a header 
being executed by a computer , instruct the computer to display and a body display , and wherein the header display 
perform the method for presenting a customized user inter comprises a lateral frame extending from the left of the 
face for a computer system with a plurality selectable I / O computer display screen to the right of the computer display 
profiles to a user as described above is provided . screen , wherein the body display is rendered below the 

According to one aspect of the present invention , a system 20 header display in the display screen of the computer system . 
for presenting a customized user interface for a system with According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
a plurality selectable I / O profiles is provided . The system system is configured to permit selection of a computer 
comprises a first user interface component configured to system configuration , and the computer system configura 
display a plurality of views of a plurality of visual repre - tion comprises a physical positioning of the computer sys 
sentations of computer content , wherein the computer con - 25 tem display relative to a base of the computer system about 
tent includes at least one of selectable digital content , a longitudinal axis of rotation . According to another embodi 
selectable computer operations and passive digital content , ment of the invention , the first user interface component is 
a second user interface component configured to display the further configured to display a search tool in the header 
plurality of visual representations of computer content on display , wherein the search tool is configured to accept 
the computer display , wherein the plurality of visual repre - 30 search terms entered by a user , and wherein the execution 
sentations of computer content include an association to a component is further configured to causes the computer 
first view of the plurality of views , the first view including system to navigate to a view of a first visual representation 
the computer content , and wherein the each of the plurality of digital content , wherein the digital content includes a 
of visual representations is responsive to focus and execu search engine , and the search engine presents results for the 
tion , wherein execution includes clicking on the visual 35 search terms in response to execution of the search tool . 
representation , and an execution component configured to According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
execute a transition in the computer system display between the system further comprises a storage component config 
the plurality of views , wherein the execution component u red to retain a previous view state . According to another 
further comprises a view selector component act configured embodiment of the invention , the execution component is 
to select one of the plurality of views for display on a 40 further configured to cause the computer system to transition 
computer system in response to a computer system configu - to a previous view in response to execution of a navigation 
ration . According to one embodiment of the present inven - element by a user . According to another embodiment of the 
tion , the execution component is further configured to tran - invention , the first user interface component further com 
sition between the plurality of views in response to prises a display of the navigation element in the header 
execution of at least one of a computer system operation , a 45 display . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
visual representation , a computer system configuration , and the body display comprises an organization of the plurality 
a change in computer system configuration . According to of visual representations of computer content rendered on 
another embodiment of the invention , the second user inter - the computer display , and the home view further comprises 
face component is further configured to display a plurality of display pages in response to a display threshold establishing 
modes of content for the computer content rendered on the 50 a maximal number of visual representations displayed per 
computer display , wherein the plurality of modes of content display page . According to another embodiment of the 
comprise at least one of a web content mode , a channel invention , the home view further comprises an indication of 
content mode , a media content mode , an application content visual representations displayed on adjacent display pages of 
mode , a communication content mode , and a passive content the home view , wherein the indication is displayed within 
mode . According to another embodiment of the invention , 55 the body of the home view . According to another embodi 
the plurality of views are configured to organize modes of ment of the invention , the second user interface component 
content into different views . According to another embodi - further comprises a nascent card displayed in the body of the 
ment of the invention , the web content mode is configured home view , wherein the nascent card is configured to permit 
to display web based content for proximal viewing by a user , generation of additional visual representations of digital 
wherein the channel content mode is configured to display 60 content . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
web based content for non - proximal viewing by a user , the execution component is further configured to execute a 
wherein the media content mode is configured to display process for creating a visual representation in response to 
media based content for non - proximal viewing by a user execution of the nascent card , wherein the process for 
mode , wherein the application content mode is configured to creating a visual representation includes acts of transitioning 
display computer applications for use by a user , wherein the 65 to a quick access view , generating a mapping to online 
communication content mode is configured to display com - digital content , executing the mapping , and displaying a first 
puter configuration operations for viewing by a user , and view of the mapped digital content . 
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According to one embodiment of the present invention , puter , and the display orientation module may display con 
the first user interface component further comprises a quick tent on the display screen in an orientation dependent on the 
access view , wherein the quick access view is configured to current display mode detected by the mode sensor . Depend 
permit user generation of a mapping between digital content ing on the hinge assembly used , the longitudinal axis may 
and a visual representation . According to another embodi - 5 comprises multiple parallel axes , and the hinge assembly 
ment of the invention , the plurality of views includes a may be configured to permit rotation of the display compo 
channel view , and the view selector component is further nent about any of the multiple parallel axes to configure the 
responsive to an integrated scroll wheel on the computer portable computer between the plurality of display modes . 
system . According to another embodiment of the invention , Still other aspects , embodiments , and advantages of these 
the view selector component is further configured to tran - 10 exemplary aspects and embodiments , are discussed in detail 
sition the computer system to the channel view in response below . Moreover , it is to be understood that both the 
to manipulation of the integrated scroll wheel . According to foregoing information and the following detailed description 
another embodiment of the invention , the channel view are merely illustrative examples of various aspects and 
further comprises a channel selector comprising a display of embodiments , and are intended to provide an overview or 
a sequence of visual representations presenting a channel 15 framework for understanding the nature and character of the 
content mode . According to another embodiment of the claimed aspects and embodiments . Any embodiment dis 
invention , the display of the sequence of visual representa closed herein may be combined with any other embodiment 
tions is responsive to manipulation of the integrated scroll in any manner consistent with the objects , aims , and needs 
wheel , and manipulation of the integrated scroll wheel disclosed herein , and references to “ an embodiment , " " some 
causes the computer system to render a next visual repre - 20 embodiments , " " an alternate embodiment , ” “ various 
sentation in the display of the sequence of visual represen - embodiments , " " one embodiment ” or the like are not nec 
tations . According to another embodiment of the invention , essarily mutually exclusive and are intended to indicate that 
the system further comprises a storage component config - a particular feature , structure , or characteristic described in 
ured to retain a current computer system configuration state connection with the embodiment may be included in at least 
and a current view state . According to another embodiment 25 one embodiment . The appearances of such terms herein are 
of the invention , the execution component is further con - not necessarily all referring to the same embodiment . 
figured to transition the computer system display between 
the plurality of views , responsive to at least one of the BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 
current computer system configuration state and the current 
view state . According to another embodiment of the inven - 30 Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
tion , the execution component is configured to transition to below with reference to the accompanying figures , which are 
a channel view in response to manipulation of an integrated not intended to be drawn to scale . The figures are included 
scroll wheel , when the computer system is in a laptop and an to provide illustration and a further understanding of the 
easel configuration . According to another embodiment of the various aspects and embodiments , and are incorporated in 
invention , the execution component is further configured to 35 and constitute a part of this specification , but are not 
transition from the first view and a home view to a channel intended as a definition of the limits of the invention . Where 
view in response to a change in computer system configu - technical features in the figures , detailed description or any 
ration state from laptop to easel . claim are followed by references signs , the reference signs 

According to one embodiment , a portable computer is have been included for the sole purpose of increasing the 
configurable between various modes , including a closed 40 intelligibility of the figures , detailed description , and / or 
mode , a laptop mode , an easel mode , a flat mode and a frame claims . Accordingly , neither the reference signs nor their 
mode . The portable computer may comprise a display com - absence are intended to have any limiting effect on the scope 
ponent including a display screen , a base , and a hinge of any claim elements . In the figures , each identical or nearly 
assembly at least partially housed within the base and identical component that is illustrated in various figures is 
configured to pivotably couple the display component to the 45 represented by a like numeral . For purposes of clarity , not 
base . The display component may be rotatable about a every component may be labeled in every figure . In the 
longitudinal axis running along an interface between the figures : 
display component and the base . In the closed mode , the FIG . 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
display screen may be disposed substantially against the computer , according to aspects of the invention , in a “ lap 
base , and rotating the display component about the longi - 50 top ” configuration ; 
tudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the FIG . 2 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
closed mode may configure the portable computer into the graphical user interface showing a home view , according to 
laptop mode . Rotating the display component about the aspects of the invention ; 
longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees axis FIGS . 3A - C are screen shots illustrating examples of a 
from the closed mode may configure the portable computer 55 graphical user interface showing web page views , according 
into the easel mode . to aspects of the invention ; 

In one example of the portable computer , the display FIG . 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to FIG . 1 in the easel mode ; 
approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode . In another FIG . 5 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
example , the portable computer comprises a display orien - 60 graphical user interface showing a quick access view , 
tation module that displays content on the display screen in according to aspects of the invention ; 
one of a plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal FIG . 6 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
axis . The orientation of the displayed content may be graphical user interface showing a bookmark view , accord 
dependent on the current display mode of the portable ing to aspects of the invention ; 
computer , or may be configurable responsive to a user input . 65 FIGS . 7A - B are screen shots illustrating examples of a 
The portable computer may further comprise a mode sensor graphical user interface showing a web page view , according 
which detects a current display mode of the portable com to aspects of the invention ; 
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FIG . 8 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 30 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
graphical user interface showing a home view , according to user interface showing a shared card , according to aspects of 
aspects of the invention ; the invention ; 

FIG . 9 is an illustration of an example conceptual model FIG . 31 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
of a graphical user interface , according to aspects of the 5 user interface showing a shared card notification , according 
invention ; to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 10 illustrates an example process for generating a FIG . 32 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
visual representation of computer content , according to user interface showing a notification messages , according to 
aspects of the invention ; aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 11 is a block diagram of one example of a portable FIG . 33 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
computer user interface architecture , according to aspects of user interface showing a notification , according to aspects of 
the invention ; the invention ; 

FIG . 12 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 34 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
graphical user interface , according to aspects of the inven - 15 user interface showing a notification , according to aspects of 
tion ; the invention ; 

FIG . 13 is a screen shot illustrating another example of a FIG . 35 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
graphical user interface according to aspects of the inven - user interface showing a web page view with a download 
tion ; interface , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 14 illustrates an example of a behavior model for 20 FIG . 36 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
display of cards responsive to computer focus , according to interpreting executable operations into streamlined opera 
aspects of the invention ; tions according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 15A is a screen shot of an example web card in a FIG . 37 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
non - hover state , according to aspects of the invention ; permitting selection of executable operations in content 

FIG . 15B is a screen shot of an example web card in a 25 according to aspects of the invention ; 
hover state , according to aspects of the invention ; FIG . 38 is a flow diagram of one example process for 

FIG . 16 is a screen shot of examples of option views of transforming executable operations into remote storage 
cards , according to aspects of the invention ; operations according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable FIG . 39 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
computer in the laptop mode , according to aspects of the ve 30 obtaining service access information , according to aspects of 
invention ; the invention ; 
FIGS . 18A - E illustrate examples of a header display FIG . 40 is a flow diagram of one example process for 

pre - configuring a streamlined device , according to aspects responsive to focus and user activity , according to aspects of of the invention ; the invention ; 35 FIG . 41A is a screen shot illustrating an example graphi 
FIG . 19 is a screen shot of a web page view including a uing a cal user interface showing a web page view with a print toolbar , according to aspects of the invention ; interface , according to aspects of the invention ; 
FIGS . 20A - B are screen shots illustrating examples of a FIG . 41B are screen shots illustrating examples of print 

graphical user interface showing a channel page view , and download interfaces , according to aspects of the inven 
according to aspects of the invention ; 40 tion ; 

FIG . 21 is a screen shot illustrating examples of a graphi FIG . 42 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
cal user interface showing a channel full view , according to streamlining user interactions with digital content , according 
aspects of the invention ; to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 22 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 43 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
graphical user interface showing a bookmark view , accord - 45 streamlining user interactions with computer content , 
ing to aspects of the invention ; according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 23 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 44 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
graphical user interface showing a channel view , according permitting a user to interact with computer content , accord 
to aspects of the invention ; ing to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 24 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 50 FIG . 45 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
graphical user interface showing a channel page view , providing consistent accessibility to computer content , 
according to aspects of the invention ; according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIGS . 25A - B are illustrations of example logical dia - FIG . 46 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
grams of the behavior for the channel view , according to providing consistent navigation operations to a user , accord 
aspects of the invention ; 55 ing to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 26 is an illustration of the portable computer con - FIGS . 47A - B are flow diagrams of example processes for 
figured into a “ frame ” mode , according to aspects of the generating a user interface element , according to aspects of 
invention ; the invention ; 

FIG . 27 is an illustration of the portable computer con - FIG . 48 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
figured into a " flat " mode , according to aspects of the 60 permitting a user to select a viewing mode for a streamlined 
invention ; device , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 28 is an illustration of an example logical diagram of FIG . 49A is a flow diagram of one example process for 
the behavior for the channel view , according to aspects of transitioning between a lean forward view to a lean back 
the invention ; ward view , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIGS . 29A - B are screen shots illustrating example graphi - 65 FIG . 49B is a flow diagram of one example process for 
cal user interfaces showing a web page view with a share transitioning between user views , according to aspects of the 
interface , according to aspects of the invention ; invention ; 

motion 
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FIG . 50 is a flow diagram of one example process for in selection of an I / O profile . According to one embodiment , 
organizing a plurality of views and GUI elements into a the visual representations are rendered as cards , as discussed 
consistent presentation , according to aspects of the inven in more detail below . Different types of cards may be 
tion ; employed to render different types of available content . For 

FIG . 51 is a block diagram of a computer system for 5 example , web based content , may be rendered as a web card 
streamlining user interactions with computer content ( e . g . FIG . 2 , 206 ) that associated with a mapping to web 
according to aspects of the invention ; and content . Some web cards map directly to web pages and in 

FIGS . 52A - C are diagrams illustrating different positions response to selection of the web card the computer device 
of the portable computer of FIG . 4 in easel mode ; executes the mapping and displays a web view of the 

FIG . 53A is an illustration of a portion of the portable 10 content . Other cards may be used to provide interactive 
computer of FIG . 1 in the laptop mode , illustrating a hinge displays selectable by a user . In another example , system 
assembly according to aspects of the invention ; and operations are displayed as system cards ( e . g . FIG . 2 , 212 ) , 

FIG . 53B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable which are associated with mappings to system operations , 
computer of FIG . 1 in the easel mode , illustrating the hinge for example communications configurations , and may com 
assembly according to aspects of the invention . 15 prise a settings card , among other system options . Another 

type of card includes a channel card ( e . g . FIG . configured to 
DETAILED DESCRIPTION stream web based content in a manner that allows for 

summarization of content , while still providing the ability to 
It is realized that the conventional wisdom with respect to fully appreciate the summarized content . 

such " feature packing ” as discussed above suffers from 20 Those skilled in the art will appreciate that previous 
significant flaws . Typical computer users simply can ' t take attempts have been made to present summary views of 
advantage of all the functionality offered , either the services available content . However , known summarized content 
and features offered by their own computer , or the services typically suffers from significant flaws . For example sum 
and features offered by online providers . The complexity of marization of web based content simply reduces the display 
the interface ( both hardware and software ) hampers adop - 25 size of the information in the content . With respect to news 
tion , as does the volume of features offered . For example , headlines , for example , this often prevents a user from being 
third party service provides often find difficulty in subscrib - able to appreciated the summarize content . Quite simply 
ing new users , educating existing users , and providing truncating a headline prevents the user from understanding 
integration of feature sets for the features they provide as the context of the portion of the headline s / he is able to read . 
well as those offered by other service providers . 30 In other examples , headlines are display to such a reduce 

Synergy between services providers can be found and size that an average computer user simply cannot read or 
exploited by even the most novice user through streamlined appreciate them . Using channel cards according to aspects 
computer systems and user interface presentation . Accord - and embodiments , summarized content may be presented in 
ing to one aspect , the interplay between various third party a manner that permits appreciation and interaction with the 
services and computer features can be readily appreciated by 35 summarized content itself . In another example , channel card 
even the most novice user because the various functionality are configured to present a streamlined view that cannot only 
and features sets are easily accessible through the stream - be appreciated and interacted , but may be transitioned from 
lined access controls and consistent user interfaces . As one mode of viewing to another without loss of the ability 
discussed further below , in one example , the graphical user to appreciate and interact with the streamlined view . 
interface improves transitions from one service to another , 40 According to one aspect , streamlining of the user device 
through a consistent view of available content . A user is able and streamlining of the user interface provided in such 
to navigate easily and quickly from one content provider to devices leads to simplified interaction between a user and 
another user the organized view . The elements that comprise features . The streamlining may impact not only features of 
the view further facilitate navigation and transition by , for the system , but features provided by services accessed by the 
example , retaining state information an in another example 45 system . Streamlined activity leads directly to better adop 
by remaining persistent to the view . tion , understanding and integration of both new and old 

According to another aspect , streamlining the computer features available to users . The consistency of user experi 
system / device the user interacts with includes establishing a ence even with third party service providers , for example , 
first set of I / O devices that a user needs to operate and fosters familiarity not only with a particular user and his / her 
providing that first set of I / O devices as a physical configu - 50 interactions with a particular device , but also with other 
ration of the device . Additionally , providing the user the users of the same / similar device . A common experience may 
ability to change from the first set of I / O devices , a first I / O be created for multiple users , fostering a community expe 
profile , to another at will improves the user experience and rience . According to one example , providing a common 
permits the user to dynamically select a preferred I / O profile experience includes establishing a global profile for a user of 
best suited to the user ' s present need . According to one 55 a streamlined device . The global profile , in some examples , 
embodiment , user selection includes transitioning from a is retained in remote storage , and accessed upon start up of 
lean back mode to a lean forward mode and vice versa . In any streamlined device . The global profile permits the user ' s 
one embodiment , the user ' s computer device is configured experience to be consistent even across multiple streamlined 
to have multiple I / O profiles that can be selected by physi - devices . In one example , configurations and customizations 
cally manipulating the orientation of the computer device 60 are retained in remote storage ; changes on one device may 
itself . be written to remote storage , propagating changes across 

According to another aspect , streamlining user interac multiple streamlined devices that access the remote storage . 
tions with the computer system / device includes representing Thus a common experience is also provided across multiple 
computer based content in visual representations that render devices . 
computer operations / behavior in a consistent manner . The 65 According to another aspect , the common experience may 
visual representations are adapted to permit easy user inter - also include a community aspect . The community aspect 
action even upon selection of a first I / O profile or the change includes sharing of content between users , sharing of con 
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tent and configurations , sharing of content , configurations , illustrated in the user device itself . According to one 
and customizations , among many options . In particular , embodiment , the user interface and the visual representa 
sharing may involve the transmission of user interface tions that comprise the interface are configured to be respon 
elements to other users . In one example , a user may share a sive to the physical configuration of the user device . In one 
card and any of its configurations with another user . Access 5 example , the view presented to user is configured to be 
to the shared user interface elements , in some embodiments , responsive to the mode / configuration of the device . 
facilitates communal computer usage . In one example , a first According to one aspect , systems and methods are pro 
user may be watching media on their streamlined device , vided for simplifying the presentation of multi - media fea 
another user known to the first user , may receive a user tures and options into an integrated and streamlined presen 
interface element that retains information related to the 10 tation format . Streamlining presentation includes reducing 
accessed content and information related to the present the number of options that a user must navigate / configure in 
context . That is for the first user watching a movie , the first order to take advantage of new systems and features , sim 
user may share the user interface element through which plifying the process of adoption and education . In one 
s / he is accessing the move , and permit the another user not embodiment a system is provided with only the physical 
only to watch the movie , but to take up the movie at the same 15 components necessary to achieve streamlined presentation 
point in time , so in essence , they get to enjoy the movie of both operating system features and integration of third 
together . Content and context retention by user interface party services . For example , a streamlined hardware device elements that can be shared provides unique advantages to provides for ( in comparison to typical desktop and laptop 
the users of the streamlined devices . systems ) a reduced user input platform as a first I / O profile , According to another aspect , various operations provides 2 20 comprising in one configuration a scroll wheel and a button on conventional systems are adapted for streamlined pro interface . Other I / O profiles are available for user selection cessing . In on example , operations that require large by manipulation of the device itself . In one embodiment , an amounts of computer storage are transformed in remote 
storage requests . In one embodiment , a streamlined device is easel mode presents the user with the first I / O profile and by 
configured to identify local storage request and transform rotating the computer device about a longitudinal axis ; the 
them into a storage request to an on - line service provider 25 user may select a second 1 / 0 profile , including a keyboard . 
identified in a user and / or device profile . In another embodi mbodi . The transition from one I / O profile to another may also cause 
ment , the system prompts a user to identify a service the computer device to alter its display . In one example , the 
provider in response to a local request . Various operations user interface provided to the user is responsive to selection 
may be transformed , including download and print opera of device mode and / or selection of I / O profile . 
tions , among others . 30 It is to be appreciated that reducing the number of I / O 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods device achieves simplicity of design and ease of operation 
and apparatus discussed herein are not limited in application by the user , and at the same time may increase the com 
to the details of construction and the arrangement of com - plexity of the graphical user interfaces needed to support 
ponents set forth in the following description or illustrated in interaction with systems and third parties that anticipate , 
the accompanying figures . The methods and apparatus are 35 rely on , or expect additional I / O devices . Streamlining 
capable of implementation in other embodiments and of device operation by the user is balanced against sophistica 
being practiced or of being carried out in various ways . tion of user the interface required to enable user interaction 
Examples of specific implementations are provided herein with the same features used with additional I / O devices . 
for illustrative purposes only and are not intended to be According to one embodiment , the user interface layer 
limiting . In particular , acts , elements and features discussed 40 provides simplified accessibility based on the device ' s I / O 
in connection with any one or more embodiments are not platform , and for some embodiments , the user interface 
intended to be excluded from a similar role in any other layer is responsive to device configurations that change the 
embodiments . device ' s I / O capabilities . In other embodiments , the user 

Also , the phraseology and terminology used herein is for interface is responsive to changes in the device ' s mode . In 
the purpose of description and should not be regarded as 45 some examples , changes in device mode and changes I / O 
limiting . Any references to embodiments or elements or acts profile will occur together , however , in other examples a 
of the systems and methods herein referred to in the singular change in mode or a change in I / O profile will not require a 
may also embrace embodiments including a plurality of corresponding change in profile or mode respectively . 
these elements , and any references in plural to any embodi - One example of a streamlined device includes a portable 
ment or element or act herein may also embrace embodi - 50 computer that is configurable between a laptop mode ( in 
ments including only a single element . References in the which the portable computer has a conventional laptop 
singular or plural form are not intended to limit the presently appearance ) and an easel mode in which the base of the 
disclosed systems or methods , their components , acts , or computer and its display component stand upright forming 
elements . The use herein of “ including , " " comprising , " an inverted “ V , ” as discussed further herein . Certain aspects 
“ having , " " containing , " " involving , " and variations thereof 55 and embodiments are directed to a portable computer that is 
is meant to encompass the items listed thereafter and equiva - configurable between different operating modes , including a 
lents thereof as well as additional items . References to “ or ” laptop mode ( in which the portable computer has a conven 
may be construed as inclusive so that any terms described tional laptop appearance ) , a flat mode , a frame mode , and an 
using “ or ” may indicate any of a single , more than one , and easel mode in which the base of the computer and its display 
all of the described terms . Any references to front and back , 60 component stand vertically forming an inverted “ V , " as 
left and right , top and bottom , and upper and lower are discussed further herein . Reference to modes of the com 
intended for convenience of description , not to limit the puter , modes of the device and intended to include the 
present systems and methods or their components to any one physical configuration of the portable computer / device . 
positional or spatial orientation . The portable computer is capable of different display 
Device Examples and Configuration Options 65 formats and functionality in the different modes , and 

Various aspects , including the integration between the includes a graphical user interface that may work seamlessly 
user interface , its views , and navigation options are further with the computer hardware to provide a unified , comfort 
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able , holistic user experience . In particular , the portable button 296 . In one example , the volume control button 294 
computer may provide access to a wide array of functions , may be a rocker switch that allows a user to easily increase 
both those traditionally provided by computing devices and or decrease the volume of audio played through the speakers 
those traditionally provided by other passive information 128 . When the user presses the volume control button 294 , 
devices . For example , the hardware and software , including 5 a volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display 
the graphical user interface , of the portable computer may be screen 110 , to provide a visual indication of the amount by 
focused toward providing access to entertainment media , which the volume is being increased or decreased . Similarly , 
such as audio and video ( e . g . , playing music , streaming pressing the mute button 296 may cause a visual indication 
video , viewing photographs , etc . ) , email , and internet , while that the volume is muted to appear on the display screen 110 . 
also providing state - of - the - art computer processing capabil - 10 According to one embodiment , when the portable com 
ity . puter 100 is configured into the easel mode , the visual 

Referring to FIG . 1 , there is illustrated one example of a display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 
portable computer according to aspects of the invention . In 180 degrees such that the information appears " right - way 
FIG . 1 , the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the up , ” even through the display screen is upside - down com 
" laptop ” mode , with the display component 102 inclined at 15 pared to when the portable computer is in the laptop mode . 
a viewing angle from the base 104 . The display component Thus , a user may simply " flip ” the portable computer 100 
102 is pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge assembly into the easel mode and immediately be able to comfortably 
( not shown ) that allows the display component to be rotated view information on the display screen 110 , without having 
with respect to the base . The hinge assembly may include a to access display screen controls to adjust the orientation of 
single or multiple hinges , which may be any of a variety of 20 the visual display . In one embodiment , the portable com 
hinge types , including , but not limited , to single - axis hinges , puter 100 includes an orientation ( or mode ) sensor that is 
multiple - axis hinges , geared hinges , etc . In one example , the configured to detect whether the portable computer is in the 
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be laptop mode or the easel mode , and to adjust the display 
rotated ( or tilted ) about a longitudinal axis 101 running accordingly . The orientation sensor may be incorporated into 
along an interface between the display component and the 25 the base component 104 , for example , underneath the key 
base 104 , as illustrated in FIG . 1 and discussed further board 106 , or into the display component . In one example , 
below . The base 104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal locating the orientation sensor in the display component 
electronic components ( not shown ) , such as a central pro - 102 , rather than the base 104 , may provide more robust 
cessing unit , memory , and other components necessary to detection and therefore , may be presently preferred in some 
operate the portable computer , as known to those skilled in 30 embodiments . The orientation sensor may be used to deter 
the art . In some embodiments , the base 104 may also include mine a precise relative orientation of the base component 
a touch pad 108 or trackball ( not shown ) for receiving user 104 with respect to the display component 102 , or vice 
commands , as known to those skilled in the art . versa , for example , to determine whether the device is in the 

Still referring to FIG . 1 , the display component 102 laptop mode , easel mode , or some point in between the two 
includes a display screen 110 , and may also include a camera 35 modes . In one example , the orientation sensor includes an 
112 , microphone 114 , and infrared receiver 116 , as discussed accelerometer whose output is fed to the computer operating 
further below . It is to be appreciated that the locations of the system ( or to dedicated logic circuitry ) which then triggers 
camera 112 , microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are a display inversion as appropriate . 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG . 1 , and may be According to one embodiment an accelerometer is used to 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 40 detect a configuration of the portable computer , although , it 
and / or base 104 , as would be recognized by those skilled in is to be appreciated that other sensors and devices may be 
the art . The display component 102 may also include cush - used to determine a configuration . According to another 
ions 118 that provide soft contact points between the base embodiment , the portable computer may include integrated 
104 and the display component 102 when the portable “ navigation ” hardware that allows a user to easily and 
computer is closed . In one example , the cushions 118 are 45 comfortably control various features and functions of the 
made of rubber . However , it is to be appreciated that the portable computer , to manipulate content displayed on the 
invention is not so limited , and the cushions 118 may portable computer , and to interact with visual representa 
comprise materials other than rubber , including , for tions of content display in a user interface . For example , as 
example , a polymer , felt , or other suitable materials as would discussed above , the portable computer 100 may comprise a 
be recognized by those skilled in the art . 50 scroll wheel 132 that allows a user to control , adjust and / or 

Referring to FIG . 4 , there is illustrated an example of the select various functionality of the portable computer . 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode . To According to another embodiment , the scroll wheel 132 may 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode ( or be used to provide “ hardware navigation ” through informa 
closed position ) into the easel mode , the display component tion , such as menus , icons , etc . , displayed on the display 
102 may be folded away from the base 104 , in the same 55 screen 110 , as discussed further below with reference to 
direction as to open the computer ( i . e . , to configure the FIG . 17 . A common display configuration used in conven 
computer from the closed position into the laptop mode ) tional computers is a " desktop " view in which multiple icons 
such that the base 104 and the display component 102 form representing links to various programs or applications are 
an inverted “ V ” shape with the bottom of the base and the displayed over a background image . Navigation may be 
back of the display component face another , as illustrated in 60 conventionally performed using a mouse , touch pad or 
FIG . 4 . In the easel mode , the display screen 110 is visible trackball , as known to those skilled in the art . 
and accessible on one side of the portable computer 100 and According to another embodiment , the portable computer 
the keyboard 106 ( not shown in FIG . 4 ) is visible and 100 includes a streamlined graphical user interface that 
accessible on the other side . supports “ map ” navigation . The map user interface provides 
As illustrated in FIG . 4 , in one embodiment , the portable 65 a clear overview of the entire computing environment and 

computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con - searching capability within the environment that may be 
trols , including a volume control button 294 and a mute accessed using the scroll wheel 132 and , optionally , one or 
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navigation buttons 166 , 168 that may be provided on the may be integrated including for example GOOGLE DOCS , 
base 104 of the portable computer 100 ( button 166 ) and / or for word processing and other office related applications 
in the keyboard 106 ( button 168 ) , illustrated in FIG . 17 . In provided on - line . Reducing and / or eliminating the need for 
one embodiment , the map mode of navigation is a hierar non volatile memory in the computer system is advanta 
chical mode that reduces the number of items to select 5 geous in that the device itself may be reduced in complexity 
amongst at any stage of navigation , thereby facilitating user and any associated cost . In some embodiments , a stream 
access with the scroll wheel 132 and , optionally , the navi lined device doe not incorporate a hard disk drive for 
gation button ( s ) 166 , 168 . Of course , it is to be appreciated storage , providing for any local storage requirement through 
that the map user interface may also be navigated using RAM and Flash memory . 
conventional tools , such as a trackball , touchpad , mouse or 10 According to one embodiment , the different modes of 
arrow keys . content 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the 

Referring to FIG . 11 , there is illustrated a block diagram display screen 110 , as illustrated in FIG . 12 . The following 
of one example of an architecture of the portable computer discussion of various features , including hardware naviga 
including a map user interface . The user interface “ home ” tion through the map user interface may refer primarily to 
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172 . 15 the display configuration illustrated in FIG . 12 . However , it 
In the illustrated example , the home screen 170 contains five is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited , and 
modes of content 172 ; however , it is to be appreciated that the modes of content may be displayed in other configura 
the home screen may include more or fewer than five modes tions , including , for example , a " desktop " and icon configu 
of content and that the modes of content may differ from the ration , a “ dashboard ” type display , as illustrated in FIG . 13 , 
examples discussed below . According to one example , the 20 or another configuration , as would be recognized by those 
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170 skilled in the art . Similarly , navigation is discussed below 
may include " media " 172a , " connect ” 172b , " web " 172c , primarily with reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navi 
" applications ” 172d , and " channels ” 172e . Using the map gation buttons 166 , 168 ; however , it is to be appreciation 
user interface , information , programs , features and applica that navigation may also be accomplished using any of the 
tions may be grouped into the various modes of content 172 . 25 conventional tools discussed above or known to those 
By selecting any mode of content 172 , for example , by using skilled in the art . 
the scroll wheel 132 and / or navigation buttons 166 , 168 , as As discussed above , according to one embodiment , the 
discussed further below , the user may access the content scroll wheel 132 and , optionally , the navigation buttons 166 , 
organized within that mode . 168 may be used to navigate the user interface . Referring 

For example , the media mode 172a may provide access to 30 again to FIG . 12 , scrolling the scroll wheel may sequentially 
a medial player to play , view , search and organize media highlight different ones of the modes of content 172 . In one 
such as music , video , photos , etc . The connect mode 172b example , the highlighting may be achieved by changing the 
may provide access to features such as , for example , email , color of the selected mode , and / or by providing a visual 
voice - over - IP , instant messaging , etc . , and the web mode indicator , such as a colored bar 176 . A highlighted mode 172 
172c may provide access to internet browsing and searching . 35 may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel , thereby 
The application mode 172d may provide access to , for bringing up a new " page ” or screen on the user interface 
example , computer applications or programs , such as word corresponding to the selected mode . Once within a selected 
processor , spreadsheet , calculator , etc . In one example , these mode of content 172 , the scroll wheel may similarly be used 
applications or programs may be provided as web - based to select particular functions , features or applications within 
services rather than programs or applications residing on the 40 that mode . In one embodiment , the default action for the 
portable computer 100 . The channels mode 172e may pro - scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the 
vide access to different functionality of the portable com - portable computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel 
puter , with the different functions or features defined as mode . For example , in easel mode , the default action for the 
different channels . For example , a channel may include an scroll wheel may be channel selection within the channels 
alarm clock channel in which the portable computer is 45 mode 172 ( e ) . In one embodiment , the scroll wheel 132 may 
configured to display a clock and can be programmed to be depressible as well as scrollable . Thus , pressing the scroll 
activate an alarm , e . g . , a sound , piece of music , etc . , at a wheel 132 , as illustrated in FIG . 4 , may allow further 
predetermined time . Another example of a channel may control , such as , for example , selecting a channel onto which 
include a " photo frame ” channel in which the portable the user has scrolled , or “ play ” and “ pause ” of audio or video 
computer may be configured to display a pre - selected image 50 being played through the portable computer 100 . 
or set of images , etc . Another example of a channel is a As discussed above , according to one embodiment , one or 
“ television " channel , in which the portable computer is more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with 
configured to stream Internet television . In one example , a the scroll wheel . In particular , in one embodiment , the 
user may configure particular Internet television channels navigation button ( s ) may be used to change the action of the 
( e . g . , a news channel , a movie channel , a home and garden 55 scroll wheel . As discussed above , in one example , the 
channel , etc . ) into sub - channels within the channels mode of default action of the scroll wheel is volume control . This 
content 172 ( e ) . Some or all of the modes of content 172 may action may be changed by pressing the navigation button 
access , retrieve and / or store information on the Internet 174 . 166 , as illustrated in FIG . 4 , for example , from volume 

Typically streamlined devices are integrated with remote control to menu navigation in the user interface , and vice 
content storage and / or access , shown at 174 . The integration 60 versa . 
may be provided through third party service providers , in According to one embodiment , the effect of pressing the 
one example photo service FLICKR is integrated with navigation button 166 may vary depending on active the 
various aspects of the device and / or the device ' s user mode of content of the portable computer 100 . For example , 
interface to provide seamless access to photo content stored if a user is in the media mode using a photo viewing 
by the third party provider . The integration with remote 65 application , pressing the navigation button 166 may change 
storage services permits reduced storage capacity on the user the action of the scroll wheel 132 from mode navigation to 
device , for example , a portable computer . Other services slideshow controls for the photos . When the navigation 
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button 166 is pressed , an control indicator box ( similar to the pared to when the portable computer is in the laptop mode . 
volume indicator box 162 discussed above with reference to In another example , for at least some activities within at 
FIG . 14 ) may appear containing different actions for the least some modes of content ( e . g . , viewing a photograph or 
photo slideshow , such as “ play , ” “ next , ” " back , " " skip , ” video ) , when the portable computer 100 is configured into 
“ full screen view , ” etc . , and scrolling the scroll wheel 132 5 the easel mode , the display may automatically adjust to " full 
may allow a user to select one of these actions . Pressing the screen view ” ( i . e . , the displayed image or video is displayed 
navigation button 166 again may return the scroll wheel on the full screen size , rather than in a window ) to allow for 
action to menu navigation , to allow the user to , for example , comfortable viewing . 
move to a different feature or application within the active In addition , as discussed above , the ability to configure 
mode , or to select a different mode . 10 the portable computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the 

As can be seen in FIG . 4 , the navigation button 166 may easel mode provides enhanced functionality . For example , 
be easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the when the portable computer 100 is not being actively used , 
easel mode , providing a convenient navigation tool for this the user may configure the portable computer into the easel 
configuration . A similar navigation button 168 may be mode , and program the portable computer to act as a digital 
provided on the keyboard 106 , as illustrated in FIG . 17 . In 15 photo frame , displaying one or more photos of the user ' s 
one example , the functionality of the two navigation buttons choice . In the easel mode , the portable computer 100 may 
166 , 168 may be the same , with the different locations occupy a smaller footprint on a surface than in the laptop or 
providing easy , comfortable access in the different configu - closed modes because the base 104 and display component 
ration modes ( i . e . , laptop or easel ) of the portable computer 102 are upright , as illustrated in FIGS . 4 and 5 . In addition , 
100 . Thus , a user may use either navigation button 166 or 20 because the portable computer can act as a passive infor 
navigation button 168 , depending on personal preference . In mation and / or entertainment device , such as a photo frame 
another example , the two navigation buttons may have or clock , as discussed above , the portable computer may 
different functionality . For example , the navigation button provide a useful function even when not being actively used 
166 may be used to alter the action of the scroll wheel 132 , by the user , and may do so ( in the easel mode ) without taking 
as discussed above , while the navigation button 168 is used 25 up much surface area . 
to navigate “ up ” or “ down ” a level within the map user It is to be appreciated that although the portable computer 
interface . For example , pressing the navigation button 168 100 is often referred to as being in either the laptop mode or 
while within a given mode of content may allow the user to easel mode , other modes or configurations are also possible . 
“ back up ” to the home screen ; or pressing the navigation For example , as discussed above , because the portable 
button 168 while within a selected channel ( in the channel 30 computer 100 can be configured from the closed position , 
mode of the content 172e ) may allow the user to " back - up ” through the laptop mode into the easel mode by rotating the 
to the channel mode main page . display component 102 , a number of configurations are 

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the possible in between “ true ” laptop mode and “ true ” easel 
functionality of the navigation buttons 166 , 168 is possible , mode . Each different configuration may invoke different 
as would be recognized by those skilled in the art , and the 35 functionality and provide a user with a different aspect of a 
above examples are given for illustration only and are not graphical user interface . 
intended to be limiting . In addition , any functions described In another example , the portable computer 100 may be 
with reference to one navigation button ( 166 or 168 ) to may configured into a “ frame ” mode , as illustrated in FIG . 26 , in 
be instead ( or additionally ) implemented with the other which the portable computer is placed on a surface 212 with 
navigation button . In one example , the function of the 40 the keyboard 106 " face down " on the surface 212 and the 
navigation buttons 166 , 168 may vary depending on whether display 110 facing upward . In the frame mode , the display 
the portable computer 100 is configured into the laptop component 102 may be at a similar orientation , and angle 
mode or the easel mode . For example , only the navigation 134 , with respect to the base component 104 as in the easel 
button 166 may be active in the easel mode , and only the mode . However , rather than the base component 104 and 
navigation button 168 may be active in the laptop mode . 45 display component 102 being oriented vertically with 
Alternatively , both navigation buttons 166 , 168 may be respect to the surface 212 , as in the easel mode ( in which the 
usable in either the laptop mode or the easel mode , but their portable computer forms an inverted “ V ” as discussed 
functionality may vary . For example , when the portable above ) , in the frame mode , the base component 104 may lie 
computer 100 is in the easel mode , the default action for the flat on the surface 212 , as shown in FIG . 26 . In one example , 
navigation button 166 may be channel selection whereas the 50 software and / or hardware protection may be provided for the 
default action for the navigation button 168 is to access the keyboard to prevent keys from being pressed ( or to prevent 
“ home ” screen . Furthermore , the portable computer 100 is the portable computer from responding to pressed keys ) 
not limited to the use of two navigation buttons and may when the portable computer is in the frame mode . 
instead comprise only a single navigation button or more Similarly , referring to FIG . 27 , there is illustrated another 
than two navigation buttons , any of which may be disposed 55 configuration of the portable computer 100 , referring to as 
in the locations described above ( e . g . , on the rounded the “ flat ” mode . In the flat mode , the display component 102 
portion 120 of the base 104 or on the keyboard 106 ) , or in may be rotated ( or opened ) to approximately 180 degrees 
other locations on the portable computer . with respect to the base component 104 , such that the base 
As discussed above , according to one embodiment , the component and display component lay flat on a surface , with 

function or display content and / or display orientation of the 60 the keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed , as shown 
portable computer may vary when the portable computer is in FIG . 27 . Unlike the easel and frame modes , in which the 
configured from the laptop mode into the easel mode , or vice keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible , in the 
versa . For example , as discussed above , when the portable flat mode , the keyboard is accessible and usable . In addition , 
computer 100 is configured into the easel mode , the visual as discussed above , the visual display on the display screen 
display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 65 110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort 
180 degrees such that the information appears " right - way - able viewing of information by persons located in different 
up , ” even through the display screen is upside - down com positions relative to the base component 104 or display 
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component 102 . The visual display on the display screen 110 the invention to the interactions described , nor the specific 
may also be manually adjusted by a user using , for example , presentations discussed , and it is to be appreciated that other 
the keyboard 106 , touch pad 108 or mouse ( not shown ) , interactions are appropriate and even desired in different 
scroll wheel 132 or navigation buttons ( not shown ) . For circumstances . Additionally , different configurations of the 
example , if a user ( located at position A ) wishes to display 5 device itself will provide for different user interactions , for 
information for a person located opposite the user ( at example , based on additional hardware not available in 
position B ) , the visual display may be rotated ( automatically another configuration . 
or manually ) 180 degrees such that the information appears Examples of User Experience 
" right - way - up , ” to the person at location B , even through the In one example , some typical user interactions with 
display screen 110 is upside - down for that person . Similarly , 10 electronic content are illustrated . The user interactions occur 
in another example , the visual display may be rotated in accordance with various aspects of the systems and 
( automatically or manually ) 90 degrees such that the infor - methods for streamlining user interaction with electronic 
mation appears “ right - way - up , ” for a person at location C . In content . In some embodiments , the streamlined device is 
one example , a user can " toggle " the visual display among adapted to accommodate multiple users . In one embodiment , 
various orientations . For example , a user at location A may 15 the user identifies him / herself to the device by entering a 
have the visual display facing themselves while using the user name and password . Once the user name and password 
keyboard 106 or other controls to change or access infor - is accepted the user may begin interacting with the device , 
mation on the display , then toggle the display orientation and if desired through the device to other content . According 
180 or 90 degrees to display the information for persons at to another embodiment , the device may display a “ users ” 
locations B or C . 20 screen , incorporating a visual representation for each user . In 

According to another aspect , system and interface stream response to selection by the user of the visual representation 
lining may be employed with devices of multiple configu - the user is identified . Identification may optionally include a 
rations . In some embodiments , multiple configurations password challenge / response after selection of the visual 
include a traditional configuration , for example , a configu representation . In some embodiments , a camera is available 
ration similar to a laptop device , and also include new 25 through the user device , and the user ' s visual representation 
configurations , for example , an easel mode . Some examples may be generated by taking a snapshot of the user . 
of streamlined devices have the ability to change between In one embodiment , that act of identifying includes access 
traditional configurations and other configurations . The to remote storage associated with the device and / or the user . 
change between configurations may change the I / O profile Remote storage is accessed to retrieve any global profiles 
of the device and hence impact the user ' s interaction with 30 that may exist for the user , and more specifically , any 
the device itself and any content displayed on the device . In changes that may have been made to the user ' s global 
one embodiment , the user interface is responsive to changes profile . In some embodiments , a local copy of any profile is 
in configuration . In another embodiment , the user interface stored on the device , and the remotely stored profile is used 
is responsive to changes in I / O profile . to identify any changes . Changes to profiles may be copied 
According to another aspect , the streamlining of the 35 to the remote location or changes in the profile may be 

user ' s multi - media experience incorporates the device the retrieved from the remote location . In one example , the local 
user uses to interact with multi - media sources , whether the and remote profiles are associated with a revision date . The 
sources are on - line or provided by the device itself . Stream - most recently revised profile may be used as the most up to 
lining of the device includes developing consistent user date profile , with a different version receiving modification 
interfaces for the user to access all features presented . The 40 as necessary to correspond . 
device ' s graphical user interface layer is customized to the In one alternative , a remote profile may be maintained for 
I / O interfaces provided . In one example a device is provided the device itself . In another , the device profile may contain 
in the form of a portable computer configurable between a information on a number of users . In some embodiments , 
laptop mode ( in which the portable computer has a conven remote access is used to retrieve configurations and / or 
tional laptop appearance ) and an easel mode in which the 45 settings maintained for any of the device , the user , and 
base of the computer and its display component stand groups of users , alone or in combination . According to one 
upright forming an inverted “ V , " a closed mode , a laptop aspect , remote storage and / or remote access to user configu 
mode , an easel mode , a flat mode and a frame mode r ation comprises one element of an example system for 
According to one embodiment , each of the display modes streamlining user interaction with electronic content . 
may employ different I / O profiles . 50 Once a user is identified ( identification may occur by 

Some of the aspects may be better understood through the default if only one user has accessed a particular device ) the 
use of examples demonstrating the interactions between a graphical user interface presents a default view of the 
system , the system user , the interfaces provided , and the electronic content available on the device . In one embodi 
accessed content . The user experience is improved through ment , the view presented is responsive to the configuration 
simplification of the interactions with the user device — 55 of the device . According to some embodiments , device 
depending on the device ' s configuration the only activity configurations may be determined using a sensor embedded 
required by the user may be to use a scroll wheel to identify in the device . In one example , a sensor is used to provide a 
selection and a button to execute the selection . Moreover , signal and from the signal the device ' s orientation is deter 
the user experience is enhanced by permitting the user to mined . Alternative methodologies are employed in other 
select the I / O profile s / he is most comfortable with and even 60 embodiments for detecting and determining a device ' s con 
select multiple I / O profiles or device configurations depend - figuration . In one alternative example , I / O devices may be 
ing upon the context presented to the user . It is to be enabled / disabled based on the physical configuration of the 
appreciated that adaptations to the user interface layer that device . For example , during a transition from laptop mode 
maintain consistency while permitting different I / O profiles to easel mode , various I / O devices that become inaccessible 
should be viewed as part of the invention . 65 may be deactivated . Determining what I / O devices are still 

The examples of user interactions are provided for the active and / or available permits identification of the device ' s 
purposes of illustration and should not be viewed as limiting configuration . In other embodiments , an accelerometer may 
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be used to detect a device configuration . In one example , a visual representations , and the page is configured to include 
device may be a portable laptop computer . The portable portions of views of other visual representations available on 
laptop computer may have multiple configurations , includ - adjacent pages . A computer operation that would cause the 
ing a laptop mode , an easel mode , a frame mode , a flat mode computer device to exceed the maximal number results in 
and a closed mode . 5 the creation of a new display page . The home view is 

In the illustrated example , FIG . 1 , the user device is organized into as many pages are required in order to 
configured in a laptop mode , and has an I / O profile ( a set of maintain the maximal threshold of display items . 
I / O devices ) that one would normally associate with a laptop Typically , the home view is configurable by the user . New 
computer . In this example , the I / O profile includes , in some items may be added , existing items may be moved and / or 
embodiments , a keyboard , a touch pad , buttons , web cam , 10 removed based on user selection . The home view further 
and a scroll wheel . The graphical user interface is configured comprises some visual representations that can not be 
to present a default view that provides the user with con removed . Commonly requested system operations have 
textual options . In this example the present context for the visual representation displayed on the home view that can 
user includes “ lean forward ” viewing and the computer not be deleted . According to one embodiment , a user may 
operations one would typically associate with user of a 15 reorganize the display but not remove system operations . 
laptop . Other contexts arise based on configuration of the For example , visual representations that map to system 
device ( for example in Easel mode ) and the computer tasks operations ( e . g . communication configuration and hardware 
the user wishes to perform . For an indentified context a configuration ) cannot be remove from the home view . Addi 
default is provided for the user eliminating the requirement tionally , some system operations will always be displayed 
of making configuration choices , however , the user is still 20 through the home view regardless of frequency of use . 
permitted to accesses the configuration directly to customize Positioning of visual representation is also organized and 
it . managed in the home view . Preferably , organization and / or 
Shown in FIG . 2 , is an example of a page of the device ' s management occurs automatically based on default settings 

home view ( 200 ) . The home view organizes user interface selected for the user . Alternatively , organization and / or man 
elements into a mapped based presentation and separates the 25 agement may occur dynamically . For example , a user may 
presentation into logical units based on a single displayed make changes to organization and / or management settings 
screen , i . e . a page . One function provided by the home view on the fly . In another embodiment , default settings control 
is to serve as an organization of interface elements and / or organization and / or management , and an interface is pro 
navigation tools that maps visual representations of avail - vided to permits a user to makes any changes to the default 
able content into a plurality of views of the available 30 settings . And in another embodiment , a user may be queried 
content . The home view is also configured to present sum - on preferences , the responses are used to establish defaults 
marized views of information to the user , so as to reduce the for operation . 
volume of information that a user needs to process in order In some embodiments , frequency of use of the visual 
to access content . In some embodiments , the mapped based representations is used to sort the presentation of visual 
interface is also configured to group like computer opera - 35 representations on the home view . More frequently accessed 
tions into a section of the map . Typically , grouped selectable visual representations are displayed at a higher position on 
computer content includes mappings to other groupings of a page and less frequently accessed representations are 
lower level functionality . For example , high level navigation displayed at a lower position on the page , and may cause the 
options are , typically , first presented to the user . The high computer device to display the visual representation on 
level navigation options provide a summarized view of the 40 another page . 
available content , making content based selections easy to In a typically configuration , visual representations are 
appreciate and accomplish . A user selects a high level organized based upon creation time , although certain visual 
navigation operation to navigate to more detailed operations . representations take precedence in the display . According to 
In some embodiments , the more detailed operations are one aspect , display precedence is established from left to 
grouped based on a mode of content . Modes of content may 45 right and from top to bottom . In one embodiment , the visual 
include for example , media , channel , connection , applica - representation displayed in the upper left portion of the 
tion , and web , among other options . display screen is associated with the highest precedence . 

According to one embodiment , high level functions and Precedence in the display may be influenced and even 
low level functions are to segregated based on proximity to ignored with respect to certain system operations and the 
displays of sources of digital content . For example , a visual 50 visual representations that map to them . For example , a 
representation that maps to the source of digital content is visual representation mapping to display for a user ' s book 
included in a lower level of functionality than the view that marks may appear in the upper left corner . According to one 
organizes the presentation of the visual representation . A embodiment , the positioning of the familiar option relating 
view that presents the digital content source itself , is to bookmarks as the visual representation of the highest 
grouped at a lower level than the visual representation that 55 precedence provides users with an option familiar to tradi 
maps to the digital content source . In another embodiment , tional use of computer systems . Although presented as a 
interfaces that provide navigation operations to digital con - streamlined interface element , the bookmark visual repre 
tent form a layer of the graphical user interface , and inter - sentation is configured to evoke familiarity in the typical 
faces that provide interaction options to digital content form computer user . 
a lower layer . In one embodiment , the home view includes 60 According to another embodiment , the visual representa 
maximal display thresholds configured to improve the abil - tion that maps to the computer functionality for creating 
ity of the user to absorb the information presented . In some interacting with a new web page is the only representation 
embodiments , a maximal number of visual representations that has a fixed position , relative to the display precedence . 
per screen is set . In one example , the maximal number of In one example , the element for triggering interaction with 
visual representations is used to define a GUI page . In 65 a new web page is always display in the bottom right corner . 
another example , the maximal number of visual represen - The other visual representation may be reshuffled based on 
tations is associated with a maximal number of full view frequency of use , and in other embodiments a user may also 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 332 of 521 PageID #: 438



US 9 , 880 , 715 B2 
29 30 

reshuffle the visual representation by drag and drop proce selection of ( 306 ) the user sees an animation returning the 
dures , however the element for triggering interaction with a user to the home view ( 200 ) . The visual representation for 
new web page remains in the bottom right corner , and in one “ Browse the web ” ( 214 ) reveals the creation of a new visual 
example , will move to a new page in response to a request representation for accessing web content ( 216 ) by sliding 
to display an new web page element when the element is 5 away from a new visual representation the takes the former 
already displayed in the bottom right corner of a page . place of ( 214 ) . The computer system displays an animation 
Drag and drop operations may be associated with a drag that shows the computer display zooming into the page view 
threshold . In one example , a drag threshold is applied to ( 300 ) of element ( 214 ) , shown in FIG . 3B . The user logs in 
require a small movement of the identified card before the and reviews his / her balance , shown in FIG . 3C at ( 350 ) . The 
device executes the drag operation . The drag threshold may 10 web page view further comprises navigation element ( 352 ) . 
be measure on the order of pixels , and may be any number The user selects ( 352 ) to return the home view ( 200 ) , selects 
of pixels that prevent accidental dragging in response to the ( 216 ) to access a new web page and in response a new web 
user attempting to click on a card . In one embodiment , the content visual representation is created , further the device 
drag threshold is set to 5 pixels . Other thresholds may be shows the display zooming into the new content . 
used , 2 , 3 , 4 , 6 , . . . pixels as examples . 15 FIG . 5 displays a quick access view ( 500 ) . As the new 

Other display precedence may be employed . For example , card has not yet been mapped to content , the device displays 
display precedence may be configured based on user loca content options in order to generate a mapping . In one 
tion and language convention for the user location . The en example , the content options may be based on frequency of 
English language is read from left to right and from top to access . Shown at ( 502 ) are visual representations generated 
bottom ; however , other languages are not . According to 20 from the most frequently visited content . Selecting any of 
some embodiments , display precedence and any correspond the visual representations in the body ( 502 ) causes the 
ing animations are configured to correspond with the con device to associate the mapping with the new card and zoom 
ventions of the local language , for example displaying from into the selected content display . At ( 504 ) provided as an 
right to left . element of the view ' s header ( 506 ) is a bookmarks control . 

Referring again to FIG . 2 , shown is an example of a page 25 Through ( 504 ) bookmarks control a user may access content 
of the home view , with user interface elements organized to not display in the frequency list ( although a user may also 
present the user with summary information of available enter a uniform resource identifier at ( 508 ) . 
content . Shown in FIG . 2 , at 202 , is a representation of In response to the selection of bookmarks a list of 
picture and video content available to the user . At 204 , a bookmarked content is displayed for selection , FIG . 6 , 600 . 
visual representation of customized content is available . The 30 Upon selecting ( 602 ) a mapping to the bookmarked content 
customized content ( discussed further herein ) comprises rss is associated with the new visual representation . In one 
items from a web location distributing via an rss feed . In alternative , a user may enter a uri for a online source to 
example shown , 204 , comprises a channel card . The channel associated with a new visual representation . The computer 
card is configured to allow easy interaction with a plurality zooms into the selected content and in this example , displays 
of rss items , and further configured to be responsive to both 35 the web page view for ( 602 ) . Bank of America ' s ( BOA ) web 
lean forward interactions and lean backward modes of site , shown in FIG . 7A at ( 700 ) . The user logs in at ( 702 ) and 
interaction . The other user interface elements include , for is able to pay the Chase bill just reviewed , shown at FIG . 7B , 
example , visual representations of web based content , spe - ( 700 ) . Having visual representations mapped to content 
cialized user interface elements for providing customized available , improves the user ' s ability to transition between 
interaction with web based content in the form of channels , 40 content views . By selecting the navigation element ( 752 ) the 
and system elements . user is returned to the home view , FIG . 8 , ( 800 ) , showing the 

A typical activity for any user includes reading his / her visual representation ( 802 ) mapped to Chase ' s web page 
email . The user may observe an e - mail from for example , the content and the newly created visual representation ( 804 ) 
user ' s credit card company , Chase . The home view ( 200 ) is mapped to Bank of America ' s web site content . Selecting 
the default vehicle through which a user interacts with the 45 ( 802 ) returns the user to the Chase content with the user ' s 
device and with electronic content displayed on the device . state preserved from the last visit , FIG . 3C , ( 350 ) . The user 
The home view presents an organization of other interactive is able to immediately review the statement balance , and by 
elements ( 202 - 216 ) . Accessing e - mail occurs in response to selecting navigation element ( 352 ) return to the home view 
selecting the visual representation ( 208 ) that maps to ( 800 ) select ( 804 ) and enter the amount due for the Chase 
YAHOO ! MAIL content . Upon selecting ( 208 ) the device 50 credit card at ( 754 ) . 
executes a mapping from the visual representation to the It is to be appreciated that visual representations mapped 
content and in response the device presents a first view of the to computer content facilitate transitions between content , 
mapped content . According to one embodiment , in response and further by providing state preserving representations a 
to selection of a visual representation mapping to content of user is able to quickly retrieve and employ information 
web page a web page view is displayed . The web page view 55 learned from content . 
is a zoomed in expression of the web based content mapped According to another aspect , the selection of a new visual 
by the visual representation . representation is configured to employ a timer . According to 

Once a user reaches the web page view ( 300 ) FIG . 3A , the some embodiments , the timer is configurable based on user 
user may interact with the content shown . Although it is to selection , so that the animation may take longer , shorter , and 
be appreciated that other representations may mapped to 60 in some embodiments the user is permitted to disable the 
different views , and different view may be used to map to animation entirely — in one example this is accomplished by 
further views . ( 302 ) shows an e - mail being reviewed by the setting the timer to allow 0 seconds for the animation , in 
user , and more specifically an e - mail from Chase Bank another example the animation is simply disabled . In some 
indicating that the user ' s credit card statement has issued . embodiments , the timer is configurable by the system . Over 
The body of the e - mail ( 304 ) includes a link ( 306 ) for 65 the course of use , the allotted time may be reduced by the 
accessing Chase ' s website . Selecting the link invokes an system automatically . Once a user has reached a certain time 
open new page view operation by default , and in response to on the streamlined device , the animation may be automati 
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cally disabled by the system . For some embodiments where be any of the former discussed cards shared from another 
the timer may be configured based on time of use , different user and / or streamlined device . The card layer 920 maps 
timers may be employed for different user profiles . Thus an either to computer functionality executed upon selection or 
experienced user may no longer see the animation , whereas additional views to provide interactive displays to the 
a novice user on the same device would see an extended 5 device ' user , for example , the views illustrated in layer 930 . 
version of the animation . Page view 932 , according to one example , is a zoomed in 
Graphical User Interface expression of a web page . At 940 shown is another layer 

Referring again to FIG . 11 , there is illustrated a block which includes a screen saver view , 942 . In one embodi 
diagram of one example of an architecture of the portable ment , the screen saver view is a passive view . In one 
computer including a map user interface . The user interface 10 example , the screen saver view may be activated by the 
“ home ” screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of computer system remaining idle for a period of time . In one 
content 172 . In the illustrated example , the home screen 170 embodiment , the screen saver view displays content from 
contains five modes of content 172 ; however , it is to be channel cards designated by a user in an options menu . In 
appreciated that the home screen may include more or fewer another embodiment , the screen saver view displays content 
than five modes of content and that the modes of content 15 from a pictures and video card . In another embodiment , the 
may differ from the examples discussed . It should also be screen saver view displays content from a shared card . 
appreciated that different architectures may be invoked in According to one embodiment , channel card view 914 
response to different device modes . For example , a portable comprises a view of the channel cards that are available to 
computer in laptop mode may display a home view as a user , and in another embodiment includes a channel 
discussed with respect to FIG . 11 , when configured in Easel 20 selector ( not shown ) . The channel selector is a selectable 
mode , user is presented with a Channel View . Shown with display configured to be responsive to manipulation of a 
respect to FIG . 23 is an example of a portable computer set scroll wheel . In one example , the channel selector is con 
in Easel mode , displaying a channel view . The Channel view figured to display a rolodex of available channel cards and 
may also display a plurality of modes of content . In FIG . 23 manipulation of a scroll wheel flips through the visual 
shown are visual representations of content ( 2304 - 2308 ) 25 rolodex . Selection of one of the channel cards invokes any 
with associated mappings . of a channel page view 934 , content menu , and a channel 

According to another aspect , streamlining the presenta card full view , depending upon the device ' s configuration , 
tion and integration of features and services includes sim and in some examples the result is responsive to where on 
plifying the I / O devices that a user needs to operate in order the card a selection was made . Various cards , depending on 
to access features of the computer system and the features of 30 the content mapped to , may also provide other views for 
any available service . According to another aspect , stream - rendering and providing for user interaction with content , 
lining includes developing consistent visual representations for example , time , 939 , album , 936 , and lens , 938 views . It 
of available content ( whether on the computer system itself is to be appreciated that the conceptual model illustrated in 
or from service providers ) . In another aspect , the organiza - FIG . 9 is only one example of a conceptual model of the 
tion of interactive elements and responsiveness of the orga - 35 graphical user interface for streamlining user interaction 
nization to navigation options , device configurations , and with electronic content . Other conceptual models may be 
user preferences improves the user ' s ability to interact with employed , for example only some of the layers may be 
the computer system and its content . In one embodiment , employed , additional layers may be used , and different 
system features and web features are consistently presented segmentations of the layers may be to provided . 
as cards for the user to interact with to achieve their 40 According to one embodiment , a method of presenting a 
computer objectives . In some embodiments , cards comprise streamlined graphical user interface for a streamlined device 
part of an interface layer between a computer user and a includes an example process 5000 , FIG . 50 . Process 5000 
user ' s computer based objective and / or computer operation provides for organizing a plurality of views and GUI ele 
In some embodiments , the number and type of cards are ments into a consistent presentation for user interaction . At 
presented in as few as three classes and / or types . Each card 45 5002 provided is a first visual representation for displaying 
for example may be similar in aspect to the other , but each multiple content modes mapped to a view of computer 
performing a different class of function on the computer c ontent . At 5004 , a plurality of visual representations are 
system . organized by type of computer operation . At 5006 , the 

Referring to FIG . 9 , shown is a conceptual model 900 of graphical user interface presents higher level operations to 
an example graphical user interface . As shown , in FIG . 9 , 50 users as a view including a group of visual representations . 
through a streamlined device 901 a user will interact will a AT 5008 , a user is permitted to select from the group of 
number of views of computer based content . In example visual representations to navigate to lower level functions 
model 900 , depending on the device ' s configuration a user provided by different views of computer content . At optional 
will be presented a home view 912 or a channel card view step 5010 , a user may be permitted to select from within 
914 . Conceptually 910 forms a layer of the mapped based 55 different groups of visual representations to navigate to 
user interface , wherein the layer is configured to organize , further lower level views of computer content . 
manage and display streamlined views to the device ' s user . According to another aspect , layers of the conceptual 
Layer 910 organizes , manages and displays objects of layer model are configured to respond to device configurations by 
920 . Layer 920 , according to some embodiments includes defaulting and / or transitioning to different views based on 
cards 921 which are selectable visual representations that are 60 device configuration . Typically a device configured in a 
mapped either to computer functions or available computer laptop mode displays a home view , 912 , to a user as the 
content . Cards further comprise web cards 922 , that map to default view . In response to a transition in mode between 
views of web content including web pages , channel cards laptop and easel the computer transitions the computer 
924 that map to customized views of content including web display from the home view , 912 , to the channel view , 914 , 
based content and picture and video content ; nascent cards 65 as the default . A user may elect to change the default view , 
926 that map to system functionality ; system cards 928 that for example by selecting a navigation button that executes a 
map to system functionality ; and shared cards 929 that can return to the home view . In one example , 168 , FIG . 17 , is 
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configured to return a user to a home view in response to system operations , for example bookmark card 212 . The 
selection of 168 , when the computer display is not on the bookmark card 212 is configured to provide traditional 
home view . In the home view , a user may invoke a channel computer operations associated with conventional systems 
card view , 914 , by manipulating scroll wheel , 132 . and browsing methods . The bookmark card serves as learn 
Home View Embodiments 5 ing tool , to provide features with which user are familiar in Referring again to FIG . 2 , shown is an example page of a new format that encourages further integration of card 
a home view , 200 . Home views according to various based interactions . According to one aspect , card interfaces 
embodiments are configured to render consistent organiza are generated by a user for each web based interaction , tion of elements of the graphical user interface . Each page eliminating the need for convention navigation in the form rendered in home view comprises a home navigation tool 10 of bookmarks . Another example of a system card appears at 250 , a header 252 , and a web search box 254 . For home 214 . 214 maps to functionality that when selected causes the views which include multiple pages , a hint or cut out of computer system to execute a web card generation process . adjacent displays are rendered at 256 , for example . Hint or FIG . 10 illustrates an example generation process , 1000 . cut outs of adjacent displays may also occur at the bottom of 
the display screen , the top of the display screen , and both top 15 Example processes , 1000 , begins at 1002 , in response to 
and bottom , where multiple adjacent pages are present . 250 , selection of a card or embedded web link ( e . g . 214 of FIG . 
home navigation tool is responsive to the context in which 2 ) that is associated with a mapping to functionality that 
it is executed . For example , the home navigation tool , 250 , generates a new web card . For example process 1000 , may 
when selected causes the computer to display the last be initiated from a page view of a web card in response to 
accessed view before the computer displayed the home view . 20 selection of link . According to one embodiment , the behav 
Where a user navigates to the home view , 200 , from a web ior of the streamlined device depends on instruction embed 
page view , the selection of the home navigation tool 250 ded within a selected link . In particular , the device in 
caused the computer to display the previous web page view . response to selection of a navigation link navigates to the 
In other examples , the home navigation tool permits , tog - identified location in the same page view . If the link encodes 
gling between other views and the home view , as illustrated 25 an instruction for open in new window and / or open in new 
in FIG . 9 , at 932 - 939 and / or 914 . tab , the device in response to selection generates a new card 

According to some embodiments , the web page view and displays the page view of the new card . Alternatively , 
includes a navigation tool , 350 , FIG . 3C , and in response to defaults may be established for link handling , including a 
selection , causes the computer to display the home view , default for selection of a link contained inside an e - mail , 
200 . Other elements included in the home view , for example , 30 which may default to a “ new card ” mapping , whereas in 
header 252 are configured to provide consistency in the some embodiments , links directed to the same domain as the 
home view across pages and in some embodiments across current view default to navigation functionality within the 
the user interface . Each page of the home view , 200 , further same window . In other words , in response to a selection of 
comprises a body , 258 , in which cards 202 - 216 are dis - a link within a certain web - page , directing navigation to 
played . The body is associated with a maximal display 35 another location with in the same web page , the default 
threshold . The maximal display threshold governs the num - functionality executed , caused the device to navigate to the 
ber of GUI elements displayed per home view page . In one selected location within the same window . 
embodiment , the displayed elements may comprise cards , According to another embodiment , handling of web links 
and the maximal display threshold is set to display twelve may also be governed entirely by the settings contained in 
cards . In addition to the maximal number of displayed 40 the selected link . For example , the device may execute 
elements , the home view may also comprise indicators of process 1000 in response to execution of a link including the 
adjacent content at 256 . The device generates a new page instruction to open in new window . The device may also 
display for the home view , 2000 , in response to exceeding execute process 1000 in response to execution of a link 
the maximal display threshold . including an instruction to open in a new tab . In one 
Home view 200 is the default view in laptop mode , and 45 embodiment , links without such references are processed by 

may be implemented as the default view in other device the web page view navigating to the linked location without 
modes ( e . g . frame , easel , flat modes ) . According to some invoking process 1000 , for example . 
embodiments , the home view is the primary mechanism for At 1002 , the mapping is executed and the computer 
permitting users to access cards and navigation through device determines its state at 1004 . The state determination 
content viewed on the device . In the home view a user can 50 is configured to identify a current view setting for the device . 
access open web sessions , view and manage their channels , Current view setting may be limited to an indication that the 
initiate new web sessions , and launch other activities . device is current showing the home view . At 1006Yes , the 

Cards , e . g . 202 - 216 , form comprises a plurality of types . device is currently showing the home view , and the device 
Some card types are organized by function , some by content . executes a card generation animation , at 1008 . In one 
The home view is comprised of various cards , each card 55 example , the animation causes the device to display a 
providing access to computer based content . According to browse the web card 214 , FIG . 2 , sliding away from a new 
one aspect , cards can be thought of as the building blocks of visual representation the takes the former place of 214 . One 
the user interface , providing access to a plurality of views the new card image is shown the computer display renders 
and / or content . Indeed , cards as elements of the GUI , are an animation the causes the user to perceive zooming into 
configured to be shared across users and across other stream - 60 the newly created card at 1010 . Alternatively , it is deter 
lined devices . The ability to employ the features and func - mined that the device ' s current display is not the home view 
tions of card based elements may be limited to streamlined at 1006NO . At 1012 , apparent motion relative to the user is 
devices , although cards to and settings may be shared with rendered by the device to provide the appearing of zooming 
traditional devices . to the home display . Other animations may be employed to 
Shown in home view 200 , are web cards 206 , 208 , and 65 establish for the user the perception of motion to the home 

216 , channel cards 204 , and 210 , further shown in home view . Once at the home view , process 1000 , proceeds as 
view 200 are special system cards that map to content and before . 
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According to one embodiment , the home view , FIG . 2 . pointer display over the visual object and depressing a 
200 , is configured to manage and organize cards . The home button to initiate the operation . 
view provides a simple and convenient mode of navigating Focus may be resolved on a computer system by analyz 
through the features and content accessible through the ing content intended to be displayed before its display on the 
device by organizing and managing cards . 5 computer system , additionally focus may be responsive to 

Card Examples actions taken on the display through for example pointing 
According to some embodiments of systems and methods devices . 

for streamlining user interaction with electronic content , According to one embodiment , when a web card or 
visual representation that render computer operation and / or channel card appears is in a hover state 1404 , additional 
content in a consistent manner further comprise cards . 10 options are display in the card header , for example at 1450 . 
According to one embodiment , cards may further comprise The additional tools displayed in the card header permit a 
types , including web cards , which map to active web pages . user to select the options associated with the card . The 
In some embodiments , device configuration sensitive dis - options view for a card 1406 , displays available selections 
plays are provided through a graphical user interface . In contained in the options . For a web card 1410 , the options 
some embodiments the device configuration sensitive dis - 15 include make a channel 1452 . The selection of make a 
plays include cards . Cards may come in a number of forms . channel at 1452 causes the device to execute functionality 
In some embodiments cards may be classified according to that transforms the web card into a channel card . The 
the functionality that they provide to a particular user . For transformation from web card to channel card includes 
example , system cards provide and display computer system transforming the display image of the card element on any 
functionality that maybe frequently accessed during ordi - 20 corresponding view . 
nary computer user and / or may be required for computer Typically the transformation may only be made for a web 
use . In some embodiments , web cards provide a user inter - card that references a content including a rss feed . The items 
face for web based content and / or web based activity . In in the rss feed are configured into a customized presenta 
some embodiments , channel cards provide additional fea - tion — as for example a channel card 1412 ( discussed further 
tures that enable a user to better interact with web based 25 herein ) . For a channel card 1412 , additional options are 
content , and in another example , channel cards provide include show in screens aver , for example . Other states may 
interactive views by utilizing different content presentations impact the display of web card including a drag and drop 
provided by a web source . Consistent user interfaces provide state . Upon focus , the additional tools will resolve in the 
an access layer to system and web based content . Consistent header section of the card , the additional tools may be 
user interfaces are used to access web based content , and 30 displayed as icons , as shown in FIG . 14 , and may also be 
even content and applications provided by third parties . rendered as selectable text options include “ bookmark , " 

In one example , a web card presents a thumbnail view of " share , " " options , " and " close . ” If a user depresses the 
the current state of the web page . In another example , the button control and does not release , the user may user drag 
web page card presents a cut out view of the web page based and drop the card within the home view . The card may be 
on computer focus within the page at the time the web page 35 dragged across pages of the home view , and the user may 
view was exited . FIG . 14 illustrates , according to one reorder the presentation of cards in the home view using 
embodiment , the behavior and rendered display of certain multiple drag and drop operations . According to one 
cards responsive to computer focus and selection by a user . embodiment , as a card is dragged across the home view , all 
A card may be in a number of states based on computer displaced cards will appear to move into new places . 
focus . One example of computer focus would include 40 According to another aspect , computer content and inter 
" hover " 1404 — hover indicates the movement of a pointer , active functionality is recast into cards . In one embodiment , 
typically represented by a white arrow on the computer the card comprises a visual representation of web content 
system display , over a card . A card may be in a normal state that simplify the user ' s interaction with even the most 
1402 when not in focus . sophistication on - line tools . Cards are configured to present 

Focus is intended to include any identification by the 45 a summarized view of available content and / or present a 
computer system of the card , short of execution of the visual indication of available functions . According to one 
mapping associated with it . For example , focus should embodiment , cards form a part of the structure of the 
include identification by tabbing through available cards , graphical user interface between the system and the user . In 
identification by using hotkeys , among other options that various embodiments , cards are configured to be context 
result in computer focus resolving on the card . The terms 50 and / or content sensitive . Some cards are configured to be 
computer focus and focus should be read to include hovering persistent . Persistent card may be removed by an affirmative 
over a screen element , tool , or other visual representation act of the user 
displayed on a computer system display . In one example , With cards , content can be easily and visually absorbed by 
focus follows a displayed pointer , and movement of the a user . In some embodiments , cards serve to maintain a 
pointer with , for example , a mouse causes the computer 55 current state of the user ' s activity . And in some embodi 
system to resolve computer focus on the visual object under m ents , cards also serve to focus the displayed content on 
the pointer display . Selection by a user or a computer system contextual information . Cards may be configurable by the 
may include focus and visual objects displayed on a com - users . Configurations options are presented to the user 
puter system display may be selected by moving a displayed consistently . In some examples , this includes displaying 
pointer . In some embodiments , selection may be accom - 60 consistent animations designed to draw the user ' s focus to 
plished by clicking on a visual object using a pointer the particular activity and to provide comfort level for the 
displayed on the computer screen . A second “ click ” may activity being displayed . 
then cause the computer system to execute functionality Shown in FIG . 43 is an example process 4300 for stream 
associated with the visual object . Execution should be read lining user interactions with computer content . The process 
to include initiating an operation associated with a visual 65 includes presenting a consistent look and feel for user access 
object , in one example execution will include clicking on a to computer operations and computer content for user inter 
visual object ( single or multiple " clicks ” ) , by positioning a face elements that also provide for a reduction in decision 
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making requirements imposed on a user during conventional and a body display , and the content is displayed in the body 
computer use . At 4302 , a user is presented with a first visual portion . The header portion provides additional information 
representation in a computer display , the visual representa - on the content , for example a title , and may further provide 
tion is responsive to computer focus and at 4304 , and the additional tools that are responsive to focus . Again provid 
user is permitted to resolve computer focus by selecting the 5 ing tools that resolve when needed and disappear when not 
visual representation . Selection and focus can be thought of reduces the amount of information a computer user need to 
in terms of a visual pointer display on the computer system assimilate in order to use a computer system . 
display , by moving the pointer over an object displayed on All computer content and operations can be configured to 
the computer display , computer focus may be resolved on display in visual representations and respective focus visual 
the visual object . Alternatively , a user may have to indicate 10 representations , providing a user with a streamlined presen 
a selection of the object by clicking on a mouse button for tation of computer content and operations . According to 
example . another example , different content types are presented 

According to one embodiment clicking is not required . In through visual representation of a similar format . In one 
another embodiment , the pointer being displayed above a embodiment , the visual representations comprise cards as 
visual object activates a " hover " state . In response to hov - 15 discussed herein . 
ering , computer focus is resolved on the visual object . At A process 4400 may be invoked by streamlined computer 
4306 , a focus visual representation is displayed to the user . system as part of process 4300 . Additionally , process 4400 
According to one embodiment , the visual representation and may operate independently or be called from other pro 
the focus representation are configured to have common cesses . Shown in FIG . 44 is a process 4400 , for permitting 
elements , and in particular , a header and body display for 20 a user to interact with computer content . At 4402 , a com 
rendering computer content associated with the visual rep - puter system displays a first content view . The first content 
resentations . The focus visual representation including a view is configured to display in a similar format as a visual 
header and body display summarizing at least one of com - representation selected by the user to navigate to the content 
puter content and computer operations are shown at 4308 view . In one embodiment , the first content view includes a 
The visual representations present a multitude of computer 25 header and body display . In another embodiment the content 
content in a streamlined form , in other words , the visual view is a zoomed in view of the visual representation used 
representation forms an indirection layer of functionality to navigate to the content view . At 4404 , an enlarged view 
that provides a window into digital content , and / or computer of the first visual representation is displayed . In one 
operations linked to the visual representation . In particular , example , the content view comprises a web browser view of 
a visual representation mapped to a web page for example , 30 a web page displayed in the body of the content view . The 
provides a view of the web page in the body of the visual visual representation used to navigate to the content view 
representation and provides additional information about the displays a portion of the web browser in the body of the 
web page in the header display . The header display may also visual representation . At 4406 , a user is permitted to interact 
include tools for providing easy access to computer func with the content displayed in the body of the content view . 
tionality associated with the web page and / or its content . In 35 The user is further permitting to access options associated 
one example the header display only display the tools in the with the content through the header display . Optionally , 
focus visual representation so the initial view of the content further computer logic may be included in process 4400 for 
is not cluttered with tools that are not needed . Further , in one presenting focus and unfocused views of the header in the 
embodiment , the tools only display in response to focus , in content view . 
other words , only when a user indicates they are necessary 40 According to another aspect , cards types should be clearly 
by moving a display pointer over the visual representation . defined by color scheme and appearance , while at the same 
Further computer logic may be embodied in process 4300 , time maintaining a similar format . For example the similar 
responsive to a display position of a pointer displayed on the format should include header placement and sizing , display 
computer screen . In response to the display position of the of tools , title and frame size . In one embodiment , a color 
pointer occupying the same location as another visual 45 scheme configured to differentiate card types provides for 
object , computer focus is resolved on that object , causing the web cards with white headers with the content displayed on 
computer system to determine functionality associated with the web card showing as a thumbnail of the current state of 
the object . the page . Channel cards are configured with black headers , 

In one example , the object is a visual representation , and and the content presented in the channel card comprises a 
in response to moving the pointer over the visual represen - 50 simplified representation of web content based on RSS feeds 
tation , the computer is caused to display a focus visual or custom visualizations of some non - RSS websites . Cus 
representation associated with the visual representation . In tomized visualizations may be pre - loaded on the device for 
one example , computer focus remains with the focus rep - specific websites , or may be provided as part of a remotely 
resentation and functionality associated with the focus rep - stored device profile and / or global profile . Updates to the 
resentation is made available for execution . Other operations 55 device profile and / or a global profile would include devel 
including display of a header responsive to focus may be opment of customized visualizations of non - RSS websites , 
executed . At 4310 , a mapping associated with at least one of and access to remote storage trigger delivery of the custom 
the focus visual representation and the visual representation ized visualizations . According to one embodiment , only 
is executed causing the computer system to navigate to a sites for which RSS or custom visualizations are available 
content view . The content view may include a display of 60 can be displayed as channel cards . 
computer operations . In one alternative , the content view System cards are shown either with blue headers or grey 
provides an interactive view of computer content . In one headers . System cards may be further classified to include 
example the computer content , comprises online content nascent cards . “ Browse the Web ” card , FIG . 2 , 214 is an 
viewed through a web browser . In another example , the example of a nascent card . The nascent card may be con 
content view is presented in a similar format as the visual 65 figured so it position is not configurable , nor is a user able 
representation used to navigate to the content . In one par - to remove the card from the home view , or any view . The 
ticular example , the content view includes a header display nascent card maps to functionality necessary to operation of 
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the streamlined device , and thus no option to close and / or are used to present web content , and channel cards that are 
remove it is available . Other system cards are configured to used to provide to a user easy and / or consistent access to 
represent activities that have been specifically designed such additional features . 
as for example , photos & video card ( s ) . The other system According to another aspect , features of cards may 
cards map to functionality also regarded as necessary so that 5 include consistent navigation tools , consistent content dis 
the other system cards can not be deleted , however , the other play — including limiting the ability to alter content of a card 
system cards can be reorganized in for example the home through user interaction with the card , state representative 
view . Functionality mapped to by the other system cards images of content , state and context representative images of 
include communications card , for configuring wireless content , customized visualization of content , and in some 
access of the device , bookmarks for presenting conventional 10 examples customized visualizations include information 
styled web page bookmarks , camera for providing for con - derived from rss content . In one embodiment , user interac 
figuration and operation of a camera , either embedded in the tions with cards are also streamlined . In another embodi 
device upon construction , or incorporated through for ment , when card configurations and / or card options are 
example a USB port . selected by a user ( if available ) a consistent animation is 

In one embodiment , a system card is mapped to function - 15 presented to the user . For example , selection of a card ' s 
ality to provide a user with streamlined access to web options may cause an animation displaying the flipping of 
bookmarks . In one example , a bookmark card is provided the card and the revelation of user selectable options . 
that is always accessible from the home view . As with other Options , for example , may include permitting the content 
system cards , the bookmark card comprises a header and a reflected in the card to be displayed as a screen saver . Certain 
body . According to one embodiment , the body display for 20 features may only be available for certain cards types . In one 
the bookmark card is unique to the bookmark card . Book - embodiment for example only channel cards ( discussed in 
marks are retrieved and displayed in the bookmark card one greater detail herein ) may be displayed in the screensaver 
at a time . In one example , the bookmark card indicates in the mode , thus only channel cards will display the option to 
body display the number of the bookmark in the list and the permit display in screensaver . In another embodiment , cer 
total number of bookmarks available . 25 tain card types may be converted through user selection . In 

According to some embodiments , the interactivity of one embodiment , web cards may be converted into channel 
individual cards is limited to navigation to a page view . For cards . It is realized that the segregation of functions between 
example , a user can not change the content of a card by the card types may improve user interaction and adoption of 
interacting only with the card . In other embodiments , chan - the different feature sets available to each . 
nel cards , for example , provide a user with the option of 30 According to another embodiment , systems and methods 
interacting directly with the card . Upon hover , channel cards for streamlining user interaction with electronic content may 
presenting news feeds may resolve navigation tools config - include a process for generating new visual representations 
ured to step through individual rss items displayed in the mapped to computer content . Shown in FIG . 47A is an 
channel card . Additionally , selection within a channel card example process 4700 , for generating a user interface ele 
presenting a news feed causes the device to execute different 35 ment . At 4702 , a visual representation associated with a 
mappings depending on what part of the channel card was computer operation for creating a new visual representation 
selected for execution . Clicking directly on an rss feed is displayed on a computer system display . The visual 
headline for example , caused the device to execute a map - representation may comprise a nascent card . Nascent cards 
ping to the web page view for that article . Selecting the body are configured to always be available to a user , that is , they 
of the channel card causes the device to execute a mapping 40 are configured so a user can not remove them . In some 
to the channel full view . Selection within the channel full embodiments , the position of the display of nascent cards 
view causes the device to display a content menu , responsive cannot be changed by the user . In one embodiment , the 
to manipulation of a scroll wheel . nascent card is always displayed in a home view , at the 

In an embodiment employing a three card presentation , bottom right corner of a home view page . For a new page 
the cards that are presented provide the user with the ability 45 this may include the nascent card appearing in the upper left 
to interact with system specific features . System features corner of the page , when no other cards are displayed on the 
may be invoked and display using consistent presentation same page . At 4704 , execution of the functionality associ 
and / or animation . Consistent presentation of like features ated with the visual representation occurs . At 4706 , a first 
may engender a comfort level in the user for new features animation is displayed to the computer system user showing 
that appear using the same and / or similar presentation . 50 the visual representation sliding away from its present 
Additionally , where a user invokes features in a similar or location to reveal a new visual representation . At 4708 , a 
consistent manner , access of new features is facilitated and second animation is displayed to a user showing the com 
user comfort level may be increased . For example , a nascent puter system zoom into the new visual representation to 
card , is a system card that provides for consistent imple - present a quick access view at 4710 . 
mentation of user activity and / or a computer objective 55 The quick access view is configured to permit a user to 
desired by the user . In one embodiment , the “ new card ” card select computer content to associate with the new visual 
is a visual representation of a system placeholder for gen - representation . In one example , this includes presenting a 
eration and presentation of new card that a user may created display of frequently accessed web content ( e . g . web pages ) 
during the course of ordinary activity . By selecting the new to the user in the quick access display . It is likely that the 
card ( for example , creating a web card used to interact with 60 user will intend to return to a page frequently accessed , in 
web content ) a consistent animation may be employed to which case , the display will meet the users needs , however , 
display to the user the creation of the new web card utilizing the quick access view is further configured to permit entry 
the nascent “ new card ” card . Other system features may be of a uniform resource indicator ( e . g . a url ) , and further 
presented through system cards . Typically , system cards will configured to allow a user to request display of bookmarked 
represent functionality used most frequently and / or func - 65 locations . At 4712 , a user is permitted to select computer 
tionality that should always be available and not subject to content to associate with the new visual representation , and 
removal by a user . Other card types , include web cards that in response to selection of the computer content , the com 

Tui 
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puter system displays an animation to the user depicting the displayed as channel cards . However , customized visualiza 
computer system zooming into a first view of the selected tions for some static sites are preloaded and for the pre 
content at 4714 . loaded static sites an rss feed is not used to display the web 

In one alternative , new visual representation may be site content in a channel card . System card body ( not shown ) 
generated without selecting a nascent card , in process 4750 , 5 comprises a custom image configured to represent the sys 
FIG . 47B . For example , a web card may include a hyperlink tem activity mapped to by the system card . 
directing a computer system to display the linked web page Options and Information Associated with Various Card 
in a new window . At 4752 , a user selects an open in new Embodiments 
window link . In one alternative , the link may include According to one embodiment , selection of the card 
instruction to open an new tab . In response to a request to 10 options icon causes the device to display a visualization of 
display a web page in a new window , a new visual repre - the card turning over . The “ back side ” of the card , FIG . 16 
sentation is generated and associated with a mapping to the ( showing a plurality of examples of the backs of various card 
web page . The computer system displays a transition from types ) comprises the following options : Show as channel 
the current web card view to the home view , 4754 , display 1602 , which transforms a web card into a channel card , and 
ing the nascent card . In an optional step , the process zooms 15 vice - versa , based either upon checking or unchecking box 
out the home view so that the nascent card is rendered on one 1604 . If the channel is a photo and video channel , this 
page . The system presents an animation to the user , 4756 , control reads “ Show as channel using [ lens ] . ” A lens is a 
similar to step 4706 , showing the nascent card sliding away customized visualization for computer content . Shown in 
from its position , revealing a new visual representation . The FIG . 16 is an example lens “ Slideshow ” at 1606 . 
system then zooms in on the new representation , 4758 , 20 According to another embodiment , the option for show as 
displaying a first view of the mapped content , 4760 . channel is either shown to as permanently checked for 
Common Card Configurations system cards that are always available as a channel ( e . g . the 
According to one aspect , cards should have common photos and video card ) , or as absent for system cards that are 

features to promote user acceptance and improve adoption not available as a channel ( e . g . a system settings card or 
of different cards , while providing familiar a form . Accord - 25 communications card ) . Show in screensaver , 1608 , is an 
ing to some embodiments , most cards are configured with a available option for channel cards . Typically 1608 is not an 
similar anatomy . According to some embodiments , cards available option for other card types , however , the photo and 
comprise certain common elements described with reference video system card does permit its content to be displayed in 
to illustrated examples . the screensaver . According to one example , new channel 

With reference to FIG . 15A shown is an example of a web 30 cards are configured to not display in screensaver mode by 
card when not in focus , however , the common features d efault and this option is not checked for new channel cards . 
among the cards are discussed in greater detail . Header 1502 Shared from , 1610 , provides information on the user or 
run along the top of the card . The color depends on the color device from which the card was shared . According to one 
scheme employed to differentiation the type of card : in one embodiment , system cards cannot be shared , and do not 
example white is used for web cards , black for channel 35 display " shared from ” information . Additionally , shared 
cards , and blue and grey for system cards . Optionally the from 1610 , does not display for card generated by a present 
header includes a favicon 1504 ( the favicon may be user . In one example , shared from 1610 is responsive to 
retrieved from the site being view in the case of web and computer focus ( e . g . hover ) . Hovering over the Shared From 
channel cards and a custom favicon is employed for system line , 1610 , causes the device to display an informational 
cards ) . The header further comprises a title 1506 for the site 40 bubble with a list of people to whom the card was shared . 
or activity conducted , and a body 1508 . In response to focus Other options may be employed for displaying shared from 
on a card the display of the card becomes a little larger information . Other options may include linking to a display 
relative to its display when out of focus and the card controls list for share from information , and in some embodiments 
1552 - 1556 , FIG . 15B , are revealed on the header , when in may include displaying the shared entities on the back of the 
a focused state . 45 card without selecting 1610 , Shared From . In such embodi 

Card options 1552 , reveals the card options , and may in ments a maximum number of shared entities may be dis 
some embodiments invoke an animation of the card flipping played before requiring selection of a more control . The 
to reveal selectable options . Share , 1554 , is configured to more control expands on the list of shared entities to provide 
permit a user to share the card with other user . Delete , 1556 , for listings that do not fit within the space provided on the 
removes the card from the home view . Card controls , such 50 back of a card . 
as 1552 - 1556 are typically not available for system cards , Shared to , 1612 , provides information about whether and 
which typically can not be shared or deleted . According to to whom the card has been shared . According to one 
one embodiment , the photos & video system card is con - embodiment , system cards can not be shared , thus no shared 
figured to display the card options ( in one example the photo to information is displayed . By default shared to , 1612 , does 
& video system card permits selection of " Show in screen - 55 not display until a card has been shared . According to some 
saver ” ) . 1508 , FIG . 15A , card body varies by the type of embodiments , the “ shared to ” field is responsive to focus . In 
card displayed . In one embodiment , a web card body 1508 one example , hovering over the shared to line causes the 
comprises a thumbnail of the current state of the web page . device to display an informational bubble with the list of 
The current state thumbnail may be updated . Updates may people to whom the card has been shared . Other options may 
occur in conjunction with a timer . Typically the timer is set 60 be employed for displaying shared to information . Other 
for default operation , and is not configurable by a user , options may include linking to a display list for share to 
although in some embodiments a user may access and information , and in some embodiments may include dis 
modify an update interval for web cards through system playing the shared entities on the back of the card without 
configurations . selecting 1612 , shared to . In such embodiments a maximum 

The body of a channel card ( not shown ) comprises a 65 number of shared entities may be displayed before requiring 
visualization of the rss feed from the web site source . Sites selection of a more control ( not shown ) . The more control 
that do not have rss feeds , typically , will not be able to be expands on the list of shared entities to provide for listings 
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that do not fit within the space provided on the back of a Web card , the devices displays the card sliding to the right 
card . Optionally the more control may cause the device to ( or down to the far left on the next row if it is already on the 
display an information bubble containing the remaining far right ) as a new web card is created in its place at 1044 . 
shared entities and / or all the shared entities . At 1046 the system renders apparent motion in the display , 

Organization of the Home View 5 showing the system zooming into the new web card . At 
Typically , the home view is configurable by the user . New 1048 , the system displays a quick access view configured to 

items may be added , existing items may be moved and / or generate a mapping between the new card and web based 
removed based on user selection . The home view further content . According to some embodiments , newly added 
comprises some visual representations that can not be cards ( whether created by the user or received as a shared 
removed . Commonly requested system operations have 10 card from another user ) always appear at the bottom of the 
visual representation displayed on the home view that can home view next to the Browse the Web card . In other 
not be deleted . According to one embodiment , a user may embodiments , the Browser the Web card may display a 
reorganize the display but not remove representations for different title , for example , " New Card . " It is to be appre 
system operations . For example , visual representations that ciated that the title is not particularly relevant to the nascent 
map to system operations ( e . g . a communication card and a 15 card , but rather , the functionality for generating new card is . 
camera card ) cannot be remove from the home view . New cards may also be created on the fly during a 
Nascent cards , for example , the Browse the web card , can browsing session as part of process 1080 , FIG . 10C . Process 
not be removed from the home view . According to some 1080 begins at 1082 in response to either a user clicking an embodiments , the Browse the web card is further limited in " open in new window ” link on a web page , or in response configurability , in that , the positioning of the card will not 
change relative to the other cards . For example , the Browse – 20 to a user executing a keyboard shortcut ( e . g . Shift - click ) to 
the web card will always be displayed last . In other perform the same function . Additionally links that contain 
examples , nascent cards may have other positions that do not computer instructions to open link in new tab will invoke the 
change , first to be displayed , last displayed on first page of same functionality at 1082 . In these cases , the system shows 
the home view , etc . In some embodiments , even nascent an animation zooming out of the current card to the home 
cards may be reorganized in the home view display . 25 view at 1084 , optional step 1086 cause the system to display 

The user interface may include default settings for orga - movement to the last page of the home view ( if not there 
nization . For example , a default organization for the home already ) , at 1088 the Browse the Web card slides out of the 
view comprises an arrangement roughly based on order of way , revealing the new card in its place at 1090 , and finally 
creation , from left to right , top to bottom . Other organization zooming into the new card , 1092 . Process 1080 , may be 
may be employed right to left , top to bottom . In one 30 implement in association with a timer to govern the overall 
example , the user of the streamline device is located in execution time of process 1080 . In one example , the process 
China , and the default organization is presented from right and animations should take no more than about half a 
to left . second . One example default setting for the home view establishes According to one embodiment , selection of the Browse 
a number of cards to display per page of the home view . In 35 the Web system card causes the system to execute a process 
one example the default caused the computer to render for generating a new web card . As part of the process for twelve cards on a page . In another example , the display of generating a new card , the system presents a quick access the twelve cards further comprises the tops of the cards on view to the user . Referring again to FIG . 5 , shown is an the next page or the bottoms of the cards on the previous example of a quick access view . As discussed earlier , the page , as appropriate . In one embodiment , the home view 
includes maximal display thresholds configured to improve 40 40 body 502 of the quick access view may display a frequently 
the ability of the user to absorb the information presented . In accessed list of content . A user may select from the dis 
some embodiments , a maximal number of visual represen played content to generate a mapping for the new cards , and 
tations per screen is set . In one example , the maximal enter the web page view for that content . Additional at 510 , 
number of visual representations is used to define a GUI the quick access view presents news from , for example , the 
page . In another example , the maximal number of visual 45 device manufacturer . At 510 , news regarding operation of a 
representations is associated with a maximal number of full streamlined device may be shared with the streamlined 
view visual representations , and the page is configured to device user community . Advice on new features may be 
include portions of views of other visual representations provided , 512 . And awareness drawn to new features . Hints 
available on adjacent pages . A computer operation that and suggestions may also be displayed , for example , 514 , 
would cause the computer device to exceed the maximal 50 referring users to GOOGLE DOCS , and on - line word pro 
number results in the creation of a new display page . The cessing / office suite solution . 
home view is organized into as many pages are required in According to another embodiment , creation of a channel 
order to maintain the maximal threshold of display items . card is available for sites with rss feeds or sites for which 

It is to be appreciated the different organization options customized visualizations are available . From the home may be employed for the home view . In one alternative , : 55 view any web card with rss feeds or with customized frequency of use may be employed to organize the cards visualizations can be used to generate a channel card . From displayed in a home view . The most frequently accessed a web page view , hovering over the option add channel content may be display first with the least frequently 
accessed content being display last . Another option includes caused the system to display a preview of the channel card . 
the use of last accessed information associated with a In one embodiment a channel card includes features not 
particular card . The most recently accessed card may be 60 he 60 observed in web or system card . For example , channel card 
displayed first and the card with oldest use would be 204 , includes a display , 280 , for an individual rss item 
displayed last . received from the online source . In this case the rss item is 

Creating New Cards a headline that permits direct access to an article ( typically 
An example process 1040 , FIG . 10B may be executed to through a web card ) . Channel card , 204 , will display a 

generate a new card . Process 1040 is executed in response 65 plurality of rss items one at a time through the channel card , 
to a user clicking the Browse the Web card on the home view thus the content in a channel card periodically changes , until 
at step 1042 . In response to the execution of the Browse the al content items have been displayed . At that time the 
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channel cards starts again from the beginning displaying device renders a page view appropriate for the selected card 
each one of the plurality of source items . ( e . g . web page view for a web card ) . In one embodiment , an 
Removing Cards integrated scroll wheel provides navigation functionality 
According to one embodiment , the home view may be from the home view . Scroll wheel functionality may be 

configured by a user . A user may remove visual represen - 5 dependent on state of the device , and may also be dependent 
tations from the home view . In a card example , a user may on configuration of the device . In one example , the device ' s 
access card option by providing focus on the card . As present state is its home view and manipulation of the scroll 
discussed above , card options are revealed in response to wheel causes the device to display the channel card view . 
focus . Options may comprise a delete option . In one According to one embodiment , returning to the home view 
example , a delete option is display as an “ X ” in the upper 10 is streamlined for the user . This may be accomplished 
right corner of a hover view of a card . To delete a card from through navigation buttons on the keyboard , for example 
the home view , a user executes the delete option by clicking 168 , FIG . 17 . The navigation button operates as a toggle 
on the “ X . ” In response to removal of a card from the home between present view and home view , returning a user to the 
the view , the remaining cards on the home view are reor - home view when the present view is elsewhere , and return 
dered by the device . In one example , the reordering com - 15 ing the user to the previous view when the present view is 
prises shifting of the displayed cards to rearrange them into the home view . A navigation element provided in visual 
the organizational schemes discussed above . In order to representation of computer content may also provide the 
ensure a close / delete selection was intended and to provide same functionality . For example , navigation button 250 , in 
the user with the ability to change their mind , an information home view 200 . In another example , a navigation button , 
display bubble may be generated in response to the delete 20 352 , FIG . 3C is provided in a web page view . 
execution . The information display bubble maps to func Reorganization of visual elements in the home view may 
tionality that causes the device to undo the delete operation implicate navigation with the home view . In one example 
in response to selection by the user . where the home view presents cards to a user through 

According to one embodiment , a dialog bubble is dis multiple pages , moving cards across the pages requires 
played off of the header of the home view . The dialogue 25 navigation within the home view . According to one embodi 
bubble displays a message confirming the delete operation ment , specialized navigation options are provide to render 
and further comprising a mapping to functionality provided , sufficient context for the relocation across pages . In one 
the causes the device to undo the delete operation in example , a user drags a card across pages within a home 
response to selection . According to another embodiment view . The device in response to the drag across pages 
hot - key functionality is provided that cause the device to 30 modifies the display of the home view to show a zoomed out 
undo that last activity performed by the device . In one display of the home view . The zoomed out display is 
example , ctrl - z , is mapped to functionality that permits the permitted to violate any associated threshold with respect to 
last activity to be undone . number of displayed items on a page of the home view . The 
Home View Navigation zoomed out display in a view of multiple pages with each 
According to one embodiment , the home view in config - 35 element of the pages being reduced in size to allow them to 

ured to display a maximum number of visual representa - be displayed in one screen . For long lists of cards , or other 
tions . For embodiments employing cards that map to com - visual representations , this may result in extremely small 
puter content and / or operations the maximal number of visual representations or cards . It is realized that even 
visual representations will restrict the number of cards thought the result may be visual representations so small that 
displayed per page of the home view . In one example the 40 they cannot be fully appreciated , the user goal is to relocate 
display number is set to twelve . In response to exceed the a card , and the temporary loss of interactivity to the user will 
display number , the device executes operations designed to not impact the user operation . Once a card is relocated , the 
render a new page for the excess . In response to multiple device caused the display to " zoom ” back out to conform to 
pages , the device is configured to display indications of management and organization scheme discussed , including 
content ( e . g . cards ) on adjacent pages . In response to move - 45 maximal display thresholds , for example . 
ment of a pointer , visual representation displayed on the Navigation away from the home view may also occur 
screen tracking computer focus , new pages may be dis - through selection of the visual representations that map to 
played . In one example , multiple pages are provided by the computer content and / or functionality . In one embodiment , 
view . The display rendered by the device give a user the clicking on a card will zoom into that card , revealing the 
impression that adjacent pages appear above and below the 50 page view for that card . In one example , clicking on a web 
current page view . For example , indications of adjacent card card caused the device to display the web page view for that 
content appear at the top and bottom of the home view body . card ' s content . In another , clicking on a channel card may 
By scrolling to the pointer towards the bottom of the screen invoke different behavior . In a channel card example , the 
the user causes the device to display the next page of the navigation behavior depends on the location within the card 
home view , further by scrolling the pointer towards the top 55 that is clicked . 
of the screen the user causes the device to display the Some channel card embodiments , display items from rss 
previous page of the home view . Additionally , according to feeds one at a time , scrolling through the rss items based on 
one embodiment , arrow keys provided on the device ' s a timer , and in one embodiment , based on selection of 
keyboard may be used to navigate pages of the home view . navigation tools within the card . If a user clicks on the body 
In one alternative , keyboard shortcuts mapped to navigation 60 of the channel card for example , the device causes the 
functionality . In one example , keys with mapped navigation channel page view to be displayed for that card . If a user 
functionality include shift - arrow , crtl - arrow , alt - arrow to clicks on an rss item displayed in the channel card , the 
provide further navigation options . device causes a web page view for the specific content to be 
One may navigate away from the home view at any time displayed . In one embodiment , a channel card maps to a 

by selecting a visual representation and causing the device 65 content feed from the NEW YORK TIMES . Clicking on an 
to execute the mapping associated with the representation . article title in the channel cards causes the system to execute 
In one embodiment , a user selects a card and in response the a mapping to the content by opening a new web card and 
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zooming into the new card ' s web page view of the selected plurality of views and with respect to visual representations 
article . Clicking elsewhere the channel card causes the of computer content , and at 4508 a plurality of representa 
system will zoom in to the channel page view for that card . tions and views provide additional focus responsive dis 

According to one embodiment , searching from the home plays , which are configured to include focused and unfo 
view causes the user interface to navigate away from the 5 cused presentations . 
home view . For example , entering search terms into search According to another aspect , methods and systems for 
box 254 , FIG . 2 , cause the device to execute a process for streamlining user interaction with computer content and 
generating a new web card and navigating to the page view operations may include a process for providing consistent 
of the newly created web card . The device in creating the feature accessibility by providing a primary means for 
new web card automatically creates a mapping to web 10 navigation to computer content and computer operations to 
content based on default settings . In one example , the occur through a consistent view . FIG . 46 , shows an example 
default settings provide for searching to occur through the process , 4600 , for providing consistent navigation opera 
well known search tool GOOGLE . Other search tools may tions to a user . At 4602 , a home view is presented to a 
be established as the default . By accessing a system card for computer user . The home view presents an organization of 
settings , in one example , displayed as a Settings card , a user 15 a plurality of visual representations of computer content , 
may change the default for the search tool . Further default 4604 . The visual representations form the building blocks of 
operations are provided by the user interface . While in the the home view . Each visual representation is mapped to 
home view , any typing that occurs on the keyboard ( except computer content and / or operations that a user may select 
for hot keys and keyboard shortcuts ) will be default populate by , for example , hovering on the visual representation , by 
the search box of the home view . Pressing return or clinking clicking on it , and by using hot keys among other options . 
on the search tool 255 , will execute the process for a new 2 | 20 At 4606 , a user executes the mapping to the computer 
card and pass the search terms to the default search tools , content and / or operations . In one example , execution of the 
and the device displays the web page view of the default mapping causes the computer to navigate to a first view of 
search tool and its response to the search terms . the content . In some embodiments , process 4600 , comprises 
Example Page Views further computer logic executed by a processor to access a 
According to one aspect a streamlined user interface is 25 stored mapping , and to generate the rendered presentation 

provided , that permits a user to access electronic content on on the computer display of the first view . 
a device responsive to context and responsive to device Typically the first view comprises a navigational elements 
configuration . According to one embodiment , an element of displayed in a portion of the first view . The navigational 
a graphical user interface that provides streamlined access element is mapped to the home view . In one example , the 
includes a plurality of views of computer content . Another 30 home view also comprises a navigational element , and a user 
element of the GUI , includes visual representations of may toggle between the first view and the home view by 
computer functionality and / or content that are associated executing the navigational element . In process 4600 , a user 
with a mapping to at least one of the plurality of views . In executes the navigational element to return to the home view 
one example , the visual representations comprise cards , as at 4608 . In one alternative , a button , a sequence of keyboard 
discussed above . The various types of cards can each be 35 keys , a hot key may also cause a computer system to execute 
associated with one of the plurality of views , and may also a transition to a home view . In another alternative , the same 
be associated with multiple views . A high level view may be button , sequence , of keyboard keys , and hot key may cause 
provided to manage and organize the ( for example in a home the computer to return to the first view upon a subsequent 
view ) . The card may be associated with a lower level view execution . Returning to the home view at 4608 , presents the 
which permits more direct interaction with the viewed user with a consistent view of content options , and the user 
content . In one example , a web page view permits a user to 40 content . In one example , a web page view permits a user to 40 may select a new first visual representation mapped to other 
interact with displayed web content for a web page . Other computer content at 4610 . Execution of the new first visual 
views including a channel page view , provide lower level representation caused the computer to navigate to a first 
views that permit interaction with content specific to channel view of the mapped computer content , returning process 
cards , and system page views provide , for example , a lower 4600 , to step 4606 . Again the user may select a navigational 
level view of system functions mapped to by the system 45 element to return the home view at 4608 to select yet another 
cards . System cards may be further classified into nascent first visual representation . In some embodiments , process 
cards , and different page view provided according to clas 4600 , represents a resident process that runs in the back 
sification . ground throughout operation of a computer device . In other 

According to one aspect , methods and systems for stream examples , process 4600 may be exited by powering down 
lining user interaction with computer content and operations 50 the computer system ( not shown ) . And in one alternative , a 
may include a process for providing consistent feature user may exit process 4600 by selecting different naviga 
accessibility across a plurality of views and a plurality of tional tools that execute mappings to other views . In another 
visual representations of computer content . FIG . 45 illus alternative , ( not shown ) a view selector may be invoked by 
trates one example process , 4500 , for providing consistent changing a configuration of a streamlined device . Invoking 
accessibility to computer content across a plurality of views 68 the view selector can cause the computer system to execute 
and a plurality of visual representations of computer content a transition to a different view without a return the home 
and / or operations . At 4502 , a view of computer content is view . In one example , invocation of the view selector by 
provided . The view is configured to include visual elements changing the device configuration from laptop to easel , 
responsive to computer focus , however achieved . The view causes the computer system to transition from a home view 
of computer content includes a header display further com to a channel view . 
prising a focus header display and an unfocused header 60 header 60 Example Web Page View 
display . In response to focus , the focus header display According to one embodiment , a web page view is the 
reveals additional controls associated with the computer computer implemented expression of a selected web card . 
content , 4504 . At 4506 , focus is removed from the focus The web page view is configured to present a consistent 
header display and the computer system transitions the view view of web based content to a user . The web page view 
of content to an unfocused header display , concealing the 65 comprise a number of elements that are maintained across 
additional controls at 4506 . In one embodiment , responsive - the web page view of different content , although in some 
ness to focus provides for user consistency in accessing a examples additional features may be provided to address 
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unique aspects of the content being viewed . In one embodi Other standard operations and options may be supported 
ment , the web page view includes a header , 354 , FIG . 3C , a in the toolbar . In one embodiment , the toolbar supports , find 
body , 356 , optionally a scroll bar 358 , and a navigation in page , find in page Next / Prev , for scrolling through hits 
element , 352 . It is to be appreciated that individual web page within the page , save photos , - text size / + text size , to 
views may comprise additional elements , and should not be 5 increase or decrease the size of the text ( text sizing may be 
read as limited to elements discussed with respect to this implemented globally so that changes in text size for one 
example . The Header 354 , is responsive to focus of the web page view will affect all web page views — alternatively 
device . In another embodiment , the header is responsive to the setting may be local to the present web page view ) , 
the type of content being displayed . In one example , the refresh , cut , paste copy , and print . Print and save behavior 
header is further to responsive to the communication pro - 10 for a streamlined device does depart from conventional 
tocol user to access the web based content . The header operation . 
portion may also be responsive to the state of the device , and According to one embodiment , the header may also 
state of the computer operation being performed ( e . g . load display additional tools whether the header is in focus or out 
ing content ) . of focus , responsive to the content of the page . In one 

Accordingly , in one embodiment the header 354 element 15 embodiment , the header , 1890 - 1891 , FIG . 18C , displays an 
of the display appears differently based on focus , content , add a channel tool , 1892 , regardless of focus ( 1890 out of 
and context of the web site being viewed . When the header focus , 1891 in focus ) . In one example , the device determines 
is out of focus , for example , the header may be rendered in that the accessed content has either a rss feed , or a custom 
an out of focus display , shown by example in FIG . 18A . The view for the static web - page , and in response reveals the add 
header display comprises navigation element , 1802 , page 20 a channel feature in the header . Selecting the add a channel 
title 1804 , optionally a visual element associated with the causes the device to execute a process for generating a new 
web page is displayed 1806 , the visual element may be a channel card as discussed further herein . 
favicon ( reduced scale image associated with a website ) , and According to another embodiment , the state of the content 
where appropriate the header displays a lock symbol 1808 to in the view may impact the tools displayed . For example , 
indicate a secure site . For secure sites , hovering over the 25 when a user is interacting with the address box ( e . g . to enter 
security symbol 1808 , caused the device to display addi - a URL or URI ) or when a page is not fully loaded , possible 
tional information regarding the security of the site . In one actions are limited . The device causes the header display to 
example , a dialogue box appears including information on adjust to remove options that are unavailable ( e . g . namely 
the security signature for the site . Share , Add channel , Bookmarks , and More ) , and adds the 

Page title provides the user the name of the page s / he is 30 following elements Go / Stop tool 1895 , FIG . 18D , and a 
on in human - readable form . In some embodiments , when the status indicator 1896 . Selecting Go causes the device to 
header is out of focus , the title of the page extends to the initiate navigation and start loading a URL or URI listed in 
right as far as possible . How far the title is display is the address box . The stop button appears while a page is 
dependent on what other elements are included in the header . loading - clicking the button will stop the page from load 
For example , when the header is out of focus the title has the 35 ing . The Go / Stop tool toggles between a presentation of Go 
most room in the display . Upon focus , the device causes the when a page ahs not yet been loaded and Stop when a 
header display to change . In one example , FIG . 18B illus - content is being accessed , for example . The status indicator 
trates a header , 1850 , in focus , and device now displays may include a customized visualization . The customized 
additional tools in the header . Additional tools may comprise visualization may be configured to tie various functions and 
a share tool , 1852 ( for sharing the web card mapping to the 40 features together . In one example , the status indicator is 
view ) , bookmark tool , 1854 ( adds web page to bookmark configured to display as a “ loading spring , ” 1896 . 1896 , is 
list ) , more tool , 1856 ( permits revelation of additional tools ) , animated to show that the device is actively downloading 
search tool , 1858 , and close tool , 1860 . Additional tools may content . It is to be appreciated that although the Go / Stop tool 
be displayed in the header on focus , including , for example , is display in the same space on the header in the described 
back and forward buttons , 1864 that may be used to access 45 example , the display for either function may also be ren 
other pages in browsing history . Additionally , the title dis - dered separately , or display above and below , among other 
play from unfocused view , 1804 , FIG . 18A , may be trans - options . 
formed into a web address box 1862 , FIG . 18B . In one The header display may be further responsive to focus and 
embodiment , focus on the header display 1850 , causes the selection . In FIG . 18E , shown is a header after selection of 
device to transform the title display into an address box , 50 the search tool 1858 . In response to selection of the search 
1862 . The address box maintains the title of the web site , tool , the device alters the heading display to include an 
until a user interacts with the address box , by for example search box 1898 , for entry of search terms . Once the search 
typing into it . Once the system detects interaction with the is initiated the device alters the header to eliminate search 
address box , the display in the address box will indicate a url box 1898 . 
and / or uri for the current site ( or whatever the user is typing ) . 55 Navigation within Web Page View 
Other options may be made available through the header by According to one aspect , navigating web pages within the 
display and selection of a more tool , 1856 . For example , the web page view is similar to existing browsers on other 
device displays a toolbar , 1904 , in response to user selection systems . For most links , when a user clicks the link , the 
of the more tool 1902 , FIG . 19 . The toolbar supports device executes a process to load a new web page into the 
operations , 1906 , provided by conventional browser of other 60 body of the current web page view , replacing the contents of 
known systems . The toolbar 1904 may also be revealed in the current page . The device operates different in response to 
response to keyboard short - cuts , for example , crtl - f opens a links that request a new window . For new window links or 
search box , 1908 , permitting the user to specify terms to find new tab links the device executes a process to generate a 
within the web page view . The toolbar display may be new web card , and further the new card is mapped to the link 
responsive to the content appearing in the web page view . 65 destination . The device executes functionality that causes 
For example , the device will display zoom tools instead of the display to " zoom " into the new card and present the 
- text size and + text size in response to . pdf content . content from the link destination . 
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According to one aspect , transitions between active web tent column , 2054 , presents the details of rss items ( if the 
page views occurs through the home view . The user selects content does not require additional space other than the 
a navigation element ( e . g . 352 FIG . 3C ) to return to the displayed screen a scroll bard will not be displayed ) . The 
home view , alternatively , a navigation button ( e . g . 168 , FIG . content column shows the headline , 2056 , includes the time 
17 ) will return the user to the home view . In another 5 the item was posted 2058 ( in one example relative to current 
embodiment , hot keys and / or shortcut keys may be time ) , the author , 2060 , and the item ' s description , 2061 , in 
employed to cause the system to return to a home view . In its entirety . According to one embodiment , images and / or 
response to selection of the shortcut and / or hot keys , the script ( html , xml , etc . ) may also be displayed in the content 
device executes a transition to the home view . From the column ( not shown ) . The content column may also comprise 
home view a user may select any other card or generate new 10 a navigation element , 2062 . In one example the navigation 
cards , as discussed above . element is labeled “ full story . ” The system launches the 

Creation of channel cards occurs differently from a web item ' s url as a new web card , and transitions to a web page 
page view , than when done in a home view . In one embodi - view of that url in response to selection of 2062 . Optionally , 
ment , in response to selection of add channel in a web page focus and / or hovering over the full story button causes the 
view , the system returns to the home view , displays the 15 system to generate a preview view of the new card that 
creation of the new card , and presents the creation of the new would be created in response to selection of full story . 
card so that both the new card and the web card from which Selection of one of the content items , e . g . 2070 - 2076 , 
add channel was selected is displayed . In this example causes the system to display the headline , author , posting 
process any maximal display threshold may be ignored in time , and full description for the selected rss item . Scroll bar , 
order to display both the originating card and the new 20 2080 , is displayed if the number of items in the headline 
channel card . Once the card generation is complete the column , 2052 , require additional pages of display . A scroll 
system zooms back into the original web page view for bar may be display in the content column as well , if the 
continued browsing . Alternatively , a system may enter a content display requires additional pages . According to one 
channel view of the newly created channel creation . In one embodiment , channel page views are configured to retain 
embodiment , the behavior of the system may be altered 25 current state . The system accesses retained state when 
according to settings accessed through a system card , and in revisiting a channel view . According to one embodiment , a 
one example a settings card . process for accessing a channel page view determines if any 

Channel Page View state information is retained for the channel page view . In 
According to one embodiment , the channel page view is response to a determination that state information exists , the 

the zoomed - in computer implemented expression of a chan - 30 system presents the last accessed content item in the content 
nel card . A channel page view presents a unique view into column If the last content item is no longer available , the 
content made available through a website . The channel page system selects the first content item by default . 
view employs visualizations similar to corresponding visu - An alternative view of channel content comprises a full 
alization on channel cards but the large format of the view screen view of rss items . In one example a channel full view 
allows for a better display of content , and provides for 35 comprises a headline display center in the screen . 
increased interaction with users . The channel page view also According to another embodiment , preview text is dis 
comprises a mapping from the display content to the source played in conjunction with the rss item . In one example , the 
from which the content is derived . Typically , content dis - channel full view includes displays configured to identify 
played in the channel page view is derived from an rss feed the source of the rss feed . In another example , a logo for the 
associated with a web - site . Additionally , some non - rss sites 40 source feed is captured and displayed as part of the channel 
have customized visualizations that can be accessed through full view . In response to selection within the channel full 
a channel page view . view , the system displays a content menu permitting selec 

According to one embodiment , the channel page view tion of any of the rss items for the content source . In one 
configured to present a consistent framework for user inter - embodiment , the content menu appears as a list of rss items 
action with rss style content . The channel page view com - 45 displayed at the lower portion of the channel full view . The 
prises a number of elements that are maintained across the content menu is configured to be responsive to manipulation 
channel page views of different content , although in some of the embedded scroll wheel . Manipulation of the scroll 
examples additional features may be provided to address wheel progress through the displayed content menu , and in 
unique aspects of the content being viewed . An example response the system displays the selected content in the full 
channel page view is illustrated in FIG . 20A , 2000 . The 50 view with preview text appearing below . Shown in FIG . 21 
channel page view shown includes a header 2002 , which is an example of a channel full view 2100 , with content 
includes a display for the title of the channel page view , menu 2102 activated by selection . Manipulation of the scroll 
2006 , a share tool , 2006 , web link 2008 , and status indicator wheel causes the system to scroll through the items in the 
2010 . The header may also include navigation element 2012 content menu . In one embodiment , the content menu tran 
for returning to a home view among other functionality . The 55 sitions between selections by rendering the apparent move 
channel page view also includes a body 2014 , for displaying ment of the entire content menu either to the left of the right 
available rss items 2016 - 2022 . Selection of the displayed rss depending upon the orientation of the manipulation of the 
items 2016 - 2022 , caused the system to display the web page scroll wheel . Alternatively , the content menu is also respon 
view of the selected article , web link 2008 , shown as " go to sive to arrow keys on the keyboard . Depressing an arrow key 
web page ” in FIG . 20 , creates a new web card for the page 60 cause the system to display the apparent movement of the 
from which the channel was created . content menu to the next item . 

Other channel page views may also be employed . FIG . According to some embodiments , the various channel 
20B , illustrates another example of a channel page view , views , for example , page and full view may also include 
2050 . Shown in 2050 is a specialized channel view for a animations of transitions between available rss feed items . 
news channel . Example view 2050 is separated into two 65 Default operation of the streamlined computer system and 
scrollable columns , providing a headline column 2052 , for streamlined user interfaces cause the system to display 
displaying individual rss items and a content column Con - transitions from one rss item to the next in association with 
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a time period . Transitions may include animations that cause includes a selector display , 2302 . The selector view is invoke 
the system to display new rss items sliding into position as upon the first click of the scroll wheel while in easel mode , 
the previous rss item slides out of view . In one example , an in laptop mode , additional clicks may be required to invoke 
rss headline item slides out of view in response to the next the channel card view and selector . In one example , the three 
headline item sliding into view . The device and user inter - 5 clicks are necessary to invoke the channel card view while 
faces may also be responsive to manipulation of the scroll the device is in a laptop mode . In another example two clicks 
wheel . For example , manipulation of the scroll may by are required . Upon invocation the channel card view com 
default invoke a transition to a channel card view . prises a visualization of the channel cards available for 

System Page View selection . In one example , the visualization resembles and 
According to one embodiment , the system page view is 10 behaves like a rolodex . As the user moves the scroll wheel 

the zoomed - in computer implemented expression of a sys - individual channels 2304 - 2310 appear to flip around the 
tem card . The system cards provide a user with the ability to hinge of the device . In response to selection , the foremost 
interact with the device ' s settings and other computer opera - channel card displayed is selected and displayed full screen . 
tions . System cards also enable a user to access customized In one example , selection includes activation of button 168 , 
functionality , for example , photo and video interactions . 15 FIG . 17 , from the easel mode of the device , although in 
According to one aspect , certain interactions with computer laptop mode selection can occur in a number of ways 
content are identified as special . The identification of special including by operation of button 168 . In another example , a 
interactions is reflected in render those operations as system different button may be selected or short cut keys selection , 
cards . System cards have the property , that they cannot be among other options . 
removed by a user . This insures that identified functionality 20 In response to selection from the channel selector view , 
remains available regarding of user intention . Additionally , the system displays a channel page view . On example of a 
the number of system cards can be limited , providing a channel page view for photo content is shown in FIG . 24 . 
distinctive interface element for system operation and According to one embodiment , the channel page view of the 
important interactions even within the streamlined GUI . In photo content automatically scans though each photo by 
one embodiment , system cards are limited to a photo and 25 default in the channel page view . The photo display restarts 
video card ( controlling photo and video operations ) , a set - again at the begin when the end of the photo content is 
tings card ( permitting access to device settings ) , a bookmark reached . In another embodiment , the default operation is to 
card ( discussed herein ) , a camera card ( permitting set and display only the selected content item ( e . g . photo ) . FIG . 
interaction with a camera ) , and a browse the web card 25A , illustrates an example logical diagram of the behavior 
( discussed herein ) . Although it is to be appreciated that other 30 for the channel view . From channel page view 2502 , selec 
system card may be implemented and the invention is not tion of the menu button ( e . g . FIG . 4 , 166 ) , caused the device 
limited to the system cards provide as example above . to display the content menu , 2504 , over the present channel 

The anatomy of the system card is similar to the anatomy page view . Selection of the menu button from the content 
of other cards . For example , an embodiment of the system menu , causes the device to display the selected content item 
card includes a header , 2202 , FIG . 22 , a navigation element , 35 in a channel page view 2502 . From channel page view 2502 , 
2204 , a title 2206 , and a body 2208 . As discussed herein , operation of the scroll wheel ( e . g . FIG . 4 , 132 ) , causes the 
nascent cards may be categorized as a type of system card . device to display channel selector view 2506 . 
Alternatively , nascent cards may comprise their own cat According to one embodiment , photo content displayed as 
egory . While nascent cards share a similar format as the a channel in the user interface , can be accessed similarly . 
other cards , nascent cards do not have a page view . Nascent 40 Shown is an example of channel functionality , in logical 
cards map directly to system functionality , that is executed diagram 2550 , FIG . 25B . From channel page view 2552 , of 
upon selection or as part of a call from another process . the photo channel , selection of the menu button ( e . g . FIG . 4 , 

Channel Card View 166 ) , causes the device to display the content menu , 2554 , 
According to one aspect , a channel card view is provided over the present channel page view . Selection of the menu 

to display high level navigation options to a user , to enable 45 button from the content menu , causes the device to display 
streamlines selection of content and operations by making the selected content item in a channel page view 2552 . From 
selections within a streamlines view . Similar to the home channel page view 2552 , operation of the scroll wheel ( e . g . 
view the channel card view is configured to render a FIG . 4 , 132 ) , causes the device to display channel selector 
consistent organization of navigational elements of a stream - view 2556 . 
lined graphical user interface . Unlike the home view , the 50 According to one embodiment , channels for displaying 
channel card view is not based on pages of display , rather the video content and / or audio content operate with a different 
channel card view is organized to display only one type of logical flow . In one example , additional interactivity is 
content , that is content that may be rendered in a channel required to allow a user to , for example , stop a video , start 
( i . e . having an rss feed or customized visualization , and for a video from the middle , among other options . According to 
special system cards ) . The channel card view is available in 55 one embodiment , the streamlined device must be able to 
both laptop and easel modes of the streamlined device . In accommodate routine operations through manipulation of 
response to configuration of the device into easel mode , the only a scroll wheel and a mouse , for example when the 
channel card view is rendered by default . The content device is in an easel mode . It is to be appreciated that in other 
displayed in the channel card view is dependent on the configurations the logical flow for the behavior of the 
channel cards displayed in the home view . Alternatively the 60 channel view may be different , and may take advantage of 
channel card view may be invoked by operating the scroll addition input / output devices available in other device 
wheel embedded in the device . modes . Shown in FIG . 28 , is an example of a logical flow for 

In response to operation of the scroll wheel , the system device / UI functionality , during the normal operation of a 
displays the channel card view , FIG . 23 , illustrates an channel view of video content . At 2802 shown is a channel 
example of a channel card view , 2300 . According to one 65 page view of video content , select of button ( e . g . FIG . 4 , 
embodiment , the channel card view comprises selector dis - 132 ) , causes the device to display contextual menu 2804 . 
play 2302 . In another embodiment , the channel card view Contextual menu , includes a visual representation of select 
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56 
able options , 2806 . The selectable options rendered include mode of the device may trigger changes in the user interface . 
at least a rewind / fast forward selector , resume selection , According to one embodiment , a transition from laptop 
other episodes . Selection of rewind / fast forward selector mode to easel mode , causes the device to transition from 
invokes a timeline controller 2809 shown in the content page either a home view or web page view to a channel selector 
view , 2808 . The time line controller is responsive to rotation 5 view . The transition from laptop to easel , may also trigger a 
of the scroll wheel , providing fast forward in one direction transition from a channel page view to channel selector 
and rewind in the other . From 2808 , selection of button 132 view . In one alternative , the transition causes the device to 
causes the device to return the view to channel page view display a channel full view for that channel card . The 
2802 . Selection of resume form 2804 , also causes the device transition from easel to laptop may also cause the device to 
to return the view to channel page view 2802 . Selection of 10 alter the view displayed to a user . In one example , if a new 
other episodes from 2804 causes the device to invoke card has been shared , the device causes the home view to be 
content menu 2810 , which provides a selector view of displayed . The last page of the home view is displayed 
available content for the channel . Selection of content , 2811 , where the new card is rendered . 
from the selector view causes the system to play the selected According to another embodiment , methods and systems 
content in channel page view 2802 . From channel page view 15 for streamlining user interactions may include a process for 
2802 , the devices displays channel selector 2812 , in transitioning between different user viewing positions . 
response to operation of the scroll wheel . The logical flow Shown in FIG . 48 , is an example process 4800 , for permit 
illustrated may be used for interactions with audio content as ting a user to select a viewing mode for a streamlined device , 
well , for example , to control playing of . mp3 or other audio and in response displaying a user interface view configured 
file . 20 for the selected viewing mode . At 4802 , a streamline com 

Selecting Device Configurations puter system presents computer content using visual repre 
According to one aspect , systems and method for stream sentation optimized for different viewing modes . In particu 

lining user interaction with electronic content include a lar , ones of the visual representations are configured to 
plurality of physical configurations for a streamlined device , display in a “ lean forward ” user viewing mode and a “ lean 
the streamlined device may be , for example , a portable 25 backward ” viewing mode . In one example , a lean forward 
computer . As discussed above the plurality of configurations user viewing mode includes a user typing at a keyboard of 
may represent modes of operation of the device , and include a laptop computer . In another example , a lean backward user 
for example laptop mode , easel mode , among others . viewing mode includes a user viewing a television from a 
According to another aspect the user interface that governs distance . One should appreciate that the examples provided 
interactions between the user the device and accessed con - 30 are illustrative and are not intended to be limiting . A 
tent is responsive the selected mode and / or configuration of streamlined device permits a user to select a device con 
the streamlined device . figuration most suited to a particular user viewing mode . For 
According to one embodiment , the streamlined device example , a user may rotate a streamlined device ' s display 

retains information on device configuration and / or mode . In relative to its based about an longitudinal axis , transitioning 
on example , information is maintained as a state variable in 35 the device from a laptop mode to an easel mode . According 
a systems register . In another example , the system may to one embodiment , the easel mode of the device permits 
obtain state from signals provide by an embedded sensor , as improved “ lean back ” interactions with computer content . In 
discussed above . The state information may be used to other words , the easel mode makes it easier to view the 
generate a system response , when the device detects a streamlined device ' s display from distances greater than 
change in configuration and / or mode . 40 conventionally used with laptop computers . Selection of a 

In a typical setting a user interacts with a streamlined lean backward user viewing mode at 4804 , triggers the 
device in one of two viewing modes . The two viewing streamlined device to transition to a content display that 
modes reflect a level of interactivity with the device being improves user interaction . On one example , in response to 
viewed . A lean forward view encompasses interactions the user selection at 4804 , the computer system display 
between a user and conventional computer systems . One 45 transitions to a channel viewing mode at 4806 . The channel 
example includes a user typing at the keyboard of their viewing mode is configured to present computer content , in 
laptop computer , in essence , the user leans into the computer large footprint displays , and further is designed to streamline 
device and display to perform interactions and view content . user interaction with the streamlined device by permitting 
Similarly a user ' s interaction with desktop computers are access through a first I / O profile associated with the stream 
conducted through a forward mode of interaction . It is 50 lined device in easel mode . The first I / O profile in easel 
realized that traditional computer devices and systems are mode may consist of a scroll wheel and a selector button . In 
notorious bad at permitting interaction with content and the some embodiments , the first I / O profile may include a 
device from greater distances . volume control . 

Interactions with content and other device for example a Other processes may be invoked to cause a user interface 
television are included in the second type of viewing mode . 55 to transition between views in response to changes in device 
A lean back mode of viewing is meant to encompass configuration . Shown in FIG . 49A , is an example process 
ordinary television viewing , and the interactions a viewer 4900 , for transitioning between a lean forward view to a lean 
has with their DVR for example . Television and their backward view . At 4902 , a user changes the streamlined 
associated devices and configured to provide for lean back device configuration from laptop to easel mode . In response 
styled interactions . It is realized that conventional system 60 the computer system switches view from its current view to 
and methods fail to provide for the transition from lean a channel view . In some examples , the computer system is 
forward to lean back interactions . As discussed above , already in a channel view , and no transition is implemented . 
streamlined devices can accommodate a plurality of con - The easel mode of the streamlined device is associated with 
figurations , and individual configurations may be designed a first I / O profile including an integrated scroll wheel and a 
to accommodate the different viewing modes . Additionally , 65 selector button . Upon manipulation of the scroll wheel , a 
the streamlines user interface is configured to be responsive view selector causes the computer system to display a 
to the configurations . For example , transitions from a laptop progression through a sequence of channel cards as the 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 346 of 521 PageID #: 452



57 
US 9 , 880 , 715 B2 

58 
scroll wheel is rotated , at 4906 . Optionally the sequence may cate between streamlined device users . In another embodi 
include other customized cards ( in one example a photo and ment , a service is hosted for streamlined device users to 
video card ) . Upon selection of a displayed channel card , a facilitate communication . The service may also be con 
channel full view is invoked at 4908 . The channel full view nected to the internet and in one example functions as a 
displays the content of the selected channel card in the 5 gateway between users , their devices , content , sharing , and 
entirety of the computer system display screen . The system communicating . The service facilitates real time sharing , in 
returns to the channel view in response to further rotation of one example a user may share a movie s / he is viewing with 
the scroll wheel . another . Not only may the user share the information that Shown in FIG . 49B , is another example process , 4950 , for s / he is watching a movie , but the user may allow another to transitioning between user views . At 4952 , a user changes a 10 watch the movie starting at the same place , allowing the device configuration from an easel mode to a laptop mode . users to perceive they are watching the movie together . In response to the change in mode , the device displays a FIG . 29A , illustrates an example interaction between a home view of available content , at 4954 . In some examples , user , the device , and the user interface , where the device the system may already be in a home view and no transition 
occurs . The user may interact with the streamlined device 15 causes a web card to be shared to other users . Shown is web 
through a second I / O profile at 4956 . In some embodiments , page view , 2900 , in response to user selection of share 2902 , 
the second I / O profile includes a keyboard , a touch pad , the device displays a share interface 2904 . The device 
buttons , web cam , and a scroll wheel . accesses the user profile to determine any groups or to nodes 

Streamlined Device Community that the user has created . In example view , 2900 , the user has 
According to one aspect , a common experience may be 20 only one group , family members 2906 . Each entry listed in 

created for multiple users , fostering a community experi - family members represents another streamlined device / user . 
ence . According to another aspect , the common experience Box 2908 permits sharing of the card with other users of 
may also include a community aspect . The community conventional systems . Comment may be included . For 
aspect includes sharing of content between users , sharing of example , a user may type any comment on the card being 
content and configurations , sharing of content , configura - 25 share into box 2910 . Comments entered on a shared card are 
tions , and customizations , among many other options . In display with the card on receipt by another streamlined 
particular , sharing may involve the transmission of user device user . The user selects any one or more of the listed 
interface elements to other users . The visual representations members 2914 - 2920 , or the user selects 2912 to share the 
that map to content and / or computer operations on one card with all the listed members . Once the selections have 
device may be transmitted to another device or another user . 30 been made and any comments entered the user selects 2924 
In one example , a user may share a card and any of its Share ! And the card is transmitted . By selecting Never Mind 
configurations with another user . Access to the shared user 2924 , the device closes the share interface . In FIG . 29B , 
interface elements , in some embodiments , facilitates com - shown is an example of a web page view after a share 
munal computer usage . In one example , a first user may be operation has been completed . At 2950 , the device notifies 
watching media on their streamlined device , another user 35 the user that the selected item has been shared . For other 
known to the first user , may receive a user interface element streamlined device users share content is received by their 
that retains information related to the accessed content and streamlined device as a web card . For other users , an e - mail 
information related to the present context . That is for the first with a link to the content is delivered . It is to be appreciated 
user watching a movie , the first user may share the user that FIG . 29A , illustrates a user with one group or node . In 
interface element ( e . g . a channel card mapped to video 40 other embodiments , a user may be permitted to generate a 
content ) through which s / he is accessing the move , and plurality of groups or nodes . Box 2926 may first display a 
permit the another user not only to watch the movie , but to list of groups , that a user may select from , in order to show 
take up the movie at the same point in time , so in essence , the members of the selected groups . In one embodiment , box 
they get to enjoy the movie together . Content and context 2926 lists more members that can be accommodated in the 
retention by user interface elements that can be shared 45 space provide by the interface . An optional scroll bar may be 
provides unique advantages to the users of the streamlined displayed into to permitting display of additional group 
devices . members . 

In some embodiments , the community aspect incorporates FIG . 30 illustrates an example of a received shared card , 
formation of groups . In one example , groups are formed 3000 . The state of the streamlined device may impact 
based on at least one of a social relationship , familial 50 behavior of the device in response to receipt of a shared card . 
relations , work relationship , etc . Different groups may share In screensaver mode , a streamlined device presents received 
different content and even different context for the same shared cards as part of the screen saver view , 3000 . Com 
content through for example , shared user interface elements . ments included with the shared card , are presented in an 
Groups may be further organized into nodes or a node may o verlay box 3002 , and any text that does not display is a first 
comprise the group . In some examples , a family forms a 55 screen is scrolled into view 3004 , while the content of the 
node regardless of the family ' s location relative to each shared card is displayed . The overlay box 3002 , may include 
other . As part of the configurations that may also occur as an image of the user who shared the card and / or content , at 
part of the device ' s purchase , at least one of the users 3006 . Shared display 3000 , may also include an indicator 
identifies his / her family members . The family members are regarding the number of content items in the shared card . 
configured into a node . The node may be used to permit 60 For example at 3008 , the number of content items in the 
sharing of content . The node may be used to permit sharing photo set being displayed indicates 1 of 4 . Other information 
of cards . Further updates to configurations on device in the associated with individual content items may also be dis 
node may be propagated automatically to other devices in played at 3010 . In the screen saver mode , the shared content 
the node . items are each display , a timer controls the length of time 

Communication between groups members may take place 65 each item is display before continuing on to the next item . 
over the internet . In one embodiment , a sub - network utilizes The device then returns to any screen saver content that was 
the internet or other communication network to communi - being displayed when the shared card came in . 
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For users receiving shared content while in an active view user ' s routine . It is realized that facilitation of communica 
( e . g . non - screensaver views ) , the system may provide a tion and / or content sharing across users improves introduc 
notification message to indicate shared content . From the tion of features and increases the likelihood of their adop 
home view , for example , the system generates notification tion . Context and content sharing are provided for and 
message to display in a message bubble . An visual indicator 5 through streamlined interfaces . The sharing opportunities 
is employed to notify the user that a system message is may be device sensitive , that is , a user with a same / similar 
present . In one example , the navigation item displayed in the device can be identified by a specific user . The users with 
home view ( e . g . FIG . 2 , 250 ) , is animated to indicate a identical devices may have the most options for how to 
message . An example notification is illustrated in FIG . 31 . share , what content to share , context settings , and may also 
Navigation element 3102 may be animated , the device 10 include the ability to share features associated with the 
displays message bubble 3104 upon focus resolving on content . In one embodiment , a user may enable features 
element 3102 . The user may select 3106 or 3108 . Upon associated with a card based interface and through sharing 
selection the device displays the shared card of 3106 , or the the card make another user aware of features of the card 
device returns to the home view 3108 . interface that the receiving user was unaware of . In another 

Similar notifications may be employed in conjunction 15 embodiment , the shared card provides all of the configura 
with other views . Further similar notifications may be used tions established for the originating card . In one alternative , 
for other contexts . In response to displaying a web page security features may be invoke to clear certain settings of 
view of a web page with stored user name information , a a card to insure that for example , banking information is not 
device may present a notification message regarding the shared to another user . In another alternative , the user 
availability of account information . FIG . 32 illustrates an 20 selecting share is prompted to confirm the share request . In 
example message for a site with two stored accounts . By response to a security identifier , the prompt to confirm 
default the system displays the content without using the includes a warning banner regarding the identified security 
stored account information . The device causes the message issue . In one example , a user receives a warning that sharing 
to disappear if a selection is not made , or if browsing activity a card including banking content may compromise the bank 
continues without selection of an account . According to 25 accounts referenced . In another embodiment , a share request 
some embodiment , notifications can either require a with an identified security issue is denied . 
response / action or the notification may disappear if no In some embodiments , the community aspect incorporates 
action is taken . Typically , notifications that do not require an formation of groups . In one example , groups are formed 
action are used to convey information . based on social relationship , familial relations , work rela 

In one embodiment , from channel view in laptop mode , 30 tionship , etc . Different groups may share different content 
the notification of the arrival of new cards is the same as in and even different context for the same content through for 
home or page view . Typically navigation element 3302 , FIG . example , shared user interface elements . Groups may be 
33 , does not appear in the channel view . In response to a new further organized into nodes or a node may comprise the 
card , the device displays 3302 and may animate its display . group . In some examples , a family forms a node regardless 
In response to focus on the 3302 , a notification bubble 3304 35 of the family ' s location relative to each other . As part of the 
appears . The system displays the home view for the page configurations that may also occur as part of the device ' s 
containing the first new card in response to selection of 3302 purchase , at least one of the users identifies his / her family 
or 3306 . members . The family members are configured into a node . 
When a notification is available in channel view , moving The node may be used to permit sharing of content . The 

the scroll wheel invokes the Channel Selector view , but the 40 node may be used to permit sharing of cards . Further updates 
system displays the first new card default ( instead of the to configurations on device in the node may be propagated 
current channel ) . When in channel view in easel mode , the automatically to other devices in the node . 
notification of the arrival of new cards is similar as above , According to another embodiment , sharing options may 
except that both the navigation element and the notification also be adapted to different devices being operated by 
bubble may appear at once . Shown in FIG . 34 , is an example 45 sharing users . For example , certain features may be disabled 
of a notification message from a channel view while in easel when a card or content is shared outside of a streamlined 
mode . The system displays both 3302 navigation element device community . In some embodiments , communities 
and 3404 message bubble together in response to shared may be based on the device being employed , membership in 
content . a group , and / or membership in a node . Additionally com 

In one embodiment of a streamlined device , the user 50 munities may be based on social interactions , familial rela 
interface is configured to provide for passive viewing of tionships , etc . Examples of communities include name lists 
selected content through a screensaver mode . The device of user identified by the device operator . In one example , 
enters screensaver mode in response to the expiration of a community lists and / or community groups are pre - generated 
idle timer expiring . Any interaction with the device causes in response to questions asked of a potential purchaser . User 
the device to exit screensaver mode . In screensaver mode , 55 names may also be added and maintained by the user . 
channel cards and content are display in order . An idle time Additionally , the system may create community lists on 
out period may be established to force a transition to a new behalf of a user based on the user ' s activity . 
channel in the event the idle time out period is exceeded For example , when composing and sending an e - mail , the 
before all the content of the channel is displayed system may query the user to determine if the recipient 

According to some embodiments , the community expe - 60 should be within the user ' s community . In one alternative , 
rience is enhanced through particular features and functions the system may add the recipient to a potential community 
facilitated by the device , the user interface layer , and / or and make the addition subject to a later confirmation . In 
configurations designed to facilitate interaction among users another option , the e - mail recipient is added by default to a 
( either with the device features themselves or also with third group with minimal sharing options . The user is provided 
party services ) . According to another aspect , community 65 the option of changing the group associated with the recipi 
experience and / or community learning furthers adoption ent . Additions to community list may require additional 
and / or integration of new computer features into a particular configurations to become effective . For example , the device 
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user may be required to accept additions , a device user may questions designed to elicit required configurations , allow 
be required to identify if the added name corresponds to the user to interact with GUI elements customized to his / her 
another user of a similar / same type of device , among other current use and preferences . 
configurations options . A process for handling download links may be responsive 

Specialized Operations 5 to the particular content selected for download . In one 
According to another aspect , certain features of conven - example , the system analyzes the selected download link to 

tion computer interactions have been specially configured to determine the type of content selected for downloading . In 
present streamlined interaction between a device , a user , and response , the system identifies accounts held by the user for 
content . In one embodiment , the device does not incorporate processing the selected content . If multiple accounts exists 
mass storage ( i . e . a hard drives ) , instead the system is 10 that handle the selected content , the account first created is 
configured to employ RAM and Flash memory storage . The used by default . A user may alter default operation through 
capacity of the flash memory is significantly less than use of system settings . For photo content , as one example , 
traditional mass storage options . Thus in some embodi - the system identifies the content as a picture ( . jpg , . gif , . tif , 
ments , traditional features such a download , have been etc . ) . The user ' s profile contains information for accessing 
configured to operate differently for a streamlined device . 15 FLICKR , a third party provider of photo access and man 

In one example , download links do not cause a stream agement services . The download link is interpreted into an 
lined device to download content . Instead , a download link operation to transfer the file into the user ' s FLICKR gallery . 
is interpreted by the device , which initiates a process for Other services may be used to host the content , for example , 
handling download links . An example process includes the download link may be interpreted to cause the system to 
accessing a third party provider of remote storage to retain 20 upload the photo to the well known MYSPACE or FACE 
the content identified in the download link . According to one BOOK services . For content that cannot be identified , the 
embodiment , the purchase of a streamlined device , include streamlined device causes the download request to be inter 
creation of an account with access to on - line storage . In one preted as a delivery request to a generic remote storage 
example , remote storage for a device is provided in con service . The remote storage service may be one provided 
junction with user information stored to customize the 25 through a third party provider , or may be the remote storage 
device and configure its operation to the particular user . space provided by a seller of the streamlined device . 

In one embodiment , customized configuration files supply An example process , 4200 , is shown in FIG . 42 for 
information required for integration for known third party streamlining user interactions with digital content . The user 
providers . In some embodiments , customized configuration interaction with digital content is streamlined by enhancing 
files are used to establish default interactions with for 30 features for simplifying user decisions by providing access 
example , Shutterfly , an on - line third party photo manage information associated with multiple user accounts for a 
ment and sharing service . In other examples , customized particular online source . Multiple account profiles can be 
configuration files are used with other third party on - line retained and presented to a user of a streamlined device . 
service providers . Other third party provides include Example process 4200 begins at step 4202 , permitting a user 
GMAIL , HOTMAIL , YAHOO ! MAIL to provide examples 35 to access electronic content through the streamlined device . 
of e - mail service providers . Other provides include , for At 4204 the source of the electronic content is determined 
example , on line banking providers , financial system pro - and matched against available access information . Access 
viders , university systems , web site development providers , information may be stored in a device profile or in another 
dating services , and social networking sites . One should example in a user profile . These profiles may be loaded at 
appreciate that the integration of an on - line service need not 40 startup of the device or may be accessed in real time when 
depend on a predetermined configuration file or settings , a content source is determined . At 4204 ( NO ) no access 
rather , various embodiments of the systems and methods are information is available for the content source , and the 
adapted to learn from user interaction and develop appro - electronic content is display at 4206 . Example electronic 
priate configurations . Certain embodiments are further con - content includes web pages and other online resources . At 
figured to take advantage of configurations developed by 45 4204 ( YES ) the content source is matched against available 
other users of such systems and methods , permitting sharing access information . At 4208 , access information is displayed 
of content , sharing of configurations , etc . According to one to a user in a user interface . The access information typically 
aspect , by using input from the users , learning from user identifies a user account available to access the content 
interactions , permitting content sharing , permitting sharing source . In one example , for an e - mail service this will 
of configurations , and by providing default configurations 50 include the e - mail address displayed in the interface . A 
for more popular services almost any on - line service can be plurality of access accounts may be available for a given 
integrated . service . The streamlined device is configured to handle 

Still other embodiments , may query the user upon entry / multiple users with multiple account to any given services . 
access into a new service for any information necessary to The user interface permits the user to identify which access 
configure the device to provide streamlined presentation and 55 account is desired . At 4210 ( NO ) the user does not identify 
integration of the third party service . In some embodiments , an access account , and at 4212 a default access account is 
the process of streamlining user interactions with electronic used . The default access account does not provide any 
content includes querying the user regarding subscribed account information , and the content source page is display , 
services and / or functions the user would like to use on their at 4216 , not including any sign - on information . At 4210 
computer . For example , during processing of a purchase of 60 ( YES ) a user selects an access account and at 4214 the 
a streamlined device a prospective purchaser receives a access information is passed to the content source , and the 
query form , or the user may receive individual questions displayed content at 4216 will return content after the 
regarding the purchaser ' s present computer use . In one sign - on process has been completed . 
example , the questions will generate a profile of subscribed In another embodiment , a process for handling download 
services , whether pay or free , and customize the user inter - 65 operations is provided . The process includes causing the 
face to permit streamlined interaction with those services out device to display a download interface , for example inter 
of the box . In one example , default configurations and / or face , 3500 , FIG . 35 . The interface presents the user with 
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options for processing the download request . Box 3502 , lists According to one embodiment , a method for streamlining 
members of the user ' s group to whom the user may send the user interaction with electronic content includes a process 
file . Box 3504 , permits a user to enter e - mail addresses to for interpreting online executable operations into stream 
send the file as an attachment or as a link if a size threshold lined operations . One example process , 3600 , FIG . 36 , for 
is exceeded . For a user who has configured third party 5 interpreting online executable operations into streamlined 
service capable of handling the file content , Box , 3506 , operations includes the step of permitting a user to access 
displays the configured providers ( e . g . Shutterfly 3508 , digital content online , at 3602 . The online digital content is 
Flickr 3510 , DropBox , 3512 ) . Each configured service dis presented to a user through a graphical user interface at 

3604 . The GUI permits a user to select executable operations plays with the account name configured for the service , for 10 in the presentation of the online digital content , at 3606 . In example at 3514 . response to selection of the executable operation , the com In one example , process , for interpreting download opera puter system determines if the executable operation requires tions also includes displaying the interface in response to local access . In one example , the executable operation computer focus on the download link . In another example , includes a download operation that would cause a conven 
hovering over the link causes the system to display a 15 tional computer system to store a file on a local mass storage 
download interface . For files sent by e - mail the system may device such as a hard drive . In response to the determination 
be configured with a maximal file size for particular e - mail that the executable operation requires local storage , a 
services . Typically files sizes of less than 5 MB are not streamlined computer device transforms the executable 
filtered , thus is the e - mail domain address is not recognized , operation ' s local access request into a remote access opera 
a default threshold of 5 MB may be used . For services with 20 tion , at 3608 . 
known size constraints the system will transmit the file to the In one example , the remote access operation includes a 
e - mail address . If the constraint is exceed , the system storage request to a online service provider . Various online 
transmits a link to the file instead of the actual file . service providers permits remote storage of various com 

Another to another embodiment , selection of print opera - puter files . Certain service providers optimize the provided 
tions may be handled in a similar fashion as to downloads . 25 service for specific file types , such photo management and 
When a printing device is attached to a streamlined device , sharing services . Other examples include e - mail access 
printing proceed as known conventionally . When a printer is providers , video and audio media management and presen 
not attached , a process for interpreting print operations may tation services . In other examples , a service provider may 
be invoked . The process for interpreting print operations , offer generic data storage not specific to any file type . In one 
includes causing the device to display a print interface 4102 , 30 embodiment , step 3608 includes transforming a download 
FIG . 41A . The print interface provides box 4104 listing request to a local mass storage device into a storage request 
group members , 4106 listing configured services , and box to a remote service . The example process can include acts of 
4108 , for entering destination e - mail addresses . Selection of identifying the file type associated with the download 
4110 sends the item in a print format , in this example a . pdf request , and selecting a service provider based on the 
file . In other examples , different file formats will be dis - 35 identified file type . 
played as part of 4110 ( e . g . word , doc , txt , wpd , xls , etc . ) . in In another example , the executable operation that requests 
some embodiments , file size limitations will be employed on local access to storage on the streamlined device may 
delivery of print format files . FIG . 41B illustrates in greater include a print operation , a save operation , a copy operation , 
detail examples of print 4150 and download interfaces 4152 . a paste operation . Typically the streamlined device is con 
Print and download operations may invoke a progress bar 40 figured to transform save , download , and print operations 
displayed over the current view , with the option of canceling into remote storage operations . According to one embodi 
transmission . ment , a print operation may be streamlined to permit the 

In another embodiment , a streamlined system includes the print operation without an attached printer . According to one 
following features : embodiment , in the absence of an attached printer , a print 
Employs remote mechanisms to access and / or deliver files 45 request generates a print file in response to execution . 
Mechanisms include indentifying a remote action in Conventionally the print file would be stored locally on a 

response to file type computer hard drive . In some embodiments , a streamlined 
Web Content Support for system that does not utilize local device does not employ local mass storage devices such as 
memory for storage hard drives . Such streamlined devices are configured to 

In response to download selection ( i . e . request to locally 50 transform local storage request into remote storage opera 
store content ) display message regarding new function - tions . In one example the print file may be directed to a 
ality ( transfer or remote store ) generic storage provider , and the file stored in the remote 

Maintain user profile associate web service providers memory associated with the generic storage provider . In 
for a particular user another embodiment , the system checks the resulting file 

web services — remote storage , email , photo sharing , cus - 55 size for the print file . If the size of the file exceeds a 
tom web page info , storage accts ( e . g . Drop Box and threshold , then the system may further streamline the opera 
Google Docs ) tion . For example , by providing a link to the file and 

In response to mouse over / selection / hover / indication of transmitting the link to a destination . A link may be trans 
selection display interface to enable remote delivery of mitted through an e - mail instead of transmitting the file 
content / file 60 itself , for example . 

Providing for selection of remote delivery to a domain Another example process may be used in conjunction 
( including home network ) including an act of verifying with 3600 . In one example , a sub - process , 3700 , FIG . 37 , for 
the content / file ' s size does not exceed a threshold value permitting selection of executable operations in online con 

In response to passing site check deliver content / file as tent can be employed . At 3702 , computer focus is resolved 
attachment 65 on an executable operation embedded in online content . 

In response to fail , store in provided remote storage , Executable operations can include download , print , save , 
generate link , and deliver link to content / file transfer , retrieve , get , fget , and generally comprise opera 
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tions that require a large memory block of nonvolatile device profile and user profile to obtain matched services at 
storage , and in particular hard drive space . A streamlined 3904 . Obtaining matched services may include filtering 
computer device includes logic stored in memory and from the available services , or it may include retrieving all 
executed by a processor to analyze a focused executable available services listed in the at least one of a device and 
operation , and at 3704 , the executable operation is analyzed . 5 user profile . In one example , filtering is performed based on 
The logic may include programming to trap download a file type that is the subject of a local access operation , in 
request for example . Once a request is trapped the stream - another example , filtering may be performed to return only 
lined device can determine what action is appropriate based remote services of the current system user , although it is to 
on the type of request . At 3706 , it is determined whether the be appreciated that other filtering operations may be per 
executable operation requires local storage . At 3706 ( No ) 10 formed . Once available services are matched 3904 , with or 
local storage is not required and the executable operation is without filtering , the matched services are displayed to a 
performed at 3708 . At 3706 ( Yes ) it is determined that local system user at 3906 in a user interface . The user interface 
storage is required and the operation is transformed into a permits the user to select from the remote services at 3908 . 
remote access operation at 3710 . Selection may include clicking on a visual indicator shown 

Example process 3600 may include additional sub - pro - 15 in a computer display ( e . g . a check box ) , other options 
cesses and / or individual steps performed in process 3600 include links to the service , other visual indicators may be 
may also comprise other processes . In one example sub used , including drop down boxes and other html , xml , and 
process 3800 , FIG . 38 , for transforming online executable human readable computer displayed forms . In one alterna 
operations associated with local storage into remote storage tive ( not shown ) , if the user does not select a service within 
operations may be employed as part of a larger process , for 20 a predetermined period of time , the system may cancel the 
example , process 3600 . At 3802 , a streamlined computer operation entirely , or alternatively select a default remote 
system identifies a result of an executable operation identi - service automatically . At 3910 , the object of the local access 
fied in a web browser displayed on the system . At 3804 , a file operation is delivered to the remote service . 
type associated with the operation is identified . At 3806 , at Configuring Streamlined Devices 
least one of a device profile and a user profile is accessed , 25 According to one aspect , streamlining user interaction 
to retrieve available services , 3808 , that may be appropriate with computer content includes improving user interfaces 
for the particular file type . Various services for a particular display , permitting configuration of streamlined device ruing 
user may be associated with the device itself , and a plurality operations . Streamlining user interaction may also include 
of users may have access to multiple services or even more providing for the pre - configuration of a streamlined device 
than one account for an individual service . Logic stored in 30 with content customized to a particular user . 
memory and executed by a processor may determine In one embodiment , a potential user may purchase a 
matched services at 3810 by accessing information stored in streamlined device on - line . During an order process , the user 
at least one of a device profile and a user profile . The access may establish an interactive session with an order manage 
information may contain records on available services , their ment system . the order management system may be opera 
access information , and the access information may include 35 tively connected to device management systems , including 
a file type designation for a particular service . for example remote storage space , remote profiles , among 

In one example , executed logic matches a file type asso - other information . The order management system is config 
ciated with the executable operation to a file type associated ured to retrieve information on the potential user during a 
with a remote service 3810 ( YES ) , and in response the purchase session . The potential user is asked for permission 
computer system retrieves access information for that 40 to retrieve information from the computer system on which 
remote service at 3812 , the local access operation can be they are order from . The interactive session may also inquire 
redirected into a remote service operation at 3814 . For if the user is ordering from home and thus their home 
example , the computer system may access the remote ser - computer ) , or form another location . In response to granting 
vice using the obtained access information , and provide an permission , an executable object is downloaded to the 
interface to transmit the object ( data ) of the local access to 45 potential user ' s home computer . The executable object may 
a location within the remote service . In one embodiment , a be encoded use any language , the specific coding language / 
default service may be configured for any streamlined environment is not important rather the operations per 
device . In the absence of matched services at 3810 ( NO ) , the formed by execution of the object on computer hardware is . 
computer system may invoke a default remote service at The executable object mines the home computer of the 
3816 , obtain the default service access information at 3812 50 potential user for web usage information . Web usage infor 
and redirect the local access operation into a remote service mation may include for example , browser history ( IE and 
operation at 3814 . FireFox ) , favorites , stored accounts , bookmarks , access fre 

In another example , process 3800 may be coupled with an quency information . The web usage information is retrieved 
interface display presented to a user of the streamlined from the home computer and processed either by the order 
device . And step 3812 may be used to populate a user 55 management system or a streamlined device management 
interface with a plurality of matched services . The interface system to generate visual representations associated with 
may also display additional information associated with the mappings to computer content . The content that is mapped 
service , for example an account name may be display to to , is determined for example , be determined the most 
permit a user to distinguish between an account s / he set up frequently accessed site for the potential user . In one 
as opposed to another user . The system may permit the user 60 embodiment , web cards are generated for the potential user . 
to designate the remote service appropriate for use in the Each web card is pre - loaded on the device that will be 
interface and step 3814 occurs to redirect the local access shipped upon completion of the order . Further , for the web 
operation into the user selected remote service . cards capable of being display as a channel card — both types 

In another embodiment , an example sub - process , 3900 , may be pre - loaded . Other specialized cards may be gener 
FIG . 39 , for obtaining service access information may be 65 ated and pre - loaded for the user based off of information 
employed to retrieve remote service information . Example obtained from their home computer . For example a book 
process 3900 , includes an act of accessing at least one of a mark card is generated from the retrieved bookmarks — The 
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retrieved bookmarks may be passed through a filter to include generating visual representations that map to ser 
remove bookmarks that have not been accessed in for vices configured on the recipient ' s computer ( online bank 
example 6 months . Although other time periods may be used ing , photo management services , file sharing services , media 
to filter bookmark information . Web cards may also be management services , e - mail providers , etc . ) . The visual 
created from the most frequently access bookmarks . 5 representations may be configured with access information 

Additional information may be mined from the potential including user names and passwords so that a recipient can 
user ' s computer . In particular , communication settings for switch over the streamlined device seamlessly . 
the home computer may be detected . Any wireless commu - Special Purpose Computer 
nication setting may be retrieved and preconfigured . After FIG . 51 shows a block diagram of a computer system 
pre - configuration the streamlined device may be considered 10 5100 in which various aspects of the present invention may 
fully operations out - of - the - box . be practiced . For example , various aspects of the invention 

The interactive session may also be used to supplement may be implemented as specialized software executing in 
any retrieved data , for example , if the executable object one or more computer systems including multiple computer 
detects frequent access to third party providers — Flickr and systems communicating over network . Computer system 
Google Docs for example but cannot detect account name 15 5100 may include a processor 5106 connected to one or 
and other access information , the interactive session may more memory devices 5110 , for storing data . Typically 
query the user to provide the required information . computer system 5100 is implemented without hard drive 

In other embodiments , the user may be sent executable devices . Memory 5110 is typically used for storing programs 
code via an e - mail during or after a purchase . For example , and data during operation of the computer system 5100 , and 
a user not on his / her own computer during the ordering 20 typically comprises Flash memory . Components of com 
process may be sent an e - mail containing an executable file , puter system 5100 may be coupled by an interconnection 
to be run when the user is on their home computer . In mechanism 5108 , which may include one or more busses 
another example , a party may purchase a streamlined device ( e . g . , between components that are integrated within a same 
for another . The purchaser may provide an e - mail address machine ) and / or a network ( e . g . , between components that 
for the intended recipient , who may execute the file to 25 reside on separate discrete machines ) . The interconnection 
transmit customization information for the streamlined mechanism enables communications ( e . g . , data , instruc 
device . tions ) to be exchanged between system components of 

According to one embodiment an example process , 4000 , system 5100 . 
FIG . 40 , for pre - configuring a streamlined device is shown . Computer system 5100 may also include one or more 
Process 4000 , beings at 4002 in response to a request to 30 input 5104 / output ( I / O ) devices 5102 , for example , a key 
purchase a streamlined device . The request is accepted at board , mouse , trackball , microphone , touch screen , a print 
4002 , and in response a management system requests per - ing device , display screen , speaker , etc . Output devices may 
mission to perform a data mining operation on a recipients include video cards and separate video memory for 
computer . Typically the person / entitiy ordering the stream improved processing performance . Storage 5112 , typically 
lined device is the same as the recipient , in which case an 35 includes a computer readable and writeable nonvolatile 
executable file can be transmitted at the same time a online recording medium in which signals are stored that define a 
request to purchase a streamlined device occurs . In one program to be executed by the processor or information 
alternative , the request may be entered offline . During an stored on or in the medium to be processed by the program . 
offline request an e - mail address may be requested and the The medium may , for example , be a flash memory . Typi 
executable file deliver to the recipient ' s email , notifying 40 cally , in operation , the processor causes data to be read from 
him / her of the file and it use to pre - configure their computer . the nonvolatile recording medium into another memory that 
In another alternative , the party ordering the streamlined allows for faster access to the information by the processor 
device intends it for another . When the purchaser and than does the medium . This memory is typically a volatile , 
recipient are different , the e - mail address is requested for the random access memory such as a dynamic random access 
intended recipient . At 4006 ( YES ) , permission is obtained 45 memory ( DRAM ) or static memory ( SRAM ) . 
and the executable file retrieves information associated with Referring again to FIG . 51 , the memory may be located in 
online use of the recipient ' s computer at 4008 . Additional storage 5112 as shown , or in memory system 5110 . The 
information may be collected including configuration processor 5106 generally manipulates the data within the 
options on the recipient ' s computer . System settings such as memory 5110 , and then copies the data to the medium 
network communication configurations may also be 50 associated with storage 5112 after processing is completed . 
retrieved . In one example , wireless network data is retrieve A variety of mechanisms are known for managing data 
to permit the streamlined device to connect immediately to movement between the medium and integrated circuit 
a recipient ' s home network . memory element and the invention is not limited thereto . 

During an order for a streamlined device , demographic The invention is not limited to a particular memory system 
information is collected on the recipient at 4010 . This often 55 or storage system . 
includes at a minimum a name and destination address for a The computer system may include specially - pro 
recipient of a streamlined device . Thus even if permission is grammed , special - purpose hardware , for example , an appli 
not granted 4006 ( NO ) information can be collected to cation - specific integrated circuit ( ASIC ) . Aspects of the 
pre - configured a streamlined device at 4010 , in this case the invention may be implemented in software executing on 
information is constrained to what is provider by the pur - 60 hardware , hardware or firmware , or any combination 
chaser during the transaction . At 4012 , accumulated infor - thereof . Further , such methods , acts , systems , system ele 
mation is used to pre - configure the streamlined device . ments and components thereof may be implemented as part 
Pre - configuration includes establishing wireless network of the computer system described above or as an indepen 
settings for the streamlined device , and may include gener dent component . 
ating visual representations of online content that are 65 Although computer system 5100 is shown by way of 
mapped to for example the most frequently accessed sites on example as one type of computer system upon which various 
the recipient ' s home computer . Other configuration can aspects of the invention may be practiced , it should be 
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appreciated that aspects of the invention are not limited to 52A ) may be made smaller than the angle 134b when the 
being implemented on the computer system as shown in user is closer to the portable computer ( FIG . 52B ) . As 
FIG . 51 . Various aspects of the invention may be practiced discussed above , in one example , the orientation sensor ( not 
on one or more computers having a different architectures or shown ) may be used to detect , either approximately or 
components that that shown in FIG . 51 . 5 precisely , the angle 134 and to provide the information to the 

Computer system 5100 may programmable using a high - computer operating system . 
level computer programming language . Computer system Referring to FIGS . 53A and 53B , there is illustrated a 
5100 may be also implemented using specially programmed , portion of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge 
special purpose hardware . In computer system 5100 , pro - assembly 138 that allows the portable computer to be 
cessor 5106 is typically a commercially available processor 10 configured into either the laptop mode ( FIG . 53A ) or the 
such as the well - known Pentium class processor available easel mode ( FIG . 53B ) , according to aspects of the inven 
from the Intel Corporation . Many other processors are tion . According to one embodiment , the hinge assembly 138 
available , including multi - core processors . Such a processor accommodates 0 - 320 degrees of rotation , allowing a mini 
usually executes an operating system which may be , for mum angle 134 ( see e . g . FIG . 52C ) of 40 degrees . However , 
example , the Windows - based operating systems ( e . g . , Win - 15 it is to be appreciated that the hinge assembly 138 may allow 
dows Vista , Windows NT , Windows 2000 ( Windows ME ) , greater or fewer degrees of rotation , provided only that 
Windows XP operating systems ) available from the Micro - sufficient rotation is allowed so as to configure the portable 
soft Corporation , MAC OS System X operating system computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the easel mode . 
available from Apple Computer , one or more of the Linux - As discussed above , in one embodiment the portable com 
based operating system distributions ( e . g . , the Enterprise 20 puter 100 includes an orientation sensor ( not shown ) that is 
Linux operating system available from Red Hat Inc . ) , the configured to detect a relative orientation of the display 
Solaris operating system available from Sun Microsystems , component 102 and the base component 104 . In one 
or UNIX operating systems available from various sources . example , the orientation sensor may be an accelerometer 
Many other operating systems may be used , and the inven incorporated into the base component 104 , as discussed 
tion is not limited to any particular operating system . 25 above . Alternatively , the orientation sensor may be incor 

The processor and operating system together define a porated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be used to 
computer platform for which application programs in high detect movement of the hinge assembly , and to translate that 
level programming languages are written . It should be movement into an information about the relative orientation 
understood that the invention is not limited to a particular of the display component 102 and the base component 104 
computer system platform , processor , operating system , or 30 ( for example , a size of the angle 134 ) . It is also to be 
network . Also , it should be apparent to those skilled in the appreciated that the orientation sensor may include elec 
art that the present invention is not limited to a specific tronic or mechanical components , or a combination thereof . 
programming language or computer system . Further , it For example , the hinge assembly may be provide with 
should be appreciated that other appropriate programming detents that provide an indication of the mode of the portable 
languages and other appropriate computer systems could 35 computer . 
also be used . As discussed above , and also illustrated in FIGS . 53A and 
One or more portions of the computer system may be 53B , the portable computer may also comprise a scroll 

distributed across one or more computer systems coupled to wheel 132 that allows a user to adjust , control and / or select 
a communications network . For example , various aspects of various aspects of the portable computer ( e . g . , wireless 
the invention may be distributed among one or more com - 40 capability or speaker volume ) or items displayed on the 
puter systems ( e . g . , servers ) configured to provide a service display screen 110 . A housing 160 may contain or support 
to one or more client computers , or to perform an overall various mechanical and / or electronic components ( not 
task as part of a distributed system . For example , various shown ) that are coupled to the scroll wheel 132 and are 
aspects of the invention may be performed on a client - server configured to convert physical movement of the scroll wheel 
or multi - tier system that includes components distributed 45 into electrical signals . These electrical signals may be pro 
among one or more server systems that perform various vided to the central processing unit of the portable computer 
functions according to various embodiments of the inven - 100 which processes the electrical signals so as to translate 
tion . In one embodiment , the Litl cloud is maintained on movement of the scroll wheel into control of a selected 
server systems accessible from a plurality of devices . These feature , for example , adjusting the volume of the speaker ( s ) 
components may be executable , intermediate ( e . g . , IL ) or 50 or selecting a particular item displayed on the display screen . 
interpreted ( e . g . , Java ) code which communicate over a Having thus described several aspects of at least one 
communication network ( e . g . , the Internet ) using a commu - embodiment , it is to be appreciated various alterations , 
nication protocol ( e . g . , TCP / IP ) . modifications , and improvements will readily occur to those 

It should be appreciated that the invention is not limited skilled in the art . Such alterations , modifications , and 
to executing on any particular system or group of systems . 55 improvements are intended to be part of this disclosure and 
Also , it should be appreciated that the invention is not are intended to be within the scope of the invention . Accord 
limited to any particular distributed architecture , network , or ingly , the foregoing description and drawings are by way of 
communication protocol . example only , and the scope of the invention should be 

Physical Configurations determined from proper construction of the appended 
Referring to FIG . 52C , when the portable computer 100 is 60 claims , and their equivalents . 

in the easel mode , the base is disposed at an angle 134 to the 
display component . This angle 134 is adjustable , for The invention claimed is : 
example , to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display 1 . A customized user interface to display computer con 
screen to be maintained for different positions of a user 136 tent on a display component of a computer system including 
and of the portable computer 100 , as illustrated in FIGS . 65 a keyboard , the user interface comprising : 
52A , 52B and 52C . For example , when the user 136 is at least one processor operatively connected to a memory 
further from the portable computer , the angle 134a ( FIG . of the computer system ; 
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a graphical user interface , executing on the at least one pages in response to a display threshold establishing a 
processor , configured to display the computer content maximal number of visual representations displayed per 
on the display component of the computer system , the display page . 
graphical user interface configured to : 11 . The user interface of claim 10 , wherein the home view 
display a plurality of views of a plurality of visual 5 further comprises an indication of visual representations 

representations of computer content , wherein the displayed on adjacent display pages of the home view , 
computer content includes at least one of selectable wherein the indication is displayed within the body of the 
digital content , selectable computer operations and home view . 
passive digital content ; 12 . The user interface of claim 4 , wherein the graphical 

an execution component , executing on the at least one 10 user interface is further configured to display a nascent card 
processor , configured to : in the home view , wherein the nascent card is configured to 
detect a current computer system configuration from at permit generation of additional visual representations of 

least a first computer system configuration where the digital content . 
keyboard is operable to receive input from an opera - 13 . The user interface of claim 12 , wherein the execution 
tor of the computer system to control the computer 15 component is further configured to execute a process for 
system and a second computer system configuration creating a visual representation in response to execution of 
where the keyboard is inoperable to receive input the nascent card , wherein the process for creating a visual 
from the operator of the computer system to control representation includes acts of : 
the computer system ; transitioning to a quick access view ; 

select one of the plurality of views for display on the 20 generating a mapping to online digital content ; 
computer system in response to the detected current executing the mapping ; and 
computer system configuration , and displaying a first view of the mapped digital content . 

transition the display component to the selected one of 14 . The user interface of claim 1 , wherein the plurality of 
the plurality of views . views includes a quick access view configured to permit user 

2 . The user interface of claim 1 , wherein in the plurality 25 generation of a mapping between digital content and a visual 
of views includes a home view configured to organize a representation . 
plurality of content modes and a channel view configured to 15 . The user interface of claim 1 , wherein the plurality of 
organize at least one of a single content mode and two views includes a channel view including a channel selector 
content modes . that displays a sequence of visual representations . 

3 . The user interface of claim 1 , wherein the plurality of 30 16 . The user interface of claim 15 , wherein the execution 
views includes a screen saver view configured to organize component is further configured to transition the computer 
selected content modes for passive viewing . system to the channel view in response to receiving user 

4 . The user interface of claim 1 , wherein the plurality of input via at least one input device integral to or operatively 
views includes a home view organizing a plurality of visual connected with the computer system . 
representations of digital content , wherein the home view 35 17 . A customized user interface to display computer 
comprises a header display and a body display , and wherein content on a display component of a computer system 
the header display comprises a lateral frame extending from including a keyboard , the user interface comprising : 
the left of the display component to the right of the display at least one processor operatively coupled to a memory of 
component , wherein the body display is rendered below the the computer system ; 
header display in the display component of the computer 40 a graphical user interface , executing on at least one 
system . processor , configured to display a plurality of views of 

5 . The user interface of claim 4 , wherein the computer a plurality of visual representations of the computer 
system configuration comprises a physical positioning of a content ; 
computer system display relative to a base of the computer an execution component , executing on the at least one 
system that includes the keyboard about a longitudinal axis 45 processor , configured to : 
of rotation . identify at least a first computer system configuration 

6 . The user interface of claim 4 , wherein the graphical where the keyboard is operable to receive input from 
user interface is further configured to display a search tool an operator of the computer system to control the 
displayed in the header display , wherein the search tool is computer system and a second computer system 
configured to accept search terms entered by a user and in 50 configuration where the keyboard is inoperable to 
response to execution , causes the computer system to navi receive input from the operator of the computer 
gate to a view of a first visual representation of digital system to control the computer system based on 
content , wherein the digital content includes a search engine , sensor input indicating a position of the display 
and the search engine presents results for the search terms . component ; 

7 . The user interface of claim 1 , further comprising a 55 select , responsive to the sensor input , a first content 
storage component configured to retain a previous view view from the plurality of views for the first com 
state . puter system configuration ; 

8 . The user interface of claim 7 , wherein the execution transition , automatically in response to the sensor input , 
component is further configured to cause the computer the display component between at least the first 
system to transition to a previous view in response to 60 content view of the plurality of views and a second 
execution of a navigation element by a user . content view of the plurality of views ; 

9 . The user interface of claim 7 , further comprising the receive user input via at least one input device integral 
navigation element displayed in a header display . to or operatively connected with the computer sys 

10 . The user interface of claim 4 , wherein the body tem ; and 
display comprises an organization of the plurality of visual 65 transition , automatically in response to receiving the 
representations of computer content rendered on the com user input , the display component from one of the 
puter display , and the home view further comprises display first content view and the second content view to a 
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channel view including a channel selector that dis display a plurality of views of a plurality of visual 
plays a sequence of visual representations . representations of computer content , wherein the 

18 . The user interface of claim 17 , wherein the at least one computer content includes at least one of selectable 
input device includes at least one of a scroll wheel , a digital content , selectable computer operations and 
touchpad , and a mouse . passive digital content ; 

19 . The user interface of claim 1 , wherein the first mode an execution component , executing on the at least one 
processor , configured to : 

is a laptop mode where the keyboard is oriented to be detect a current computer system configuration from at 
accessible to the operator and wherein the second mode is an least a first computer system configuration where the 
easel mode or a frame mode where the keyboard is oriented keyboard is positioned to receive input from an 
to be inaccessible to the operator . operator of the computer system and a second com 

20 . A customized user interface to display computer puter system configuration where the keyboard is not 
content on a display component of a computer system positioned to receive input from the operator of the 
including a keyboard , the user interface comprising : computer system ; 

at least one processor operatively connected to a memory 15 select one of the plurality of views for display on the 
of the computer system ; computer system in response to the detected current 

a graphical user interface , executing on the at least one computer system configuration , and 
processor , configured to display the computer content transition the display component to the selected one of 
on the display component of the computer system , the the plurality of views . 
graphical user interface configured to : * * * * * 
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SYSTEM AND METHOD FOR Internet , often referred to as Web 2.0 , also subscribes to 
STREAMLINING USER INTERACTION conventional thinking in that more and more features are 

WITH ELECTRONIC CONTENT being packed into each and every aspect of the web expe 
rience . Third party service providers can be found for almost 

RELATED APPLICATIONS any service_virtually no limitations have been found for 
the services that can be provided . 

This Application is a continuation of , and claims priority More typically , these on - line services provide very useful 
under 35 U.S.C. § 120 to , U.S. application Ser . No. 14/680 , opportunities for the users who know how to take advantage 
422 , entitled “ SYSTEM AND METHOD FOR STREAM of them online photo management / sharing , online finan 
LINING USER INTERACTION WITH ELECTRONIC 10 cial services , online marketplaces , online exchanges , web 
CONTENT ” filed on Apr. 7 , 2015 , which is a continuation hosting , web development , dating services , social network 
of , and claims priority under 35 U.S.C. § 120 to , U.S. patent ing to name only a few . Very often these on - line services can 
application Ser . No. 12 / 416,496 entitled “ SYSTEM AND be found for free or minimal costs . Typically , registration is 
METHOD FOR STREAMLINING USER INTERACTION the only requirement for participating in what is offered as 
WITH ELECTRONIC CONTENT , ” filed on Apr. 1 , 2009 , 15 free services . In other words , all that is required is the 
which is a continuation - in - part of , and claims priority under creation of a user name and password . Each service often 
35 U.S.C. § 120 to , U.S. patent application Ser . No. 12/170 , attempts to outdo competitors by offering more and more 
951 entitled “ PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE options / features than their competitors . 
DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS , ” filed on Jul . 10 , 2008 , 
which claims priority under 35 U.S.C. § 119 ( e ) to U.S. 20 SUMMARY 
Provisional Application Ser . No. 61 / 041,365 , entitled “ POR 
TABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CON It is realized that the conventional wisdom with respect to 
FIGURATIO 5 , " filed Apr. 1 , 2008 , each of which is such " feature packing ” as discussed above suffers from 
hereby incorporated herein by reference in its entirety . U.S. significant flaws . Typical computer users simply can't take 
patent application Ser . No. 12 / 416,496 is also a continua- 25 advantage of all the functionality offered , either the services 
tion - in - part of , and claims priority under 35 U.S.C. § 120 to and features offered by their own computer , or the services 
U.S. patent application Ser . No. 12 / 170,939 , entitled “ POR and features offered by online providers . The complexity of 
TABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CON the interface ( both hardware and software ) hampers adop 
FIGURATIONS , ” filed on Jul . 10 , 2008 , which claims tion , as does the volume of features offered . For example , 
priority under 35 U.S.C. 119 ( e ) to U.S. Provisional Appli- 30 third party service provides often find difficulty in subscrib 
cation Ser . No. 61 / 041,365 , entitled “ PORTABLE COM ing new users , educating existing users , and providing 
PUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA integration of feature sets for the features they provide as 
TIONS , ” filed Apr. 1 , 2008 , each of which is hereby well as those offered by other service providers . 
incorporated herein by reference in its entirety . In addition , Further complicating the user's interaction with computer 
U.S. patent application Ser . No. 12 / 416,496 also claims 35 devices and provided services is the inflexibility of the 
priority under 35 U.S.C. 119 ( e ) to U.S. Provisional Appli devices being used and their accompanying interfaces . It is 
cation Ser . No. 61 / 041,365 , entitled “ PORTABLE COM realized that a device that can provide a user with a flexible 
PUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA portal into electronic content , that is , one that can be 
TIONS , ” filed Apr. 1 , 2008 , which is hereby incorporated configured dynamically improves the user experience . For 
herein by reference in its entirety . 40 example , permitting transitions from a “ lean back ” mode of 

viewing ( imagine , for example , a person watching television 
BACKGROUND from their couch ) to a “ lean forward ” mode of viewing 

( picture , for example , a laptop user typing away in a word 
Much of the advancement in contemporary computer processing application ) on a computer device improves the 

systems and services stems from the significant increases in 45 user experience . Further , user interfaces that are responsive 
computing power . Hand in hand with those increases , to the user's dynamic configurations improve the user's 
enhanced features sets have developed designed to utilize ability to interact with the electronic content , from the 
that computing power . Conventional wisdom suggests that machine itself , the internet , and even from both sources . 
the more features that can be provided to a particular Accordingly , aspects and embodiments are directed to a 
computer user , the better the user's experience will be . 50 graphical user interface that organizes interface elements 

As computers have become more powerful and capable of into modes of content for presentation to a user . Different 
providing more and more features , ordinary / typical com views of the modes of content are used to present the user 
puter users has not been able to keep up with availability of with an interface that is responsive to configurations of the 
features and services . User may become frustrated by the device and responsive to activity being performed by the 
inability to navigate the myriad ( sometime unending ) con- 55 user . Further the elements that comprise the graphical user 
figurations and options provided in order to achieve some interface are configured to present a summarized view of 
thing useful and / or workable to their ordinary use . Many available actions and content , in order to simplify user 
users simply don't take advantage of provided features . interaction . The different views present different organiza 
Some outright ignore options and features that would sim tions of the interface elements and in some example display 
plify the use of their computer system . This may occur 60 only certain ones of the modes of content in order to reduce 
because of user ignorance or even fear and in some instances the number of options a user must navigate to accomplish an 
because the user lacks experience with new features objective . 
user doesn't know the feature can be useful . According to one aspect of the present invention , a 
User frustration is felt not only with respect to the newer customized user interface for a computer system with a 

more powerful computer systems being offered today , but 65 plurality selectable I / O profiles configured to present com 
also frustration abounds with respect to their computer's puter operations to a user in a format configured to a selected 
interaction with the Internet . The present movement on the I / O profile is provided . The user interface comprises a map 

so the 
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based graphical user interface displayed on the computer connect content mode is configured to display computer 
system , the map based user interface comprising a plurality configuration operations for viewing by a user . According to 
of views of a plurality of visual representations of computer another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of modes 
content , wherein the computer content includes at least one of content include an application content mode , wherein the 
of selectable digital content , selectable computer operations 5 application content mode is configured to display computer 
and passive digital content , and the plurality of visual applications for use by a user . According to another embodi 
representations of computer content rendered on the com ment of the invention , in the plurality of views includes a 
puter display , wherein the plurality of visual representations home view configured to organize a plurality of content 
of computer content include an association to a first view of modes . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
the plurality of views , the first view including the computer 10 the plurality of views includes a channel view configured to 
content , and wherein the each of the plurality of visual organize a single content mode . According to another 
representations is responsive to focus and execution , embodiment of the invention , the plurality of views includes 
wherein execution includes clicking on the visual represen a channel view configured to organize dual content modes . 
tation , and an execution component comprising at least one According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
computer hardware element configured to transition the 15 plurality of modes of content include a passive content 
computer system display between the plurality of views , mode , wherein the passive content mode is configured to 
wherein the execution component further comprises a view display web based content for non - proximal viewing with 
selector component configured to select one of the plurality out user interaction . 
of views for display on a computer system in response to a According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
computer system configuration . According to one embodi- 20 the plurality of modes of content include a passive content 
ment of the present invention , the execution component is mode , wherein the passive content mode is optimized to 
further configured to transition between the plurality of display web based content for non - proximal viewing with 
views in response to execution of at least one of a computer out user interaction . According to another embodiment of 
system operation , a visual representation , a computer system the invention , the plurality of views includes a screen saver 
configuration , and a change in computer system configura- 25 view configured to organize selected content modes for 
tion . According to another embodiment of the invention , the passive viewing . According to another embodiment of the 
user interface further comprises a plurality of modes of invention , the plurality of views further comprise a first 
content for the computer content rendered on the computer layer , wherein the first layer organizes computer operations , 
display . including navigation operations , into groups based on simi 

According to one aspect of the present invention , the 30 lar functional operation . According to another embodiment 
plurality of views are configured to organize modes of of the invention , the first layer maps to groupings of lower 
content into different views . According to another embodi level functionality . According to another embodiment of the 
ment of the invention , the plurality of modes of content invention , the first layer include navigation operations maps 
comprise at least one of a web content mode , a channel to a seconding layer comprising computer operations for 
content mode , a media content mode , an application content 35 interacting with computer content . According to another 
mode , a communication content mode , and a passive content embodiment of the invention , levels of computer functions 
mode . According to another embodiment of the invention , are segregated based on proximity of the operation to a 
the plurality of modes of content include a web content source of digital content , higher levels including operations 
mode , wherein the web content mode is configured to that navigate to lower level operations that permit interac 
display web based content for proximal viewing by a user . 40 tion with computer content . 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
plurality of modes of content include a channel content the first layer comprises a home view and a channel view , 
mode , wherein the channel content mode is configured to and the first layer is further configured to organize and 
display web based content for non - proximal viewing by a simplify access to lower level functions . According to 
user . According to another embodiment of the invention , the 45 another embodiment of the invention , the visual represen 
plurality of modes of content include a media content mode , tations comprise a lower layer relative to the first layer and 
wherein the media content mode is configured to display include lower level functions . According to another embodi 
media based content for non - proximal viewing by a user ment of the invention , the plurality of views includes a home 
mode . According to another embodiment of the invention , view organizing a plurality of visual representations of 
the plurality of modes of content include a web content 50 digital content , wherein the home view is displayed respon 
mode , wherein the web content mode is optimized to display sive to a computer system configuration . According to 
web based content for proximal viewing by a user . Accord another embodiment of the invention , the computer system 
ing to another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of configuration comprises a physical positioning of the com 
modes of content include a channel content mode , wherein puter system about a longitudinal axis of rotation . According 
the channel content mode is optimized to display web based 55 to another embodiment of the invention , the computer 
content for non - proximal viewing by a user . According to system configuration further comprises a physical position 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of modes ing of a computer system display relative to a base of the 
of content include a media content mode , wherein the media computer system . According to another embodiment of the 
content mode is optimized to display media based content invention , the home view comprises a header display and a 
for non - proximal viewing by a user mode . 60 body display . According to another embodiment of the 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , invention , the header display comprises a lateral bar extend 
the media based content includes at least one of digital ing from the left of the computer display screen to the right 
photos , digital audio files , and digital video files . According of the computer display screen . According to another 
to another embodiment of the invention , the media based embodiment of the invention , the user interface further 
content is accessed through a remote service . According to 65 comprises a search tool displayed in the header display , 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of modes wherein the search tool is configured to accept search terms 
of content include a connect content mode , wherein the entered by a user and in response to execution , causes the 
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computer system to navigate to a view of a first visual channel selector comprises a display of a sequence of visual 
representation of digital content , wherein the digital content representations presenting a channel content mode . Accord 
includes a search engine , and the search engine presents ing to another embodiment of the invention , the display of 
results for the search terms . the sequence of visual representations is responsive to 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , 5 manipulation of the integrated scroll wheel , and manipula 
the user interface further comprises a storage component tion of the integrated scroll wheel causes the computer 
configured to retain a previous view state . According to system to render a next visual representation in the display 
another embodiment of the invention , the execution com of the sequence of visual representations . According to 
ponent is further configured to cause the computer system to another embodiment of the invention , the visual represen 
transition to a previous view in response to execution of a 10 tations are responsive to execution by a selector , including 
navigation element by a user . According to another embodi a button . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
ment of the invention , the user interface further comprises a the button is available in a plurality of computer system 
navigation element disposed in the header display . Accord configurations . According to another embodiment of the 
ing to another embodiment of the invention , the body invention , the execution component is further configured to 
display is rendered below the header display in the display 15 cause the computer system to transition to the first view 
screen of the computer system . According to another including the digital content in response to execution of the 
embodiment of the invention , the body comprises an orga selector by a user . According to another embodiment of the 
nization of the plurality of visual representations of com invention , the user interface further comprises a storage 
puter content rendered on the computer display . According component configured to retain a current computer system 
to another embodiment of the invention , the user interface 20 configuration state . 
further comprises a display threshold for a screen rendered According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
in the computer display . According to another embodiment the storage component is further configured to retain a 
of the invention , the home view is configured into pages current view state . According to another embodiment of the 
based on the display of the computer system and the display invention , the execution component is further configured to 
threshold . According to another embodiment of the inven- 25 transition the computer system display between the plurality 
tion , the display threshold establishes a maximum number of of views , responsive to at least one of the current computer 
visual representations display per page of the home view . system configuration state and the current view state . 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the user According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
interface further comprises an indication of visual represen execution component is configured to transition to a channel 
tations displayed on adjacent pages of the home view , 30 view in response to manipulation of an integrated scroll 
wherein the indication is display within the body of the wheel , when the computer system is in a laptop and an easel 
home view . configuration . According to another embodiment of the 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , invention , the user interface further comprises a scroll wheel 
the user interface further comprises a nascent card displayed threshold configured to require additional manipulations of 
in the body of the home view , wherein the nascent card is 35 the integrated scroll in order to cause the transition to the 
configured to permit generation of additional visual repre channel view , when the current computer system configu 
sentations of digital content . According to another embodi ration state indicates the computer system is in a laptop 
ment of the invention , the execution component is further configuration . According to another embodiment of the 
configured to execute a process for creating a visual repre invention , the execution component is further configured to 
sentation in response to execution of the nascent card , 40 transition from the first view and a home view to a channel 
wherein the process for creating a visual representation view in response to a change in computer system configu 
includes acts of transitioning to a quick access view , gen ration state from laptop to easel . 
erating a mapping to online digital content , executing the According to another embodiment , the interface discussed 
mapping , and displaying a first view of the mapped digital above is displayed on a portable computer configurable 
content . According to another embodiment of the invention , 45 between a plurality of display modes including a closed 
the user interface further comprises a quick access view , mode , a laptop mode and an easel mode . The portable 
wherein the quick access view is configured to permit user computer further comprises a display component including 
generation of a mapping between digital content and a visual a display screen , a base , a hinge assembly at least partially 
representation . According to another embodiment of the housed within the base and configured to pivotably couple 
invention , the quick access view permits a user to select 50 the display component to the base , wherein the display 
from a display of frequently accessed web content to gen component is rotatable about a longitudinal axis running 
erate the mapping . According to another embodiment of the along an interface between the display component and the 
invention , the quick access view permits a user to select base , wherein , in the closed mode , the display screen is 
from a display of stored bookmarks to generate the mapping . disposed substantially against the base , wherein rotating the 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the 55 display component about the longitudinal axis up to approxi 
quick access view permits a user to enter a url to generate the mately 180 degrees from the closed mode configures the 
mapping . According to another embodiment of the inven portable computer into the laptop mode , and wherein rotat 
tion , the plurality of views includes a channel view , and the ing the display component about the longitudinal axis 
view selector component is further responsive to an inte beyond approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode 
grated scroll wheel on the computer system . According to 60 configures the portable computer into the easel mode . 
another embodiment of the invention , the view selector According to one aspect of the present invention , a 
component is further configured to transition the computer method for presenting a customized user interface for a 
system to the channel view in response to manipulation of computer system with a plurality selectable I / O profiles to a 
the integrated scroll wheel . user is provided . The method comprises displaying a a map 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , 65 based graphical user interface on the computer system , the 
the channel view further comprises a channel selector . act of displaying the map based user interface includes acts 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the of displaying a plurality of views of a plurality of visual 
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representations of computer content , wherein the computer invention , the computer system configuration comprises a 
content includes at least one of selectable digital content , physical positioning of the computer system display relative 
selectable computer operations and passive digital content , to a base of the computer system about a longitudinal axis 
and displaying the plurality of visual representations of of rotation . According to another embodiment of the inven 
computer content rendered on the computer display , wherein 5 tion , the method further comprises displaying a search tool 
the plurality of visual representations of computer content in the header display , accepting entry of search terms 
include an association to a first view of the plurality of through an I / O device , navigating to a view of a first visual 
views , the first view including the computer content , and representation of computer content , wherein the computer 
wherein the each of the plurality of visual representations is content includes a search engine , and the search engine 
responsive to focus and execution , wherein execution 10 presents results for the search terms , in response to an act of 
includes clicking on the visual representation , and execut executing the search tool . According to another embodiment 
ing , by a computer processor , a transition in the computer of the invention , the method further comprises an act of 
system display between the plurality of views , wherein the storing in a computer memory a previous view state . 
act of executing includes an act of selecting one of the According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
plurality of views for display on a computer system in 15 method further comprises acts of displaying a navigation 
response to a computer system configuration . According to element in the header display , permitting execution of the 
one embodiment of the present invention , the act of execut navigation element by a user , and transitioning the computer 
ing occurs in response to an act of permitting execution of system display to a previous view , in response to the act of 
at least one of a computer system operation , a visual permitting 
representation , a computer system configuration , and a 20 According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
change in computer system configuration . According to the home view further comprises at least one display page 
another embodiment of the invention , the method further and the method further comprising acts of displaying the 
comprises an act of displaying a plurality of modes of plurality of visual representations of computer content ren 
content for the computer content on the computer display , dered on the computer display in the body display , and 
wherein the plurality of modes of content comprise at least 25 displaying a maximal number of visual representations in a 
one of a web content mode , a channel content mode , a media display page of the home view . According to another 
content mode , an application content mode , a communica embodiment of the invention , the method further comprises 
tion content mode , and a passive content mode . displaying an indication of visual representations displayed 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , on adjacent display pages in the home view , wherein the 
the plurality of views are configured to organize modes of 30 indication is displayed within the body of the home view . 
content into different views . According to another embodi According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
ment of the invention , the web content mode is configured method further comprises acts of displaying a nascent card 
to display web based content for proximal viewing by a user , in the body of the home view , permitting execution func 
wherein the channel content mode is configured to display tionality associated with the nascent card , and generating an 
web based content for non - proximal viewing by a user , 35 additional visual representations of digital content in 
wherein the media content mode is configured to display response to execution of the functionality associated with 
media based content for non - proximal viewing by a user the nascent card . According to another embodiment of the 
mode , wherein the application content mode is configured to invention , the method further comprising act of executing a 
display computer applications for use by a user , wherein the process for creating a visual representation in response to 
communication content mode is configured to display com- 40 execution of the functionality associated with nascent card , 
puter configuration operations for viewing by a user , and wherein the process for creating a visual representation 
wherein the passive content mode is configured to display includes acts of transitioning to a quick access view , gen 
web based content for non - proximal viewing without user erating a mapping to online digital content , executing the 
interaction . According to another embodiment of the inven mapping , and displaying a first view of the mapped digital 
tion , in the plurality of views includes a home view and a 45 content . 
channel view , and the method further comprises acts of According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
organizing a plurality of content modes into the home view ; the method further comprises acts of displaying a quick 
and organizing at least one of a single content mode and a access view , permitting a user to select a source of digital 
two content modes into the channel view . According to content in the quick access view , and generating a mapping 
another embodiment of the invention , the plurality of views 50 between the source of digital content and a visual represen 
includes a screen saver view , and the method further com tation in response to an act of selecting a source of digital 
prises an act of organizing selected content modes for content . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
passive viewing in the screen saver view . the plurality of views includes a channel view , and the act of 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , executing a transition occurs in response an act of activating 
the plurality of views includes a home view , and the method 55 an integrated scroll wheel on the computer system . Accord 
further comprises organizing a plurality of visual represen ing to another embodiment of the invention , the method 
tations of digital content into the home view , wherein the further comprises an act of displaying a channel selector 
home view is displayed responsive to a computer system including an act of displaying a sequence of visual repre 
configuration , displaying the home view in response to a sentations . According to another embodiment of the inven 
compute system configuration , wherein the act of displaying 60 tion , the act of displaying the sequence of visual represen 
the home view includes an act of displaying a header display tations is responsive to manipulation of the integrated scroll 
and a body display in the home view , wherein the header wheel , and the method further comprises and act of display 
display comprises a lateral frame extending from the left of ing a next visual representation from the sequence of visual 
the computer display screen to the right of the computer representations , in response to manipulation of the inte 
display screen , and wherein the body display is rendered 65 grated scroll wheel . According to another embodiment of the 
below the header display in the display screen of the invention , the method further comprises an act of storing in 
computer system . According to another embodiment of the a computer memory a current computer system configura 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 420 of 521 PageID #: 526



US 10,564,818 B2 
9 10 

tion state and a current view state . According to another display computer applications for use by a user , wherein the 
embodiment of the invention , the act of executing , by a communication content mode is configured to display com 
computer processor , a transition in the computer system puter configuration operations for viewing by a user , and 
display the execution component , includes an act of transi wherein the passive content mode is configured to display 
tioning the computer system display between the plurality of 5 web based content for non - proximal viewing without user 
views , responsive to at least one of the current computer interaction . 
system configuration state and the current view state . According to one embodiment of the present invention , 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , the first user interface component is further configured to 
the transition occurs to a channel view in response to display a home view configured to organize a plurality of 
manipulation of an integrated scroll wheel , when the com- 10 content modes , and a channel view configured to organize at 
puter system is in a laptop and an easel configuration . least one of a single content mode and two content modes . 
According to another embodiment of the invention , the According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
transition occurs from at least one of the first view and a plurality of views includes a screen saver view configured to 
home view to a channel view in response to a change in organize selected content modes for passive viewing . 
computer system configuration state from laptop to easel . 15 According to another embodiment of the invention , the first 

According to one aspect of the present invention , a user interface component is further configured to display a 
computer - readable medium having computer - readable sig home view organizing a plurality of visual representations of 
nals stored thereon that define instructions that , as a result of digital content , wherein the home view comprises a header 
being executed by a computer , instruct the computer to display and a body display , and wherein the header display 
perform the method for presenting a customized user inter- 20 comprises a lateral frame extending from the left of the 
face for a computer system with a plurality selectable I / O computer display screen to the right of the computer display 
profiles to a user as described above is provided . screen , wherein the body display is rendered below the 

According to one aspect of the present invention , a system header display in the display screen of the computer system . 
for presenting a customized user interface for a system with According to another embodiment of the invention , the 
a plurality selectable I / O profiles is provided . The system 25 system is configured to permit selection of a computer 
comprises a first user interface component configured to system configuration , and the computer system configura 
display a plurality of views of a plurality of visual repre tion comprises a physical positioning of the computer sys 
sentations of computer content , wherein the computer con tem display relative to a base of the computer system about 
tent includes at least one of selectable digital content , a longitudinal axis of rotation . According to another embodi 
selectable computer operations and passive digital content , 30 ment of the invention , the first user interface component is 
a second user interface component configured to display the further configured to display a search tool in the header 
plurality of visual representations of computer content on display , wherein the search tool is configured to accept 
the computer display , wherein the plurality of visual repre search terms entered by a user , and wherein the execution 
sentations of computer content include an association to a component is further configured to causes the computer 
first view of the plurality of views , the first view including 35 system to navigate to a view of a first visual representation 
the computer content , and wherein the each of the plurality of digital content , wherein the digital content includes a 
of visual representations is responsive to focus and execu search engine , and the search engine presents results for the 
tion , wherein execution includes clicking on the visual search terms in response to execution of the search tool . 
representation , and an execution component configured to According to one embodiment of the present invention , 
execute a transition in the computer system display between 40 the system further comprises a storage component config 
the plurality of views , wherein the execution component ured to retain a previous view state . According to another 
further comprises a view selector component act configured embodiment of the invention , the execution component is 
to select one of the plurality of views for display on a further configured to cause the computer system to transition 
computer system in response to a computer system configu to a previous view in response to execution of a navigation 
ration . According to one embodiment of the present inven- 45 element by a user . According to another embodiment of the 
tion , the execution component is further configured to tran invention , the first user interface component further com 
sition between the plurality of views in response to prises a display of the navigation element in the header 
execution of at least one of a computer system operation , a display . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
visual representation , a computer system configuration , and the body display comprises an organization of the plurality 
a change in computer system configuration . According to 50 of visual representations of computer content rendered on 
another embodiment of the invention , the second user inter the computer display , and the home view further comprises 
face component is further configured to display a plurality of display pages in response to a display threshold establishing 
modes of content for the computer content rendered on the a maximal number of visual representations displayed per 
computer display , wherein the plurality of modes of content display page . According to another embodiment of the 
comprise at least one of a web content mode , a channel 55 invention , the home view further comprises an indication of 
content mode , a media content mode , an application content visual representations displayed on adjacent display pages of 
mode , a communication content mode , and a passive content the home view , wherein the indication is displayed within 
mode . According to another embodiment of the invention , the body of the home view . According to another embodi 
the plurality of views are configured to organize modes of ment of the invention , the second user interface component 
content into different views . According to another embodi- 60 further comprises a nascent card displayed in the body of the 
ment of the invention , the web content mode is configured home view , wherein the nascent card is configured to permit 
to display web based content for proximal viewing by a user , generation of additional visual representations of digital 
wherein the channel content mode is configured to display content . According to another embodiment of the invention , 
web based content for non - proximal viewing by a user , the execution component is further configured to execute a 
wherein the media content mode is configured to display 65 process for creating a visual representation in response to 
media based content for non - proximal viewing by a user execution of the nascent card , wherein the process for 
mode , wherein the application content mode is configured to creating a visual representation includes acts of transitioning 
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to a quick access view , generating a mapping to online computer , or may be configurable responsive to a user input . 
digital content , executing the mapping , and displaying a first The portable computer may further comprise a mode sensor 
view of the mapped digital content . which detects a current display mode of the portable com 

According to one embodiment of the present invention , puter , and the display orientation module may display con 
the first user interface component further comprises a quick 5 tent on the display screen in an orientation dependent on the 
access view , wherein the quick access view is configured to current display mode detected by the mode sensor . Depend 
permit user generation of a mapping between digital content ing on the hinge assembly used , the longitudinal axis may 
and a visual representation . According to another embodi comprises multiple parallel axes , and the hinge assembly 
ment of the invention , the plurality of views includes a may be configured to permit rotation of the display compo 
channel view , and the view selector component is further 10 nent about any of the multiple parallel axes to configure the 
responsive to an integrated scroll wheel on the computer portable computer between the plurality of display modes . 
system . According to another embodiment of the invention , Still other aspects , embodiments , and advantages of these 
the view selector component is further configured to tran exemplary aspects and embodiments , are discussed in detail 
sition the computer system to the channel view in response below . Moreover , it is to be understood that both the 
to manipulation of the integrated scroll wheel . According to 15 foregoing information and the following detailed description 
another embodiment of the invention , the channel view are merely illustrative examples of various aspects and 
further comprises a channel selector comprising a display of embodiments , and are intended to provide an overview or 
a sequence of visual representations presenting a channel framework for understanding the nature and character of the 
content mode . According to another embodiment of the claimed aspects and embodiments . Any embodiment dis 
invention , the display of the sequence of visual representa- 20 closed herein may be combined with any other embodiment 
tions is responsive to manipulation of the integrated scroll in any manner consistent with the objects , aims , and needs 
wheel , and manipulation of the integrated scroll wheel disclosed herein , and references to " an embodiment , " " some 
causes the computer system to render a next visual repre embodin ats , " " an alternate embodir nt , ” “ various 
sentation in the display of the sequence of visual represen embodiments , " " one embodiment ” or the like are not nec 
tations . According to another embodiment of the invention , 25 essarily mutually exclusive and are intended to indicate that the system further comprises a storage component config a particular feature , structure , or characteristic described in 
ured to retain a current computer system configuration state connection with the embodiment may be included in at least 
and a current view state . According to another embodiment one embodiment . The appearances of such terms herein are 
of the invention , the execution component is further con not necessarily all referring to the same embodiment . 
figured to transition the computer system display between 30 
the plurality of views , responsive to at least one of the BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 
current computer system configuration state and the current 
view state . According to another embodiment of the inven Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
tion , the execution component is configured to transition to below with reference to the accompanying figures , which are 
a channel view in response to manipulation of an integrated 35 not intended to be drawn to scale . The figures are included 
scroll wheel , when the computer system is in a laptop and an to provide illustration and a further understanding of the 
easel configuration . According to another embodiment of the various aspects and embodiments , and are incorporated in 
invention , the execution component is further configured to and constitute a part of this specification , but are not 
transition from the first view and a home view to a channel intended as a definition of the limits of the invention . Where 
view in response to a change in computer system configu- 40 technical features in the figures , detailed description or any 
ration state from laptop to easel . claim are followed by references signs , the reference signs 

According to one embodiment , a portable computer is have been included for the sole purpose of increasing the 
configurable between various modes , including a closed intelligibility of the figures , detailed description , and / or 
mode , a laptop mode , an easel mode , a flat mode and a frame claims . Accordingly , neither the reference signs nor their 
mode . The portable computer may comprise a display com- 45 absence are intended to have any limiting effect on the scope 
ponent including a display screen , a base , and a hinge of any claim elements . In the figures , each identical or nearly 
assembly at least partially housed within the base and identical component that is illustrated in various figures is 
configured to pivotably couple the display component to the represented by a like numeral . For purposes of clarity , not 
base . The display component may be rotatable about a every component may be labeled in every figure . In the 
longitudinal axis running along an interface between the 50 figures : 
display component and the base . In the closed mode , the FIG . 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
display screen may be disposed substantially against the computer , according to aspects of the invention , in a " lap 
base , and rotating the display component about the longi top ” configuration ; 
tudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the FIG . 2 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
closed mode may configure the portable computer into the 55 graphical user interface showing a home view , according to 
laptop mode . Rotating the display component about the aspects of the invention ; 
longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees axis FIG . 3A - C are screen shots illustrating examples of a 
from the closed mode may configure the portable computer graphical user interface showing web page views , according 
into the easel mode . to aspects of the invention ; 

In one example of the portable computer , the display 60 FIG . 4 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up to FIG . 1 in the easel mode ; 
approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode . In another FIG . 5 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
example , the portable computer comprises a display orien graphical user interface showing a quick access view , 
tation module that displays content on the display screen in according to aspects of the invention ; 
one of a plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal 65 FIG . 6 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 
axis . The orientation of the displayed content may be graphical user interface showing a bookmark view , accord 
dependent on the current display mode of the portable ing to aspects of the invention ; 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 422 of 521 PageID #: 528



5 

10 

15 

US 10,564,818 B2 
13 14 

FIG . 7A - B are screen shots illustrating examples of a FIG . 29A - B are screen shots illustrating example graphi 
graphical user interface showing a web page view , according cal user interfaces showing a web page view with a share 
to aspects of the invention ; interface , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 8 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 30 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
graphical user interface showing a home view , according to user interface showing a shared card , according to aspects of 
aspects of the invention ; the invention ; 

FIG . 9 is an illustration of an example conceptual model FIG . 31 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
of a graphical user interface , according to aspects of the user interface showing a shared card notification , according 
invention ; to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 10 illustrates an example process for generating a FIG . 32 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
visual representation of computer content , according to user interface showing a notification messages , according to 
aspects of the invention ; aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 11 is a block diagram of one example of a portable FIG . 33 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
computer user interface architecture , according to aspects of user interface showing a notification , according to aspects of 
the invention ; the invention ; 

FIG . 12 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 34 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
graphical user interface , according to aspects of the inven user interface showing a notification , according to aspects of 
tion ; the invention ; 

FIG . 13 is a screen shot illustrating another example of a 20 FIG . 35 is a screen shot illustrating an example graphical 
graphical user interface according to aspects of the inven user interface showing a web page view with a download 
tion ; interface , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 14 illustrates ex mple of a behavior model for FIG . 36 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
display of cards responsive to computer focus , according to interpreting executable operations into streamlined opera 
aspects of the invention ; 25 tions according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 15A is a screen shot of an example web card in a FIG . 37 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
non - hover state , according to aspects of the invention ; permitting selection of executable operations in content 

FIG . 15B is a screen shot of an example web card in a according to aspects of the invention ; 
hover state , according to aspects of the invention ; FIG . 38 is a flow diagram of one example process for 

FIG . 16 is a screen shot of examples of option views of 30 transforming executable operations into remote storage 
cards , according to aspects of the invention ; operations according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 39 is a flow diagram of one example process for FIG . 17 is an illustration of an example of the portable obtaining service access information , according to aspects of computer in the laptop mode , according to aspects of the the invention ; invention ; FIG . 40 is a flow diagram of one example process for FIG . 18A - E illustrate examples of a header display pre - configuring a streamlined device , according to aspects responsive to focus and user activity , according to aspects of of the invention ; 
the invention ; FIG . 41A is a screen shot illustrating an example graphi 

FIG . 19 is a screen shot of a web page view including a cal user interface showing a web page view with a print 
toolbar , according to aspects of the invention ; 40 interface , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 20A - B are screen shots illustrating examples of a FIG . 41B are screen shots illustrating examples of print 
graphical user interface showing a channel page view , and download interfaces , according to aspects of the inven 
according to aspects of the invention ; tion ; 

FIG . 21 is a screen shot illustrating examples of a graphi FIG . 42 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
cal user interface showing a channel full view , according to 45 streamlining user interactions with digital content , according 
aspects of the invention ; to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 22 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 43 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
graphical user interface showing a bookmark view , accord streamlining user interactions with computer content , 
ing to aspects of the invention ; according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 23 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a 50 FIG . 44 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
graphical user interface showing a channel view , according permitting a user to interact with computer content , accord 
to aspects of the invention ; ing to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 24 is a screen shot illustrating one example of a FIG . 45 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
graphical user interface showing a channel page view , providing consistent accessibility to computer content , 
according to aspects of the invention ; 55 according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 25A - B are illustrations of example logical diagrams FIG . 46 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
of the behavior for the channel view , according to aspects of providing consistent navigation operations to a user , accord 
the invention ; ing to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 26 is an illustration of the portable computer con FIG . 47A - B are flow diagrams of example processes for 
figured into a “ frame ” mode , according to aspects of the 60 generating a user interface element , according to aspects of 
invention ; the invention ; 

FIG . 27 is an illustration of the portable computer con FIG . 48 is a flow diagram of one example process for 
figured into a “ flat ” mode , according to aspects of the permitting a user to select a viewing mode for a streamlined 
invention ; device , according to aspects of the invention ; 

FIG . 28 is an illustration of an example logical diagram of 65 FIG . 49A is a flow diagram of one example process for 
the behavior for the channel view , according to aspects of transitioning between a lean forward view to a lean back 
the invention ; ward view , according to aspects of the invention ; 

35 
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FIG . 49B is a flow diagram of one example process for computer operations / behavior in a consistent manner . The 
transitioning between user views , according to aspects of the visual representations are adapted to permit easy user inter 
invention ; action even upon selection of a first I / O profile or the change 

FIG . 50 is a flow diagram of one example process for in selection of an I / O profile . According to one embodiment , 
organizing a plurality of views and GUI elements into a 5 the visual representations are rendered as cards , as discussed 
consistent presentation , according to aspects of the inven in more detail below . Different types of cards may be 
tion ; employed to render different types of available content . For 

FIG . 51 is a block diagram of a computer system for example , web based content , may be rendered as a web card 
streamlining user interactions with computer content ( e.g. FIG . 2 , 206 ) that associated with a mapping to web 
according to aspects of the invention ; and 10 content . Some web cards map directly to web pages and in 

FIGS . 52A - C are diagrams illustrating different positions response to selection of the web card the computer device 
of the portable computer of FIG . 4 in easel mode ; executes the mapping and displays a web view of the 

FIG . 53A is an illustration of a portion of the portable content . Other cards may be used to provide interactive 
computer of FIG . 1 in the laptop mode , illustrating a hinge displays selectable by a user . In another example , system 
assembly according to aspects of the invention ; and 15 operations are displayed as system cards ( e.g. FIG . 2 , 212 ) , 

FIG . 53B is an in illustration of a portion of the portable which are associated with mappings to system operations , 
computer of FIG . 1 in the easel mode , illustrating the hinge for example communications configurations , and may com 
assembly according to aspects of the invention . prise a settings card , among other system options . Another 

type of card includes a channel card ( e.g. Fig . configured to 
DETAILED DESCRIPTION 20 stream web based content in a manner that allows for 

summarization of content , while still providing the ability to 
It is realized that the conventional wisdom with respect to fully appreciate the summarized content . 

such “ feature packing ” as discussed above suffers from Those skilled in the art will appreciate that previous 
significant flaws . Typical computer users simply can't take attempts have been made to present summary views of 
advantage of all the functionality offered , either the services 25 available content . However , known summarized content 
and features offered by their own computer , or the services typically suffers from significant flaws . For example sum 
and features offered by online providers . The complexity of marization of web based content simply reduces the display 
the interface ( both hardware and software ) hampers adop size of the information in the content . With respect to news 
tion , as does the volume of features offered . For example , headlines , for example , this often prevents a user from being 
third party service provides often find difficulty in subscrib- 30 able to appreciated the summarize content . Quite simply 
ing new users , educating existing users , and providing truncating a headline prevents the user from understanding 
integration of feature sets for the features they provide as the context of the portion of the headline s / he is able to read . 
well as those offered by other service providers . In other examples , headlines are display to such a reduce 

Synergy between services providers can be found and size that an average computer user simply cannot read or 
exploited by even the most novice user through streamlined 35 appreciate them . Using channel cards according to aspects 
computer systems and user interface presentation . Accord and embodiments , summarized content may be presented in 
ing to one aspect , the interplay between various third party a manner that permits appreciation and interaction with the 
services and computer features can be readily appreciated by summarized content itself . In another example , channel card 
even the most novice user because the various functionality are configured to present a streamlined view that cannot only 
and features sets are easily accessible through the stream- 40 be appreciated and interacted , but may be transitioned from 
lined access controls and consistent user interfaces . As one mode of viewing to another without loss of the ability 
discussed further below , in one example , the graphical user to appreciate and interact with the streamlined view . 
interface improves transitions from one service to another , According to one aspect , streamlining of the user device 
through a consistent view of available content . A user is able and streamlining of the user interface provided in such 
to navigate easily and quickly from one content provider to 45 devices leads to simplified interaction between a user and 
another user the organized view . The elements that comprise features . The streamlining may impact not only features of 
the view further facilitate navigation and transition by , for the system , but features provided by services accessed by the 
example , retaining state information an in another example system . Streamlined activity leads directly to better adop 
by remaining persistent to the view . tion , understanding and integration of both new and old 

According to another aspect , streamlining the computer 50 features available to users . The consistency of user experi 
system / device the user interacts with includes establishing a ence even with third party service providers , for example , 
first set of 1/0 devices that a user needs to operate and fosters familiarity not only with a particular user and his / her 
providing that first set of I / O devices as a physical configu interactions with a particular device , but also with other 
ration of the device . Additionally , providing the user the users of the same / similar device . A common experience may 
ability to change from the first set of I / O devices , a first I / O 55 be created for multiple users , fostering a community expe 
profile , to another at will improves the user experience and rience . According to one example , providing a common 
permits the user to dynamically select a preferred I / O profile experience includes establishing a global profile for a user of 
best suited to the user's present need . According to one a streamlined device . The global profile , in some examples , 
embodiment , user selection includes transitioning from a is retained in remote storage , and accessed upon start up of 
lean back mode to a lean forward mode and vice versa . In 60 any streamlined device . The global profile permits the user's 
one embodiment , the user's computer device is configured experience to be consistent even across multiple streamlined 
to have multiple I / O profiles that can be selected by physi devices . In one example , configurations and customizations 
cally manipulating the orientation of the computer device are retained in remote storage ; changes on one device may 
itself . be written to remote storage , propagating changes across 

According to another aspect , streamlining user interac- 65 multiple streamlined devices that access the remote storage . 
tions with the computer system / device includes representing Thus a common experience is also provided across multiple 
computer based content in visual representations that render devices . 
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According to another aspect , the common experience may present systems and methods or their components to any one 
also include a community aspect . The community aspect positional or spatial orientation . 
includes sharing of content between users , sharing of con Device Examples and Configuration Options 
tent and configurations , sharing of content , configurations , Various aspects , including the integration between the 
and customizations , among many options . In particular , 5 user interface , its views , and navigation options are further 
sharing may involve the transmission of user interface illustrated in the user device itself . According to one 
elements to other users . In one example , a user may share a embodiment , the user interface and the visual representa 
card and any of its configurations with another user . Access tions that comprise the interface are configured to be respon 
to the shared user interface elements , in some embodiments , sive to the physical configuration of the user device . In one 
facilitates communal computer usage . In one example , a first example , the view presented to user is configured to be 
user may be watching media on their streamlined device , responsive to the mode / configuration of the device . 
another user known to the first user , may receive a user According to one aspect , systems and methods are pro 
interface element that retains information related to the vided for simplifying the presentation of multi - media fea 
accessed content and information related to the present tures and options into an integrated and streamlined presen 
context . That is for the first user watching a movie , the first tation format . Streamlining presentation includes reducing 
user may share the user interface element through which the number of options that a user must navigate / configure in 
s / he is accessing the move , and permit the another user not order to take advantage of new systems and features , sim 
only to watch the movie , but to take up the movie at the same plifying the process of adoption and education . In one 
point in time , so in essence , they get to enjoy the movie 20 embodiment a system is provided with only the physical 
together . Content and context retention by user interface components necessary to achieve streamlined presentation 
elements that can be shared provides unique advantages to of both operating system features and integration of third 
the users of the streamlined devices . party services . For example , a streamlined hardware device 

According to another aspect , various operations provides provides for ( in comparison to typical desktop and laptop 
on conventional systems are adapted for streamlined pro- 25 systems ) a reduced user input platform as a first I / O profile , 
cessing . In on example , operations that require large comprising in one configuration a scroll wheel and a button 
amounts of computer storage are transformed in remote interface . Other I / O profiles are available for user selection 
storage requests . In one embodiment , a streamlined device is by manipulation of the device itself . In one embodiment , an 
configured to identify local storage request and transform easel mode presents the user with the first I / O profile and by 
them into a storage request to an on - line service provider 30 rotating the computer device about a longitudinal axis ; the 
identified in a user and / or device profile . In another embodi user may select a second I / O profile , including a keyboard . 
ment , the system prompts a user to identify a service The transition from one I / O profile to another may also cause 
provider in response to a local request . Various operations the computer device to alter its display . In one example , the 
may be transformed , including download and print opera user interface provided to the user is responsive to selection 
tions , among others . 35 of device mode and / or selection of I / O profile . 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods It is to be appreciated that reducing the number of I / O 
and apparatus discussed herein are not limited in application device achieves simplicity of design and ease of operation 
to the details of construction and the arrangement of com by the user , and at the same time may increase the com 
ponents set forth in the following description or illustrated in plexity of the graphical user interfaces needed to support 
the accompanying figures . The methods and apparatus are 40 interaction with systems and third parties that anticipate , 
capable of implementation in other embodiments and of rely on , or expect additional I / O devices . Streamlining 
being practiced or of being carried out in various ways . device operation by the user is balanced against sophistica 
Examples of specific implementations are provided herein tion of user the interface required to enable user interaction 
for illustrative purposes only and are not intended to be with the same features used with additional I / O devices . 
limiting . In particular , acts , elements and features discussed 45 According to one embodiment , the user interface layer 
in connection with any one or more embodiments are not provides simplified accessibility based on the device's I / O 
intended to be excluded from a similar role in any other platform , and for some embodiments , the user interface 
embodiments . layer is responsive to device configurations that change the 

Also , the phraseology and terminology used herein is for device's I / O capabilities . In other embodiments , the user 
the purpose of description and should not be regarded as 50 interface is responsive to changes in the device's mode . In 
limiting . Any references to embodiments or elements or acts some examples , changes in device mode and changes I / O 
of the systems and methods herein referred to in the singular profile will occur together , however , in other examples a 
may also embrace embodiments including a plurality of change in mode or a change in I / O profile will not require a 
these elements , and any references in plural to any embodi corresponding change in profile or mode respectively . 
ment or element or act herein may also embrace embodi- 55 One example of a streamlined device includes a portable 
ments including only a single element . References in the computer that is configurable between a laptop mode ( in 
singular or plural form are not intended to limit the presently which the portable computer has a conventional laptop 
disclosed systems or methods , their components , acts , or appearance ) and an easel mode in which the base of the 
elements . The use herein of " including , " " comprising , ” computer and its display component stand upright forming 
“ having , ” “ containing , ” “ involving , ” and variations thereof 60 an inverted “ V , ” as discussed further herein . Certain aspects 
is meant to encompass the items listed thereafter and equiva and embodiments are directed to a portable computer that is 
lents thereof as well as additional items . References to “ or ” configurable between different operating modes , including a 
may be construed as inclusive so that any terms described laptop mode ( in which the portable computer has a conven 
using “ or ” may indicate any of a single , more than one , and tional laptop appearance ) , a flat mode , a frame mode , and an 
all of the described terms . Any references to front and back , 65 easel mode in which the base of the computer and its display 
left and right , top and bottom , and upper and lower are component stand vertically forming an inverted “ V , " as 
intended for convenience of description , not to limit the discussed further herein . Reference to modes of the com 
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puter , modes of the device and intended to include the and accessible on one side of the portable computer 100 and 
physical configuration of the portable computer / device . the keyboard 106 ( not shown in FIG . 4 ) is visible and 

The portable computer is capable of different display accessible on the other side . 
formats and functionality in the different modes , and As illustrated in FIG . 4 , in one embodiment , the portable 
includes a graphical user interface that may work seamlessly 5 computer may comprise integrated hardware volume con 
with the computer hardware to provide a unified , comfort trols , including a volume control button 294 and a mute 
able , holistic user experience . In particular , the portable button 296. In one example , the volume control button 294 
computer may provide access to a wide array of functions , may be a rocker switch that allows a user to easily increase 
both those traditionally provided by computing devices and or decrease the volume of audio played through the speakers 
those traditionally provided by other passive information 10 128. When the user presses the volume control button 294 , 
devices . For example , the hardware and software , including a volume indicator may temporarily appear on the display 
the graphical user interface , of the portable computer may be screen 110 , to provide a visual indication of the amount by 
focused toward providing access to entertainment media , which the volume is being increased or decreased . Similarly , 
such as audio and video ( e.g. , playing music , streaming pressing the mute button 296 may cause a visual indication 
video , viewing photographs , etc. ) , email , and internet , while 15 that the volume is muted to appear on the display screen 110 . 
also providing state - of - the - art computer processing capabil According to one embodiment , when the portable com 
ity . puter 100 is configured into the easel mode , the visual 
Referring to FIG . 1 , there is illustrated one example of a display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 

portable computer according to aspects of the invention . In 180 degrees such that the information appears “ right - way 
FIG . 1 , the portable computer 100 is illustrated in the 20 up , ” even through the display screen is upside - down com 
“ laptop ” mode , with the display component 102 inclined at pared to when the portable computer is in the laptop mode . 
a viewing angle from the base 104. The display component Thus , a user may simply “ flip " the portable computer 100 
102 is pivotably coupled to the base 104 by a hinge assembly into the easel mode and immediately be able to comfortably 
( not shown ) that allows the display component to be rotated view information on the display screen 110 , without having 
with respect to the base . The hinge assembly may include a 25 to access display screen controls to adjust the orientation of 
single or multiple hinges , which may be any of a variety of the visual display . In one embodiment , the portable com 
hinge types , including , but not limited , to single - axis hinges , puter 100 includes an orientation ( or mode ) sensor that is 
multiple - axis hinges , geared hinges , etc. In one example , the configured to detect whether the portable computer is in the 
hinge assembly allows the display component 102 to be laptop mode or the easel mode , and to adjust the display 
rotated ( or tilted ) about a longitudinal axis 101 running 30 accordingly . The orientation sensor may be incorporated into 
along an interface between the display component and the the base component 104 , for example , underneath the key 
base 104 , as illustrated in FIG . 1 and discussed further board 106 , or into the display component . In one example , 
below . The base 104 includes a keyboard 106 and internal locating the orientation sensor in the display component 
electronic components ( not shown ) , such as a central pro 102 , rather than the base 104 , may provide more robust 
cessing unit , memory , and other components necessary to 35 detection and therefore , may be presently preferred in some 
operate the portable computer , as known to those skilled in embodiments . The orientation sensor may be used to deter 
the art . In some embodiments , the base 104 may also include mine a precise relative orientation of the base component 
a touch pad 108 or trackball ( not shown ) for receiving user 104 with respect to the display component 102 , or vice 
commands , as known to those skilled in the art . versa , for example , to determine whether the device is in the 

Still referring to FIG . 1 , the display component 102 40 laptop mode , easel mode , or some point in between the two 
includes a display screen 110 , and may also include a camera modes . In one example , the orientation sensor includes an 
112 , microphone 114 , and infrared receiver 116 , as discussed accelerometer whose output is fed to the computer operating 
further below . It is to be appreciated that the locations of the system ( or to dedicated logic circuitry ) which then triggers 
camera 112 , microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are a display inversion as appropriate . 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG . 1 , and may be 45 According to one embodiment an accelerometer is used to 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 detect a configuration of the portable computer , although , it 
and / or base 104 , as would be recognized by those skilled in is to be appreciated that other sensors and devices may be 
the art . The display component 102 may also include cush used to determine a configuration . According to another 
ions 118 that provide soft contact points between the base embodiment , the portable computer may include integrated 
104 and the display component 102 when the portable 50 “ navigation ” hardware that allows a user to easily and 
computer is closed . In one example , the cushions 118 are comfortably control various features and functions of the 
made of rubber . However , it is to be appreciated that the portable computer , to manipulate content displayed on the 
invention is not so limited , and the cushions 118 may portable computer , and to interact with visual representa 
comprise materials other than rubber , including , for tions of content display in a user interface . For example , as 
example , a polymer , felt , or other suitable materials as would 55 discussed above , the portable computer 100 may comprise a 
be recognized by those skilled in the art . scroll wheel 132 that allows a user to control , adjust and / or 

Referring to FIG . 4 , there is illustrated an example of the select various functionality of the portable computer . 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode . To According to another embodiment , the scroll wheel 132 may 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode ( or be used to provide “ hardware navigation ” through informa 
closed position ) into the easel mode , the display component 60 tion , such as menus , icons , etc. , displayed on the display 
102 may be folded away from the base 104 , in the same screen 110 , as discussed further below with reference to 
direction as to open the computer ( i.e. , to configure the FIG . 17. A common display configuration used in conven 
computer from the closed position into the laptop mode ) tional computers is a " desktop " view in which multiple icons 
such that the base 104 and the display component 102 form representing links to various programs or applications are 
an inverted “ V ” shape with the bottom of the base and the 65 displayed over a background image . Navigation may be 
back of the display component face another , as illustrated in conventionally performed using a mouse , touch pad or 
FIG . 4. In the easel mode , the display screen 110 is visible trackball , as known to those skilled in the art . 
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According to another embodiment , the portable computer one example photo service FLICKR is integrated with 
100 includes a streamlined graphical user interface that various aspects of the device and / or the device's user 
supports “ map ” navigation . The map user interface provides interface to provide seamless access to photo content stored 
a clear overview of the entire computing environment and by the third party provider . The integration with remote 
searching capability within the environment that may be 5 storage services permits reduced storage capacity on the user 
accessed using the scroll wheel 132 and , optionally , one or device , for example , a portable computer . Other services navigation buttons 166 , 168 that may be provided on the may be integrated including for example GOOGLE DOCS , 
base 104 of the portable computer 100 ( button 166 ) and / or for word processing and other office related applications in the keyboard 106 ( button 168 ) , illustrated in FIG . 17. In provided on - line . Reducing and / or eliminating the need for one embodiment , the map mode of navigation is a hierar- 10 non volatile memory in the computer system is advanta chical mode that reduces the number of items to select geous in that the device itself may be reduced in complexity amongst at any stage of navigation , thereby facilitating user and any associated cost . In some embodiments , a stream access with the scroll wheel 132 and , optionally , the navi 
gation button ( s ) 166 , 168. Of course , it is to be appreciated lined device doe not incorporate a hard disk drive for 
that the map user interface may also be navigated using 15 storage , providing for any local storage requirement through 
conventional tools , such as a trackball , touchpad , mouse or RAM and Flash memory . 
arrow keys . According to one embodiment , the different modes of 

Referring to FIG . 11 , there is illustrated a block diagram content 172 may be displayed as a series of bars across the 
of one example of an architecture of the portable computer display screen 110 , as illustrated in FIG . 12. The following 
including a map user interface . The user interface “ home ” 20 discussion of various features , including hardware naviga 
screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of content 172 . tion through the map user interface may refer primarily to 
In the illustrated example , the home screen 170 contains five the display configuration illustrated in FIG . 12. However , it 
modes of content 172 ; however , it is to be appreciated that is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited , and 
the home screen may include more or fewer than five modes the modes of content may be displayed in other configura 
of content and that the modes of content may differ from the 25 tions , including , for example , a “ desktop ” and icon configu 
examples discussed below . According to one example , the ration , a " dashboard ” type display , as illustrated in FIG . 13 , 
modes of content 172 accessible via the home screen 170 or another configuration , as would be recognized by those 
may include “ media ” 172a , “ connect ” 172b , “ web ” 172c , skilled in the art . Similarly , navigation is discussed below 
" applications ” 172d , and “ channels ” 172e . Using the map primarily with reference to the scroll wheel 132 and navi 
user interface , information , programs , features and applica- 30 gation buttons 166 , 168 ; however , it is to be appreciation 
tions may be grouped into the various modes of content 172 . that navigation may also be accomplished using any of the 
By selecting any mode of content 172 , for example , by using conventional tools discussed above or known to those 
the scroll wheel 132 and / or navigation buttons 168 , as skilled in the art . 
discussed further below , the user may access the content As discussed above , according to one embodiment , the 
organized within that mode . 35 scroll wheel 132 and , optionally , the navigation buttons 166 , 

For example , the media mode 172a may provide access to 168 may be used to navigate the user interface . Referring 
a medial player to play , view , search and organize media again to FIG . 12 , scrolling the scroll wheel may sequentially 
such as music , video , photos , etc. The connect mode 1726 highlight different ones of the modes of content 172. In one 
may provide access to features such as , for example , email , example , the highlighting may be achieved by changing the 
voice - over - IP , instant messaging , etc. , and the web mode 40 color of the selected mode , and / or by providing a visual 
172c may provide access to internet browsing and searching . indicator , such as a colored bar 176. A highlighted mode 172 
The application mode 172d may provide access to , for may be selected by pressing the scroll wheel , thereby 
example , computer applications or programs , such as word bringing up a new " page ” or screen on the user interface 
processor , spreadsheet , calculator , etc. In one example , these corresponding to the selected mode . Once within a selected 
applications or programs may be provided as web - based 45 mode of content 172 , the scroll wheel may similarly be used 
services rather than programs or applications residing on the to select particular functions , features or applications within 
portable computer 100. The channels mode 172e may pro that mode . In one embodiment , the default action for the 
vide access to different functionality of the portable com scroll wheel 132 may vary depending on whether the 
puter , with the different functions or features defined as portable computer 100 is in the laptop mode or the easel 
different channels . For example , a channel may include an 50 mode . For example , in easel mode , the default action for the 
alarm clock channel in which the portable computer is scroll wheel may be channel selection within the channels 
configured to display a clock and can be programmed to mode 172 ( e ) . In one embodiment , the scroll wheel 132 may 
activate an alarm , e.g. , a sound , piece of music , etc. , at a be depressible as well as scrollable . Thus , pressing the scroll 
predetermined time . Another example of a channel may wheel 132 , as illustrated in FIG . 4 , may allow further 
include a “ photo frame ” channel in which the portable 55 control , such as , for example , selecting a channel onto which 
computer may be configured to display a pre - selected image the user has scrolled , or “ play ” and “ pause ” of audio or video 
or set of images , etc. Another example of a channel is a being played through the portable computer 100 . 
“ television ” channel , in which the portable computer is As discussed above , according to one embodiment , one or 
configured to stream Internet television . In one example , a more navigation buttons may be used in conjunction with 
user may configure particular Internet television channels 60 the scroll wheel . In particular , in one embodiment , the 
( e.g. , a news channel , a movie channel , a home and garden navigation button ( s ) may be used to change the action of the 
channel , etc. ) into sub - channels within the channels mode of scroll wheel . As discussed above , in one example , the 
content 172 ( e ) . Some or all of the modes of content 172 may default action of the scroll wheel is volume control . This 
access , retrieve and / or store information on the Internet 174 . action may be changed by pressing the navigation button 

Typically streamlined devices are integrated with remote 65 166 , as illustrated in FIG . 4 , for example , from volume 
content storage and / or access , shown at 174. The integration control to menu navigation in the user interface , and vice 
may be provided through third party service providers , in versa . 
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According to one embodiment , the effect of pressing the portable computer may vary when the portable computer is 
navigation button 166 may vary depending on active the configured from the laptop mode into the easel mode , or vice 
mode of content of the portable computer 100. For example , versa . For example , as discussed above , when the portable 
if a user is in the media mode using a photo viewing computer 100 is configured into the easel mode , the visual 
application , pressing the navigation button 166 may change 5 display on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 
the action of the scroll wheel 132 from mode navigation to 180 degrees such that the information appears “ right - way 
slideshow controls for the photos . When the navigation up , ” even through the display screen is upside - down com 
button 166 is pressed , an control indicator box ( similar to the pared to when the portable computer is in the laptop mode . 
volume indicator box 162 discussed above with reference to In another example , for at least some activities within at 
FIG . 14 ) may appear containing different actions for the 10 least some modes of content ( e.g. , viewing a photograph or 
photo slideshow , such as “ play , ” “ next , ” “ back , ” “ skip , ” video ) , when the portable computer 100 is configured into 
“ full screen view , ” etc. , and scrolling the scroll wheel 132 the easel mode , the display may automatically adjust to “ full 
may allow a user to select one of these actions . Pressing the screen view ” ( i.e. , the displayed image or video is displayed 
navigation button 166 again may return the scroll wheel on the full screen size , rather than in a window ) to allow for 
action to menu navigation , to allow the user to , for example , 15 comfortable viewing . 
move to a different feature or application within the active In addition , as discussed above , the ability to configure 
mode , or to select a different mode . the portable computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the 
As can be seen in FIG . 4 , the navigation button 166 may easel mode provides enhanced functionality . For example , 

be easily accessed when the portable computer 100 is in the when the portable computer 100 is not being actively used , 
easel mode , providing a convenient navigation tool for this 20 the user may configure the portable computer into the easel 
configuration . A similar navigation button 168 may be mode , and program the portable computer to act as a digital 
provided on the keyboard 106 , as illustrated in FIG . 17. In photo frame , displaying one or more photos of the user's 
one example , the functionality of the two navigation buttons choice . In the easel mode , the portable computer 100 may 
166 , 168 may be the same , with the different locations occupy a smaller footprint on a surface than in the laptop or 
providing easy , comfortable access in the different configu- 25 closed modes because the base 104 and display component 
ration modes ( i.e. , laptop or easel ) of the portable computer 102 are upright , as illustrated in FIGS . 4 and 5. In addition , 
100. Thus , a user may use either navigation button 166 or because the portable computer can act as a passive infor 
navigation button 168 , depending on personal preference . In mation and / or entertainment device , such as a photo frame 
another example , the two navigation buttons may have or clock , as discussed above , the portable computer may 
different functionality . For example , the navigation button 30 provide a useful function even when not being actively used 
166 may be used to alter the action of the scroll wheel 132 , by the user , and may do so in the easel mode ) without taking 
as discussed above , while the navigation button 168 is used up much surface area . 
to navigate “ up ” or “ down ” a level within the map user It is to be appreciated that although the portable computer 
interface . For example , pressing the navigation button 168 100 is often referred to as being in either the laptop mode or 
while within a given mode of content may allow the user to 35 easel mode , other modes or configurations are also possible . 
“ back up ” to the home screen ; or pressing the navigation For example , as discussed above , because the portable 
button 168 while within a selected channel in the channel computer 100 can be configured from the closed position , 
mode of the content 172e ) may allow the user to " back - up ” through the laptop mode into the easel mode by rotating the 
to the channel mode main page . display component 102 , a number of configurations are 

It is to be appreciated that numerous variations on the 40 possible in between “ true ” laptop mode and “ true ” easel 
functionality of the navigation buttons 166 , 168 is possible , mode . Each different configuration may invoke different 
as would be recognized by those skilled in the art , and the functionality and provide a user with a different aspect of a 
above examples are given for illustration only and are not graphical user interface . 
intended to be limiting . In addition , any functions described In another example , the portable computer 100 may be 
with reference to one navigation button ( 166 or 168 ) may be 45 configured into a “ frame ” mode , as illustrated in FIG . 26 , in 
instead ( or additionally ) implemented with the other navi which the portable computer is placed on a surface 212 with 
gation button . In one example , the function of the navigation the keyboard 106 “ face down ” on the surface 212 and the 
buttons 166 , 168 may vary depending on whether the display 110 facing upward . In the frame mode , the display 
portable computer 100 is configured into the laptop mode or component 102 may be at a similar orientation , and angle 
the easel mode . For example , only the navigation button 166 50 134 , with respect to the base component 104 as in the easel 
may be active in the easel mode , and only the navigation mode . However , rather than the base component 104 and 
button 168 may be active in the laptop mode . Alternatively , display component 102 being oriented vertically with 
both navigation buttons 166 , 168 may be usable in either the respect to the surface 212 , as in the easel mode ( in which the 
laptop mode or the easel mode , but their functionality may portable computer forms an inverted “ V ” as discussed 
vary . For example , when the portable computer 100 is in the 55 above ) , in the frame mode , the base component 104 may lie 
easel mode , the default action for the navigation button 166 flat on the surface 212 , as shown in FIG . 26. In one example , 
may be channel selection whereas the default action for the software and / or hardware protection may be provided for the 
navigation button 168 is to access the “ home ” screen . keyboard to prevent keys from being pressed ( or to prevent 
Furthermore , the portable computer 100 is not limited to the the portable computer from responding to pressed keys ) 
use of two navigation buttons and may instead comprise 60 when the portable computer is in the frame mode . 
only a single navigation button or more than two navigation Similarly , referring to FIG . 27 , there is illustrated another 
buttons , any of which may be disposed in the locations configuration of the portable computer 100 , referring to as 
described above ( e.g. , on the rounded portion 120 of the base the “ flat ” mode . In the flat mode , the display component 102 
104 or on the keyboard 106 ) , or in other locations on the may be rotated ( or opened ) to approximately 180 degrees 
portable computer . 65 with respect to the base component 104 , such that the base 
As discussed above , according to one embodiment , the component and display component lay flat on a surface , with 

function or display content and / or display orientation of the the keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed , as shown 
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in FIG . 27. Unlike the easel and frame modes , in which the select multiple I / O profiles or device configurations depend 
keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible , in the ing upon the context presented to the user . It is to be 
flat mode , the keyboard is accessible and usable . In addition , appreciated that adaptations to the user interface layer that 
as discussed above , the visual display on the display screen maintain consistency while permitting different I / O profiles 
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort- 5 should be viewed as part of the invention . 
able viewing of information by persons located in different The examples of user interactions are provided for the 
positions relative to the base component 104 or display purposes of illustration and should not be viewed as limiting 
component 102. The visual display on the display screen 110 the invention to the interactions described , nor the specific 
may also be manually adjusted by a user using , for example , presentations discussed , and it is to be appreciated that other 
the keyboard 106 , touch pad 108 or mouse ( not shown ) , 10 interactions are appropriate and even desired in different 
scroll wheel 132 or navigation buttons ( not shown ) . For circumstances . Additionally , different configurations of the 
example , if a user ( located at position A ) wishes to display device itself will provide for different user interactions , for 
information for a person located opposite the user ( at example , based on additional hardware not available in 
position B ) , the visual display may be rotated ( automatically another configuration . 
or manually ) 180 degrees such that the information appears 15 Examples of User Experience 
" right - way - up , ” to the person at location B , even through the In one example , some typical user interactions with 
display screen 110 is upside - down for that person . Similarly , electronic content are illustrated . The user interactions occur 
in another example , the visual display may be rotated in accordance with various aspects of the systems and 
( automatically or manually ) 90 degrees such that the infor methods for streamlining user interaction with electronic 
mation appears “ right - way - up , ” for a person at location C. In 20 content . In some embodiments , the streamlined device is 
one example , a user can “ toggle ” the visual display among adapted to accommodate multiple users . In one embodiment , 
various orientations . For example , a user at location A may the user identifies him / herself to the device by entering a 
have the visual display facing themselves while using the user name and password . Once the user name and password 
keyboard 106 or other controls to change or access infor is accepted the user may begin interacting with the device , 
mation on the display , then toggle the display orientation 25 and if desired through the device to other content . According 
180 or 90 degrees to display the information for persons at to another embodiment , the device may display a “ users ” 
locations B or C. screen , incorporating a visual representation for each user . In 

According to another aspect , system and interface stream response to selection by the user of the visual representation 
lining may be employed with devices of multiple configu the user is identified . Identification may optionally include a 
rations . In some embodiments , multiple configurations 30 password challenge / response after selection of the visual 
include a traditional configuration , for example , a configu representation . In some embodiments , a camera is available 
ration similar to a laptop device , and also include new through the user device , and the user's visual representation 
configurations , for example , an easel mode . Some examples may be generated by taking a snapshot of the user . 
of streamlined devices have the ability to change between In one embodiment , that act of identifying includes access 
traditional configurations and other configurations . The 35 to remote storage associated with the device and / or the user . 
change between configurations may change the I / O profile Remote storage is accessed to retrieve any global profiles 
of the device and hence impact the user's interaction with that may exist for the user , and more specifically , any 
the device itself and any content displayed on the device . In changes that may have been made to the user's global 
one embodiment , the user interface is responsive to changes profile . In some embodiments , a local copy of any profile is 
in configuration . In another embodiment , the user interface 40 stored on the device , and the remotely stored profile is used 
is responsive to changes in I / O profile . to identify any changes . Changes to profiles may be copied 

According to another aspect , the streamlining of the to the remote location or changes in the profile may be 
user's multi - media experience incorporates the device the retrieved from the remote location . In one example , the local 
user uses to interact with multi - media sources , whether the and remote profiles are associated with a revision date . The 
sources are on - line or provided by the device itself . Stream- 45 most recently revised profile may be used as the most up to 
lining of the device includes developing consistent user date profile , with a different version receiving modification 
interfaces for the user to access all features presented . The as necessary to correspond . 
device's graphical user interface layer is customized to the In one alternative , a remote profile may be maintained for 
I / O interfaces provided . In one example a device is provided the device itself . In another , the device profile may contain 
in the form of a portable computer configurable between a 50 information on a number of users . In some embodiments , 
laptop mode ( in which the portable computer has a conven remote access is used to retrieve configurations and / or 
tional laptop appearance ) and an easel mode in which the settings maintained for any of the device , the user , and 
base of the computer and its display component stand groups of users , alone or in combination . According to one 
upright forming an inverted “ V , ” a closed mode , a laptop aspect , remote storage and / or remote access to user configu 
mode , an easel mode , a flat mode and a frame mode . 55 ration comprises one element of an example system for 
According to one embodiment , each of the display modes streamlining user interaction with electronic content . 
may employ different I / O profiles . Once a user is identified ( identification may occur by 

Some of the aspects may be better understood through the default if only one user has accessed a particular device ) the 
use of examples demonstrating the interactions between a graphical user interface presents a default view of the 
system , the system user , the interfaces provided , and the 60 electronic content available on the device . In one embodi 
accessed content . The user experience is improved through ment , the view presented is responsive to the configuration 
simplification of the interactions with the user device of the device . According to some embodiments , device 
depending on the device's configuration the only activity configurations may be determined using a sensor embedded 
required by the user may be to use a scroll wheel to identify in the device . In one example , a sensor is used to provide a 
selection and a button to execute the selection . Moreover , 65 signal and from the signal the device's orientation is deter 
the user experience is enhanced by permitting the user to mined . Alternative methodologies are employed in other 
select the I / O profile s / he is most comfortable with and even embodiments for detecting and determining a device's con 
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figuration . In one alternative example , I / O devices may be maximal display thresholds configured to improve the abil 
enabled / disabled based on the physical configuration of the ity of the user to absorb the information presented . In some 
device . For example , during a transition from laptop mode embodiments , a maximal number of visual representations 
to easel mode , various I / O devices that become inaccessible per screen is set . In one example , the maximal number of 
may be deactivated . Determining what I / O devices are still 5 visual representations is used to define a GUI page . In 
active and / or available permits identification of the device's another example , the maximal number of visual represen configuration . In other embodiments , an accelerometer may tations is associated with a maximal number of full view be used to detect a device configuration . In one example , a visual representations , and the page is configured to include device may be a portable laptop computer . The portable portions of views of other visual representations available on laptop computer may have multiple configurations , includ- 10 adjacent pages . A computer operation that would cause the ing a laptop mode , an easel mode , a frame mode , a flat mode 
and a closed mode . computer device to exceed the maximal number results in 

In the illustrated example , FIG . 1 , the user device is the creation of a new display page . The home view is 
configured in a laptop mode , and has an I / O profile ( a set of organized into as many pages are required in order to 
I / O devices ) that one would normally associate with a laptop 15 maintain the maximal threshold of display items . 
computer . In this example , the I / O profile includes , in some Typically , the home view is configurable by the user . New 
embodiments , a keyboard , a touch pad , buttons , web cam , items may be added , existing items may be moved and / or 
and a scroll wheel . The graphical user interface is configured removed based on user selection . The home view further 
to present a default view that provides the user with con comprises some visual representations that can not be 
textual options . In this example the present context for the 20 removed . Commonly requested system operations have 
user includes “ lean forward ” viewing and the computer visual representation displayed on the home view that can 
operations one would typically associate with user of a not be deleted . According to one embodiment , a user may 
laptop . Other contexts arise based on configuration of the reorganize the display but not remove system operations . 
device ( for example in Easel mode ) and the computer tasks For example , visual representations that map to system 
the user wishes to perform . For an identified context a 25 operations ( e.g. communication configuration and hardware 
default is provided for the user eliminating the requirement configuration ) cannot be remove from the home view . Addi 
of making configuration choices , however , the user is still tionally , some system operations will always be displayed 
permitted to accesses the configuration directly to customize through the home view regardless of frequency of use . 
it . Positioning of visual representation is also organized and 
Shown in FIG . 2 , is an example of a page of the device's 30 managed in the home view . Preferably , organization and / or 

home view ( 200 ) . The home view organizes user interface management occurs automatically based on default settings 
elements into a mapped based presentation and separates the selected for the user . Alternatively , organization and / or man 
presentation into logical units based on a single displayed agement may occur dynamically . For example , a user may 
screen , i.e. a page . One function provided by the home view make changes to organization and / or management settings 
is to serve as an organization of interface elements and / or 35 on the fly . In another embodiment , default settings control 
navigation tools that maps visual representations of avail organization and / or management , and an interface is pro 
able content into a plurality of views of the available vided to permits a user to makes any changes to the default 
content . The home view is also configured to present sum settings . And in another embodiment , a user may be queried 
marized views of information to the user , so as to reduce the on preferences , the responses are used to establish defaults 
volume of information that a user needs to process in order 40 for operation . 
to access content . In some embodiments , the mapped based In some embodiments , frequency of use of the visual 
interface is also configured to group like computer opera representations is used to sort the presentation of visual 
tions into a section of the map . Typically , grouped selectable representations on the home view . More frequently accessed 
computer content includes mappings to other groupings of visual representations are displayed at a higher position on 
lower level functionality . For example , high level navigation 45 a page and less frequently accessed representations are 
options are , typically , first presented to the user . The high displayed at a lower position on the page , and may cause the 
level navigation options provide a summarized view of the computer device to display the visual representation on 
available content , making content based selections easy to 
appreciate and accomplish . A user selects a high level In a typically configuration , visual representations are 
navigation operation to navigate to more detailed operations . 50 organized based upon creation time , although certain visual 
In some embodiments , the more detailed operations are representations take precedence in the display . According to 
grouped based on a mode of content . Modes of content may one aspect , display precedence is established from left to 
include for example , media , channel , connection , applica right and from top to bottom . In one embodiment , the visual 
tion , and web , among other options . representation displayed in the upper left portion of the 
According to one embodiment , high level functions and 55 display screen is associated with the highest precedence . 

low level functions are segregated based on proximity to Precedence in the display may be influenced and even 
displays of sources of digital content . For example , a visual ignored with respect to certain system operations and the 
representation that maps to the source of digital content is visual representations that map to them . For example , a 
included in a lower level of functionality than the view that visual representation mapping to display for a user's book 
organizes the presentation of the visual representation . A 60 marks may appear in the upper left corner . According to one 
view that presents the digital content source itself , is embodiment , the positioning of the familiar option relating 
grouped at a lower level than the visual representation that to bookmarks as the visual representation of the highest 
maps to the digital content source . In another embodiment , precedence provides users with an option familiar to tradi 
interfaces that provide navigation operations to digital con tional use of computer systems . Although presented as a 
tent form a layer of the graphical user interface , and inter- 65 streamlined interface element , the bookmark visual repre 
faces that provide interaction options to digital content form sentation is configured to evoke familiarity in the typical 
a lower layer . In one embodiment , the home view includes computer user . 

another page . 
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According to another embodiment , the visual representa be appreciated that other representations may mapped to 
tion that maps to the computer functionality for creating different views , and different view may be used to map to 
interacting with a new web page is the only representation further views . ( 302 ) shows an e - mail being reviewed by the 
that has a fixed position , relative to the display precedence . user , and more specifically an e - mail from Chase Bank 
In one example , the element for triggering interaction with 5 indicating that the user's credit card statement has issued . 
a new web page is always display in the bottom right corner . The body of the e - mail ( 304 ) includes a link ( 306 ) for 
The other visual representation may be reshuffled based on accessing Chase's website . Selecting the link invokes an 
frequency of use , and in other embodiments a user may also open new page view operation by default , and in response to 
reshuffle the visual representation by drag and drop proce selection of ( 306 ) the user sees an animation returning the 
dures , however the element for triggering interaction with a 10 user to the home view ( 200 ) . The visual representation for 
new web page remains in the bottom right corner , and in one “ Browse the web ” ( 214 ) reveals the creation of a new visual 
example , will move to a new page in response to a request representation for accessing web content ( 216 ) by sliding 
to display an new web page element when the element is away from a new visual representation the takes the former 
already displayed in the bottom right corner of a page . Drag place of ( 214 ) . The computer system displays an animation 
and drop operations may be associated with a drag threshold . 15 that shows the computer display zooming into the page view 
In one example , a drag threshold is applied to require a small ( 300 ) of element ( 214 ) , shown in FIG . 3B . The user logs in 
movement of the identified card before the device executes and reviews his / her balance , shown in FIG . 3C at ( 350 ) . The 
the drag operation . The drag threshold may be measure on web page view further comprises navigation element ( 352 ) . 
the order of pixels , and may be any number of pixels that The user selects ( 352 ) to return the home view ( 200 ) , selects 
prevent accidental dragging in response to the user attempt . 20 ( 216 ) to access a new web page and in response a new web 
ing to click on a card . In one embodiment , the drag threshold content visual representation is created , further the device 
is set to 5 pixels . Other thresholds may be used , 2 , 3 , 4 , shows the display zooming into the new content . 
6 , ... pixels as examples . FIG . 5 displays a quick access view ( 500 ) . As the new 

Other display precedence may be employed . For example , card has not yet been mapped to content , the device displays 
display precedence may be configured based on user loca- 25 content options in order to generate a mapping . In one 
tion and language convention for the user location . The example , the content options may be based on frequency of 
written English language is read from left to right and from access . Shown at ( 502 ) are visual representations generated 
top to bottom ; however , other languages are not . According from the most frequently visited content . Selecting any of 
to some embodiments , display precedence and any corre the visual representations in the body ( 502 ) causes the 
sponding animations are configured to correspond with the 30 device to associate the mapping with the new card and zoom 
conventions of the local language , for example displaying into the selected content display . At ( 504 ) provided as an 
from right to left . element of the view's header ( 506 ) is a bookmarks control . 
Referring again to FIG . 2 , shown is an example of a page Through ( 504 ) bookmarks control a user may access content 

of the home view , with user interface elements organized to not display in the frequency list ( although a user may also 
present the user with summary information of available 35 enter a uniform resource identifier at ( 508 ) . 
content . Shown in FIG . 2 , at 202 , is a representation of In response to the selection of bookmarks a list of 
picture and video content available to the user . At 204 , a bookmarked content is displayed for selection , FIG . 6 , 600 . 
visual representation of customized content is available . The Upon selecting ( 602 ) a mapping to the bookmarked content 
customized content ( discussed further herein ) comprises rss is associated with the new visual representation . In one 
items from a web location distributing via an rss feed . In 40 alternative , a user may enter a uri for a online source to 
example shown , 204 , comprises a channel card . The channel associated with a new visual representation . The computer 
card is configured to allow easy interaction with a plurality zooms into the selected content and in this example , displays 
of rss items , and further configured to be responsive to both the web page view for ( 602 ) , Bank of America's ( BOA ) web 
lean forward interactions and lean backward modes of site , shown in FIG . 7A at ( 700 ) . The user logs in at ( 702 ) and 
interaction . The other user interface elements include , for 45 is able to pay the Chase bill just reviewed , shown at FIG . 7B , 
example , visual representations of web based content , spe ( 700 ) . Having visual representations mapped to content 
cialized user interface elements for providing customized available , improves the user's ability to transition between 
interaction with web based content in the form of channels , content views . By selecting the navigation element ( 752 ) the 
and system elements . user is returned to the home view , FIG . 8 , ( 800 ) , showing the 

A typical activity for any user includes reading his / her 50 visual representation ( 802 ) mapped to Chase's web page 
email . The user may observe an e - mail from for example , the content and the newly created visual representation ( 804 ) 
user's credit card company , Chase . The home view ( 200 ) is mapped to Bank of America's web site content . Selecting 
the default vehicle through which a user interacts with the ( 802 ) returns the user to the Chase content with the user's 
device and with electronic content displayed on the device . state preserved from the last visit , FIG . 3C , ( 350 ) . The user 
The home view presents an organization of other interactive 55 is able to immediately review the statement balance , and by 
elements ( 202-216 ) . Accessing e - mail occurs in response to selecting navigation element ( 352 ) return to the home view 
selecting the visual representation ( 208 ) that maps to ( 800 ) select ( 804 ) and enter the amount due for the Chase 
YAHOO ? MAIL content . Upon selecting ( 208 ) the device credit card at ( 754 ) . 
executes a mapping from the visual representation to the It is to be appreciated that visual representations mapped 
content and in response the device presents a first view of the 60 to computer content facilitate transitions between content , 
mapped content . According to one embodiment , in response and further by providing state preserving representations a 
to selection of a visual representation mapping to content of user is able to quickly retrieve and employ information 
web page a web page view is displayed . The web page view learned from content . 
is a zoomed in expression of the web based content mapped According to another aspect , the selection of a new visual 
by the visual representation . 65 representation is configured to employ a timer . According to 

Once a user reaches the web page view ( 300 ) FIG . 3A , the some embodiments , the timer is configurable based on user 
user may interact with the content shown . Although it is to selection , so that the animation may take longer , shorter , and 
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in some embodiments the user is permitted to disable the cards 921 which are selectable visual representations that are 
animation entirely - in one example this is accomplished by mapped either to computer functions or available computer 
setting the timer to allow 0 seconds for the animation , in content . Cards further comprise web cards 922 , that map 
another example the animation is simply disabled . In some views of web content including web pages ; channel cards 
embodiments , the timer is configurable by the system . Over 5 924 that map to customized views of content including web 
the course of use , the allotted time may be reduced by the based content and picture and video content ; nascent cards 
system automatically . Once a user has reached a certain time 926 that map to system functionality ; system cards 928 that 
on the streamlined device , the animation may be automati map to system functionality ; and shared cards 929 that can 
cally disabled by the system . For some embodiments where be any of the former discussed cards shared from another 
the timer may be configured based on time of use , different 10 user and / or streamlined device . The card layer 920 maps 
timers may be employed for different user profiles . Thus an either to computer functionality executed upon selection or 
experienced user may no longer see the animation , whereas additional views to provide interactive displays to the 
a novice user on the same device would see an extended device ' user , for example , the views illustrated in layer 930 . 
version of the animation . Page view 932 , according to one example , is a zoomed in 
Graphical User Interface 15 expression of a web page . At 940 shown is another layer 

Referring again to FIG . 11 , there is illustrated a block which includes a screen saver view , 942. In one embodi 
diagram of one example of an architecture of the portable ment , the screen saver view is a passive view . In one 
computer including a map user interface . The user interface example , the screen saver view may be activated by the 
“ home ” screen 170 that displays a plurality of modes of computer system remaining idle for a period of time . In one 
content 172. In the illustrated example , the home screen 170 20 embodiment , the screen saver view displays content from 
contains five modes of content 172 ; however , it is to be channel cards designated by a user in an options menu . In 
appreciated that the home screen may include more or fewer another embodiment , the screen saver view displays content 
than five modes of content and that the modes of content from a pictures and video card . In another embodiment , the 
may differ from the examples discussed . It should also be screen saver view displays content from a shared card . 
appreciated that different architectures may be invoked in 25 According to one embodiment , channel card view 914 
response to different device modes . For example , a portable comprises a view of the channel cards that are available to 
computer in laptop mode may display a home view as a user , and in another embodiment includes a channel 
discussed with respect to FIG . 11 , when configured in Easel selector ( not shown ) . The channel selector is a selectable 
mode , user is presented with a Channel View . Shown with display configured to be responsive to manipulation of a 
respect to FIG . 23 is an example of a portable computer set 30 scroll wheel . In one example , the channel selector is con 
in Easel mode , displaying a channel view . The Channel view figured to display a rolodex of available channel cards and 
may also display a plurality of modes of content . In FIG . 23 manipulation of a scroll wheel flips through the visual 
shown are visual representations of content ( 2304-2308 ) rolodex . Selection of one of the channel cards invokes any 
with associated mappings . of a channel page view 934 , content menu , and a channel 

According to another aspect , streamlining the presenta- 35 card full view , depending upon the device's configuration , 
tion and integration of features and services includes sim and in some examples the result is responsive to where on 
plifying the I / O devices that a user needs to operate in order the card a selection was made . Various cards , depending on 
to access features of the computer system and the features of the content mapped to , may also provide other views for 
any available service . According to another aspect , stream rendering and providing for user interaction with content , 
lining includes developing consistent visual representations 40 for example , time , 939 , album , 936 , and lens , 938 views . It 
of available content ( whether on the computer system itself is to be appreciated that the conceptual model illustrated in 
or from service providers ) . In another aspect , the organiza FIG . 9 is only one example of a conceptual model of the 
tion of interactive elements and responsiveness of the orga graphical user interface for streamlining user interaction 
nization to navigation options , device configurations , and with electronic content . Other conceptual models may be 
user preferences improves the user's ability to interact with 45 employed , for example only some of the layers may be 
the computer system and its content . In one embodiment , employed , additional layers may be used , and different 
system features and web features are consistently presented segmentations of the layers may be provided . 
as cards for the user to interact with to achieve their According to one embodiment , a method of presenting a 
computer objectives . In some embodiments , cards comprise streamlined graphical user interface for a streamlined device 
part of an interface layer between a computer user and a 50 includes an example process 5000 , FIG . 50. Process 5000 
user's computer based objective and / or computer operation . provides for organizing a plurality of views and GUI ele 
In some embodiments , the number and type of cards are ments into a consistent presentation for user interaction . At 
presented in as few as three classes and / or types . Each card 5002 provided is a first visual representation for displaying 
for example may be similar in aspect to the other , but each multiple content modes mapped to a view of computer 
performing a different class of function on the computer 55 content . At 5004 , a plurality of visual representations are 
system . organized by type of computer operation . At 5006 , the 

Referring to FIG . 9 , shown is a conceptual model 900 of graphical user interface presents higher level operations to 
an example graphical user interface . As shown , in FIG . 9 , users as a view including a group of visual representations . 
through a streamlined device 901 a user will interact will a AT 5008 , a user is permitted to select from the group of 
number of views of computer based content . In example 60 visual representations to navigate to lower level functions 
model 900 , depending on the device's configuration a user provided by different views of computer content . At optional 
will be presented a home view 912 or a channel card view step 5010 , a user may be permitted to select from within 
914. Conceptually 910 forms a layer of the mapped based different groups of visual representations to navigate to 
user interface , wherein the layer is configured to organize , further lower level views of computer content . 
manage and display streamlined views to the device's user . 65 According to another aspect , layers of the conceptual 
Layer 910 organizes , manages and displays objects of layer model are configured to respond to device configurations by 
920. Layer 920 , according to some embodiments includes defaulting and / or transitioning to different views based on 
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device configuration . Typically a device configured in a configured to be shared across users and across other stream 
laptop mode displays a home view , 912 , to a user as the lined devices . The ability to employ the features and func 
default view . In response to a transition in mode between tions of card based elements may be limited to streamlined 
laptop and easel the computer transitions the computer devices , although cards and settings may be shared with 
display from the home view , 912 , to the channel view , 914 , 5 traditional devices . 
as the default . A user may elect to change the default view , Shown in home view 200 , are web cards 206 , 208 , and 
for example by selecting a navigation button that executes a 216 , channel cards 204 , and 210 , further shown in home 
return to the home view . In one example , 168 , FIG . 17 , is view 200 are special system cards that map to content and 
configured to return a user to a home view in response to system operations , for example bookmark card 212. The 
selection of 168 , when the computer display is not on the 10 bookmark card 212 is configured to provide traditional 
home view . In the home view , a user may invoke a channel computer operations associated with conventional systems 
card view , 914 , by manipulating scroll wheel , 132 . and browsing methods . The bookmark card serves as learn 
Home View Embodiments ing tool , to provide features with which user are familiar in 

Referring again to FIG . 2 , shown is an example page of a new format that encourages further integration of card 
a home view , 200. Home views according to various 15 based interactions . According to one aspect , card interfaces 
embodiments are configured to render consistent organiza are generated by a user for each web based interaction , 
tion of elements of the graphical user interface . Each page eliminating the need for convention navigation in the form 
rendered in home view comprises a home navigation tool of bookmarks . Another example of a system card appears at 
250 , a header 252 , and a web search box 254. For home 214. 214 maps to functionality that when selected causes the 
views which include multiple pages , a hint or cut out of 20 computer system to execute a web card generation process . 
adjacent displays are rendered at 256 , for example . Hint or FIG . 10 illustrates an example generation process , 1000 . 
cut outs of adjacent displays may also occur at the bottom of Example processes , 1000 , begins at 1002 , in response to 
the display screen , the top of the display screen , and both top selection of a card or embedded web link ( e.g. 214 of FIG . 
and bottom , where multiple adjacent pages are present . 250 , 2 ) that is associated with a mapping to functionality that 
home navigation tool is responsive to the context in which 25 generates a new web card . For example process 1000 , may 
it is executed . For example , the home navigation tool , 250 , be initiated from a page view of a web card in response to 
when selected causes the computer to display the last selection of link . According to one embodiment , the behav 
accessed view before the computer displayed the home view . ior of the streamlined device depends on instruction embed 
Where a user navigates to the home view , 200 , from a web ded within a selected link . In particular , the device in 
page view , the selection of the home navigation tool 250 30 response to selection of a navigation link navigates to the 
caused the computer to display the previous web page view . identified location in the same page view . If the link encodes 
In other examples , the home navigation tool permits , tog an instruction for open in new window and / or open in new 
gling between other views and the home view , as illustrated tab , the device in response to selection generates a new card 
in FIG . 9 , at 932-939 and / or 914 . and displays the page view of the new card . Alternatively , 

According to some embodiments , the web page view 35 defaults may be established for link handling , including a 
includes a navigation tool , 350 , FIG . 3C , and in response to default for selection of a link contained inside an e - mail , 
selection , causes the computer to display the home view , which may default to a “ new card ” mapping , whereas in 
200. Other elements included in the home view , for example , some embodiments , links directed to the same domain as the 
header 252 are configured to provide consistency in the current view default to navigation functionality within the 
home view across pages and in some embodiments across 40 same window . In other words , in response to a selection of 
the user interface . Each page of the home view , 200 , further a link within a certain web - page , directing navigation to 
comprises a body , 258 , in which cards 202-216 are dis another location with in the same web page , the default 
played . The body is associated with a maximal display functionality executed , caused the device to navigate to the 
threshold . The maximal display threshold governs the num selected location within the same window . 
ber of GUI elements displayed per home view page . In one 45 According to another embodiment , handling of web links 
embodiment , the displayed elements may comprise cards , may also be governed entirely by the settings contained in 
and the maximal display threshold is set to display twelve the selected link . For example , the device may execute 
cards . In addition to the maximal number of displayed process 1000 in response to execution of a link including the 
elements , the home view may also comprise indicators of instruction to open in new window . The device may also 
adjacent content at 256. The device generates a new page 50 execute process 1000 in response to execution of a link 
display for the home view , 2000 , in response to exceeding including an instruction to open in a new tab . In one 
the maximal display threshold . embodiment , links without such references are processed by 
Home view 200 is the default view in laptop mode , and the web page view navigating to the linked location without 

may be implemented as the default view in other device invoking process 1000 , for example . 
modes ( e.g. frame , easel , flat modes ) . According to some 55 At 1002 , the mapping is executed and the computer 
embodiments , the home view is the primary mechanism for device determines its state at 1004. The state determination 
permitting users to access cards and navigation through is configured to identify a current view setting for the device . 
content viewed on the device . In the home view a user can Current view setting may be limited to an indication that the 
access open web sessions , view and manage their channels , device is current showing the home view . At 1006 Yes , the 
initiate new web sessions , and launch other activities . 60 device is currently showing the home view , and the device 

Cards , e.g. 202-216 , form comprises a plurality of types . executes a card generation animation , at 1008. In one 
Some card types are organized by function , some by content . example , the animation causes the device to display a 
The home view is comprised of various cards , each card browse the web card 214 , FIG . 2 , sliding away from a new 
providing access to computer based content . According to visual representation the takes the former place of 214. One 
one aspect , cards can be thought of as the building blocks of 65 the new card image is shown the computer display renders 
the user interface , providing access to a plurality of views an animation the causes the user to perceive zooming into 
and / or content . Indeed , cards as elements of the GUI , are the newly created card at 1010. Alternatively , it is deter 
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mined that the device's current display is not the home view plished by clicking on a visual object using a pointer 
at 1006 NO . At 1012 , apparent motion relative to the user is displayed on the computer screen . A second “ click ” may 
rendered by the device to provide the appearing of zooming then cause the computer system to execute functionality 
to the home display . Other animations may be employed to associated with the visual object . Execution should be read 
establish for the user the perception of motion to the home 5 to include initiating an operation associated with a visual 
view . Once at the home view , process 1000 , proceeds as object , in one example execution will include clicking on a 
before . visual object ( single or multiple " clicks " ) , by positioning a According to one embodiment , the home view , FIG . 2 . pointer display over the visual object and depressing a 200 , is configured to manage and organize cards . The home button to initiate the operation . view provides a simple and convenient mode of navigating 10 Focus may be resolved on a computer system by analyz through the features and content accessible through the ing content intended to be displayed before its display on the device by organizing and managing cards . 

Card Examples computer system , additionally focus may be responsive to 
According to some embodiments of systems and methods actions taken on the display through for example pointing 

devices . for streamlining user interaction with electronic content , 15 
visual representation that render computer operation and / or According to one embodiment , when a web card or 
content in a consistent manner further comprise cards . channel card appears is in a hover state 1404 , additional 
According to one embodiment , cards may further comprise options are display in the card header , for example at 1450 . 
types , including web cards , which map to active web pages . The additional tools displayed in the card header permit a 
In some embodiments , device configuration sensitive dis- 20 user to select the options associated with the card . The 
plays are provided through a graphical user interface . In options view for a card 1406 , displays available selections 
some embodiments the device configuration sensitive dis contained in the options . For a web card 1410 , the options 
plays include cards . Cards may come in a number of forms . include make a channel 1452. The selection of make a 
In some embodiments cards may be classified according to channel at 1452 causes the device to execute functionality 
the functionality that they provide to a particular user . For 25 that transforms the web card into a channel card . The 
example , system cards provide and display computer system transformation from web card to channel card includes 
functionality that maybe frequently accessed during ordi transforming the display image of the card element on any 
nary computer user and / or may be required for computer corresponding view . 
use . In some embodiments , web cards provide a user inter Typically the transformation may only be made for a web 
face for web based content and / or web based activity . In 30 card that references a content including a rss feed . The items 
some embodiments , channel cards provide additional fea in the rss feed are configured into a customized presenta 
tures that enable a user to better interact with web based tion as for example a channel card 1412 ( discussed further 
content , and in another example , channel cards provide herein ) . For a channel card 1412 , additional options are 
interactive views by utilizing different content presentations include show in screensaver , for example . Other states may 
provided by a web source . Consistent user interfaces provide 35 impact the display of web card including a drag and drop 
an access layer to system and web based content . Consistent state . Upon focus , the additional tools will resolve in the 
user interfaces are used to access web based content , and header section of the card , the additional tools may be 
even content and applications provided by third parties . displayed as icons , as shown in FIG . 14 , and may also be 

In one example , a web card presents a thumbnail view of rendered as selectable text options include " bookmark , ” 
the current state of the web page . In another example , the 40 " share , " " options , ” and “ close . ” If a user depresses the 
web page card presents a cut out view of the web page based button control and does not release , the user may user drag 
on computer focus within the page at the time the web page and drop the card within the home view . The card may be 
view was exited . FIG . 14 illustrates , according to one dragged across pages of the home view , and the user may 
embodiment , the behavior and rendered display of certain reorder the presentation of cards in the home view using 
cards responsive to computer focus and selection by a user . 45 multiple drag and drop operations . According to one 
A card may be in a number of states based on computer embodiment , as a card is dragged across the home view , all 
focus . One example of computer focus would include displaced cards will appear to move into new places . 
" hover " 1404 - hover indicates the movement of a pointer , According to another aspect , computer content and inter 
typically represented by a white arrow on the computer active functionality is recast into cards . In one embodiment , 
system display , over a card . A card may be in a normal state 50 the card comprises a visual representation of web content 
1402 when not in focus . that simplify the user's interaction with even the most 

Focus is intended to include any identification by the sophistication on - line tools . Cards are configured to present 
computer system of the card , short of execution of the a summarized view of available content and / or present a 
mapping associated with it . For example , focus should visual indication of available functions . According to one 
include identification by tabbing through available cards , 55 embodiment , cards form a part of the structure of the 
identification by using hotkeys , among other options that graphical user interface between the system and the user . In 
result in computer focus resolving on the card . The terms various embodiments , cards are configured to be context 
computer focus and focus should be read to include hovering and / or content sensitive . Some cards are configured to be 
over a screen element , tool , or other visual representation persistent . Persistent card may be removed by an affirmative 
displayed on a computer system display . In one example , 60 act of the user 
focus follows a displayed pointer , and movement of the With cards , content can be easily and visually absorbed by 
pointer with , for example , a mouse causes the computer a user . In some embodiments , cards serve to maintain a 
system to resolve computer focus on the visual object under current state of the user's activity . And in some embodi 
the pointer display . Selection by a user or a computer system ments , cards also serve to focus the displayed content on 
may include focus and visual objects displayed on a com- 65 contextual information . Cards may be configurable by the 
puter system display may be selected by moving a displayed users . Configurations options are presented to the user 
pointer . In some embodiments , selection may be accom consistently . In some examples , this includes displaying 

22 
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consistent animations designed to draw the user's focus to content view . The content view may include a display of 
the particular activity and to provide comfort level for the computer operations . In one alternative , the content view 
activity being displayed . provides an interactive view of computer content . In one 
Shown in FIG . 43 is an example process 4300 for stream example the computer content , comprises online content 

lining user interactions with computer content . The process 5 viewed through a web browser . In another example , the 
includes presenting a consistent look and feel for user access content view is presented in a similar format as the visual to computer operations and computer content for user inter representation used to navigate to the content . In one par 
face elements that also provide for a reduction in decision ticular example , the content view includes a header display making requirements imposed on a user during conventional and a body display , and the content is displayed in the body computer use . At 4302 , a user is presented with a first visual 10 portion . The header portion provides additional information representation in a computer display , the visual representa on the content , for example a title , and may further provide tion is responsive to computer focus and at 4304 , and the additional tools that are responsive to focus . Again provid user is permitted to resolve computer focus by selecting the 
visual representation . Selection and focus can be thought of ing tools that resolve when needed and disappear when not 
in terms of a visual pointer display on the computer system 15 reduces the amount of information a computer user need to 
display , by moving the pointer over an object displayed on assimilate in order to use a computer system . 
the computer display , computer focus may be resolved on All computer content and operations can be configured to 
the visual object . Alternatively , a user may have to indicate display in visual representations and respective focus visual 
a selection of the object by clicking on a mouse button for representations , providing a user with a streamlined presen 
example . 20 tation of computer content and operations . According to 
According to one embodiment clicking is not required . In another example , different content types are presented 

another embodiment , the pointer being displayed above a through visual representation of a similar format . In one 
visual object activates a “ hover ” state . In response to hov embodiment , the visual representations comprise cards as 
ering , computer focus is resolved on the visual object . At discussed herein . 
4306 , a focus visual representation is displayed to the user . 25 A process 4400 may be invoked by streamlined computer 
According to one embodiment , the visual representation and system as part of process 4300. Additionally , process 4400 
the focus representation are configured to have common may operate independently or be called from other pro 
elements , and in particular , a header and body display for cesses . Shown in FIG . 44 is a process 4400 , for permitting 
rendering computer content associated with the visual rep a user to interact with computer content . At 4402 , a com 
resentations . The focus visual representation including a 30 puter system displays a first content view . The first content 
header and body display summarizing at least one of com view is configured to display in a similar format as a visual 
puter content and computer operations are shown at 4308 . representation selected by the user to navigate to the content 
The visual representations present a multitude of computer view . In one emb liment , the first content view includes a 
content in a streamlined form , in other words , the visual header and body display . In another embodiment the content 
representation forms an indirection layer of functionality 35 view is a zoomed in view of the visual representation used 
that provides a window into digital content , and / or computer to navigate to the content view . At 4404 , an enlarged view 
operations linked to the visual representation . In particular , of the first visual representation is displayed . In one 
a visual representation mapped to a web page for example , example , the content view comprises a web browser view of 
provides a view of the web page in the body of the visual a web page displayed in the body of the content view . The 
representation and provides additional information about the 40 visual representation used to navigate to the content view 
web page in the header display . The header display may also displays a portion of the web browser in the body of the 
include tools for providing easy access to computer func visual representation . At 4406 , a user is permitted to interact 
tionality associated with the web page and / or its content . In with the content displayed in the body of the content view . 
one example the header display only display the tools in the The user is further permitting to access options associated 
focus visual representation so the initial view of the content 45 with the content through the header display . Optionally , 
is not cluttered with tools that are not needed . Further , in one further computer logic may be included in process 4400 for 
embodiment , the tools only display in response to focus , in presenting focus and unfocused views of the header in the 
other words , only when a user indicates they are necessary content view . 
by moving a display pointer over the visual representation . According to another aspect , cards types should be clearly 
Further computer logic may be embodied in process 4300 , 50 defined by color scheme and appearance , while at the same 
responsive to a display position of a pointer displayed on the time maintaining a similar format . For example the similar 
computer screen . In response to the display position of the format should include header placement and sizing , display 
pointer occupying the same location as another visual of tools , title and frame size . In one embodiment , a color 
object , computer focus is resolved on that object , causing the scheme configured to differentiate card types provides for 
computer system to determine functionality associated with 55 web cards with white headers with the content displayed on 
the object . the web card showing as a thumbnail of the current state of 

In one example , the object is a visual representation , and the page . Channel cards are configured with black headers , 
in response to moving the pointer over the visual represen and the content presented in the channel card comprises a 
tation , the computer is caused to display a focus visual simplified representation of web content based on RSS feeds 
representation associated with the visual representation . In 60 or custom visualizations of some non - RSS websites . Cus 
one example , computer focus remains with the focus rep tomized visualizations may be pre - loaded on the device for 
resentation and functionality associated with the focus rep specific websites , or may be provided as part of a remotely 
resentation is made available for execution . Other operations stored device profile and / or global profile . Updates to the 
including display of a header responsive to focus may be device profile and / or a global profile would include devel 
executed . At 4310 , a mapping associated with at least one of 65 opment of customized visualizations of non - RSS websites , 
the focus visual representation and the visual representation and access to remote storage trigger delivery of the custom 
is executed causing the computer system to navigate to a ized visualizations . According to one embodiment , only 
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sites for which RSS or custom visualizations are available during the course of ordinary activity . By selecting the new 
can be displayed as channel cards . card ( for example , creating a web card used to interact with 

System cards are shown either with blue headers or grey web content ) a consistent animation may be employed to 
headers . System cards may be further classified to include display to the user the creation of the new web card utilizing 
nascent cards . “ Browse the Web ” card , FIG . 2 , 214 is an 5 the nascent “ new card ” card . Other system features may be 
example of a nascent card . The nascent card may be con presented through system cards . Typically , system cards will 
figured so it position is not configurable , nor is a user able represent functionality used most frequently and / or func 
to remove the card from the home view , or any view . The tionality that should always be available and not subject to 
nascent card maps to functionality necessary to operation of removal by a user . Other card types , include web cards that 
the streamlined device , and thus no option to close and / or 10 are used to present web content , and channel cards that are 
remove it is available . Other system cards are configured to used to provide to a user easy and / or consistent access to 
represent activities that have been specifically designed such additional features . 
as for example , photos & video card ( s ) . The other system According to another aspect , features of cards may 
cards map to functionality also regarded as necessary so that include consistent navigation tools , consistent content dis 
the other system cards can not be deleted , however , the other 15 play — including limiting the ability to alter content of a card 
system cards can be reorganized in for example the home through user interaction with the card , state representative 
view . Functionality mapped to by the other system cards images of content , state and context representative images of 
include communications card , for configuring wireless content , customized visualization of content , and in some 
access of the device , bookmarks for presenting conventional examples customized visualizations include information 
styled web page bookmarks , camera for providing for con- 20 derived from rss content . In one embodiment , user interac 
figuration and operation of a camera , either embedded in the tions with cards are also streamlined . In another embodi 
device upon construction , or incorporated through for ment , when card configurations and / or card options are 
example a USB port selected by a user ( if available ) a consistent animation is 

In one embodiment , a system card is mapped to function presented to the user . For example , selection of a card's 
ality to provide a user with streamlined access to web 25 options may cause an animation displaying the flipping of 
bookmarks . In one example , a bookmark card is provided the card and the revelation of user selectable options . 
that is always accessible from the home view . As with other Options , for example , may include permitting the content 
system cards , the bookmark card comprises a header and a reflected in the card to be displayed as a screen saver . Certain 
body . According to one embodiment , the body display for features may only be available for certain cards types . In one 
the bookmark card is unique to the bookmark card . Book- 30 embodiment for example only channel cards ( discussed in 
marks are retrieved and displayed in the bookmark card one greater detail herein ) may be displayed in the screensaver 
at a time . In one example , the bookmark card indicates in the mode , thus only channel cards will display the option to 
body display the number of the bookmark in the list and the permit display in screensaver . In another embodiment , cer 
total number of bookmarks available . tain card types may be converted through user selection . In 

According to some embodiments , the interactivity of 35 one embodiment , web cards may be converted into channel 
individual cards is limited to navigation to a page view . For cards . It is realized that the segregation of functions between 
example , a user can not change the content of a card by the card types may improve user interaction and adoption of 
interacting only with the card . In other embodiments , chan the different feature sets available to each . 
nel cards , for example , provide a user with the option of According to another embodiment , systems and methods 
interacting directly with the card . Upon hover , channel cards 40 for streamlining user interaction with electronic content may 
presenting news feeds may resolve navigation tools config include a process for generating new visual representations 
ured to step through individual rss items displayed in the mapped to computer content . Shown in FIG . 47A is an 
channel card . Additionally , selection within a channel card example process 4700 , for generating a user interface ele 
presenting a news feed causes the device to execute different ment . At 4702 , a visual representation associated with a 
mappings depending on what part of the channel card was 45 computer operation for creating a new visual representation 
selected for execution . Clicking directly on an rss feed is displayed on a computer system display . The visual 
headline for example , caused the device to execute a map representation may comprise a nascent card . Nascent cards 
ping to the web page view for that article . Selecting the body are configured to always be available to a user , that is , they 
of the channel card causes the device to execute a mapping are configured so a user can not remove them . In some 
to the channel full view . Selection within the channel full 50 embodiments , the position of the display of nascent cards 
view causes the device to display a content menu , responsive cannot be changed by the user . In one embodiment , the 
to manipulation of a scroll wheel . nascent card is always displayed in a home view , at the 

In an embodiment employing a three card presentation , bottom right corner of a home view page . For a new page 
the cards that are presented provide the user with the ability this may include the nascent card appearing in the upper left 
to interact with system specific features . System features 55 corner of the page , when no other cards are displayed on the 
may be invoked and display using consistent presentation same page . At 4704 , execution of the functionality associ 
and / or animation . Consistent presentation of like features ated with the visual representation occurs . At 4706 , a first 
may engender a comfort level in the user for new features animation is displayed to the computer system user showing 
that appear using the same and / or similar presentation . the visual representation sliding away from its present 
Additionally , where a user invokes features in a similar or 60 location to reveal a new visual representation . At 4708 , a 
consistent manner , access of new features is facilitated and second animation is displayed to a user showing the com 
user comfort level may be increased . For example , a nascent puter system zoom into the new visual representation to 
card , is a system card that provides for consistent imple present a quick access view at 4710 . 
mentation of user activity and / or a computer objective The quick access view is configured to permit a user to 
desired by the user . In one embodiment , the “ new card ” card 65 select computer content to associate with the new visual 
is a visual representation of a system placeholder for gen representation . In one example , this includes presenting a 
eration and presentation of new card that a user may created display of frequently accessed web content ( e.g. web pages ) 
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to the user in the quick access display . It is likely that the The current state thumbnail may be updated . Updates may 
user will intend to return to a page frequently accessed , in occur in conjunction with a timer . Typically the timer is set 
which case , the display will meet the users needs , however , for default operation , and is not configurable by a user , 
the quick access view is further configured to permit entry although in some embodiments a user may access and 
of a uniform resource indicator ( e.g. a url ) , and further 5 modify an update interval for web cards through system 
configured to allow a user to request display of bookmarked configurations . 
locations . At 4712 , a user is permitted to select computer The body of a channel card ( not shown ) comprises a 
content to associate with the new visual representation , and visualization of the rss feed from the web site source . Sites 
in response to selection of the computer content , the com that do not have rss feeds , typically , will not be able to be 
puter system displays an animation to the user depicting the 10 displayed as channel cards . However , customized visualiza 
computer system zooming into a first view of the selected tions for some static sites are preloaded and for the pre 
content at 4714 . loaded static sites an rss feed is not used to display the web 

In one alternative , new visual representation may be site content in a channel card . System card body ( not shown ) 
generated without selecting a nascent card , in process 4750 , comprises a custom image configured to represent the sys 
FIG . 47B . For example , a web card may include a hyperlink 15 tem activity mapped to by the system card . 
directing a computer system to display the linked web page Options and Information Associated with Various Card 
in a new window . At 4752 , a user selects an open in new Embodiments 
window link . In one alternative , the link may include According to one embodiment , selection of the card 
instruction to open an new tab . In response to a request to options icon causes the device to display a visualization of 
display a web page in a new window , a new visual repre- 20 the card turning over . The “ back side ” of the card , FIG . 16 
sentation is generated and associated with a mapping to the ( showing a plurality of examples of the backs of various card 
web page . The computer system displays a transition from types ) comprises the following options : Show as channel 
the current web card view to the home view , 4754 , display 1602 , which transforms a web card into a channel card , and 
ing the nascent card . In an optional step , the process zooms vice - versa , based either upon checking or unchecking box 
out the home view so that the nascent card is rendered on one 25 1604. If the channel is a photo and video channel , this 
page . The system presents an animation to the user , 4756 , control reads “ Show as channel using [ lens ] . " A lens is a 
similar to step 4706 , showing the nascent card sliding away customized visualization for computer content . Shown in 
from its position , revealing a new visual representation . The FIG . 16 is an example lens “ Slideshow ” at 1606 . 
system then zooms in on the new representation , 4758 , According to another embodiment , the option for show as 
displaying a first view of the mapped content , 4760 . 30 channel is either shown as permanently checked for system 

Common Card Configurations cards that are always available as a channel ( e.g. the photos 
According to one aspect , cards should have common and video card ) , or as absent for system cards that are not 

features to promote user acceptance and improve adoption available as a channel ( e.g. a system settings card or com 
of different cards , while providing familiar a form . Accord munications card ) . Show in screensaver , 1608 , is an avail 
ing to some embodiments , most cards are configured with a 35 able option for channel cards . Typically 1608 is not an 
similar anatomy . According to some embodiments , cards available option for other card types , however , the photo and 
comprise certain common elements described with reference video system card does permit its content to be displayed in 
to illustrated examples . the screensaver . According to one example , new channel 

With reference to FIG . 15A shown is an example of a web cards are configured to not display in screensaver mode by 
card when not in focus , however , the common features 40 default and this option is not checked for new channel cards . 
among the cards are discussed in greater detail . Header 1502 Shared from , 1610 , provides information on the user or 
run along the top of the card . The color depends on the color device from which the card was shared . According to one 
scheme employed to differentiation the type of card : in one embodiment , system cards cannot be shared , and do not 
example white is used for web cards , black for channel display " shared from ” information . Additionally , shared 
cards , and blue and grey for system cards . Optionally the 45 from 1610 , does not display for card generated by a present 
header includes a favicon 1504 ( the favicon may be user . In one example , shared from 1610 is responsive to 
retrieved from the site being view in the case of web and computer focus ( e.g. hover ) . Hovering over the Shared From 
channel cards and a custom favicon is employed for system line , 1610 , causes the device to display an informational 
cards ) . The header further comprises a title 1506 for the site bubble with a list of people to whom the card was shared . 
or activity conducted , and a body 1508. In response to focus 50 Other options may be employed for displaying shared from 
on a card the display of the card becomes a little larger information . Other options may include linking to a display 
relative to its display when out of focus and the card controls list for share from information , and in some embodiments 
1552-1556 , FIG . 15B , are revealed on the header , when in may include displaying the shared entities on the back of the 
a focused state . card without selecting 1610 , Shared From . In such embodi 

Card options 1552 , reveals the card options , and may in 55 ments a maximum number of shared entities may be dis 
some embodiments invoke an animation of the card flipping played before requiring selection of a more control . The 
to reveal selectable options . Share , 1554 , is configured to more control expands on the list of shared entities to provide 
permit a user to share the card with other user . Delete , 1556 , for listings that do not fit within the space provided on the 
removes the card from the home view . Card controls , such back of a card . 
as 1552-1556 are typically not available for system cards , 60 Shared to , 1612 , provides information about whether and 
which typically can not be shared or deleted . According to to whom the card has been shared . According to one 
one embodiment , the photos & video system card is con embodiment , system cards can not be shared , thus no shared 
figured to display the card options ( in one example the photo to information is displayed . By default shared to , 1612 , does 
& video system card permits selection of “ Show in screen not display until a card has been shared . According to some 
saver ” ) . 1508 , FIG . 15A , card body varies by the type of 65 embodiments , the “ shared to ” field is responsive to focus . In 
card displayed . In one embodiment , a web card body 1508 one example , hovering over the shared to line causes the 
comprises a thumbnail of the current state of the web page . device to display an informational bubble with the list of 
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people to whom the card has been shared . Other options may displayed in a home view . The most frequently accessed 
be employed for displaying shared to information . Other content may be display first with the least frequently 
options may include linking to a display list for share to accessed content being display last . Another option includes 
information , and in some embodiments may include dis the use of last accessed information associated with a 
playing the shared entities on the back of the card without 5 particular card . The most recently accessed card may be 
selecting 1612 , shared to . In such embodiments a maximum displayed first and the card with oldest use would be 
number of shared entities may be displayed before requiring displayed last . 
selection of a more control ( not shown ) . The more control Creating New Cards 
expands on the list of shared entities to provide for listings An example process 1040 , FIG . 10B may be executed to 
that do not fit within the space provided on the back of a 10 generate a new card . Process 1040 is executed in response 
card . Optionally the more control may cause the device to to a user clicking the Browse the Web card on the home view 
display an information bubble containing the remaining at step 1042. In response to the execution of the Browse the 
shared entities and / or all the shared entities . Web card , the devices displays the card sliding to the right 

Organization of the Home View ( or down to the far left on the next row if it is already on the 
Typically , the home view is configurable by the user . New 15 far right ) as a new web card is created in its place at 1044 . 

items may be added , existing items may be moved and / or At 1046 the system renders apparent motion in the display , 
removed based on user selection . The home view further showing the system zooming into the new web card . At 
comprises some visual representations that can not be 1048 , the system displays a quick access view configured to 
removed . Commonly requested system operations have generate a mapping between the new card and web based 
visual representation displayed on the home view that can 20 content . According to some embodiments , newly added 
not be deleted . According to one embodiment , a user may cards ( whether created by the user or received as a shared 
reorganize the display but not remove representations for card from another user ) always appear at the bottom of the 
system operations . For example , visual representations that home view next to the Browse the Web card . In other 
map to system operations ( e.g. a communication card and a embodiments , the Browser the Web card may display a 
camera card ) cannot be remove from the home view . 25 different title , for example , “ New Card . ” It is to be appre 
Nascent cards , for example , the Browse the web card , can ciated that the title is not particularly relevant to the nascent 
not be removed from the home view . According to some card , but rather , the functionality for generating new card is . 
embodiments , the Browse the web card is further limited in New cards may also be created on the fly during a 
configurability , in that , the positioning of the card will not browsing session as part of process 1080 , FIG . 10C . Process 
change relative to the other cards . For example , the Browse 30 1080 begins at 1082 in response to either a user clicking an 
the web card will always be displayed last . In other " open in new window ” link on a web page , or in response 
examples , nascent cards may have other positions that do not to a user executing a keyboard shortcut ( e.g. Shift - click ) to 
change , first to be displayed , last displayed on first page of perform the same function . Additionally links that contain 
the home view , etc. In some embodiments , even nascent computer instructions to open link in new tab will invoke the 
cards may be reorganized in the home view display . 35 same functionality at 1082. In these cases , the system shows 

The user interface may include default settings for orga an animation zooming out of the current card to the home 
nization . For example , a default organization for the home view at 1084 , optional step 1086 cause the system to display 
view comprises an arrangement roughly based on order of movement to the last page of the home view ( if not there 
creation , from left to right , top to bottom . Other organization already ) , at 1088 the Browse the Web card slides out of the 
may be employed right to left , top to bottom . In one 40 way , revealing the new card in its place at 1090 , and finally 
example , the user of the streamline device is located in zooming into the new card , 1092. Process 1080 , may be 
China , and the default organization is presented from right implement in association with a timer to govern the overall 
to left . execution time of process 1080. In one example , the process 

One example default setting for the home view establishes and animations should take no more than about half a 
a number of cards to display per page of the home view . In 45 second . 
one example the default caused the computer to render According to one embodiment , selection of the Browse 
twelve cards on a page . In another example , the display of the Web system card causes the system to execute a process 
the twelve cards further comprises the tops of the cards on for generating a new web card . As part of the process for 
the next page or the bottoms of the cards on the previous generating a new card , the system presents a quick access 
page , as appropriate . In one embodiment , the home view 50 view to the user . Referring again to FIG . 5 , shown is an 
includes maximal display thresholds configured to improve example of a quick access view . As discussed earlier , the 
the ability of the user to absorb the information presented . In body 502 of the quick access view may display a frequently 
some embodiments , a maximal number of visual represen accessed list of content . A user may select from the dis 
tations per screen is set . In one example , the maximal played content to generate a mapping for the new cards , and 
number of visual representations is used to define a GUI 55 enter the web page view for that content . Additional at 510 , 
page . In another example , the maximal number of visual the quick access view presents news from , for example , the 
representations is associated with a maximal number of full device manufacturer . At 510 , news regarding operation of a 
view visual representations , and the page is configured to streamlined device may be shared with the streamlined 
include portions of views of other visual representations device user community . Advice on new features may be 
available on adjacent pages . A computer operation that 60 provided , 512. And awareness drawn to new features . Hints 
would cause the computer device to exceed the maximal and suggestions may also be displayed , for example , 514 , 
number results in the creation of a new display page . The referring users to GOOGLE DOCS , and on - line word pro 
home view is organized into as many pages are required in cessing / office suite solution . 
order to maintain the maximal threshold of display items . According to another embodiment , creation of a channel 

It is to be appreciated the different organization options 65 card is available for sites with rss feeds or sites for which 
may be employed for the home view . In one alternative , customized visualizations are available . From the home 
frequency of use may be employed to organize the cards view any web card with rss feeds or with customized 
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visualizations can be used to generate a channel card . From screen the user causes the device to display the previous 
a web page view , hovering over the option add channel page of the home view . Additionally , according to one 
caused the system to display a preview of the channel card . embodiment , arrow keys provided on the device's keyboard 
In one embodiment a channel card includes features not may be used to navigate pages of the home view . In one 
observed in web or system card . For example , channel card 5 alternative , keyboard shortcuts mapped to navigation func 
204 , includes a display , 280 , for an individual rss item tionality . In one example , keys with mapped navigation 
received from the online source . In this case the rss item is functionality include shift - arrow , crtl - arrow , alt - arrow to 
a headline that permits direct access to an article ( typically provide further navigation options . 
through a web card ) . Channel card , 204 , will display a One may navigate away from the home view at any time 
plurality of rss items one at a time through the channel card , 10 by selecting a visual representation and causing the device 
thus the content in a channel card periodically changes , until to execute the mapping associated with the representation . 
al content items have been displayed . At that time the In one embodiment , a user selects a card and in response the 
channel cards starts again from the beginning displaying device renders a page view appropriate for the selected card 
each one of the plurality of source items . ( e.g. web page view for a web card ) . In one embodiment , an 
Removing Cards 15 integrated scroll wheel provides navigation functionality 
According to one embodiment , the home view may be from the home view . Scroll wheel functionality may be 

configured by a user . A user may remove visual represen dependent on state of the device , and may also be dependent 
tations from the home view . In a card example , a user may on configuration of the device . In one example , the device's 
access card option by providing focus on the card . As present state is its home view and manipulation of the scroll 
discussed above , card options are revealed in response to 20 wheel causes the device to display the channel card view . 
focus . Options may comprise a delete option . In one According to one embodiment , returning to the home view 
example , a delete option is display as an “ X ” in the upper is streamlined for the user . This may be accomplished 
right corner of a hover view of a card . To delete a card from through navigation buttons on the keyboard , for example 
the home view , a user executes the delete option by clicking 168 , FIG . 17. The navigation button operates as a toggle 
on the “ X. ” In response to removal of a card from the home 25 between present view and home view , returning a user to the 
the view , the remaining cards on the home view are reor home view when the present view is elsewhere , and return 
dered by the device . In one example , the reordering com ing the user to the previous view when the present view is 
prises shifting of the displayed cards to rearrange them into the home view . A navigation element provided in visual 
the organizational schemes discussed above . In order to representation of computer content may also provide the 
ensure a close / delete selection was intended and to provide 30 same functionality . For example , navigation button 250 , in 
the user with the ability to change their mind , an information home view 200. In another example , a navigation button , 
display bubble may be generated in response to the delete 352 , FIG . 3C is provided in a web page view . 
execution . The information display bubble maps to func Reorganization of visual elements in the home view may 
tionality that causes the device to undo the delete operation implicate navigation with the home view . In one example 
in response to selection by the user . 35 where the home view presents cards to a user through 

According to one embodiment , a dialog bubble is dis multiple pages , moving cards across the pages requires 
played off of the header of the home view . The dialogue navigation within the home view . According to one embodi 
bubble displays a message confirming the delete operation ment , specialized navigation options are provide to render 
and further comprising a mapping to functionality provided , sufficient context for the relocation across pages . In one 
the causes the device to undo the delete operation in 40 example , a user drags a card across pages within a home 
response to selection . According to another embodiment , view . The device in response to the drag across pages 
hot - key functionality is provided that cause the device to modifies the display of the home view to show a zoomed out 
undo that last activity performed by the device . In one display of the home view . The zoomed out display is 
example , ctrl - z , is mapped to functionality that permits the permitted to violate any associated threshold with respect to 
last activity to be undone . 45 number of displayed items on a page of the home view . The 
Home View Navigation zoomed out display in a view of multiple pages with each 
According to one embodiment , the home view in config element of the pages being reduced in size to allow them to 

ured to display a maximum number of visual representa be displayed in one screen . For long lists of cards , or other 
tions . For embodiments employing cards that map to com visual representations , this may result in extremely small 
puter content and / or operations the maximal number of 50 visual representations or cards . It is realized that even 
visual representations will restrict the number of cards thought the result may be visual representations so small that 
displayed per page of the home view . In one example the they cannot be fully appreciated , the user goal is to relocate 
display number is set to twelve . In response to exceed the a card , and the temporary loss of interactivity to the user will 
display number , the device executes operations designed to not impact the user operation . Once a card is relocated , the 
render a new page for the excess . In response to multiple 55 device caused the display to “ zoom ” back out to conform to 
pages , the device is configured to display indications of management and organization scheme discussed , including 
content ( e.g. cards ) on adjacent pages . In response to move maximal display thresholds , for example . 
ment of a pointer , visual representation displayed on the Navigation away from the home view may also occur 
screen tracking computer focus , new pages may be dis through selection of the visual representations that map to 
played . In one example , multiple pages are provided by the 60 computer content and / or functionality . In one embodiment , 
view . The display rendered by the device give a user the clicking on a card will zoom into that card , revealing the 
impression that adjacent pages appear above and below the page view for that card . In one example , clicking on a web 
current page view . For example , indications of adjacent card card caused the device to display the web page view for that 
content appear at the top and bottom of the home view body . card's content . In another , clicking on a channel card may 
By scrolling the pointer towards the bottom of the screen the 65 invoke different behavior . In a channel card example , the 
user causes the device to display the next page of the home navigation behavior depends on the location within the card 
view , further by scrolling the pointer towards the top of the that is clicked . 
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Some channel card embodiments , display items from rss trates one example process , 4500 , for providing consistent 
feeds one at a time , scrolling through the rss items based on accessibility to computer content across a plurality of views 
a timer , and in one embodiment , based on selection of and a plurality of visual representations of computer content 
navigation tools within the card . If a user clicks on the body and / or operations . At 4502 , a view of computer content is 
of the channel card for example , the device causes the 5 provided . The view is configured to include visual elements 
channel page view to be displayed for that card . If a user responsive to computer focus , however achieved . The view 
clicks on an rss item displayed in the channel card , the of computer content includes a header display further com 
device causes a web page view for the specific content to be prising a focus header display and an unfocused header 
displayed . In one embodiment , a channel card maps to a display . In response to focus , the focus header display 
content feed from the NEW YORK TIMES . Clicking on an 10 reveals additional controls associated with the computer 
article title in the channel cards causes the system to execute content , 4504. At 4506 , focus is removed from the focus 
a mapping to the content by opening a new web card and header display and the computer system transitions the view 
zooming into the new card's web page view of the selected of content to an unfocused header display , concealing the 
article . Clicking elsewhere the channel card causes the additional controls at 4506. In one embodiment , responsive 
system will zoom in to the channel page view for that card . 15 ness to focus provides for user consistency in accessing a 

According to one embodiment , searching from the home plurality of views and with respect to visual representations 
view causes the user interface to navigate away from the of computer content , and at 4508 a plurality of representa 
home view . For example , entering search terms into search tions and views provide additional focus responsive dis 
box 254 , FIG . 2 , cause the device to execute a process for plays , which are configured to include focused and unfo 
generating a new web card and navigating to the page view 20 cused presentations . 
of the newly created web card . The device in creating the According to another aspect , methods and systems for 
new web card automatically creates a mapping to web streamlining user interaction with computer content and 
content based on default settings . In one example , the operations may include a process for providing consistent 
default settings provide for searching to occur through the feature accessibility by providing a primary means for 
well known search tool GOOGLE . Other search tools may 25 navigation to computer content and computer operations to 
be established as the default . By accessing a system card for occur through a consistent view . FIG . 46 , shows an example 
settings , in one example , displayed as a Settings card , a user process , 4600 , for providing consistent navigation opera 
may change the default for the search tool . Further default tions to a user . At 4602 , a home view is presented to a 
operations are provided by the user interface . While in the computer user . The home view presents an organization of 
home view , any typing that occurs on the keyboard ( except 30 a plurality of visual representations of computer content , 
for hot keys and keyboard shortcuts ) will be default populate 4604. The visual representations form the building blocks of 
the search box of the home view . Pressing return or clinking the home view . Each visual representation is mapped to 
on the search tool 25 will execute the process for a new computer content and / or operations that a user may select 
card and pass the search terms to the default search tools , by , for example , hovering on the visual representation , by 
and the device displays the web page view of the default 35 clicking on it , and by using hot keys among other options . 
search tool and its response to the search terms . At 4606 , a user executes the mapping to the computer 
Example Page Views content and / or operations . In one example , execution of the 
According to one aspect a streamlined user interface is mapping causes the computer to navigate to a first view of 

provided , that permits a user to access electronic content on the content . In some embodiments , process 4600 , comprises 
a device responsive to context and responsive to device 40 further computer logic executed by a processor to access a 
configuration . According to one embodiment , an element of stored mapping , and to generate the rendered presentation 
a graphical user interface that provides streamlined access on the computer display of the first view . 
includes a plurality of views of computer content . Another Typically the first view comprises a navigational elements 
element of the GUI , includes visual representations of displayed in a portion of the first view . The navigational 
computer functionality and / or content that are associated 45 element is mapped to the home view . In one example , the 
with a mapping to at least one of the plurality of views . In home view also comprises a navigational element , and a user 
one example , the visual representations comprise cards , as may toggle between the first view and the home view by 
discussed above . The various types of cards can each be executing the navigational element . In process 4600 , a user 
associated with one of the plurality of views , and may also executes the navigational element to return to the home view 
be associated with multiple views . A high level view may be 50 at 4608. In one alternative , a button , a sequence of keyboard 
provided to manage and organize the ( for example in a home keys , a hot key may also cause a computer system to execute 
view ) . The card may be associated with a lower level view a transition to a home view . In another alternative , the same 
which permits more direct interaction with the viewed button , sequence , of keyboard keys , and hot key may cause 
content . In one example , a web page view permits a user to the computer to return to the first view upon a subsequent 
interact with displayed web content for a web page . Other 55 execution . Returning to the home view at 4608 , presents the 
views including a channel page view , provide lower level user with a consistent view of content options , and the user 
views that permit interaction with content specific to channel may select a new first visual representation mapped to other 
cards , and system page views provide , for example , a lower computer content at 4610. Execution of the new first visual 
level view of system functions mapped to by the system representation caused the computer to navigate to first 
cards . System cards may be further classified into nascent 60 view of the mapped computer content , returning process 
cards , and different page view provided according to clas 4600 , to step 4606. Again the user may select a navigational 
sification . element to return the home view at 4608 to select yet another 

According to one aspect , methods and systems for stream first visual representation . In some embodiments , process 
lining user interaction with computer content and operations 4600 , represents a resident process that runs in the back 
may include a process for providing consistent feature 65 ground throughout operation of a computer device . In other 
accessibility across a plurality of views and a plurality of examples , process 4600 may be exited by powering down 
visual representations of computer content . FIG . 45 illus the computer system ( not shown ) . And in one alternative , a 
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user may exit process 4600 by selecting different naviga device to transform the title display into an address box , 
tional tools that execute mappings to other views . In another 1862. The address box maintains the title of the web site , 
alternative , ( not shown ) a view selector may be invoked by until a user interacts with the address box , by for example 
changing a configuration of a streamlined device . Invoking typing into it . Once the system detects interaction with the 
the view selector can cause the computer system to execute 5 address box , the display in the address box will indicate a url 
a transition to a different view without a return the home and / or uri for the current site ( or whatever the user is typing ) . 
view . In one example , invocation of the view selector by Other options may be made available through the header by 
changing the device configuration from laptop to easel , display and selection of a more tool , 1856. For example , the 
causes the computer system to transition from a home view device displays a toolbar , 1904 , in response to user selection 
to a channel view . 10 of the more tool 1902 , FIG . 19. The toolbar supports 

Example Web Page View operations , 1906 , provided by conventional browser of other 
According to one embodiment , a web page view is the known systems . The toolbar 1904 may also be revealed in 

computer implemented expression of a selected web card . response to keyboard short - cuts , for example , crtl - f opens a 
The web page view is configured to present a consistent search box , 1908 , permitting the user to specify terms to find 
view of web based content to a user . The web page view 15 within the web page view . The toolbar display may be 
comprise a number of elements that are maintained across responsive to the content appearing in the web page view . 
the web page view of different content , although in some For example , the device will display zoom tools instead of 
examples additional features may be provided to address -text size and + text size in response to .pdf content . 
unique aspects of the content being viewed . In one embodi Other standard operations and options may be supported 
ment , the web page view includes a header , 354 , FIG . 3C , a 20 in the toolbar . In one embodiment , the toolbar supports , find 
body , 356 , optionally a scroll bar 358 , and a navigation in page , find in page Next / Prev , for scrolling through hits 
element , 352. It is to be appreciated that individual web page within the page , save photos , -text size / + text size , to 
views may comprise additional elements , and should not be increase or decrease the size of the text ( text sizing may be 
read as limited to elements discussed with respect to this implemented globally so that changes in text size for one 
example . The Header 354 , is responsive to focus of the 25 web page view will affect all web page views — alternatively 
device . In another embodiment , the header is responsive to the setting may be local to the present web page view ) , 
the type of content being displayed . In one example , the refresh , cut , paste copy , and print . Print and save behavior 
header is further responsive to the communication protocol for a streamlined device does depart from conventional 
user to access the web based content . The header portion operation 
may also be responsive to the state of the device , and state 30 According to one embodiment , the header may also 
of the computer operation being performed ( e.g. loading display additional tools whether the header is in focus or out 
content ) . of focus , responsive to the content of the page . In one 

Accordingly , in one embodiment the header 354 element embo the header , 1890-1891 , FIG . 18C , displays an 
of the display appears differently based on focus , content , add a channel tool , 1892 , regardless of focus ( 1890 out of 
and context of the web site being viewed . When the header 35 focus , 1891 in focus ) . In one example , the device determines 
is out of focus , for example , the header may be rendered in that the accessed content has either a rss feed , or a custom 
an out of focus display , shown by example in FIG . 18A . The view for the static web - page , and in response reveals the add 
header display comprises navigation element , 1802 , page a channel feature in the header . Selecting the add a channel 
title 1804 , optionally a visual element associated with the causes the device to execute a process for generating a new 
web page is displayed 1806 , the visual element may be a 40 channel card as discussed further herein . 
favicon ( reduced scale image associated with a website ) , and According to another embodiment , the state of the content 
where appropriate the header displays a lock symbol 1808 to in the view may impact the tools displayed . For example , 
indicate a secure site . For secure sites , hovering over the when a user is interacting with the address box ( e.g. to enter 
security symbol 1808 , caused the device to display addi a URL or URI ) or when a page is not fully loaded , possible 
tional information regarding the security of the site . In one 45 actions are limited . The device causes the header display to 
example , a dialogue box appears including information on adjust to remove options that are unavailable ( e.g. namely 
the security signature for the site . Share , Add channel , Bookmarks , and More ) , and adds the 

Page title provides the user the name of the page s / he is following elements Go / Stop tool 1895 , FIG . 18D , and a 
on in human - readable form . In some embodiments , when the status indicator 1896. Selecting Go causes the device to 
header is out of focus , the title of the page extends to the 50 initiate navigation and start loading a URL or URI listed in 
right as far as possible . How far the title is display is the address box . The stop button appears while a page is 
dependent on what other elements are included in the header . loading - clicking the button will stop the page from load 
For example , when the header is out of focus the title has the ing . The Go / Stop tool toggles between a presentation of Go 
most room in the display . Upon focus , the device causes the when a page ahs not yet been loaded and Stop when a 
header display to change . In one example , FIG . 18B illus- 55 content is being accessed , for example . The status indicator 
trates a header , 1850 , in focus , and device now displays may include a customized visualization . The customized 
additional tools in the header . Additional tools may comprise visualization may be configured to tie various functions and 
a share tool , 1852 ( for sharing the web card mapping to the features together . In one example , the status indicator is 
view ) , bookmark tool , 1854 ( adds web page to bookmark configured to display as a “ loading spring , ” 1896. 1896 , is 
list ) , more tool , 1856 ( permits revelation of additional tools ) , 60 animated to show that the device is actively downloading 
search tool , 1858 , and close tool , 1860. Additional tools may content . It is to be appreciated that although the Go / Stop tool 
be displayed in the header on focus , including , for example , is display in the same space on the header in the described 
back and forward buttons , 1864 that may be used to access example , the display for either function may also be ren 
other pages in browsing history . Additionally , the title dis dered separately , or display above and below , among other 
play from unfocused view , 1804 , FIG . 18A , may be trans- 65 options . 
formed into a web address box 1862 , FIG . 18B . In one The header display may be further responsive to focus and 
embodiment , focus on the header display 1850 , causes the selection . In FIG . 18E , shown is a header after selection of 
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the search tool 1858. In response to selection of the search channel page view is illustrated in FIG . 20A , 2000. The 
tool , the device alters the heading display to include an channel page view shown includes a header 2002 , which 
search box 1898 , for entry of search terms . Once the search includes a display for the title of the channel page view , 
is initiated the device alters the header to eliminate search 2006 , a share tool , 2006 , web link 2008 , and status indicator 
box 1898 . 5 2010. The header may also include navigation element 2012 

Navigation within Web Page View for returning to a home view among other functionality . The 
According to one aspect , navigating web pages within the channel page view also includes a body 2014 , for displaying 

web page view is similar to existing browsers on other available rss items 2016-2022 . Selection of the displayed rss 
systems . For most links , when a user clicks the link , the items 2016-2022 , caused the system to display the web page 
device executes a process to load a new web page into the 10 view of the selected article , web link 2008 , shown as “ go to 
body of the current web page view , replacing the contents of web page ” in FIG . 20 , creates a new web card for the page 
the current page . The device operates different in response to from which the channel was created . 
links that request a new window . For new window links or Other channel page views may also be employed . FIG . 
new tab links the device executes a process to generate a 20B , illustrates another example of a channel page view , 
new web card , and further the new card is mapped to the link 15 2050. Shown in 2050 is a specialized channel view for a 
destination . The device executes functionality that causes news channel . Example view 2050 is separated into two 
the display to “ zoom ” into the new card and present the scrollable columns , providing a headline column 2052 , for 
content from the link destination . displaying individual rss items and a content column . Con 

According to one aspect , transitions between active web tent column , 2054 , presents the details of rss items ( if the 
page views occurs through the home view . The user selects 20 content does not require additional space other than the 
a navigation element ( e.g. 352 FIG . 3C ) to return to the displayed screen a scroll bard will not be displayed ) . The 
home view , alternatively , a navigation button ( e.g. 168 , FIG . content column shows the headline , 2056 , includes the time 
17 ) will return the user to the home view . In another the item was posted 2058 ( in one example relative to current 
embodiment , hot keys and / or shortcut keys may be time ) , the author , 2060 , and the item's description , 2061 , in 
employed to cause the system to return to a home view . In 25 its entirety . According to one embodiment , images and / or 
response to selection of the shortcut and / or hot keys , the script ( html , xml , etc. ) may also be displayed in the content 
device executes a transition to the home view . From the column ( not shown ) . The content column may also comprise 
home view a user may select any other card or generate new a navigation element , 2062. In one example the navigation 
cards , as discussed above . element is labeled “ full story . ” The system launches the 

Creation of channel cards occurs differently from a web 30 item's url as a new web card , and transitions to a web page 
page view , than when done in a home view . In one embodi view of that url in response to selection of 2062. Optionally , 
ment , in response to selection of add channel in a web page focus and / or hovering over the full story button causes the 
view , the system returns to the home view , displays the system to generate a preview view of the new card that 
creation of the new card , and presents the creation of the new would be created in response to selection of full story . 
card so that both the new card and the web card from which 35 Selection of one of the content items , e.g. 2070-2076 , 
add channel was selected is displayed . In this example causes the system to display the headline , author , posting 
process any maximal display threshold may be ignored in time , and full description for the selected rss item . Scroll bar , 
order to display both the originating card and the new 2080 , is displayed if the number of items in the headline 
channel card . Once the card generation is complete the column , 2052 , require additional pages of display . A scroll 
system zooms back into the original web page view for 40 bar may be display in the content column as well , if the 
continued browsing . Alternatively , a system may enter a content display requires additional pages . According to one 
channel view of the newly created channel creation . In one embodiment , channel page views are configured to retain 
embodiment , the behavior of the system may be altered current state . The system accesses retained state when 
according to settings accessed through a system card , and in revisiting a channel view . According to one embodiment , a 
one example a settings card . 45 process for accessing a channel page view determines if any 

Channel Page View state information is retained for the channel page view . In 
According to one embodiment , the channel page view is response to a determination that state information exists , the 

the zoomed - in computer implemented expression of a chan system presents the last accessed content item in the content 
nel card . A channel page view presents a unique view into column . If the last content item is no longer available , the 
content made available through a website . The channel page 50 system selects the first content item by default . 
view employs visualizations similar to corresponding visu An alternative view of channel content comprises a full 
alization on channel cards but the large format of the view screen view of rss items . In one example a channel full view 
allows for a better display of content , and provides for comprises a headline display center in the screen . According 
increased interaction with users . The channel page view also to another embodiment , preview text is displayed in con 
comprises a mapping from the display content to the source 55 junction with the rss item . In one example , the channel full 
from which the content is derived . Typically , content dis view includes displays configured to identify the source of 
played in the channel page view is derived from an rss feed the rss feed . In another example , a logo for the source feed 
associated with a web - site . Additionally , some non - rss sites is captured and displayed as part of the channel full view . In 
have customized visualizations that can be accessed through response to selection within the channel full view , the 
a channel page view . 60 system displays a content menu permitting selection of any 

According to one embodiment , the channel page view of the rss items for the content source . In one embodiment , 
configured to present a consistent framework for user inter the content menu appears as a list of rss items displayed at 
action with rss style content . The channel page view com the lower portion of the channel full view . The content menu 
prises a number of elements that are maintained across the is configured to be responsive to manipulation of the embed 
channel page views of different content , although in some 65 ded scroll wheel . Manipulation of the scroll wheel progress 
examples additional features may be provided to address through the displayed content menu , and in response the 
unique aspects of the content being viewed . An example system displays the selected content in the full view with 
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preview text appearing below . Shown in FIG . 21 is an lined graphical user interface . Unlike the home view , the 
example of a channel full view 2100 , with content menu channel card view is not based on pages of display , rather the 
2102 activated by selection . Manipulation of the scroll channel card view is organized to display only one type of 
wheel causes the system to scroll through the items in the content , that is content that may be rendered in a channel 
content menu . In one embodiment , the content menu tran 5 ( i.e. having an rss feed or customized visualization , and for 
sitions between selections by rendering the apparent move special system cards ) . The channel card view is available in 
ment of the entire content menu either to the left of the right both laptop and easel modes of the streamlined device . In 
depending upon the orientation of the manipulation of the response to configuration of the device into easel mode , the 
scroll wheel . Alternatively , the content menu is also respon channel card view is rendered by default . The content 
sive to arrow keys on the keyboard . Depressing an arrow key 10 displayed in the channel card view is dependent on the 
cause the system to display the apparent movement of the channel cards displayed in the home view . Alternatively the 
content menu to the next item . channel card view may be invoked by operating the scroll 

According to some embodiments , the various channel wheel embedded in the device . 
views , for example , page and full view may also include In response to operation of the scroll wheel , the system 
animations of transitions between available rss feed items . 15 displays the channel card view , FIG . 23 , illustrates an 
Default operation of the streamlined computer system and example of a channel card view , 2300. According to one 
streamlined user interfaces cause the system to display embodiment , the channel card view comprises selector dis 
transitions from one rss item to the next in association with play 2302. In another embodiment , the channel card view 
a time period . Transitions may include animations that cause includes a selector display , 2302. The selector view is invoke 
the system to display new rss items sliding into position as 20 upon the first click of the scroll wheel while in easel mode , 
the previous rss item slides out of view . In one example , an in laptop mode , additional clicks may be required to invoke 
rss headline item slides out of view in response to the next the channel card view and selector . In one example , the three 
headline item sliding into view . The device and user inter clicks are necessary to invoke the channel card view while 
faces may also be responsive to manipulation of the scroll the device is in a laptop mode . In another example two clicks 
wheel . For example , manipulation of the scroll may by 25 are required . Upon invocation the channel card view com 
default invoke a transition to a channel card view . prises a visualization of the channel cards available for 

System Page View selection . In one example , the visualization resembles and 
According to one embodiment , the system page view is behaves like a rolodex . As the user moves the scroll wheel 

the zoomed - in computer implemented expression of a sys individual channels 2304-2310 appear to flip around the 
tem card . The system cards provide a user with the ability to 30 hinge of the device . In response to selection , the foremost 
interact with the device's settings and other computer opera channel card displayed is selected and displayed full screen . 
tions . System cards also enable a user to access customized In one example , selection includes activation of button 168 , 
functionality , for example , photo and video interactions . FIG . 17 , from the easel mode of the device , although in 
According to one aspect , certain interactions with computer laptop mode selection can occur in a number of ways 
content are identified as special . The identification of special 35 including by operation of button 168. In another example , a 
interactions is reflected in render those operations as system different button may be selected or short cut keys selection , 
cards . System cards have the property , that they cannot be among other options . 
removed by a user . This insures that identified functionality In response to selection from the channel selector view , 
remains available regarding of user intention . Additionally , the system displays a channel page view . On example of a 
the number of system cards can be limited , providing a 40 channel page view for photo content is shown in FIG . 24 . 
distinctive interface element for system operation and According to one embodiment , the channel page view of the 
important interactions even within the streamlined GUI . In photo content automatically scans though each photo by 
one embodiment , system cards are limited to a photo and default in the channel page view . The photo display restarts 
video card ( controlling photo and video operations ) , a set again at the begin when the end of the photo content is 
tings card ( permitting access to device settings ) , a bookmark 45 reached . In another embodiment , the default operation is to 
card ( discussed herein ) , a camera card ( permitting set and display only the selected content item ( e.g. photo ) . FIG . 
interaction with a camera ) , and a browse the web card 25A , illustrates an example logical diagram of the behavior 
( discussed herein ) . Although it is to be appreciated that other for the channel view . From channel page view 2502 , selec 
system card may be implemented and the invention is not tion of the menu button ( e.g. FIG . 4 , 166 ) , caused the device 
limited to the system cards provide as example above . 50 to display the content menu , 2504 , over the present channel 

The anatomy of the system card is similar to the anatomy page view . Selection of the menu button from the content 
of other cards . For example , an embodiment of the system menu , causes the device to display the selected content item 
card includes a header , 2202 , FIG . 22 , a navigation element , in a channel page view 2502. From channel page view 2502 , 
2204 , a title 2206 , and a body 2208. As discussed herein , operation of the scroll wheel ( e.g. FIG . 4 , 132 ) , causes the 
nascent cards may be categorized as a type of system card . 55 device to display channel selector view 2506 . 
Alternatively , nascent cards may comprise their own cat According to one embodiment , photo content displayed as 
egory . While nascent cards share a similar format as the a channel in the user interface , can be accessed similarly . 
other cards , nascent cards do not have a page view . Nascent Shown is an example of channel functionality , in logical 
cards map directly to system functionality , that is executed diagram 2550 , FIG . 25B . From channel page view 2552 , of 
upon selection or as part of a call from another process . 60 the photo channel , selection of the menu button ( e.g. FIG . 4 , 

Channel Card View 166 ) , causes the device to display the content menu , 2554 , 
According to one aspect , a channel card view is provided over the present channel page view . Selection of the menu 

to display high level navigation options to a user , to enable button from the content menu , causes the device to display 
streamlines selection of content and operations by making the selected content item in a channel page view 2552. From 
selections within a streamlines view . Similar to the home 65 channel page view 2552 , operation of the scroll wheel ( e.g. 
view the channel card view is configured to render a FIG . 4 , 132 ) , causes the device to display channel selector 
consistent organization of navigational elements of a stream view 2556 . 
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According to one embodiment , channels for displaying conducted through a forward mode of interaction . It is 
video content and / or audio content operate with a different realized that traditional computer devices and systems are 
logical flow . In one example , additional interactivity is notorious bad at permitting interaction with content and the 
required to allow a user to , for example , stop a video , start device from greater distances . 
a video from the middle , among other options . According to Interactions with content and other device for example a 
one embodiment , the streamlined device must be able to television are included in the second type of viewing mode . 
accommodate routine operations through manipulation of A lean back mode of viewing is meant to encompass 
only a scroll wheel and a mouse , for example when the ordinary television viewing , and the interactions a viewer 
device is in an easel mode . It is to be appreciated that in other has with their DVR for example . Television and their 
configurations the logical flow for the behavior of the 10 associated devices and configured to provide for lean back 
channel view may be different , and may take advantage of styled interactions . It is realized that conventional system 
addition input / output devices available in other device and methods fail to provide for the transition from lean 
modes . Shown in FIG . 28 , is an example of a logical flow for forward to lean back interactions . As discussed above , 
device / UI functionality , during the normal operation of a streamlined devices can accommodate a plurality of con 
channel view of video content . At 2802 shown is a channel 15 figurations , and individual configurations may be designed 
page view of video content , select of button ( e.g. FIG . 4 , to accommodate the different viewing modes . Additionally , 
132 ) , causes the device to display contextual menu 2804 . the streamlines user interface is configured to be responsive 
Contextual menu , includes a visual representation of select to the configurations . For example , transitions from a laptop 
able options , 2806. The selectable options rendered include mode of the device may trigger changes in the user interface . 
at least a rewind / fast forward selector , resume selection , 20 According to one embodiment , a transition from laptop 
other episodes . Selection of rewind / fast forward selector mode to easel mode , causes the device to transition from 
invokes a timeline controller 2809 shown in the content page either a home view or web page view to a channel selector 
view , 2808. The time line controller is responsive to rotation view . The transition from laptop to easel , may also trigger a 
of the scroll wheel , providing fast forward in one direction transition from a channel page view to channel selector 
and rewind in the other . From 2808 , selection of button 132 25 view . In one alternative , the transition causes the device to 
causes the device to return the view to channel page view display a channel full view for that channel card . The 
2802. Selection of resume form 2804 , also causes the device transition from easel to laptop may also cause the device to 
to return the view to channel page view 2802. Selection of alter the view displayed to a user . In one example , if a new 
other episodes from 2804 causes the device to invoke card has been shared , the device causes the home view to be 
content menu 2810 , which provides a selector view of 30 displayed . The last page of the home view is displayed 
available content for the channel . Selection of content , 2811 , where the new card is rendered . 
from the selector view causes the system to play the selected According to another embodiment , methods and systems 
content in channel page view 2802. From channel page view for streamlining user interactions may include a process for 
2802 , the devices displays channel selector 2812 , in transitioning between different user viewing positions . 
response to operation of the scroll wheel . The logical flow 35 Shown in FIG . 48 , is an example process 4800 , for permit 
illustrated may be used for interactions with audio content as ting a user to select a viewing mode for a streamlined device , 
well , for example , to control playing of.mp3 or other audio and in response displaying a user interface view configured 
file . for the selected viewing mode . At 4802 , a streamline com 

Selecting Device Configurations puter system presents computer content using visual repre 
According to one aspect , systems and method for stream- 40 sentation optimized for different viewing modes . In particu 

lining user interaction with electronic content include a lar , ones of the visual representations are configured to 
plurality of physical configurations for a streamlined device , display in a “ lean forward ” user viewing mode and a “ lean 
the streamlined device may be , for example , a portable backward ” viewing mode . In one example , a lean forward 
computer . As discussed above the plurality of configurations user viewing mode includes a user typing at a keyboard of 
may represent modes of operation of the device , and include 45 a laptop computer . In another example , a lean backward user 
for example laptop mode , easel mode , among others . viewing mode includes a user viewing a television from a 
According to another aspect the user interface that governs distance . One should appreciate that the examples provided 
interactions between the user the device and accessed con are illustrative and are not intended to be limiting . A 
tent is responsive the selected mode and / or configuration of streamlined device permits a user to select a device con 
the streamlined device . 50 figuration most suited to a particular user viewing mode . For 

According to one embodiment , the streamlined device example , a user may rotate a streamlined device's display 
retains information on device configuration and / or mode . In relative to its based about an longitudinal axis , transitioning 
on example , information is maintained as a state variable in the device from a laptop mode to an easel mode . According 
a systems register . In another example , the system may to one embodiment , the easel mode of the device permits 
obtain state from signals provide by an embedded sensor , as 55 improved “ lean back ” interactions with computer content . In 
discussed above . The state information may be used to other words , the easel mode makes it easier to view the 
generate a system response , when the device detects a streamlined device's display from distances greater than 
change in configuration and / or mode . conventionally used with laptop computers . Selection of a 

In a typical setting a user interacts with a streamlined lean backward user viewing mode at 4804 , triggers the 
device in one of two viewing modes . The two viewing 60 streamlined device to transition to a content display that 
modes reflect a level of interactivity with the device being improves user interaction . On one example , in response to 
viewed . A lean forward view encompasses interactions the user selection at 4804 , the computer system display 
between a user and conventional computer systems . One transitions to a channel viewing mode at 4806. The channel 
example includes a user typing at the keyboard of their viewing mode is configured to present computer content , in 
laptop computer , in essence , the user leans into the computer 65 large footprint displays , and further is designed to streamline 
device and display to perform interactions and view content . user interaction with the streamlined device by permitting 
Similarly a user's interaction with desktop computers are access through a first I / O profile associated with the stream 
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lined device in easel mode . The first I / O profile in easel based on at least one of a social relationship , familial 
mode may consist of a scroll wheel and a selector button . In relations , work relationship , etc. Different groups may share 
some embodiments , the first I / O profile may include a different content and even different context for the same 
volume control . content through for example , shared user interface elements . 

Other processes may be invoked to cause a user interface 5 Groups may be further organized into nodes or a node may 
to transition between views in response to changes in device comprise the group . In some examples , a family forms a 
configuration . Shown in FIG . 49A , is an example process node regardless of the family's location relative to each 
4900 , for transitioning between a lean forward view to a lean other . As part of the configurations that may also occur as 
backward view . At 4902 , a user changes the streamlined part of the device's purchase , at least one of the users 
device configuration from laptop to easel mode . In response 10 identifies his / her family members . The family members are 
the computer system switches view from its current view to configured into a node . The node may be used to permit 
a channel view . In some examples , the computer system is sharing of content . The node may be used to permit sharing 
already in a channel view , and no transition is implemented . of cards . Further updates to configurations on device in the 
The easel mode of the streamlined device is associated with node may be propagated automatically to other devices in 
a first I / O profile including an integrated scroll wheel and a 15 the node . 
selector button . Upon manipulation of the scroll wheel , a Communication between groups members may take place 
view selector causes the computer system to display a over the internet . In one embodiment , a sub - network utilizes 
progression through a sequence of channel cards as the the internet or other communication network to communi 
scroll wheel is rotated , at 4906. Optionally the sequence may cate between streamlined device users . In another embodi 
include other customized cards ( in one example a photo and 20 ment , a service is hosted for streamlined device users to 
video card ) . Upon selection of a displayed channel card , a facilitate communication . The service may also be con 
channel full view is invoked at 4908. The channel full view nected to the internet and in one example functions as a 
displays the content of the selected channel card in the gateway between users , their devices , content , sharing , and 
entirety of the computer system display screen . The system communicating . The service facilitates real time sharing , in 
returns to the channel view in response to further rotation of 25 one example a user may share a movie s / he is viewing with 
the scroll wheel . another . Not only may the user share the information that 
Shown in FIG . 49B , is another example process , 4950 , for s / he is watching a movie , but the user may allow another to 

transitioning between user views . At 4952 , a user changes a watch the movie starting at the same place , allowing the 
device configuration from an easel mode to a laptop mode . users to perceive they are watching the movie together . 
In response to the change in mode , the device displays a 30 FIG . 29A , illustrates an example interaction between a 
home view of available content , at 4954. In some examples , user , the device , and the user interface , where the device 
the system may already be in a home view and no transition causes a web card to be shared to other users . Shown is web 
occurs . The user may interact with the streamlined device page view , 2900 , in response to user selection of share 02 , 
through a second I / O profile at 4956. In some embodiments , the device displays a share interface 2904. The device 
the second I / O profile includes a keyboard , a touch pad , 35 accesses the user profile to determine any groups or nodes 
buttons , web cam , and a scroll wheel . that the user has created . In example view , 2900 , the user has 

Streamlined Device Community only one group , family members 2906. Each entry listed in 
According to one aspect , a common experience may be family members represents another streamlined device / user . 

created for multiple users , fostering a community experi Box 2908 permits sharing of the card with other users of 
ence . According to another aspect , the common experience 40 conventional systems . Comment may be included . For 
may also include a community aspect . The community example , a user may type any comment on the card being 
aspect includes sharing of content between users , sharing of share into box 2910. Comments entered on a shared card are 
content and configurations , sharing of content , configura display with the card on receipt by another streamlined 
tions , and customizations , among many other options . In device user . The user selects any one or more of the listed 
particular , sharing may involve the transmission of user 45 members 2914-2920 , or the user selects 2912 to share the 
interface elements to other users . The visual representations card with all the listed members . Once the selections have 
that map to content and / or computer operations on one been made and any comments entered the user selects 2924 
device may be transmitted to another device or another user . Share ! And the card is transmitted . By selecting Never Mind 
In one example , a user may share a card and any of its 2924 , the device closes the share interface . In FIG . 29B , 
configurations with another user . Access to the shared user 50 shown is an example of a web page view after a share 
interface elements , in some embodiments , facilitates com operation has been completed . At 2950 , the device notifies 
munal computer usage . In one example , a first user may be the user that the selected item has been shared . For other 
watching media on their streamlined device , another user streamlined device users share content is received by their 
known to the first user , may receive a user interface element streamlined device as a web card . For other users , an e - mail 
that retains information related to the accessed content and 55 with a link to the content is delivered . It is to be appreciated 
information related to the present context . That is for the first that FIG . 29A , illustrates a user with one group or node . In 
user watching a movie , the first user may share the user other embodiments , a user may be permitted to generate a 
interface element ( e.g. a channel card mapped to video plurality of groups or nodes . Box 2926 may first display a 
content ) through which s / he is accessing the move , and list of groups , that a user may select from , in order to show 
permit the another user not only to watch the movie , but to 60 the members of the selected groups . In one embodiment , box 
take up the movie at the same point in time , so in essence , 2926 lists more members that can be accommodated in the 
they get to enjoy the movie together . Content and context space provide by the interface . An optional scroll bar may be 
retention by user interface elements that can be shared displayed into to permitting display of additional group 
provides unique advantages to the users of the streamlined members . 
devices . 65 FIG . 30 illustrates an example of a received shared card , 

In some embodiments , the community aspect incorporates 3000. The state of the streamlined device may impact 
formation of groups . In one example , groups are formed behavior of the device in response to receipt of a shared card . 
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In screensaver mode , a streamlined device presents received In one embodiment of a streamlined device , the user 
shared cards as part of the screen saver view , 3000. Com interface is configured to provide for passive viewing of 
ments included with the shared card , are presented in an selected content through a screensaver mode . The device 
overlay box 3002 , and any text that does not display is a first enters screensaver mode in response to the expiration of a 
screen is scrolled into view 3004 , while the content of the 5 idle timer expiring . Any interaction with the device causes 
shared card is displayed . The overlay box 3002 , may include the device to exit screensaver mode . In screensaver mode , 
an image of the user who shared the card and / or content , at channel cards and content are display in order . An idle time 
3006. Shared display 3000 , may also include an indicator out period may be established to force a transition to a new 
regarding the number of content items in the shared card . channel in the event the idle time out period is exceeded 
For example at 3008 , the number of content items in the 10 before all the content of the channel is displayed . 
photo set being displayed indicates 1 of 4. Other information According to some embodiments , the community expe 

rience is enhanced through particular features and functions associated with individual content items may also be dis facilitated by the device , the user interface layer , and / or played at 3010. In the screen saver mode , the shared content configurations designed to facilitate interaction among users items are each display , a timer controls the length of time 15 ( either with the device features themselves or also with third each item is display before continuing on to the next item . party services ) . According to another aspect , community 
The device then returns to any screen saver content that was experience and / or community learning furthers adoption 
being displayed when the shared card came in . and / or integration of new computer features into a particular 

For users receiving shared content while in an active view user's routine . It is realized that facilitation of communica 
( e.g. non - screensaver views ) , the system may provide a 20 tion and / or content sharing across users improves introduc 
notification message to indicate shared content . From the tion of features and increases the likelihood of their adop 
home view , for example , the system generates notification tion . Context and content sharing are provided for and 
message to display in a message bubble . An visual indicator through streamlined interfaces . The sharing opportunities 
is employed to notify the user that a system message is may be device sensitive , that is , a user with a same / similar 
present . In one example , the navigation item displayed in the 25 device can be identified by a specific user . The users with 
home view ( e.g. FIG . 2 , 250 ) , is animated to indicate a identical devices may have the most options for how to 
message . An example notification is illustrated in FIG . 31 . share , what content to share , context settings , and may also 
Navigation element 3102 may be animated , the device include the ability to share features associated with the 
displays message bubble 3104 upon focus resolving on content . In one embodiment , a user may enable features 
element 3102. The user may select 3106 or 3108. Upon 30 associated with a card based interface and through sharing 
selection the device displays the shared card of 3106 , or the the card make another user aware of features of the card 
device returns to the home view 3108 . interface that the receiving user was unaware of . In another 

Similar notifications may be employed in conjunction embo nt , the shared card provides all of the configura 
with other views . Further similar notifications may be used tions established for the originating card . In one alternative , 
for other contexts . In response to displaying a web page 35 security features may be invoke to clear certain settings of 
view of a web page with stored user name information , a a card to insure that for example , banking information is not 
device may present a notification message regarding the shared to another user . In another alternative , the user 
availability of account information . FIG . 32 illustrates an selecting share is prompted to confirm the share request . In 
example message for a site with two stored accounts . By response to a security identifier , the prompt to confirm 
default the system displays the content without using the 40 includes a warning banner regarding the identified security 
stored account information . The device causes the message issue . In one example , a user receives a warning that sharing 
to disappear if a selection is not made , or if browsing activity a card including banking content may compromise the bank 
continues without selection of an account . According to accounts referenced . In another embodiment , a share request 
some embodiment , notifications can either require a with an identified security issue is denied . 
response / action or the notification may disappear if no 45 In some embodiments , the community aspect incorporates 
action is taken . Typically , notifications that do not require an formation of groups . In one example , groups are formed 
action are used to convey information . based on social relationship , familial relations , work rela 

In one embodiment , from channel view in laptop mode , tionship , etc. Different groups may share different content 
the notification of the arrival of new cards is the same as in and even different context for the same content through for 
home or page view . Typically navigation element 3302 , FIG . 50 example , shared user interface elements . Groups may be 
33 , does not appear in the channel view . In response to a new further organized into nodes or a node may comprise the 
card , the device displays 3302 and may animate its display . group . In some examples , a family forms a node regardless 
In response to focus on the 3302 , a notification bubble 3304 of the family's location relative to each other . As part of the 
appears . The system displays the home view for the page configurations that may also occur as part of the device's 
containing the first new card in response to selection of 3302 55 purchase , at least one of the users identifies his / her family 
or 3306 . members . The family members are configured into a node . 
When a notification is available in channel view , moving The node may be used to permit sharing of content . The 

the scroll wheel invokes the Channel Selector view , but the node may be used to permit sharing of cards . Further updates 
system displays the first new card default ( instead of the to configurations on device in the node may be propagated 
current channel ) . When in channel view in easel mode , the 60 automatically to other devices in the node . 
notification of the arrival of new cards is similar as above , According to another embodiment , sharing options may 
except that both the navigation element and the notification also be adapted to different devices being operated by 
bubble may appear at once . Shown in FIG . 34 , is an example sharing users . For example , certain features may be disabled 
of a notification message from a channel view while in easel when a card or content is shared outside of a streamlined 
mode . The system displays both 3302 navigation element 65 device community . In some embodiments , communities 
and 3404 message bubble together in response to shared may be based on the device being employed , membership in 
content . a group , and / or membership in a node . Additionally com 
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munities may be based on social interactions , familial rela of configurations , and by providing default configurations 
tionships , etc. Examples of communities include name lists for more popular services almost any on - line service can be 
of user identified by the device operator . In one example , integrated 
community lists and / or community groups are pre - generated Still other embodiments , may query the user upon entry / 
in response to questions asked of a potential purchaser . User 5 access into a new service for any information necessary to 
names may also be added and maintained by the user . configure the device to provide streamlined presentation and 
Additionally , the system may create community lists on integration of the third party service . In some embodiments , 
behalf of a user based on the user's activity . the process of streamlining user interactions with electronic 
For example , when composing and sending an e - mail , the content includes querying the user regarding subscribed 

system may query the user to determine if the recipient 10 services and / or functions the user would like to use on their 
should be within the user's community . In one alternative , computer . For example , during processing of a purchase of 
the system may add the recipient to a potential community a streamlined device a prospective purchaser receives a 
and make the addition subject to a later confirmation . In query form , or the user may receive individual questions 
another option , the e - mail recipient is added by default to a regarding the purchaser's present computer use . In one 
group with minimal sharing options . The user is provided 15 example , the questions will generate a profile of subscribed 
the option of changing the group associated with the recipi services , whether pay or free , and customize the user inter 
ent . Additions to community list may require additional face to permit streamlined interaction with those services out 
configurations to become effective . For example , the device of the box . In one example , default configurations and / or 
user may be required to accept additions , a device user may questions designed to elicit required configurations , allow 
be required to identify if the added name corresponds to 20 the user to interact with GUI elements customized to his / her 
another user of a similar / same type of device , among other current use and preferences . 
configurations options . A process for handling download links may be responsive 

Specialized Operations to the particular content selected for download . In one 
According to another aspect , certain features of conven example , the system analyzes the selected download link to 

tion computer interactions have been specially configured to 25 determine the type of content selected for downloading . In 
present streamlined interaction between a device , a user , and response , the system identifies accounts held by the user for 
content . In one embodiment , the device does not incorporate processing the selected content . If multiple accounts exists 
mass storage ( i.e. a hard drives ) , instead the system is that handle the selected content , the account first created is 
configured to employ RAM and Flash memory storage . The used by default . A user may alter default operation through 
capacity of the flash memory is significantly less than 30 use of system settings . For photo content , as one example , 
traditional mass storage options . Thus in some embodi the system identifies the content as a picture ( .jpg , .gif , .tif , 
ments , traditional features such a download , have been etc. ) . The user's profile contains information for accessing 
configured to operate differently for a streamlined device . FLICKR , a third party provider of photo access and man 

In one example , download links do not cause a stream agement services . The download link is interpreted into an 
lined device to download content . Instead , a download link 35 operation to transfer the file into the user's FLICKR gallery . 
is interpreted by the device , which initiates a process for Other services may be used to host the content , for example , 
handling download links . An example process includes the download link may be interpreted to cause the system to 
accessing a third party provider of remote storage to retain upload the photo to the well known MYSPACE or FACE 
the content identified in the download link . According to one BOOK services . For content that cannot be identified , the 
embodiment , the purchase of a streamlined device , include 40 streamlined device causes the download request to be inter 
creation of an account with access to on - line storage . In one preted as a delivery request to a generic remote storage 
example , remote storage for a device is provided in con service . The remote storage service may be one provided 
junction with user information stored to customize the through a third party provider , or may be the remote storage 
device and configure its operation to the particular user . space provided by a seller of the streamlined device . 

In one embodiment , customized configuration files supply 45 An example process , 4200 , is shown in FIG . 42 for 
information required for integration for known third party streamlining user interactions with digital content . The user 
providers . In some embodiments , customized configuration interaction with digital content is streamlined by enhancing 
files are used to establish default interactions with for features for simplifying user decisions by providing access 
example , Shutterfly , an on - line third party photo manage information associated with multiple user accounts for a 
ment and sharing service . In other examples , customized 50 particular online source . Multiple account profiles can be 
configuration files are used with other third party on - line retained and presented to a user of a streamlined device . 
service providers . Other third party provides include Example process 4200 begins at step 4202 , permitting a user 
GMAIL , HOTMAIL , YAHOO ! MAIL to provide examples to access electronic content through the streamlined device . 
of e - mail service providers . Other provides include , for At 4204 the source of the electronic content is determined 
example , on line banking providers , financial system pro- 55 and matched against available access information . Access 
viders , university systems , web site development providers , information may be stored in a device profile or in another 
dating services , and social networking sites . One should example in a user profile . These profiles may be loaded at 
appreciate that the integration of an on - line service need not startup of the device or may be accessed in real time when 
depend on a predetermined configuration file or settings , a content source is determined . At 4204 ( NO ) no access 
rather , various embodiments of the systems and methods are 60 information is available for the content source , and the 
adapted to learn from user interaction and develop appro electronic content is display at 4206. Example electronic 
priate configurations . Certain embodiments are further con content includes web pages and other online resources . At 
figured to take advantage of configurations developed by 4204 ( YES ) the content source is matched against available 
other users of such systems and methods , permitting sharing access information . At 4208 , access information is displayed 
of content , sharing of configurations , etc. According to one 65 to a user in a user interface . The access information typically 
aspect , by using input from the users , learning from user identifies a user account available to access the content 
interactions , permitting content sharing , permitting sharing source . In one example , for an e - mail service this will 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 447 of 521 PageID #: 553



5 

10 

15 

US 10,564,818 B2 
63 64 

include the e - mail address displayed in the interface . A In response to download selection ( i.e. request to locally 
plurality of access accounts may be available for a given store content ) display message regarding new function 
service . The streamlined device is configured to handle ality ( transfer or remote store ) 
multiple users with multiple account to any given services . Maintain user profile associate web service providers 
The user interface permits the user to identify which access for a particular user 
account is desired . At 4210 ( NO ) the user does not identify web services -remote storage , email , photo sharing , cus 
an access account , and at 4212 a default access account is tom web page info , storage accts ( e.g. Drop Box and 
used . The default access account does not provide any Google Docs 
account information , and the content source page is display , In response to mouse over / selection / hover / indication of 
at 4216 , not including any sign - on information . At 4210 selection display interface to enable remote delivery of 

content / file ( YES ) a user selects an access account and at 4214 the Providing for selection of remote delivery to a domain access information is passed to the content source , and the 
displayed content at 4216 will return content after the ( including home network ) including an act of verifying 

the content / file's size does not exceed a threshold value sign - on process has been completed . In response to passing site check deliver content / file as 
In another embodiment , a process for handling download attachment 

operations is provided . The process includes causing the In response to fail , store in provided remote storage , 
device to display a download interface , for example inter generate link , and deliver link to content / file 
face , 3500 , FIG . 35. The interface presents the user with According to one embodiment , a method for streamlining 
options for processing the download request . Box 3502 , lists 20 user interaction with electronic content includes a process 
members of the user's group to whom the user may send the for interpreting online executable operations into stream 
file . Box 3504 , permits a user to enter e - mail addresses to lined operations . One example process , 3600 , FIG . 36 , for 
send the file as an attachment or as a link if a size threshold interpreting online executable operations into streamlined 
is exceeded . For a user who has configured third party operations includes the step of permitting a user to access 
service capable of handling the file content , Box , 3506 , 25 digital content online , at 3602. The online digital content is 
displays the configured providers ( e.g. Shutterfly 3508 , presented to a user through a graphical user interface at 
Flickr 3510 , DropBox , 3512 ) . Each configured service dis 3604. The GUI permits a user to select executable operations 
plays with the account name configured for the service , for in the presentation of the online digital content , at 3606. In 
example at 3514 . response to selection of the executable operation , the com 

In one example , process , for interpreting download opera- 30 puter system determines if the executable operation requires 
tions also includes displaying the interface in response to local access . In one example , the executable operation 
computer focus on the download link . In another example , includes a download operation that would cause a conven 
hovering over the link causes the system to display a tional computer system store a file on a local mass storage 
download interface . For files sent by e - mail the system may device such as a hard drive . In response to the determination 
be configured with a maximal file size for particular e - mail 35 that the executable operation requires local storage , a 
services . Typically files sizes of less than 5 MB are not streamlined computer device transforms the executable 
filtered , thus is the e - mail domain address is not recognized , operation's local access request into a remote access opera 
a default threshold of 5 MB may be used . For services with tion , at 3608 . 
known size constraints the system will transmit the file to the In one example , the remote access operation includes a 
e - mail address . If the constraint is exceed , the system 40 storage request to a online service provider . Various online 
transmits a link to the file instead of the actual file . service providers permits remote storage of various com 

Another to another embodiment , selection of print opera puter files . Certain service providers optimize the provided 
tions may be handled in a similar fashion as to downloads . service for specific file types , such photo management and 
When a printing device is attached to a streamlined device , sharing services . Other examples include e - mail access 
printing proceed as known conventionally . When a printer is 45 providers , video and audio media management and presen 
not attached , a process for interpreting print operations may tation services . In other examples , a service provider may 
be invoked . The process for interpreting print operations , offer generic data storage not specific to any file type . In one 
includes causing the device to display a print interface 4102 , embodiment , step 3608 includes transforming a download 
FIG . 41A . The print interface provides box 4104 listing request to a local mass storage device into a storage request 
group members , 4106 listing configured services , and box 50 to a remote service . The example process can include acts of 
4108 , for entering destination e - mail addresses . Selection of identifying the file type associated with the download 
4110 sends the item in a print format , in this example a .pdf request , and selecting a service provider based on the 
file . In other examples , different file formats will be dis identified file type . 
played as part of 4110 ( e.g. word , doc , txt , wpd , xls , etc. ) . in In another example , the executable operation that requests 
some embodiments , file size limitations will be employed on 55 local access to storage on the streamlined device may 
delivery of print format files . FIG . 41B illustrates in greater include a print operation , a save operation , a copy operation , 
detail examples of print 4150 and download interfaces 4152 . a paste operation . Typically the streamlined device is con 
Print and download operations may invoke a progress bar figured to transform save , download , and print operations 
displayed over the current view , with the option of canceling into remote storage operations . According to one embodi 
transmission . 60 ment , a print operation may be streamlined to permit the 

In another embodiment , a streamlined system includes the print operation without an attached printer . According to one 
following features : embodiment , in the absence of an attached printer , a print 
Employs remote mechanisms to access and / or deliver files request generates a print file in response to execution . 
Mechanisms include identifying a remote action in Conventionally the print file would be stored locally on a 

response to file type 65 computer hard drive . In some embodiments , a streamlined 
Web Content Support for system that does not utilize local device does not employ local mass storage devices such as 
memory for storage hard drives . Such streamlined devices are configured to 
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transform local storage request into remote storage opera 3816 , obtain the default service access information at 3812 
tions . In one example the print file may be directed to a and redirect the local access operation into a remote service 
generic storage provider , and the file stored in the remote operation at 3814 . 
memory associated with the generic storage provider . In In another example , process 3800 may be coupled with an 
another embodiment , the system checks the resulting file 5 interface display presented to a user of the streamlined 
size for the print file . If the size of the file exceeds a device . And step 3812 may be used to populate a user threshold , then the system may further streamline the opera interface with a plurality of matched services . The interface tion . For example , by providing a link to the file and may also display additional information associated with the transmitting the link to a destination . A link may be trans service , for example an account name may be display to mitted through an e - mail instead of transmitting the file 10 permit a user to distinguish between an account s / he set up itself , for example . as opposed to another user . The system may permit the user Another example process may be used in conjunction 
with 3600. In one example , a sub - process , 3700 , FIG . 37 , for to designate the remote service appropriate for use in the 
permitting selection of executable operations in online con interface and step 3814 occurs to redirect the local access 
tent can be employed . At 3702 , computer focus is resolved 15 operation into the user selected remote service . 
on an executable operation embedded in online content . In another embodiment , an example sub - process , 3900 , 
Executable operations can include download , print , save , FIG . 39 , for obtaining service access information may be 
transfer , retrieve , get , fget , and generally comprise opera employed to retrieve remote service information . Example 
tions that require a large memory block of nonvolatile process 3900 , includes an act of accessing at least one of a 
storage , and in particular hard drive space . A streamlined 20 device profile and user profile to obtain matched services at 
computer device includes logic stored in memory and 3904. Obtaining matched services may include filtering 
executed by a processor to analyze a focused executable from the available services , or it may include retrieving all 
operation , and at 3704 , the executable operation is analyzed . available services listed in the at least one of a device and 
The logic may include programming to trap download user profile . In one example , filtering is performed based on 
request for example . Once a request is trapped the stream- 25 a file type that is the subject of a local access operation , in 
lined device can determine what action is appropriate based another example , filtering may be performed to return only 
on the type of request . At 3706 , it is determined whether the remote services of the current system user , although it is to 
executable operation requires local storage . At 3706 ( No ) be appreciated that other filtering operations may be per 
local storage is not required and the executable operation is formed . Once available services are matched 3904 , with or 
performed at 3708. At 3706 ( Yes ) it is determined that local 30 without filtering , the matched services are displayed to a 
storage is required and the operation is transformed into a system user at 3906 in a user interface . The user interface 
remote access operation at 3710 . permits the user to select from the remote services at 3908 . 
Example process 3600 may include additional sub - pro Selection may include clicking on a visual indicator shown 

cesses and / or individual steps performed in process 3600 in a computer display ( e.g. a check box ) , other options 
may also comprise other processes . In one example sub- 35 include links to the service , other visual indicators may be 
process 3800 , FIG . 38 , for transforming online executable used , including drop down boxes and other html , xml , and 
operations associated with local storage into remote storage human readable computer displayed forms . In one alterna 
operations may be employed as part of a larger process , for tive ( not shown ) , if the user does not select a service within 
example , process 3600. At 3802 , a streamlined computer a predetermined period of time , the system may cancel the 
system identifies a result of an executable operation identi- 40 operation entirely , or alternatively select a default remote 
fied in a web browser displayed on the system . At 3804 , a file service automatically . At 3910 , the object of the local access 
type associated with the operation is identified . At 3806 , at operation is delivered to the remote service . 
least one of a device profile and a user profile is accessed , Configuring Streamlined Devices 
to retrieve available services , 3808 , that may be appropriate According to one aspect , streamlining user interaction 
for the particular file type . Various services for a particular 45 with computer content includes improving user interfaces 
user may be associated with the device itself , and a plurality display , permitting configuration of streamlined device ruing 
of users may have access to multiple services or even more operations . Streamlining user interaction may also include 
than one account for an individual service . Logic stored in providing for the pre - configuration of a streamlined device 
memory and executed by a processor may determine with content customized to a particular user . 
matched services at 3810 by accessing information stored in 50 In one embodiment , a potential user may purchase a 
at least one of a device profile and a user profile . The access streamlined device on - line . During an order process , the user 
information may contain records on available services , their may establish an interactive session with an order manage 
access information , and the access information may include ment system . the order management system may be opera 
a file type designation for a particular service . tively connected to device management systems , including 

In one example , executed logic matches a file type asso- 55 for example remote storage space , remote profiles , among 
ciated with the executable operation to a file type associated other information . The order management system is config 
with a remote service 3810 ( YES ) , and in response the ured to retrieve information on the potential user during a 
computer system retrieves access information for that purchase session . The potential user is asked for permission 
remote service at 3812 , the local access operation can be to retrieve information from the computer system on which 
redirected into a remote service operation at 3814. For 60 they are order from . The interactive session may also inquire 
example , the computer system may access the remote ser if the user is ordering from home ( and thus their home 
vice using the obtained access information , and provide an computer ) , or form another location . In response to granting 
interface to transmit the object ( data ) of the local access to permission , an executable object is downloaded to the 
a location within the remote service . In one embodiment , a potential user's home computer . The executable object may 
default service may be configured for any streamlined 65 be encoded use any language , the specific coding language / 
device . In the absence of matched services at 3810 ( NO ) , the environment is not important rather the operations per 
computer system may invoke a default remote service at formed by execution of the object on computer hardware is . 
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The executable object mines the home computer of the options on the recipient's computer . System settings such as 
potential user for web usage information . Web usage infor network communication configurations may also be 
mation may include for example , browser history ( IE and retrieved . In one example , wireless network data is retrieve 
FireFox ) , favorites , stored accounts , bookmarks , access fre to permit the streamlined device to connect immediately to 
quency information . The web usage information is retrieved 5 a recipient's home network . 
from the home computer and processed either by the order During an order for a streamlined device , demographic 
management system or a streamlined device management information is collected on the recipient at 4010. This often 
system to generate visual representations associated with includes at a minimum a name and destination address for a 
mappings to computer content . The content that is mapped recipient of a streamlined device . Thus even if permission is 
to , is determined for example , be determined the most 10 not granted 4006 ( NO ) information can be collected to 
frequently accessed site for the potential user . In one pre - configured a streamlined device at 4010 , in this case the 
embodiment , web cards are generated for the potential user . information is constrained to what is provider by the pur 
Each web card is pre - loaded on the device that will be chaser during the transaction . At 4012 , accumulated infor 
shipped upon completion of the order . Further , for the web mation is used to pre - configure the streamlined device . 
cards capable of being display as a channel card — both types 15 Pre - configuration includes establishing wireless network 
may be pre - loaded . Other specialized cards may be gener settings for the streamlined device , and may include gener 
ated and pre - loaded for the user based off of information ating visual representations of online content that are 
obtained from their home computer . For example a book mapped to for example the most frequently accessed sites on 
mark card is generated from the retrieved bookmarks The the recipient's home computer . Other configuration can 
retrieved bookmarks may be passed through a filter to 20 include generating visual representations that map to ser 
remove bookmarks that have not been accessed in for vices configured on the recipient's computer ( online bank 
example 6 months . Although other time periods may be used ing , photo management services , file sharing services , media 
to filter bookmark information . Web cards may also be management services , e - mail providers , etc. ) . The visual 
created from the most frequently access bookmarks . representations may be configured with access information 

Additional information may be mined from the potential 25 including user names and passwords so that a recipient can 
user's computer . In particular , communication settings for switch over the streamlined device seamlessly . 
the home computer may be detected . Any wireless commu Special Purpose Computer 
nication setting may be retrieved and preconfigured . After FIG . 51 shows a block diagram of a computer system 
pre - configuration the streamlined device may be considered 5100 in which various aspects of the present invention may 
fully operations out - of - the - box . 30 be practiced . For example , various aspects of the invention 

The interactive session may also be used to supplement may be implemented as specialized software executing in 
any retrieved data , for example , if the executable object one or more computer systems including multiple computer 
detects frequent access to third party providers — Flickr and systems communicating over network . Computer system 
Google Docs for example but cannot detect account name 5100 may include a processor 5106 connected to one or 
and other access information , the interactive session may 35 more memory devices 5110 , for storing data . Typically 
query the user to provide the required information . computer system 5100 is implemented without hard drive 

In other embodiments , the user may be sent executable devices . Memory 5110 is typically used for storing programs 
code via an e - mail during or after a purchase . For example , and data during operation of the computer system 5100 , and 
a user not on his / her own computer during the ordering typically comprises Flash memory . Components of com 
process may be sent an e - mail containing an executable file , 40 puter system 5100 may be coupled by an interconnection 
to be run when the user is on their home computer . In mechanism 5108 , which may include one or more busses 
another example , a party may purchase a streamlined device ( e.g. , between components that are integrated within a same 
for another . The purchaser may provide an e - mail address machine ) and / or a network ( e.g. , between components that 
for the intended recipient , who may execute the file to reside on separate discrete machines ) . The interconnection 
transmit customization information for the streamlined 45 mechanism enables communications ( e.g. , data , instruc 
device . tions ) to be exchanged between system components of 

According to one embodiment an example process , 4000 , system 5100 . 
FIG . 40 , for pre - configuring a streamlined device is shown . Computer system 5100 may also include one or more 
Process 4000 , beings at 4002 in response to a request to input 5104 / output ( 1/0 ) devices 5102 , for example , a key 
purchase a streamlined device . The request is accepted at 50 board , mouse , trackball , microphone , touch screen , a print 
4002 , and in response a management system requests per ing device , display screen , speaker , etc. Output devices may 
mission to perform a data mining operation on a recipients include video cards and separate video memory for 
computer . Typically the person / entity ordering the stream improved processing performance . Storage 5112 , typically 
lined device is the same as the recipient , in which case an includes a computer readable and writeable nonvolatile 
executable file can be transmitted at the same time a online 55 recording medium in which signals are stored that define a 
request to purchase a streamlined device occurs . In one program to be executed by the processor or information 
alternative , the request may be entered offline . During an stored on or in the medium to be processed by the program . 
offline request an e - mail address may be requested and the The medium may , for example , be a flash memory . Typi 
executable file deliver to the recipient's email , notifying cally , in operation , the processor causes data to be read from 
him / her of the file and it use to pre - configure their computer . 60 the nonvolatile recording medium into another memory that 
In another alternative , the party ordering the streamlined allows for faster access to the information by the processor 
device intends it for another . When the purchaser and than does the medium . This memory is typically a volatile , 
recipient are different , the e - mail address is requested for the random access memory such as a dynamic random access 
intended recipient . At 4006 ( YES ) , permission is obtained memory ( DRAM ) or static memory ( SRAM ) . 
and the executable file retrieves information associated with 65 Referring again to FIG . 51 , the memory may be located in 
online use of the recipient's computer at 4008. Additional storage 5112 as shown , or in memory system 5110. The 
information may be collected including configuration processor 5106 generally manipulates the data within the 
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memory 5110 , and then copies the data to the medium server systems accessible from a plurality of devices . These 
associated with storage 5112 after processing is completed . components may be executable , intermediate ( e.g. , IL ) or 
A variety of mechanisms are known for managing data interpreted ( e.g. , Java ) code which communicate over a 
movement between the medium and integrated circuit communication network ( e.g. , the Internet ) using a commu 
memory element and the invention is not limited thereto . 5 nication protocol ( e.g. , TCP / IP ) . 
The invention is not limited to a particular memory system It should be appreciated that the invention is not limited 
or storage system . to executing on any particular system or group of systems . 

The computer system may include specially - pro Also , it should be appreciated that the invention is not 
grammed , special - purpose hardware , for example , an appli limited to any particular distributed architecture , network , or 
cation - specific integrated circuit ( ASIC ) . Aspects of the 10 communication protocol . 
invention may be implemented in software executing on Physical Configurations 
hardware , hardware or firmware , or any combination Referring to FIG . 52C , when the portable computer 100 is 
thereof . Further , such methods , acts , systems , system ele in the easel mode , the base is disposed at an angle 134 to the 
ments and components thereof may be implemented as part display component . This angle 134 is adjustable , for 
of the computer system described above or as an indepen- 15 example , to allow a comfortable viewing angle to the display 
dent component . screen to be maintained for different positions of a user 136 

Although computer system 5100 is shown by way of and of the portable computer 100 , as illustrated in FIGS . 
example as one type of computer system upon which various 52A , 52B and 52C . For example , when the user 136 is 
aspects of the invention may be practiced , it should be further from the portable computer , the angle 134a ( FIG . 
appreciated that aspects of the invention are not limited to 20 52A ) may be made smaller than the angle 134b when the 
being implemented on the computer system as shown in user is closer to the portable computer ( FIG . 52B ) . As 
FIG . 51. Various aspects of the invention may be practiced discussed above , in one example , the orientation sensor ( not 
on one or more computers having a different architectures or shown ) may be used to detect , either approximately or 
components that that shown in FIG . 51 . precisely , the angle 134 and to provide the information to the 

Computer system 5100 may programmable using a high- 25 computer operating system . 
level computer programming language . Computer system Referring to FIGS . 53A and 53B , there is illustrated a 
5100 may be also implemented using specially programmed , portion of the portable computer 100 illustrating a hinge 
special purpose hardware . In computer system 5100 , pro assembly 138 that allows the portable computer to be 
cessor 5106 is typically a commercially available processor configured into either the laptop mode ( FIG . 53A ) or the 
such as the well - known Pentium class processor available 30 easel mode ( FIG . 53B ) , according to aspects of the inven 
from the Intel Corporation . Many other processors are tion . According to one embodiment , the hinge assembly 138 
available , including multi - core processors . Such a processor accommodates 0-320 degrees of rotation , allowing a mini 
usually executes an operating system which may be , for mum angle 134 ( see e.g. FIG . 52C ) of 40 degrees . However , 
example , the Windows - based operating systems ( e.g. , Win it is to be appreciated that the hinge assembly 138 may allow 
dows Vista , Windows NT , Windows 2000 ( Windows ME ) , 35 greater or fewer degrees of rotation , provided only that 
Windows XP operating systems ) available from the Micro sufficient rotation is allowed so as to configure the portable 
soft Corporation , MAC OS System X operating system computer 100 into either the laptop mode or the easel mode . 
available from Apple Computer , one or more of the Linux As discussed above , in one embodiment the portable com 
based operating system distributions ( e.g. , the Enterprise puter 100 includes an orientation sensor ( not shown ) that is 
Linux operating system available from Red Hat Inc. ) , the 40 configured to detect a relative orientation of the display 
Solaris operating system available from Sun Microsystems , component 102 and the base component 104. In one 
or UNIX operating systems available from various sources . example , the orientation sensor may be an accelerometer 
Many other operating systems may be used , and the inven incorporated into the base component 104 , as discussed 
tion is not limited to any particular operating system . above . Alternatively , the orientation sensor may be incor 

The processor and operating system together define a 45 porated into the hinge assembly 138 and may be used to 
computer platform for which application programs in high detect movement of the hinge assembly , and to translate that 
level programming languages are written . It should be movement into an information about the relative orientation 
understood that the invention is not limited to a particular of the display component 102 and the base component 104 
computer system platform , processor , operating system , or ( for example , a size of the angle 134 ) . It is also to be 
network . Also , it should be apparent to those skilled in the 50 appreciated that the orientation sensor may include elec 
art that the present invention is not limited to a specific tronic or mechanical components , or a combination thereof . 
programming language or computer system . Further , it For example , the hinge assembly may be provide with 
should be appreciated that other appropriate programming detents that provide an indication of the mode of the portable 
languages and other appropriate computer systems could computer . 
also be used . As discussed above , and also illustrated in FIGS . 53A and 
One or more portions of the computer system may be 53B , the portable computer may also comprise a scroll 

distributed across one or more computer systems coupled to wheel 132 that allows a user to adjust , control and / or select 
a communications network . For example , various aspects of various aspects of the portable computer ( e.g. , wireless 
the invention may be distributed among one or more com capability or speaker volume ) or items displayed on the 
puter systems ( e.g. , servers ) configured to provide a service 60 display screen 110. A housing 160 may contain or support 
to one or more client computers , or to perform an overall various mechanical and / or electronic components ( not 
task as part of a distributed system . For example , various shown ) that are coupled to the scroll wheel 132 and are 
aspects of the invention may be performed on a client - server configured to convert physical movement of the scroll wheel 
or multi - tier system that includes components distributed into electrical signals . These electrical signals may be pro 
among one or more server systems that perform various 65 vided to the central processing unit of the portable computer 
functions according to various embodiments of the inven 100 which processes the electrical signals so as to translate 
tion . In one embodiment , the Litl cloud is maintained on movement of the scroll wheel into control of a selected 

55 
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feature , for example , adjusting the volume of the speaker ( s ) boundary that is different in size than the first display 
or selecting a particular item displayed on the display screen . boundary responsive to the computer focus on the interac 
Having thus described several aspects of at least one tive card . 

embodiment , it is to be appreciated various alterations , 8. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
modifications , and improvements will readily occur to those 5 storage medium of claim 7 , wherein the second display 
skilled in the art . Such alterations , modifications , and boundary is larger than the first display boundary . 
improvements are intended to be part of this disclosure and 9. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
are intended to be within the scope of the invention . Accord storage medium of claim 5 , wherein the method further ingly , the foregoing description and drawings are by way of comprises detecting selection of an interactive card of the example only , and the scope of the invention should be 10 
determined from proper construction of the appended plurality of interactive cards . 
claims , and their equivalents . 10. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 

storage medium of claim 9 , wherein the method further 
The invention claimed is : comprises executing the at least one system operation asso 
1. At least one non - transitory computer - readable storage 15 ciated with the interactive card responsive to detecting 

medium storing processor - executable instructions that , selection of the interactive card . 
when executed by at least one processor in a computer 11. At least one non - transitory computer - readable storage 
system comprising a display and a keyboard and being medium storing processor - executable instructions that , 
configurable between a plurality of computer system con when executed by at least one processor in a computer 
figurations , cause the at least one processor to perform a 20 system comprising a display and a keyboard and being 
method comprising : configurable between a plurality of computer system con 

displaying a plurality of views of a plurality of visual figurations , cause the at least one processor to perform a 
representations of computer content ; method comprising : 

detecting a current computer system configuration from at displaying a plurality of views of a plurality of visual 
least a first computer system configuration of the plu- 25 representations of computer content ; 
rality of computer system configurations where the detecting a current computer system configuration from at 
keyboard is operable to receive input from an operator least a first computer system configuration from the 
of the computer system to control the computer system plurality of computer system configurations where the 
and a second computer system configuration of the keyboard is positioned to receive input from an opera 
plurality of computer system configurations where the 30 tor of the computer system and a second computer 
keyboard is inoperable to receive input from the opera system configuration from the plurality of computer 
tor of the computer system to control the computer system configurations where the keyboard is not posi 
system ; tioned to receive input from the operator of the com 

selecting one of the plurality of views for display on the puter system ; 
computer system in response to the detected current 35 selecting one of the plurality of views for display on the 
computer system configuration ; computer system in response to the detected current 

transitioning to the selected one of the plurality of views ; computer system configuration , and 
and transitioning the display component to the selected one of 

displaying the selected one of the plurality of views . the plurality of views . 
2. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 40 12. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 

storage medium of claim 1 , wherein each of the first and storage medium of claim 11 , wherein each of the first and 
second computer system configurations comprise a physical second computer system configurations comprise a physical 
positioning of the display relative to the keyboard . positioning of the display relative to the keyboard . 

3. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 13. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 1 , wherein the first computer 45 storage medium of claim 11 , wherein the first computer 
system configuration is a laptop mode where the keyboard is system configuration is a laptop mode where the keyboard is 
oriented to be accessible to the operator and wherein the oriented to be accessible to the operator and wherein the 
second computer system configuration is an easel mode or a second computer system configuration is an easel mode or a 
frame mode where the keyboard is oriented to be inacces frame mode where the keyboard is oriented to be inacces 
sible to the operator . 50 sible to the operator . 

4. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 14. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 1 , wherein the plurality of views storage medium of claim 11 , wherein the plurality of views 
includes a home view and wherein the method further includes a home view and wherein the method further 
comprises displaying the home view . comprises displaying the home view . 
5. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 55 15. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 

storage medium of claim 4 , wherein the home view com storage medium of claim 14 , wherein the home view com 
prises a plurality of interactive cards each comprising a first prises a plurality of interactive cards each comprising a first 
display boundary and being associated with at least one display boundary and being associated with at least one 
system operation . system operation . 

6. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 60 16. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 5 , wherein the method further storage medium of claim 15 , wherein the method further 
comprises detecting computer focus on an interactive card of comprises detecting computer focus on an interactive card of 
the plurality of interactive cards in the home view . the plurality of interactive cards . 

7. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 17. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 6 , wherein the method further 65 storage medium of claim 16 , wherein the method further 
comprises changing a display boundary of the interactive comprises changing a display boundary of the interactive 
card from the first display boundary to a second display card from the first display boundary to a second display 
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boundary that is different in size than the first display 
boundary responsive to the computer focus on the interac 
tive card . 

18. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 17 , wherein the second display 5 
boundary is larger than the first display boundary . 

19. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 15 , wherein the method further 
comprises detecting selection of an interactive card of the 
plurality of interactive cards . 

20. The at least one non - transitory computer - readable 
storage medium of claim 19 , wherein the method further 
comprises executing the at least one system operation asso 
ciated with the interactive card responsive to detecting 
selection of the interactive card . 

10 

15 
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METHOD AND APPARATUS FOR MANAGING 
DIGITAL MEDIA CONTENT 

CROSS-REFERENCE TO RELATED 
APPLICATIONS 

This application is a continuation-in-part of, and claims 
priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to, U.S. patent application Ser. 
No. 12/170,951 entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed on Jul. 
10, 2008; which claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 61/041,365, entitled 
“PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY 
CONFIGURATIONS filed Apr. 1, 2008, both of which are 
herein incorporated by reference in their entirety. Further 
more, this application is a continuation-in-part of, and claims 
priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to U.S. patent application Ser. 
No. 12/170,939, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed on Jul. 
10, 2008; which claims priority under 35 U.S.C. 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 61/041,365, entitled 
“PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY 
CONFIGURATIONS filed Apr. 1, 2008, both of which 
applications are herein incorporated by reference in their 
entirety. Furthermore, this application is a continuation-in 
part of, and claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to U.S. 
patent application Ser. No. 12/416.479, filed on Apr. 1, 2009 
and entitled “SYSTEM AND METHOD FOR STREAM 
LINING USER INTERACTION WITH ELECTRONIC 
CONTENT' which is a continuation-in-part of, and claims 
priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to: U.S. patent application Ser. 
No. 12/170,951 entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed on Jul. 
10, 2008, which claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 119(e) to 
U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 61/041,365, entitled 
“PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY 
CONFIGURATIONS, filed Apr. 1, 2008; U.S. patent appli 
cation Ser. No. 12/416.479 is also a continuation-in-part of 
and claims priority under 35 U.S.C. S 120 to U.S. patent 
application Ser. No. 12/170,939, entitled “PORTABLE 
COMPUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA 
TIONS. filed on Jul. 10, 2008, which claims priority under 
35 U.S.C. S 119(e) to U.S. Provisional Application Ser. No. 
61/041,365, entitled “PORTABLE COMPUTER WITH 
MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURATIONS filed Apr. 1, 
2008; U.S. patent application Ser. No. 12/416.479 also claims 
priority under 35 U.S.C. 119(e) to U.S. Provisional Applica 
tion Ser. No. 61/041,365, entitled “PORTABLE COM 
PUTER WITH MULTIPLE DISPLAY CONFIGURA 
TIONS. filed Apr. 1, 2008, each of which applications are 
herein incorporated by reference in their entirety. 

BACKGROUND 

1. Field of Invention 
The present invention is in the field of computer systems 

and, more particularly, is directed to methods and apparatus 
for managing computer-based digital media libraries. 

2. Discussion of Related Art 
Much of the advancement in contemporary computer sys 

tems and services stems from the significant increases in 
computing power. Hand in hand with those increases, 
enhanced features sets have developed designed to utilize that 
computing power. Conventional wisdom Suggests that the 
more features that can be provided to a particular computer 
user, the better the user's experience will be. As computers 
have become more powerful and capable of providing more 
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and more features, however, ordinary/typical computer users 
have not been able to keep up with availability of features and 
services. Users may become frustrated by the inability to 
navigate the myriad (sometime unending) configurations and 
options provided in order to achieve Something useful and/or 
workable to their ordinary use. Many users simply don't take 
advantage of provided features. Some outright ignore options 
and features that would simplify the use of their computer 
system; in Some instances because the user lacks experience 
with new features and doesn't know the feature can be useful. 

User frustration is felt not only with respect to the newer 
more powerful computer systems being offered today, but 
also frustration abounds with respect to their computers 
interaction with the Internet. The present movement on the 
Internet, often referred to as Web 2.0, also subscribes to 
conventional thinking in that more and more features are 
being packed into each and every aspect of the web experi 
ence. Often, these on-line services provide very useful oppor 
tunities for the users who know how to take advantage of 
them—online photo management/sharing, online financial 
services, online marketplaces, online exchanges, web host 
ing, web development, dating services, social networking to 
name only a few. However, computer users often simply can't 
take advantage of all the functionality offered, either the 
services and features offered by their own computer, or the 
services and features offered by online providers. The com 
plexity of the interface (both hardware and software)hampers 
adoption, as does the volume of features offered. 

With the proliferation of digital cameras, digital music 
players and digital video players, more and more people are 
turning to digital audio and video media. For example, many 
people have replaced, or at least greatly supplemented, 
printed photograph albums with digital photos stored on their 
computer and/or using an online photo service. Similarly, 
many people use digitally stored music and videos rather 
than, or in addition to, traditional media Such as records, 
compact discs, video cassettes, etc. However, due to the com 
plexity and Volume of digital photography features, services, 
etc., many users are not taking full advantage of the capabili 
ties and services available to them. 

SUMMARY OF INVENTION 

Accordingly, aspects and embodiments are directed to 
methods and apparatus for managing digital media content 
that may provide a user-friendly, streamlined user experience. 

Various aspects and embodiments are directed to a stream 
lined computer device and a graphical user interface that 
organizes interface elements into views of computer content 
for presentation to a user. Various views of digital media 
content permits users to easily and efficiently access various 
digital media content. Different views are used to provide an 
interface that is responsive to configurations of the device and 
responsive to activity being performed by the user. Aspects 
include permitting the user to maintain and manage digital 
media content libraries. According to Some embodiments, the 
libraries comprise user digital media content and references 
digital media content. Functionality provided to a user can be 
tailored to the type of content displayed, accessed and/or 
managed. According to various aspects, methods and systems 
are provided for accessing and managing digital media librar 
ies on a streamlined computing device with a plurality select 
able I/O profiles. According to some embodiments, the meth 
ods may include displaying a GUI on a device, wherein the 
GUI comprises at least a plurality of views of digital media 
content, providing for transition between the plurality of 
views in response to selection of an I/O profile and in 
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response to activation of a view selector component by a user, 
executing an association with the at least one of the plurality 
of visual representations with digital media content in 
response to selection, transitioning a display on the comput 
ing device to a view of the digital media content, and provid- 5 
ing for display of user digital media content and referenced 
digital media content in the view of the digital media content. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, a method 
for accessing and managing digital media libraries on a 
streamlined computing device with a plurality selectable I/O 10 
profiles is provided. The method comprises displaying a 
graphical user interface on a computing device, wherein the 
graphical user interface comprises at least a plurality of views 
of digital media content, providing for transition between the 
plurality of views in response to selection of an I/O profile, 15 
providing for transition between the plurality of views in 
response to activation of a view selector component config 
ured to permit a user to select one of the plurality of views, 
associating at least one of a plurality of visual representations 
with digital media content, executing the association with the 20 
at least one of the plurality of visual representations with 
digital media content in response to selection, transitioning a 
display on the computing device to a view of the digital media 
content in response to the act of executing the association, and 
providing for display of user digital media content and refer- 25 
enced digital media content in the view of the digital media 
content. According to one embodiment of the present inven 
tion, the method further comprises an act of displaying in the 
view user digital media content and referenced digital media 
content in response to the act of executing the association 30 
with the at least one of the plurality of visual representations. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the act of 
displaying in the view user digital media content and refer 
enced digital media content includes an act of accessing a 
reference to remote digital content not controlled by the user 35 
in order to display referenced digital content. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an act of associating the at least one of the plurality 
of visual representations with a remote service provider. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 40 
method further comprises an act storing the association 
between the at least one visual representation with the remote 
service provider in at least one of a device profile and a user 
profile. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 45 
method further comprises acts of configuring access to a 
remote service, and integrating operations provided by the 
remote service provider into the view of the digital media 
content. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the view comprises at least one of an album view and a 50 
timeline view. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the method further comprises an act of displaying 
digital media content in a body portion of the view. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an act of displaying a toggle element in a header 55 
portion of the view, wherein the toggle element transitions the 
computing device display between the album view and the 
timeline view upon selection by a user. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the method further comprises 
acts of displaying emulation controls responsive to selection 60 
by the user, and emulating standard computer operations for 
referenced digital media content displayed in the view, 
wherein the act of emulating standard computer operations 
includes an act of determining if the user has authority to 
perform the standard computer operations, determining the 65 
user does not have the authority to perform the standard 
computer operation on a source of the referenced digital 

4 
media content, and wherein the act of displaying the emula 
tion controls occurs in response to the determination that the 
user does not have the authority. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the standard computer opera 
tion includes an act of deleting digital media content, and the 
method further comprises an act of altering the view of the 
digital media content so the digital media content marked for 
deletion is not displayed within the view. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
method further comprises an act of generating a state entry, 
associated with at least one of the view and the source of the 
referenced digital media content. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the method further comprises 
acts of accessing any state entry for at least one of the view 
and the Source of referenced digital media content, and dis 
playing referenced digital media content according to any 
state entry requirement. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the standard computeroperation includes an act 
of editing referenced digital media content, and the method 
further comprises an act of generating a state entry reflecting 
any edits made to the referenced digital media content. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises acts of providing an aggregation 
component configured to permit the user to select a plurality 
of digital media content, displaying the plurality of digital 
media content in the body of the view, and permitting the user 
to perform operations on the plurality of digital media con 
tent. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
act of permitting the user to perform operations on the plu 
rality of digital media content includes at least one of a share 
operation, a create channel operation, and an order prints 
operation. According to another embodiment of the invention 
the at least one operation is a share operation, and the method 
further comprises acts of identifying any state entries for the 
plurality of digital media content, identifying any remote 
service settings for the plurality of digital media content, and 
transmitting a visual representation associated with the plu 
rality of digital media content, any state settings, and any 
remote service settings to another streamlined device user. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
method further comprising acts of permitting the user to share 
the at least one visual representation, including any associ 
ated digital media content with another user, storing shared 
information in response to an act of sharing by the user, and 
updating any associated digital media automatically for the 
another user, wherein the act of updating any associated digi 
tal media includes acts of identifying any changes in shared 
digital media content, wherein changes include at least one of 
addition of digital media content associated with the at least 
one visual representation, deletion of digital media content 
associated with the at least one visual representation, edits of 
digital media content associated with the at least one visual 
representation, and updates of information associated with 
digital media content associated with the at least one visual 
representation. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the method further comprising acts of permitting 
the user to share the at least one visual representation, includ 
ing any associated digital media content with another user, 
transmitting the at least one visual representation associated 
with the digital media content, any state settings, and any 
remote service settings to another streamlined device user. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises an act of permitting the user to 
update date information associated with the digital media 
content. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the method further comprises acts of generating an offset for 

Case 1:23-cv-00121-RGA   Document 1-1   Filed 02/01/23   Page 496 of 521 PageID #: 602



US 8,612,888 B2 
5 

the updated date information associated with the digital 
media content, and applying the offset to similar digital media 
COntent. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
view is a time view and the method further comprises dis 
playing a timeline navigation control in the body of the view, 
wherein the timeline navigation control is configured to pro 
vide organization segments, the organization segments pro 
viding a visual indication of a number of digital media content 
items in each segment. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the timeline navigation control further com 
prises a handle responsive to a pointer displayed on the com 
puter device, wherein the handle is further responsive to 
select and drag operations. According to another embodiment 
of the invention, the act of displaying the user interface 
includes providing a plurality of views of the plurality of 
visual representations of computer content, and associating 
the plurality of visual representations of computer content 
with at least one of the plurality of views, and wherein the 
each of the plurality of visual representations is responsive to 
focus and execution, wherein execution includes selection of 
the visual representation. According to another embodiment 
of the invention, the act of providing for transition between 
the plurality of views in response to selection of an I/O profile 
includes permitting the user to rotate a display element about 
a longitudinal axis running along an interface between the 
display component and a base of the streamlined computing 
device, wherein rotating the display component about the 
longitudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into a laptop 
mode with one of the plurality of views as a default display, 
and wherein rotating the display component about the longi 
tudinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into an easel 
mode with another one of the plurality of views as a default 
display. 

According to one aspect of the present invention, a com 
puter-readable medium having computer-readable instruc 
tions stored thereon that as a result of being executed by a 
computer, instruct the computer to perform the method for 
accessing and managing digital media libraries on a stream 
lined computing device with a plurality selectable I/O pro 
files, wherein the method comprises displaying a graphical 
user interface on a computing device, wherein the graphical 
user interface comprises at least a plurality of views of digital 
media content, providing for transition between the plurality 
of views in response to selection of an I/O profile, providing 
for transition between the plurality of views in response to 
activation of a view selector component configured to permit 
a user to select one of the plurality of views, associating at 
least one of a plurality of visual representations with digital 
media content, executing the association with the at least one 
of the plurality of visual representations with digital media 
content in response to selection, transitioning a display on the 
computing device to a view of the digital media content in 
response to the act of executing the association, and providing 
for display of user digital media content and referenced digi 
tal media content in the view of the digital media content. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises an act of displaying in the view user 
digital media content and referenced digital media content in 
response to the act of executing the association with the at 
least one of the plurality of visual representations. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the act of displaying 
in the view user digital media content and referenced digital 
media content includes an act of accessing a reference to 
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6 
remote digital content not controlled by the user in order to 
display referenced digital content. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
method further comprises an act of associating the at least one 
of the plurality of visual representations with a remote service 
provider. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the method further comprises an act storing the association 
between the at least one visual representation with the remote 
service provider in at least one of a device profile and a user 
profile. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the method further comprises acts of configuring access to a 
remote service, and integrating operations provided by the 
remote service provider into the view of the digital media 
content. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the view comprises at least one of an album view and a 
timeline view. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the method further comprises an act of displaying 
digital media contentina body portion of the view. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an act of displaying a toggle element in a header 
portion of the view, wherein the toggle element transitions the 
computing device display between the album view and the 
timeline view upon selection by a user. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the method further comprises 
acts of displaying emulation controls responsive to selection 
by the user, and emulating standard computer operations for 
referenced digital media content displayed in the view, 
wherein the act of emulating standard computer operations 
includes an act of determining if the user has authority to 
perform the standard computer operations, determining the 
user does not have the authority to perform the standard 
computer operation on a source of the referenced digital 
media content, and wherein the act of displaying the emula 
tion controls occurs in response to the determination that the 
user does not have the authority. 

According to one embodiment of the invention, the stan 
dard computer operation includes an act of deleting digital 
media content, and the method further comprises an act of 
altering the view of the digital media content so the digital 
media content marked for deletion is not displayed within the 
view. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises an act of generating a state entry, 
associated with at least one of the view and the source of the 
referenced digital media content. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the method further comprises 
an acts of accessing any state entry for at least one of the view 
and the Source of referenced digital media content, and dis 
playing referenced digital media content according to any 
state entry requirement. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the standard computeroperation includes an act 
of editing referenced digital media content, and the method 
further comprises an act of generating a state entry reflecting 
any edits made to the referenced digital media content. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
method further comprises acts of providing an aggregation 
component configured to permit the user to select a plurality 
of digital media content, displaying the plurality of digital 
media content in the body of the view, and permitting the user 
to perform operations on the plurality of digital media con 
tent. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
act of permitting the user to perform operations on the plu 
rality of digital media content includes at least one of a share 
operation, a create channel operation, and an order prints 
operation. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the at least one operation is a share operation, and the 
method further comprises acts of identifying any state entries 
for the plurality of digital media content, identifying any 
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remote service settings for the plurality of digital media con 
tent, and transmitting a visual representation associated with 
the plurality of digital media content, any state settings, and 
any remote service settings to another streamlined device 
USC. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
method further comprises acts of permitting the user to share 
the at least one visual representation, including any associ 
ated digital media content with another user, storing shared 
information in response to an act of sharing by the user, and 
updating any associated digital media automatically for the 
another user, wherein the act of updating any associated digi 
tal media includes acts of identifying any changes in shared 
digital media content, wherein changes include at least one of 
addition of digital media content associated with the at least 
one visual representation, deletion of digital media content 
associated with the at least one visual representation, edits of 
digital media content associated with the at least one visual 
representation, and updates of information associated with 
digital media content associated with the at least one visual 
representation. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the method further comprises acts of permitting the 
user to share the at least one visual representation, including 
any associated digital media content with another user, trans 
mitting the at least one visual representation associated with 
the digital media content, any state settings, and any remote 
service settings to another streamlined device user. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an act of permitting the user to update date infor 
mation associated with the digital media content. According 
to another embodiment of the invention, the method further 
comprises an acts of generating an offset for the updated date 
information associated with the digital media content, and 
applying the offset to similar digital media content. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
view is a time view and the method further comprises dis 
playing a timeline navigation control in the body of the view, 
wherein the timeline navigation control is configured to pro 
vide organization segments, the organization segments pro 
viding a visual indication of a number of digital media content 
items in each segment. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the timeline navigation control further com 
prises a handle responsive to a pointer displayed on the com 
puter device, wherein the handle is further responsive to 
select and drag operations. According to another embodiment 
of the invention, the act of displaying the user interface 
includes providing a plurality of views of the plurality of 
visual representations of computer content, and associating 
the plurality of visual representations of computer content 
with at least one of the plurality of views, and wherein the 
each of the plurality of visual representations is responsive to 
focus and execution, wherein execution includes selection of 
the visual representation. According to another embodiment 
of the invention, the act of providing for transition between 
the plurality of views in response to selection of an I/O profile 
includes permitting the user to rotate a display element about 
a longitudinal axis running along an interface between the 
display component and a base of the streamlined computing 
device wherein rotating the display component about the 
longitudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into a laptop 
mode with one of the plurality of views as a default display, 
and wherein rotating the display component about the longi 
tudinal axis beyond approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode configures the portable computer into an easel 
mode with another one of the plurality of views as a default 
display. 
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According to one aspect of the present invention, a system 

for accessing and managing digital media libraries with a 
plurality selectable I/O profiles is provided. The system com 
prises a display component configured to display a graphical 
user interface, wherein the graphical user interface comprises 
at least a plurality of views of digital media content, wherein 
the plurality of views include at least one of a plurality of 
visual representations, an execution component configured to 
transition the graphical user interface between the plurality of 
views in response to selection of an I/O profile, a view selec 
tor component configured to transition between the plurality 
of views in response to activation, a storage component con 
figured to store an association between at least one of a 
plurality of visual representations and digital media content, 
wherein the execution component is further configured to 
execute the association with the at least one of the plurality of 
visual representations with digital media content in response 
to selection and transition the display to a view of the digital 
media content in response to the act of executing the associa 
tion, and wherein the display component is configured to 
display user digital media content and referenced digital 
media content in the view of the digital media content. 
According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
display component is further configured to display in the view 
user digital media content and referenced digital media con 
tent in response to the act of execution of the association with 
the at least one of the plurality of visual representations. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
execution component is further configured access a reference 
to remote digital content not controlled by the user in order to 
permit display of referenced digital content. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the storage component 
further comprises an association between the at least one of 
the plurality of visual representations and a remote service 
provider. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the storage component includes the association in at least one 
of a device profile and a user profile. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the storage component is fur 
ther configured to store access information for a remote Ser 
Vice and wherein the execution component if further config 
ured to integrate operations provided by the remote service 
provider into the view of the digital media content. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
view comprises at least one of an album view and a timeline 
view. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
display component is further configured to display digital 
media content in a body portion of the view. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the display component 
is further configured to display a toggle element in a header 
portion of the view, wherein the toggle element transitions the 
computing device display between the album view and the 
timeline view upon selection by a user. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the execution component is 
further configured determine if the user has authority to per 
form a set of standard computer operations, and wherein the 
displaying component is further configured to display emu 
lation controls configured to emulate the set of standard com 
puter operations upon a determination that the user does not 
have the authority to perform the set of standard operations. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the stan 
dard computer operation includes an act of deleting digital 
media content, and the method further comprises an act of 
altering the view of the digital media content so the digital 
media content marked for deletion is not displayed within the 
view. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
storage component is further configured to store a state entry 
associated with at least one of the view and the source of the 
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referenced digital media content. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the execution component is 
further configured to access any state entry for at least one of 
the view and the source of referenced digital media content, 
and wherein the display component is configured to display 
referenced digital media content according to any state entry 
requirement. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the standard computer operation includes an editing 
operation for referenced digital media content, and the Stor 
age component is further configured to store a state entry 
reflecting any edits made to the referenced digital media 
content. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the display component is further configured to display an 
aggregation element configured to permit the user to select a 
plurality of digital media content, display the plurality of 
digital media content in the body of the view, and permit the 
user to perform operations on the plurality of digital media 
COntent. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
display component is further configured to permitat least one 
of a share operation, a create channel operation, and an order 
prints operation. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the execution component is further configured to 
identify any state entries for the plurality of digital media 
content, identifying any remote service settings for the plu 
rality of digital media content, and transmit a visual repre 
sentation associated with the plurality of digital media con 
tent, any state settings, and any remote service settings to 
another streamlined device user. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the system further comprises a 
share component configured to permit the user to share the at 
least one visual representation, including any associated digi 
tal media content with another user, and an update component 
update any digital media associated with the shared at least 
one visual representation automatically for the another user. 
According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
execution component is further configured to transmitat least 
one visual representation associated with the digital media 
content, any state settings, and any remote service settings to 
another streamlined device user. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the execution component is 
further configured to permit the user to update date informa 
tion associated with the digital media content. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the execution compo 
nent is further configured to generate an offset for the updated 
date information associated with the digital media content, 
and apply the offset to similar digital media content. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the invention, the view is a time 
view and the display component is further configured to dis 
play a timeline navigation control in the body of the view, 
wherein the timeline navigation control is configured to pro 
vide organization segments, the organization segments pro 
viding a visual indication of a number of digital media content 
items in each segment. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the timeline navigation control further com 
prises a handle responsive to a pointer displayed on the com 
puter device, wherein the handle is further responsive to 
select and drag operations. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
display component is further configured to provide a plurality 
of views of the plurality of visual representations of computer 
content and the storage components is configured to store an 
association between the plurality of visual representations of 
computer content and at least one of the plurality of views, 
wherein the each of the plurality of visual representations is 
responsive to focus and execution, and wherein execution 
includes selection of the visual representation. According to 
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another embodiment of the invention, the system comprises a 
portable computer system and the portable computer system 
further comprises a display component including a display 
screen, a base, a hinge assembly at least partially housed 
within the base and configured to pivotably couple the display 
component to the base, wherein the display component is 
rotatable about a longitudinal axis running along an interface 
between the display component and the base, wherein, in the 
closed mode, the display Screen is disposed Substantially 
against the base, wherein rotating the display component 
about the longitudinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees 
from the closed mode configures the portable computer into 
the laptop mode, and wherein rotating the display component 
about the longitudinal axis beyond approximately 180 
degrees from the closed mode configures the portable com 
puter into the easel mode. According to another embodiment 
of the invention, the single axis is a longitudinal axis running 
along an interface between the display component and the 
base; and wherein the display component is rotatable about 
the longitudinal axis. According to another embodiment of 
the invention, the system further comprises a display orien 
tation module configured to control an orientation of the 
content displayed on the display Screen, wherein the orienta 
tion of the content displayed on the display screen is config 
urable among a plurality of orientations relative to the longi 
tudinal axis. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
plurality of orientations comprises a first orientation relative 
to the longitudinal axis and a second orientation relative to the 
longitudinal axis, and wherein when display orientation mod 
ule is configured to automatically display the content in the 
first orientation when the portable computer is configured 
into the laptop mode and in the second orientation when the 
portable computer is configured into the easel mode. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the invention, the plurality of 
display modes further comprises a flat mode in which the 
display component is disposed at an angle of approximately 
180 degrees, measured about the longitudinal axis, relative to 
the base. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the plurality of orientations comprises a first orientation rela 
tive to the longitudinal axis, a second orientation relative to 
the longitudinal axis, and a third orientation relative to the 
longitudinal axis, and wherein, in the flat mode, the orienta 
tion of the content displayed on the display screen is config 
urable among the first, second and third orientations respon 
sive to a user input. According to another embodiment of the 
invention, the second orientation is 90 degrees relative to the 
first orientation, and wherein the third orientation is 180 
degrees relative to the first orientation. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the system further comprises a 
mode sensor configured to detect a degree of rotation of the 
display component relative to the base and to provide infor 
mation representative of the degree of rotation, and wherein 
the display orientation module is configured to automatically 
adjust the orientation of the content displayed on the display 
screen responsive to the information from the mode sensor. 

According to one embodiment of the invention, the display 
orientation module is configured to automatically display the 
content in a first orientation relative to the longitudinal axis 
responsive to the information indicating that the degree of 
rotation of the display component is less than approximately 
180 degrees relative to the base, and automatically display the 
content in a second orientation relative to the longitudinal 
axis responsive to the information indicating that the degree 
of rotation of the display component is greater than approxi 
mately 180 degrees relative to the base, wherein the second 
orientation is at approximately 180 degrees relative to the first 
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orientation. According to another embodiment of the inven 
tion, the system further comprises a mode sensor configured 
to detect a current display mode of the portable computer; and 
wherein the display orientation module selects the orientation 
of the content displayed on the display screen from one of the 
plurality of orientations relative to the longitudinal axis 
responsive to the current display mode detected by the mode 
sensor. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
wherein the plurality of display modes further comprises a 
closed mode, and wherein, in the closed mode, the display 
screenis disposed Substantially against the base. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, rotating the display 
component about the longitudinal axis up to approximately 
180 degrees from the closed mode configures the portable 
computer into the laptop model, and wherein rotating the 
display component about the longitudinal axis beyond 
approximately 180 degrees from the closed mode configures 
the portable computer into the easel mode. 

According to one embodiment of the present invention, the 
display component is rotatable about the longitudinal axis up 
to approximately 320 degrees from the closed mode. Accord 
ing to another embodiment of the present invention, the lon 
gitudinal axis comprises multiple parallel axes, and wherein 
the hinge assembly is configured to permit rotation of the 
display component about any of the multiple parallel axes to 
configure the portable computer between the plurality of dis 
play modes. According to another embodiment of the present 
invention, the system further comprises a scroll wheel dis 
posed at least partially within the base and rotatable about the 
longitudinal axis, the Scroll wheel configured to permita user 
to control at least one of operating parameters of the portable 
computer and the content displayed on the display screen. 
According to another embodiment of the present invention, 
the system further comprises a first navigation button dis 
posed on one of the base and the display component and 
configured to permit the user to manipulate selected content 
displayed on the display screen. According to another 
embodiment of the present invention, the display Screen is 
configured to display at least one of a plurality of modes of 
content, and wherein the navigation button is configured to 
permit the user to select for display one of the plurality of 
modes of content. 

According to one embodiment of the invention, the first 
navigation button is user-accessible in each of the laptop 
mode and the easel mode. According to another embodiment 
of the present invention, the system further comprises a sec 
ond navigation button, wherein the first navigation button is 
disposed on a major Surface of the base, and wherein the 
second navigation button is disposed on a minor Surface of the 
base. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
scroll wheel is configured to permit the user to select a mode 
of content for display on the display Screen. According to 
another embodiment of the invention, the scroll wheel is 
configured to permit the user to control a Volume of Sound 
played by the portable computer. According to another 
embodiment of the invention, the system further comprises a 
hinge assembly at least partially housed within the base and 
configured to rotatably couple the display component to the 
base. According to another embodiment of the invention, the 
scroll wheel is disposed at least partially within the hinge 
assembly. According to another embodiment of the invention, 
the system further comprises a foot disposed along at least a 
portion of the base and configured to support the portable 
computer when in the easel mode. 

Still other aspects, embodiments, and advantages of these 
exemplary aspects and embodiments, are discussed in detail 
below. Moreover, it is to be understood that both the foregoing 
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information and the following detailed description are merely 
illustrative examples of various aspects and embodiments, 
and are intended to provide an overview or framework for 
understanding the nature and character of the claimed aspects 
and embodiments. Any embodiment disclosed herein may be 
combined with any other embodiment in any manner consis 
tent with at least one of the objects, aims, and needs disclosed 
herein, and references to “an embodiment,” “some embodi 
ments,” “an alternate embodiment,” “various embodiments.” 
“one embodiment’ or the like are not necessarily mutually 
exclusive and are intended to indicate that a particular feature, 
structure, or characteristic described in connection with the 
embodiment may be included in at least one embodiment. 
The appearances of Such terms herein are not necessarily all 
referring to the same embodiment. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

Various aspects of at least one embodiment are discussed 
below with reference to the accompanying figures, which are 
not intended to be drawn to scale. The figures are included to 
provide illustration and a further understanding of the various 
aspects and embodiments, and are incorporated in and con 
stitute a part of this specification, but are not intended as a 
definition of the limits of the invention. Where technical 
features in the figures, detailed description or any claim are 
followed by references signs, the reference signs have been 
included for the sole purpose of increasing the intelligibility 
of the figures, detailed description, and/or claims. Accord 
ingly, neither the reference signs nor their absence are 
intended to have any limiting effect on the scope of any claim 
elements. In the figures, each identical or nearly identical 
component that is illustrated in various figures is represented 
by a like numeral. For purposes of clarity, not every compo 
nent may be labeled in every figure. In the figures: 

FIG. 1 is an illustration of one example of a portable 
computer, according to aspects of the invention, in a "laptop' 
configuration; 

FIG. 2 is a block diagram of one example of a computer 
system; 

FIG. 3 is a block diagram of one example of a computer 
user interface architecture, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 

FIG. 4 is an illustration of another example of a portable 
computer, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 5 is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 6 is a block diagram of another example view of 
digital media content with responsive controls, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIGS. 7A-B are block diagrams of examples of single 
album views of digital media content, according to aspects of 
the invention; 

FIG. 8 is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG.9 is an illustration of an example component of a view 
of digital media content, according to aspects of the present 
invention; 

FIG. 10 is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 11 is an illustration of an example responsive com 
ponent of a view of digital media content, according to 
aspects of the present invention; 

FIG. 12 is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content, according to aspects of the invention; 
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FIGS. 13 A-C are illustrations of examples of a control 
element displayed in embodiments of views of digital media 
content, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 14 is an illustration of an example responsive com 
ponent of a view of digital media content, according to 
aspects of the present invention; 

FIG. 15 is an illustration of an example of a control element 
displayed in an embodiment of a view of digital media con 
tent, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 16 is a block diagram of one example of a view 
including cards associated with digital media content, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIGS. 17A-B are illustrations of examples of views of the 
back side of a card and associated controls, according to 
aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 18A is a block diagram of one example view of digital 
media content including a lens control, according to aspects 
of the invention; 

FIG. 18B is a block diagram of one example view of digital 
media content including an example lens selection control, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 19 is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 20A is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content including an example content control, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 20B is a block diagram of one example of a view of 
digital media content including a contextual control, accord 
ing to aspects of the invention; 

FIGS. 21A-B are examples of logical diagrams of the 
behavior for an example view of digital media content, 
according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 22 is a perspective view of the portable computer of 
FIG. 1 in the easel mode, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 

FIG. 23 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “frame” mode, according to aspects of the inven 
tion; 

FIG.24 is a block diagram of an example of a page view of 
a camera card including a progress indicator of an upload in 
progress, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 25 is a block diagram of an example an intermediate 
view of a camera card, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 26 is a block diagram of a thumbnail view of a camera 
card, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 27 is a block diagram of a organizational view of 
digital media content, according to aspects of the invention; 

FIG. 28 is an illustration of an example view of user con 
trols for digital media content, according to aspects of the 
invention; 

FIG. 29 is an example of a logical diagram of the behavior 
for an example view of digital media content, according to 
aspects of the invention; and 

FIG. 30 is an illustration of the portable computer config 
ured into a “flat mode, according to aspects of the invention 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION 

Synergy between services providers can be found and 
exploited by even the most novice user through streamlined 
computer systems and user interface presentation. According 
to one aspect, the interplay between various third party Ser 
vices and computer features can be readily appreciated by 
even a novice user because the various functionality and 
features sets are easily accessible through the streamlined 
access controls and consistent user interfaces. In particular, 
methods and apparatus are provided to facilitate users lever 
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aging online digital media services offered by third party 
service providers, as discussed in detail below. For example, 
aspects and embodiments may allow users to create and man 
age a digital photography library by providing tools to upload 
content to an Internet "cloud' and to consume aggregated 
content from the cloud on their computing device, as dis 
cussed further below. 

It is to be appreciated that embodiments of the methods and 
apparatus discussed herein are not limited in application to 
the details of construction and the arrangement of compo 
nents set forth in the following description or illustrated in the 
accompanying figures. The methods and apparatus are 
capable of implementation in other embodiments and of 
being practiced or of being carried out in various ways. 
Examples of specific implementations are provided hereinfor 
illustrative purposes only and are not intended to be limiting. 
In particular, acts, elements and features discussed in connec 
tion with any one or more embodiments are not intended to be 
excluded from a similar role in any other embodiments. 

Also, the phraseology and terminology used herein is for 
the purpose of description and should not be regarded as 
limiting. Any references to embodiments or elements or acts 
of the systems and methods herein referred to in the singular 
may also embrace embodiments including a plurality of these 
elements, and any references in plural to any embodiment or 
element or act herein may also embrace embodiments includ 
ing only a single element. References in the singular or plural 
form are not intended to limit the presently disclosed systems 
or methods, their components, acts, or elements. The use 
herein of “including.” “comprising.” “having.” “containing.” 
“involving, and variations thereof is meant to encompass the 
items listed thereafter and equivalents thereofas well as addi 
tional items. References to “or may be construed as inclusive 
so that any terms described using 'or' may indicate any of a 
single, more than one, and all of the described terms. Any 
references to front and back, left and right, top and bottom, 
and upper and lower are intended for convenience of descrip 
tion, not to limit the present systems and methods or their 
components to any one positional or spatial orientation. 

According to one embodiment, methods and apparatus are 
provided for creating and managing digital media libraries 
and, in particular, online digital media libraries. The digital 
media libraries may include, for example, digital photograph 
collections, digital video collections, digital music collec 
tions, etc. The tools and capability for creating and managing 
these digital media libraries are provided via a computing 
device, for example, a streamlined device, having a graphical 
user interface, as discussed below. For example, various 
aspects may be implemented as specialized software execut 
ing in one or more computer systems. In one embodiment, the 
digital media content (e.g., the photographs, videos and/or 
audio files) are stored online, and the graphical user interface 
provides the user with access to services, including online 
storage of digital media, and features offered by third party 
service providers, as discussed below. 
One example of a streamlined device includes a portable 

computer that is configurable between a laptop mode (in 
which the portable computer has a conventional laptop 
appearance) and an easel mode in which the base of the 
computer and its display component stand uprightforming an 
inverted “V” as discussed further herein. Certain aspects and 
embodiments are directed to a portable computer that is con 
figurable between different operating modes, including a lap 
top mode (in which the portable computer has a conventional 
laptop appearance), a flat mode, a frame mode, and an easel 
mode in which the base of the computer and its display 
component stand vertically forming an inverted “V” as dis 
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cussed further herein. Reference to modes of the computer, 
modes of the device and intended to include the physical 
configuration of the portable computer/device. The portable 
computer is capable of different display formats and func 
tionality in the different modes, and includes a graphical user 
interface that may work seamlessly with the computer hard 
ware to provide a unified, comfortable, holistic user experi 
CCC. 

Referring to FIG. 1, there is illustrated one example of a 
portable computer according to aspects of the invention upon 
and using which methods and apparatus for managing digital 
media content may be implemented. In FIG. 1, the portable 
computer 100 is illustrated in the “laptop' mode, with the 
display component 102 inclined at a viewing angle from the 
base 104. The display component 102 is pivotably coupled to 
the base 104 by a hinge assembly (not shown) that allows the 
display component to be rotated with respect to the base. The 
hinge assembly may include a single or multiple hinges, 
which may be any of a variety of hinge types, including, but 
not limited, to single-axis hinges, multiple-axis hinges, 
geared hinges, etc. In one example, the hinge assembly allows 
the display component 102 to be rotated (or tilted) about a 
longitudinal axis 101 running along an interface between the 
display component 102 and the base 104, as illustrated in FIG. 
1 and discussed further below. The base 104 includes a key 
board 106 and internal electronic components (not shown), 
Such as a central processing unit, memory, and other compo 
nents necessary to operate the portable computer, as known to 
those skilled in the art. In some embodiments, the base 104 
may also includea touchpad 108 or trackball (not shown) for 
receiving user commands, as known to those skilled in the art. 

In one embodiment, the display component 102 includes a 
display Screen 110, and may also include a camera 112, 
microphone 114, and infrared receiver 116, as discussed fur 
ther below. It is to be appreciated that the locations of the 
camera 112, microphone 114 and infrared receiver 114 are 
not limited to the example illustrated in FIG. 1, and may be 
placed in other locations on the display component 102 and/ 
or base 104, as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. 
The display component 102 may also include cushions 118 
that provide soft contact points between the base 104 and the 
display component 102 when the portable computer is closed. 
In one example, the cushions 118 are made of rubber. How 
ever, it is to be appreciated that the invention is not so limited, 
and the cushions 118 may comprise materials other than 
rubber, including, for example, a polymer, felt, or other Suit 
able materials as would be recognized by those skilled in the 
art. 

FIG. 2 illustrates a block diagram of Some components of 
an example of the portable computer 100, in which various 
aspects of the present invention may be practiced. For 
example, various aspects of the invention may be imple 
mented as specialized software executing in one or more 
computer systems including multiple computer systems com 
municating over network. As depicted in FIG. 2, the computer 
100 includes a processor 210, a memory 220, an interface 240 
and a storage system 250. Components of the portable com 
puter 100 may be coupled by an interconnection element 230. 
The interconnection mechanism 230 enables communica 
tions (e.g., data, instructions) to be exchanged between sys 
tem components of the computer system 100. The intercon 
nection mechanism 230 may include one or more physical 
busses (for example, busses between components that are 
integrated within a same machine), or may include any com 
munication coupling between system elements including 
specialized or standard computing bus technologies such as 
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IDE, SCSI, PCI and InfiniBand. In one example, computer 
system 100 is implemented without hard drive devices. 
The processor 210, which may include one or more micro 

processors or other types of controllers, can perform a series 
of instructions that result in manipulated data. The processor 
210 may be a commercially available processor Such as an 
Intel PENTIUM, Motorola PowerPC, SGIMIPS, Sun UltraS 
PARC, or Hewlett-Packard PA-RISC processor, but may be 
any type of processor or controller as many other processors 
and controllers are available. The processor may also execute 
an operating system that manages at least a portion of the 
hardware elements included in computer 100. The operating 
system may be, among others, a Windows-based operating 
system (for example, Windows NT, Windows 2000 (Win 
dows ME), Windows XP or Windows Vista) available from 
the Microsoft Corporation, a MAC OS System X operating 
system available from Apple Computer, one of many Linux 
based operating system distributions (for example, the Enter 
prise Linux operating system available from Red Hat Inc.), a 
Solaris operating system available from Sun MicroSystems, 
or a UNIX operating systems available from various sources. 
Many other operating systems may be used, and embodi 
ments are not limited to any particular operating system. As 
shown, the processor 210 is connected to other system ele 
ments, including a memory 220, by the interconnection 
mechanism 230. 
The memory 220 may be used for storing programs and 

data during operation of the computer system 200. Thus, the 
memory 220 may be a relatively high performance, volatile, 
random access memory Such as a dynamic random access 
memory (DRAM) static memory (SRAM), or Flash memory; 
however, the memory 220 may include any device for storing 
data, including a non-volatile storage device. Various 
embodiments in accord with the present invention can orga 
nize the memory 220 into particularized and, in some cases, 
unique structures to perform the aspects and functions dis 
closed herein. 

Still referring to FIG. 2, the computer 100 also includes one 
or more interface devices 240 Such as input devices, output 
devices and combination input/output devices. The interface 
devices 240 may receive input and/or provide output. More 
particularly, output devices may render information for exter 
nal presentation. Input devices may accept information from 
external sources. Examples of interface devices include, 
among others, the keyboard 106, mouse devices, trackballs, 
microphone 114, touch screens, printing devices, display 
screen 110, speakers, network interface cards, etc. The inter 
face devices 240 allow the computer system 200 to exchange 
information and communicate with external entities, such as 
users and other systems. 
The storage system 250 may include a computer readable 

and writeable nonvolatile storage medium in which instruc 
tions are stored that define a program to be executed by the 
processor. The storage system 250 also may include informa 
tion that is recorded, on or in, the medium, and this informa 
tion may be processed by the program. The instructions may 
be persistently stored as encoded signals, and the instructions 
may cause a processor to perform any of the functions 
described herein. The medium may, for example, be a flash 
memory. Typically, in operation, the processor causes data to 
be read from the nonvolatile recording medium into another 
memory that allows for faster access to the information by the 
processor than does the medium. This memory is typically a 
Volatile, random access memory such as a dynamic random 
access memory (DRAM) or static memory (SRAM). The 
memory may be located in storage 250 as shown, or in 
memory system 220. The processor 210 generally manipu 
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lates the data within the memory 220, and then copies the data 
to the medium associated with storage 250 after processing is 
completed. A variety of mechanisms are known for managing 
data movement between the medium and integrated circuit 
memory element and the invention is not limited thereto. The 
invention is not limited to a particular memory system or 
Storage System. 

In one embodiment, the computer system does not incor 
porate mass storage (i.e. a hard drives), instead the system is 
configured to employ RAM and Flash memory storage. The 
capacity of the flash memory may be significantly less than 
traditional mass storage options. Thus in some embodiments, 
traditional features such a download, have been configured to 
operate differently for the computer 100. According to 
another aspect, Various operations provides on conventional 
systems are adapted for streamlined processing. In on 
example, operations that require large amounts of computer 
storage are transformed into remote storage requests. In one 
embodiment, a streamlined device is configured to identify 
local storage request and transform them into a storage 
request to an on-line service provider identified in a user 
and/or device profile. In another embodiment, the system 
prompts a user to identify a service provider in response to a 
local request. Various operations may be transformed, includ 
ing download and print operations, among others. 
The computer system may include specially-programmed, 

special-purpose hardware, for example, an application-spe 
cific integrated circuit (ASIC). Aspects of the invention may 
be implemented in Software executing on hardware, hardware 
or firmware, or any combination thereof. Further, such meth 
ods, acts, systems, system elements and components thereof 
may be implemented as part of the computer system 
described above or as an independent component. 

Although the portable computer 100 is shown by way of 
example as one type of computer system upon which various 
aspects and functions may be practiced, aspects of the inven 
tion are not limited to being implemented on the computer 
system as shown in FIGS. 1 and 2. Various aspects and func 
tions inaccord with the present invention may be practiced on 
one or more computers having a different architectures or 
components than those shown in FIG. 2. 

Computer system 100 may programmable using a high 
level computer programming language. Computer system 
100 may be also implemented using specially programmed, 
special purpose hardware. The processor 210 and operating 
system together define a computer platform for which appli 
cation programs in high-level programming languages are 
written. It should be understood that the invention is not 
limited to a particular computer system platform, processor, 
operating system, or network. Also, it should be apparent to 
those skilled in the art that the present invention is not limited 
to a specific programming language or computer System. 
Further, it should be appreciated that other appropriate pro 
gramming languages and other appropriate computer systems 
could also be used. 
One or more portions of the computer system may be 

distributed across one or more computer systems coupled to a 
communications network. For example, various aspects of 
the invention may be distributed among one or more com 
puter systems (e.g., servers) configured to provide a service to 
one or more client computers, or to performan overall task as 
part of a distributed System. For example, various aspects of 
the invention may be performed on a client-server or multi 
tier system that includes components distributed among one 
or more server systems that perform various functions 
according to various embodiments of the invention. In one 
embodiment, an Internet cloud is maintained on server sys 
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tems accessible from a plurality of devices. These compo 
nents may be executable, intermediate (e.g., IL) or interpreted 
(e.g., Java) code which communicate over a communication 
network (e.g., the Internet) using a communication protocol 
(e.g., TCP/IP). It should be appreciated that the invention is 
not limited to executing on any particular system or group of 
systems. Also, it should be appreciated that the invention is 
not limited to any particular distributed architecture, network, 
or communication protocol. 

According to one embodiment, streamlining user interac 
tions with the computer system/device includes representing 
computer based content in visual representations that render 
computer operations/behavior in a consistent manner. These 
visual representations may be rendered as cards, as discussed 
in more detail below. Different types of cards may be 
employed to render different types of available content. For 
example, web based content, may be rendered as a web card 
that is associated with a mapping to web content. Some web 
cards map directly to web pages and in response to selection 
of the web card the computer device executes the mapping 
and displays a web view of the content. Other cards may be 
used to provide interactive displays selectable by a user. In 
another example, system operations are displayed as system 
cards, which are associated with mappings to system opera 
tions, for example communications configurations, and may 
comprise a settings card, among other system options. 
Another type of card includes a channel card configured to 
stream web based content in a manner that allows for Sum 
marization of content, while still providing the ability to fully 
appreciate the Summarized content. 

Using channel cards according to aspects and embodi 
ments, summarized content may be presented in a manner 
that permits appreciation and interaction with the Summa 
rized content itself. In another example, channel card are 
configured to present a streamlined view that cannot only be 
appreciated and interacted, but may be transitioned from one 
mode of viewing to another without loss of the ability to 
appreciate and interact with the streamlined view. A more 
detailed discussion of embodiments and examples of a card 
based system for rendering computer based content in visual 
representations is discussed in U.S. patent application Ser. 
No. 12/416.479, filed on Apr. 1, 2009 and entitled “SYSTEM 
AND METHOD FOR STREAMLINING USER INTERAC 
TION WITH ELECTRONIC CONTENT,” which is incorpo 
rated herein by reference in its entirety. 
As discussed above, according to one embodiment, meth 

ods and apparatus are provided for managing digital media 
libraries via, for example, the computer 100. In one example, 
the computer 100 includes a streamlined graphical user inter 
face that provides access to the digital media libraries. 
According to another embodiment, there is a community 
aspect to the digital media libraries, which includes sharing of 
digital content, configurations and customizations between 
users. In particular, sharing may involve the transmission of 
user interface elements to other users. In one example, a user 
may share a card and any of its configurations with another 
user. Access to the shared user interface elements, in some 
embodiments, facilitates communal computerusage. Content 
and context retention by user interface elements that can be 
shared provides unique advantages to the users of the stream 
lined devices, as discussed further below. 

Referring to FIG. 3, there is illustrated a block diagram of 
one example of an architecture of the portable computer 100 
including a streamlined user interface. The user interface 
includes a “home screen 310 that displays a plurality of 
modes of content 320. In the illustrated example, the home 
screen 310 contains five modes of content 320; however, it is 
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to be appreciated that the home screen may include more or 
fewer than five modes of content and that the modes of con 
tent may differ from the examples discussed below. Accord 
ing to one example, the modes of content 320 accessible via 
the home screen 310 may include “media' 321, "connect” 
322, “web' 323, “applications' 324, and “channels' 325. 
Using the streamlined user interface, also referred to as a 
'map' interface, information, programs, features and appli 
cations may be grouped into the various modes of content 
320. By selecting any mode of content 320, the user may 
access the content organized within that mode. For example, 
the media mode 321 may provide access to a media player to 
play, view, search and organize digital media Such as music, 
video, photos, etc. The web mode 323 may provide access to 
internet browsing and searching. The channels mode 325 may 
provide access to different functionality of the portable com 
puter, with the different functions or features defined as dif 
ferent channels. For example, a channel may include a “photo 
frame channel in which the portable computer may be con 
figured to display a pre-selected image or set of images, etc. 
from a digital media library. Some or all of the modes of 
content 320 may access, retrieve and/or store information on 
an Internet cloud 330. 

From the home screen 310, the user may navigate among 
the different modes of content 320 and, once a particular 
mode of contentis selected, may navigate within that mode of 
content. In one example, the home view 310 is comprised of 
various cards, each card providing access to computer based 
content. According to one aspect, cards can be thought of as 
the building blocks of the user interface, providing access to 
a plurality of views and/or content. Indeed, cards as elements 
of the graphical user interface, are configured to be shared 
across users and across other streamlined devices. The ability 
to employ the features and functions of card based elements 
may be limited to streamlined devices, although cards and 
settings may be shared with traditional devices. 

Navigation from the home view in and among different 
modes of content may be accomplished using traditional 
interfaces, such as the keyboard 106, touchpad 108, a mouse, 
trackball, joystick, or other interface device. In one embodi 
ment, the portable computer 100 may include additional navi 
gation devices, including a scroll wheel and one or more 
navigation buttons, as shown, for example, in FIG. 4. In the 
example illustrated in FIG. 4, the portable computer 100 
includes a scroll wheel 120 and two navigation buttons 122, 
124. In one example, the scroll wheel 120 is positioned, as 
shown in FIG.4, such that it is rotatable about the longitudinal 
axis 101 (see FIG. 1) running along the interface between the 
display component 102 and the base 104. According to one 
embodiment, the portable computer 100 is configurable into 
various different configuration modes including the laptop 
mode shown in FIGS. 1 and 4, and an “easel' mode in which 
the base 104 and the display component 102 stand upright 
forming an inverted “V” as discussed further below. Accord 
ingly, positioning the scroll wheel 120 on the longitudinal 
axis 101 may have certain advantages, including providing 
accessibility to the scroll wheel in the different configuration 
modes of the portable computer; however, it is to be appreci 
ated that the scroll wheel may be placed in any convenient or 
suitable location on the portable computer, not limited to the 
position shown in FIG. 4. Similarly, positioning the naviga 
tion button 122 on the side of the base 104, as shown in FIG. 
4, may also provide accessibility in the different configura 
tion modes of the portable computer 100; however it is to be 
appreciated that the navigation button 122 may be placed in a 
variety of locations, not limited to the location illustrated in 
FIG. 4. 
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As discussed above, in one example, the media mode of 

content 321 may provide access to a media player to play, 
view, search and organize digital media Such as music, video, 
photos, etc. Thus, a user may use the media mode of content 
321 to create and manage digital media libraries including, 
for example, collections of digital photographs. According to 
one embodiment, methods, tools and interfaces are provided 
to allow users to store, organize, edit, view and share digital 
photograph collections, as well as video and/or audio collec 
tions. These collections may be presented to the user as if 
stored on local storage associated with the portable computer 
100; however, as discussed above, in at least some examples, 
the digital media content is stored remotely in the cloud 330 
(see FIG. 3). Therefore, the portable computer software may 
include the ability to interact with third party online service 
providers, as discussed further below. In addition, as dis 
cussed above, in one example, the portable computer 100 
includes a camera 112 and therefore, methods, tools and 
interfaces may be provided to allow the user to take and 
manage photographs and/or video using the camera 112. The 
portable computer 100 may also be configured to allow an 
external digital camera (not shown) to be connected to the 
computer, Such that the user may extract photographs and/or 
Videos from the external camera, to store, manage and share 
using the computer, as discussed further below. 

According to one embodiment, the computer 100 is inte 
grated with remote content storage and/or access in the cloud 
330. The integration may be provided through third party 
service providers, in one example photo service FLICKR is 
integrated with various aspects of the device and/or the 
device's user interface to provide seamless access to photo 
content stored by the third party provider. Thus, digital con 
tent items, such as photographs, videos, etc. may be displayed 
on the portable computer, as discussed below, but stored 
remotely. The integration with remote storage services per 
mits reduced storage capacity on the user device, for example, 
a portable computer. Reducing and/or eliminating the need 
for non Volatile memory in the computer system is advanta 
geous in that the device itself may be reduced in complexity 
and any associated cost. In some embodiments, a streamlined 
device do not incorporate a hard disk drive for storage, pro 
viding for any local storage requirement through RAM and 
Flash memory. 

Content may be added to the user's digital medial library in 
a variety of different ways. For example, digital content items 
added to the user's account with any online hosting service 
(e.g., FLICKR, SHUTTERFLY, etc.) the user has registered 
with the portable computer 100 may be automatically added 
to the user's digital media library. If a person shares an album 
with the user via a registered online hosting service, and 
Subsequently updates the shared album to include new items, 
the new items may be automatically added to the user's digital 
media library. The user may add content items, such as pho 
tographs, directly from web pages using, for example, a “save 
image' control in the web browser toolbar. In one example, 
clicking and holding on a particular image on a web page 
opens a contextual menu providing options for the user to 
save one or more photographs. For example, clicking a "save 
multiple photos' option in the contextual menu may prompt 
the user to click on all displayed images that he/she wishes to 
save and then clicka "done' or “save' control to complete the 
action. The user may similarly save photographs from an 
email. As discussed above, in one embodiment, the portable 
computer 100 does not include local mass storage; instead the 
digital media content items are stored by an online hosting 
service. Accordingly, saving of photos from a web page or 
email may be implemented through the hosting service. The 
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user may also add content items by uploading them from a 
camera, card reader or USB device, as discussed further 
below. In one example, the portable computer 100 may be 
pre-loaded with a selection of stock images that automatically 
appear in the user's digital media library. The user may delete 
these stock images; however, if the user's digital media 
library eve becomes empty, the stock images may be auto 
matically re-added to the library. 

According to one embodiment, collections of digital con 
tent items, including photographs and videos, may be dis 
played in any of a plurality of different views. These views 
may include a time view, an album view, a page view, an 
intermediate view, and a lens view, each of which is discussed 
further below. Each view may offer the user particular inter 
action options, features and benefits, as also discussed below. 
In the time view, an entire digital media library may be dis 
played with content items arranged chronologically, regard 
less of whether or not the content items (e.g., individual 
photographs or videos) have been assigned to an album. In the 
album view, individual albums of content items may be dis 
played. In the album view, those content items not assigned to 
an album are not displayed. The time view and the album view 
may be considered the “workhorses” of the digital media 
aspect of the portable computer 100, allowing a user to 
quickly and easily locate individual content items and per 
form actions, such as, share content with others, create chan 
nels, and order photograph prints from online service provid 
ers. The lens view may offer the user a variety of interactions 
with the digital media content, as discussed further below. In 
one example, for some photograph editing functions, such as 
correcting red-eye, cropping, adjusting contrast, etc., inter 
faces to online service providers may be supplied, allowing 
the user to leverage existing features of their online photo 
graph service provider. 

Referring to FIG. 5, there is illustrated a block diagram of 
one example of an album view. In the album view, the screen 
may include a body portion 550 in which the albums are 
displayed, and a header 555. In the illustrated example, in the 
album view, the albums 510 are displayed as a list in the body 
portion 550, with a scroll bar 515 that allows the user to scroll 
down to see additional albums that do not fit within the page 
view. In one example, the list of albums may be sorted by 
earliest photograph creation date, with the newest on top; 
however, it will be readily appreciated that numerous other 
organizations of the albums 510 are possible. A header cap 
tion 525 identifies the number of albums present and the total 
number of photographs contained within the albums. In one 
example, each album 510 includes a title 530 that identifies 
the album. The title 530 may be created by the user and may 
be descriptive of the photographs contained within the album. 
Each album 510 may also include a caption 535 that identifies 
information about the album. For example, the caption 535 
may indicate the number of photographs in the album as well 
as the date range of the photographs in the album. For each 
album 510 there may be displayed a preview photograph 540, 
which may be, for example, a photograph selected by the user 
(e.g., a representative or favorite photograph), or a default 
selected photograph, for example, the first photograph in the 
album. Each photograph in the album may be displayed as a 
thumbnail 545. In the header 555, there may be displayed 
user-selectable “buttons' 560, 565 which allow the user to 
select between the time view and the album view, for 
example, by clicking (e.g., using a mouse, the touchpad, the 
scroll wheel, or a navigation button) on the button corre 
sponding to the desired view. 

According to one embodiment, the album view allows the 
user to access and view albums of their own photographs, as 
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well as albums shared with them by other users, for example, 
through an online photo-sharing service. As discussed above, 
in one embodiment, only photographs (or other digital con 
tent items) that have been assigned an album by the user will 
be displayed in the album view. The computer 100 may 
include software that automatically creates a default album 
for any unsorted/unassigned photographs found on the com 
puter. In one example, this default album is not displayed in 
the album view. Many online photo hosting services require 
the use of albums and do not allow a photo to be saved to the 
service without being assigned to an album. However, this 
requirement may not be meaningful to users who are used to 
having many photographs in the real world which are not 
associated with an album. Accordingly, the digital media 
system may automatically create the default album to store 
otherwise unsorted content items. 

Still referring to FIG. 5, the thumbnails 545 provide the 
user with a preview of the individual photographs contained 
in the album. In one embodiment, when the user "hovers' 
over a particular thumbnail 545, the preview photograph 540 
changes to display that thumbnail. The thumbnail may also 
increase slightly. Hover indicates the movement of a pointer, 
typically represented by a white arrow on the computer sys 
tem display, over aparticular item on the display Screen, Such 
as a thumbnail 545. 

In one example, when the user hovers over a thumbnail, 
album controls may appear, as shown in FIG. 6. Referring to 
FIG. 6, the album controls 610 may include options to share 
an album (e.g., control 612), and to edit the album using a 
third party service provider (e.g., control 614). In one 
example, albums that are shared from within the album view 
may be shared as channel cards, but may also appear in the 
recipient's album view. As discussed above, in one example 
in which the photographs are stored on the cloud 330 (see 
FIG. 3), using a third party service provider website (for 
example, FLICKR; SHUTTERFLY: SNAPFISH, etc.), the 
control 614 for editing the album may automatically display 
the name of the service provider. If selected (e.g., clicked on) 
by the user, the edit control 614 may automatically open a 
web card to the album on the service where it is stored. In one 
example, the edit control 614 may only appear for albums of 
the users own photographs, and not for albums that have been 
shared with the user by another user, for which the user may 
not have editing privileges. The album controls 610 may also 
include a control 616 for “dissolving the album and a control 
618 for deleting the album. Selecting the dissolve control 616 
may remove the album, but retain the album contents in the 
user's digital media library. If the user selects the delete 
album control 618, the album and its contents may be deleted 
from the user's digital media library, after a warning/confir 
mation message is displayed to the user. In one example, if the 
user selects the share control 612 to share an album with 
another person, any changes the user has made to the album 
(e.g., removing a content item) are retained when the other 
person views the shared album. 

According to one embodiment, when the user clicks on (or 
otherwise selects) an individual photograph thumbnail 545, 
or on the preview photograph 540 in a particular album 510, 
a single album view may be displayed. In one example of the 
single album view, the album thumbnails 545 in the selected 
album 510 grow larger and arrange themselves in a horizontal 
list, as shown in FIG. 7A. In the single album view illustrated 
in FIG. 7A, the user sees larger previews 710 of the photo 
graphs in the selected album. The user may navigate back and 
forth among the items in the album by hovering over the left 
or right edges of the list, optionally over a scroll indicator 720, 
to scroll the list of preview images 710. In one example, the 
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speed of the scrolling depends on where the cursor is in the 
active area. For example, the closer the cursor is to the edge of 
the screen, the faster the scroll. In one embodiment, when the 
user is scrolling left or right through the album, the horizontal 
list of previews 710 tilts to show perspective, as shown in FIG. 
7B. In one example, in the tilted view, the images scroll 
automatically and the speed of the scrolling action corre 
sponds to the maximum scrolling speed that would be avail 
able manually, e.g., if the cursor were as close to the edge of 
the screen as possible. In another example, the degree of tilt 
corresponds to the scrolling speed. For example, the more 
tilted the view, the faster the scroll. A scroll indicator 720 may 
indicate the direction of the scroll. Clicking on an individual 
item in the single album view may Zoom that item into an 
intermediate view, as discussed further below. In the interme 
diate view, the user may still see hints of the other images in 
the album in the background, thus providing context for the 
Zoomed-in item. Clicking on the item in the intermediate 
view may enlarge the item into a full screen view, as discussed 
further below. 

In one embodiment, clicking on the background 730 
returns the user to the album view shown in FIG. 5. In one 
example, the background 730 includes the users other 
albums. Thus, clicking on the background may mean clicking 
on another album; however, even in this case, clicking on the 
other album in the background 730 may still return the user to 
the album view, rather than to a single album view of the 
clicked-on album in the background. This may simply navi 
gation for the user, particularly where the majority of the 
background belongs to other albums, such that if clicking on 
one of the background albums jumped to that album, the user 
would find it difficult to return to the overall album view of 
FIG.S. 
As discussed above, an alternative to the album view is the 

time view. According to one embodiment, in the time view, 
the entire contents of the user's digital media library is dis 
played, even if items are not organized into albums. The 
digital content items in the digital media library may be 
arranged chronologically (e.g., in the order they were taken 
for photos and videos) in columns from top to bottom, left to 
right, or in rows from left to right, top to bottom. It is to be 
appreciated that other arrangements of the digital content 
items may also be implemented. An example of the time view 
is illustrated in FIG. 8. Similar to the album view, the time 
view may comprise a body portion 810 and a header 820. As 
shown in FIG. 8, in the body portion 810 of the time view, 
preview images 830 of each item in the digital media library 
is displayed. As discussed above, the preview images are 
arranged in columns and rows. A timeline 840 may supply a 
navigation control that allows the user quick access to the 
content in the digital media library and a visual indication of 
the number of items in the library. 

In one embodiment, the digital content items in the user's 
digital media library are stored, using a service offered by a 
third party service provider (e.g., FLICKR, SHUTTERFLY. 
SNAPFISH, etc.) in the cloud 330 (see FIG. 3). Thus, the 
preview images displayed in the time view may be visual 
representations of remotely stored content. 

Referring to FIG. 9, there is illustrated an example of the 
timeline 840 that may be displayed in the time view. In the 
illustrated example, the timeline includes three rows of tick 
marks 910 that correspond to the three rows of preview 
images 830 displayed in the body portion 810 of the time view 
illustrated in FIG.8. It is to be appreciated, however, that the 
preview images 830 may be displayed in any number of rows, 
not limited to three rows, and therefore, the timeline 840 may 
include any corresponding number of rows of tick marks 910, 
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not limited to three rows. Scroll controls 920 may be provided 
to allow the user to scroll through the timeline using a cursor. 
In one example, superimposed over the timeline 840 are 
markers 930 for individual months and years, as shown in 
FIG.9. In addition, the timeline may include a “handle' 940 
which indicates the section of timeline that corresponds to the 
preview images 830 displayed in the body portion 810. In one 
example, clicking anywhere on the timeline 840 moves the 
handle 940 to that point in time and changes the display of 
preview images 830 accordingly. According to one embodi 
ment, the timeline 840 is not linear. Instead, the length 
between tick marks 910 on the timeline corresponds to the 
number of digital content items in the digital media library for 
that period of time. Thus, the spacing between markers 930 
for different months or years may provide a visual indication 
of the number of content items in that month or year. For 
example, if the media library contains 300 content items (e.g. 
photographs and/or videos) for March 2007 and 100 content 
items for April 2007, the space allocated to March 2007 on the 
timeline 840 may be three times greater than the space allo 
cated to April 2007. 
The timeline 840 may also provide a visual indication of 

new content recently added to the digital media library. For 
example, when another person shares an album with the user, 
or when the user uploads new photographs and/or videos 
from a camera, a new content indicator 950 may be displayed 
in the timeline 840. In one example, the new content indicator 
950 includes highlighting or changing the color of the tick 
marks 910 corresponding to the newly added content items. 
The new content indicator 950 may persist for a predeter 
mined time period, or until the user acknowledges the new 
content. For example, when an album is shared with the user, 
the new content indicator 950 may persist until the user 
acknowledges the shared card notification, as discussed fur 
ther below. In another example, when the user uploads new 
content to the library, the new content indicator 950 may 
persist until the user closes/cancels an “upload complete' 
notification, as also discussed further below. 
There may be multiple ways in which a user can navigate in 

the time view. For example, if the user hovers over the left or 
right edge of the timeline 840, the timeline may scroll to 
reveal more of the timeline. In one example, if this scrolling 
causes the handle 940 to bump against the edge of the visible 
timeline, the handle remains on the edge and the content in the 
body 810 displayed changes accordingly. In this manner, the 
handle 940 is always visible. As discussed above, clicking on 
the timeline 840 may bring the user directly to the corre 
sponding time frame. In one example, if the user clicks on the 
timeline 840, thereby jumping to a new point in time, a brief 
animation, such as the “wall of preview images 830 in the 
body 810 tilting and scrolling, may be displayed. The user 
may also click on and drag the handle 940 to scroll through 
the preview images 830. In one example, clicking and drag 
ging the handle 940 will similarly cause the wall of preview 
images 830 to tilt and scroll. As discussed above with refer 
ence to the album view, the degree of tilt may correspond to 
the speed of the scroll, and the direction of the tilt may 
correspond to the direction of the scroll. 
As discussed above with reference to the single album 

view, clicking on a particular preview image 710 or 830 may 
cause the display to navigate to the intermediate view. In one 
example, in the intermediate view, the selected image is 
enlarged and comes to the foreground of the screen, while the 
remaining preview images 710, 830, recede into the back 
ground. Referring to FIG. 10, in one example, the unselected 
preview images slide left and right so that a few may be seen 
at the edges of the screen, providing context for the selected 
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image, as discussed above. The enlarging of the selected 
image and receding of the remaining images may be ani 
mated, providing the user with a visual experience as the view 
changes to the intermediate view. To return to the previous 
view, i.e., either time view or single album view, the user may 
click anywhere on the background 1010, even on one of the 
receded images 1015. 

Referring to FIG. 10, in one example, the intermediate 
view includes a caption area that displays a caption 1020 for 
the item 1025. The caption 1020 may be editable if the item 
1025 belongs to the user. If the user has not yet entered a 
caption for the item, a message. Such as "click here to enter a 
caption for this photo/video, may be displayed in the caption 
area. If the item belongs to another person, i.e., is in an album 
that has been shared with the user, the caption 1020 may be set 
by the other person and therefore may not be editable by the 
user. The date the item was taken may also be displayed in a 
date area 1030. The intermediate view may include naviga 
tion controls 1035 which allow the user to step through items 
in the digital media library or album, for example, depending 
on whether the user entered the intermediate view from the 
time view or single album view, while remaining in the inter 
mediate view. The intermediate view may also include a 
toolbar 1040 that provides access to a number of actions that 
may be performed on the item 1025. In one example, the 
contents of the toolbar 1040 depends on whether the item 
belongs to the user or is an item that has been shared with the 
user, and on the type of item (e.g., whether the item is a 
photograph or video). 

In one embodiment, clicking on the item 1025 in the inter 
mediate view further Zooms into the image, presenting it a 
full-screen view. If the item 1025 is a video, the video may 
start playing automatically. Moving the cursor may cause a 
control bar to be displayed, as discussed above, to allow the 
user to stop and start the video, and to navigate forwards and 
backwards within the video. The control bar may disappear if 
the cursor remains still for a predetermined period of time, for 
example, a few seconds. In one example, in the full screen 
view, only the image (photo or video) is shown; that is, the 
view does not include a header or other information which 
may distract the user from the image itself. If the item 1025 is 
a photograph, by default, the full screen view may include no 
controls, and no indication whether comments are available. 
In one example, if the user moves the pointer (e.g., using a 
mouse) to the edge of the screen, the left/right navigation 
control indicators appear as in other views. The user may also 
use the arrow keys or other keyboard keys or other input 
devices to cycle through images in the full screen view. In one 
example, clicking anywhere on the photo or video (or using 
another input mechanism, for example, pressing the Escape 
key) will return to the intermediate view. 

Historically and to present, the interface on digital cameras 
can be difficult to set or change and thus it is not uncommon 
for the date stamp of photographs and/or videos taken with 
the camera to appear incorrectly in the user's digital media 
library. Correct dates, however, may be critical to the success 
of time view and potentially also to many features of the 
digital media functionality of the portable computer 100. 
Therefore, in one example, the date setting may be adjustable 
for items in the digital media library. In one example, if the 
user hovers over the date area 1030 for an item in the inter 
mediate view, an indication may be provided that the date is 
editable. For example, the color of the date may change, 
and/or the date area may be highlighted. Clicking the date 
may cause controls for editing the date to become available. 
For example, as shown in FIG. 11, the date area may display 
scrollable fields for the month (1045), day (1050), and year 
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(1055), along with a save button 1060. The user may change 
the date by clicking the scroll arrows for each field, selecting 
a desired date for the item 1025. According to one embodi 
ment, once the user makes the correction, the user may be 
prompted to adjust the dates for all items that were taken with 
the same camera and uploaded in the same session. Thus, the 
digital media program may identify all the items that are 
likely to have dates offset by the same amount as the item just 
corrected, and offer to correct the date(s) of these item(s) by 
the same offset. For example, a prompt to the user may read: 
“I have identified it other items taken with the same camera 
and saved at the same time as this photo/video. Would you 
like me to correct the date for these items as well?' with the 
options “Yes, please' and “No, thanks' for the user to select. 
In one example, “No, thanks’ is the default. 

According to one embodiment, for content items that 
belong to the user, date corrections may propagate throughout 
their computer network. Thus, if the user corrects the date on 
a content item that has previously been shared with another 
user, the corrected date is reflected on the other user's display. 
This propagation of corrections may be effected because the 
digital content items, and associated data, such as date, cap 
tion, etc., may be stored in the cloud 330, as discussed above. 
Thus, when the other user views the shared content item, they 
are viewing a visual representation of digital content stored in 
the cloud, rather than a locally stored digital content item. 
Some online digital photograph and/or video services do not 
permit editing of dates associated with the stored photographs 
and/or videos. In addition, a user may wish to edit the date 
associated with a shared item, for which they may not have 
editing privileges. Thus, although in some instances it may be 
preferable to save date corrections to the hosting photo/video 
service, if this is not possible, date corrections may be locally 
stored on the portable computer 100 for display purposes. In 
this instance, date corrections will be reflected when the user 
views the digital content item on the portable computer 100, 
but will not propagate to other users viewing shared items. 

Referring again to FIG. 10, as discussed above, the inter 
mediate view includes a toolbar 1040 that includes one or 
more controls 1065 that may be used to manipulate the item 
1025. In one embodiment, the toolbar 1040 contains controls 
1065 including "add to pick list,” “add/view comments, and 
“rotate.” The “add to pick list' and “add/view comments' 
controls are discussed below. The rotate control rotates the 
item 102590 degrees, either clockwise oranti-clockwise. The 
direction of rotation may be pre-set (i.e., rotation is always in 
the same direction) or may be user-selectable. If possible, the 
rotation may be stored with the item 1025 on the appropriate 
online photo/video hosting service, burifnot, the change may 
be stored locally and affects only the user's view of the item 
1025. If the item 1025 belongs to the user, the toolbar may 
further include an edit control 1070 and a delete control 1075. 

In general, photo editing can be grouped into two broad 
categories, namely editing that alters the content of an image 
(such as cropping, red-eye, removal, and adjusting the con 
trast), and editing that alters the display of an image (such as 
rotation, creation date, and view/hide). In one embodiment, 
the digital media aspect of the portable computer 100 may 
encourage users to leverage existing services (offered by their 
online photo hosting service) for the former, via the edit 
control 1070, while supplying tools for the latter. In one 
example, the edit control 1070 may display a message similar 
to "edit on service.” where the service is the name of the 
third party hosting service that stores the user's digital media 
library in the cloud 330 (for example, FLICKR). Clicking on 
the edit control 1070 may open a web card for the item 1025 
on the user's hosting service, allowing the user to edit the 
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item, as discussed further below. In some instances, the user 
will not have the appropriate access to perform either type of 
editing operations on many of the images in their media 
library, either because the particular image does not belong to 
the user, or because the photo hosting service does not support 
the particular editing action. According to one embodiment, 
the digital media aspect of the portable computer 100 allows 
the user to perform display edits on any digital contentitem in 
their digital media library regardless of whether or not that 
edit function is available via the library hosting service. For 
example, the user may rotate any photo or video in their 
digital media library, using the rotate control discussed above, 
even if this rotation is only available on the user's display on 
the portable computer 100 and does not affect the underlying 
data stored in the cloud 330. 

Similarly, the function of the delete control 1075 may vary 
depending on various factors. If the item 1025 belongs to the 
user, the delete control 1075 may allow the user to delete the 
item from their digital media library. If the item 1025 does not 
belong to the user, the delete control 1075 may be replaced in 
the toolbar 1040 by a “remove' control (not shown). The 
remove control allows the user to remove items from their 
digital media library that do not belong to them, without 
affecting the underlying data in the cloud. Thus, the underly 
ing data may remain in the cloud, since the user does not have 
permission to actually delete the item), but the item is 
removed from the user's view on the portable computer 100. 
Thus, the user may make local changes to their own data that 
are not reflected on the underlying media library hosting 
service, thus allowing the user to customize and enhance their 
own viewing experience. 

Still referring to FIG. 10, if the item 1025 is a video, the 
toolbar 1040 may include additional video controls (not 
shown), such as “play' and “stop’ or “pause.” The video 
controls may also include a video play timeline with a click 
and-drag “scrubber' that identifies the current playpoint in 
the video in relation to the length of the view, and also allows 
the user to navigate through the video. 
As discussed above, in one embodiment, one of the con 

trols 1065 in the toolbar 1040 is a “comments' control, that 
allows the user to add and/or view comments associated with 
the item 1025. If comments are available for the item 1025, a 
comments icon 1080 may be displayed on the item, for 
example, in an upper corner of the item. In one example, in the 
intermediate view, the comments icon 1080 shows the num 
ber of comments available for the item 1025. If the user clicks 
the comments control in the toolbar 1040 of the intermediate 
view, the item 1025 turns over to reveal a "back side' showing 
existing comments and allowing the user to add/edit com 
ments. In one example, an animation of the item 1025 turning 
over is provided. 

Referring to FIG. 12 there is illustrated one example, of a 
“back view of the item 1025. The back view includes a 
preview image 1210 of the item 1025, along with an “add 
comments’ area 1220 where the user can type a new com 
ment. Comments may also be added by persons with whom 
the user (or someone else) has shared the item 1025. Thus, 
existing comments 1230 may be displayed, along with a user 
image 1240 selected by the person leaving the comment and 
an identifier 1250 which provides identifying information for 
the comment, such as the name of the person who left the 
comment and the date and time the comment was left. In one 
example, the back view includes a “from selector 1260 
which allows the user to select to display only comments from 
a particular person or group of persons. If the user types a 
comment into the add comments area 1220, an "add com 
ment” button 1270 may be displayed. Clicking the add com 
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ment button 1270 may add the user's comment to the item 
1025. Clicking a “done” button 1280 may turn the item 1025 
back over, returning the user to the intermediate view. In one 
example, the navigation controls 1035 remain available in the 
back side view, allowing the user to navigate backwards and 
forwards through the digital medial library, displaying the 
back side (comments) view for each item. In one example, 
clicking in the background 1010 turns the item 1025 back 
over and then exits the intermediate view, returning the user to 
either the single album view or time view. An animation of 
these steps occurring may be displayed during the transition 
from the comments view, through the intermediate view, to 
the single album or time view. 

In one example, a small comments icon 1080 is also dis 
played in the corner of those preview images 710 (in the 
single album view) or 810 (in the time view) for which com 
ments are available. Clicking on the comments icon 1080 may 
bring up the comments view for the associated content item. 
In one example, clicking on the comments icon 1080 in one of 
these views causes an animation to be displayed, the anima 
tion including Zooming into the intermediate view for the 
selected preview image 710, 810, and turning the item 1025 
over, as discussed above. 
As discussed above, in one embodiment, one of the con 

trols 1065 in the toolbar 1040 is an “add to pick list” control. 
The pick list is an organization tool that allows the user to 
gather togethera group of digital contentitems for a particular 
action. For example, in the pick list, the user may collect 
content items to be shared with another user, used to create a 
custom channel, as discussed further below, or for which the 
user wishes to buy prints or access some other service pro 
vided by the online library hosting service. According to one 
embodiment, the pick list appears when the user adds a con 
tent item to the pick list, and may remain visible until the user 
clears the list. For example, FIG. 13A illustrates an example 
of the single album view, with the pick list 1310 displayed 
across the top of the view. Similarly, FIG. 13B illustrates an 
example of the time view displaying the pick list 1310. It is to 
be appreciated that although the pick list 1310 is shown in 
FIGS. 13A and 13B located near the top of the screen, below 
the header 555,820, its location is not limited to the illustrated 
example, and the pick list may be displayed elsewhere on the 
screen, for example, along the bottom of the screen, or verti 
cally along one side of the screen. 

According to one embodiment, the pick list 1310 com 
prises one or more thumbnails 1320 corresponding to the 
content items added to the pick list, as shown in FIGS. 13A 
and 13B. The thumbnails 1320 may be arranged in the order 
in which the content items were added to the pick list 1310. In 
one example, the thumbnails 1320 cannot be re-ordered by 
the user. Navigation controls 1330 allow the user to scroll 
through the pick list 1310. Referring to FIG. 13C, there is 
illustrated one example of a pick list 1310 including pick list 
controls 1340. The pick list controls 1340 may allow the user 
to performany of a number of actions on the pick list 1310 and 
on the content items contained in the pick list. For example, 
the pick list controls 1340 may include options to order prints, 
to share the items in the pick list, to add a channel, and/or to 
clear and close the pick list. In one example, selecting the 
clear and close control empties the pick list1310 and removes 
it from display; however, the contentitems in the pick list may 
not be deleted from the digital content library. Hovering over 
a particular thumbnail 1320a (as indicated by pointer 126) 
may increase the size of that thumbnail, as shown in FIG. 
13C, and reveal a delete icon 1350. In one example, hovering 
on the delete item causes a tip to be displayed, indicating that 
clicking the delete icon 1350 will cause the content item to be 
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deleted from the pick list. In one example, clicking on the 
delete icon 1350 deletes the content item from the pick list 
1310, but not from the user's digital media library. Clicking 
elsewhere (i.e., not on the delete icon 1350) on the thumbnail 
1320a may cause the associated content item to open in the 
intermediate view. If the user was in the time view (FIG.13B), 
the timeline 840 may scroll in the background and the handle 
940 moves as appropriate. If the user was in the album view 
and clicks a thumbnail 1320 in the pick list 1310, the back 
ground of the intermediate view may reflect the appropriate 
album. In one example, if the user is in the album view and 
clicks on a thumbnail 1320 in the pick list 1310 that happens 
to be unsorted (i.e., not associated with an album), the display 
may switch to the time view. 

According to one embodiment, hovering on a preview 
image 710 (in the single album view) or 830 (in the time view) 
will cause the preview image to enlarge slightly and two 
controls to appear, as shown in FIG. 14. The pointer 126 
indicates the user hovering on the preview image 1410. These 
controls may include a delete icon 1420 and an “add to pick 
list” button 1430. If comments are available for the content 
item associated with the preview image 1410, the comments 
icon 1080 may also be displayed. Clicking on the “add to pick 
list” button 1430 adds the content item to the user's pick list 
1310. Clicking on the delete icon 1420 deletes the content 
item from the user's digital media library. In one example, 
clicking the delete icon 1420 also causes an informational 
“bubble' (not shown) to appear, letting the user know that the 
content item has been deleted. The bubble may remain on the 
screen for certain time period, for example, a few seconds, 
and may include an undelete button, giving the user the ability 
to undo the deletion of the content item. Conventional “undo' 
actions, such as pressing "CTRL-Z' may also undo the dele 
tion of the content item. The effect of deleting a content item 
on the underlying data in the cloud 330 may depend on 
whether the content item belongs to the user, or is an item that 
has been shared with the user by someone else. For example, 
if the content item belongs to the user, then deleting it may 
also delete the content item from the library stored by the 
online hosting service. If the content item belongs to someone 
else, deleting it in the user's digital medial library may 
remove the 'map' or reference to that item, such that it is no 
longer displayed in the user's media library, but does not 
affect the underlying data in the cloud 330. 

Referring again to FIG. 13C, in one example, clicking a 
“share” button in the pick list controls 1340 Clicking the 
Share button in the Pick List launches a share bubble 1360, as 
shown in FIG. 15. The share bubble 1360 may include several 
fields, including a name field 1362 where the user may name 
the content item or group of content items to be shared, and 
fields where the user may either select from the pre-set list of 
persons (field 1364) those persons with whom the user wishes 
to share the items, or enter one oremail addresses (field 1366) 
of persons with whom the items are to be shared. The share 
bubble 1360 may also include a comments field 1368 where 
the user may enter comments about the items being shared or 
a message to the person(s) with whom the content items are 
being shared. Clicking the “share” button 1370 may complete 
the share action. A "cancel button 1372 may be provided to 
cancel the share action; alternatively, simply clicking any 
where not on the share bubble 1360 may also cancel the share 
action. A similar share bubble may also appear when the user 
selects the share album control 612 in the album view dis 
cussed above. 
The pick list controls 1340 may also include an “order 

prints' button to allow the user to order prints of the photo 
graphs in the pick list 1310. According to one embodiment, 
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clicking “order prints' button from the pick list 1310 shows 
the user options for ordering (such as print size, number of 
prints, etc.), and then places the order using information 
previously collected from the user, for example, during initial 
configuration of the portable computer 100. According to 
another embodiment, clicking the “order prints' button from 
the pick list 1310 opens an ordering panel that provides the 
user with options for ordering prints from any of a variety of 
online photo service providers. The ordering panel may 
include weblinks that allow the user to navigate to the web 
sites of the online photo service providers. The ordering panel 
may also include a “stop’ or "cancel' button. In another 
embodiment, clicking the “order prints' button from the pick 
list 1310 automatically opens a webpage of the online photo 
hosting service where the user's digital media library is 
stored. Thus, the user may order the desired prints (or other 
merchandise) directly from the hosting service on which they 
are stored. In one example, using the “order prints' control 
does not clear the content items from the pick list1310 in case 
the user wishes to perform another action with the items. 

According to one embodiment, the pick list controls 1340 
may also include a control to create or add a channel. In one 
example, selecting the create a channel control in the pick list 
1310 creates a channel card containing the content items in 
the pick list. As discussed above, according to one aspect, 
streamlining the presentation and integration of features and 
services available through the portable computer 100 
includes developing consistent visual representations of 
available content (whether on the computer 100 or from third 
party service providers). In one embodiment, system features 
and web features are consistently presented as cards for the 
user to interact with to achieve their computer objectives. In 
Some embodiments, cards comprise part of an interface layer 
between a computer user and a user's computer based objec 
tive and/or computer operation. Thus, the cards form a part of 
the structure of the graphical user interface between a com 
puter system and the user to provide access to a plurality of 
views and/or content. In various embodiments, cards are con 
figured to be context and/or content sensitive. Thus, the cards 
are selectable visual representations that are mapped either to 
computer functions or available computer content. Some 
examples of cards include web cards that map to views of web 
content including web pages, channel cards that map to cus 
tomized views of content including web based content and 
picture and video content, and system cards that map to 
system functionality. In one example, system cards are con 
figured to represent activities that have been specifically 
designed such as for example, a digital media card. 

Referring to FIG. 16, in one embodiment, the home view 
310 (see FIG. 3) is configured to manage and organize cards. 
Thus, in one example, the home view 310 includes a body 
1610 in which a plurality of cards 1620 are arranged. The 
home view 310 may also include a header 1630 which dis 
plays a home indicator 1640, letting the user know that they 
are in the home view, 1640, and optionally includes a web 
search bar 1650, providing the user direct access to searching 
on the Internet. The home view 310 provides a simple and 
convenient mode of navigating through the features and con 
tent accessible through the device by organizing and manag 
ing cards. In some embodiments, channel cards provide addi 
tional features that enable a user to better interact with web 
based content, and in another example, channel cards provide 
interactive views by utilizing different content presentations 
provided by a web source. Thus, consistent user interfaces are 
used to access web based content, even content and applica 
tions provided by third parties. 
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According to one aspect, cards may have common features 
to promote user acceptance and improve adoption of different 
cards, while providing familiar a form. In one example, most 
cards are configured with a similar anatomy, and may com 
prise certain common elements described with reference to 
illustrated examples. According to one aspect, different cards 
types displayed in the home view are clearly defined by color 
scheme and appearance, while at the same time maintaining a 
similar format. For example the similar format includes 
header placement and sizing, display of tools, title and frame 
size. In one embodiment, a color Scheme configured to dif 
ferentiate card types provides for web cards with white head 
ers with the content displayed on the web card showing as a 
thumbnail of the current state of the page. Channel cards may 
be configured with black headers, and the content presented 
in the channel card may comprise a simplified representation 
of the associated media or web content. System cards may be 
shown either with blue headers or grey headers. 

According to one embodiment, the digital media aspect of 
the streamlined device is presented as and accessed through a 
system card 1620a. The digital media system card 1620 com 
prises a header 1660 running along the top of the card which 
identifies it as the digital media card, and a body 1670 which 
displays an image of one of the digital content items in the 
user's digital media library. In one example, the image dis 
played in the body 1670 is selected at random from the user's 
digital media library and may change periodically, for 
example, every few seconds or minutes. From the home view 
310, selecting (e.g., by clicking) the digital media card 1620 
navigates to either the time view or the album view of the 
user's digital media library. The default view may be set in the 
card options, as discussed further below. 
As discussed above, when the user selects the “create a 

channel control in the pick list 1310, a channel card is 
created containing the content items in the pick list. The 
channel creation process may be animated. In one example, 
when the user clicks the control button, the system Zooms out 
of the digital media library view to the home view 310, scrolls 
to the end of the displayed cards 1620 (if necessary), and 
shows the new channel card appearing, then scrolls back (if 
necessary) to where the digital media card 1620a is displayed 
in the home view, and Zooms back into digital media view 
from which the user clicked on the control in the pick list 
1310. The whole animation may take a brief time; short 
enough to not be too annoying to the user, but long enough not 
to cause the user any vertigo. 

According to one embodiment, the user may also create 
channel from online photo services (such as SMUGMUG or 
KODAKGALLERY). In one example, when the user creates 
a channel from one of these services, the option may be given 
to save the photographs to the user's digital media library. If 
the user decides to add the photographs to the digital media 
library, new photographs subsequently added to the feed from 
the online service may also be added to the digital media 
library. This automatic updating stops (i.e., no more photo 
graphs are added) if the user deletes the channel card or 
transforms it into a web card. Similarly, the user may trans 
form a web card of an online photo service (such as FLICKR 
or SHUTTERFLY) into a channel card using the card options 
discussed below. In one example, when the user creates a 
channel card from one of these photo services, the option is 
again given to add the contents of the channel card to the 
user's digital media library. This allows the user to get the 
benefit of an aggregated media library on the portable com 
puter, but without automatically cluttering it up with 
unwanted images. Content Subsequently added to the channel 
may also be added to user's digital media library. If the user 
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deletes the channel card or transforms it back into a web card, 
new content is no longer added to the digital media library, but 
the existing content may not be removed. 

Referring again to FIG. 16, the cards 1620 may include an 
“options’ icon 1680 in the header 1660. In one embodiment, 
when card configurations and/or card options are selected by 
a user (if available), e.g., by clicking the card options icon 
1680, a consistent animation is presented to the user. For 
example, selection of a cards options may cause an anima 
tion displaying the flipping of the card and the revelation of 
user selectable options. In one example, if the user clicks the 
card options icon 1680, there is presented a visualization of 
the card turning over, similar to the animation/visualization of 
the item 1025 turning over to display the comments view 
discussed above. On the “back side' of the card 1620 the user 
may see various options which may differ depending on the 
type of card. Referring to FIG. 17A, there is illustrated one 
example of the back side of a card 1620. In the illustrated 
example, the card 1620 includes a header 1710 that displays 
an identifying field 1715 and optionally a logo or image 1720, 
to identify the card to the user. In an example of a web card, 
the identifying field 1715 may include the name of the asso 
ciated website and optionally some description of the card. 
For example, a web card for an online news service may 
display the name of the news service along with a description 
such as “local news’ or “news headlines' that identifies the 
card for the user. The available options for the card 1620 are 
shown in the body 1725 of the card. 

In the illustrated example, the body 1725 of the back side of 
the web card 1620b shows an option 1730 for transforming 
the card into a channel card, and Vice-versa. In the example of 
a web card, if the user checks the option 1730, the web card is 
recast into a channel card. Unchecking the option 1730 trans 
forms the channel cardback into a web card. The option 1730 
may be displayed permanently checked for cards that are 
always available as channel cards (e.g., the digital media card 
1620a, as shown in FIG. 17B), and may be missing for cards 
that are not available as channels, for example, some system 
cards. In the example of the digital media card 1620a, the 
option 1730 may include an option to show the card as a 
channel using a particular lens. Thus, for the digital media 
card 1620a, the control 1730 may read “Show as channel 
using lens, as shown in FIG. 17B.’ A lens is a customized 
visualization for computer content, as discussed further 
below. 

Still referring to FIG. 17A, channel cards may include an 
option 1735 to show the card in a screensaver. Typically the 
screensaver option 1735 is not an available option for other 
card types; however, the digital media system card 1620a 
does permit its content to be displayed in the screensaver. In 
one example, the digital media card 1620a is added to the 
screensaver mode by default. In the channel view (discussed 
below) and Screensaver mode, the digital media system 
selects photographs randomly from the user's digital media 
library. This allows the portable computer 100 to function like 
a smart digital picture frame by default when the device is 
idle. According to one example, new channel cards are con 
figured to not display in screensaver mode by default and 
therefore, the option 1735 is not checked for new channel 
cards. 
The card options may also include share information/con 

trols 1740. The shared information 1740 may include a 
“shared to/from line which provides information on the user 
or device from which or with which the card was shared. 
Hovering over the “shared from line causes the device to 
display an informational bubble with a list of people to whom 
the card was shared. Other options may be employed for 
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displaying shared from information. Other options may 
include linking to a display list for share from information, 
and in some embodiments may include displaying the shared 
entities on the back of the card without selecting the “shared 
from line. In such embodiments a maximum number of 
shared entities may be displayed before requiring selection of 
a more control. The more control expands on the list of shared 
entities to provide for listings that do not fit within the space 
provided on the back of a card. A “shared to line may provide 
information about whether and to whom the card has been 
shared. According to one embodiment, system cards can not 
be shared, thus no shared to information is displayed. By 
default the “shared to line does not display until a card has 
been shared. In one example, hovering over the shared to line 
causes the device to display an informational bubble with the 
list of people to whom the card has been shared. Other options 
may be employed for displaying shared to information. Other 
options may include linking to a display list for share to 
information, and in some embodiments may include display 
ing the shared entities on the back of the card without select 
ing the “shared to line. In Such embodiments a maximum 
number of shared entities may be displayed before requiring 
selection of a more control (not shown). The more control 
expands on the list of shared entities to provide for listings 
that do not fit within the space provided on the back of a card. 
Optionally the more control may cause the device to display 
an information bubble containing the remaining shared enti 
ties and/or all the shared entities. The share information 1740 
may also display the number of times the card has been 
shared. As discussed above, the user may share content items 
from the pick list 1310 with other users. In one example, 
sharing items from the pick list operates similar to sharing a 
channel card that contains only photographs and videos. The 
recipient receives a channel card on their streamlined device 
(or an email with a link to the channel card on a website if the 
recipient does not have a streamlined device. 

Still referring to FIG. 17A, for some cards the card options 
may further include a delete control 1745 which removes the 
card 1620 from the home view 310. The delete control 1745 
is typically not available for system cards, which typically can 
not be deleted by the user. The card 1620 may also show a 
“last updated field 1750 that displays update information. 
For example, for a web card that streams news or other online 
content, the update field 1750 may display the last time the 
feed was updated, for example, "last updated 3 minutes ago' 
or “last updated at date/time.” A "done” button 1755 may be 
provided that allows the user to turn the card 1620 back over 
to the front side view when the user is finished viewing/ 
changing the card options. In one example, clicking the 
"done' button 1755 causes the system to display an animation 
of the card 1620 flipping over to show front side and Zooming 
back out to the home view 310. 
As discussed above, another view of the digital media 

library which may be offered to the user is the lens view. The 
lens view is a group of visualizations, or "lenses. that the user 
can choose from and which offer the user different ways in 
which to experience and interact with their digital media 
libraries. The content displayed and the interactions available 
may depend on the individual lens. In one example, all or at 
least some of the lenses allow the user to add a particular 
picture to the pick list 1310. The pick list may or may not be 
displayed in the lens view. In one example, lenses Support 
passive viewing, i.e., they do not require user interaction to be 
effective since they can be applied to the channel view and 
screensaver mode. 

According to one embodiment, by default, channel cards 
are displayed in the channel page view according to a pre 
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determined visualization. For channels that comprise photo 
graphs and videos, including the digital media card 1620a, 
and channels created from online photo services such as 
FLICKR or SHUTTERFLY, lenses are also available to 
modify the visualization of the channel. According to one 
embodiment, the channel page view is the Zoomed-in com 
puter implemented expression of a channel card. The channel 
page view may be invoked by clicking on the channel card. A 
channel page view may present a unique view into content 
made available through a website. The channel page view 
employs visualizations similar to corresponding visualiza 
tion on channel cards but the large format of the view allows 
for a better display of content, and provides for increased 
interaction with users. The channel page view also comprises 
a mapping from the display content to the Source from which 
the content is derived. The channel page view comprises a 
number of elements that are maintained across the channel 
page views of different content, although in Some examples 
additional features may be provided to address unique aspects 
of the content being viewed. An example of a channel page 
view is the album view illustrated in FIG. 5. 
As discussed above, and referring to FIG. 17B, for the 

digital media card, the channel control may read: "Show as 
channel using lens' to allow the user to select a particular 
lens. The lens button 1760 may display the name of the 
currently selected lens. Clicking the lens button 1760 reveals 
controls, for example, a drop-down menu, for selecting a lens. 
In one example, when the user clicks on the drop-down menu 
to select a lens, the card 1620a and drop-down menu remain 
visible, but the rest of the home view 310 becomes obscured 
by a preview of the selected lens. Lenses may also be selected 
from any of the time view, album view, intermediate view, or 
lens view of the user's digital media library. For example, 
referring to FIG. 18A, there is illustrated an example of the 
time view showing the lens button 1760. The lensbutton 1760 
displays the name of the currently selected lens. In one 
example, clicking on the lens button 1760 will switch to the 
lens view and show the current lens. Referring to FIG. 18B, 
there is illustrated an example of a lens view. The lens view 
includes a header 1810 and a body 1820 in which an image 
1025 of the content item is displayed. The lens button is 
shown as a drop-down menu 1830, as discussed above, 
revealing a list of available lenses. The drop-down menu may 
be displayed responsive to the user clicking the arrow 1840 on 
the lens button. As the user moves through the list, an instant 
preview of the highlighted lens may appear in the body 1820 
of the screen. Selecting a new lens from the list makes it the 
current lens, and changes the text on the lens button 1760 (see 
FIG. 18A) to match. 
One example of a lens is the slideshow lens. In one embodi 

ment, in a channel page view, the slideshow lens automati 
cally shows random images from the user's digital media 
library in the full screen view. Each image may be displayed 
for a predetermined period of time, for example, a few sec 
onds. In another example, the images are shown as a forward 
moving series, as shown in FIG. 19. In the example in FIG. 19. 
the front image 1910 is shown for a few seconds, then 
replaced with the next image 1920 and the series “shifts 
forward with a new image being added at the back of the line. 
In one example, the images displayed are selected from a 
particular album, and the system automatically scans through 
all the images in the album, randomly or in sequence. The 
photo display restarts again at the beginning when the end of 
the photo content is reached. From the slideshow, the user 
may navigate to any image in the digital media library. 

FIG. 21A, illustrates an example logical diagram of the 
behavior for the slideshow lens in the channel view. From 
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channel page view 2110, selection of a menu button causes 
the device to display a content menu 2120, over the present 
channel page view. Selection of the menu button from the 
content menu, causes the device to display the selected con 
tent item in a channel page view 2502. The menu button may 
be a clickable button displayed on the screen (not shown in 
FIG. 19) or may be a hardware button, such as a button on the 
keyboard 106 (see FIG. 1) or one of the navigation buttons 
122, 124 discussed above. In one example, from the channel 
page view 2110, operation of the scroll wheel 120 (see FIG. 
4), causes the device to display a channel selector view 2130. 
The channel selector may allow the user to select different 
albums or different channels for display. It is to be appreciated 
that the navigations discussed in reference to examples of 
navigating through photo content in the channel page view 
and slideshow lens may be similarly applied to channel page 
views of cards other than the digital media card, optionally 
using lenses other than the slideshow lens. 

In one embodiment, if the user presses the menu button 
while looking at a particular item, a content menu for the 
album to which that item belongs is displayed, as shown in 
FIG. 20A. In one example, the content menu 2010 is config 
ured to be responsive to manipulation of the embedded scroll 
wheel 120 discussed above. Manipulation of the scroll wheel 
120 progress through the displayed content menu 2010, and 
in response the system displays the selected content in the full 
view with preview text appearing below. Manipulation of the 
scroll wheel 120 causes the system to scroll through the 
photos in the current album. In one embodiment, the content 
menu 2010 transitions between selections by rendering the 
apparent movement of the entire content menu either to the 
left of the right depending upon the orientation of the manipu 
lation of the scroll wheel 120. Alternatively, the content menu 
is also responsive to arrow keys on the keyboard 106. 
Depressing an arrow key causes the system to display the 
apparent movement of the content menu 2010 to the next 
item. In one example, if the image 1025 belongs to more than 
one album, the system shows the content menu for the first 
album. If the item does not belong to any album, the system 
may show the content menu for unsorted images. In another 
example, pressing and holding the menu button may cause a 
content menu to be displayed, allowing the user to scroll 
through and select a particular album. A prompt 1930 may be 
displayed, as shown in FIG. 19, providing the user with 
instructions for changing the album. 

According to one embodiment, if the user presses and 
holds the menu button, a contextual menu 2020 of all of the 
albums in the digital media library appears, as shown in FIG. 
20B. The user may then use the scroll wheel 120 to navigate 
to any of the albums. The contextual menu 2020 may display 
the title of the albums, along with a representative, first or 
random thumbnail 2030 of a content item in the album. In one 
example, pressing the menu button opens the selected album, 
showing the first image in full screen and proceeding to show 
the rest as usual. 

According to one embodiment, channels for displaying 
video content and/or audio content operate with a different 
logical flow. In one example, additional interactivity is 
required to allow a user to, for example, stop a video, start a 
Video from the middle, among other options. According to 
one embodiment, the streamlined device must be able to 
accommodate routine operations through manipulation of 
only a scroll wheel and a mouse, for example when the device 
is in an easel mode. It is to be appreciated that in other 
configurations the logical flow for the behavior of the channel 
view may be different, and may take advantage of addition 
input/output devices available in other device modes. Shown 
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in FIG. 21B, is an example of a logical flow for device/UI 
functionality, during the normal operation of a channel view 
of video content. At 2140 shown is a channel page view of 
Video content. Select of button (e.g. one of the navigation 
buttons 122, 124), causes the device to display a contextual 
menu 2145. The Contextual menu 2145 may include a visual 
representation of selectable options 2150. The selectable 
options 2150 rendered may include at least a rewind/fast 
forward selector, resume selection, other episodes, etc. Selec 
tion of the rewind/fast forward selector invokes a timeline 
controller 2155 shown in the content page view 2160. In one 
example, the time line controller 2155 is responsive to rota 
tion of the scroll wheel 120, providing fast forward in one 
direction and rewind in the other. From 2160, selection of a 
navigation button causes the device to return the view to 
channel page view 2140. Selection of “resume' from the 
options 2150 also causes the device to return the view to 
channel page view 2140. Selection of other episodes from 
2150 causes the device to invoke a content menu 2165, which 
provides a selector view of available content for the channel. 
Selection of content 2170 from the selector view 2165 causes 
the system to play the selected content in channel page view 
2140. From channel page view 2140, the device displays a 
channel selector 2175, in response to operation of the scroll 
wheel 120. The logical flow illustrated may be used for inter 
actions with audio content as well, for example, to control 
playing of .mp3 or other audio files. 
As discussed above, in one embodiment, the portable com 

puter is configurable into different modes, including a laptop 
mode (in which the portable computer has a conventional 
laptop appearance), a flat mode, a frame mode, and an easel 
mode in which the base of the computer and its display 
component stand vertically forming an inverted “V” as dis 
cussed above. It is be appreciated that different user interface 
architectures may be invoked in response to different device 
modes. For example, a portable computer in laptop mode may 
display a home view 310 as discussed with respect to FIG.16, 
whereas when configured in Easel mode, user may be pre 
sented with a channel page view, for example, the slideshow 
view discussed above. 

Referring to FIG. 22, there is illustrated an example of the 
portable computer 100 configured into the easel mode. To 
convert the portable computer 100 from the laptop mode (or 
closed position) into the easel mode, the display component 
102 may be folded away from the base 104, in the same 
direction as to open the computer (i.e., to configure the com 
puter from the closed position into the laptop mode) Such that 
the base 104 and the display component 102 forman inverted 
“V” shape with the bottom of the base and the back of the 
display component face another, as illustrated in FIG. 22. In 
the easel mode, the display screen 110 is visible and acces 
sible on one side of the portable computer 100 and the key 
board 106 (not shown in FIG.22) is visible and accessible on 
the other side. Having the portable computer 100 be config 
urable between different modes supports the presentation of 
computer content using visual representation optimized for 
different viewing modes. In particular, ones of the visual 
representations are configured to display in a “lean forward' 
user viewing mode and a “lean backward' viewing mode. In 
one example, a lean forward user viewing mode includes a 
user typing at a keyboard of a laptop computer. In another 
example, a lean backward user viewing mode includes a user 
viewing a television from a distance. One should appreciate 
that the examples provided are illustrative and are not 
intended to be limiting. The configurable portable computer 
100 permits a user to select a device configuration most suited 
to a particular user viewing mode. According to one embodi 
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ment, the easel mode of the device permits improved “lean 
back' interactions with computer content. In other words, the 
easel mode makes it easier to view the streamlined device's 
display from distances greater than conventionally used with 
laptop computers. 

According to one embodiment, the function or display 
content and/or display orientation of the portable computer 
may vary when the portable computer is configured from the 
laptop mode into the easel mode, or vice versa. Thus, selec 
tion of a lean backward user viewing mode at triggers the 
portable computer 100 to transition to a content display that 
improves user interaction in that mode. For example, in 
response to configuring the device into the easel mode, the 
computer system display may transition to a channel viewing 
mode. The channel viewing mode is configured to present 
computer content, in large footprint displays, and further is 
designed to streamline user interaction with the streamlined 
device by permitting access through a first I/O profile asso 
ciated with the streamlined device in easel mode. The first I/O 
profile in easel mode may consist of a scroll wheel and a 
selector button. In some embodiments, the first I/O profile 
may include a Volume control. In another example, for at least 
Some activities within at least some modes of content (e.g., 
viewing a photograph or video), when the portable computer 
100 is configured into the easel mode, the display may auto 
matically adjust to “full screen view” (i.e., the displayed 
image or video is displayed on the full screen size, rather than 
in a window) to allow for comfortable viewing. 

In addition, in one embodiment, when the portable com 
puter 100 is configured into the easel mode, the visual display 
on the display screen 110 is automatically rotated 180 degrees 
such that the information appears "right-way-up, even 
through the display Screen is upside-down compared to when 
the portable computer is in the laptop mode. Thus, a user may 
simply “flip' the portable computer 100 into the easel mode 
and immediately be able to comfortably view information on 
the display Screen 110, without having to access display 
screen controls to adjust the orientation of the visual display. 
The ability to configure the portable computer 100 into either 
the laptop mode or the easel mode provides enhanced func 
tionality. For example, when the portable computer 100 is not 
being actively used, the user may configure the portable com 
puter into the easel mode, and program the portable computer 
to act as a digital photo frame, displaying one or more photos 
of the user's choice. In the easel mode, the portable computer 
100 may occupy a smaller footprint on a surface than in the 
laptop or closed modes because the base 104 and display 
component 102 are upright, as illustrated in FIG. 22. In addi 
tion, because the portable computer can act as a passive 
information and/or entertainment device. Such as a photo 
frame, as discussed above, the portable computer may pro 
vide a useful function even when not being actively used by 
the user, and may do so (in the easel mode) without taking up 
much surface area. 

In another example, the portable computer 100 may be 
configured into a “frame” mode, as illustrated in FIG. 23, in 
which the portable computer is placed on a surface 2310 with 
the keyboard 106 “face down” on the surface 2310 and the 
display 110 facing upward. In the frame mode, the display 
component 102 may be at a similar orientation, and angle 
2320, with respect to the base component 104 as in the easel 
mode. However, rather than the base component 104 and 
display component 102 being oriented vertically with respect 
to the surface 2310, as in the easel mode (in which the por 
table computer forms an inverted “V” as discussed above), in 
the frame mode, the base component 104 may lie flat on the 
surface 2310, as shown in FIG. 23. In one example, software 
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and/or hardware protection may be provided for the keyboard 
to prevent keys from being pressed (or to prevent the portable 
computer from responding to pressed keys) when the portable 
computer is in the frame mode. 

According to some embodiments, the streamlined com 
puter system/device includes a plurality of I/O devices that a 
user needs to operate and transitions between modes (e.g. 
frame and easel) triggers the presentation of different I/O 
profiles to the computer user. One should appreciate that the 
various I/O profiles can be selected through physical configu 
ration of the device. By providing the user the ability to 
change from a first I/O profile to another, at will, improves the 
user experience and permits the user to dynamically select a 
preferred I/O profile best suited to the user's present need. 
According to one embodiment, user selection of I/O profile 
includes transitioning from a lean back mode to a lean for 
ward mode and vice versa. In one embodiment, the user's 
computer device is configured to have multiple I/O profiles 
that can be selected by physically manipulating the orienta 
tion of the computer device itself. 

According to one aspect, streamlining user interactions 
with the computer system/device includes representing com 
puter based content in visual representations that render com 
puter operations/behavior in a consistent manner. The visual 
representations are adapted to permit easy user interaction 
even upon selection of a first I/O profile or the change in 
selection of an I/O profile. According to one embodiment, the 
visual representations are rendered as cards. Different types 
of cards may be employed to render different types of avail 
able content. For example, web based content, may be ren 
dered as a web card that associated with a mapping to web 
content. Some web cards map directly to web pages and in 
response to selection of the web card the computer device 
executes the mapping and displays a web view of the content. 
Other cards may be used to provide interactive displays 
selectable by a user. In another example, system operations 
are displayed as system cards, which are associated with 
mappings to system operations, for example communications 
configurations, and may comprise a settings card, among 
other system options. Another type of card includes a channel 
card configured to stream web based content in a manner that 
allows for summarization of content, while still providing the 
ability to fully appreciate the Summarized content. 

In one example, a streamlined hardware device provides 
for (in comparison to typical desktop and laptop systems) a 
reduced user input platform as a first I/O profile, comprising 
in one configuration a scroll wheel and a button interface. 
Other I/O profiles are available for user selection by manipu 
lation of the device itself. In one embodiment, an easel mode 
presents the user with the first I/O profile and by rotating the 
computer device about alongitudinal axis; the user may select 
a second I/O profile, including a keyboard (e.g. laptop mode). 
The transition from one I/O profile to another may also cause 
the computer device to alter its display. In one example, the 
user interface provided to the user is responsive to selection of 
device mode and/or selection of I/O profile. 

It is to be appreciated that reducing the number of I/O 
device achieves simplicity of design and ease of operation by 
the user, and at the same time may increase the complexity of 
the graphical user interfaces needed to Support interaction 
with systems and third parties that anticipate, rely on, or 
expect additional I/O devices. Streamlining device operation 
by the user is balanced against Sophistication of user the 
interface required to enable user interaction with the same 
features used with additional I/O devices. According to one 
embodiment, the user interface layer provides simplified 
accessibility based on the device's I/O platform, and for some 
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embodiments, the user interface layer is responsive to device 
configurations that change the device's I/O capabilities. In 
other embodiments, the user interface is responsive to 
changes in the device's mode. In some examples, changes in 
device mode and changes I/O profile will occur together, 
however, in other examples a change in mode or a change in 
I/O profile will not require a corresponding change in profile 
or mode respectively. 

Referring to FIG. 30, there is illustrated another configu 
ration of the portable computer 100, referring to as the “flat' 
mode. In the flat mode, the display component 102 may be 
rotated (or opened) to approximately 180 degrees with 
respect to the base component 104, such that the base com 
ponent and display component lay flat on a Surface, with the 
keyboard 106 and display screen 110 exposed, as shown in 
FIG. 30. Unlike the easel and frame modes, in which the 
keyboard may be concealed and not easily accessible, in the 
flat mode, the keyboard is accessible and usable. In addition, 
as discussed above, the visual display on the display Screen 
110 may be automatically rotated to accommodate comfort 
able viewing of information by persons located in different 
positions relative to the base component 104 or display com 
ponent 102. The visual display on the display screen 110 may 
also be manually adjusted by a user using, for example, the 
keyboard 106, touch pad 108 or mouse (not shown), scroll 
wheel 122 or navigation buttons (not shown). For example, if 
a user (located at position A) wishes to display information 
for a person located opposite the user (at position B), the 
visual display may be rotated (automatically or manually) 
180 degrees such that the information appears "right-way 
up to the person at location B, even through the display 
screen 110 is upside-down for that person. Similarly, in 
another example, the visual display may be rotated (automati 
cally or manually) 90 degrees such that the information 
appears “right-way-up for a person at location C. In one 
example, a user can “toggle the visual display among various 
orientations. For example, a user at location A may have the 
visual display facing themselves while using the keyboard 
106 or other controls to change or access information on the 
display, then toggle the display orientation 180 or 90 degrees 
to display the information for persons at locations B or C. 

According to another aspect, System and interface stream 
lining may be employed with devices of multiple configura 
tions. In some embodiments, multiple configurations include 
a traditional configuration, for example, a configuration simi 
lar to a laptop device, and also include new configurations, for 
example, an easel mode. Some examples of streamlined 
devices have the ability to change between traditional con 
figurations and other configurations. The change between 
configurations may change the I/O profile of the device and 
hence impact the user's interaction with the device itself and 
any content displayed on the device. In one embodiment, the 
user interface is responsive to changes in configuration. In 
another embodiment, the user interface is responsive to 
changes in I/O profile. 

According to another aspect, the streamlining of the user's 
multi-media experience incorporates the device the user uses 
to interact with multi-media Sources, whether the Sources are 
on-line or provided by the device itself. Streamlining of the 
device includes developing consistent user interfaces for the 
user to access all features presented. The device's graphical 
user interface layer is customized to the I/O interfaces pro 
vided. In one example a device is provided in the form of a 
portable computer configurable between a laptop mode (in 
which the portable computer has a conventional laptop 
appearance) and an easel mode in which the base of the 
computer and its display component stand uprightforming an 
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inverted “V” a closed mode, a laptop mode, an easel mode, a 
flat mode and a frame mode. According to one embodiment, 
each of the display modes may employ different I/O profiles. 

In some embodiments, multiple configurations include a 
traditional configuration, for example, a configuration similar 
to a laptop device, and also include new configurations, for 
example, an easel mode. Some examples of streamlined 
devices have the ability to change between traditional con 
figurations and other configurations. The change between 
configurations may change the I/O profile of the device and 
hence impact the user's interaction with the device itself and 
any content displayed on the device. In one embodiment, the 
user interface is responsive to changes in configuration. In 
another embodiment, the user interface is responsive to 
changes in I/O profile. 

Referring again to FIG. 16, the computer system may 
include various system cards that map to computer function 
ality. Functionality mapped to by System cards may include, 
for example, a communications card, for configuring wireless 
access of the device, bookmarks for presenting conventional 
styled web page bookmarks, and a camera card for providing 
for configuration and operation of a camera, either embedded 
in the device upon construction, or incorporated through for 
example a USB port. According to one embodiment, a camera 
system card 1622 may provide a user with an easy way to get 
digital photographs and/or videos off their digital camera and 
stored safely in the cloud 330 with their online hosting ser 
vice. The camera card may provide information and Support 
during each stage of the process: before, during and after a 
digital camera is connected to the portable computer 100 and 
the content items uploaded to the cloud 330. 

Digital cameras typically present themselves to computers 
as storage devices. In many cases, the portable computer 100 
may not be able to distinguish between a digital camera, a 
memory card reader, a USB drive, or other attached storage 
devices. Therefore, according to one embodiment, the camera 
card treats all Such devices in the same way. Thus, the camera 
card may support the upload of images and videos regardless 
of the type of devices on which they are stored. Accordingly, 
although the following discussion may refer primarily to a 
camera, the term "camera' is intended to be synonymous with 
digital camera, card reader, USB drive, or other attachable 
storage device. 

According to one embodiment, when a camera is attached 
to the portable computer 100, the camera card becomes avail 
able in a channel view, where it displays images on the card 
using the slideshow lens. However, it will be appreciated that 
the camera card may also become available in the home view 
or another view, and may display the images using a lens 
and/or view other than the slideshow lens. When no camera is 
attached to the portable computer, the camera card may none 
theless be visible in the home view 310. Selecting the camera 
card may “open the card into a “page view” (i.e., the card is 
viewed full screen) and may display instructions/information 
about connecting a camera to the portable computer 100. 
When a camera is first attached to the portable computer 100, 
the system may Zoom into the camera card and present the 
user with several options. For example, the user may be able 
to upload all the images from the camera to the online photo 
hosting service, allowing the system to create default albums. 
Alternatively, the user can customize the upload by adjusting 
albums and selecting from multiple online services, as dis 
cussed further below. In another example, the user can simply 
view the images that are on the camera, without necessarily 
initiating an upload. In one embodiment, while photos and/or 
videos are being uploaded to the cloud 330, the user can 
continue to review images on the camera card. As discussed 
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further below, the user may also see the upload progress both 
in the camera card and in the digital media card 1620a. The 
presence of a camera attached to the portable computer need 
not constrain the user's access to the rest of the system. The 
user may simply navigate away from the camera card to 
interact normally with the portable computer and use its other 
functions. 

Referring to FIG. 24, there is illustrated an example of a 
page view of a camera card 1622 showing an upload of 
images 2410 in progress. The camera card 1622 includes a 
header 2415 and a body 2420 in which the images 2410 are 
displayed. The header may include information that identifies 
the card 1622 as the camera card and, when a camera is 
connected to the portable computer 100, information 2425 
that identifies the connected camera (e.g., a make/model of 
the camera). The header may also include status information 
2430 that tells the user the current activity being performed by 
the camera card, for example, “saving new photos and/or 
videos.” The header may also include a “stop' control 2435 
that allows the user to stop the saving/upload process, as well 
as a display control 2440 that allows the user to, for example, 
cause the camera card to display the images 2410 using the 
slideshow lens. In the body 2420, a status indicator 2445 may 
inform the user of the progress of the save/upload process. For 
example, the status indicator 2445 may tell the user that 34 of 
70 content items have been processed and the save is 50% 
complete. 

In one embodiment, clicking on an individual image 2410 
on the camera card 1622, regardless of the stage of the upload 
process, may bring the user to the intermediate view, as shown 
in FIG. 25. The other images re-arrange themselves to form a 
horizontal line of images sorted by the date the items were 
taken with older items to the left. The intermediate view for 
the camera card 1622 is similar to the intermediate view for 
the digital media card 1620a discussed above. In one 
example, in the intermediate view for the camera card 1622, 
the user options may include the ability to edit a caption for 
the selected image 2410a by typing into the caption field 
2450. The date field 2455 displays the date of the image 
underneath the caption area. In one example, if the user clicks 
on the date field 2455, it becomes editable, allowing the user 
to correct the date in case the camera does not have the correct 
date, as discussed above. If the user corrects the date and 
saves the changes, the system may then prompt the user to see 
whether it should change the dates for the rest of the contents 
of the camera by the same offset. The intermediate view of the 
camera card 1622 may also include a rotate option 2460 
which may allow the user to rotate the image 2410, as also 
discussed above. In one example, each click on the rotate 
button 2460 rotates the image (either clockwise or anti-clock 
wise) by 90 degrees, and the user may thus click as many 
times as necessary to rotate the image by the desired amount. 
A delete option 2465 deletes the item from the camera card, 
after prompting the user to confirm the delete. As in interme 
diate view in the digital media application, the user can navi 
gate between photos and videos by clicking on the left or right 
navigation bars 2470, or by using the arrow keys or other 
controls as would be recognized by those skilled in the art. In 
one example, clicking anywhere on the image 2410 shows the 
image full-screen. The header 2415 may also include controls 
for deleting items (control 2475), creating a new album (con 
trol 2480) and saving (control 2485), each of which is dis 
cussed further below. 
When no camera is connected to the portable computer 

100, or when the system does not see a camera, it may be in 
one of two states: normal or interrupted upload (discussed 
below). According to one embodiment, in the normal state, 

5 

10 

15 

25 

30 

35 

40 

45 

50 

55 

60 

65 

42 
the camera card 1622 on the home view 310 displays a 
generic camera image, and selecting the camera card may 
display some helpful information about how to connect a 
camera to the portable computer, as discussed above. By 
placing the camera card on the home view 310, even when no 
camera is connected, the capabilities of the camera card appli 
cation are highlighted. For example, a user, upon seeing the 
camera card, may be reminded to connect a camera to the 
portable computer, making it more likely that the user will use 
the portable computer for managing digital media content 
items. 

According to one embodiment, when a user attaches a 
camera to the portable computer 100, the user sees an anima 
tion of the system going to the home view 310, Scrolling as 
necessary to the page containing the camera card 1622 (which 
may show thumbnails of the content of the camera), then 
Zooming into the camera card. In one example, if the user has 
already selected the camera card and is viewing the camera 
card in the page view prior to connecting the camera, this 
animation may not show. Once in the page view for the 
camera card, the user can see the contents of the attached 
camera, and may be given options for what can be done with 
the content on the camera. These options may be displayed, 
for example, in a bubble that appears over the line of images 
2410. In one example, the options include a simple save and 
an advanced save. The simple save option may save the con 
tents of the camera card to the user's online photo hosting 
service with automatically created albums. If the user has 
registered more than one online hosting service, the user may 
select the desired service from a drop-down menu. The 
advanced save option provides the user with the opportunity 
to manipulate the automatically saved sets, delete photos, 
and/or save photos to multiple online hosting services, as 
discussed further below. 

In the page view, as shown for example in FIG. 24, the user 
can interact with the images on the camera. This interaction 
may be similar to interacting with digital content items in the 
time view or album view discussed above. As discussed 
above, the user is free to interact normally with the entire 
system even when a camera is attached, and is not required to 
first complete any action associated with the camera card. For 
example, if the user returns to the home view 310 without 
initiating an upload of images, the camera card 1622 shows 
thumbnails 2620 of the images on the attached camera, as 
shown for example in FIG. 26. The header 2415 of the camera 
card may also display the number 2610 of new content items 
on the camera. 

According to one embodiment, once a user has connected 
a camera to the portable computer 100 and is brought to the 
camera card, the user may rely on the system to create albums 
by selecting the simple save option. The upload process then 
begins, as discussed further below, using automatically-gen 
erated albums and saving images to the user's registered 
online photo hosting service. If there is more than one photo 
hosting service associated with the portable computer, the 
simple save option may default to the service that was used 
during the last upload. Some existing photo hosting services 
do not support video content. Accordingly, the portable com 
puter may provide video storage services, either locally or 
through the cloud 330. Accordingly, users may have more 
than one service associated with the portable computer 100: 
however, the difference between the photo hosting service 
and the video hosting service may be seamlessly transparent 
to the user. In one example, in the simple save mode, by 
default, “delete items from the camera when they are safe' is 
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checked. If a user prefers to leave the images on the camera, 
the user can uncheck this box before initiating the simple save 
option. 
As discussed above, in one embodiment, the system may 

save the user time and effort by automatically organizing 5 
digital content items, including photos and videos, into 
albums. In one example, albums are created by date, with 
photos and videos taken on the same day going into a single 
album. If a set of photos are close in time (e.g., are taken 
within 90 minutes or so of each other) but span two days, the 10 
album may span those two days as well. For example, it may 
not be uncommon to see images taken just before and just 
after midnight on New Year's Day, and these images may be 
grouped into a single album. In one example, automatically 
generated albums may not contain fewer than a predeter- 15 
mined number of images, for example, five images. In the 
case that fewer than five photos for a single date are on the 
camera (or if there are fewer than 5 photos total on the cam 
era), the photos may appear in the unsorted photos area dis 
cussed below. In one example, the default name of the auto- 20 
matically generated album is the date (or date range) on which 
the content items were taken. 
As discussed above, an alternative to the simple save option 

is the advanced save option. Selecting the advanced save 
option may bring the user to a “choose & organize” Screen, an 25 
example of which is illustrated in FIG. 27. From the “choose 
& organize' screen, the user may organize digital content 
items before uploading them. Referring to FIG. 27, in one 
example, the “choose & organize' screen has four main areas, 
namely, albums 2710 which may appear at the top of the list 30 
and comprise automatically generated albums and/or albums 
that the user creates manually; unsorted photos 2715, videos 
2720; and previously uploaded content 2725 which may 
appears at the end of the list. The “choose & organize' screen 
may also display a new content indicator 2730 which tells the 35 
user the number of new photos and videos on the camera. In 
one embodiment, automatically generated albums (discussed 
further below) are arranged in chronological order starting 
with the newest album at top. It is to be appreciated that 
although only one album 2710 is shown in FIG. 27, the 40 
"choose & organize' screen may display any number of 
albums. A scroll bar (not shown) may be used to Scroll up and 
down the page if there are more albums than can be displayed 
at one time on the screen. In one example, if the user corrects 
the date of items in an automatically generated album, the 45 
album date may update to reflect the change, and the order of 
the albums in the list may be automatically updated. Each 
album 2710 includes an album title 2735 and thumbnails 
2740 of the content items included in the album. When the 
user hovers over any part of an album 2710, that album may 50 
become active. When an album 2710 is active, the album title 
2735 becomes an editable field, and a "dissolve album' but 
ton (not shown) is revealed. In one example, clicking the 
“dissolve album' button causes all the photos from that album 
to be placed into the unsorted photos area 2715. 55 

According to one embodiment, “unsorted photos” (i.e., 
those not associated with an album) are displayed in the 
unsorted photos area 2715. The unsorted photos area 2715 
includes a header 2745 identifying the area to the user, and 
also includes thumbnails 2740 of all items included in the 60 
unsorted photos area. In one example, when the camera is first 
attached, the unsorted photos area 2715 may be empty. A user 
can drag individual photos out of albums 2710 into the 
unsorted photos area 2715. As discussed above, a user can 
also click the “dissolve album' button (not shown) on an 65 
album 2710, thereby sending all the photos in that album to 
the unsorted photos area 2715. The user can also drag photos 

44 
from the unsorted photos area 2715 into an album 2710. The 
videos area 2720 may similarly include a header 2745 iden 
tifying the area to a user, and thumbnails 2740 of an image of 
each video. 

In one embodiment, if a user clicks the “new album' con 
trol button 2480 in the header 2415, a new album is added to 
the top of the list, pushing other albums down. When the new 
album appears, the title 2735 of the album may be pre-popu 
lated with “new album, but this title may also be selected/ 
active so that the user can simply start typing to replace it. The 
user can then drag individual photos from other albums or 
from the unsorted photos area 2715 into the new album. The 
new album control 2480 may also be selected from the inter 
mediate view, as shown in FIG. 25. 
From the “choose & organize' screen a user may also 

delete items, such as, for example, out-of-focus or unflatter 
ing photos. In one example, the camera card Supports batch 
deletion. This process may also provide the user with a safety 
net, making it more difficult to delete a content item by 
accident. In one example, when the user hovers over an indi 
vidual thumbnail 2740, a check box labeled “delete” (or 
similar language) appears, and once the user checks the box, 
the image dims. The check box (without the “delete label) 
may remain visible after it is checked, even if the user moves 
the cursor away from the item, making it very visually clear 
how to reverse the action. Un-checking the box may return the 
item to full saturation. When the user marks one or more items 
for deletion, the control buttons 2480 and 2485 in the header 
2415 may be replaced with an “unmark all option. The 
“delete all control 2475 may remain or be replaced with 
“delete marked items.” If user selects the “unmark all con 
trol, all the items marked for deletion are unmarked. Selecting 
the delete control 2475 deletes the marked items and the 
thumbnails 2740 are removed from view. The remaining 
thumbnails 2740 may then rearrange themselves appropri 
ately. The user can also delete items from the intermediate 
view shown in FIG. 24. In some cases, the camera (or other 
media device) that the user connects to the portable computer 
100 may be locked or otherwise write-protected, making 
deletion impossible. In this case, the delete buttons (in the 
header 2415 and overlayed onto the thumbnails 2740) are 
dimmed, and information may be included in the header 2415 
that indicates that the camera is locked. In this state, if the user 
hovers over the dimmed “delete all button 2475 in the header 
2415, a message may be displayed. Such as “no deletion 
possible because the memory card is locked.” 

Still referring to FIG. 27, the user may move digital content 
items among different albums 2710 and to and from the 
unsorted photos area 2715. For example, the user can drag 
photos between albums 2710, from albums 2710 to the 
unsorted photos area 2715, or from the unsorted photos area 
into albums. When the user drags a photo, other thumbnails 
2740 on the screen rearrange themselves to accommodate the 
added/removed item. In one example, because videos are 
saved separately from photos, the user may not be able to drag 
videos from the video area 2720 into albums 2710. Similarly, 
the user may not drag a photo into the video area 2720. In one 
example, if the user attempts to drags a photo to an unavail 
able location (such as the videos area 2720 or previously 
uploaded items area 2725), the photo snaps back to its origi 
nal location. 

In one embodiment, if the user has previously uploaded 
items from a camera, but elected not to delete them, they 
appear in the “previously saved' area 2725. If there are no 
items that have been previously uploaded from the user's 
camera, the previously saved area 2725 may not appear. The 
previously saved area 2725 includes a header 2750 which 
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identifies the area to the user, and may also display the num 
ber of previously uploaded content items that are on the 
camera. The previously saved area 2725 may initially not 
display thumbnails of the items, but instead display a “show 
items' button 2755. Clicking the “show items” button 2755 
may reveal thumbnails of the previously uploaded items. The 
user may then select individual items to delete, or may drag 
photos from this area into albums 2710 or drag videos to the 
videos area 2720. If the user drags an item to an album 2710, 
the underlying behavior of the system on upload depends on 
the associated online photo hosting service. For services that 
use an "image stream” concept and therefore allow individual 
images to appear in multiple albums (e.g., FLICKR), the 
image may be added to the album using the camera card 
interface, but not uploaded again. For other services, the 
image may be uploaded again into the new album. 

According to one embodiment, clicking on a thumbnail 
2740 brings the user to the intermediate view, shown, for 
example, in FIG. 25. Clicking anywhere in the background 
may return the user to the standard view of the “choose & 
organize' screen. When the user has organized the digital 
content items to his/her satisfaction, the user may click the 
“save... control 2485 in the header 2415. In one example, 
clicking the save control 2485 causes a modal page bubble 
2810 to appear, providing the user with options for saving, as 
shown in FIG. 28. The user may elect to save or not save each 
individual album, as well as unsorted photos and videos using 
the checkboxes 2815. In the illustrated example, a checkbox 
is included with each column header to allow the user to 
quickly select all items in that column. If the user has regis 
tered more than one photo or video host service, a column 
may be provided for each service, identified by name. The 
user may then elect to save each individual album to one, all, 
or none of the services, using the appropriate checkboxes. In 
one example, the system warns the user about potential 
restrictions a photo host service may place on videos (e.g., 
size, format, etc.), allowing the user to use that information in 
selecting where the videos are to be saved. A checkbox 2830 
may be provided to given the user the option of whether or not 
the system will delete items from the attached camera after 
the items have been safely uploaded. In one example, deleting 
the items upon successful upload is selected by default. If the 
user does not select a service for a set of items (e.g., one or 
more albums, unsorted photos, or videos), the system will 
leave those items—they will not be uploaded, but they will 
also not be deleted from the camera. In this case, the infor 
mation about the album (e.g., its contents and title) may be 
retained until the camera is disconnected from the portable 
computer. Thus, once the upload process for the rest of the 
items is complete and the user returns to the “choose & 
organize' screen, the album is still as the user arranged it. The 
bubble 2810 may further include a “cancel” button 2840 to 
allow the user the cancel the upload and return to the “choose 
& organize' screen, and a “save' button 2850 to initiate the 
upload process. 

According to one embodiment, once the user initiates the 
upload process, by selecting either the simple save or 
advanced save option, the portable computer 100 begins 
uploading the digital content items to the cloud 330. As dis 
cussed above, the user may see the progress of the upload on 
the camera card. The user may also upload digital content 
items from within the digital media card 1620a. For example, 
the user may use the time view or album view to locate content 
items to upload, for example, to a social networking site or 
another online hosting service. In one example, the upload 
may be initiated from the user's pick list discussed above. 
Whether the upload is initiated from the camera card or the 
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digital media card, the user may see information regarding the 
status of the upload, for example, whether each content item 
has been saved, how much progress has been made on the 
upload, which online hosting service the content item is being 
uploaded to, etc. In one example, during upload, the camera 
card displays the images being uploaded, with the current 
image shown enlarged. In one example, the user can interact 
with the images during the upload process. This interaction 
may behave similarly to the single album view in the digital 
media application discussed above. 

In one example, all content uploaded on the user's behalf 
may be marked as “private” or the equivalent on their photo 
hosting service. This default behavior protects the user's pri 
vacy and keeps others from viewing the user's content with 
out the user's permission. It is to be appreciated; however, that 
other default options may be implemented, and the user may 
be prompted to identify content as private or public, or 
equivalents thereof. 

According to one embodiment, if the user has elected to 
have images deleted from the camera after upload, then each 
content item is deleted as soon as it is uploaded into the cloud 
330. In one example, the user can still see the content items in 
the context of the camera card, however, until the camera is 
disconnected from the portable computer 100. Referring to 
FIG. 24, in one example, if the user clicks the “Stop saving 
button 2435 in the header 2415, the upload stops and the 
system then returns the user to the initial screen as though the 
camera had just been attached. In this instance, content items 
that have already been uploaded and deleted from the camera 
are no longer included. The content item that was in process 
when the user clicked the “Stop saving button 2435 will not 
have been deleted from the camera yet and may therefore 
appear. In another example, if the user had elected not to 
delete content items from the camera (e.g., by unchecking 
box 2830, content items that have already been uploaded may 
appear in the previously saved area 2725. 
Once the upload is complete (i.e. the digital content items 

are safely stored in the cloud 330), the system may display an 
informational bubble letting the user know it is safe to remove 
the camera. The user may then be returned to the camera card 
page view (if the simple save option was used) or to the 
"choose & organize' screen if the advanced save option was 
used. In either case, the system recognizes that the content 
items have been uploaded. If the content items have been 
deleted from the camera, they no longer appear in “choose & 
organize' screen, and if they have been left on the camera they 
appear in the previously saved area 2725. Once the camera is 
disconnected, or the user navigates away from the camera 
card after an upload, the newly uploaded content items may 
become indistinguishable from previously stored items in the 
digital media library. 

In some instances, the upload process may be interrupted 
before it is complete. For example, the camera may run out of 
power, the portable computer may lose its connection to the 
cloud, or the user may disconnect the camera before the 
upload is complete. In one example, in the event of an inter 
rupted upload, the camera card displays a warning and infor 
mation about the state of the upload and/or camera. From the 
page view of the camera card, the user may elect to stop the 
upload or cancel the message, retuning the system to the "no 
camera connected State. In one example, if the user elected to 
stop the upload and Subsequently reconnects the camera, the 
camera card will behave as though it were the first time that 
camera is being connected. Alternatively, if the user elected 
instead to cancel the 'saving interrupted message, the cam 
era card may resume uploading the digital content items the 
next time the user connects the camera. If the user has taken 
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Some new photos during the time when the camera was dis 
connected and then reconnected, the new photos may be 
automatically uploaded when the camera is reconnected. 
Alternatively, the use may be given the option to upload the 
new photos or not, or may navigate to the “choose & orga 
nize' screen to select certain photos for upload. Any digital 
content items not uploaded may remain on the camera and be 
treated as new photos the next time the camera is connected to 
the portable computer. 
As discussed above, in one embodiment the portable com 

puter 100 is configurable into an easel mode. One example of 
the camera card behavior when a camera is connected to the 
portable computer in the easel mode is shown in diagram 
matic form in FIG. 29. In this example, the camera card 
becomes the current channel 2910 and a camera menu 2920 is 
displayed to give the user the opportunity to save the contents 
of the camera (2930) or view the contents as a slideshow 
(2940). In one example, the save behavior is similar to the 
simple save behavior discussed above in that the system may 
save new items using automatically generated albums. In 
another example, if the user elects to save the contents of the 
camera, the upload begins. In one example, each content item 
is shown in full screen as it uploads, with an indication of its 
progress. In one example, the portable computer will not enter 
the screensaver mode during an upload. As in other examples 
discussed above, the user may continue to interact with the 
system during the upload. For example, the user may view 
other channels, and can navigate back to the camera card 
channel to view the progress of the upload. Once the upload is 
complete, a notification may be displayed to the effect that it 
is safe to disconnect the camera. In one example, this notifi 
cation remains as long as the camera is still attached to the 
portable computer, but may be displayed in a corner or other 
unobtrusive location. In one example, when the user discon 
nects the camera, the camera card is no longer available as a 
channel. According to one embodiment, if an upload has been 
interrupted and the user reconnects the camera to the portable 
computer in the easel mode, the upload resumes in the back 
ground without notification. If there are no new images on the 
camera, the user may only be given the option to see a slide 
show of the images on the camera. 

Having thus described several aspects of at least one 
embodiment, it is to be appreciated various alterations, modi 
fications, and improvements will readily occur to those 
skilled in the art. Such alterations, modifications, and 
improvements are intended to be part of this disclosure and 
are intended to be within the scope of the invention. Accord 
ingly, the foregoing description and drawings are by way of 
example only, and the scope of the invention should be deter 
mined from proper construction of the appended claims, and 
their equivalents. 

What is claimed is: 
1. A method for accessing and managing digital media 

libraries on a streamlined computing device with a plurality 
of selectable I/O profiles, the method comprising: 

displaying a graphical user interface on the computing 
device, wherein the graphical user interface comprises at 
least a plurality of views of digital media content; 

providing for transition between the plurality of views in 
response to selection of an I/O profile; 

providing for transition between the plurality of views in 
response to activation of a view selector component 
configured to permit a user to select one of the plurality 
of views, wherein providing for the transition between 
the plurality of views in response to selection of the I/O 
profile includes: 
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permitting the user to rotate a display component of the 

computing device about a longitudinal axis running 
along an interface between the display component 
and a base of the streamlined computing device; 

wherein rotating the display component about the lon 
gitudinal axis from a closed mode to a first physical 
orientation configures the computing device into a 
laptop mode having a first physical configuration of 
the display component and the base, with one of the 
plurality of views as a default display; and 

wherein rotating the display component about the lon 
gitudinal axis from the closed mode to a second physi 
cal orientation configures the computing device into 
another display mode having a second physical con 
figuration of the display component and the base, with 
another one of the plurality of views as the default 
display; 

associating at least one of a plurality of visual representa 
tions with digital media content; 

executing the association with the at least one of the plu 
rality of visual representations with digital media con 
tent in response to selection; 

transitioning a display on the computing device to a view of 
the digital media content in response to the act of execut 
ing the association; and 

providing for display of user digital media content and 
referenced digital media content in the view of the digi 
tal media content. 

2. The method according to claim 1, further comprising an 
act of displaying in the view user digital media content and 
referenced digital media content in response to the act of 
executing the association with the at least one of the plurality 
of visual representations. 

3. The method according to claim 2, wherein the act of 
displaying in the view user digital media content and refer 
enced digital media content includes an act of accessing a 
reference to remote digital content not controlled by the user 
in order to display referenced digital content. 

4. The method according to claim 1, further comprising an 
act of associating the at least one of the plurality of visual 
representations with a remote service provider. 

5. The method of claim 4, further comprising an act storing 
the association between the at least one visual representation 
with the remote service provider in at least one of a device 
profile and a user profile. 

6. The method according to claim 1 further comprising acts 
of: 

configuring access to a remote service; and 
integrating operations provided by the remote service pro 

vider into the view of the digital media content. 
7. The method according to claim 1, wherein the view 

comprises at least one of an album view and a timeline view. 
8. The method according to claim 7, further comprising an 

act of displaying digital media contentina body portion of the 
view. 

9. The method according to claim 7, further comprising an 
act of displaying a toggle element in a header portion of the 
view, wherein the toggle element transitions the computing 
device display between the album view and the timeline view 
upon selection by a user. 

10. The method according to claim 7, further comprising 
acts of: 

displaying emulation controls responsive to selection by 
the user, and 

emulating standard computer operations for referenced 
digital media content displayed in the view, wherein the 
actofemulating standard computer operations includes: 
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an act of determining if the user has authority to perform 
the standard computer operations, 

determining the user does not have the authority to per 
form the standard computer operation on a source of 
the referenced digital media content, and wherein the 5 
act of displaying the emulation controls occurs in 
response to the determination that the user does not 
have the authority. 

11. The method according to claim 10, wherein the stan 
dard computer operation includes an act of deleting digital 
media content, and the method further comprises an act of 
altering the view of the digital media content so the digital 
media content marked for deletion is not displayed within the 
view. 15 

12. The method according to claim 11, further comprising 
an act of generating a state entry, associated with at least one 
of the view and the source of the referenced digital media 
COntent. 

13. The method according to claim 12, further comprising 
an acts of 

accessing any state entry for at least one of the view and the 
Source of referenced digital media content; and 

displaying referenced digital media content according to 
any state entry requirement. 

14. The method according to claim 10, wherein the stan 
dard computer operation includes an act of editing referenced 
digital media content, and the method further comprises an 
act of generating a state entry reflecting any edits made to the 
referenced digital media content. 

15. The method according to claim 7, further comprising 
acts of: 

providing an aggregation component configured to permit 
the user to select a plurality of digital media content; 

displaying the plurality of digital media content in the body 
of the view; and 

permitting the user to perform operations on the plurality 
of digital media content. 

16. The method according to claim 15, wherein the act of 
permitting the user to perform operations on the plurality of 
digital media content includes at least one of a share opera 
tion, a create channel operation, and an orderprints operation. 

17. The method according to claim 16, wherein the at least 
one operation is a share operation, and the method further 
comprises acts of: 

identifying any state entries for the plurality of digital 
media content; 

identifying any remote service settings for the plurality of 
digital media content; and 

transmitting a visual representation associated with the 
plurality of digital media content, any state settings, and 
any remote service settings to another streamlined 
device user. 

18. The method according to claim 7, wherein the view is 55 
a time view and the method further comprises: 

displaying a timeline navigation control in the body of the 
view, wherein the timeline navigation control is config 
ured to provide organization segments, the organization 
segments providing a visual indication of a number of 60 
digital media content items in each segment. 

19. The method according to claim 18, wherein the time 
line navigation control further comprises a handle responsive 
to a pointer displayed on the computer device, wherein the 
handle is further responsive to select and drag operations. 

20. The method according to claim 1, further comprising 
acts of: 
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permitting the user to share the at least one visual repre 

sentation, including any associated digital media con 
tent with another user; 

storing shared information in response to an act of sharing 
by the user; and 

updating any associated digital media automatically for the 
another user, wherein the act of updating any associated 
digital media includes acts of: 
identifying any changes in shared digital media content, 

wherein changes include at least one of addition of 
digital media content associated with the at least one 
visual representation, deletion of digital media con 
tent associated with the at least one visual represen 
tation, edits of digital media content associated with 
the at least one visual representation, and updates of 
information associated with digital media content 
associated with the at least one visual representation. 

21. The method according to claim 1, further comprising 
acts of: 

permitting the user to share the at least one visual repre 
sentation, including any associated digital media con 
tent with another user; 

transmitting the at least one visual representation associ 
ated with the digital media content, any state settings, 
and any remote service settings to another streamlined 
device user. 

22. The method according to claim 1, further comprising an 
act of permitting the user to update date information associ 
ated with the digital media content. 

23. The method according to claim 22, further comprising 
an acts of 

generating an offset for the updated date information asso 
ciated with the digital media content; and 

applying the offset to similar digital media content. 
24. The method according to claim 1, wherein the act of 

displaying the user interface includes: 
providing a plurality of views of the plurality of visual 

representations of computer content; and 
associating the plurality of visual representations of com 

puter content with at least one of the plurality of views, 
and wherein the each of the plurality of visual represen 
tations is responsive to focus and execution, wherein 
execution includes selection of the visual representation. 

25. The method according to claim 1, 
wherein rotating the display component about the longitu 

dinal axis up to approximately 180 degrees from the 
closed mode and configures the computing device into a 
laptop mode with one of the plurality of views as a 
default display; and 

wherein rotating the display component about the longitu 
dinal axis configures the computing device into the 
another display mode with another one of the plurality of 
views as the default display, and includes rotating the 
display component beyond approximately 180 degrees 
from the closed mode to configure the computing device 
into an easel mode with another one of the plurality of 
views as the default display. 

26. A non-transitory computer-readable medium having 
computer-readable instructions stored thereon that as a result 
of being executed by a computer, instruct the computer to 
perform the method for accessing and managing digital 
media libraries on a streamlined computing device with a 
plurality of selectable I/O profiles, wherein the method com 
prises: 

displaying a graphical user interface on the computing 
device, wherein the graphical user interface comprises at 
least a plurality of views of digital media content; 
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providing for transition between the plurality of views in 
response to selection of an I/O profile, wherein provid 
ing for the transition between the plurality of views in 
response to selection of the I/O profile includes: 
permitting the user to rotate a display component of the 

computing device about a longitudinal axis running 
along an interface between the display component 
and a base of the streamlined computing device; 

wherein rotating the display component about the lon 
gitudinal axis from a closed mode to a first physical 
orientation configures the computing device into a 
laptop mode having a first physical configuration of 
the display component and the base with one of the 
plurality of views as a default display; and 

wherein rotating the display component about the lon 
gitudinal axis from the closed mode to a second physi 
cal orientation configures the computing device into 
another display mode having a second physical con 
figuration of the display component and the base with 
another one of the plurality of views as the default 
display; 

providing for transition between the plurality of views in 
response to activation of a view selector component 
configured to permit a user to select one of the plurality 
of views; 

associating at least one of a plurality of visual representa 
tions with digital media content; 

executing the association with the at least one of the plu 
rality of visual representations with digital media con 
tent in response to selection; 

transitioning a display on the computing device to a view of 
the digital media content in response to the act of execut 
ing the association; and 

providing for display of user digital media content and 
referenced digital media content in the view of the digi 
tal media content. 

27. A system for accessing and managing digital media 
libraries with a plurality of selectable I/O profiles, the system 
comprising: 

a display component configured to display a graphical user 
interface on a computing device, wherein the graphical 
user interface comprises at least a plurality of views of 
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digital media content, wherein the plurality of views 
include at least one of a plurality of visual representa 
tions; 

an execution component configured to transition the 
graphical user interface between the plurality of views in 
response to selection of an I/O profile, wherein selecting 
the I/O profile includes: 
responding to user rotation of a display component of 

the computing device about a longitudinal axis run 
ning along an interface between the display compo 
nent and a base of the streamlined computing device; 

responding to rotation of the display component about 
the longitudinal from a closed mode to a first physical 
orientation configures the computing device into a 
laptop mode having a first physical configuration of 
the display component and the base with one of the 
plurality of views as a default display; and 

responding to rotation of the display component about 
the longitudinal axis from the closed mode to a second 
physical orientation configures the computing device 
into another display mode having a second physical 
configuration of the display component and the base 
with another one of the plurality of views as the 
default display; 

a view selector component configured to transition 
between the plurality of views in response to activation; 

a storage component configured to store an association 
between at least one of a plurality of visual representa 
tions and digital media content; 

wherein the execution component is further configured to 
execute the association with the at least one of the plu 
rality of visual representations with digital media con 
tent in response to selection and transition the display to 
a view of the digital media content in response to the act 
of executing the association; and 

wherein the display component is configured to display 
user digital media content and referenced digital media 
content in the view of the digital media content. 

k k k k k 
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