

EXHIBIT 2

**TO THE DECLARATION OF BRIAN J. NISBET
IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS' MOTION
FOR FEES AND COSTS**

WINSTON & STRAWN LLP

333 S. Grand Ave.
 Los Angeles, CA 90071-1543
 TAX ID NO. 36-1975990

Alphatec Holdings, Inc.
 Tyson Marshall
 Director of Legal Affairs
 5818 El Camino Real
 Carlsbad, CA 92008

Invoice No. 2721459
 Invoice Date 01/22/20
 Client Matter No. 201205.00001

For Legal Services Rendered Through December 31, 2019 In Connection With:
00001 NuVasive, Inc. v. Alphatec Holdings, Inc.

Date	Attorney/Other Prof	Hours	Description
12/06/19	D. Dalke	1.70	Review ex parte motion for special master and associated declarations
12/06/19	B. Nisbet	4.50	Review motion for protective order; conference with N. Wickramasekera re motion and response
12/06/19	L. Quan	1.50	Research cases and prepare material in preparation for response to ex parte motion for protective order and assignment of special master
12/06/19	N. Wickramasekera	6.60	Review NuVasive's motion for disqualification and cited exhibits and documents; confer with client and team re same
12/07/19	D. Dalke	4.60	Review and research NuVasive's motion for special master and associated declarations
12/07/19	E. Lewis	6.70	Analyze NuVasive's arguments re motion to disqualify Alphatec's counsel and research re same
12/07/19	B. Nisbet	2.80	Research re motion for protective order, review motion for protective order, call with N. Wickramasekera re motion for protective order
12/07/19	L. Petroff	2.00	Preliminary review and evaluation of Nuvasive's Ex Parte Motion for Protective Order and Appointment of Special Master, Supporting Declarations, and Exhibits
12/07/19	L. Quan	9.50	Assist in preparation of Alphatec's notice of emergency request re ex parte motion for

Date	Attorney/Other Prof	Hours	Description
12/07/19	S. Raghavan	2.20	Confer and strategize regarding NuVasive's ex parte motion for protective order and appointment of special master; research re same
12/07/19	G. Skogg	4.50	Research re case data for review by team attorneys for motion response; correspondence re attorney binders for response to ex parte motion
12/07/19	B. Wardlaw	6.50	Review NuVasive ex parte motion for protective order; research for response to NuVasive ex parte motion
12/07/19	N. Wickramasekera	16.20	Review NuVasive's motion for disqualification and cited exhibits and documents; confer with client and team re same; pull and review NuVasive's cited cases; investigate underlying facts and facts re NuVasive's delay; draft and revise request for emergency in-person status conference
12/08/19	E. Lewis	1.20	Analyze NuVasive's arguments re motion to disqualify Alphatec's counsel
12/08/19	B. Nisbet	1.90	Draft notice of request for status conference re motion for protective order; call with N. Wickramasekera re the same
12/08/19	L. Quan	9.30	Assist in preparation of Alphatec's notice of emergency request re ex parte motion for protective order and assignment of special master
12/08/19	S. Raghavan	1.40	Confer and strategize regarding NuVasive's ex parte motion for protective order and appointment of special master; continue review and analysis of NuVasive's motion; begin drafting Alphatec's opposition to NuVasive's motion
12/08/19	B. Wardlaw	0.60	Review draft response to NuVasive ex parte motion for a protective order
12/08/19	N. Wickramasekera	2.20	Revise and finalize request for emergency in-person status conference

Date	Attorney/Other Prof	Hours	Description
12/09/19	D. Dalke	6.00	Conferences re response to ex parte motion for special master; draft response to ex parte motion for special master
12/09/19	C. Hockman	0.50	Confer with team regarding emergency motion
12/09/19	E. Lewis	7.80	Analyze NuVasive's motion for protective order and appointment of a special master; confer with team re response strategy; research response motion; draft response motion
12/09/19	B. Nisbet	6.60	Prepare opposition to motion for protective order, calls with N. Wickramasekera, the court's chambers, and team re the same
12/09/19	L. Petroff	1.20	Confirm result of court hearing; telephone call, B. Nesbet re open issues; review comparable briefs and theories re protection of proprietary information
12/09/19	L. Quan	3.00	Assist in preparation for notice of emergency request for in person hearing and stay re ex parte motion for protective order and assignment of special master
12/09/19	S. Raghavan	10.60	Confer and strategize regarding NuVasive's ex parte motion for protective order and appointment of special master; continue review and analysis of NuVasive's motion; continue drafting Alphatec's opposition to NuVasive's motion
12/09/19	G. Skogg	8.50	Prepare files for attorneys for ex parte motion; revisions to case indexes for attorney use; correspondence re attorney binders for response to case schedule
12/09/19	B. Wardlaw	10.30	Opposition to ex parte motion for protective order and appointment of special master: create document for motion response; call with team to strategize response to the motion; research documents for the motion: review docket for

Date	Attorney/Other Prof	Hours	Description
			motion response; begin to draft motion
12/09/19	N. Wickramasekera	11.40	Finalize and file request for emergency in-person status conference; continue to review cases cited in NuVasive's briefing; review additional case law relevant to motion; prepare response to NuVasive's motion for disqualification; confer with team re research and declaration to support response to NuVasive's motion for disqualification
12/10/19	D. Dalke	15.80	Review and revise responses to ex parte motion for special master; draft declarations in support of response; conduct legal research re disqualification standards
12/10/19	E. Lewis	4.60	Research response to Ex Parte Motion for Protective Order and Appointment of Special Master; draft same; edit same
12/10/19	B. Nisbet	8.10	Review record and research cases re NuVasive's motion for protective order, draft opposition to motion for protective order, review C. Hunsaker declaration, correspondences re the same
12/10/19	L. Petroff	0.50	Review issues re disclosure of relevant and discoverable information; follow-up with B. Nisbet re confidentiality provisions in employment agreements
12/10/19	S. Raghavan	11.10	Confer and strategize regarding NuVasive's ex parte motion for protective order and appointment of special master; continue review and analysis of NuVasive's motion; continue drafting Alphatec's opposition to NuVasive's motion
12/10/19	G. Skogg	3.00	Research re documents and case data for attorney review in preparation of response to ex parte motion; preparation of case documents for attorney review; revisions to case indexes for attorney use; correspondence with team attorneys re preparation of response to ex parte motion

Explore Litigation Insights

Docket Alarm provides insights to develop a more informed litigation strategy and the peace of mind of knowing you're on top of things.

Real-Time Litigation Alerts



Keep your litigation team up-to-date with **real-time alerts** and advanced team management tools built for the enterprise, all while greatly reducing PACER spend.

Our comprehensive service means we can handle Federal, State, and Administrative courts across the country.

Advanced Docket Research



With over 230 million records, Docket Alarm's cloud-native docket research platform finds what other services can't. Coverage includes Federal, State, plus PTAB, TTAB, ITC and NLRB decisions, all in one place.

Identify arguments that have been successful in the past with full text, pinpoint searching. Link to case law cited within any court document via Fastcase.

Analytics At Your Fingertips



Learn what happened the last time a particular judge, opposing counsel or company faced cases similar to yours.

Advanced out-of-the-box PTAB and TTAB analytics are always at your fingertips.

API

Docket Alarm offers a powerful API (application programming interface) to developers that want to integrate case filings into their apps.

LAW FIRMS

Build custom dashboards for your attorneys and clients with live data direct from the court.

Automate many repetitive legal tasks like conflict checks, document management, and marketing.

FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS

Litigation and bankruptcy checks for companies and debtors.

E-DISCOVERY AND LEGAL VENDORS

Sync your system to PACER to automate legal marketing.