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Exemplar - PersonalWeb Fee Reduction Request re Amazon's Alter Ego Claims
Date Timekeeper Description Hours  Original 

Amount 
 Adjusted 
Amount 

Category (1) 
Entries 

(Doc Review)
(30% Discount)

Category (2) 
Entries

(Alter Ego)
(100% Discount)

Fenwick & West
2/4/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Conduct legal and factual research on subpoenas to 

PersonalWeb investors (2.0); Discussions regarding receivership 
with team and receiver (0.4).

2.4 1,963.20$        1,783.20$         

2/8/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze draft subpoena requests. 0.5 409.00$            371.50$            
2/9/2022 Todd Gregorian Revise subpoenas to insider investor entities and other 

judgment enforcement tasks.
2.4 2,181.60$        1,558.25$         

2/9/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Discussions regarding appellate proceedings and draft 
subpoenas with T. Gregorian and opposing counsel.

0.3 245.40$            222.90$            

2/10/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to judgment enforcement issues including subpoenas 
to insider investors and Stubbs proposed motion to withdraw 
as counsel.

1.5 1,363.50$        973.91$            

2/14/2022 Todd Gregorian Work on judgment enforcement issues, including subpoenas to 
insider investors, opposition to withdrawal motion, and phone 
conference with receiver’s counsel.

3.0 2,727.00$        1,947.81$         

2/14/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence regarding scheduling meeting and draft 
subpoenas with team and records research regarding the same.

0.5 409.00$            371.50$            

2/15/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise subpoenas to PersonalWeb creditors, conduct factual 
and records research regarding the same, and correspondence 
regarding the same with team.

2.5 2,045.00$        1,857.50$         

2/17/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Finalize subpoenas to creditors of PersonalWeb and supporting 
documents, and correspondence regarding the same with team 
and process server.

2.9 2,372.20$        2,154.70$         

2/18/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise and fiInalize subpoenas to creditors of PersonalWeb and 
coordinate service of the same on the creditors and opposing 
counsel, and correspondence regarding the same with team 
and process server.

1.8 1,472.40$        1,337.40$         

3/2/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to third party subpoenas. 0.3 272.70$            194.78$            
3/2/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze PersonalWeb's creditors' objections and responses to 

subpoenas and correspondence regarding the same with team.
0.6 490.80$            445.80$            

3/3/2022 Todd Gregorian Correspondence with opposing counsel re subpoenas. 0.8 727.20$            519.42$            
3/3/2022 Todd Gregorian Revise motion to compel production in response to post-

judgment subpoenas.
4.4 3,999.60$        2,856.79$         

3/3/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Draft motion to compel third-party subpoenaed parties, 
conduct legal and records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence and discussions regarding the same with team.

2.3 1,881.40$        1,708.90$         

3/3/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence regarding meet and confer on third-party 
subpoenas with opposing counsel and team.

0.4 327.20$            297.20$            

3/4/2022 Todd Gregorian Revise motion to compel production in response to post-
judgment subpoenas.

4.0 3,636.00$        2,597.08$         

3/4/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Coordinate service of third-party subpoena and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

0.4 327.20$            297.20$            

3/4/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise motion to compel third-party subpoenaed parties, 
conduct legal and records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence and discussions regarding the same with team.

1.8 1,472.40$        1,337.40$         

3/7/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to third party subpoena motion to compel and 
withdrawal opposition.

0.7 636.30$            454.49$            
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3/7/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze draft motion to compel post- judgment discovery and 
correspondence and discussions regarding the same with team.

1.5 1,227.00$        1,114.50$         

3/8/2022 Todd Gregorian Interoffice conference re pending enforcement tasks (0.2); 
meet and confer with opposing counsel re subpoenas (0.6).

0.8 727.20$            519.42$            

3/14/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence and discussions regarding third-party 
subpoena with team and process server.

0.5 409.00$            371.50$            

3/15/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise third-party subpoena, conduct factual research 
regarding the same, and correspondence regarding the same 
with team and process server.

2.2 1,799.60$        1,634.60$         

3/15/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence and discussions regarding motion to compel 
compliance with third-party subpoenas with team and 
opposing counsel, and conduct legal and records research 
regarding the same.

1.8 1,472.40$        1,337.40$         

3/16/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Coordinate service of third-party subpoena, conduct factual 
research regarding the same, and correspondence regarding 
the same with team and process server.

1.6 1,308.80$        1,188.80$         

3/16/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Draft miscellaneous action pleadings regarding enforcement of 
third-party subpoenas, and conduct legal research regarding 
the same.

1.7 1,390.60$        1,263.10$         

3/17/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to subpoena service and discovery motion. 0.9 818.10$            584.34$            
3/17/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise and finalize joint statement to compel compliance with 

third-party subpoenas and supporting documents, conduct 
legal and records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team and opposing 

1.8 1,472.40$        1,337.40$         

3/17/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Assist with drafting miscellaneous action pleadings regarding 
enforcement of third-party subpoenas, conduct legal research 
regarding the same, and correspondence and discussions 
regarding the same with team.

2.2 1,799.60$        1,634.60$         

3/17/2022 Robert T. Winant Cite check Statement re Discovery Dispute and prepare 1.0 440.00$            342.16$            
3/18/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to motion to compel subpoena responses. 0.3 272.70$            194.78$            
3/18/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise, finalize, and coordinate filing of joint statement to 

compel compliance with third-party subpoenas and supporting 
documents, conduct legal and records research regarding the 
same, and correspondence regarding the same with team and 
opposing counsel.

2.4 1,963.20$        1,783.20$         

3/18/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Assist with drafting miscellaneous action pleadings and 
supporting documents regarding enforcement of third-party 
subpoenas, conduct legal and records research regarding the 
same, and correspondence and discussions regarding the same 

3.2 2,617.60$        2,377.60$         

3/21/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence regarding service of third-party subpoena with 
team and process server.

0.3 245.40$            222.90$            

3/21/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise draft miscellaneous action pleadings regarding 
enforcement of third-party subpoenas, and correspondence 
and discussions regarding the same with team.

1.4 1,145.20$        1,040.20$         

3/22/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence and discussions regarding service of third-
party subpoena with team and process server, and conduct 
factual research regarding the same.

0.8 654.40$            594.40$            

3/23/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence and discussions regarding service of third-
party subpoena with team and process server, and conduct 
factual research regarding the same.

0.8 654.40$            594.40$            

3/28/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence and discussions regarding service of third-
party subpoena with team and process server.

0.5 409.00$            371.50$            
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4/7/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Review subpoena and requests for production, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

1.2 981.60$            891.60$            

4/8/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Review subpoenas and requests for productions, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

1.0 818.00$            743.00$            

4/12/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze Court's order compelling production of documents 
from third- parties.

0.3 245.40$            222.90$            

4/25/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Summarize recent related orders on third-party funding 
arrangements, conduct legal research regarding the same, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

0.5 409.00$            371.50$            

4/25/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Draft stipulation for discovery on third-parties, conduct records 
research regarding the same, and correspondence and 
discussions regarding the same with team and opposing 

1.8 1,472.40$        1,337.40$         

4/26/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise, finalize, and coordinate filing of stipulation for discovery 
on third- parties, and correspondence regarding the same with 
team and opposing counsel.

0.5 409.00$            371.50$            

4/27/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Coordinate legal research on potential waiver and drafting of 
third-party subpoena with team, and conduct records research 
regarding the same.

0.6 490.80$            445.80$            

4/28/2022 Alyssa Crooke Draft third party subpoena to Monto Party Holdings. 0.7 322.70$            293.30$            
4/28/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Assist with drafting third-party subpoena, conduct records 

research regarding the same, and correspondence regarding 
the same with team.

0.7 572.60$            520.10$            

4/29/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise, finalize, and serve third-party subpoena, conduct 
factual and records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team and opposing 

3.0 2,454.00$        2,229.00$         

5/6/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence regarding third-party document production 
with third-party and team.

0.3 245.40$            222.90$            

5/10/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Discussions and correspondence regarding third-party discovery 
with opposing counsel.

0.2 163.60$            148.60$            

5/10/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze document production received from subpoenaed third-
party, and correspondence regarding the same with team.

1.8 1,472.40$        1,337.40$         
$1,337.40

5/11/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to plaintiff creditor compliance with subpoenas and 
conferences re same.

0.7 636.30$            454.49$            

5/12/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding third-
party subpoenas with opposing counsel.

0.3 245.40$            222.90$            

5/16/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Draft joint stipulation regarding third- party subpoenas, 
conduct records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence and discussions regarding the same with team.

2.5 2,045.00$        1,857.50$         

5/17/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise joint stipulation regarding third-party subpoenas, 
conduct records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence and discussions regarding the same with team 

1.6 1,308.80$        1,188.80$         

5/18/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise, finalize, and coordinate filing of joint stipulation 
regarding third- party subpoenas, and correspondence 
regarding the same with team and opposing counsel.

1.1 899.80$            817.30$            

5/18/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise, finalize, and coordinate filing of motion to compel and 
accompanying documents, and correspondence regarding the 
same with team.

3.2 2,617.60$        2,377.60$         

5/26/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Review document production of PersonalWeb creditors, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

0.7 572.60$            520.10$            
$520.10

5/27/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Review document production of PersonalWeb creditors, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

1.6 1,308.80$        1,188.80$         
$1,188.80

5/27/2022 Robert T. Winant Upload and review incoming productions from M. Weiss and 
Insiders.

1.0 440.00$            342.16$            
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5/31/2022 Alyssa Crooke Review and summarize documents produced by Personalweb 
insiders/creditors.

1.8 829.80$            754.20$            
$754.20

6/2/2022 Alyssa Crooke Review and summarize documents produced by PersonalWeb's 
insider/creditors.

3.2 1,475.20$        1,340.80$         
$1,340.80

6/3/2022 Alyssa Crooke Review and summarize documents produced by PersonalWeb's 
insider/creditors.

3.6 1,659.60$        1,508.40$         
$1,508.40

6/6/2022 Alyssa Crooke Summarize documents produced by Insider/Creditors. 1.3 599.30$            544.70$            $544.70
6/7/2022 Alyssa Crooke Summarize documents produced by Insider/Creditors. 0.5 230.50$            209.50$            $209.50
6/8/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence regarding PersonalWeb creditors' document 

production with team and opposing counsel.
0.3 245.40$            222.90$            

6/8/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze document production of PersonalWeb creditors and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

2.2 1,799.60$        1,634.60$         
$1,634.60

6/8/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Prepare for and participate in court conference on expediting 
motion to compel, and correspondence and discussions 
regarding the same with team and opposing counsel.

2.3 1,881.40$        1,708.90$         

6/9/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze PersonalWeb creditors' document production. 0.7 572.60$            520.10$            $520.10
6/9/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Correspondence regarding informal discovery conference with 

team and opposing counsel.
0.4 327.20$            297.20$            

6/10/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Draft correspondence on meet and confer with PersonalWeb 
creditors, conduct legal and records research regarding the 
same, and correspondence and discussions regarding the same 

4.5 3,681.00$        3,343.50$         

6/13/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise and deliver correspondence on meet and confer with 
PersonalWeb creditors, conduct records research regarding the 
same, and correspondence regarding the same with team and 
opposing counsel.

1.7 1,390.60$        1,263.10$         

6/14/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Coordinate meet and confer on insiders' discovery and 
correspondence regarding the same with team and opposing 
counsel.

0.2 163.60$            148.60$            

6/14/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Draft motion to compel discovery from insiders, conduct legal 
and records research regarding the same, and correspondence 
regarding the same with team.

3.2 2,617.60$        2,377.60$         

6/15/2022 Todd Gregorian Revise joint statement on motion to compel. 0.7 636.30$            454.49$            
6/15/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise motion to compel discovery from insiders, conduct legal 

and records research regarding the same, and correspondence 
regarding the same with team.

3.6 2,944.80$        2,674.80$         

6/16/2022 Todd Gregorian Revise joint statement on motion to compel and interoffice 
conferences re same.

0.7 636.30$            454.49$            

6/16/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Revise motion to compel discovery from insiders, conduct legal 
and records research regarding the same, and correspondence 
regarding the same with team.

3.6 2,944.80$        2,674.80$         

6/16/2022 Robert T. Winant Cite check joint statement re motion to compel. 0.8 352.00$            273.73$            
6/17/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to discovery disputes and direct associate work. 1.0 909.00$            649.27$            
6/17/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Prepare for and participate in meet and confers regarding 

written discovery with opposing counsel, review inbound 
documents, and correspondence and discussions regarding the 

4.5 3,681.00$        3,343.50$         

6/20/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze correspondence receivedfrom PersonalWeb creditors, 
conduct records research regarding the same, and 
correspondence regarding the same with team.

0.8 654.40$            594.40$            

6/21/2022 Todd Gregorian Attention to discovery disputes and direct associate work. 0.2 181.80$            129.85$            
6/21/2022 Chris Shawn Lavin Analyze correspondence and document production received 

from PersonalWeb creditors, conduct records research 
regarding the same, and correspondence regarding the same 

3.2 2,617.60$        2,377.60$         

$2,377.60
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