

EXHIBIT A

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: March 31, 2022
Invoice Number: 901197
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 3

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
02/01/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Revise reply in support of petition for writ supersedeas and discussions regarding the same with team.	5.6	4,580.80
02/02/22	Todd Gregorian	Revise reply in support of writ petition.	1.0	909.00
02/02/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Revise reply in support of petition for writ supersedeas and discussions regarding the same with team (2.5); Discussions regarding Federal Circuit appendix with team (0.3).	2.8	2,290.40
02/02/22	Robert T. Winant	Review N.D. Cal hearing transcript and update disclient filings.	0.4	176.00
02/02/22	Robert T. Winant	Review updated joint appendix.	0.5	220.00
02/03/22	Lawrence Gallwas	Review and confirm factual and legal citations in Amazon's reply in support of its petition for writ of supersedeas.	1.8	792.00
02/03/22	Todd Gregorian	Revise reply in support of writ petition to stay state court proceeding.	2.0	1,818.00
02/03/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Revise reply in support of petition for writ supersedeas and discussions regarding the same with team (6.2); Correspondence regarding receivership with receiver (0.4).	6.6	5,398.80
02/03/22	Robert T. Winant	Cite check reply in support of writ of supersedeas.	1.5	660.00
02/04/22	Todd Gregorian	Draft meet and confer correspondence with receiver counsel M. Bubman and update client re sanctions threat.	0.8	727.20

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: March 31, 2022
Invoice Number: 901197
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 4

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
02/04/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Discussions regarding appellate submissions with team and clerk of court.	0.4	327.20
02/04/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Conduct legal and factual research on subpoenas to PersonalWeb investors (2.0); Discussions regarding receivership with team and receiver (0.4).	2.4	1,963.20
02/07/22	Alyssa Crooke	Research history of claim preclusion and "transaction or occurrence."	1.4	645.40
02/07/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Revise, finalize, and coordinate filing of reply in support of petition for writ supersedeas and discussions regarding the same with team.	2.3	1,881.40
02/08/22	Alyssa Crooke	Research history of claim preclusion and "transaction or occurrence."	0.8	368.80
02/08/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Analyze draft subpoena requests.	0.5	409.00
02/09/22	Todd Gregorian	Revise subpoenas to insider investor entities and other judgment enforcement tasks.	2.4	2,181.60
02/09/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Discussions regarding appellate proceedings and draft subpoenas with T. Gregorian and opposing counsel.	0.3	245.40
02/10/22	Alyssa Crooke	Research history of claim preclusion and "transaction or occurrence."	0.8	368.80
02/10/22	Todd Gregorian	Attention to judgment enforcement issues including subpoenas to insider investors and Stubbs proposed motion to withdraw as counsel.	1.5	1,363.50
02/10/22	J. David Hadden	Reviewed PersonalWeb's motion to withdraw.	0.4	458.00

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: March 31, 2022
Invoice Number: 901197
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 5

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
02/10/22	J. David Hadden	Team meeting.	0.4	458.00
02/10/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Prepare for and participate in team meeting on case status.	0.7	572.60
02/10/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Analyze opposing counsel's motion to withdraw and correspondence regarding the same with team.	1.3	1,063.40
02/10/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Draft joint stipulation extending deadline to oppose motion to withdraw.	0.8	654.40
02/10/22	Melanie Mayer	Review correspondence from Amazon customer regarding case status and draft response.	0.2	204.20
02/10/22	Robert T. Winant	Team meeting.	0.1	44.00
02/10/22	Robert T. Winant	Collect authorities and prepare binder of material re 2nd motion to withdraw.	0.8	352.00
02/11/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Correspondence regarding appellate briefing and subpoenas with team and co-counsel (0.5); correspondence regarding joint stipulation for extension of time to respond to motion to withdraw with team and opposing counsel (0.4).	0.9	736.20
02/14/22	Todd Gregorian	Work on judgment enforcement issues, including subpoenas to insider investors, opposition to withdrawal motion, and phone conference with receiver's counsel.	3.0	2,727.00
02/14/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Correspondence regarding appellate motion to withdraw with team and legal research regarding the same.	0.4	327.20

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: March 31, 2022
Invoice Number: 901197
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 6

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
02/14/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Revise joint stipulation for extension of time to respond to motion to withdraw, and correspondence regarding the same with team and opposing counsel.	1.0	818.00
02/14/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Correspondence regarding scheduling meeting and draft subpoenas with team and records research regarding the same.	0.5	409.00
02/15/22	Todd Gregorian	Attention to withdrawal motion and other enforcement matters.	0.8	727.20
02/15/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Draft motion for extension of time to respond to motion to withdraw, conduct legal and records research regarding the same, and correspondence and discussions regarding the same with team and opposing counsel.	2.3	1,881.40
02/15/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Revise subpoenas to PersonalWeb creditors, conduct factual and records research regarding the same, and correspondence regarding the same with team.	2.5	2,045.00
02/16/22	Todd Gregorian	Call with co-counsel re enforcement strategy and work on securing extension for withdrawal opposition.	0.8	727.20
02/16/22	Chris Shawn Lavin	Prepare for and participate in status call with team and follow-up correspondence regarding the same.	1.0	818.00

Explore Litigation Insights

Docket Alarm provides insights to develop a more informed litigation strategy and the peace of mind of knowing you're on top of things.

Real-Time Litigation Alerts



Keep your litigation team up-to-date with **real-time alerts** and advanced team management tools built for the enterprise, all while greatly reducing PACER spend.

Our comprehensive service means we can handle Federal, State, and Administrative courts across the country.

Advanced Docket Research



With over 230 million records, Docket Alarm's cloud-native docket research platform finds what other services can't. Coverage includes Federal, State, plus PTAB, TTAB, ITC and NLRB decisions, all in one place.

Identify arguments that have been successful in the past with full text, pinpoint searching. Link to case law cited within any court document via Fastcase.

Analytics At Your Fingertips



Learn what happened the last time a particular judge, opposing counsel or company faced cases similar to yours.

Advanced out-of-the-box PTAB and TTAB analytics are always at your fingertips.

API

Docket Alarm offers a powerful API (application programming interface) to developers that want to integrate case filings into their apps.

LAW FIRMS

Build custom dashboards for your attorneys and clients with live data direct from the court.

Automate many repetitive legal tasks like conflict checks, document management, and marketing.

FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS

Litigation and bankruptcy checks for companies and debtors.

E-DISCOVERY AND LEGAL VENDORS

Sync your system to PACER to automate legal marketing.