EXHIBIT B



1330 Connecticut Avenue, NW Washington, DC 20036-1795 TEL: 202.429.3000 FAX: 202.429.3902 www.steptoe.com

July 21, 2021

Todd Gregorian Esq. Partner Fenwick & West LLP 555 California Street San Francisco, CA, 94194

INVOICE SUMMARY

Our Matter No. 122886.00001			Invoice No. 30007880		
JUDGMENT ENFORCEMENT					
For professional services rendered	ed through June 30, 2021				
Total Fees:		\$	39,826.00		
Total Expense	s:	_	0.00		
Total Amount	Due:	\$	39,826.00		



AMAZON, AMAZON WEBS SERVICES INC & TWITCH

Our Matter No. 122886.00001

Invoice No. 30007880 Invoice Date 07/21/2021

Page 2

_	_	_	\sim					_	•
-	-	_	SI	110	лι	vı	Δ	ĸ	Y
	_	_	•			**	_	.,	

Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Amount
S.K. Davidson	7.20	1,165.00	8,388.00
M.J. Baratz	7.80	955.00	7,449.00
Y. Malino	16.40	745.00	12,218.00
E. Marshak	15.80	745.00	11,771.00
TOTAL HOURS	47.20	TOTAL FEES	\$39,826.00

FEE DETAIL

Steven K. Davidson

Date	Hours	Description
06/08/21	1.00	Review of research regarding receiver and consider same.
06/09/21	1.40	Confer with colleagues and T. Gregorian and consider next steps.
06/10/21	1.00	Review of status and consider next steps.
06/16/21	1.30	Review of status; confer with colleagues and consider next steps.
06/22/21	1.00	Confer with M. Baratz and E. Marshak; draft note to client.
06/23/21	0.70	Confer with client and consider next steps.
06/28/21	0.80	Review of status; consider motion to intervene in receivership.
TOTAL	7 20	

Michael Baratz

Date	Hours	Description
06/04/21	0.20	Confer with Y. Malino regarding background information and status.
06/08/21	0.10	Review and analyze legal research and summary regarding receivers.
06/09/21	0.80	Confer with Y. Malino and S. Davidson regarding receivership and strategy; call with T. Krigman, Y. Malino and S. Davidson regarding same.
06/11/21	0.50	Review and analyze information regarding receivership and preliminary injunction.
06/15/21	0.60	Prepare and send email to T. Gregorian regarding thoughts on receiver counsel; confer with S Davidson regarding status and strategy; review and consider receiver issues.
06/16/21	0.80	Call with Y. Malino regarding receivership status; call with E. Marshak regarding receivership issues.
06/17/21	0.20	Confer with S. Davidson regarding contacting receiver.
06/21/21	2.50	Review and analyze receivership/injunction issues; review and consider strategy regarding intervention; draft summary email regarding strategy to team.
06/22/21	1.90	Review and revise summary note regarding receivership; review and analyze legal research regarding receivership; confer with S. Davidson and E. Marshak regarding receivership strategy; confer with E. Marshak regarding fugitive disentitlement doctrine. legal research regarding judgment lien and receivership under California law.
06/23/21	0.20	Prepare and send email to team regarding motion to intervene.
TOTAL	7.80	



AMAZON, AMAZON WEBS SERVICES INC & TWITCH

Our Matter No. 122886.00001

Invoice No. 30007880 Invoice Date 07/21/2021 Page 3

Yvonne Woldeab Malino

Date	Hours	Description
06/05/21	1.40	Legal research regarding receiverships and creditor remedies.
06/06/21	2.80	Review and analyze CA complaint seeking appointment of receiver; research receiverships in California and its effect on preexisting judgment creditor rights; research and summarize creditor remedies.
06/08/21	1.20	Conduct public research and analyze results regarding Brilliant Digital plaintiffs and PWT.
06/09/21	2.20	Discuss proposed creditor remedies regarding receivership with M. Baratz and S. Davidson; client call to discuss status and strategical next steps; review California docket and research 3 plaintiffs
06/11/21	3.00	Research and analyze plaintiffs in receivership action, and define overlap between plaintiffs and defendant; research and summarize receiver appointed, connections to other entities, and PI restrictions.
06/16/21	0.50	Discuss Amazon strategy and next steps with M. Baratz.
06/17/21	1.60	Research motion to intervene, effect on receiverships, and subsequent procedures available in CA courts.
06/18/21	3.70	Research and summarize intervention procedural and substantive issues for team; confer with E. Marshak regarding strategy based on preliminary injunction case law results.
TOTAL	16.40	

Emma Marshak

Date	Hours	Description
06/18/21	4.10	Review pleadings; call with Y. Malino to discuss next steps; research receiver actions with non- consenting creditors and applicability of preliminary injunctions to post-judgment discovery.
06/19/21	0.70	Research impact of preliminary injunction on post-judgment discovery.
06/21/21	0.80	Draft summary of recommendations regarding intervention in receivership and post-judgment discovery; arrange for docket tracking.
06/22/21	1.80	Call with S. Davidson and M. Baratz to discuss case strategy; research fugitive disentitlement doctrine; draft summary of strategic plan.
06/23/21	0.30	Discuss intervention strategy with M. Baratz.
06/28/21	7.10	Draft motion to intervene and accompanying pleadings.
06/29/21	1.00	Draft declaration in support of motion to intervene.
TOTAL	15.80	





1330 Connecticut Avenue, NW Washington, DC 20036-1795 TEL: 202.429.3000 FAX: 202.429.3902 www.steptoe.com

July 21, 2021

Todd Gregorian Esq. Partner Fenwick & West LLP 555 California Street San Francisco, CA, 94194

INVOICE SUMMARY

Our Matter No. 122886.00001	Invoice No. 30007880	
JUDGMENT ENFORCEMENT		
For professional services rendered through June 30, 2021		
Total Fees:	\$	39,826.00
Total Expenses:	_	0.00
Total Amount Due:	\$	39,826.00

INVOICE IS DUE AND PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR REMITTANCE



Limited Liability Partnership under the laws of the District of Columbia, U.S.A.
BEUING BRUSSELS CHICAGO HONG KONG LONDON LOS ANGELES NEW YORK SAN FRANCISCO WASHINGTON



DOCKET

Explore Litigation Insights



Docket Alarm provides insights to develop a more informed litigation strategy and the peace of mind of knowing you're on top of things.

Real-Time Litigation Alerts



Keep your litigation team up-to-date with **real-time** alerts and advanced team management tools built for the enterprise, all while greatly reducing PACER spend.

Our comprehensive service means we can handle Federal, State, and Administrative courts across the country.

Advanced Docket Research



With over 230 million records, Docket Alarm's cloud-native docket research platform finds what other services can't. Coverage includes Federal, State, plus PTAB, TTAB, ITC and NLRB decisions, all in one place.

Identify arguments that have been successful in the past with full text, pinpoint searching. Link to case law cited within any court document via Fastcase.

Analytics At Your Fingertips



Learn what happened the last time a particular judge, opposing counsel or company faced cases similar to yours.

Advanced out-of-the-box PTAB and TTAB analytics are always at your fingertips.

API

Docket Alarm offers a powerful API (application programming interface) to developers that want to integrate case filings into their apps.

LAW FIRMS

Build custom dashboards for your attorneys and clients with live data direct from the court.

Automate many repetitive legal tasks like conflict checks, document management, and marketing.

FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS

Litigation and bankruptcy checks for companies and debtors.

E-DISCOVERY AND LEGAL VENDORS

Sync your system to PACER to automate legal marketing.

