


EXHIBIT 4

	Silicon Valley Center 801 California Street Mountain View, CA 94041 Tel 650.988.8500 Fax 650.938.5200
---	---

Amazon.com
410 Terry Avenue, North
Seattle, WA 98109-5210

Invoice Date: February 28, 2018
Client Number: 23984
Matter Number: 00507
Invoice Number: 698241

Attn: David Zapolsky

For professional services rendered through January 31, 2018.

Fees: \$ 106,827.00

CURRENT AMOUNT DUE \$ 106,827.00

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: February 28, 2018
Invoice Number: 698241
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 2

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/08/18	Saina Shamilov	Research best way to defend Amazon customers sued by Personal Web.	1.5	1,095.00
01/09/18	Todd Gregorian	Research and analysis re: declaratory judgment complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	2.5	1,700.00
01/09/18	Phillip Haack	Prepare client memorandum re: recommendation for PersonalWeb cases.	5.8	3,944.00
01/09/18	J. David Hadden	Reviewed new complaints; interoffice conference and e-mails with client re: strategy to get customer cases dismissed.	1.3	1,189.50
01/09/18	Saina Shamilov	Review PersonalWeb's complaint against Amazon customers.	1.0	730.00
01/10/18	Todd Gregorian	Research and analysis re: declaratory judgment complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	7.3	4,964.00
01/10/18	Phillip Haack	Prepare client memorandum re: recommendation for PersonalWeb cases.	4.2	2,856.00
01/10/18	J. David Hadden	Interoffice e-mails re: strategy.	0.3	274.50
01/11/18	Todd Gregorian	Work on declaratory judgment complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	6.2	4,216.00
01/11/18	Phillip Haack	Prepare client memorandum re: recommendation for PersonalWeb cases.	2.4	1,632.00
01/11/18	Saina Shamilov	Review research and draft regarding ways to defend customer sued by PersonalWeb.	2.1	1,533.00

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: February 28, 2018
Invoice Number: 698241
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 3

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/12/18	Todd Gregorian	Work on declaratory judgment complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	4.3	2,924.00
01/12/18	Phillip Haack	Prepare declaratory judgment complaint, analyze legal issues relating to preclusion of prior claims for same.	4.4	2,992.00
01/12/18	J. David Hadden	Interoffice conference and e-mail to client re: proposed declaratory judgment action.	0.8	732.00
01/12/18	Elizabeth Hagan	Discuss strategy re: motion for preliminary injunction against PersonalWeb with team.	0.3	186.00
01/12/18	Chieh Tung	Strategize for and draft complaint for declaratory judgment.	6.5	2,502.50
01/13/18	Phillip Haack	Prepare declaratory judgment complaint; analyze legal issues relating to preclusion of prior claims for same.	0.8	544.00
01/13/18	Elizabeth Hagan	Draft motion for anti-suit preliminary injunction against PersonalWeb.	9.2	5,704.00
01/14/18	Phillip Haack	Revise declaratory judgment complaint; analyze legal issues relating to preclusion of prior claims for same.	3.5	2,380.00
01/15/18	Phillip Haack	Revise declaratory judgment complaint; discuss same with team.	1.4	952.00
01/15/18	Elizabeth Hagan	Revise motion to enjoin customer suits by PersonalWeb.	1.7	1,054.00
01/15/18	Chieh Tung	Revise complaint for declaratory judgment and research supporting case law.	8.3	3,195.50

Amazon.com
Client Number: 23984

Invoice Date: February 28, 2018
Invoice Number: 698241
Billing Attorney: J. David Hadden

Page 4

PersonalWeb
Matter number 23984-00507

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/16/18	Todd Gregorian	Work on declaratory judgment complaint and motion.	3.0	2,040.00
01/16/18	Phillip Haack	Revise declaratory judgment complaint; discuss same with team.	5.7	3,876.00
01/16/18	J. David Hadden	Reviewed new claim preclusion case.	0.3	274.50
01/16/18	Elizabeth Hagan	Revise motion to enjoin PersonalWeb's customer suits.	1.9	1,178.00
01/16/18	Chieh Tung	Revise complaint for declaratory judgment and research supporting case law.	2.5	962.50
01/17/18	Todd Gregorian	Work on declaratory judgment complaint.	8.4	5,712.00
01/17/18	Phillip Haack	Revise declaratory judgment complaint; discuss same with team.	1.1	748.00
01/17/18	Chieh Tung	Revise complaint for default judgment.	0.8	308.00
01/17/18	Chieh Tung	Research case law to support complaint for declaratory judgment.	1.9	731.50
01/18/18	Todd Gregorian	Work on declaratory judgment complaint and motion.	2.5	1,700.00
01/18/18	Phillip Haack	Revise declaratory judgment complaint; discuss same with team.	5.7	3,876.00
01/18/18	Elizabeth Hagan	Research privity of customers for claim preclusion purposes in the Ninth Circuit for declaratory judgment complaint and motion to enjoin customer suits.	3.0	1,860.00
01/18/18	Saina Shamilov	Prepare declaratory judgment complaint.	6.3	4,599.00
01/18/18	Chieh Tung	Research case law to support complaint for declaratory judgment.	3.3	1,270.50

Explore Litigation Insights

Docket Alarm provides insights to develop a more informed litigation strategy and the peace of mind of knowing you're on top of things.

Real-Time Litigation Alerts



Keep your litigation team up-to-date with **real-time alerts** and advanced team management tools built for the enterprise, all while greatly reducing PACER spend.

Our comprehensive service means we can handle Federal, State, and Administrative courts across the country.

Advanced Docket Research



With over 230 million records, Docket Alarm's cloud-native docket research platform finds what other services can't. Coverage includes Federal, State, plus PTAB, TTAB, ITC and NLRB decisions, all in one place.

Identify arguments that have been successful in the past with full text, pinpoint searching. Link to case law cited within any court document via Fastcase.

Analytics At Your Fingertips



Learn what happened the last time a particular judge, opposing counsel or company faced cases similar to yours.

Advanced out-of-the-box PTAB and TTAB analytics are always at your fingertips.

API

Docket Alarm offers a powerful API (application programming interface) to developers that want to integrate case filings into their apps.

LAW FIRMS

Build custom dashboards for your attorneys and clients with live data direct from the court.

Automate many repetitive legal tasks like conflict checks, document management, and marketing.

FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS

Litigation and bankruptcy checks for companies and debtors.

E-DISCOVERY AND LEGAL VENDORS

Sync your system to PACER to automate legal marketing.