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DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES  

 

 
 
 
 

 

 Food and Drug Administration 
Silver Spring  MD  20993 

 
 
NDA 022272 NDA APPROVAL 
 
Purdue Pharma L.P. 
One Stamford Forum 
Stamford, CT 06901-3431 
 
Attention:  Craig Landau, M.D. 
 CMO & VP Clinical, Medical & Regulatory Affairs 
 
 
Dear Dr. Landau: 
 
Please refer to your new drug application (NDA) dated, received November 29, 2007, submitted 
under section 505(b) of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (FDCA) for OxyContin 
(Oxycodone Hydrochloride Controlled-Release) Tablets. 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your submissions dated November 30, and December 19, 20 and 21, 
2007, January 14, February 8, 12, 14 (2), and 15 (2), March 7, 10, 14, 18, 25 (2), and 27, April 
11 (2) and 23, May 7, August 20, September 26, October 30, November 11 and 20, and 
December 5, 8, and 10, 2008, and March 30, May 18, June 2, 10, and 16, July 13 and 24, August 
7, September 18, October 6 and 9, and November 4, 6, 17, 19, and 23, December 16 and 22 
2009, and February 5, and 24, March 11, 25, 26, and 31, and April 2, 2010. 
 
The February 5, 2010, submission constituted a complete response to our December 30, 2009, 
action letter. 
 
This new drug application provides for the use of OxyContin (Oxycodone Hydrochloride 
Controlled-Release) Tablets, 10 mg, 15 mg, 20 mg, 30 mg, 40 mg, 60 mg, and 80 mg, for 
treatment of moderate-to-severe pain when a continuous, around-the-clock opioid analgesic is 
needed for an extended period of time. 
 
We have completed our review of this application, as amended.  It is approved, effective on the 
date of this letter, for use as recommended in the content of labeling [21 CFR 314.50(1)] in 
structured product labeling (SPL) format submitted on March 31, 2010. 
 
We are waiving the requirements of 21 CFR 201.57(d)(8) regarding the length of Highlights of 
prescribing information.  This waiver applies to all future supplements containing revised 
labeling unless we notify you otherwise. 
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CONTENT OF LABELING 
 
As soon as possible, but no later than 14 days from the date of this letter, please resubmit the 
content of labeling [21 CFR 314.50(l)] in structured product labeling (SPL) format, as described 
at http://www.fda.gov/ForIndustry/DataStandards/StructuredProductLabeling/default.htm, that is 
identical to the enclosed labeling text for the package insert and Medication Guide. For 
administrative purposes, please designate this submission, “SPL for approved NDA 022272.” 
 
 
CARTON AND IMMEDIATE CONTAINER LABELS 
 
We acknowledge your March 31, 2010, submission containing final printed carton and container 
labels. 
 
Marketing the product with FPL that is not identical to the approved labeling text may render the 
product misbranded and an unapproved new drug. 
 
 
POSTMARKETING REQUIREMENTS UNDER 505(o) 

 
As you were informed in our December 30, 2009, Complete Response Letter, FDA has 
determined that you are required to conduct postmarketing studies of OxyContin (Oxycodone 
Hydrochloride Controlled-Release) Tablets to assess the known serious risks of OxyContin 
(Oxycodone Hydrochloride Controlled-Release) Tablets, in particular, whether the changes made 
to the OxyContin (Oxycodone Hydrochloride Controlled-Release) Tablets formulation that are 
the subject of this application and which are intended to deter misuse and abuse actually result in 
a decrease in the risks of misuse and abuse, and their consequences.   
 
Specifically, we have determined that you are required, pursuant to section 505(o)(3) of the 
FDCA, to conduct epidemiological  studies to address whether the changes made to the 
OxyContin (Oxycodone Hydrochloride Controlled-Release) Tablets formulation that are the 
subject of this application result in a decrease in misuse and abuse, and their consequences: 
addiction, overdose, and death. 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your proposal, included in your February 5, 2010, resubmission to 
this application, that contains brief descriptions of possible postmarketing studies to fulfill this 
requirement.  Because of design and methodology challenges, we continue to be concerned that 
the proposed studies will not successfully capture the necessary information that will allow us to 
assess the impact, if any, attributable to the change in the OxyContin (Oxycodone Hydrochloride 
Controlled-Release) Tablets formulation.  Therefore, we will continue discussion of your 
postmarketing study proposals at an advisory committee meeting in the fall of 2010 on the 
design and methodology of the proposed studies.  
 
For the study to be conducted first, you must submit the final protocol and the timetable for 
completion of the study by January 31, 2011.  Likewise, for the study to be conducted last, you 
must submit the final protocol and timetable for completion of the study by March 1, 2011. 
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